



Nelson Mullins Riley & Scarborough LLP

Attorneys and Counselors at Law

Tax ID No. 57-0215445

Post Office Box 11070 / Columbia, South Carolina 29211

Tel: 803.799.2000

Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Cafe Holdings
Corp
ATTN: Lyena Hale
Store Master Funding V, LLC
8377 East Hartford Drive
Suite 100
Scottsdale, AZ 85255

April 15, 2019
Invoice 1955744 Page 1

Our Matter # 058320/01500
Name of Matter: Cafe Holdings Corp.

For Services Through 04/15/19

CAO - Claim Administration

03/15/19	Telephone call with Michael Weaver to discuss utility company claim. B.K. POSTON / Partner	0.10 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$45.00
	Subtotal CAO	0.10 hrs.		\$45.00

EXC - Executory Contracts

03/01/19	Reviewing expedited motion to assume and reject certain executory contracts. B.K. POSTON / Partner	0.30 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$135.00
03/01/19	Review motion to assume or reject motion to expedite and order. F.B. KNOWLTON / Partner	0.20 hrs.	535.00/hr	\$107.00
03/05/19	Telephone conference with Dave Wheeler regarding expedited hearing issues. F.B. KNOWLTON / Partner	0.20 hrs.	535.00/hr	\$107.00
03/15/19	Reviewing second omnibus motion to reject executory contracts and email to co- counsel on same. B.K. POSTON / Partner	0.20 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$90.00
	Subtotal EXC	0.90 hrs.		\$439.00

RCP - Retention/Compensation of Professionals

03/21/19	Prepare certificates of no objection as to second fee applications. L.K. HANN / Senior Paralegal	0.50 hrs.	195.00/hr	\$97.50
03/22/19	Reviewing certificates of no objection, instructing on filing same, and email to PSZ&J with filed copies. B.K. POSTON / Partner	0.20 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$90.00
03/22/19	Submit certificates of no objection to fee applications for filing electronically to the Court. L.K. HANN / Senior Paralegal	0.20 hrs.	195.00/hr	\$39.00
03/25/19	Revising pre-bill in advance of drafting February fee application.			

April 15, 2019
 Invoice 1955744 Page 2

	B.K. POSTON / Partner	0.60 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$270.00
03/26/19	Drafting monthly fee application. B.K. POSTON / Partner	2.20 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$990.00
03/26/19	Revising pre-bill for February fee application. B.K. POSTON / Partner	0.40 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$180.00
03/27/19	Drafting notice to PSZJ third fee application and email to co-counsel regarding fee applications. B.K. POSTON / Partner	0.30 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$135.00
03/29/19	Submit Nelson Mullins and Pachulski Stang third fee applications electronically to the Court for filing and serve out Nelson Mullins' application. L.K. HANN / Senior Paralegal	1.10 hrs.	195.00/hr	\$214.50
04/01/19	Prepare certificate of service as to PSZJ's fee application and serve same. L.K. HANN / Senior Paralegal	0.50 hrs.	195.00/hr	\$97.50
04/12/19	Drafting final fee application. B.K. POSTON / Partner	0.70 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$315.00
04/13/19	Drafting and revising final fee application. B.K. POSTON / Partner	6.20 hrs.	450.00/hr	\$2,790.00
04/15/19	Preparing final fee application. L.K. HANN / Senior Paralegal	5.50 hrs.	195.00/hr	\$1,072.50
	Subtotal RCP	18.40 hrs.		\$6,291.00

Fees for Legal Services \$6,775.00

BILLING SUMMARY

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Position</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
F.B. KNOWLTON	Partner	0.40	\$535.00	\$214.00
B.K. POSTON	Partner	11.20	\$450.00	\$5,040.00
L.K. HANN	Senior Paralegal	7.80	\$195.00	\$1,521.00
TOTAL		19.40	\$349.23	\$6,775.00

TOTAL FOR THIS INVOICE \$6,775.00

April 15, 2019
 Invoice 1955744 Page 3

REMITTANCE COPY

Please Return With Your Payment To:

ATTN: Accounts Receivable
Nelson Mullins Riley & Scarborough LLP
 Post Office Drawer 11009
 Columbia, South Carolina 29211
 Telephone (803) 799-2000
 accounts.receivable@nelsonmullins.com

Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of Cafe Holdings
 Corp
 ATTN: Lyena Hale
 Store Master Funding V, LLC
 8377 East Hartford Drive
 Suite 100
 Scottsdale, AZ 85255

Our Matter # 058320/01500
 Name of Matter: Cafe Holdings Corp.

For Services Through 04/15/19

Fees for Professional Services	\$6,775.00	
Charges for Other Services Provided/Expenses Incurred	0.00	
TOTAL FOR THIS INVOICE		\$6,775.00

ADDITIONAL INVOICES OUTSTANDING

Invoice Number	Invoice Date	A/R Balance
1928725	01/28/2019	\$8,287.60
1938650	02/26/2019	\$13,652.96
1948652	03/26/2019	\$20,155.68

Total Additional Invoices \$42,096.24

PLEASE DISREGARD IF PAYMENT IS IN TRANSIT

Terms of Payment: Balance due within thirty days of invoice date

ELECTRONIC PAYMENT INSTRUCTIONS

**Domestic Wire
 And ACH Transfer**

Beneficiary:
 Nelson Mullins Riley &
 Scarborough, LLP
 1320 Main Street
 Columbia, SC 29201
Beneficiary Bank:
 Synovus Bank (formerly NBSC, a division of Synovus Bank)
 1148 Broadway
 Columbus, GA 31901
ABA/Routing Number: 061100606
Beneficiary Account: 1002720611

**Foreign Wire (USD)
 Transfer**

Beneficiary:
 Nelson Mullins Riley &
 Scarborough, LLP
 1320 Main Street
 Columbia, SC 29201
Beneficiary Bank:
 Synovus Bank
 Birmingham, Alabama, USA
SWIFT Code: FICOUS44
Beneficiary Account: 1002720611
 (Only if required, in addition to SWIFT
 Code FICOUS44, use ABA 061100606).

Wire Reference Field: Note the Nelson Mullins Invoice and Matter Number.

