

# **EXHIBIT A**

**CHIEFTAIN SAND and PROPPANT, LLC, et al**  
**FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED FROM 01/09/2017 THROUGH AND 01/31/2017 BY PROFESSIONAL:**

<b>Professional</b>	<b>Date</b>	<b>Description of Services</b>	<b>Rate</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Fees</b>
Jay Lindenberg	1/12/2017	Conference call with Debtor, Debtor's accountant and W. Pederson, regarding tax filing for bankrupt entity 505(b) election and related issues.	500.00	0.4	200.00
<b>Jay Lindenberg Total</b>				<b>0.4</b>	<b>200.00</b>
Ryan Farley	1/12/2017	Review docket and update calendar.	320.00	0.4	128.00
Ryan Farley	1/20/2017	Conference call re: Initial Debtor Interview.	320.00	0.5	160.00
<b>Ryan Farley Total</b>				<b>0.9</b>	<b>288.00</b>
Wayne Weitz	1/9/2017	Conference call with client and advisors re: filing status and first day hearing prep.	610.00	0.2	122.00
Wayne Weitz	1/10/2017	Telephonic participation in first day hearing.	610.00	0.8	488.00
Wayne Weitz	1/11/2017	Finalize retention application documents.	610.00	0.3	183.00
Wayne Weitz	1/12/2017	Case update meeting with W. Pederson.	610.00	0.2	122.00
Wayne Weitz	1/18/2017	Travel R/T Wilmington for Committee organization meeting.	305.00	1.5	457.50
Wayne Weitz	1/18/2017	Attendance at Committee organization meeting and follow-up conference call with V. Serri and H. Cohen.	610.00	1.0	610.00
Wayne Weitz	1/20/2017	Participation in Initial Debtor Interview (IDI) with U.S. Trustee.	610.00	0.5	305.00
Wayne Weitz	1/25/2017	Preparation of Pillowtex analysis in support of retention application.	610.00	0.3	183.00
Wayne Weitz	1/25/2017	Weekly case update call with Debtor and professionals.	610.00	0.5	305.00
Wayne Weitz	1/30/2017	Weekly update conference call with client and advisors.	610.00	0.3	183.00
<b>Wayne Weitz Total</b>				<b>5.6</b>	<b>2,958.50</b>
William Pederson	1/9/2017	Review of first day pleadings, email comments to counsel.	500.00	0.4	200.00
William Pederson	1/9/2017	Weekly status call with Client and professionals.	500.00	0.2	100.00
William Pederson	1/10/2017	Travel time to/from office to Wilmington to attend first day hearing.	250.00	1.0	250.00
William Pederson	1/10/2017	Attend first day hearing in Delaware Bankruptcy Court.	500.00	0.8	400.00
William Pederson	1/12/2017	Call with S. Hofkes and J. Lindenberg re: tax issues related to filing; Continue call with S. Hofkes re: questions related to financials statements and property taxes.	500.00	0.6	300.00
William Pederson	1/18/2017	Call with W. Weitz and counsel (H. Cohen) re: update follow-up committee formation meeting in Wilmington.	500.00	0.2	100.00
William Pederson	1/19/2017	Initial review of filing schedule worksheets.	500.00	0.4	200.00
William Pederson	1/19/2017	Call with Debtors (S. Hofkes, V. Serri) re: wind down and events post-sale.	500.00	0.3	150.00
William Pederson	1/24/2017	Initial review of schedules.	500.00	1.2	600.00
William Pederson	1/25/2017	Conference call with Debtor and Agent re: review of Schedules and SOFAs.	500.00	1.4	700.00
William Pederson	1/25/2017	Weekly conference call with Debtor and counsel.	500.00	0.4	200.00

William Pederson	1/27/2017 Conference call re: Global Notes.	500.00	0.3	150.00
William Pederson	1/27/2017 Initial review of revised Schedules and SOFAs.	500.00	0.3	150.00
William Pederson	1/30/2017 Weekly conference call with Debtors and counsel.	500.00	0.2	100.00
William Pederson	1/30/2017 Follow-up on edits for Schedules.	500.00	0.3	150.00
William Pederson	1/30/2017 Review of final drafts of SOFAs and Schedules.	500.00	0.9	450.00
<b>William Pederson Total</b>			<b>8.9</b>	<b>4,200.00</b>
<b>Grand Total</b>			<b><u>15.8</u></b>	<b><u>\$ 7,646.50</u></b>

**CHIEFTAIN SAND and PROPPANT, LLC, et al**  
**FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED FROM 02/01/2017 THROUGH AND 03/31/2017 BY PROFESSIONAL:**

<b>Professional</b>	<b>Date</b>	<b>Description of Services</b>	<b>Rate</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Fees</b>
Lou Ann Torres	2/15/2017	Retrieve time entries and begin preparation of monthly fee application.	\$ 150.00	1.0	\$ 150.00
Lou Ann Torres	2/16/2017	Prepare monthly fee application.	150.00	3.5	525.00
Lou Ann Torres	2/17/2017	Continue preparation of monthly fee application.	150.00	2.0	300.00
Lou Ann Torres	3/3/2017	Finalize fee application.	150.00	0.5	75.00
<b>Lou Ann Torres Total</b>				<b>7.0</b>	<b>1,050.00</b>
Ryan Farley	3/13/2017	Call with counsel re: bids.	320.00	0.2	64.00
Ryan Farley	3/13/2017	Combine bid materials for review.	320.00	0.2	64.00
Ryan Farley	3/15/2017	Review bids and summarize.	320.00	2.8	896.00
Ryan Farley	3/20/2017	Review Counsel's bid summary, finalize EA summary.	320.00	1.2	384.00
Ryan Farley	3/20/2017	Conference call with Counsel re: bids and auction.	320.00	0.8	256.00
Ryan Farley	3/21/2017	Discuss plan of liquidation with W. Pederson and forward examples.	320.00	0.6	192.00
<b>Ryan Farley Total</b>				<b>5.8</b>	<b>1,856.00</b>
Wayne Weitz	2/6/2017	Weekly team update call.	610.00	0.3	183.00
Wayne Weitz	2/13/2017	Weekly update call with Debtor and advisors.	610.00	0.2	122.00
Wayne Weitz	2/21/2017	Weekly update call with advisors and Debtor re: case administration and planning for bids and aucti	610.00	0.9	549.00
Wayne Weitz	2/28/2017	Email correspondence client re: auction administration.	610.00	0.2	122.00
Wayne Weitz	3/2/2017	Prepare and finalize January 2017 fee application.	610.00	2.5	1,525.00
Wayne Weitz	3/6/2017	Weekly update call with client and professionals.	610.00	0.2	122.00
Wayne Weitz	3/13/2017	Review preliminary bids received.	610.00	1.0	610.00
Wayne Weitz	3/13/2017	Weekly update call with Debtor and professionals.	610.00	0.4	244.00
Wayne Weitz	3/14/2017	Review submitted bids.	610.00	2.0	1,220.00
Wayne Weitz	3/16/2017	Email correspondence counsel, phone call R. Farley re:	610.00	0.4	244.00
Wayne Weitz	3/20/2017	Conference call with Debtor and advisors re: case progress and auction prep. Follow-up email correspondence counsel re: same.	610.00	0.8	488.00
Wayne Weitz	3/22/2017	Pre-auction meeting with Debtors and advisors in preparation for auction.	610.00	2.5	1,525.00
Wayne Weitz	3/22/2017	Attendance and participation at bankruptcy auction.	610.00	10.0	6,100.00
Wayne Weitz	3/27/2017	Attend sale hearing.	610.00	0.5	305.00
Wayne Weitz	3/27/2017	Travel to/from Wilmington for sale hearing.	305.00	1.8	549.00
<b>Wayne Weitz Total</b>				<b>23.7</b>	<b>13,908.00</b>
William Pederson	2/6/2017	Weekly conference call.	500.00	0.3	150.00
William Pederson	2/13/2017	Weekly conference call.	500.00	0.2	100.00
William Pederson	2/16/2017	Review Monthly Operating Report for January.	500.00	0.4	200.00
William Pederson	2/16/2017	Review fee application time entries.	500.00	0.2	100.00
William Pederson	2/21/2017	Weekly conference call with Debtor and Counsel.	500.00	0.9	450.00
William Pederson	3/6/2017	Attend weekly conference call re: update and next steps.	500.00	0.2	100.00
William Pederson	3/13/2017	Weekly conference call with Debtor.	500.00	0.4	200.00
William Pederson	3/14/2017	Call with S. Hofkes to discuss post-sale items and cash-flow.	500.00	0.3	150.00
William Pederson	3/20/2017	Weekly call with Debtor and counsel re: status and upcoming auction.	500.00	0.5	250.00
William Pederson	3/21/2017	Review of draft wind down budget and projections.	500.00	0.4	200.00

CHIEFTAIN SAND and PROPPANT, LLC, et al  
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED FROM 02/01/2017 THROUGH AND 03/31/2017 BY PROFESSIONAL:

<u>Professional</u>	<u>Date</u>	<u>Description of Services</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
William Pederson	3/22/2017	Discussions with W. Weitz re: sale process and bidding.	500.00	0.3	150.00
		<b>William Pederson Total</b>		<b>4.1</b>	<b>2,050.00</b>
		<b>Grand Total</b>		<b><u>40.6</u></b>	<b><u>\$ 18,864.00</u></b>

**CHIEFTAIN SAND and PROPPANT, LLC, et al**  
**FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED FROM 01/09/2017 THROUGH AND 01/31/2017 BY DATE ORDER:**

<b>Professional</b>	<b>Date</b>	<b>Description of Services</b>	<b>Rate</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Fees</b>
William Pederson	1/9/2017	Review of first day pleadings, email comments to counsel.	\$ 500.00	0.4	\$ 200.00
Wayne Weitz	1/9/2017	Conference call with client and advisors re: filing status and first day hearing prep.	610.00	0.2	122.00
William Pederson	1/9/2017	Weekly status call with Client and professionals.	500.00	0.2	100.00
William Pederson	1/10/2017	Travel time to/from office to Wilmington to attend first day hearing.	250.00	1.0	250.00
Wayne Weitz	1/10/2017	Telephonic participation in first day hearing.	610.00	0.8	488.00
William Pederson	1/10/2017	Attend first day hearing in Delaware Bankruptcy Court.	500.00	0.8	400.00
Wayne Weitz	1/11/2017	Finalize retention application documents.	610.00	0.3	183.00
Ryan Farley	1/12/2017	Review docket and update calendar.	320.00	0.4	128.00
William Pederson	1/12/2017	Call with S. Hofkes and J. Lindenberg re: tax issues related to filing; Continue call with S. Hofkes re: questions related to financials statements and property taxes.	500.00	0.6	300.00
Jay Lindenberg	1/12/2017	Conference call with Debtor, Debtor's accountant and W. Pederson, regarding tax filing for bankrupt entity 505(b) election and related issues.	500.00	0.4	200.00
Wayne Weitz	1/12/2017	Case update meeting with W. Pederson.	610.00	0.2	122.00
William Pederson	1/18/2017	Call with W. Weitz and counsel (H. Cohen) re: update follow-up committee formation meeting in Wilmington.	500.00	0.2	100.00
Wayne Weitz	1/18/2017	Travel R/T Wilmington for Committee organization meeting.	305.00	1.5	457.50
Wayne Weitz	1/18/2017	Attendance at Committee organization meeting and follow-up conference call with V. Serri and H. Cohen.	610.00	1.0	610.00
William Pederson	1/19/2017	Initial review of filing schedule worksheets.	500.00	0.4	200.00
William Pederson	1/19/2017	Call with Debtors (S. Hofkes, V. Serri) re: wind down and events post-sale.	500.00	0.3	150.00
Ryan Farley	1/20/2017	Conference call re: Initial Debtor Interview.	320.00	0.5	160.00
Wayne Weitz	1/20/2017	Participation in Initial Debtor Interview (IDI) with U.S. Trustee.	610.00	0.5	305.00
William Pederson	1/24/2017	Initial review of schedules.	500.00	1.2	600.00
Wayne Weitz	1/25/2017	Preparation of Pillowtex analysis in support of retention application.	610.00	0.3	183.00
Wayne Weitz	1/25/2017	Weekly case update call with Debtor and professionals.	610.00	0.5	305.00
William Pederson	1/25/2017	Conference call with Debtor and Agent re: review of Schedules and SOFAs.	500.00	1.4	700.00
William Pederson	1/25/2017	Weekly conference call with Debtor and counsel.	500.00	0.4	200.00
William Pederson	1/27/2017	Conference call re: Global Notes.	500.00	0.3	150.00
William Pederson	1/27/2017	Initial review of revised Schedules and SOFAs.	500.00	0.3	150.00
William Pederson	1/30/2017	Weekly conference call with Debtors and counsel.	500.00	0.2	100.00
William Pederson	1/30/2017	Follow-up on edits for Schedules.	500.00	0.3	150.00
William Pederson	1/30/2017	Review of final drafts of SOFAs and Schedules.	500.00	0.9	450.00
Wayne Weitz	1/30/2017	Weekly update conference call with client and advisors.	610.00	0.3	183.00
<b>Total Hours &amp; Fees</b>				<b>15.8</b>	<b>\$ 7,646.50</b>

**CHIEFTAIN SAND and PROPPANT, LLC, et al**  
**FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED FROM 02/01/2017 THROUGH AND 03/31/2017 BY DATE ORDER:**

<b>Professional</b>	<b>Date</b>	<b>Description of Services</b>	<b>Rate</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Fees</b>
Wayne Weitz	2/6/2017	Weekly team update call.	\$ 610.00	0.3	\$ 183.00
William Pederson	2/6/2017	Weekly conference call.	500.00	0.3	150.00
Wayne Weitz	2/13/2017	Weekly update call with Debtor and advisors.	610.00	0.2	122.00
William Pederson	2/13/2017	Weekly conference call.	500.00	0.2	100.00
Lou Ann Torres	2/15/2017	Retrieve time entries and begin preparation of monthly fee application.	150.00	1.0	150.00
William Pederson	2/16/2017	Review Monthly Operating Report for January.	500.00	0.4	200.00
Lou Ann Torres	2/16/2017	Prepare monthly fee application.	150.00	3.5	525.00
William Pederson	2/16/2017	Review fee application time entries.	500.00	0.2	100.00
Lou Ann Torres	2/17/2017	Continue preparation of monthly fee application.	150.00	2.0	300.00
Wayne Weitz	2/21/2017	Weekly update call with advisors and Debtor re: case administration and planning for bids and auction.	610.00	0.9	549.00
William Pederson	2/21/2017	Weekly conference call with Debtor and Counsel.	500.00	0.9	450.00
Wayne Weitz	2/28/2017	Email correspondence client re: auction administration.	610.00	0.2	122.00
Wayne Weitz	3/2/2017	Prepare and finalize January 2017 fee application.	610.00	2.5	1,525.00
Lou Ann Torres	3/3/2017	Finalize fee application.	150.00	0.5	75.00
Wayne Weitz	3/6/2017	Weekly update call with client and professionals.	610.00	0.2	122.00
William Pederson	3/6/2017	Attend weekly conference call re: update and next steps.	500.00	0.2	100.00
Ryan Farley	3/13/2017	Call with counsel re: bids.	320.00	0.2	64.00
Ryan Farley	3/13/2017	Combine bid materials for review.	320.00	0.2	64.00
Wayne Weitz	3/13/2017	Weekly update call with Debtor and professionals.	610.00	0.4	244.00
Wayne Weitz	3/13/2017	Review preliminary bids received.	610.00	1.0	610.00
William Pederson	3/13/2017	Weekly conference call with Debtor.	500.00	0.4	200.00
Wayne Weitz	3/14/2017	Review submitted bids.	610.00	2.0	1,220.00
William Pederson	3/14/2017	Call with S. Hofkes to discuss post-sale items and cash-flow.	500.00	0.3	150.00
Ryan Farley	3/15/2017	Review bids and summarize.	320.00	2.8	896.00
Wayne Weitz	3/16/2017	Email correspondence counsel, phone call R. Farley re: analysis bids received and designation of lead bidder.	610.00	0.4	244.00
Ryan Farley	3/20/2017	Review Counsel's bid summary, finalize EA summary.	320.00	1.2	384.00
Ryan Farley	3/20/2017	Conference call with Counsel re: bids and auction.	320.00	0.8	256.00
Wayne Weitz	3/20/2017	Conference call with Debtor and advisors re: case progress and auction prep. Follow-up email correspondence counsel re: same.	610.00	0.8	488.00
William Pederson	3/20/2017	Weekly call with Debtor and counsel re: status and upcoming auction.	500.00	0.5	250.00
Ryan Farley	3/21/2017	Discuss plan of liquidation with W. Pederson and forward examples.	320.00	0.6	192.00
William Pederson	3/21/2017	Review of draft wind down budget and projections.	500.00	0.4	200.00
Wayne Weitz	3/22/2017	Pre-auction meeting with Debtors and advisors in preparation for auction.	610.00	2.5	1,525.00
Wayne Weitz	3/22/2017	Attendance and participation at bankruptcy auction.	610.00	10.0	6,100.00
William Pederson	3/22/2017	Discussions with W. Weitz re: sale process and bidding.	500.00	0.3	150.00
Wayne Weitz	3/27/2017	Attend sale hearing.	610.00	0.5	305.00
Wayne Weitz	3/27/2017	Travel to/from Wilmington for sale hearing.	305.00	1.8	549.00
<b>Grand Total</b>				<b>40.6</b>	<b>\$ 18,864.01</b>

**CHIEFTAIN SAND and PROPPANT, LLC, et al**  
**FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED FROM 01/09/2017 THROUGH AND 01/31/2017 BY PROJECT CATEGORY:**

<b>Professional</b>	<b>Date</b>	<b>Description of Services</b>	<b>Rate</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Fees</b>
William Pederson	1/19/2017	Call with Debtors (S. Hofkes, V. Serri) re: wind down and events post-sale.	500.00	0.3	150.00
<b>Asset Disposition Total</b>				<b>0.3</b>	<b>150.00</b>
William Pederson	1/9/2017	Review of first day pleadings, email comments to counsel.	500.00	0.4	200.00
Wayne Weitz	1/9/2017	Conference call with client and advisors re: filing status and first day hearing prep.	610.00	0.2	122.00
William Pederson	1/9/2017	Weekly status call with Client and professionals.	500.00	0.2	100.00
William Pederson	1/19/2017	Initial review of filing schedule worksheets.	500.00	0.4	200.00
William Pederson	1/24/2017	Initial review of schedules.	500.00	1.2	600.00
Wayne Weitz	1/25/2017	Weekly case update call with Debtor and professionals.	610.00	0.5	305.00
William Pederson	1/25/2017	Conference call with Debtor and Agent re: review of Schedules and SOFAs.	500.00	1.4	700.00
William Pederson	1/25/2017	Weekly conference call with Debtor and counsel.	500.00	0.4	200.00
William Pederson	1/27/2017	Conference call re: Global Notes.	500.00	0.3	150.00
William Pederson	1/27/2017	Initial review of revised Schedules and SOFAs.	500.00	0.3	150.00
William Pederson	1/30/2017	Weekly conference call with Debtors and counsel.	500.00	0.2	100.00
William Pederson	1/30/2017	Follow-up on edits for Schedules.	500.00	0.3	150.00
William Pederson	1/30/2017	Review of final drafts of SOFAs and Schedules.	500.00	0.9	450.00
Wayne Weitz	1/30/2017	Weekly update conference call with client and advisors.	610.00	0.3	183.00
<b>Business Analysis Total</b>				<b>7.0</b>	<b>3,610.00</b>
Wayne Weitz	1/10/2017	Telephonic participation in first day hearing.	610.00	0.8	488.00
William Pederson	1/10/2017	Attend first day hearing in Delaware Bankruptcy Court.	500.00	0.8	400.00
Ryan Farley	1/12/2017	Review docket and update calendar.	320.00	0.4	128.00
Wayne Weitz	1/12/2017	Case update meeting with W. Pederson.	610.00	0.2	122.00
Ryan Farley	1/20/2017	Conference call re: Initial Debtor Interview.	320.00	0.5	160.00
Wayne Weitz	1/20/2017	Participation in Initial Debtor Interview (IDI) with U.S. Trustee.	610.00	0.5	305.00
<b>Case Administration Total</b>				<b>3.2</b>	<b>1,603.00</b>
Wayne Weitz	1/11/2017	Finalize retention application documents.	610.00	0.3	183.00
Wayne Weitz	1/25/2017	Preparation of Pillowtex analysis in support of retention application.	610.00	0.3	183.00
<b>Fee/Employment Application Total</b>				<b>0.6</b>	<b>366.00</b>
William Pederson	1/12/2017	Call with S. Hofkes and J. Lindenberg re: tax issues related to filing; Continue call with S. Hofkes re: questions related to financials statements and property taxes.	500.00	0.6	300.00
Jay Lindenberg	1/12/2017	Conference call with Debtor, Debtor's accountant and W. Pederson, regarding tax filing for bankrupt entity 505(b) election and related issues.	500.00	0.4	200.00
<b>Financing Total</b>				<b>1.0</b>	<b>500.00</b>
William Pederson	1/18/2017	Call with W. Weitz and counsel (H. Cohen) re: update follow-up committee formation meeting in Wilmington.	500.00	0.2	100.00
Wayne Weitz	1/18/2017	Attendance at Committee organization meeting and follow-up conference call with V. Serri and H. Cohen.	610.00	1.0	610.00



			<b>1.2</b>	<b>710.00</b>
	<b>Meetings of Creditors Total</b>			
William Pederson	1/10/2017 Travel time to/from office to Wilmington to attend first day hearing.	250.00	1.0	250.00
Wayne Weitz	1/18/2017 Travel R/T Wilmington for Committee organization meeting.	305.00	1.5	457.50
	<b>Travel Time Total</b>		<b>2.5</b>	<b>707.50</b>
	<b>Grand Total</b>		<b><u>15.8</u></b>	<b><u>\$ 7,646.50</u></b>

**CHIEFTAIN SAND and PROPPANT, LLC, et al**  
**FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED FROM 02/01/2017 THROUGH AND 03/31/2017 BY PROJECT CATEGORY:**

<b>Professional</b>	<b>Date</b>	<b>Description of Services</b>	<b>Rate</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Fees</b>
Wayne Weitz	2/6/2017	Weekly team update call.	\$ 610.00	0.3	\$ 183.00
William Pederson	2/6/2017	Weekly conference call.	500.00	0.3	150.00
Wayne Weitz	2/13/2017	Weekly update call with Debtor and advisors.	610.00	0.2	122.00
William Pederson	2/13/2017	Weekly conference call.	500.00	0.2	100.00
Wayne Weitz	2/21/2017	Weekly update call with advisors and Debtor re: case administration and planning for bids and auction.	610.00	0.9	549.00
William Pederson	2/21/2017	Weekly conference call with Debtor and Counsel.	500.00	0.9	450.00
Wayne Weitz	2/28/2017	Email correspondence client re: auction administration.	610.00	0.2	122.00
Ryan Farley	3/13/2017	Call with counsel re: bids.	320.00	0.2	64.00
Ryan Farley	3/13/2017	Combine bid materials for review.	320.00	0.2	64.00
Wayne Weitz	3/13/2017	Review preliminary bids received.	610.00	1.0	610.00
William Pederson	3/13/2017	Weekly conference call with Debtor.	500.00	0.4	200.00
Wayne Weitz	3/13/2017	Weekly update call with Debtor and professionals.	610.00	0.4	244.00
Wayne Weitz	3/14/2017	Review submitted bids.	610.00	2.0	1,220.00
Ryan Farley	3/15/2017	Review bids and summarize.	320.00	2.8	896.00
Wayne Weitz	3/16/2017	Email correspondence counsel, phone call R. Farley re analysis of bids received and designation of lead	610.00	0.4	244.00
Ryan Farley	3/20/2017	Review Counsel's bid summary, finalize EA summary.	320.00	1.2	384.00
Ryan Farley	3/20/2017	Conference call with Counsel re: bids and auction.	320.00	0.8	256.00
William Pederson	3/20/2017	Weekly call with Debtor and counsel re: status and upcoming auction.	500.00	0.5	250.00
Wayne Weitz	3/20/2017	Conference call with Debtor and advisors re: case progress and auction prep. Follow-up email correspondence counsel re: same.	610.00	0.8	488.00
Wayne Weitz	3/22/2017	Pre-auction meeting with Debtors and advisors in preparation for auction.	610.00	2.5	1,525.00
William Pederson	3/22/2017	Discussions with W. Weitz re: sale process and	500.00	0.3	150.00
Wayne Weitz	3/22/2017	Attendance and participation at bankruptcy auction.	610.00	10.0	6,100.00
Wayne Weitz	3/27/2017	Attend sale hearing.	610.00	0.5	305.00
<b>Asset Disposition Total</b>				<b>27.0</b>	<b>14,676.00</b>
William Pederson	2/16/2017	Review Monthly Operating Report for January.	500.00	0.4	200.00
William Pederson	3/21/2017	Review of draft wind down budget and projections.	500.00	0.4	200.00
<b>Business Analysis Total</b>				<b>0.8</b>	<b>400.00</b>
Wayne Weitz	3/6/2017	Weekly update call with client and professionals.	610.00	0.2	122.00
William Pederson	3/6/2017	Attend weekly conference call re: update and next	500.00	0.2	100.00
William Pederson	3/14/2017	Call with S. Hofkes to discuss post-sale items and	500.00	0.3	150.00
<b>Case Administration Total</b>				<b>0.7</b>	<b>372.00</b>
Lou Ann Torres	2/15/2017	Retrieve time entries and begin preparation of monthly fee application.	150.00	1.0	150.00
Lou Ann Torres	2/16/2017	Prepare monthly fee application.	150.00	3.5	525.00
William Pederson	2/16/2017	Review fee application time entries.	500.00	0.2	100.00

**CHIEFTAIN SAND and PROPPANT, LLC, et al**  
**FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED FROM 02/01/2017 THROUGH AND 03/31/2017 BY PROJECT CATEGORY:**

<b>Professional</b>	<b>Date</b>	<b>Description of Services</b>	<b>Rate</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Fees</b>
Lou Ann Torres	2/17/2017	Continue preparation of monthly fee application.	150.00	2.0	300.00
Wayne Weitz	3/2/2017	Prepare and finalize January 2017 fee application.	610.00	2.5	1,525.00
Lou Ann Torres	3/3/2017	Finalize fee application.	150.00	0.5	75.00
		<b>Fee/Employment Application Total</b>		<b>9.7</b>	<b>2,675.00</b>
Ryan Farley	3/21/2017	Discuss plan of liquidation with W. Pederson and forward examples.	320.00	0.6	192.00
		<b>Plan &amp; Disclosure Statements Total</b>		<b>0.6</b>	<b>192.00</b>
Wayne Weitz	3/27/2017	Travel to/from Wilmington for sale hearing.	305.00	1.8	549.00
		<b>Travel Time Total</b>		<b>1.8</b>	<b>549.00</b>
		<b>Grand Total</b>		<b>40.6</b>	<b>\$ 18,864.00</b>