

EXHIBIT B

CHIEFTAIN SAND and PROPPANT, LLC, et al
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED FROM 04/01/2017 THROUGH AND 05/31/2017 BY DATE ORDER:

Professional	Date	Description of Services	Rate	Hours	Fees
Wayne Weitz	4/3/2017	Conference call debtor and advisors re: closing conditions and procedures.	\$ 610.00	0.4	\$ 244.00
Wayne Weitz	4/3/2017	Review investment bankers' retention and compensation arrangements and fee request. Email corr and phone calls V. Serri and W. Pederson re: same.	610.00	0.9	549.00
William Pederson	4/3/2017	Weekly conference call with Debtor and Counsel.	500.00	0.4	200.00
Wayne Weitz	4/3/2017	Weekly update conference call.	610.00	0.4	244.00
Wayne Weitz	4/10/2017	Weekly update conference call.	610.00	0.3	183.00
Lou Ann Torres	4/10/2017	Begin preparation of February and March monthly fee application.	150.00	1.0	150.00
William Pederson	4/14/2017	Review of draft fee application.	500.00	0.4	200.00
Wayne Weitz	4/17/2017	Weekly case update conference call with Debtors and advisors.	610.00	0.3	183.00
Wayne Weitz	4/17/2017	Retrieve and review liquidation analysis examples.	610.00	0.8	488.00
Wayne Weitz	4/17/2017	Review first interim fee app for filing.	610.00	0.6	366.00
William Pederson	4/17/2017	Weekly call with counsel re:winddown budget and related matters.	500.00	0.3	150.00
William Pederson	4/24/2017	Weekly conference call with debtor and counsel.	500.00	0.4	200.00
William Pederson	5/1/2017	Weekly conference call with debtor and counsel.	500.00	0.5	250.00
Lou Ann Torres	5/11/2017	Begin preparation of fee application.	150.00	1.0	150.00
Ryan Farley	5/12/2017	Review plan and disclosure statement along with winddown budget to assist in preparation of liquidation analysis.	320.00	2.2	704.00
Wayne Weitz	5/15/2017	Weekly update call with counsel.	610.00	0.3	183.00
Wayne Weitz	5/15/2017	Review liquidation analysis with R. Farley.	610.00	0.5	305.00
William Pederson	5/15/2017	Weekly conference call with Debtor and counsel.	500.00	0.3	150.00
Ryan Farley	5/15/2017	Discuss liquidation analysis with W. Weitz and call with counsel.	320.00	0.5	160.00
Ryan Farley	5/15/2017	Analysis of winddown budget and prepare liquidation analysis.	320.00	3.1	992.00
Ryan Farley	5/16/2017	Revisions to Liquidation Analysis.	320.00	1.2	384.00
Wayne Weitz	5/22/2017	Meeting with R. Farley to review liquidation analysis and prepare for weekly update call.	610.00	0.5	305.00
Wayne Weitz	5/22/2017	Weekly update conference call.	610.00	0.5	305.00
Wayne Weitz	5/22/2017	Meeting with R. Farley, phone call with H. Cohen re: Liquidation Analysis. Revisions to analysis and submission to counsel.	610.00	0.3	183.00
Ryan Farley	5/22/2017	Weekly call with counsel and Debtor.	320.00	0.5	160.00
Ryan Farley	5/22/2017	Discuss liquidation analysis with W. Weitz.	320.00	0.3	96.00
Total Hours & Fees				17.9	\$ 7,484.00