

EXHIBIT A

Client/Matter: 114307 93983	Chieftain Sand and Proppant, LLC Chapter 11 Restructuring
---------------------------------------	--

Tran Date	Description Of Services	Task Code	Tkpr	Initials	Hours	Value
06/14/2017	Prepare monthly operating report for electronic filing (0.1); file and serve same; emails with team re: same. (0.1)	ZD04	26059	ER	0.20	\$53.00
	Sub-Total For Task: ZD04 Business Operations				0.20	\$53.00
06/05/2017	Attend weekly professionals' update call.	ZD05	00269	HAC	0.40	\$222.00
06/14/2017	Draft Notice of Cancelled Hearing (0.1); prepare notice for electronic filing; file and serve; review and receipt of as-filed copies; emails with team re: same (0.1).	ZD05	26059	ER	0.20	\$53.00
06/14/2017	Draft Notice of Adjourned Hearing (0.2); prepare notice for electronic filing; file and serve (0.1); review and receipt of as-filed copies; emails with team re: same (0.1).	ZD05	26059	ER	0.40	\$106.00
06/22/2017	Confer with chambers re: cancellation of 6/27 hearing; emails and confer with H. Cohen re: same.	ZD05	26059	ER	0.10	\$26.50
06/22/2017	Draft Notice of Agenda Cancelling Hearing (0.1); email with H. Cohen re: same.	ZD05	26059	ER	0.10	\$26.50
06/22/2017	Draft Notice of Agenda for 6/27 Hearing (0.1); prepare for electronic filing; file and serve (0.1); email with H. Cohen re: same (0.1).	ZD05	26059	ER	0.30	\$79.50
06/23/2017	Telephone call with courtroom deputy re: cancellation of 6/27 hearing (.1); Review amended agenda (.2).	ZD05	00269	HAC	0.30	\$166.50
	Sub-Total For Task: ZD05 Case Administration				1.80	\$680.00
06/14/2017	Drafting Serri stay on bonus agreement (1.4); Telephone call with R. Zackin re: structure of agreement (.1); Telephone call with V. Serri re: same (.1).	ZD07	00269	HAC	1.60	\$888.00
06/14/2017	Confer with H. Cohen re Serri release agreement.	ZD07	00113	RSZ	0.20	\$118.00
06/14/2017	Drafting re Serri release agreement.	ZD07	00113	RSZ	1.30	\$767.00
06/14/2017	Conf. call with Vic Serri and H. Cohen re release agreement.	ZD07	00113	RSZ	0.20	\$118.00
06/19/2017	Review lender comments to Serri bonus agreement (.4); Revise same (.3).	ZD07	00269	HAC	0.70	\$388.50
06/19/2017	Review lenders' comments re Serri release agreement(.1); revise release agreement (.2).	ZD07	00113	RSZ	0.30	\$177.00
06/19/2017	Call with H.Cohen re Serri release agreement.	ZD07	00113	RSZ	0.20	\$118.00
06/21/2017	Revising Serri release agreement.	ZD07	00113	RSZ	1.00	\$590.00
06/27/2017	Revising Serri release agreement re ECP's comments.	ZD07	00113	RSZ	0.50	\$295.00
06/27/2017	E-mails with Victor Serri and H.Cohen re release agreement.	ZD07	00113	RSZ	0.20	\$118.00
	Sub-Total For Task: ZD07 Employee Benefits and Pensions				6.20	\$3,577.50
06/02/2017	Draft CNO for KPMG Retention (0.2); prepare CNO for electronic filing (0.1); file and serve same (0.1); review and receipt as-filed copies (0.1); coordinate delivery to chambers (0.1).	ZD08	26059	ER	0.50	\$132.50
06/05/2017	Review and receipt of orders on KPMG retention; email with H. Cohen re: same.	ZD08	26059	ER	0.10	\$26.50
	Sub-Total For Task: ZD08 Employment Applications				0.60	\$159.00
06/06/2017	Draft Gibbons 5th Monthly fee application.	ZD10	26059	ER	0.40	\$106.00

Client/Matter: 114307 93983	Chieftain Sand and Proppant, LLC Chapter 11 Restructuring
---------------------------------------	--

Tran Date	Description Of Services	Task Code	Tkpr	Initials	Hours	Value
06/07/2017	Draft Gibbons 5th Monthly fee application (0.9); prepare for electronic filing (0.2); file and serve same (0.1); review and receipt of as-filed version (0.1).	ZD10	26059	ER	1.30	\$344.50
06/08/2017	Docket deadlines for Gibbons 5th Monthly fee application.	ZD10	26059	ER	0.10	\$26.50
06/12/2017	Draft Certificate of No Objection (CNO) for Gibbons 4th Monthly Fee Application (0.1); prepare CNO for electronic filing (0.1); file and serve same; email with team re: same (0.1).	ZD10	26059	ER	0.30	\$79.50
06/13/2017	Draft Certificate of No Objection (CNO) for DRC 4th Monthly Fee Application (0.1); prepare CNO for electronic filing; file and serve same; email with team re: same (0.1).	ZD10	26059	ER	0.20	\$53.00
06/14/2017	Review and receipt of as-filed Certificate of No Objection for DRC 4th Monthly Fee Application; email with team re: same (0.1).	ZD10	26059	ER	0.10	\$26.50
06/19/2017	Review Eisner third monthly fee application.	ZD10	00269	HAC	0.40	\$222.00
06/19/2017	Prepare EisnerAmper 3rd Monthly Fee Application and associated exhibits and notice for electronic filing (.3); file and serve (.1); review and receipt of as-filed version (.1); emails with team re: same (.1).	ZD10	26059	ER	0.60	\$159.00
06/21/2017	Prepare Certificate of No Objection for TPH Final Fee Application for electronic filing (0.1); file and serve (0.1); review and receipt of filed copy (0.1); prepare for and coordinate submission of CNO binder to chambers (0.1); confer with chambers re: same; conferrals and emails with team re: same (0.1).	ZD10	26059	ER	0.50	\$132.50
06/27/2017	Prepare Donlin Recano 5th Monthly Fee Application for electronic filing (0.1); file and serve same (0.1); review and receipt of as-filed versions of same (0.1).	ZD10	26059	ER	0.30	\$79.50
06/27/2017	Draft Notice for Donlin Recano 5th Monthly Fee Application.	ZD10	26059	ER	0.10	\$26.50
06/29/2017	Draft Certificate of No Objection for Gibbons 5th Monthly Fee Application (0.1); prepare for electronic filing; file and serve same (0.1); review and receipt of as-filed version of same (0.1).	ZD10	26059	ER	0.30	\$79.50
	Sub-Total For Task: ZD10 Fee Applications				4.60	\$1,335.00
06/13/2017	Telephone call with S. Hofkes re: MOR status.	ZD38	00269	HAC	0.20	\$111.00
06/14/2017	Telephone call with S. Hofkes re: update on April MOR.	ZD38	00269	HAC	0.20	\$111.00
	Sub-Total For Task: ZD38 Reporting				0.40	\$222.00
06/06/2017	Review Caldwell Baker objection and related declaration.	ZD43	00269	HAC	4.40	\$2,442.00
06/07/2017	Review amended Caldwell Baker Motion (2.1); Telephone call with V. Serri re: same (.8); Telephone call with E. Kosmowski re: same (.8); Review lease agreement related to motion (.5).	ZD43	00269	HAC	4.20	\$2,331.00
06/08/2017	Confer with H. Cohen re: legal issues on Caldwell Baker claim (.2); review pleadings and conduct legal research re: same (1.1).	ZD43	30382	BT	1.30	\$552.50
06/09/2017	Review pleadings and conduct legal research re: legal issues on Caldwell Baker claim.	ZD43	30382	BT	1.70	\$722.50
06/12/2017	Telephone call with V. Serri re: Caldwell Baker facts.	ZD43	00269	HAC	0.50	\$277.50
06/12/2017	Telephone call with V. Serri re: status of timing on Caldwell Baker hearing.	ZD43	00269	HAC	0.20	\$111.00

Time Detail
Run Date: 7/13/2017

Client/Matter: 114307 93983	Chieftain Sand and Proppant, LLC Chapter 11 Restructuring
---------------------------------------	--

Tran Date	Description Of Services	Task Code	Tkpr	Initials	Hours	Value
06/12/2017	Telephone call with E. Kosmowski re: hearing status on Caldwell Baker motion.	ZD43	00269	HAC	0.20	\$111.00
06/12/2017	Conduct legal research in opposition to Caldwell Baker claim (4.6); confer with H. Cohen and C. Viceconte re: same (.2).	ZD43	30382	BT	4.80	\$2,040.00
06/12/2017	Telephone conference with client V. Serri and H. Cohen regarding factual background and strategy considerations in connection with claim by Caldwell-Baker (.3); conferences with H. Cohen in preparation for telephone conference with client regarding p rocedural and substantive strategy considerations (.5).	ZD43	00247	CV	0.80	\$424.00
06/13/2017	Telephone call with E. Kosmowski re: trial dates for Caldwell Baker dispute.	ZD43	00269	HAC	0.10	\$55.50
06/14/2017	Telephone call with A. Reilly re: update on Caldwell Baker motion.	ZD43	00269	HAC	0.30	\$166.50
06/16/2017	Telephone call with V. Serri re: discovery matters pertaining to Caldwell Baker motion.	ZD43	00269	HAC	0.20	\$111.00
06/19/2017	Telephone call with E. Kosmowski re: hearing status on Caldwell motion.	ZD43	00269	HAC	0.10	\$55.50
06/19/2017	Telephone call with S. Bannister re: Third Party discovery matters in Caldwell dispute.	ZD43	00269	HAC	0.50	\$277.50
06/19/2017	Telephone call with V. Serri re: hearing matters related to Caldwell Baker dispute.	ZD43	00269	HAC	0.30	\$166.50
06/19/2017	Telephone conference with S. Banister, in-house counsel at IANR, regarding factual background of matter and potential deposition of IANR representative in connection with upcoming hearing on claim by Caldwell-Baker.	ZD43	00247	CV	0.40	\$212.00
06/19/2017	Telephone conference with V. Serri and H. Cohen regarding strategy considerations for information to be obtained from IANR in connection with upcoming hearing on claim by Caldwell-Baker.	ZD43	00247	CV	0.10	\$53.00
06/20/2017	Telephone call with E. Kosmowski re: discovery schedule on Caldwell Baker motion.	ZD43	00269	HAC	0.20	\$111.00
06/20/2017	Telephone call with V. Serri re: potential discovery schedule.	ZD43	00269	HAC	0.20	\$111.00
06/20/2017	Review and analyze email communications provided by A. Homan at IANR regarding CIT cars and regarding issues relating to Caldwell-Baker cars at IANR from 2016 and 2017 time frame in connection with upcoming hearing on Caldwell-Baker claim under lease agreement.	ZD43	00247	CV	1.20	\$636.00
06/23/2017	Analyzing documents to be produced to Caldwell Baker in connection with administrative expense claim motion/litigation.	ZD43	00269	HAC	3.60	\$1,998.00
06/23/2017	Telephone call with V. Serri re: status of discovery matters in Caldwell Baker dispute.	ZD43	00269	HAC	0.40	\$222.00
06/23/2017	Further review and analyze email communications between and among Caldwell-Baker, IANR and Chieftain regarding claim under CBC rail car lease (1.0); further outline issues for upcoming depositions of G. Baker and IANR representative and Court hearing regarding CBC's claim (.5).	ZD43	00247	CV	1.50	\$795.00
06/26/2017	Telephone call with T. Jones re: research topics for Caldwell Baker dispute.	ZD43	00269	HAC	0.50	\$277.50
06/26/2017	Telephone call with V. Serri re: status of discovery in Caldwell Baker dispute.	ZD43	00269	HAC	0.30	\$166.50
06/26/2017	Strategizing with C. Viceconte re: discovery matters and key litigation topics.	ZD43	00269	HAC	1.10	\$610.50
06/26/2017	Telephone conference with H. Cohen regarding research on Caldwell Baker claim.	ZD43	30496	TBJ	0.60	\$177.00
06/26/2017	Reviewing relevant filings and contract documents in support of research on Caldwell Baker claim.	ZD43	30496	TBJ	1.30	\$383.50
06/26/2017	Telephone conference with V. Serri and H. Cohen (.2); conference with H. Cohen regarding further strategy considerations relating to Caldwell-Baker dispute (.3).	ZD43	00247	CV	0.50	\$265.00
06/27/2017	Telephone call with V. Serri re: scope of discovery.	ZD43	00269	HAC	0.20	\$111.00

Time Detail
Run Date: 7/13/2017

Client/Matter: 114307 93983	Chieftain Sand and Proppant, LLC Chapter 11 Restructuring
---------------------------------------	--

Tran Date	Description Of Services	Task Code	Tkpr	Initials	Hours	Value
06/27/2017	Begin to prepare timeline of key events and outline of themes and topics for upcoming depositions of G. Baker of Caldwell-Baker (.3); begin to prepare timeline of key events and outline of themes and topics for upcoming deposition A. Homan of IANR (. 3); and review and analyze relevant documents in connection with the depositions (.4).	ZD43	00247	CV	1.00	\$530.00
06/28/2017	Telephone call with E. Kosmowski re: discovery schedule.	ZD43	00269	HAC	0.40	\$222.00
06/30/2017	Drafting Caldwell Baker discovery reuqets.	ZD43	00269	HAC	3.90	\$2,164.50
06/30/2017	Research regarding mitigation of damages, breach of good faith and related contract claims.	ZD43	30496	TBJ	1.90	\$560.50
06/30/2017	Further review and analyze Caldwell-Baker's amended motion for allowance of claim under Railcar Lease Agreement (1.0); review and analyze Lease Agreement and Amendment and Sworn Statement of G. Baker (1.0); outline key points and provisions of the sa me in anticipation of review of relevant emails and upcoming depositions of G. Baker and IANR representative (.5).	ZD43	00247	CV	2.50	\$1,325.00
	Sub-Total For Task: ZD43 Executory Contracts				41.40	\$20,775.00
06/10/2017	review and analyze the following in connection with upcoming hearing regarding same: Caldwell-Baker's Amended Motion for Allowance and Immediate Payment of Administrative Expense Claims (.5); subject Lease re: same (.5); sworn statement of G. Baker (.5); Debtor's objection to Caldwell-Baker's initial motion for allowance (.5); Debtor's motion to reject Caldwell-Baker lease (.5); and Caldwell-Baker's objection to Debtor's motion to reject lease (.5).	ZD46	00247	CV	3.00	\$1,590.00
	Sub-Total For Task: ZD46 Other Motion Practice				3.00	\$1,590.00
06/01/2017	Telephone call with V. Serri re: ECP plan comments.	ZD48	00269	HAC	0.30	\$166.50
06/05/2017	Telephone call with V. Serri re: plan comments.	ZD48	00269	HAC	0.20	\$111.00
06/13/2017	Telephone call with V. Serri re: exit status/strategies.	ZD48	00269	HAC	0.20	\$111.00
06/13/2017	Telephone call with A. Reilly re: UST plan comments.	ZD48	00269	HAC	0.30	\$166.50
06/14/2017	Telephone call with V. Serri re: update on plan discussions.	ZD48	00269	HAC	0.30	\$166.50
	Sub-Total For Task: ZD48 Plan of Reorganization				1.30	\$721.50
06/05/2017	Email to J. Holland regarding acknowledgement letter from Progressive Rail.	ZD50	00159	LAG	0.10	\$65.50
06/05/2017	Exchange emails with S. Hofkes regarding closing flow of funds.	ZD50	00159	LAG	0.20	\$131.00
06/05/2017	Chieftan working group status conference call.	ZD50	00159	LAG	0.50	\$327.50
06/05/2017	Conference with H. Cohen regarding entity dissolution matters and review of Delaware LLC Act and Wisconsin LLC Act.	ZD50	00159	LAG	0.70	\$458.50
06/08/2017	Email to J. Gray regarding letter of credit release.	ZD50	00159	LAG	0.10	\$65.50
06/13/2017	Review of email correspondence regarding disposition of Barron County letter of credit (.2); exchange of correspondence with J. Gray, Esq. regarding letter of credit (.2).	ZD50	00159	LAG	0.40	\$262.00
06/14/2017	Review of continuing on-going exchanges of emails regarding status of Wells Fargo letter of credit in favor of Barron County.	ZD50	00159	LAG	0.30	\$196.50
06/15/2017	Review COBRA coverage issues per exchange of emails with V. Serri.	ZD50	00159	LAG	0.20	\$131.00
06/15/2017	Emails to V. Serri and J. Holland regarding COBRA matters.	ZD50	00159	LAG	0.40	\$262.00
	Sub-Total For Task: ZD50 Sale Motion/363 Sales				2.90	\$1,899.50
	Total For Matter: 93983 Chapter 11 Restructuring				62.40	\$31,012.50

Totals For Client:

62.40 \$31,012.50