

# **EXHIBIT A**

Time Detail  
Run Date: 8/10/2017

<b>Client/Matter:</b> 114307 93983	<b>Chieftain Sand and Proppant, LLC Chapter 11 Restructuring</b>
---------------------------------------	--

Tran Date	Description Of Services	Task Code	Tkpr	Initials	Hours	Value
07/05/2017	Prepare May Monthly Operating Report for electronic filing (0.1); email with H. Cohen re: same (0.1).	ZD04	26059	ER	0.20	\$53.00
07/07/2017	Prepare combined Plan and Disclosure Statement for electronic filing (.1); file and serve same; review and receipt of as-filed version of same (.1); email with J. coehn re: same (.1).	ZD04	26059	ER	0.30	\$79.50
07/28/2017	Prepare 2nd Quarter Ordinary Course Professionals Statement for electronic filing; file and serve; review and receipt of as-filed version; email with H. Cohen re: same.	ZD04	26059	ER	0.10	\$26.50
	<b>Sub-Total For Task: ZD04 Business Operations</b>				<b>0.60</b>	<b>\$159.00</b>
07/24/2017	Telephone call with V. Serri re: matters pertaining to omnibus hearing today.	ZD05	00269	HAC	0.20	\$111.00
	<b>Sub-Total For Task: ZD05 Case Administration</b>				<b>0.20</b>	<b>\$111.00</b>
07/05/2017	Emails and telephone call to coordinate court reporters for Kansas and Iowa depositions (0.2); communication with H. Cohen re: same (0.1).	ZD06	26059	ER	0.30	\$79.50
07/10/2017	Telephone calls with M. Schein related to CIT claim (.4); Follow up research re: same (.8).	ZD06	00269	HAC	1.20	\$666.00
07/26/2017	Prepare Certificate of Counsel with exhibits re: CIT Stipulation for electronic filing; file and serve same (0.1); review and receipt of as-filed version; prepare for submission to chambers (0.1); review and receipt of filed order (0.1); emails with team re: same. (0.1).	ZD06	26059	ER	0.40	\$106.00
	<b>Sub-Total For Task: ZD06 Claims Administration and Objections</b>				<b>1.90</b>	<b>\$851.50</b>
07/11/2017	Draft 6th Monthly Fee Application and Notice.	ZD10	26059	ER	1.00	\$265.00
07/12/2017	Draft Gibbons 6th Monthly Fee Application and Notice.	ZD10	26059	ER	0.90	\$238.50
07/12/2017	Draft Gibbons 2nd Interim Fee Application.	ZD10	26059	ER	0.30	\$79.50
07/12/2017	Email with Donlin Recano and EisnerAmper re: June monthly fee applications and 2nd Interim applications.	ZD10	26059	ER	0.10	\$26.50
07/13/2017	Draft Gibbons 2nd Interim Fee Application.	ZD10	26059	ER	1.20	\$318.00
07/13/2017	Draft DRC 2nd Interim Fee Application (1.0); prepare exhibit (0.2).	ZD10	26059	ER	1.20	\$318.00
07/13/2017	Draft Gibbons 6th Monthly Fee Application (0.2); Prepare same for electronic filing (0.1); file and serve (0.1); docket deadlines re: same; confer and emails with team re: same (0.1).	ZD10	26059	ER	0.50	\$132.50
07/13/2017	Emails with Donlin Recano re: June monthly fee applications; draft Notice for Donlin Recano 6th Monthly Fee Application (0.1); prepare fee application for electronic filing (0.1); file and serve same; docket deadlines re: same; emails with team re: same (0.1).	ZD10	26059	ER	0.30	\$79.50
07/14/2017	Draft DRC 2nd Interim Fee Application (0.4); emails with H. Cohen and DRC re: same (0.1).	ZD10	26059	ER	0.50	\$132.50

**Gibbons P.C.**Time Detail  
Run Date: 8/10/2017

<b>Client/Matter:</b> 114307 93983	<b>Chieftain Sand and Proppant, LLC Chapter 11 Restructuring</b>
---------------------------------------	--

Tran Date	Description Of Services	Task Code	Tkpr	Initials	Hours	Value
07/17/2017	Draft portions of Donlin Recano 2nd interim fee application; email with Donlin Recano re: same.	ZD10	26059	ER	0.10	\$26.50
07/18/2017	Draft portions of Gibbons 2nd Interim Fee Application.	ZD10	26059	ER	0.40	\$106.00
07/19/2017	Draft portions of Gibbons 2nd Interim Fee Application; email with H. Cohen re: same.	ZD10	26059	ER	0.20	\$53.00
07/20/2017	Draft 2nd Interim Fee Application for EisnerAmper (0.9); prepare exhibit for same (0.2); emails with H. Cohen and EisnerAmper re: same (0.1); confer with chambers regarding hearing date; docket hearing (0.1).	ZD10	26059	ER	1.30	\$344.50
07/20/2017	Draft CNO for 3rd Monthly Fee Application for EisnerAmper (0.1); prepare same for electronic filing; file and serve same (0.1); review and receipt of as-filed copy; email and confer with H. Cohen and noticing agent re: same (0.1).	ZD10	26059	ER	0.30	\$79.50
07/20/2017	Emails with EisnerAmper re: June fee application.	ZD10	26059	ER	0.10	\$26.50
07/21/2017	Draft Notice of 2nd Interims; email to H. Cohen re: same.	ZD10	26059	ER	0.10	\$26.50
07/21/2017	Confer with team and chambers re: procedures for Disclosure Statement Motion proposed order; docket confirmation hearing.	ZD10	26059	ER	0.10	\$26.50
07/24/2017	Prepare 2nd Interims for electronic filing (0.2); file and serve (0.2); confer with H. Cohen re: same; review and receipt of as-filed versions (0.2); email with noticing agent re: service of same; docket deadlines (0.1).	ZD10	26059	ER	0.70	\$185.50
	<b>Sub-Total For Task: ZD10 Fee Applications</b>				<b>9.30</b>	<b>\$2,464.50</b>
07/28/2017	Multiple communications with client re: matters pertaining to tax filings.	ZD22	00269	HAC	0.60	\$333.00
	<b>Sub-Total For Task: ZD22 Tax Issues</b>				<b>0.60</b>	<b>\$333.00</b>
07/18/2017	Draft Agenda for 7/24 hearing; emails and confer with H. Cohen re: same.	ZD25	26059	ER	0.40	\$106.00
07/19/2017	Conferrals with team re: preparation of additional binder for submission to chambers.	ZD25	26059	ER	0.10	\$26.50
07/19/2017	Prepare Agenda for 7/24 hearing for electronic filing; file and serve same; email with H. Cohen re: same.	ZD25	26059	ER	0.10	\$26.50
07/21/2017	Draft Notice of Agenda for Disclosure Statement Motion (0.3); confer and email with H. Cohen re: same. (0.1)	ZD25	26059	ER	0.40	\$106.00
07/24/2017	Prepare for (2.2) and attend hearing related to CB motion (1.1).	ZD25	00269	HAC	3.30	\$1,831.50
	<b>Sub-Total For Task: ZD25 Court Hearings</b>				<b>4.30</b>	<b>\$2,096.50</b>
07/05/2017	Reviewing May MOR.	ZD38	00269	HAC	0.60	\$333.00
07/07/2017	Review June MOR.	ZD38	00269	HAC	0.70	\$388.50
07/28/2017	Finalize second quarter OCP report.	ZD38	00269	HAC	1.10	\$610.50
07/31/2017	Review emails related to audit matters (.7); telephone calls with V. Serri re: same (.5).	ZD38	00269	HAC	1.20	\$666.00
	<b>Sub-Total For Task: ZD38 Reporting</b>				<b>3.60</b>	<b>\$1,998.00</b>

<b>Client/Matter:</b> 114307 93983	<b>Chieftain Sand and Proppant, LLC Chapter 11 Restructuring</b>
---------------------------------------	--

Tran Date	Description Of Services	Task Code	Tkpr	Initials	Hours	Value
07/03/2017	Outline key points of motion papers in anticipation of upcoming depositions of G. Baker and IANR representative.	ZD43	00247	CV	2.00	\$1,060.00
07/05/2017	Telephone call with Special Committee to discuss filing of plan.	ZD43	00269	HAC	0.50	\$277.50
07/05/2017	Telephone call with E. Kosmowski to discuss production logistics.	ZD43	00269	HAC	0.10	\$55.50
07/05/2017	Reviewing Debtors' document production.	ZD43	00269	HAC	2.90	\$1,609.50
07/05/2017	Legal Research regarding contract claims.	ZD43	30496	TBJ	6.60	\$1,947.00
07/05/2017	Communicate with H. Cohen regarding options for processing and producing emails.	ZD43	15969	JVI	0.20	\$44.00
07/05/2017	Confer with H. Cohen regarding document production and deposition issues relating to Caldwell-Baker dispute.	ZD43	00247	CV	0.20	\$106.00
07/06/2017	Finalizing document production review.	ZD43	00269	HAC	5.60	\$3,108.00
07/06/2017	Reviewing supplemental research related to Caldwell Baker objection.	ZD43	00269	HAC	2.10	\$1,165.50
07/06/2017	Legal Research regarding contract claims.	ZD43	30496	TBJ	3.40	\$1,003.00
07/06/2017	Docket Kansas and Iowa depositions.	ZD43	26059	ER	0.10	\$26.50
07/06/2017	Confer with H. Cohen re: upcoming depositions; emails with court reporter re: same.	ZD43	26059	ER	0.10	\$26.50
07/06/2017	Process email data for conversion to a searchable format for production, per H. Cohen.	ZD43	15969	JVI	1.40	\$308.00
07/07/2017	Drafting supplemental Caldwell Baker objection.	ZD43	00269	HAC	6.20	\$3,441.00
07/07/2017	Process email data for conversion to a searchable format and prepare for production, per H. Cohen.	ZD43	15969	JVI	2.00	\$440.00
07/09/2017	Strategize regarding potential revisions and supplements to objection to Administrative claims.	ZD43	00247	CV	0.60	\$318.00
07/10/2017	Emails with court reporter and confer with team re deposition logistics.	ZD43	26059	ER	0.10	\$26.50
07/10/2017	Initial review of documents produced by Caldwell-Baker and by Chieftain in preparation for upcoming depositions of G. Baker of Caldwell-Baker and A. Homan of Iowa Northern Railway Company and upcoming administrative claim hearing (1.5); further outline areas to be addressed at depositions and hearing (1.0).	ZD43	00247	CV	2.50	\$1,325.00
07/11/2017	Emails with court reporter re deposition logistics.	ZD43	26059	ER	0.10	\$26.50
07/11/2017	Identify key produced emails for potential use at upcoming depositions of G. Baker of Caldwell-Baker and A. Homan of Iowa Northern Railway Company.	ZD43	00247	CV	5.00	\$2,650.00
07/12/2017	Review second batch of client emails for production to Caldwell Baker.	ZD43	00269	HAC	2.90	\$1,609.50
07/12/2017	Prepare document production according to specifications provided by H. Cohen.	ZD43	15969	JVI	1.50	\$330.00
07/12/2017	Review and analyze attachments to emails produced by Caldwell-Baker to further identify and compile key documents from documents produced by Chieftain and Caldwell-Baker (3.0); Create chronology and exhibits for potential use at upcoming depositions of G. Baker of Caldwell-Baker and A. Homan of Iowa Northern Railway Company and Court Hearing (2.5); further review internal case memoranda and strategize regarding themes, topics and areas of inquiry for depositions (1.0).	ZD43	00247	CV	6.50	\$3,445.00
07/13/2017	Analyzing supplemental document production related to Caldwell Baker dispute.	ZD43	00269	HAC	2.80	\$1,554.00
07/13/2017	Emails with team and court reporter re: confirmation of tomorrow's deposition.	ZD43	26059	ER	0.10	\$26.50

Time Detail  
Run Date: 8/10/2017

**Client/Matter:** 114307 Chieftain Sand and Proppant, LLC  
93983 Chapter 11 Restructuring

Tran Date	Description Of Services	Task Code	Tkpr	Initials	Hours	Value
07/13/2017	Prepare document production according to specifications provided by H. Cohen.	ZD43	15969	JV1	1.00	\$220.00
07/13/2017	Travel from Wilmington, Delaware to Kansas City, Missouri and then to Olathe, Kansas in order to take deposition of G. Baker of Caldwell-Baker in Gardener, Kansas, in connection with upcoming hearing on administrative expense claim.	ZD43	00247	CV	4.00	\$1,060.00
07/13/2017	Further outline topics and areas of inquiry in preparation for upcoming depositions of G. Baker of Caldwell-Baker and A. Homan of Iowa Northern Railway Company in light of the chronology of key emails produced by Caldwell-Baker.	ZD43	00247	CV	3.00	\$1,590.00
07/14/2017	Attend Grant Baker deposition telephonically.	ZD43	00269	HAC	6.10	\$3,385.50
07/14/2017	Telephone call with V. Serri re: summary of Grant Baker deposition.	ZD43	00269	HAC	0.30	\$166.50
07/14/2017	Revising opposition brief based on information from Grant Baker deposition.	ZD43	00269	HAC	1.70	\$943.50
07/14/2017	Emails with team and court reporter re: confirmation of Monday's deposition.	ZD43	26059	ER	0.10	\$26.50
07/14/2017	Attend and conduct deposition of G. Baker of Caldwell-Baker in Gardener, Kansas, in anticipation of hearing on administrative claim for alleged payments due under railcar lease.	ZD43	00247	CV	6.50	\$3,445.00
07/14/2017	Travel from Gardener, Kansas, to Kansas City Airport for travel to Wilmington, Delaware (flight cancelled).	ZD43	00247	CV	1.50	\$397.50
07/15/2017	Travel from Kansas City, Missouri to Cedar Rapids, Iowa in order to take deposition of A. Homan of Iowa Northern Railway Company.	ZD43	00247	CV	4.50	\$1,192.50
07/15/2017	Further prepare outline of topics and areas of inquiry, including those based on deposition testimony of G. Baker of Caldwell-Baker, for upcoming deposition of A. Homan of Iowa Northern Railway Company.	ZD43	00247	CV	1.20	\$636.00
07/16/2017	Review and analyze case law regarding issue of whether holdover rent provision of Caldwell Baker railcar lease agreement may be deemed an unenforceable penalty (1.0); prepare internal memorandum to H. Cohen and B. Jones regarding analysis of cases (. 2).	ZD43	00247	CV	1.20	\$636.00
07/16/2017	Communications with H. Cohen regarding strategy considerations for upcoming deposition of A. Homan of Iowa Northern Railway Company.	ZD43	00247	CV	0.30	\$159.00
07/16/2017	Further prepare outline of topics and areas of inquiry for A. Homan deposition (.5); further compile potential exhibits for use at upcoming deposition of A. Homan of Iowa Northern Railway Company (.5).	ZD43	00247	CV	1.00	\$530.00
07/17/2017	Attend Amy Homan deposition.	ZD43	00269	HAC	6.10	\$3,385.50
07/17/2017	Research in opposition to Caldwell Baker lease claims.	ZD43	30496	TBJ	1.10	\$324.50
07/17/2017	Review and receipt of Baker transcript formats and exhibits (0.1); emails with court reporter and team re: same (0.1).	ZD43	26059	ER	0.20	\$53.00
07/17/2017	Prepare document production according to specifications provided by H. Cohen.	ZD43	15969	JV1	3.10	\$682.00
07/17/2017	Attend and conduct deposition of A. Homan of Iowa Northern Railway Company in Cedar Rapids, Iowa.	ZD43	00247	CV	6.50	\$3,445.00
07/17/2017	Email communications and telephone conferences with V. Serri and H. Cohen regarding strategy considerations in the course of and following the deposition of A. Homan of Iowa Northern Railway Company.	ZD43	00247	CV	0.40	\$212.00
07/18/2017	Telephone call with E. Kosmowski re: trial logistics.	ZD43	00269	HAC	0.40	\$222.00
07/18/2017	Revising Caldwell Baker objection.	ZD43	00269	HAC	1.80	\$999.00
07/18/2017	Review and receipt of Homan transcript formats and exhibits (.1); emails with court reporter and team re: same (.1).	ZD43	26059	ER	0.20	\$53.00

<b>Client/Matter:</b> 114307 93983	<b>Chieftain Sand and Proppant, LLC Chapter 11 Restructuring</b>
---------------------------------------	--

Tran Date	Description Of Services	Task Code	Tkpr	Initials	Hours	Value
07/18/2017	Create attorney reference binders in preparation for hearing.	ZD43	26059	ER	1.30	\$344.50
07/18/2017	Create agenda binder for submission to chambers (.9); conferral with team re: same (.1).	ZD43	26059	ER	1.00	\$265.00
07/18/2017	Prepare document production according to specifications provided by H. Cohen.	ZD43	15969	JV1	2.50	\$550.00
07/18/2017	Strategize regarding proposed revisions and supplements to the objection to Administrative Claim based on deposition testimony of G. Baker and A. Homan.	ZD43	00247	CV	1.00	\$530.00
07/19/2017	Preparing for Caldwell Baker trial.	ZD43	00269	HAC	6.10	\$3,385.50
07/19/2017	Telephone call with A Reilly re: status of Caldwell dispute.	ZD43	00269	HAC	0.30	\$166.50
07/19/2017	Telephone call with E. Kosmowski re: trial and settlement matters.	ZD43	00269	HAC	0.60	\$333.00
07/19/2017	Prepare Objection, depositions, and exhibits for electronic filing (0.3); file and serve same (0.2); review and receipt of as-filed copies of same (0.2); email and confer with team and noticing agent re: same (0.2).	ZD43	26059	ER	0.90	\$238.50
07/19/2017	Prepare document production according to specifications provided by H. Cohen.	ZD43	15969	JV1	1.50	\$330.00
07/19/2017	Prepare proposed revisions and supplements to Objection to Caldwell Baker's Amended Motion for Administrative Claim Expense (2.0); confer with H. Cohen regarding related strategy considerations (.5).	ZD43	00247	CV	2.50	\$1,325.00
07/19/2017	Identify portions of Homan testimony to be read into record at July 24, 2017 hearing regarding Caldwell Baker's administrative claim.	ZD43	00247	CV	1.50	\$795.00
07/19/2017	Conference with H. Cohen regarding outline and strategy considerations for anticipated testimony of V. Serri of Chieftain at July 24, 2017 hearing regarding Caldwell Baker's administrative claim.	ZD43	00247	CV	0.50	\$265.00
07/19/2017	Review exhibits marked at depositions of G. Baker and A. Homan, along with other pertinent case records, in connection with anticipated designation of joint exhibits for use at July 24, 2017 hearing regarding Caldwell Baker's administrative claim.	ZD43	00247	CV	0.50	\$265.00
07/20/2017	Research recent Kansas lawsuit filings by Caldwell-Baker Co.	ZD43	40028	CH	0.50	\$100.00
07/20/2017	Prepare document production according to specifications provided by H. Cohen.	ZD43	15969	JV1	3.00	\$660.00
07/20/2017	Review and analyze potential terms of settlement among Debtors, Caldwell Baker Company, and Iowa Northern Railway Company, including draft Stipulation of potential settlement (.5); multiple conferences with H. Cohen and V. Serri regarding the same (.5).	ZD43	00247	CV	1.00	\$530.00
07/21/2017	Review and analyze and prepare further revisions to, and review and execute final version of, settlement stipulation among Chieftain, Caldwell Baker and Iowa Northern Railway Company regarding Caldwell-Baker's administrative claim (1.0); multiple communications and telephone calls with involved counsel and H. Cohen regarding the same (.7).	ZD43	00247	CV	1.70	\$901.00
07/24/2017	Review form of CIT deposit stipulation.	ZD43	00269	HAC	2.30	\$1,276.50
	<b>Sub-Total For Task:</b>	<b>ZD43</b>			<b>136.40</b>	<b>\$61,953.50</b>
07/06/2017	Finalizing plan and related materials.	ZD48	00269	HAC	1.40	\$777.00
07/06/2017	Prepare Debtors Motion for Approval of Combined Plan and Disclosure Statement with exhibits for electronic filing (0.3); file and serve same (0.2); review and receipt of filed copy of same (0.1); communications with H. Cohen re: same (0.1).	ZD48	26059	ER	0.70	\$185.50

Time Detail  
Run Date: 8/10/2017

<b>Client/Matter:</b> 114307 93983	<b>Chieftain Sand and Proppant, LLC</b> <b>Chapter 11 Restructuring</b>
---------------------------------------	--

Tran Date	Description Of Services	Task Code	Tkpr	Initials	Hours	Value
07/06/2017	Prepare Debtors Combined Plan and Disclosure Statement for electronic filing; file and serve same (0.1); review and receipt of filed copy of same (0.1); email with H. Cohen re: same (0.1).	ZD48	26059	ER	0.30	\$79.50
07/07/2017	Draft Notice of Disclosure Statement and Solicitation Motion; prepare same for electronic filing; file and serve same (0.2); review and receipt of filed copy of same; emails with H. Cohen re: same (0.1).	ZD48	26059	ER	0.30	\$79.50
07/07/2017	Docket deadlines re: Disclosure Statement and Solicitation Motion.	ZD48	26059	ER	0.10	\$26.50
07/21/2017	Draft Certificate of No Objection for Disclosure Statement Motion (0.1); confer and email with H. Cohen re: same. (0.1)	ZD48	26059	ER	0.20	\$53.00
07/24/2017	Finalizing solicitation documents.	ZD48	00269	HAC	1.30	\$721.50
07/24/2017	Prepare Certificate of No Objection for Disclosure Statement for electronic filing (0.5); confer and email with H. Cohen re: same. (0.1)	ZD48	26059	ER	0.60	\$159.00
07/25/2017	Finalize solicitation plan with Donlin Recano.	ZD48	00269	HAC	1.30	\$721.50
07/25/2017	Prepare Certificate of No Objection for Disclosure Statement with exhibits for electronic filing (0.1); file and serve same (0.1); email and confer with team re: same. (0.1); prepare for submission to chambers (0.2).	ZD48	26059	ER	0.50	\$132.50
07/25/2017	Draft Notice of Agenda Cancelling Hearing (0.1); prepare same for electronic filing; file and serve same (0.1); email and confer with team re: same; email noticing agent re: same; telephone call with courtroom deputy re permission to cancel hearing ( 0.1).	ZD48	26059	ER	0.30	\$79.50
07/26/2017	Telephone call with A. Reilly re: status of plan matters (.2); Final communications with Donlin re: service and solicitation matters related to plan.	ZD48	00269	HAC	1.40	\$777.00
07/27/2017	Prepare Notice of Disclosure Statement Preliminary Approval Order for electronic filing; file and serve; review and receipt of as-filed version; email with H. Cohen re: same.	ZD48	26059	ER	0.10	\$26.50
	<b>Sub-Total For Task:</b>	<b>ZD48</b>	<b>Plan of Reorganization</b>		<b>8.50</b>	<b>\$3,818.50</b>
	<b>Total For Matter:</b>	<b>93983</b>	<b>Chapter 11 Restructuring</b>		<b>165.40</b>	<b>\$73,785.50</b>
<b>Totals For Client:</b>					<b>165.40</b>	<b>\$73,785.50</b>