

EXHIBIT A

Gibbons P.C.Time Detail
Run Date: 9/11/2017

Client/Matter: 114307 93983	Chieftain Sand and Proppant, LLC Chapter 11 Restructuring
---------------------------------------	--

Tran Date	Description Of Services	Task Code	Tkpr	Initials	Hours	Value
08/07/2017	Communication with H. Cohen re: monthly operating report.	ZD04	26059	ER	0.10	\$26.50
08/08/2017	Prepare Monthly Operating Report for electronic filing (0.1); file and serve same (0.1).	ZD04	26059	ER	0.20	\$53.00
	Sub-Total For Task: ZD04 Business Operations				0.30	\$79.50
08/07/2017	Telephone call with V. Serri re: case status update.	ZD05	00269	HAC	0.20	\$111.00
08/31/2017	Email V. Serri re: entry of second interim fee order.	ZD05	00269	HAC	0.20	\$111.00
	Sub-Total For Task: ZD05 Case Administration				0.40	\$222.00
08/07/2017	Review analysis of pending secured claims.	ZD06	00269	HAC	0.70	\$388.50
	Sub-Total For Task: ZD06 Claims Administration and Objections				0.70	\$388.50
08/04/2017	Draft Certificates of No Objection to Monthly Fee Applications.	ZD10	26059	ER	0.20	\$53.00
08/08/2017	Review draft July fee application.	ZD10	00269	HAC	2.10	\$1,165.50
08/17/2017	Emails with DRC re: 7th monthly fee application.	ZD10	26059	ER	0.10	\$26.50
08/21/2017	Review second interim fee order.	ZD10	00269	HAC	0.60	\$333.00
08/21/2017	Review Seventh Monthly Fee Application for Gibbons PC.	ZD10	00269	HAC	0.90	\$499.50
08/21/2017	Review Donlin Recano's Seventh Monthly Fee Application.	ZD10	00269	HAC	0.30	\$166.50
08/21/2017	Draft Proposed Order Granting 2nd Interim Fee Applications of Debtors' Professionals with exhibit (0.5); draft Certificate of No Objection regarding same (0.1); prepare same for electronic filing (0.1); file and serve; email team re: same (0.1)	ZD10	26059	ER	0.80	\$212.00
08/21/2017	Coordinate assembly of Fee Application Binder for Second Interims with D. Seward (.1); prepare Certificate of No Objection and Proposed Order for delivery to chambers (.1); email and confer with team re: Fee Application Binder and submission of all t o chambers (.1).	ZD10	26059	ER	0.30	\$79.50
08/21/2017	Draft 7th Monthly Fee Application for Gibbons (0.5); draft Notice for Gibbons Fee Application (0.1); prepare Gibbons Fee Application for electronic filing (0.1); file and serve same (0.1); email with team re: same; review and receipt of as-filed vers ion of same (0.1).	ZD10	26059	ER	0.90	\$238.50
08/21/2017	Draft Notice of Donlin Recano Fee Application (0.1); prepare Donlin Recano Fee Application for electronic filing (0.1); file and serve same; email with team re: same; review and receipt of as-filed version of same (0.1).	ZD10	26059	ER	0.30	\$79.50
08/22/2017	Docket deadlines for 7th Monthly Fee Applications of DRC and Gibbons.	ZD10	26059	ER	0.10	\$26.50
	Sub-Total For Task: ZD10 Fee Applications				6.60	\$2,880.00
08/03/2017	Telephone call with A. Reilly re: third party subpoena matter (.3); telephone call with V. Serri re: same (.3).	ZD14	00269	HAC	0.60	\$333.00
	Sub-Total For Task: ZD14 Litigation				0.60	\$333.00
08/01/2017	Telephone calls with V. Serri re: KPMG reporting matters.	ZD24	00269	HAC	0.30	\$166.50
	Sub-Total For Task: ZD24 Other				0.30	\$166.50
08/07/2017	Review July MOR.	ZD38	00269	HAC	1.20	\$666.00
	Sub-Total For Task: ZD38 Reporting				1.20	\$666.00

Gibbons P.C.Time Detail
Run Date: 9/11/2017

Client/Matter: 114307 93983	Chieftain Sand and Proppant, LLC Chapter 11 Restructuring
---------------------------------------	--

Tran Date	Description Of Services	Task Code	Tkpr	Initials	Hours	Value
07/17/2017	Following the deposition of A. Homan of Iowa Northern Railway Company in Cedar Rapids, Iowa, travel from Cedar Rapids, Iowa to Wilmington, Delaware.	ZD43	00247	CV	5.50	\$1,457.50
	Sub-Total For Task: ZD43 Executory Contracts				5.50	\$1,457.50
08/07/2017	Drafting Second Exclusivity Motion.	ZD48	00269	HAC	3.90	\$2,164.50
08/07/2017	Prepare 2nd Exclusivity Motion for electronic filing (0.1); file and serve same (0.1); review and receipt of as-filed versions of same; email with H. Cohen re: same (0.1) .	ZD48	26059	ER	0.30	\$79.50
08/07/2017	Prepare three Certificates of No Objection to Monthly Fee Applications for electronic filing (0.1); file and serve same (0.1); review and receipt of as-filed versions of same; email with H. Cohen re: same (0.1) .	ZD48	26059	ER	0.30	\$79.50
08/24/2017	Review email from UST re: comments/changes to Plan.	ZD48	00269	HAC	0.60	\$333.00
08/24/2017	Email with A. Reilly re: UST proposed change to plan injunction.	ZD48	00269	HAC	0.20	\$111.00
08/24/2017	Revising confirmation declaration.	ZD48	00269	HAC	2.40	\$1,332.00
08/24/2017	Revising confirmation order.	ZD48	00269	HAC	2.80	\$1,554.00
08/25/2017	Draft causes of action supplement for Plan.	ZD48	00269	HAC	2.80	\$1,554.00
08/28/2017	Telephone call with V. Serri re: confirmation status update.	ZD48	00269	HAC	0.60	\$333.00
08/28/2017	Email to V. Serri re: confirmation declaration.	ZD48	00269	HAC	0.20	\$111.00
08/28/2017	Telephone call with A. Reilly re: status of confirmation declaration and order (.3); Email to A Reilly re: same (.1).	ZD48	00269	HAC	0.40	\$222.00
08/29/2017	Drafting notice re: causes of action list (1.1); Review comments from ECP to same (.4); Revise same (.4); Email with A. Reilly re: ECP comments (.2).	ZD48	00269	HAC	2.10	\$1,165.50
08/29/2017	Email UST re: comments to plan injunction.	ZD48	00269	HAC	0.20	\$111.00
	Sub-Total For Task: ZD48 Plan of Reorganization				16.80	\$9,150.00
	Total For Matter: 93983 Chapter 11 Restructuring				32.40	\$15,343.00
Totals For Client:					32.40	\$15,343.00