

Exhibit A



222 Delaware Ave, Ste. 1410
 Wilmington, DE 19801-1621
 (302) 467-4200 *office*
 (302) 467-4201 *fax*
 TAX I.D. #23-1423089

Kim Bridges
 Halt Medical, Inc.
 131 Sand Creek Road
 Brentwood, CA 94513

Invoice Number: 15071539
 Invoice Date: 06/21/2017
 Client Number: 217186
 Matter Number: 560882

Re: Halt Medical, Inc. - Chapter 11 Post-Petition

For professional services rendered through May 31, 2017

Fees

Task Code	B110 Case Administration	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
04/12/17 SK Kortanek	Review DRC case website	0.30	225.00
04/12/17 TL Stoner	Prepare and efile notice of withdrawal re DIP motion, Richards declaration and first day affidavit	0.50	175.00
04/12/17 TL Stoner	Finalize and efile corrected DIP motion, Richards declaration and first day affidavit	1.00	350.00
04/12/17 TL Stoner	Assist P. Jackson with preparing and revising various first day hearing documents	2.00	700.00
04/12/17 TL Stoner	Finalize, efile and coordinate hand delivery to chambers of various first day documents and hearing binders	5.50	1,925.00
04/13/17 SK Kortanek	Review entered DIP and other first day orders	0.50	375.00
04/13/17 PA Jackson	Coordinate service of first-day orders, motions with DRC, Reliable	0.40	226.00
04/13/17 TL Stoner	Review and email to DBR team and co-counsel re various as filed pleadings and signed orders	1.10	385.00
04/13/17 TL Stoner	Assist S. Kortanek and P. Jackson with first day hearing preparations	2.50	875.00
04/14/17 SK Kortanek	Review initial draft of critical dates calendar	0.30	225.00
04/14/17 PA Jackson	Review, finalize, and coordinate filing of notices of entry of orders/second-day hearing; related emails with DRC re: applicable service lists	1.20	678.00
04/14/17 TL Stoner	Finalize and arrange service of first day documents with Reliable	1.00	350.00
04/14/17 TL Stoner	Prepare and email to S. Kortanek and P. Jackson re critical dates calendar	1.30	455.00
04/19/17 TL Stoner	Coordinate with L. Delle Donne at DSBA re 4/21 formation meeting	0.40	140.00

217186 Halt Medical, Inc.
 560882 Halt Medical, Inc. - Chapter 11 Post-Petition
 June 21, 2017

Invoice No. 15071539
 Page 2

Task Code	B110 Case Administration	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
04/20/17 TL Stoner	Review, call and email with Reliable re billing statement inquiry	0.50	175.00
04/21/17 TL Stoner	Review and email to S. Kortanek and P. Jackson re U.S. Trustee's statement that unsecured creditors' committee has not been appointed	0.10	35.00
04/27/17 SK Kortanek	Prepare for call with Debtor management and advisors (0.5); Participate in update conference call with company management (K. Bridges and J. McFadden), with B Eisenbach and M Balistreri (1.0)	1.50	1,125.00
04/27/17 TL Stoner	Review docket sheets and pleadings	0.10	35.00
04/28/17 TL Stoner	Monitor and review docket sheets and pleadings	0.50	175.00
05/01/17 PA Jackson	Review notice of commencement/341 and coordinate filing of same with T. Stoner	0.10	56.50
05/01/17 PA Jackson	Review notice of commencement/341 and coordinate filing of same with T. Stoner	0.10	56.50
05/05/17 PA Jackson	Emails with chambers re: omnibus hearing date scheduling	0.10	56.50
05/05/17 TL Stoner	Review pleadings and update critical dates	1.20	420.00
05/08/17 TL Stoner	Review and email exchange with S. Kortanek and P. Jackson re critical dates	0.30	105.00
05/09/17 TL Stoner	Finalize, efile and coordinate service of OCP and interim compensation motions	1.00	350.00
05/09/17 TL Stoner	Update critical dates	0.20	70.00
05/09/17 TL Stoner	Prepare and email exchange with P. Jackson re OCP Motion package	0.50	175.00
05/09/17 TL Stoner	Email to claims agent re service of OCP and interim compensation motions (.1); Confer with P. Jackson re same (.1)	0.20	70.00
05/09/17 TL Stoner	Prepare and email exchange with P. Jackson re Interim Compensation Motion package	0.40	140.00
05/09/17 TL Stoner	Email exchange with claims agent re service of filed pleadings	0.30	105.00
05/10/17 TL Stoner	Review and email exchange with J. Miceli and claims agent re updated contact information for M. Rainsberger of Halt Investment	0.20	70.00
05/11/17 TL Stoner	Review docket sheets and pleadings	0.10	35.00
05/12/17 TL Stoner	Review draft schedule to disclosure declaration - DBR application	0.10	35.00
05/15/17 TL Stoner	Review and coordinate with P. Jackson and claims agent re service of schedules statements, DBR retention application, DRC retention application, DIP motion and related orders	0.50	175.00

217186 Halt Medical, Inc.
 560882 Halt Medical, Inc. - Chapter 11 Post-Petition
 June 21, 2017

Invoice No. 15071539
 Page 3

<u>Task Code</u>	<u>B110 Case Administration</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
05/17/17 PA Jackson	Emails with DRC re: supplemental service of notices of commencement/sale, with J. McFadden re: upcoming case deadlines	0.20	113.00
05/19/17 SK Kortanek	Review exchange of email correspondence (K Bridges and R Eisenbach) regarding docket update, parties	0.20	150.00
05/19/17 TL Stoner	Scan, efile and coordinate service of declaration and statement of C. Radabaugh on behalf of Radabaugh Law Group	0.40	140.00
05/23/17 SK Kortanek	Emails with T Stoner and P Jackson regarding June 6 hearing agenda and notices, planning	0.30	225.00
05/24/17 J Argentina	Email correspondence with U.S. Trustee's office regarding 341 meeting and DBR retention order.	0.20	90.00
05/25/17 PA Jackson	Coordinate filing of CNOs re: interim comp, OCP motions	0.10	56.50
05/25/17 TL Stoner	Prepare and email exchange with P. Jackson re CNOs to interim compensation and ordinary course professional motions	0.60	210.00
05/25/17 TL Stoner	Finalize, efile and coordinate hand delivery to chambers of certificates of no objection to interim compensation and ordinary course professional motions	0.80	280.00
05/30/17 SK Kortanek	Review interim compensation procedures order	0.30	225.00
05/30/17 TL Stoner	Assist with filing and service of Debtors Motion for Entry of an Order Further Temporarily Suspending Section 345(b) Deposit and Investment Requirements	1.00	350.00
05/30/17 TL Stoner	Prepare, revise and email exchange with P. Jackson re OCP supplemental notice	1.00	350.00
05/30/17 TL Stoner	Review OCP motion and order	0.20	70.00
05/30/17 TL Stoner	Research and email exchange with Reliable re service information for Heritage Bank	0.40	140.00
05/30/17 TL Stoner	Review and email exchange with DBR team and client re interim comp and OCP orders	0.20	70.00
Total B110		31.90	13,018.00
<u>Task Code</u>	<u>B120 Asset Analysis and Recovery</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
04/14/17 TL Stoner	Review, scan and exchange email correspondence with claims agent attaching list of counter parties (.2); Discuss same with P. Jackson (.1)	0.30	105.00
Total B120		0.30	105.00

217186 Halt Medical, Inc.
 560882 Halt Medical, Inc. - Chapter 11 Post-Petition
 June 21, 2017

Invoice No. 15071539
 Page 4

Task Code	B150 Meetings of and Communications with Creditors	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
04/25/17 TL Stoner	Prepare, review, and email exchange with S. Kortanek and P. Jackson re 341 notice	0.80	280.00
04/25/17 TL Stoner	Coordinate with P. Naegle and DSBA re final invoice for organizational meeting	0.30	105.00
05/08/17 PA Jackson	Call from Handal & Marofsky re: unpaid prepetition balance	0.20	113.00
05/17/17 PA Jackson	Emails with B. Eisenbach re: inquiry from print ad vendor	0.10	56.50
Total B150		1.40	554.50

Task Code	B160 Retention of Applicant	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
04/12/17 J Argentina	Draft DBR retention application.	2.40	1,080.00
04/21/17 J Argentina	Correspondence with Donlin Recano regarding their 327 retention application.	0.30	135.00
04/26/17 PA Jackson	Draft DBR retention app; related emails with S. Kortanek re: same	1.60	904.00
04/27/17 J Argentina	Correspondence with T. Stoner and P. Jackson regarding DRC retention application.	0.30	135.00
05/04/17 J Argentina	Draft certification of counsel regarding order approving retention of Cooley firm as special counsel.	0.60	270.00
05/11/17 SK Kortanek	Provide comments on retention application - DBR	0.60	450.00
05/12/17 SK Kortanek	Review order authorizing Cooley retention	0.10	75.00
05/12/17 PA Jackson	Finalize and coordinate filing/service of DBR retention application	0.30	169.50
05/12/17 TL Stoner	Preparation of DBR retention application and associated exhibits	2.00	700.00
05/19/17 SK Kortanek	Exchange email correspondence with R Schepacarter regarding Drinker Biddle retention order, proposed revisions	0.40	300.00
05/24/17 SK Kortanek	Review revised form of Drinker retention order (0.2); Review exchange of emails with R Schepacarter and J Argentina regarding proposed revised form of order, proceeding on Drinker retention application (0.2)	0.40	300.00
05/24/17 J Argentina	Revise DBR retention application and related files to reflect comments by U.S. Trustee.	0.70	315.00
05/30/17 J Argentina	Draft certification of counsel and exhibits for order approving DBR retention.	0.30	135.00
05/30/17 J Argentina	Assign filing and service of certification of counsel and exhibits for order approving DBR retention.	0.10	45.00

217186 Halt Medical, Inc.
 560882 Halt Medical, Inc. - Chapter 11 Post-Petition
 June 21, 2017

Invoice No. 15071539
 Page 6

Task Code	B165 Retention of Others	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
04/24/17 PA Jackson	Revise interim comp, OCP motions	1.10	621.50
04/24/17 PA Jackson	Finalize and coordinate filing/service of Cooley retention app	0.30	169.50
04/24/17 TL Stoner	Finalize, efile and coordinate service of Cooley retention application and declaration re employee comp	0.70	245.00
04/24/17 TL Stoner	Prepare notice and email exchange with P. Jackson re Cooley retention application	0.40	140.00
04/26/17 PA Jackson	Revise interim comp, OCP motions; related emails with client re: same	0.80	452.00
04/27/17 SK Kortanek	Review email exchange with K Bridges and P Jackson re Ordinary Course Professional motion and procedures	0.20	150.00
04/27/17 PA Jackson	Emails with client re: OCP, interim comp motions	0.40	226.00
04/27/17 TL Stoner	Coordinate and email exchange with J. Argentina and P. Jackson re DRC retention application	0.50	175.00
04/28/17 TL Stoner	Research and email exchange with S. Kortanek re previously filed chapter 11 cases re retention declarations	1.20	420.00
05/04/17 SK Kortanek	Email correspondence exchange R Eisenbach and revise U.S. Trustee email correspondence (R Schepacarter) re revisions to order on Cooley retention (0.3); Email exchange with J Argentina re: COC preparation and revised Cooley retention order (0.1)	0.40	300.00
05/04/17 TL Stoner	Prepare and email exchange with P. Jackson and S. Kortanek re CNO to CGI's retention application	0.40	140.00
05/08/17 SK Kortanek	Meet with P Jackson regarding retention applications - Debtor's professionals	0.30	225.00
05/08/17 TL Stoner	Finalize and coordinate hand delivery to chambers of CNO binder re CGI retention application	0.30	105.00
05/09/17 SK Kortanek	Review order approving application to retain Canaccord Genuity as investment banker	0.30	225.00
05/09/17 SK Kortanek	Email correspondence exchange with R Eisenbach and P Jackson regarding revised form or order on Cooley retention, Cert of Counsel to address U.S. Trustee resolution	0.30	225.00
05/09/17 SK Kortanek	Meet with P Jackson re Ordinary Course Professional motion and procedures	0.20	150.00
05/09/17 PA Jackson	Coordinate filing of interim comp, OCP motions	0.40	226.00
05/09/17 TL Stoner	Prepare, finalize and efile COC re Cooley retention application	0.40	140.00
05/10/17 SK Kortanek	Review certification of counsel on Cooley retention	0.20	150.00
05/10/17 TL Stoner	Prepare and submit to chambers COC binder re Cooley retention application	0.50	175.00

217186 Halt Medical, Inc.
 560882 Halt Medical, Inc. - Chapter 11 Post-Petition
 June 21, 2017

Invoice No. 15071539
 Page 7

Task Code	B165 Retention of Others	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
05/11/17 SK Kortanek	Review order authorizing Cooley retention	0.10	75.00
05/11/17 SK Kortanek	Exchange email correspondence with regarding R Schepacarter re: OUST comment to OCP order, and agreement to same; email exchange with P Jackson regarding COC on OCP revision	0.30	225.00
05/12/17 SK Kortanek	Review Donlin retention application	0.40	300.00
05/12/17 PA Jackson	Finalize and coordinate filing/service of DRC 327 retention application	0.30	169.50
05/12/17 TL Stoner	Revise notice re DRC retention application (.2); Email exchange with P. Jackson re same (.1)	0.30	105.00
05/12/17 TL Stoner	Review and email exchange with S. Kortanek, P. Jackson, client and co-counsel re order approving retention of Cooley	0.20	70.00
05/12/17 TL Stoner	Update and email exchange with P. Jackson re DRC 327 retention application	0.60	210.00
05/15/17 SK Kortanek	Exchange email correspondence with K Bridges and B Eisenbach regarding ordinary course professionals (0.2); Exchange email correspondence with OCP Carolyn Radabaugh regarding procedures (0.2)	0.40	300.00
05/16/17 SK Kortanek	Exchange email correspondence with B Eisenbach regarding updated disclosures for Cooley (0.2); Review and comment on proposed supplement (0.3)	0.50	375.00
05/17/17 TL Stoner	Assist S. Kortanek with filing and service of supplemental declaration in support of Cooley's retention application	0.70	245.00
05/19/17 SK Kortanek	Review exchange of email correspondence with OCP Carolyn Radabaugh and P Jackson, with finalized disclosure declaration	0.20	150.00
05/19/17 PA Jackson	Emails with C. Radabaugh re: OCP declaration	0.50	282.50
05/22/17 SK Kortanek	Review docket and critical dates, and assignments P Jackson and T Stoner regarding upcoming CNO/COC deadlines, revisions, for Drinker, OCP, DRC	0.50	375.00
05/25/17 SK Kortanek	Review exchange of email correspondence re OCP Armanino with P Jackson and R Eisenbach	0.30	225.00
05/30/17 J Argentina	Email correspondence with T. Stoner, P. Jackson, and S. Kortanek regarding objections to DRC retention application and related filings.	0.20	90.00
05/30/17 PA Jackson	Emails with T. Stoner re: additional OCP	0.10	56.50
05/31/17 J Argentina	Review and approve Certificate of No Objection related to retention of DRC.	0.20	90.00
05/31/17 J Argentina	Review and approve final Certificate of Counsel and proposed order related to retention of DBR and coordinate filing of same.	0.20	90.00

217186 Halt Medical, Inc.
 560882 Halt Medical, Inc. - Chapter 11 Post-Petition
 June 21, 2017

Invoice No. 15071539
 Page 8

Task Code	B165 Retention of Others	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
05/31/17 TL Stoner	Prepare and email exchange with S. Kortanek and J. Argentina re CNO to Donlin Recano's retention application and COC to DBR's retention application	0.70	245.00
05/31/17 TL Stoner	Finalize and efile re CNO to Donlin Recano's retention application and COC to DBR's retention application	0.40	140.00
Total B165		24.50	12,895.00

Task Code	B190 Other Contested Matters	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
04/27/17 J Argentina	Prepare final DIP Order.	2.40	1,080.00
04/28/17 J Argentina	Prepare final DIP order by incorporating changes from interim order and other conforming edits.	2.30	1,035.00
05/02/17 J Argentina	Draft Certification of Counsel with exhibits related to final DIP order.	0.70	315.00
05/02/17 J Argentina	Email correspondence with S. Kortanek regarding Certification of Counsel with exhibits related to final DIP order.	0.30	135.00
Total B190		5.70	2,565.00

Task Code	B210 Business Operations	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
04/12/17 J Argentina	Revise Motion for Retention of Ordinary Course of Business professionals and related pleadings.	0.70	315.00
04/12/17 J Argentina	Revise motion for payment of interim compensation and related pleadings.	0.50	225.00
04/20/17 PA Jackson	Call with J. McFadden re: impact of first-day orders, operational issues (.7); follow-up emails with J. McFadden, UST re: form UDA and other documents for Heritage Bank (.9)	1.60	904.00
04/20/17 PA Jackson	Emails with client, S. Kortanek re: change to commission program; draft supplemental declaration regarding same and email to S. Kortanek	0.70	395.50
04/21/17 PA Jackson	Emails with R. Schepacarter re: supplemental declaration re: change to commission program	0.10	56.50
04/24/17 PA Jackson	Finalize and coordinate filing/service of supplemental declaration re: change to commissions program	0.10	56.50
04/25/17 PA Jackson	Email to J. McFadden re: invoice question	0.10	56.50
04/27/17 TL Stoner	Assist P. Jackson with finalizing, filing and service of initial monthly operating report	2.00	700.00

217186 Halt Medical, Inc.
 560882 Halt Medical, Inc. - Chapter 11 Post-Petition
 June 21, 2017

Invoice No. 15071539
 Page 9

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Task Code		B210 Business Operations		
04/28/17	SK Kortanek	Email correspondence with K Bridges and B Eisenbach regarding reimbursement improvement opportunity, analysis	0.40	300.00
05/03/17	PA Jackson	Email to J. McFadden re: penalties/late fees issue	0.10	56.50
05/09/17	SK Kortanek	Review correspondence from IRS and R Schepacarter re company tax return filings, and response communications from J McFadden	0.40	300.00
05/20/17	PA Jackson	Email to J. McFadden re: IP attorney	0.10	56.50
05/23/17	TL Stoner	Prepare and email exchange with S. Kortanek and P. Jackson re monthly operating report for filing	0.50	175.00
05/23/17	TL Stoner	Finalize, efile and serve monthly operating report for April 2017	0.40	140.00
05/30/17	SK Kortanek	Meet with P Jackson regarding investment guidelines (0.3); Review motion to further extend section 345 waiver (0.3)	0.60	450.00
05/30/17	PA Jackson	Emails with J. Argentina re: 345 extension motion (.2); review/revise draft of same and coordinate filing/service (.9)	1.10	621.50
Total B210			9.40	4,808.50
			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Task Code		B220 Employee Benefits/Pensions		
04/19/17	SK Kortanek	Call with R Schepacarter regarding proposed modifications to commission sales compensation program	0.60	450.00
04/19/17	SK Kortanek	Call with J McFadden regarding proposed modification to the company's commission sales program (0.3); Prepare draft correspondence to R Schepacarter regarding proposed modification to sales commission compensation program (0.3); Exchange email correspondence with K Bridges and J McFadden regarding draft email to United States Trustee (0.2)	0.80	600.00
04/24/17	SK Kortanek	Email correspondence and call with R Schepacarter regarding sales program and supporting declaration	0.20	150.00
05/17/17	SK Kortanek	Exchange email correspondence with U.S. Dept or Labor regarding ERISA/defined benefit plan inquiry, controlled group question (0.2); exchange email correspondence with B Eisenbach regarding ERISA inquiry (0.2); Review controlled group issue (0.4)	0.80	600.00
Total B220			2.40	1,800.00

217186 Halt Medical, Inc.
 560882 Halt Medical, Inc. - Chapter 11 Post-Petition
 June 21, 2017

Invoice No. 15071539
 Page 10

Task Code	B230 Financing/Cash Collections	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
04/13/17 SK Kortanek	Revisions and review of turn of proposed interim DIP financing order to reflect court comments	0.70	525.00
04/13/17 SK Kortanek	Exchange email correspondence with R Schepacarter and B Keilson regarding UST comments to proposed interim DIP order	0.60	450.00
04/13/17 PA Jackson	Revise interim DIP order and email to UST, lenders' counsel for approval; coordinate filing of same under certification of counsel	0.80	452.00
04/13/17 TL Stoner	Finalize, efile and coordinate hand delivery to chambers of COC re revised interim DIP order	0.50	175.00
04/14/17 TL Stoner	Prepare, finalize and efile notice of hearing re entry of interim DIP order and final hearing	1.20	420.00
04/18/17 SK Kortanek	Email correspondence exchange M Bernstein regarding further DIP order revisions	0.40	300.00
04/27/17 SK Kortanek	Review proposed form of final DIP order (0.4), and email exchange with B Eisenbach and P Jackson, J Argentina regarding final order (0.3)	0.70	525.00
04/27/17 PA Jackson	Emails with S. Kortanek, J. Argentina re: form of final DIP order	0.10	56.50
04/28/17 SK Kortanek	Prepare for (0.2) and participate in conference call regarding DIP modifications, and associated operational and contract matters (0.9)	1.10	825.00
05/01/17 SK Kortanek	Call K Mumford re DIP order revisions (0.2); Review and revise final DIP order and circulate to parties (0.8)	1.00	750.00
05/01/17 SK Kortanek	Email correspondence exchange M Bernstein regarding DIP order revisions, final DIP hearing	0.30	225.00
05/01/17 SK Kortanek	Review revised DIP budget from J McFadden and related email correspondence with R Eisenbach	0.50	375.00
05/01/17 TL Stoner	Prepare and email exchange with S. Kortanek re notice of filing of revised proposed final DIP order	0.60	210.00
05/02/17 SK Kortanek	Email correspondence exchange with B Keilson for OUST re sign-off on revised final DIP order (0.1); Email correspondence exchange with K Mumford re OUST and ACAS sign-off on DIP order, polling for any other changes (0.2)	0.30	225.00
05/02/17 TL Stoner	Prepare, revise and email exchange with S. Kortanek and J. Argentina re certification of counsel for final DIP order	1.10	385.00
05/03/17 SK Kortanek	Review final DIP order as entered	0.20	150.00
05/03/17 SK Kortanek	Post-hearing review and revision to DIP order (0.4); Emails with parties regarding DIP order revisions (0.5); Review certification on DIP order (0.2)	1.10	825.00

217186 Halt Medical, Inc.
 560882 Halt Medical, Inc. - Chapter 11 Post-Petition
 June 21, 2017

Invoice No. 15071539
 Page 11

Task Code	B230 Financing/Cash Collections	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
05/03/17 PA Jackson	Draft certification of counsel re: notice of challenge deadline to litigants; email to S. Kortanek	0.40	226.00
05/03/17 TL Stoner	Assist with finalizing, efilng and coordinating hand delivery to chambers of COC re final DIP order and supplement to sale motion	2.00	700.00
05/05/17 SK Kortanek	Exchange emails K Bridges re DIP lender fee submission and follow-up (0.2); Call K Mumford re DIP Lender fees (0.3)	0.50	375.00
05/05/17 PA Jackson	Emails with S. Kortanek re: cert of counsel re: notice of challenge deadline to plaintiffs; coordinate filing and service of same	0.40	226.00
05/05/17 TL Stoner	Efile and coordinate hand delivery to chambers of COC re DIP motion and notice to litigants	0.40	140.00
05/08/17 SK Kortanek	Review budget to projected for administrative expense claims	0.50	375.00
05/08/17 SK Kortanek	Email correspondence exchange with K Mumford, DIP Lender counsel, regarding fee submission	0.20	150.00
05/08/17 PA Jackson	Call and emails with S. Kortanek re: revised DIP budget	0.20	113.00
05/10/17 SK Kortanek	Review administrative accruals to DIP budget (0.3); Email correspondence with DIP counsel K Mumford re: fee submissions (0.2)	1.50	1,125.00
05/11/17 SK Kortanek	Call B Eisenbach regarding Final DIP budget projected to actuals (0.3); Review and update budget items for estate professionals (0.4)	0.70	525.00
05/11/17 SK Kortanek	Review DIP credit agreement terms on reimbursement and fee provisions (0.3); Exchange email correspondence with K Mumford regarding DIP Lender fee submission (0.3); Call with K Mumford re DIP fee submission (0.4)	1.00	750.00
05/12/17 SK Kortanek	Review DIP budget respecting restructuring items (0.2); email claims and noticing agent Donlin Recano regarding budget update (0.2); Review DIP lender professional fee submissions from K Brown (0.4); Email correspondence to K Bridges and J McFadden regarding DIP Lender professional fee submission (0.2)	1.00	750.00
05/15/17 SK Kortanek	Exchange email correspondence with J McFadden regarding DIP Lender fee submission and response thereto (0.2); Exchange email correspondence with K Mumford regarding schedule on DIP lender fee submission (0.2)	0.40	300.00
05/19/17 SK Kortanek	Review payment information for DIP legal expense submission (0.2); Email correspondence with DIP counsel K Mumford re: fee submissions (0.2)	0.40	300.00
05/23/17 SK Kortanek	Exchange email correspondence with B Eisenbach re DIP budget actuals to projected, including with K Bridges	0.50	375.00

217186 Halt Medical, Inc.
 560882 Halt Medical, Inc. - Chapter 11 Post-Petition
 June 21, 2017

Invoice No. 15071539
 Page 13

Task Code	B280 Sale Motion/363 State	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
04/12/17 SK Kortanek	Review and revise sale motion	0.70	525.00
04/12/17 SK Kortanek	Revisions to motion papers and assignment meetings with P Jackson and T Stoner regarding first day pleading updates and corrections	0.70	525.00
04/12/17 TL Stoner	Assist P. Jackson with filing of sale motion	2.00	700.00
04/13/17 SK Kortanek	Review and revise sale motion for filing	0.80	600.00
04/13/17 SK Kortanek	Review and comment on draft process update letter from M Balistreri	0.40	300.00
04/13/17 SK Kortanek	Review and revise turns of first day orders being revised, review redlines (DIP order, cash management, utilities)	0.50	375.00
04/13/17 PA Jackson	Emails with potential IT asset purchaser, Canaccord re: expression of interest	0.20	113.00
04/14/17 TL Stoner	Prepare, finalize and efile notice of hearing re sale motion	0.60	210.00
04/24/17 SK Kortanek	Review process email and memorandum from Canaccord	0.40	300.00
04/24/17 PA Jackson	Review email from UST re: bid procedures comments	0.10	56.50
04/25/17 SK Kortanek	Call with Bob Eisenberg regarding pending sale procedures action items (0.6)	0.60	450.00
04/26/17 SK Kortanek	Review bid procedures objection filed by the U.S. Trustee (0.4); email exchanges with B Eisenbach and management team regarding U.S. Trustee bid procedures objection (0.4); Call with B Eisenbach regarding U.S. Trustee objection (0.2)	1.00	750.00
04/26/17 J Argentina	Review objection by US Trustee to sale motion and related correspondence.	0.30	135.00
04/26/17 PA Jackson	Review UST sale objection; research Silverstein bid protections precedent	0.40	226.00
04/26/17 TL Stoner	Review and email exchange with S. Kortanek and P. Jackson re US Trustee's objection to sale motion	0.10	35.00
04/26/17 TL Stoner	Legal research re 363 sale objections	1.50	525.00
04/27/17 SK Kortanek	Conference call with R Schepacarter and B Eisenbach regarding UST bid procedures objection (0.5); Call B Eisenbach regarding bid procedures matters (0.3)	0.80	600.00
04/30/17 SK Kortanek	Draft reply to U.S. Trustee bid procedures (breakup fee) objection	2.50	1,875.00
05/03/17 SK Kortanek	Review supplement to Bid Procedures for filing	0.30	225.00
05/03/17 PA Jackson	Revise/conform bid procedures order and draft certification of counsel submitting same; emails with UST, stalking horse, upset bidder counsel re: same; coordinate filing and service of same	0.80	452.00
05/04/17 SK Kortanek	Review Bidding Procedures order as entered	0.20	150.00

217186 Halt Medical, Inc.
 560882 Halt Medical, Inc. - Chapter 11 Post-Petition
 June 21, 2017

Invoice No. 15071539
 Page 14

<u>Task Code</u>	<u>B280 Sale Motion/363 State</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
05/04/17 SK Kortanek	Review certification on Bidding Procedures Order (0.3); Review parties' email correspondence re bidding procedures order sign-off (0.2)	0.50	375.00
05/04/17 TL Stoner	Finalize, efile and coordinate hand delivery to chambers of COC re bid procedures order	0.70	245.00
05/04/17 TL Stoner	Review and email exchange with DBR team and co-counsel re signed bid procedures order	0.20	70.00
05/05/17 SK Kortanek	Review parties' email correspondence (G Richards with Gynesonics counsel E Vendt) regarding NDA, data room, financials	0.30	225.00
05/09/17 SK Kortanek	Review notice of potential assumption/assignment (0.2) and notice of sale hearing and bidding procedures (0.2)	0.40	300.00
05/09/17 PA Jackson	Coordinate filing of sale, cure notices	0.20	113.00
05/09/17 TL Stoner	Review and email exchange with DBR team, co-counsel and CGI re sale notice, cure notice and CGI retention order	0.30	105.00
05/09/17 TL Stoner	Assist P. Jackson with filing and coordinating service of cure notice and sale notice	1.50	525.00
05/11/17 SK Kortanek	Meet with P Jackson regarding bid procedures and auction matters	0.50	375.00
05/11/17 PA Jackson	Confer with S. Kortanek re: SH professional fees issue	0.50	282.50
05/12/17 SK Kortanek	Review and revise application to retain Drinker Biddle, Kortanek declaration	0.90	675.00
05/17/17 SK Kortanek	Exchange email correspondence with G Richards regarding auction procedures and status, planning for sale hearing (0.3); Exchange email correspondence with K Bridges and R Eisenbach regarding bidding procedures under various scenarios (0.2); Review bid procedures (0.3)	0.80	600.00
05/18/17 SK Kortanek	Confer with counsel to interested party (SG) regarding sale process, timing (0.3)	0.30	225.00
05/30/17 SK Kortanek	Exchange email correspondence with B Eisenbach regarding Minnetronix cure schedule/sale order language addition	0.40	300.00
Total B280		23.20	14,143.00

<u>Task Code</u>	<u>B290 U.S. Trustee Matters</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
04/12/17 SK Kortanek	Email correspondence exchange R Schepacarter regarding formation meeting, and confer with management	0.40	300.00
04/12/17 SK Kortanek	Exchange email correspondence with R Schepacarter regarding first day motion updates, docket updates	0.40	300.00

217186 Halt Medical, Inc.
 560882 Halt Medical, Inc. - Chapter 11 Post-Petition
 June 21, 2017

Invoice No. 15071539
 Page 15

Task Code	B290 U.S. Trustee Matters	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
04/13/17 TL Stoner	Coordinate with S Kortanek and R. Schepacarter and arrange with DSBA re reservation for 4/21 formation meeting	0.50	175.00
04/14/17 SK Kortanek	Exchange email correspondence with R Vinson and OUST regarding initial reporting requirements package for the Debtor (0.3); Prepare memorandum and email correspondence with K Bridges and Debtor team regarding initial reporting and OUST monthly reporting requirements (0.4)	0.70	525.00
04/14/17 SK Kortanek	Exchange email correspondence with U.S. Trustee's office (R Vinson et al) with intimal Debtor information package (direct authorization, Guidelines, MORs), and furnish same to Debtor team (Richards, McFadden)	0.40	300.00
04/14/17 SK Kortanek	Email correspondence with R Schepacarter regarding section 341 meeting and IDI scheduling and logistics	0.30	225.00
04/15/17 SK Kortanek	Exchange email correspondence with G Richards regarding formation meeting, initial debtor interview (0.2); Exchange email correspondence with K Bridges and J McFadden regarding IDI and formation meeting scheduling, coverage, logistics (0.4)	0.60	450.00
04/20/17 SK Kortanek	Call R Schepacarter re status of UCC formation meeting scheduled for April 21 (0.3); Email correspondence with K Bridges and R Eisenberg re: creditor information, case status and task list (0.4)	0.70	525.00
04/20/17 SK Kortanek	Review email correspondence from G Richards and B Eisenbach regarding U.S. Trustee information requests and procedures (0.4); Email correspondence and call with R Schepacarter regarding background information and documents relating to creditors (0.5)	0.90	675.00
05/01/17 SK Kortanek	Review notice of meeting of creditors	0.20	150.00
05/19/17 SK Kortanek	Exchange email correspondence with R Schepacarter and B Keilson regarding section 341 meeting time change (0.3); Call with J McFadden at Halt regarding scheduling conflicts and reschedule request for 341 (0.3)	0.60	450.00
05/23/17 SK Kortanek	Work on revisions to Drinker retention order, incorporating UST comments (0.3); Exchange email correspondence with R Schepacarter regarding language changes in Drinker retention order (0.2)	0.50	375.00
05/23/17 SK Kortanek	Work on section 341 scheduling with Debtor team (Email drafting and call J McFadden at company)	0.30	225.00
05/24/17 SK Kortanek	Exchange email correspondence with R Schepacarter regarding 341 meeting	0.20	150.00

217186 Halt Medical, Inc.
 560882 Halt Medical, Inc. - Chapter 11 Post-Petition
 June 21, 2017

Invoice No. 15071539
 Page 16

Task Code	B290 U.S. Trustee Matters	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
05/31/17 SK Kortanek	Exchange email correspondence with B Eisenbach, K Bridges re 341 meeting, sale hearing planning (0.4); Email exchange with R Schepacarter regarding Halt 341 rescheduling to June 6, calendar same for company representative (0.2)	0.60	450.00
Total B290		7.30	5,275.00
Task Code	B310 Claims Administration/Objections/Bar Date	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
04/20/17 SK Kortanek	Call with B Eisenbach re creditor information, U.S. Trustee matters	0.30	225.00
05/09/17 SK Kortanek	Meet with P Jackson regarding administrative claims management and analysis	0.30	225.00
05/18/17 J Argentina	Draft bar date notice and publication notice.	1.80	810.00
05/18/17 J Argentina	Draft Bar Date Motion and proposed order.	3.70	1,665.00
05/23/17 SK Kortanek	Review notice of filing of claims register	0.10	75.00
05/30/17 J Argentina	Revise motion to set bar dates and related proposed form of order.	0.30	135.00
05/30/17 J Argentina	Draft motion to further suspend the investment obligations of Section 345(b) of the Bankruptcy Code and related proposed form of order.	2.30	1,035.00
Total B310		8.80	4,170.00
Task Code	B320 Plan and Disclosure Statement	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
05/10/17 PA Jackson	Draft combined Plan/DS	0.90	508.50
05/18/17 PA Jackson	Draft combined Plan/DS	0.80	452.00
Total B320		1.70	960.50
Task Code	B420 Restructuring	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
04/12/17 PA Jackson	Final review, preparation, and finalization of first-day declaration; work with B. Eisenbach, K. Bridges-Rodriguez, T. Stoner re: same	4.00	2,260.00
Total B420		4.00	2,260.00
Task Code	B445 Court Hearings/Preparation/Agenda	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
04/12/17 SK Kortanek	Case preparation meeting with B Eisenbach, K Bridges, G Richards	3.50	2,625.00

217186 Halt Medical, Inc.
 560882 Halt Medical, Inc. - Chapter 11 Post-Petition
 June 21, 2017

Invoice No. 15071539
 Page 17

Task Code	B445 Court Hearings/Preparation/Agenda	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
04/12/17 SK Kortanek	Meet with company (K Bridges) and advisors (B Eisenbach, G Richards and P Jackson) regarding first day filings and hearing preparation (2.5); Prepare witness outlines for first day hearing (1.5);	4.00	3,000.00
04/12/17 SK Kortanek	Exchange email correspondence with M Bernstein regarding first day hearing	0.20	150.00
04/12/17 SK Kortanek	Review as-filed first day motions	1.20	900.00
04/12/17 SK Kortanek	Exchange email correspondence with Chambers and team regarding first day hearing timing	0.40	300.00
04/12/17 SK Kortanek	Review and comment on G Richards draft declaration in support of DIP financing	0.50	375.00
04/12/17 J Argentina	Prepare orders on various first day matters for hearing on April 13, 2017.	0.70	315.00
04/12/17 PA Jackson	Work with K. Bridges-Rodriguez, R. Eisenbach, S. Kortanek, G. Richards, T. Stoner to finalize and file first-day motions, including withdrawn/corrected declarations and sale motion; various emails with A. Landis, K. Mumford, R. Schepacarter, DRC team re: same	6.30	3,559.50
04/12/17 TL Stoner	Arrange courtcall appearance of M. Bernstein for 4/13/17 hearing	0.20	70.00
04/13/17 SK Kortanek	Meet with company (K Bridges) and advisors (B Eisenbach, G Richards and P Jackson) regarding first day filings and hearing preparation (2.5); Prepare witness outlines for first day hearing (1.5); Present first day motions - case introduction, DIP motion and other first day relief (1.6)	5.60	4,200.00
04/13/17 SK Kortanek	Email correspondence exchange with chambers regarding blacklines for the Court and clerk's office	0.40	300.00
04/13/17 J Argentina	Prepare documents (clean orders, declarations, and notes, etc.) and materials for first day hearing.	1.90	855.00
04/13/17 J Argentina	Represent Debtor at First Day Hearing in Delaware Bankruptcy Court.	1.80	810.00
04/13/17 J Argentina	Draft certification of counsel related to revisions to DIP Financing order.	0.50	225.00
04/13/17 PA Jackson	Preparation for first-day hearing	2.50	1,412.50
04/13/17 PA Jackson	Attendance/presentation at first-day hearing	1.50	847.50
04/14/17 SK Kortanek	Review transcript of first day hearing	0.40	300.00
04/20/17 TL Stoner	Prepare, revise and email exchange with P. Jackson re coc for 5/15 omnibus hearing date	0.60	210.00
04/21/17 SK Kortanek	Prepare for (0.4) and attend Committee formation meeting (1.2)	1.60	1,200.00

217186
560882
June 21, 2017

Halt Medical, Inc.
Halt Medical, Inc. - Chapter 11 Post-Petition

Invoice No. 15071539
Page 18

Task Code	B445 Court Hearings/Preparation/Agenda	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
04/27/17 SK Kortanek	Review email correspondence from M Bernstein for ACAS regarding final DIP order comments, and follow-on exchanges with B Eisenbach (0.4); Emails with J Argentina regarding final DIP order preparation, redlines, circulation (0.3)	0.70	525.00
04/27/17 SK Kortanek	Prepare initial witness outline - investment banker witness for bid procedures hearing (1.5); Circulate witness outline to B Eisenbach regarding transactional history comments (0.3); Calls with K Mumford (2x) regarding hearing preparation for bid procedures (0.5)	2.30	1,725.00
04/27/17 TL Stoner	Review 4/12/17 hearing transcript	0.30	105.00
04/27/17 TL Stoner	Prepare and email exchange with S. Kortanek, P. Jackson and J. Argentina re 5/3/17 agenda	0.80	280.00
05/01/17 SK Kortanek	Hearing preparation - witness outlines (1.5); Exchange email correspondence with regarding G Richards and M Balistreri regarding hearing prep (0.4)	1.90	1,425.00
05/01/17 SK Kortanek	Review May 3 hearing agenda and key pleadings summary	0.50	375.00
05/01/17 TL Stoner	Prepare 5/3 hearing binder	0.70	245.00
05/01/17 TL Stoner	Finalize, efile and coordinate service of 341 notice	0.60	210.00
05/01/17 TL Stoner	Revise 5/3 agenda and binder	0.50	175.00
05/01/17 TL Stoner	Finalize, efile and coordinate service and hand delivery to chambers of 5/3 agenda and hearing binder	1.00	350.00
05/02/17 SK Kortanek	Hearing preparation meeting R Eisenbach (0.7); Review and revise proffer for K Bridges (0.8); Review and revise proffer to G Richards (0.7); Hearing outline revisions and updates (2.3)	4.50	3,375.00
05/02/17 TL Stoner	Prepare 5/3 hearing binder for S. Kortanek	1.40	490.00
05/02/17 TL Stoner	Prepare draft amended agenda for 5/317	0.40	140.00
05/03/17 SK Kortanek	Prepare for hearing (witness outlines, presentation, exhibits) (2.5); Appear at hearing on final DIP and bid procedures and present motions including evidentiary presentation on bidding procedure (3.5)	6.00	4,500.00
05/03/17 PA Jackson	Preparation and attendance at bid procedures hearing; related follow-up with client, Cooley, Canaccord	4.30	2,429.50
05/03/17 TL Stoner	Assist S. Kortanek and P. Jackson with 5/3 hearing preparations	1.50	525.00
05/05/17 TL Stoner	Review and email exchange with S. Kortanek 5/3/17 hearing transcript	0.40	140.00
05/08/17 SK Kortanek	Review transcript of bidding procedures and final DIP hearing	0.50	375.00
05/09/17 J Argentina	Preparations for hearing on May 16.	0.20	90.00

217186 Halt Medical, Inc.
 560882 Halt Medical, Inc. - Chapter 11 Post-Petition
 June 21, 2017

Invoice No. 15071539
 Page 19

Task Code	B445 Court Hearings/Preparation/Agenda	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
05/09/17 TL Stoner	Finalize, efile and upload proposed order for COC re omnibus hearing dates	0.30	105.00
05/09/17 TL Stoner	Prepare, revise and email exchange with P. Jackson re coc regarding omnibus hearing dates	0.40	140.00
05/09/17 TL Stoner	Prepare 5/15 agenda	0.30	105.00
05/10/17 J Argentina	Review and revise agenda for May 16 hearing.	0.20	90.00
05/10/17 TL Stoner	Prepare, revise and email exchange with S. Kortanek, P. Jackson and J. Argentina re 5/15 agenda	0.80	280.00
05/11/17 J Argentina	Email correspondence with DBR personnel regarding preparations and agenda for hearing on May 16.	0.30	135.00
05/11/17 J Argentina	Calls with Judge Silverstein's chambers regarding hearing on May 16.	0.30	135.00
05/11/17 TL Stoner	Prepare revised 5/15 agenda	0.40	140.00
05/12/17 SK Kortanek	Review draft amended hearing agenda for May 15 omnibus	0.20	150.00
05/12/17 J Argentina	Review and coordinate filing of agenda for May 16, 2017 hearing.	0.30	135.00
05/12/17 TL Stoner	Update and email exchange with J. Argentina, S. Kortanek and P. Jackson re 5/15 agenda	0.30	105.00
05/15/17 TL Stoner	Update 6/6/17 agenda	0.70	245.00
Total B445		66.80	40,899.00
Current Fees			\$130,548.00

Time and Fee Summary

Timekeeper	Title	Rate	Hours	Fees
SK Kortanek	Partner	\$750.00	88.10	\$66,075.00
PA Jackson	Associate	\$565.00	47.20	\$26,668.00
J Argentina	Associate	\$450.00	29.10	\$13,095.00
TL Stoner	Paralegal	\$350.00	70.60	\$24,710.00
Totals			235.00	\$130,548.00

217186 Halt Medical, Inc.
 560882 Halt Medical, Inc. - Chapter 11 Post-Petition
 June 21, 2017

Invoice No. 15071539
 Page 20

Summary of Task Amounts

Task	Activity	Hours	Fees
B110	Case Administration	31.90	13,018.00
	Task B110 TOTAL	31.90	13,018.00
B120	Asset Analysis and Recovery	0.30	105.00
	Task B120 TOTAL	0.30	105.00
B150	Meetings of and Communications with Creditors	1.40	554.50
	Task B150 TOTAL	1.40	554.50
B160	Retention of Applicant	10.50	5,313.50
	Task B160 TOTAL	10.50	5,313.50
B161	Fee Application	4.10	1,435.00
	Task B161 TOTAL	4.10	1,435.00
B165	Retention of Others	24.50	12,895.00
	Task B165 TOTAL	24.50	12,895.00
B190	Other Contested Matters	5.70	2,565.00
	Task B190 TOTAL	5.70	2,565.00
B210	Business Operations	9.40	4,808.50
	Task B210 TOTAL	9.40	4,808.50
B220	Employee Benefits/Pensions	2.40	1,800.00
	Task B220 TOTAL	2.40	1,800.00
B230	Financing/Cash Collections	21.70	13,603.50
	Task B230 TOTAL	21.70	13,603.50
B235	Creditor Information Sharing/1102 Matters	0.20	150.00
	Task B235 TOTAL	0.20	150.00
B270	Reports and Schedules	11.10	6,592.50
	Task B270 TOTAL	11.10	6,592.50
B280	Sale Motion/363 State	23.20	14,143.00
	Task B280 TOTAL	23.20	14,143.00
B290	U.S. Trustee Matters	7.30	5,275.00
	Task B290 TOTAL	7.30	5,275.00
B310	Claims Administration/Objections/Bar Date	8.80	4,170.00

217186 Halt Medical, Inc.
 560882 Halt Medical, Inc. - Chapter 11 Post-Petition
 June 21, 2017

Invoice No. 15071539
 Page 21

	Task B310 TOTAL	8.80	4,170.00
B320	Plan and Disclosure Statement	1.70	960.50
	Task B320 TOTAL	1.70	960.50
B420	Restructuring	4.00	2,260.00
	Task B420 TOTAL	4.00	2,260.00
B445	Court Hearings/Preparation/Agenda	66.80	40,899.00
	Task B445 TOTAL	66.80	40,899.00
Total		235.00	130,548.00

Expenses

Computer Assisted Research (Westlaw)	422.00
Searches	796.00
CourtCall Service - Dawn S. Marra, 04/20/17 - Invoice for attorney attendance at hearing by telephone.	51.00
Travel - Lodging (Hotel, Apt, Other) - Dawn S. Marra, 04/19/17 - Payment for use of conference center at DSBA for formation meeting.	200.00
Travel - Lodging (Hotel, Apt, Other) - Dawn S. Marra, 04/26/17 - Private room rental at the Delaware State Bar Association for meeting regarding Halt Medical.	200.00
Document Productions - Reliable Wilmington Draft and E-File 5/19/17 (PO# 560882)	117.99
Document Productions - Reliable Wilmington Draft and Efile AOS 5/23/17. (PO# 560882)	69.08
Meals - 04/10/17 - Lunch for Patrick Jackson and Bob Eisenbach while working on the Halt Medical pre- filing of Petitions. - P. Jackson, S. Kortanek, B. Eisenbach	28.40
Meals - Cavanaugh's Restaurant -4/12/17 Lunch For Restructuring Meeting	87.00
Outside Photocopying Services - Reliable Wilmington Mailout services in Halt	5,699.61
Outside Photocopying Services Parcels Inc. 04/12/17 - Blowback documents from email attachment x1 Hand delivery to Judge	71.46
Outside Photocopying Services Parcels Inc. 04/13/17 - Blowback x 1 from email attachments Rush hand delivery to Judge S	22.20
Outside Photocopying Services - Reliable Wilmington Mailout, envelope, postage services	505.28
Outside Photocopying Services - Reliable Wilmington Hourly-transcript- original	304.50
Outside Photocopying Services Parcels Inc. 04/12/17 - Blowback x 1 from email attachment Staple per copy Delivery to Ju	8.10

217186 Halt Medical, Inc.
 560882 Halt Medical, Inc. - Chapter 11 Post-Petition
 June 21, 2017

Invoice No. 15071539
 Page 22

Outside Photocopying Services - Reliable Wilmington April 25, 2017	512.50
Outside Photocopying Services - Reliable Wilmington Mailout , envelopes, postage	183.06
Outside Photocopying Services Parcels Inc. 05/04/17 - Blowback x 2 from email attachment Single sided Rush hand to Jud	73.52
Outside Photocopying Services Parcels Inc. 05/12/17 - Blowback x 1 from email attachment Hand delivery to Judge Silvers	7.74
Express Delivery Services Parcels Inc. 04/10/17 - 2 binders - downtown delivery/pickup - Office of the US Trustee	7.50
Express Delivery Services Parcels Inc. 04/12/17 - Downtown delivery/pickup - Judge Laurie Selber Silverste	7.50
Express Delivery Services Parcels Inc. 04/13/17 - Downtown delivery/pickup Judge Laurie Selber Silverstein	7.50
Express Delivery Services Parcels Inc. 04/13/17 - Downtown delivery/pickup Bankruptcy Court - DBR	7.50
Express Delivery Services - Reliable Wilmington Halt. Draft & E-File AOS. 5/1/17	108.70
Express Delivery Services - Reliable Wilmington 5/10/17. Mailout services, Draft & E-file, Postage	269.40
Express Delivery Services Parcels Inc. 05/01/17 - Downtown delivery / pickup	7.50
Express Delivery Services Parcels Inc. 05/04/17 - Downtown delivery pickup - Judge Laurie Selber Silverstein	7.50
Express Delivery Services Parcels Inc. 05/05/17 - Discounted delivery - Judge Laurie Selber Silverstein	7.50
Express Delivery Services Parcels Inc. 05/08/17 - Discounted delivery - Judge Laurie Selber Silverstein	5.00
Filing Fees - Dawn S. Marra, 04/12/17 - Filing fee for Chapter 11 Voluntary Petition re Halt Medical.	1,717.00
Filing Fees - Dawn S. Marra, 04/12/17 - Filing fee for Sale Motion re Halt Medical.	181.00
Court Reporter Service - Reliable Wilmington April 29, 2017	1,218.00
Court Reporter Service - Reliable Wilmington Daily Transcript - Original 5/3/17	459.80
Court Reporter Service - Reliable Wilmington Draft & E-file AOS 5/17/17	113.53
Court Reporter Service - Reliable Wilmington Draft & E-file AOS 5/17/17	119.94
Money Order For Audio CD Of Oral Hearing/S J=Kortanek	32.29

Total Current Expenses

\$13,636.60

Total this Invoice

\$144,184.60

217186
560882
June 21, 2017

Halt Medical, Inc.
Halt Medical, Inc. - Chapter 11 Post-Petition

Invoice No. 15071539
Page 23

Payment for legal services is due within 30 days of invoice date.