

**Exhibit A**

**Fees Statement**

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

## TIME DETAIL

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
01/22/19	AF O'Neill	016		Review responses and documents to data request in preparation for hearing (.5); further revise first day outlines (1.5)	2.00
01/22/19	AF O'Neill	011		Non-working travel time from Chicago to Wilmington (billed at half time)	.50
01/22/19	AF O'Neill	016		Discuss witness prep outline with J. Skakun (.6); meet with N. Pernick and K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) and team (B. Warner and J. Skakun) to prepare for first day hearing (1.0); meet with C. Anderson (Maremont) about case dynamics and regarding declaration with J. Skakun (1.6); review updated orders and discuss formation meeting and scheduling issues including call with FCR counsel about hearing and timing (.2); attention to potential open issues for the hearing (.5)	3.90
01/22/19	AF O'Neill	016		Multiple communications with local counsel regarding hearing issues and US Trustee issues with first days (.5); analysis regarding information requests and feasibility of litigation information (.5)	1.00
01/22/19	AF O'Neill	013		Emails with J. Holgado (PACE) and call with L. Shelko (Company) regarding data requests (.3)	.30
01/22/19	AF O'Neill	010		Analysis of open issues for discussion with company and team (.9); communicate with B. Warner regarding travel and hearing logistics (.2)	1.10
01/22/19	AF O'Neill	010		Review communications, documents regarding first-day hearing and comment on same	.40
01/22/19	AF O'Neill	016		Prepare portions of presentation for first day hearings	1.20
01/22/19	J Schomberg	001		Prepare redlines of first day pleadings (.5); email same to Cole Schotz for UST (.1); review and monitor docket for filing of first day pleadings (.9); review same and prepare for distribution (1.1)	2.60
01/22/19	J Schomberg	010		Prepare calendar invites regarding case hearing dates	.20
01/22/19	JM Skakun	001		Prepare and confer with A. O'Neill, B. Warner, and local counsel regarding 1/23 first day hearing (1.6), and prepare and confer with C. Anderson and A. O'Neill regarding 1/23 first day hearing (1.6);	3.80

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

<b>Date</b>	<b>Name</b>	<b>Task</b>	<b>Activity</b>	<b>Narrative</b>	<b>Hours</b>
				further prepare for first day hearing (.6)	
01/22/19	AR Stromberg	001		Review first day pleadings	.50
01/22/19	BM Warner	001		Manage and coordinate chapter 11 case filing	2.10
01/22/19	BM Warner	016		Prepare for participation in first day hearing	6.10
01/22/19	BM Warner	011		Non-working travel time from Chicago to Delaware for first day hearing (billed at half time)	1.00
01/22/19	BM Warner	001		Revise first day orders in advance of first day hearing	2.00
01/23/19	AF O'Neill	016		Prepare comments for hearing (.9); review and finalize same (.3); review new strategies regarding filing and transmit to client for review (.3); discuss hearing with C. Anderson (Maremont), B. Warner and J. Skakun (1.1); multiple communications with K. Stickles and N. Pernick (Cole Schotz) regarding UST communications and likely approach (.9); attend court hearing including travel to court and discussions with parties in interest before and after (2.3); communications with team and K. Stickles and N. Pernick (Cole Schotz) regarding next steps and outcome (1.3)	7.10
01/23/19	AF O'Neill	006		Communications with A. Stromberg regarding retention motions and with FCR regarding J. Patton affidavit including analysis regarding strategy for same in light of UST comments at hearing	.30
01/23/19	AF O'Neill	006		Review issues raised at hearing	1.00
01/23/19	AF O'Neill	010		Discuss next steps with C. Anderson (Maremont) (.2); follow up with chart regarding IDI interview, attendance and documents for same (.3); discuss same with B. Warner and with Sidley resources and game plan response for same (.2)	.70
01/23/19	AF O'Neill	010		Various communications with B. Warner regarding fee codes, IDI documents requests from UST	.40
01/23/19	AF O'Neill	011		Non-working travel time from Philadelphia to Chicago from hearing (billed at half time)	.80
01/23/19	W Price	018		Draft board minutes	.70
01/23/19	J Schomberg	001		Revise publication notice regarding updated court dates (.8); distribute same (.1)	.90
01/23/19	J Schomberg	001		Confer with Bank of America regarding cash management order (.3); confer with JPMorgan	.40

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631

Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

<b>Date</b>	<b>Name</b>	<b>Task</b>	<b>Activity</b>	<b>Narrative</b>	<b>Hours</b>
				regarding cash management order (.1)	
01/23/19	JM Skakun	016		Prepare and attend first day hearing in support of potential testimony by and cross examination of declarants C. Anderson and J. W. Song, including further analysis of key issues for potential testimony and discussion with C. Anderson (Maremont) and with A. O'Neill regarding same (3.1); confer with C. Anderson (Maremont), A. O'Neill, B. Warner, and local counsel regarding first day hearing and strategy regarding FCR issues in light of hearing (1.5)	4.60
01/23/19	JM Skakun	011		Non-working travel time from Wilmington to Chicago (billed at half time)	1.20
01/23/19	AR Stromberg	006		Prepare motion to appoint FCR	3.50
01/23/19	AR Stromberg	016		Telephonic attendance at first day hearing to address potential strategic information regarding potential UST objections to retention, FCR appointments, and plan confirmation	1.40
01/23/19	BM Warner	010		Prepare notices regarding case commencement and scheduling (2.0); manage U.S. Trustee information requests (1.0); confer with J. Schomberg and outside counsel regarding post-filing case management and scheduling (1.0)	4.00
01/23/19	BM Warner	011		Non-working travel time to Chicago from first day hearing (billed at half time)	1.50
01/23/19	BM Warner	016		Prepare for first day hearing (3.0); attend and present motions at first day hearing (2.3)	5.30
01/24/19	CM Barbuto	018		Review of board minutes for January 21 board meeting	.20
01/24/19	AF O'Neill	010		Review precedent IDI filings and follow up communications with K. Stickles regarding filing of initial monthly reports and IDI response (.7); provide advice to C. Anderson (Maremont) regarding payments in ordinary course versus prepetition payments and analysis regarding protocol for same (.2)	.90
01/24/19	AF O'Neill	006		Communications with B. Warner regarding open items (.2); and with A. Stromberg regarding retention papers and review A. Rovira comments on same (.3); review FCR appointment motion draft from A. Stromberg and review form of affidavit and consider strategic issues regarding potential UST opposition (2.5)	3.00

## SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

## Restructuring

<b>Date</b>	<b>Name</b>	<b>Task</b>	<b>Activity</b>	<b>Narrative</b>	<b>Hours</b>
01/24/19	AF O'Neill	017		Call and emails with counsel for Zurich and communications with A. Stromberg regarding call with Zurich including analysis of next steps	.30
01/24/19	AF O'Neill	006		Further discussions regarding FCR motion	.20
01/24/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with team regarding dates for transmission of IDI/Monthly operating materials to UST and review same (.3); communications with client regarding McDade letter (.1)	.40
01/24/19	AF O'Neill	017		Follow-up with ACC counsel regarding insurer issues and analysis regarding same	.30
01/24/19	W Price	018		Draft board minutes for January 31 board meeting	.90
01/24/19	AR Rovira	006		Review retention materials (1.5); provide comments regarding same (.5)	2.00
01/24/19	J Schomberg	001		Prepare new articles regarding Maremont first day hearing for A. O'Neill	.10
01/24/19	AR Stromberg	006		Review and comment on motion to appoint FCR and related declaration (3.2); email YCST (FCR counsel) regarding same (.4)	3.60
01/24/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review UST/DOJ objections in Fairbanks, Kaiser Gypsum and Duro Dyne	1.70
01/24/19	AR Stromberg	015		Call with counsel to Zurich regarding plan treatment (.5); emails with A.O'Neill and FCR/ACC regarding same (.4)	.90
01/24/19	BM Warner	010		Confer with A. O'Neill regarding case tasks (.2); review emails regarding case filing (.4); review and circulate combined notice for filing (.3); confer with local counsel regarding UST requests and IDI (.3); research regarding UST request (.3)	1.50
01/24/19	BM Warner	018		Review board meeting minutes from W. Price (.5); revise same (.3)	.80
01/24/19	BM Warner	007		Confer with accounting department regarding timekeeping issues for Maremont fee applications	.40
01/24/19	BM Warner	001		Confer with A. Stromberg regarding second day motions	.30
01/25/19	Q Couch	010		Prepare index and perform QC of binder materials for use by J. Skakun regarding US Trustee issues	2.40
01/25/19	NC Jenkins	001		Prepare binder regarding FCR materials for J. Skakun	.40
01/25/19	AF O'Neill	006		Communications with A. Stromberg regarding	.20

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631

Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

<b>Date</b>	<b>Name</b>	<b>Task</b>	<b>Activity</b>	<b>Narrative</b>	<b>Hours</b>
				Kasowitz (special asbestos counsel) retention and open issues for same	
01/25/19	AF O'Neill	010		Review new court order regarding DOJ and other governmental entities timing issues, analysis regarding same and communications with team regarding same (.4); review A. Stromberg memo to client regarding same and follow up regarding same (.3); prepare for call with client regarding IDI meeting and review letter requests and precedent responses for same (.3); call with P Bialy, B. Conly and T. Chirillo (Company), B. Warner and K. Stickles (Cole Schultz) regarding IDI prep and responses (.9); follow up with B. Warner regarding same (.3); review documents transmitted for response to same (.5)	2.70
01/25/19	AF O'Neill	010		Review additional IDI materials from K. Stickles (Cole Schotz)	.50
01/25/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review B. Eilander (Company) agenda for call with company and prepare for same (.3); call with Plan proponents regarding first-day update and next steps (.5)	.80
01/25/19	AR Stromberg	006		Draft 327(e) retention application for Kasowitz (special asbestos counsel)	3.50
01/25/19	AR Stromberg	001		Review Delaware order regarding effect of shut-down on cases (.2); prepare summary of same to A. O'Neill (.2)	.40
01/25/19	BM Warner	001		Correspondence with claims agent and local counsel regarding notice (.3); review and analyze second day motion (.2)	.50
01/25/19	BM Warner	010		Call with A. O'Neill, local counsel and client regarding reporting	.90
01/28/19	AF O'Neill	017		Call with B. Warner regarding creditor communications	.10
01/28/19	AF O'Neill	010		Review T. Chirillo (Company) questions about restructuring costs/budget and respond preliminary, analysis regarding same	.40
01/28/19	AF O'Neill	006		Communications with A. Stromberg regarding retention apps	.20
01/28/19	AF O'Neill	006		Emails with counsel to the FCR regarding draft motion to retain and next steps for filing (.2); follow-up with FCR counsel regarding filing (.1)	.30

## SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631

Maremont Corporation

## Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
01/28/19	AF O'Neill	017		Call from creditor regarding filing notice	.10
01/28/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with P. Bialy (company) regarding IDI meeting	.20
01/28/19	AF O'Neill	018		Review W. Price draft minutes from January 21 board meeting and comment regarding same	.40
01/28/19	AF O'Neill	007		Analyze Donlin Recano fee request and follow-up regarding same	.20
01/28/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications regarding notice delivery/protocol and check with DRC regarding completion and next steps for publication notice	.20
01/28/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with team regarding bill codes and time entry protocol, follow-up regarding same (.2); review revised company chart for IDI (.3)	.50
01/28/19	AF O'Neill	006		Meet with A. Stromberg regarding retention issues and timing of distribution of documents (.3); review comments on Kasowitz (special asbestos counsel) retention (.4); follow-up meeting with A. Stromberg regarding same (.1)	.80
01/28/19	AF O'Neill	010		Review T. Chirillo (Company) questions regarding initial monthly operating reporting including analysis regarding same and review K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) responses regarding same	.40
01/28/19	AF O'Neill	006		Review A. Stromberg responses to comments to FCR motion, including further analysis regarding approach and timing for same	.40
01/28/19	AF O'Neill	010		Review IDI issues (.3); prepare advice to client regarding IDI meeting (.4); communications with client regarding IDI issues including analysis regarding same (.2)	.90
01/28/19	W Price	018		Finalize board minutes for January 21 meeting	.30
01/28/19	J Schomberg	001		Confer with B. Warner regarding interim compensation procedures motion (.2); revise same (2.3)	2.50
01/28/19	AR Stromberg	006		Revise retention applications for Sidley and Kasowitz (special asbestos counsel) (4.8); meeting with A. O'Neill regarding same and IDI (.4)	5.20
01/28/19	BM Warner	010		Confer with client regarding reporting (.2); revise materials regarding debtor reporting requirements (.8); confer with A. O'Neill regarding case inquiry (.1)	1.10

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

## Restructuring

<b>Date</b>	<b>Name</b>	<b>Task</b>	<b>Activity</b>	<b>Narrative</b>	<b>Hours</b>
01/28/19	BM Warner	001		Research regarding interim compensation procedures and provide comments to motion (3.0); confer with claims agent regarding notice (.2); review affidavit of service from claims and noticing agent (.2); confer with J. Schomberg regarding interim compensation procedures motion (.2)	3.60
01/29/19	AF O'Neill	003		Communications with banker regarding trust funding	.10
01/29/19	AF O'Neill	010		Begin further analysis of initial monthly operating report issues/questions	.50
01/29/19	AF O'Neill	018		Further edits to Jan 21 board minutes and communications with W. Price regarding same	.20
01/29/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with B. Warner regarding Plan Supplement documents (.2); draft email to FCR/ACC regarding Plan Supplement items and next steps to complete same (.5); follow up with B. Warner regarding technical Plan modifications and analysis regarding same (.5)	1.20
01/29/19	AF O'Neill	018		Further communications with W. Price regarding delivery of board minutes	.10
01/29/19	AF O'Neill	006		Communications with A. Stromberg regarding internal company issues and analysis regarding budget impact	.20
01/29/19	AF O'Neill	017		Review timing issues and communications with ACC counsel regarding same	.20
01/29/19	AF O'Neill	018		Review draft bylaws and certificate of incorporation (1.1) communications with B. Warner and W. Price regarding same (.2)	1.30
01/29/19	AF O'Neill	010		Further analysis regarding IDI response and initial monthly operating report and multiple communications with K. Stickles regarding same (1.0); follow up with Maremont team and FCR, ACC and DRC team regarding same and professional fee estimates (.5)	1.50
01/29/19	AF O'Neill	010		Review Sidley final prepetition invoice and assess reporting for initial monthly operating report and various, communications with Sidley team regarding same (.3); communications regarding filing of IDI responses and for meeting with K. Stickles (.2)	.50
01/29/19	AF O'Neill	017		Further analysis regarding formation meeting and	.10



## SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

## Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				consider meeting statement	
01/29/19	AF O'Neill	010		Review company IDI responses including communications regarding same	.30
01/29/19	AF O'Neill	010		Follow up comments from company on IDI submission documents	.20
01/29/19	AF O'Neill	006		Further markup of FCR retention motion (.4); emails with A. Stromberg regarding same (.2)	.60
01/29/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with B. Warner regarding publication notice	.10
01/29/19	AF O'Neill	006		Communications with client regarding Cole Schotz retention	.20
01/29/19	AF O'Neill	006		Communications with FCR counsel regarding motion to appoint FCR and review comments on same	.20
01/29/19	AF O'Neill	010		Finalize memo to client regarding various questions on monthly operating reports (.5); review draft IDI letter response from K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) (.2); follow-up communications regarding same (.1)	.80
01/29/19	W Price	018		Finalize board meeting minutes (.4); circulate to the directors with comments (.1)	.50
01/29/19	J Schomberg	017		Confer with former Maremont employees regarding questions and concerns about chapter 11 process	1.00
01/29/19	AR Stromberg	006		Draft motion to appoint FCR	.70
01/29/19	AR Stromberg	001		Revise interim compensation procedures motion (1.1); confer with B. Warner regarding same (.3)	1.40
01/29/19	AR Stromberg	006		Revise Sidley retention application	.80
01/29/19	BM Warner	018		Review emails and board meeting minutes	.20
01/29/19	BM Warner	010		Confer with A. O'Neill regarding case deadlines (.3); review reporting materials from client and confer with local counsel regarding submission (.3); manage case inquiries and confer with client regarding corporate history (1.0)	1.60
01/29/19	BM Warner	001		Prepare interim compensation procedures motion (5.1); confer with A. Stromberg regarding same (.3)	5.40
01/29/19	BM Warner	015		Research regarding modified plan	1.20
01/30/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review Plan issues in connection with Plan	.50

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				Supplement items	
01/30/19	AF O'Neill	006		Calls with counsel to FCR regarding motion to appoint and follow up communications regarding same (.3); communications with B. Warner and A. Stromberg regarding pleadings (.2)	.50
01/30/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with team regarding key dates, review K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) memo regarding same	.30
01/30/19	AF O'Neill	006		Review further comments to FCR Motion and analysis of potential response items and strategy for same (1.1); preliminary review of Kasowitz (special asbestos counsel) retention application (.8)	1.90
01/30/19	AR Stromberg	006		Review and comment on motion to appoint FCR and related declaration	1.30
01/30/19	AR Stromberg	006		Review 327(e) motion and Kasowitz (special asbestos counsel) comments on motion and declaration (.8); revise Sidley retention application including analysis of search reports for retention application (2.1)	2.90
01/30/19	BM Warner	010		Confer with local counsel regarding notice	.20
01/30/19	BM Warner	001		Analyze FCR motion (.3); confer with A. Stromberg regarding same (.2); review and revise FCR motion and declaration (5.5)	6.00
01/30/19	BM Warner	015		Review bylaws and certificate of incorporation regarding plan supplement (.7); revise materials regarding same (.5)	1.20
01/31/19	AF O'Neill	006		Further review of comments to FCR Motion (.2); communications with A. Stromberg regarding same/next steps (.2); follow up with A. Stromberg and M. Hutchins (Kasowitz) regarding Kasowitz (special asbestos counsel) retention (.3)	.70
01/31/19	AF O'Neill	006		Further communications with M. Hutchins (Kasowitz) regarding defense payments (.2); multiple communications with A. Stromberg and B. Warner regarding FCR Motion and Kasowitz (special asbestos counsel) retention including analysis regarding same (.5)	.70
01/31/19	AF O'Neill	010		Further communications with T. Chirillo (Company) regarding IDI (.2); review questions regarding process/timing from L. Shelko (Company) (.1); draft memo regarding same (.6)	.90

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

## Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
01/31/19	AF O'Neill	010		Follow up with C. Anderson (Maremont) regarding filings and UST motion	.20
01/31/19	AF O'Neill	017		Review creditor formation meeting and issues (.2); communications with B. Warner regarding deck, analysis regarding same (.2)	.40
01/31/19	AF O'Neill	018		Further communications regarding bylaws/charter	.20
01/31/19	AF O'Neill	010		Provide advice to client regarding next steps	.50
01/31/19	AF O'Neill	006		Review changes to Sidley retention papers (.4); call with E. Harron (counsel to FCR) regarding second day issues (.3)	.70
01/31/19	AF O'Neill	010		Review materials and deadlines and send update memo to C. Anderson (Maremont)	.30
01/31/19	AF O'Neill	006		Consider latest updates from Fairbanks case (.2); follow up emails with B. Warner regarding filings (.2); review filed FCR Motion (.2)	.60
01/31/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with ACC regarding first day transcript	.10
01/31/19	AF O'Neill	010		Call with L. Holland (Company), T. Chirillo (Company) and S. Summerville (Company) regarding billing matters and retainers	.20
01/31/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review B. Warner memo regarding Plan indemnification provisions and respond to same	.30
01/31/19	AR Stromberg	006		Revise drafts of Sidley, Kasowitz, and Cole Schotz retention applications (1.9); call with K.Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding same (.8)	2.70
01/31/19	AR Stromberg	006		Review final version of motion to appoint FCR	.70
01/31/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review recent pleadings in pending asbestos bankruptcy cases	1.00
01/31/19	BM Warner	001		Confer with A. O'Neill and A. Stromberg regarding second day motions (.5); revise FCR motion and declaration (1.4); review emails and confer with client and Sidley team regarding second day pleadings (.3); file FCR motion (.3); correspondence with client, Sidley team and claims and noticing agent regarding same (.2)	2.70
01/31/19	BM Warner	006		Revise retention applications	1.70
01/31/19	BM Warner	015		Revise bylaws and certificate of incorporation for inclusion in plan supplement	2.50
01/31/19	BM Warner	010		Draft formation meeting presentation	.40

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

## Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
02/01/19	AF O'Neill	006		Communications with C. Anderson (Maremont) regarding review of professional retention applications (.2); follow-up with A. Stromberg and B. Warner regarding same (.2)	.40
02/01/19	AF O'Neill	010		Assess final pre-petition bills and retainer amounts for IDI/monthly reports	.30
02/01/19	AF O'Neill	001		Final review of interim compensation motion, comment and sign-off on same (.5); meet with B. Warner regarding comments (.2); follow-up communications with B. Warner and client regarding final draft/timing (.4)	1.10
02/01/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with B. Warner regarding FCR updates and timing of upcoming filing	.10
02/01/19	AF O'Neill	017		Analysis regarding formation meeting/open case issues	.20
02/01/19	AF O'Neill	013		Review final pre-petition fees/comments on same	.30
02/01/19	AF O'Neill	006		Review redline of Cole Schotz retention application and next steps for same	.30
02/01/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review precedent Fairbanks papers regarding UST affirmative motion to appoint FCR (.6); analysis regarding same (.5)	1.10
02/01/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with B. Warner regarding slides for creditor presentation, review issues for same	.30
02/01/19	AF O'Neill	006		Review A. Stromberg communications and changed pages for professional retention	.20
02/01/19	AF O'Neill	006		Meet with A. Stromberg regarding retention papers, FCR objections in Fairbanks and insurance/Plan issues	.40
02/01/19	AF O'Neill	006		Final review of Sidley retention motion, comments and sign-off on same (.8); meet with A. Stromberg regarding same (.2) and follow-up regarding same with client and billing (.3)	1.30
02/01/19	AF O'Neill	006		Communications with B. Warner regarding Cole Schotz agreement (.1); review documents regarding same (.1)	.20
02/01/19	W Price	018		Research on indemnification in the bylaws and charter (.5); revise bylaws and charter (.3)	.80
02/01/19	J Schomberg	017		Confer with former Maremont employee regarding questions and concerns about chapter 11 process	.20

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

## Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
02/01/19	AR Stromberg	006		Review Kasowitz (special asbestos counsel) retention application (.3); Revise Sidley retention application and declaration (1.2); review materials regarding same (1.3)	2.80
02/01/19	AR Stromberg	015		Research developments in pending asbestos bankruptcy cases	.30
02/01/19	BM Warner	001		Correspondence with client, A. Stromberg and local counsel regarding preparation of second day motions (.2); revise interim compensation procedures motion and retention applications regarding filing (4.7)	4.90
02/01/19	BM Warner	010		Draft formation meeting presentation	1.60
02/01/19	BM Warner	015		Revise plan supplement materials	.80
02/04/19	AF O'Neill	006		Follow-up communications with A. Stromberg, B. Warner and K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding retention papers (.3); review redlines of same (.2)	.50
02/04/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with counsel to proposed FCR regarding creditors meeting and next steps	.30
02/04/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with J. Conlan regarding committee formation and related issues	.40
02/04/19	AF O'Neill	017		Follow-up with N. Ramsey (ACC counsel) regarding appointment and next steps	.20
02/04/19	AF O'Neill	001		Draft summaries of motions for client (.7); follow-up emails with L. Shelko (Company) and C. Anderson (Maremont) regarding same (.3)	1.00
02/04/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review notice of committee formation and new pleadings in cases	.30
02/04/19	AF O'Neill	009		Communications with B. Warner, J. Holgado (PACE) and M. Hutchins (Kasowitz) regarding data points for meeting related to insurance and asbestos litigation/cases	.30
02/04/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with counsel to Zurich regarding next steps	.20
02/04/19	AF O'Neill	017		Attend creditors committee formation meeting including analysis regarding related issues	2.80
02/04/19	AF O'Neill	010		Prepare for IDI, review response for same (1.6); meet with P. Bialy (company) and K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) to prepare for same (.7); attend IDI meeting with UST (and P. Bialy and K. Stickles) (.8)	3.10

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

## Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
02/04/19	AF O'Neill	017		Review, comment and revise slides for presentation to creditors for formation meeting	1.00
02/04/19	AF O'Neill	006		Analysis regarding professional retention filing (.2); provide comments/next steps to A. Stromberg and B. Warner regarding same (.3)	.50
02/04/19	W Price	018		Review and revise bylaws and charter.	.70
02/04/19	J Schomberg	017		Confer with former Maremont employees regarding questions and concerns about chapter 11 process	.40
02/04/19	AR Stromberg	001		Revise interim compensation procedures motion and related materials	1.20
02/04/19	AR Stromberg	006		Revise retention applications	.90
02/04/19	BM Warner	017		Confer with party in interest regarding environmental issues (.5); research regarding same (.4)	.90
02/04/19	BM Warner	001		Revise and finalize interim compensation procedures motion and retention applications regarding filing (4.3); confer with A. Stromberg regarding case status (.4); provide comments regarding notice (.4)	5.10
02/04/19	BM Warner	015		Review amended bylaws changes and confer with W. Price regarding same (.6); revise bylaws and circulate to W. Price (.3)	.90
02/05/19	CM Barbuto	018		Review of charter and bylaw indemnity provisions	.80
02/05/19	AF O'Neill	018		Assess Charter revisions and communications with C. Barbuto regarding same (.2); communications with B. Warner regarding same (.1); review redlines from B. Warner regarding modification provisions (.2)	.50
02/05/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with L. Shelko (Company) and B. Warner regarding notice issues	.20
02/05/19	AF O'Neill	017		Meet with A. Stromberg regarding insurance issues (.2); call with FCR counsel regarding FCR appointment issues (.1); review Fairview alternative candidate submissions by UST (.1)	.40
02/05/19	AF O'Neill	009		Review litigation questions from J. Holgado at PACE (.1); provide analysis and advice regarding same to J. Holgado and L. Shelko (Company) (.4); follow-up with M. Hutchins (Kasowitz) regarding CT servicing issues (.1)	.60

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

## Restructuring

<b>Date</b>	<b>Name</b>	<b>Task</b>	<b>Activity</b>	<b>Narrative</b>	<b>Hours</b>
02/05/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review Garlock trust distribution procedures summary from A. Stromberg and compare to Maremont TDPs (.5); follow up meeting with A. Stromberg regarding same (.1)	.60
02/05/19	AF O'Neill	017		Call with counsel to the proposed FCR regarding various issues regarding plan and process	.60
02/05/19	AF O'Neill	010		Respond to T. Chirillo (Company) regarding initial monthly report	.20
02/05/19	AF O'Neill	007		Communications with DRC regarding fee applications/review same	.20
02/05/19	AF O'Neill	010		Follow up with A. Stromberg, B. Warner regarding business issues from IDI	.30
02/05/19	AF O'Neill	017		Prepare agenda of items for discussion with FCR (.2); and meet with A. Stromberg regarding Zurich issues (.2)	.40
02/05/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with T. Chirillo (Company) and P. Bialy (Company) regarding initial monthly report and call regarding same (.7); follow-up with B. Warner regarding information for monthly report and regarding DRC bill (.3); follow-up communications with T. Chirillo (Company) and P. Bialy (Company) regarding same (.2)	1.20
02/05/19	W Price	018		Further revise Reorganized Maremont bylaws and charter.	.90
02/05/19	J Schomberg	001		Confer with K. Ly of Bank of America regarding cash management order (.3); confer with J. Tjiachris of JPMorgan Chase regarding cash management order (.2)	.50
02/05/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review and analyze precedent asbestos cases and potential objections to plan and precedent asbestos (2.1); conference with A.O'Neill regarding same (.4); call with YCST regarding plan issues (.4)	2.90
02/05/19	BM Warner	010		Correspondence with local counsel and claims agent regarding notice (.2); research regarding corporate history (.3); confer with A. O'Neill and J. Schomberg regarding cash management order (.3); research regarding claims agent and administrative advisor orders (.4); confer with client and claims agent regarding invoices and order requirements (.5); confer with A. O'Neill and claims agent regarding operating report data (.7)	2.40
02/05/19	BM Warner	018		Revise materials regarding amended charter and	.80

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				bylaws (.6); confer with W. Price regarding same (.2)	
02/06/19	AF O'Neill	010		Preliminary review of latest initial monthly report from T. Chirillo (Company) and email comments regarding same (.3); call with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding same (.2); prepare further comments to draft of same and analysis regarding same (.4); follow-up calls with T. Chirillo (Company) regarding changes to same (.2)	1.10
02/06/19	AF O'Neill	018		Communications with C. Barbuto and B. Warner regarding revisions to bylaws and charter (.4); review distribution of same to FCR/ACC (.1)	.50
02/06/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with N. Vorhees (DRC) regarding timing	.20
02/06/19	AF O'Neill	015		Prepare for call with Zurich regarding plan treatment (.1); call with A. Stromberg and counsel to Zurich regarding same (.2); meet with A. Stromberg regarding plan confirmation language (.2); communications with client and FCR/ACC regarding proposed Zurich agreement (.2)	.70
02/06/19	AF O'Neill	018		Call with S. Edmiston (Maremont director) regarding status and potential role as director for reorganized Maremont	.30
02/06/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with B. Eilander (Company) regarding next steps (.3); call regarding status and agenda for weekly call (.2)	.50
02/06/19	AF O'Neill	009		Emails to ACC and FCR regarding updated litigation schedules from PACE (.1); review materials regarding same (.1)	.20
02/06/19	AF O'Neill	010		Multiple communications with T. Chirillo (Company) and K. Kwiatkowski (Company) regarding monthly amounts (.4); email documents regarding same (.1)	.50
02/06/19	AF O'Neill	010		Review revised monthly report from P. Burks (Company) and make final comments to same (.2); communications with B. Warner regarding same (.2)	.40
02/06/19	AF O'Neill	017		Call with E. Harron (proposed counsel to FCR) regarding claims issues and directors for reorganized Debtor (.2); follow-up communications regarding cooperation agreement and preliminary review of same (.3)	.50



SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

## Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
02/06/19	AF O'Neill	009		Draft advice to L. Shelko (Company) and M. Hutchins (Kasowitz) regarding automatic stay (.3); review follow-up from M. Hutchins and respond to same (.2)	.50
02/06/19	AF O'Neill	007		Review first draft January fees for fee application	.30
02/06/19	AF O'Neill	009		Follow-up communications with L. Shelko (Company) and M. Hutchins (Kasowitz) regarding protocol for late filed lawsuits	.20
02/06/19	AF O'Neill	010		Review further comments from T. Chirillo (Company) regarding monthly report and respond regarding same	.20
02/06/19	J Schomberg	001		Confer with J. Tjiachris of JPMorgan Chase regarding cash management order	.20
02/06/19	AR Stromberg	015		Call with counsel to Zurich regarding plan treatment (.2); review and comment on draft asbestos records cooperation agreement (.7)	.90
02/06/19	BM Warner	015		Confer with A. O'Neill and W. Price regarding amended charter and bylaws (.2); revise and circulate documents regarding same (1.0)	1.20
02/06/19	BM Warner	010		Prepare drafts of initial debtor report	1.20
02/07/19	DJ Lutes	007		Call with B. Warner regarding fee compensation motion, trustee guides, case background and related fee application tasks (.3); review compensation motion and calendar deadlines (.2); call with M. Byrne regarding fee application tasks (.2)	.70
02/07/19	AF O'Neill	007		Communications with M. Byrne, D. Lutes regarding final prepetition bill (.1); communications with company regarding same (.1)	.20
02/07/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with B. Eilander (Company) regarding update call (.1); review agenda/GANNT chart and analysis regarding same (.2)	.30
02/07/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review Plan Supplement filing (.6); review A. Stromberg comments to cooperation agreement and precedent agreement (.3); analysis of corporate structure dynamics (.3); communications with A. Stromberg and E. Harron (proposed counsel to FCR) regarding next steps for same (.4)	1.60
02/07/19	AF O'Neill	009		Communications with J. Holgado (PACE) regarding FFIC document representation and analysis regarding same (.3); communications with	.50

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

<b>Date</b>	<b>Name</b>	<b>Task</b>	<b>Activity</b>	<b>Narrative</b>	<b>Hours</b>
				M. Hutchins (Kasowitz) regarding strategy for postpetition claims (.2)	
02/07/19	AF O'Neill	015		Multiple communications with E. Harron (counsel to FCR) regarding plan supplement deliverables/timing	.20
02/07/19	AF O'Neill	015		Office conference with A. Stromberg regarding Plan issues and analysis regarding same	.50
02/07/19	AF O'Neill	010		Call with J. Conlan regarding case update/UST dynamics	.30
02/07/19	J Schomberg	017		Confer with former Maremont employee regarding questions and concerns about chapter 11 process	.20
02/07/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review asbestos records cooperation agreement (1.2); prepare comments regarding same (.8)	2.00
02/07/19	BM Warner	010		Strategize with A. Stromberg regarding case tasks and next steps	.50
02/07/19	BM Warner	007		Review fee application requirements (.6); call with D. Lutes regarding fee application process (.3); emails to D. Lutes regarding same (.3)	1.20
02/07/19	BM Warner	015		Draft plan supplement and notice of filing	2.50
02/08/19	DJ Lutes	001		Research docket for first day motions and orders (.4); review motions, exhibits and orders (.9); prepare electronic files for same (1.6); review second day motions and proposed orders (.9)	3.80
02/08/19	DJ Lutes	006		Research docket for retention applications for professionals (.2); review applications, declarations and exhibits regarding same (.3); prepare electronic files regarding same (.7)	1.20
02/08/19	DJ Lutes	015		Research docket for plan solicitation materials, scheduling and notices (.2); review plan, disclosure statement and hearing deadlines (.4); prepare electronic files regarding same (.7)	1.30
02/08/19	AF O'Neill	006		Review communications from US Trustee regarding professional retention and analysis regarding same	.50
02/08/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review A. Stromberg and M. Hutchins (Kasowitz) comments to cooperation agreement and discuss next steps (.3); analysis regarding same (.2)	.50
02/08/19	AF O'Neill	006		Multiple communications with A. Stromberg and B. Warner regarding retention issues (.4); communications with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz)	.60

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

## Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				regarding same (.2)	
02/08/19	AF O'Neill	006		Analyze ACC issues and retention papers filed by same (.6); review issues related to same (.3)	.90
02/08/19	AF O'Neill	017		Review query from PBGC and analysis regarding same (.2); communication with B. Warner regarding same (.1)	.30
02/08/19	AF O'Neill	010		Review/comments as new initial dates	.20
02/08/19	AF O'Neill	009		Multiple communications regarding insurance reimbursement issues with PACE including analysis regarding same	.30
02/08/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review open plan issues and allocation of review (.7); review issues regarding confirmation order, and memo in support (.5)	1.20
02/08/19	J Schomberg	001		Confer with B. Warner regarding bank correspondence concerning cash management order	.20
02/08/19	AR Stromberg	006		Analyze UST comments on retention applications and proposed responses (.9); review materials regarding same (.6); conference with B. Warner regarding response to same (.5); call with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding comments on retention application (.5)	2.50
02/08/19	BM Warner	001		Analyze UST comments regarding second day pleadings (.3); revise proposed orders regarding second day pleadings (.5); correspond with A. Stromberg and A. O'Neill regarding UST comments (.2); confer within Sidley team regarding retention application disclosures (1.1)	2.10
02/08/19	BM Warner	017		Review inquiry from party in interest (.1); confer with A. O'Neill and A. Stromberg regarding response (.2); confer with client and party in interest regarding same (.3); call with client regarding response to same (.2); draft summary of client call regarding same (.2)	1.00
02/08/19	BM Warner	006		Meeting with A. Stromberg regarding retention applications and confirmation documents	.50
02/08/19	BM Warner	015		Research regarding executory contract plan supplement exhibit (2.8); draft plan supplement exhibit (.7)	3.50
02/11/19	CM Barbuto	018		Assess issue about director and officer roles for reorganized entity	.20

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

## Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
02/11/19	DJ Lutes	010		Review docket, notices, key pleadings and hearing deadlines (.1); prepare electronic files for same (.3)	.40
02/11/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with N. Pernick (Cole Schotz) and Sidley team regarding call from FFIC and next steps regarding same	.20
02/11/19	AF O'Neill	009		Communications with L. Shelko (Company) regarding weekly reports from PACE	.10
02/11/19	AF O'Neill	017		Review ACC comments to cooperation agreement and communications with A. Stromberg regarding same (.4); follow up regarding next steps with ACC and FCR (.2); and review comments regarding same (.1)	.70
02/11/19	AF O'Neill	006		Communications with B. Warner regarding retention comments from UST and related reminders	.20
02/11/19	AF O'Neill	006		Multiple communications with Sidley team regarding retention next steps and plan supplement issues including analysis regarding same	1.00
02/11/19	AF O'Neill	015		Follow-up with J. Schomberg regarding director/officer exhibit (.1); meeting with B. Warner regarding same (.1)	.20
02/11/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review cumulative comments to cooperation agreement and prepare for call with M. Hutchins (Kasowitz) and L. Shelko (Company) regarding same (.8); follow-up communications with A. Stromberg regarding same (.3); call with M. Hutchins and A. Stromberg regarding agreement (.5)	1.60
02/11/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review first-day transcript for Judge Carey Plan issues including analysis on options to address same	.30
02/11/19	AF O'Neill	009		Follow up with J. Holgado (PACE) regarding Fireman's issues (.2); analysis regarding automatic stay issues (.3)	.50
02/11/19	AF O'Neill	006		Review Duro Dyne FCR litigation update and communications with team regarding same (.6); review appellate papers and follow-up communications with team regarding disposition and schedule (.9)	1.50
02/11/19	AF O'Neill	006		Follow-up regarding committee issues/retention (.1); review B. Warner summary regarding same and A. Stromberg follow-up regarding interested	.20

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

## Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				parties (.1)	
02/11/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications regarding trust operations with M. Sohr (Citizens Bank)	.20
02/11/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with A. Stromberg and B. Warner regarding technical Plan modifications	.20
02/11/19	W Price	018		Research Delaware Law regarding officers and directors (.9); update bylaws and charter regarding same (.4)	1.30
02/11/19	J Schomberg	015		Draft S. Edmiston biographical paragraph for plan supplement (1.4); draft task list and post-petition work plan (3.1)	4.50
02/11/19	AR Stromberg	015		Revise asbestos records cooperation agreement	1.70
02/11/19	AR Stromberg	015		Call with L.Shelko (Company), A.O'Neill and M.Hutchins (Kasowitz) regarding same	.50
02/11/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review and analyze UST/DOJ plan objection in pending asbestos case	3.70
02/11/19	BM Warner	006		Confer with A. O'Neill and A. Stromberg regarding retention application responses (.2); review and analyze ACC retention applications and correspondence with A. O'Neill, A. Stromberg and ACC regarding filings (.6); draft supplemental declaration for Kasowitz retention (1.8); research regarding district court appeal regarding FCR retention (.3)	2.90
02/11/19	BM Warner	010		Review case articles regarding debtors (.1); email to Sidley team regarding same (.1); correspondence with J. Schomberg regarding case work plan and diligence documents (.7); revise same (2.0)	2.90
02/11/19	BM Warner	015		Revise and circulate plan supplement exhibit to C. Barbuto and W. Price (.3); confer with A. O'Neill regarding plan supplement exhibit (.2); correspondence with J. Schomberg regarding same (.2); correspondence with W. Price regarding plan supplement exhibits (.1); revise plan to make technical amendments (.2); review and analyze first day hearing transcript regarding technical plan amendments (.5); research plan supplement exhibit regarding directors and officers (.7); revise same (.3); correspondence with A. Stromberg and review emails regarding plan supplement exhibits (.1); confer with ACC counsel regarding plan supplement exhibit (.1)	2.70

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

## Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
02/11/19	BM Warner	001		Prepare summary of informal comments and responses regarding second day pleadings and applications	2.30
02/11/19	BM Warner	017		Draft response to third party regarding case inquiry and circulate to client	.20
02/12/19	CM Barbuto	018		Prepare comments on charter	.30
02/12/19	DJ Lutes	010		Review docket, notices, key pleadings and hearing deadlines (.1); prepare electronic files for same (.2)	.30
02/12/19	DJ Lutes	007		Prepare monthly fee application materials (.2); review guides and deadlines regarding same (.2)	.40
02/12/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with FCR regarding FFIC and strategy/issues regarding same	.20
02/12/19	AF O'Neill	010		Follow-up with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding UST MOR requests including approach regarding same, and big case protocol issues	.20
02/12/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with L. Shelko (Company) and T. Chirillo (Company) regarding MORs and PACE issues, analysis and respond regarding same (.2); follow-up communications with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding local issues/UST communications for same (.2); follow-up communications with B. Warner and J. Schomberg regarding record for same (.2)	.60
02/12/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review draft Exhibit M and comment/revise same (.1); communications with B. Warner and J. Schomberg regarding same (.1)	.20
02/12/19	AF O'Neill	015		Analysis and communications with B. Warner and J. Schomberg regarding assets of subsidiary debtors and plan modifications	.30
02/12/19	AF O'Neill	010		Draft email to J. Heck at UST regarding MOR	.20
02/12/19	AF O'Neill	013		Communications with T. Chirillo (Company) and company regarding payment of DRC, noticing and reminders regarding same	.20
02/12/19	AF O'Neill	018		Review FCR comments to charter/bylaws and communications/analysis regarding same with corporate team	.20
02/12/19	AF O'Neill	010		Review revised task list and work plan regarding second day and confirmation issues (.2); analysis regarding same and consider approach for confirmation case (.2)	.40

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

## Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
02/12/19	AF O'Neill	015		Follow-up communications with FCR regarding plan supplement filing	.20
02/12/19	AF O'Neill	015		Meet with A. Stromberg, B. Warner and J. Schomberg regarding plan issues and confirmation preparation	1.00
02/12/19	AF O'Neill	010		Review memos from B. Warner and J. Schomberg regarding MOR filing (.1); communications with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding same (.1)	.20
02/12/19	AF O'Neill	010		Follow-up with T. Chirillo (Company) regarding MOR issues and filing tasks	.10
02/12/19	AF O'Neill	010		Review update from K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding UST conversation and draft response regarding assets (.2); communications with K. Stickles and A. Stromberg regarding same (.2)	.40
02/12/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review executory contracts plan supplement exhibit (.2); follow-up communications with client regarding same (.2); communications with B. Warner regarding additional contracts (.2)	.60
02/12/19	AF O'Neill	006		Multiple communications with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) and A. Stromberg regarding response to UST and provide additional language regarding same	.40
02/12/19	AF O'Neill	017		Review B. Warner response to PBGC	.10
02/12/19	AF O'Neill	006		Review final delivery of retention answers to UST (.2); draft summary explanation and email to client regarding same (.3); follow-up with P. Bialy (Company) regarding same (.1)	.60
02/12/19	AF O'Neill	009		Assess L. Shelko (Company) inquiry regarding PACE and CT acceptance of service and respond regarding same (.2); follow-up with M. Lou Patterson (Company) regarding same and affidavits of service and process (.2)	.40
02/12/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review A. Stromberg summary of open cooperation agreement issues, redline regarding same and analysis (.1); respond to A. Stromberg regarding same (.1)	.20
02/12/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with A. Stromberg regarding FFIC issues and analysis regarding same (.2); meet with A. Stromberg regarding strategy for same (.1); communications with ACC/FCR regarding same (.1)	.40

## SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

## Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
02/12/19	AF O'Neill	015		Multiple communications with team regarding Plan Supplement documents and review distributions of same (.4); review memo regarding director contract from B. Warner and respond regarding same (.3)	.70
02/12/19	W Price	018		Review bylaws and charter (.7); revise same (.5)	1.20
02/12/19	J Schomberg	010		Research precedent monthly operating reports	.50
02/12/19	J Schomberg	015		Review plan language regarding transfer of books and records to reorganized debtor (.3); confer with A. O'Neill, A. Stromberg and B. Warner regarding work plan and task list for second day hearing and confirmation (1.0)	1.30
02/12/19	AR Stromberg	015		Prepare Maremont task list and workplan	.70
02/12/19	AR Stromberg	015		Conference with A.O'Neill, B.Warner, J.Schomberg regarding task list and confirmation preparations	1.00
02/12/19	AR Stromberg	015		Revise asbestos records cooperation agreement	1.00
02/12/19	AR Stromberg	015		Call with M.Fink (ACC counsel) regarding asbestos records cooperation agreement	.50
02/12/19	AR Stromberg	015		Call with L.Davis (insurance counsel) regarding FFIC agreement	.40
02/12/19	AR Stromberg	006		Review emails to UST regarding comments to Sidley retention	.40
02/12/19	BM Warner	015		Confer with A. O'Neill and J. Schomberg regarding plan supplement and plan questions (.3); research regarding plan and plan supplement questions (.3); revise plan supplement exhibit and circulate to client (.5); research and confer with A. Stromberg and W. Price regarding plan supplement/corporate document question (1.0); correspondence with W. Price regarding plan supplement exhibits (.4); revise plan supplement exhibits (.5); review and analyze director agreement regarding plan supplement (.8); revise plan supplement exhibits regarding comments from ACC and proposed FCR (.8)	4.60
02/12/19	BM Warner	013		Research regarding monthly operating report question	.50
02/12/19	BM Warner	010		Meeting with A. O'Neill, A. Stromberg and J. Schomberg regarding case work plan and strategy (1.0); correspondence with client and A. O'Neill	1.20



SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				regarding asbestos litigation (.2)	
02/12/19	BM Warner	001		Confer with client and asbestos counsel regarding informal comments regarding second day pleadings (.3); revise summary of responses regarding second day pleadings (.2); correspondence with ACC counsel regarding informal comments regarding interim compensation procedures (.2)	.70
02/13/19	DJ Lutes	010		Emails with B. Warner regarding administrative tasks for electronic filed version of key pleadings (.2); review key filings for digital file uploads (.2)	.40
02/13/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review B. Warner memo regarding Plan confirmation evidentiary issues and respond regarding same (.3); analysis regarding support materials for contested/uncontested plans (.3)	.60
02/13/19	AF O'Neill	009		Communications with J. Skakun regarding litigation support with analysis regarding same	.20
02/13/19	AF O'Neill	010		Assess K. Kwiatkowski (Company) memo regarding retainers and analysis regarding same (.2); follow-up correspondence with M. Fink (ACC counsel) and K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding same (.3)	.50
02/13/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review revised cooperation agreement	.20
02/13/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with A. Stromberg, ACC and FCR regarding call (.2); call with R. Brady (counsel to FCR), M. Hutchins (Kaswotiz), M. Fink (ACC counsel) and A. Stromberg regarding cooperation agreement (.4)	.60
02/13/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review FCR comments to contract exhibit (.1); communications regarding same and bylaws/charter with B. Warner (.2); communications with A. Stromberg regarding next steps for Plan Supplements (.2)	.50
02/13/19	AF O'Neill	006		Review communications from UST regarding retention issues (.1); multiple communications with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz), A. Stromberg and B. Warner regarding same including next steps, finalizing documents and analysis regarding same (.5); review A. Stromberg memo regarding Sidley reps for additional support, comments and communications regarding same (.2)	.80
02/13/19	AF O'Neill	006		Communications regarding and review supplemental Kasowitz declaration	.20

## SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

## Restructuring

<b>Date</b>	<b>Name</b>	<b>Task</b>	<b>Activity</b>	<b>Narrative</b>	<b>Hours</b>
02/13/19	AF O'Neill	006		Communications with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding UST issues	.20
02/13/19	AF O'Neill	015		Further communications with FCR/ACC regarding plan supplement documents and analysis regarding approach on same	.30
02/13/19	AF O'Neill	006		Communications with ACC regarding professional retention issues, follow-up regarding same, and UST issues	.20
02/13/19	AF O'Neill	006		Review and comment on revised Cole Schotz order/CNO	1.00
02/13/19	AR Stromberg	006		Address UST comments on Sidley retention, Kasowitz retention, and interim compensation	1.50
02/13/19	AR Stromberg	015		Call with YCST, M. Hutchins (Kasowitz) and A. O'Neill regarding cooperation agreement	.50
02/13/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review plan supplement and related notice	.50
02/13/19	BM Warner	015		Revise plan supplement exhibit to ACC and proposed FCR (.4); email Sidley team regarding same (.1); revise plan supplement exhibit regarding comments from proposed FCR (.2); research regarding confirmation documents and declarations and revise work plan (3.2); research regarding plan confirmation precedent (1.4); draft confirmation order (.7); research regarding plan modifications (.5)	6.50
02/13/19	BM Warner	006		Confer with Sidley parties regarding informal comments regarding professional retention (.3); correspondence with professionals regarding retention comments (.3); correspondence with declarant regarding supplemental Kasowitz declaration (.1); correspondence with administrative advisor and A. O'Neill regarding informal comments regarding retention (.3)	1.00
02/13/19	BM Warner	001		Revise proposed orders regarding second day pleadings	1.30
02/13/19	BM Warner	010		Revise case work plan and task list	1.20
02/14/19	DJ Lutes	006		Review objection regarding futures representative retention (.2); prepare materials for Sidley team regarding same (.1)	.30
02/14/19	AF O'Neill	010		Review and comment on work plan and task list	.20
02/14/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review Plan Supplement items and communications regarding distribution of final	.30

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				drafts of same to creditors and company (.2); analysis regarding open issues (.1)	
02/14/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding submissions and next steps	.20
02/14/19	AF O'Neill	001		Analysis of likely UST options with respect to FCR issues	1.00
02/14/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with ACC and FCR regarding Plan Supplement filing	.20
02/14/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review UST objection (.4); multiple communications with team regarding same (1.0)	1.40
02/14/19	AF O'Neill	006		Review DCR language and comments regarding same (.1); communications with B. Warner and A. Stromberg regarding next steps for response to UST/omnibus issues memo (.2)	.30
02/14/19	AF O'Neill	006		Meet with A. Stromberg regarding UST response and review and comment on draft letter to UST regarding remaining issues (.5); finalize and email same to UST (.3)	.80
02/14/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with P. Bialy (Company), K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) and J. Heck (UST) regarding MOR requirements	.20
02/14/19	AF O'Neill	001		Prepare for FCR motion reply, review case law and precedent transcripts/papers regarding same	1.00
02/14/19	AF O'Neill	001		Call with E. Harron and B. Brady (proposed FCR counsel) regarding objection (.3); follow-up with A. Stromberg regarding same (.2)	.50
02/14/19	J Schomberg	006		Summarize UST congressional testimony regarding FCR appointments	1.00
02/14/19	AR Stromberg	006		Draft email to UST regarding comments on retention applications and interim compensation procedures	.70
02/14/19	AR Stromberg	001		Analyze UST objection to FCR motion (.9); review materials regarding same (1.2)	2.10
02/14/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review plan supplement and related notice	.50
02/14/19	BM Warner	015		Research regarding plan precedent and releases (1.6); confer with local counsel regarding plan and plan supplement (.4); revise and distribute multiple iterations of plan supplement documents to client, ACC, proposed FCR and local counsel (.9); correspondence with local counsel, ACC and director regarding plan supplement (.5); research	7.60

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

<b>Date</b>	<b>Name</b>	<b>Task</b>	<b>Activity</b>	<b>Narrative</b>	<b>Hours</b>
				and draft confirmation order and plan revisions (4.2)	
02/14/19	BM Warner	006		Correspondence with A. O'Neill and A. Stromberg regarding informal retention application responses and proposed orders	.20
02/14/19	BM Warner	001		Analyze FCR objection from UST (.3); review materials regarding same (.2)	.50
02/14/19	BM Warner	010		Review and analyze asbestos case articles regarding case issues	.30
02/15/19	DJ Lutes	015		Review Plan Supplement materials (.1); prepare electronic files of materials for Sidley team regarding same (.2)	.30
02/15/19	DJ Lutes	007		Emails to A. O'Neill regarding fee application issues (.1); review fee application issues regarding same (.2); prepare 1st monthly fee application materials (.3)	.60
02/15/19	AF O'Neill	009		Communications with M.L. Patterson (Company) regarding various litigation issues and DE corporate issues including analysis regarding same	.40
02/15/19	AF O'Neill	010		Prepare for call with client, communications with A. Stromberg regarding same (.2); call with client and A. Stromberg regarding litigation update and other case status items (.5)	.70
02/15/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review J. Schomberg memo regarding pending UST/FCR legislation (.3); multiple emails with J. Schomberg and A. Stromberg regarding same (.2)	.50
02/15/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review transcripts from precedent cases regarding UST objection (1.1); analysis regarding approach (.9)	2.00
02/15/19	AF O'Neill	001		Office conference with A. Stromberg regarding outline/topics for background in response to UST	.20
02/15/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with B. Warner regarding Plan Supplement including review and comment regarding same (.5); follow-up communications with ACC/FCR regarding filing (.2)	.70
02/15/19	AF O'Neill	010		Review and revise work plan (.5); email to client for review (.1)	.60
02/15/19	AF O'Neill	017		Calls with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding communications with creditors related to cross-defaults including analysis regarding same	.40

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

## Restructuring

<b>Date</b>	<b>Name</b>	<b>Task</b>	<b>Activity</b>	<b>Narrative</b>	<b>Hours</b>
02/15/19	AF O'Neill	007		Continue to work on fee application (.3); emails to M. Byrne and D.J. Lutes regarding same (.1); follow-up communications to M. Byrne regarding same (.1)	.50
02/15/19	J Schomberg	006		Summarize proposed bill regarding FCR appointments (1.0); research and compile case law regarding FCR appointments (3.5)	4.50
02/15/19	AR Stromberg	001		Review and analyze UST objection, caselaw and precedent materials	5.80
02/15/19	BM Warner	010		Analyze emails regarding case administration and notice (.2); review email regarding research summary (.2)	.40
02/15/19	BM Warner	015		Review and revise plan supplement documents (1.7); email to local counsel for filing (.2); revise chapter 11 plan (.3)	2.20
02/16/19	J Schomberg	006		Research case law regarding FCR appointments	2.60
02/16/19	JM Skakun	006		Analyze US Trustee's objection to FCR motion, and transcripts of evidentiary hearings in prior asbestos bankruptcy court challenges to FCR motions in preparation for potential evidentiary hearing and discovery issues	4.20
02/16/19	AR Stromberg	001		Research for reply to UST Objection (2.3); draft outline for same (.8)	3.10
02/17/19	AF O'Neill	006		Continued review of UST objection to J. Patton retention and strategic analysis regarding same	1.50
02/17/19	J Schomberg	006		Research case law regarding FCR appointments	4.60
02/17/19	AR Stromberg	001		Research for reply to UST objection (2.1); draft outline regarding same (.9)	3.00
02/17/19	BM Warner	015		Revise chapter 11 plan (.3); draft proposed findings of fact, conclusions of law and confirmation order (4.0)	4.30
02/18/19	DJ Lutes	007		Prepare 1st monthly fee application materials (.2); call with M. Byrne regarding same (.2)	.40
02/18/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review Zurich language from A. Stromberg and communications regarding next steps (.1); review response from FCR and chart regarding same (.2); discuss Zurich and FFIC with A. Stromberg (.2); analysis regarding same (.1)	.60
02/18/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review case law and precedent regarding UST Objection	4.00

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

## Restructuring

<b>Date</b>	<b>Name</b>	<b>Task</b>	<b>Activity</b>	<b>Narrative</b>	<b>Hours</b>
02/18/19	AF O'Neill	017		Review creditor issues regarding default, communications with J. Schomberg regarding same	.50
02/18/19	AF O'Neill	006		Communications with R. Schepacater (UST) regarding professional retention and next steps	.20
02/18/19	J Schomberg	015		Draft confirmation brief regarding asbestos trust sections (3.2); draft same regarding feasibility (3.8); draft same regarding disclosure statement approval (3.0)	10.00
02/18/19	AR Stromberg	001		Research and draft outline of response to UST FCR Objection (3.2); emails with K.Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding timeline of same (.3); conference with A.O'Neill regarding objection (.3)	3.80
02/18/19	AR Stromberg	015		Draft language for confirmation order regarding Zurich treatment (.6); email client, ACC and FCR regarding same (.2)	.80
02/18/19	BM Warner	015		Draft proposed findings of fact, conclusions of law and confirmation order	7.50
02/19/19	DJ Lutes	007		Prepare monthly fee application materials (1.8); email materials with M. Byrne regarding same (.3); call with A. O'Neill regarding same (.1)	2.20
02/19/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review email from R. Schepacarter (UST) regarding new motion and communications with team and K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding same (.5); review local rule regarding same (.2); call with B. Brady and E. Harron (proposed counsel to FCR) regarding next steps (.4); meet with A. Stromberg regarding impact on response and consider strategic implications of motions to appoint at same hearing (.4); draft email note to C. Anderson (Maremont) and L. Shelko (Company) regarding same and follow-up communications with them regarding same (.3); review motion to appoint from Fairbanks case and debtor response to same (.3); respond to UST regarding motion and motion and request (.5); review responses from other parties (.2); communications regarding staffing with team (.2); call with B. Warner regarding preparing objections to same (.2); review preliminary agenda from K. Stickles (.2)	3.40
02/19/19	AF O'Neill	017		Prepare for call with FCR regarding response (.2) and call with E. Harron and B. Brady (proposed counsel for FCR) and A. Stromberg regarding	.60

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

## Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				approach (.4)	
02/19/19	AF O'Neill	001		Further revise preliminary statement and communications regarding same (.5); meet with A. Stromberg for inclusion in response (.2)	.70
02/19/19	AF O'Neill	001		Prepare comments on certain other sections of response	.80
02/19/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review revised draft of response (.8); email with comments regarding same to client, Cole Schotz and FCR/ACC (.3)	1.10
02/19/19	AF O'Neill	010		Call with B. Eilander (Company) regarding case update	.40
02/19/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review A. Stromberg outline/memo regarding reply to UST with analysis regarding same (1.1); draft background section for reply (1.2)	2.30
02/19/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with B. Eilander (Company) regarding consent agreement for Easley and review same (.2); multiple communications with B. Warner regarding same (.2)	.40
02/19/19	AF O'Neill	001		Meet with A. Stromberg regarding next steps regarding FCR response	.10
02/19/19	AF O'Neill	001		Revise preliminary statement for response	1.20
02/19/19	AF O'Neill	010		Call with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) and A. Stromberg and B. Warner regarding filings and timing regarding same	.50
02/19/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review draft response to UST and analysis regarding same	1.30
02/19/19	AF O'Neill	006		Communications with B. Warner and M. Hutchins (Kasowitz) regarding retention applications	.20
02/19/19	AF O'Neill	001		Communications with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) and team regarding upcoming filings regarding FCR	.20
02/19/19	J Schomberg	015		Draft confirmation brief regarding plan confirmation requirements (3.8); draft same regarding feasibility (.8); prepare same regarding revisions to confirmation brief and cite checking (3.2)	7.80
02/19/19	AR Stromberg	001		Research, review and revise reply to FCR Objection (8.8); call with YCST regarding same (.5)	9.30
02/19/19	AR Stromberg	006		Call with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding	.50

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				retention applications and certificates of no objection	
02/19/19	BM Warner	005		Review and analyze consent to assignment regarding executory contract (.2); correspondence with A. O'Neill regarding same (.3)	.50
02/19/19	BM Warner	006		Revise and finalize Kasowitz supplemental declaration and circulate to A. O'Neill, A. Stromberg and M. Hutchins (Kasowitz) for review (.6); correspond with A. Stromberg and A. O'Neill regarding UST retention correspondence (.5)	1.10
02/19/19	BM Warner	015		Draft proposed findings of fact, conclusions of law and confirmation order	5.60
02/19/19	BM Warner	009		Call with A. O'Neill, A. Stromberg and local counsel regarding reply strategy and case status (.8); research and draft objection to motion to shorten (2.7)	3.50
02/19/19	BM Warner	017		Correspond with counsel regarding pension plan inquiry	.30
02/20/19	DJ Lutes	007		Prepare monthly fee application materials (1.6); email materials and comments to M. Byrne regarding same (.2)	1.80
02/20/19	DJ Lutes	010		Research docket and incoming key pleadings, responses, replies and objections (.2); prepare summaries and electronic materials regarding same (.3)	.50
02/20/19	AF O'Neill	001		Email update to client regarding new filings	.20
02/20/19	AF O'Neill	001		Further communications with team and K. Stickles regarding filings, arguments and sequencing	.50
02/20/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with FCR/ACC regarding new pleadings and approach	.40
02/20/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review ACC response to UST Objection	.30
02/20/19	AF O'Neill	001		Communications with J. Skakun and B. Warner regarding approach (.2); review A. Stromberg summaries of UST candidate and analysis regarding same (.5); review status and developing strategic points regarding same (.4)	1.10
02/20/19	AF O'Neill	006		Call with M. Fink (counsel to ACC) regarding retainers	.20
02/20/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review further UST pleadings including strategic analysis for same	2.00



SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

## Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
02/20/19	AF O'Neill	001		Multiple emails with K. Stickles and P. Ratkowiak (Cole Schotz) regarding COC/CNOs for retentions and review same	.40
02/20/19	AF O'Neill	009		Communications with J. Holgado (PACE) regarding FFIC payment	.10
02/20/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review various comments to FCR Reply (.5); multiple communications with A. Stromberg regarding same (.4); further revise draft of same and finalize for filing (2.3)	3.20
02/20/19	AF O'Neill	017		Call with proposed counsel to FCR regarding reply and strategy for hearing	.30
02/20/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review set of documents and forward on to A. Rovira and J. Skakun regarding review	.30
02/20/19	AF O'Neill	001		Provide additional comments to A. Stromberg regarding certain sections to reply	.40
02/20/19	J Schomberg	015		Draft confirmation brief regarding plan confirmation requirements (1.5); revise and cite check same (8.5)	10.00
02/20/19	J Schomberg	001		Cite check and revise Reply to UST FCR Objection	5.10
02/20/19	JM Skakun	006		Review draft reply to US Trustee objection to Debtors' FCR motion, and send comments to A. O'Neill and A. Stromberg (1.3); analyze US Trustee FCR motion and motion to shorten (.5); confer with B. Warner regarding strategy for response (.3); analyze and revise draft objection to motion to shorten from B. Warner (3.5)	5.60
02/20/19	AR Stromberg	001		Call with YCST regarding reply in support of FCR Motion (.4); review and revise FCR Reply and supporting materials (3.2); review and analyze UST Motion and Motion to Shorten (2.5)	6.10
02/20/19	BM Warner	006		Review emails from A. O'Neill and A. Stromberg and confer with J. Schomberg regarding FCR reply and motion (.3); analyze and revise reply to UST FCR appointment motion (3.1); draft compendium regarding same and finalize for filing (1.5); draft and revise objection to motion to shorten (5.1); meeting with J. Skakun regarding same (.3)	10.30
02/20/19	BM Warner	015		Continue to draft proposed findings of fact, conclusions of law and confirmation order (3.0); confer with A. Stromberg regarding same (.5)	3.50

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
 Maremont Corporation

## Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
02/21/19	DJ Lutes	007		Prepare fee application materials (.5); emails with A. O'Neill regarding same (.1); communications with M. Byrne regarding same (.3)	.90
02/21/19	DJ Lutes	006		Review incoming key professional retention and FCR pleadings, orders and notices (.8); prepare electronic files for Sidley team regarding same (.7)	1.50
02/21/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review draft objection to motion to shorten and provide preliminary comments regarding same (.5); follow-up communications with J. Skakun and B. Warner regarding finalizing same (.2)	.70
02/21/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review agenda from K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) and communications with K. Stickles regarding timing of objections (.3); review revised form of objection from B. Warner and comment regarding same (.5)	.80
02/21/19	AF O'Neill	001		Call with E. Harron (proposed FCR counsel) regarding strategy for hearing	.20
02/21/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review further comments from J. Skakun on draft and incorporate same	.30
02/21/19	AF O'Neill	001		Launch draft objection for review	.20
02/21/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review comments and communications from client and K. Stickles	.30
02/21/19	AF O'Neill	001		Call with E. Harron and B. Brady (proposed FCR counsel) regarding objection, ACC objection, next steps and analysis regarding same	.30
02/21/19	AF O'Neill	001		Finalize objection for filing (.2); communications with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding same (.1)	.30
02/21/19	AF O'Neill	017		Review ACC objection and call with M. Fink (counsel to ACC) regarding same next steps	.40
02/21/19	AF O'Neill	001		Multiple follow-up communications with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) about potential FCR outcomes and analyze same (.5); analyze related preparation streams (.3)	.80
02/21/19	AF O'Neill	001		Communications with J. Schomberg regarding case law summaries and other hearing preparation	.20
02/21/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with A. Stromberg regarding FFIC and Zurich (.2); preliminary review of draft objection from FFIC (.2); consider approach with insurers in context of confirmation (.2)	.60
02/21/19	AF O'Neill	007		Review draft January bill (.1); communications with DJ Lutes and M. Byrne regarding same and	.30

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				launch to C. Anderson (Maremont) for client review (.2)	
02/21/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review D and O insurance issues	.20
02/21/19	AF O'Neill	013		Review Delaware secretary of state forms from company and comment on same	.20
02/21/19	AF O'Neill	001		Prepare for potential telephonic hearing on motion to shorten and process (.5), review pleadings in connection with same (.4)	.90
02/21/19	AF O'Neill	001		Begin drafting preliminary statement for Debtors objection (.5); analyze objection to UST Motion to appoint on FCR (.3)	.80
02/21/19	AF O'Neill	006		Communications with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) and B. Warner regarding drafting of retention orders and inquiries regarding motion to shorten	.20
02/21/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review order for motion to shorten (.1); email update to client (.2); analysis of implications for process and cases (.6); call with A. Stromberg regarding same (.3); communications with team regarding next steps and with ACC/FCR regarding call on approach to telephonic hearing (.7)	1.90
02/21/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review revised agenda for 2/25 hearing and provide comments regarding same	.20
02/21/19	J Schomberg	015		Make confirmation brief revisions and perform cite checks	.50
02/21/19	JM Skakun	006		Analyze ACC objection to US Trustee's motion to shorten	.20
02/21/19	JM Skakun	006		Analyze precedent objections to US Trustee's FCR motion	.50
02/21/19	JM Skakun	006		Analyze agenda and strategy for 2/25 hearing and 3/8 hearing regarding FCR motions, including strategy for objections and factual record evidence	.50
02/21/19	JM Skakun	006		Analyze A. O'Neill comments on draft objection to US Trustee's motion to shorten, as well as comments from local counsel and FCR counsel, and revise draft objection accordingly	1.20
02/21/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review potential FFIC plan objection (.7); email counsel to Zurich regarding confirmation language (.3)	1.00
02/21/19	AR Stromberg	001		Review objection to motion to shorten and outline substantive objection (2.6); review scheduling	2.90

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

## Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				order (.3)	
02/21/19	BM Warner	009		Revise objection to motion to shorten (1); correspondence with local counsel, A. O'Neill and J. Skakun regarding same (.3)	1.30
02/21/19	BM Warner	015		Draft proposed findings of fact, conclusions of law and confirmation order	6.60
02/21/19	BM Warner	009		Correspondence regarding pleadings and case status	.30
02/22/19	DJ Lutes	007		Prepare monthly fee application materials (2.1); review procedures order regarding same (.2); review fee application exhibits (.4)	2.70
02/22/19	DJ Lutes	010		Review docket for key pleadings, orders and notices (.3); prepare electronic materials regarding same (.1)	.40
02/22/19	AF O'Neill	001		Emails with C. Anderson (Maremont) regarding hearing (.2); emails with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding approach to FCR (.2)	.40
02/22/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications to Sidley team regarding insurance objection and next steps	.20
02/22/19	AF O'Neill	001		Analysis of FCR appointment issues (.9); prepare for meetings regarding same (.6)	1.50
02/22/19	AF O'Neill	001		Preliminary review of appellate brief from Duro Dyne (.3); communications with J. Skakun regarding same (.2)	.50
02/22/19	AF O'Neill	001		Meet with J. Skakun and A. Stromberg regarding FCR litigation strategy (call with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) in part) (.3); call with ACC/FCR, K. Stickles and A. Stromberg/J. Skakun regarding approach for teleconference (1.0); follow-up call with K. Stickles and team regarding same (.2); call with Carl Anderson (Maremont) regarding approach (.3); and draft summary to chart regarding same (.2)	2.00
02/22/19	J Schomberg	016		Draft summaries for hearing regarding cases cited in UST FCR motion	2.60
02/22/19	J Schomberg	001		Confer with A. Stromberg regarding objection to UST FCR motion	.70
02/22/19	JM Skakun	006		Analyze confidentiality and privilege issues to answer question from A. O'Neill	.50
02/22/19	JM Skakun	006		Confer with H. Sultanian regarding FCR motion research and vetting UST FCR candidates (.4);	.50

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				review materials regarding same (.1)	
02/22/19	JM Skakun	006		Prepare for (.5) and confer with A. O'Neill, A. Stromberg, local counsel, ACC counsel, and FCR counsel regarding strategy for upcoming hearing and motion, and potential discovery issues (1.0)	1.50
02/22/19	JM Skakun	006		Analyze strategy for discovery and record on appeal for FCR issue (.5); analyze Duro Dyne materials (.7)	1.20
02/22/19	AR Stromberg	015		Comment on draft confirmation order (.7); review materials regarding same (.5)	1.20
02/22/19	AR Stromberg	001		Conference with J.Schomberg regarding objection to FCR motion (.4); conference with A.O'Neill and J.Skakun regarding FCR Motions (1.0); call with ACC and YCST regarding same (.5); review and analyze issues relating to FCR appointment (1.1)	3.00
02/22/19	HB Sultanian	006		Meet with J. Skakun regarding strategy concerning FCR candidates (.4); Review pleadings regarding FCR appointment (1.0)	1.40
02/23/19	J Schomberg	001		Continue to draft objection to UST FCR motion	2.30
02/23/19	JM Skakun	006		Analyze Duro Dyne and Fairbanks materials regarding FCR arguments, including Duro Dyne district court appeal brief and Fairbanks objection to US Trustee FCR motion (1.9); analyze strategy for responding to US Trustee FCR motion filed on 2/20/19 (.6)	2.50
02/24/19	AF O'Neill	001		Prepare strategy for hearing	.50
02/24/19	J Schomberg	001		Draft objection to UST FCR motion	2.00
02/24/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review draft confirmation order (2.3); provide comments on same (2.0)	4.30
02/24/19	HB Sultanian	006		Review pleadings regarding FCR appointment.	2.00
02/25/19	DJ Lutes	007		Prepare 1st monthly fee application materials (.8); email to B. Warner regarding same (.1)	.90
02/25/19	DJ Lutes	010		Analyze incoming key pleadings, notices and orders (.2); prepare electronic materials regarding same (.2)	.40
02/25/19	AF O'Neill	017		Calls with E. Harron (FCR) and N. Ramsey (ACC) considering options for approach	.80
02/25/19	AF O'Neill	015		Call with A. Rovira regarding status and next steps with Plan documents	.20

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

## Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
02/25/19	AF O'Neill	001		Call with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding hearing approach and communications with UST office regarding same	.30
02/25/19	AF O'Neill	001		Communications with J. Skakun and A. Stromberg regarding hearing (.7); prepare comments for hearing (.4)	1.10
02/25/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with B. Eilander (Company) regarding update call topics	.10
02/25/19	AF O'Neill	001		Meet with J. Skakun and A. Stromberg prior to hearing to discuss approach	.20
02/25/19	AF O'Neill	013		Communications with B. Warner regarding environmental sites and record regarding next steps	.20
02/25/19	AF O'Neill	009		Communications with L. Shelko (Company) regarding account activity and related issues	.20
02/25/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review draft stipulation from A. Stromberg for issues for hearing (.3); comment on same (.1); follow-up communications regarding same/review J. Skakun comments regarding same (.2); consider issues for ACC/FCR related to stipulation and timing for same (.2)	.80
02/25/19	AF O'Neill	010		Call with client regarding hearing and next steps	.50
02/25/19	AF O'Neill	017		Review comments from FCR, ACC and K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) on draft stipulation (.2); respond to same regarding same (.1)	.30
02/25/19	AF O'Neill	016		Attend telephonic hearing on FCR appointment process	.50
02/25/19	AF O'Neill	017		Calls with E. Harron (FCR) and N. Ramsey (ACC) in part and with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) in part regarding outcome of hearing	.50
02/25/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with M. Fink (counsel to ACC) regarding confidentiality provisions and review same	.20
02/25/19	AF O'Neill	001		Further review of stipulation, analysis of deposition timing and issue (.3); office conference with A. Stromberg regarding same (.2); revise redline of same (.1); further communications regarding Fairbanks issues and analysis regarding same (.2)	.80
02/25/19	AR Rovira	015		Review draft confirmation brief	1.50
02/25/19	J Schomberg	001		Review objection to UST FCR motion (.3);	2.00

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

## Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				research precedent case law regarding plan objections based on TDPs (1.7)	
02/25/19	J Schomberg	010		Research for amended agenda and email same internally	.10
02/25/19	JM Skakun	016		Attend status hearing regarding FCR motion process	.50
02/25/19	JM Skakun	006		Prepare for status hearing regarding FCR motion process and potential discovery with A. O'Neill, A. Stromberg, and B. Warner (0.7); review draft stipulation regarding procedures for FCR motion discovery and 3/8 hearing and review comments from FCR counsel, ACC counsel, and local counsel regarding same (0.2); prepare and confer with H. Sultanian regarding preparing for US Trustee FCR candidate depositions, focusing on key topics (0.9)	1.80
02/25/19	AR Stromberg	015		Prepare draft confirmation order	3.20
02/25/19	AR Stromberg	001		Conference with YCST and ACC regarding UST Motion (.4); conference with A. O'Neill, J. Skakun and B. Warner regarding FCR motion response (.7); draft stipulation regarding FCR Motions (2.6); research potential objections to UST motion (1.7)	5.40
02/25/19	AR Stromberg	016		Participate in telephonic status hearing	.50
02/25/19	HB Sultanian	006		Review pleadings regarding FCR appointment (3.2); meet with J. Skakun regarding discovery into FCR candidates (.3); draft outline for depositions of FCR candidates (2.3)	5.80
02/25/19	BM Warner	016		Prepare for telephonic status hearing attendance (.2); attend telephonic status hearing regarding scheduling and confirmation issues (.5)	.70
02/25/19	BM Warner	015		Prepare proposed findings of fact, conclusions of law, and confirmation order (6.3); correspondence with A. Stromberg regarding revisions (.4)	6.70
02/25/19	BM Warner	015		Analyze emails regarding case status and strategy (.3); revise work plan (.5); analyze plan and exhibits regarding environmental issue (.2); confer with counsel regarding same (.2)	1.20
02/26/19	ST Advani	014		Telephone conference with company tax team regarding qualified settlement fund issues (.30); prep for same (.10)	.40
02/26/19	ST Advani	014		Telephone conference with A. O'Neill regarding	.20

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631

Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

<b>Date</b>	<b>Name</b>	<b>Task</b>	<b>Activity</b>	<b>Narrative</b>	<b>Hours</b>
				status of tax analysis	
02/26/19	DJ Lutes	007		Prepare 1st monthly fee application materials (2.1); emails to Sidley team regarding expense materials (.2)	2.30
02/26/19	DJ Lutes	010		Analyze incoming key pleadings, notices and orders (.2); prepare electronic materials regarding same (.1)	.30
02/26/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review J. Grier credentials (.1); communications with team regarding same (.2)	.30
02/26/19	AF O'Neill	017		Call with E. Harron (FCR) regarding FFIC settlement issues and next steps regarding FCR Motion including follow-up communications regarding same	.30
02/26/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with C. Anderson (Maremont) regarding hearing logistics	.10
02/26/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review Plan confirmation documents from B. Warner (.3); analysis regarding same (.2)	.50
02/26/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review response from R. Shepacarter (UST) on discovery stipulation and analysis regarding same	.30
02/26/19	AF O'Neill	001		Call with M. Fink (ACC) regarding stipulation and next steps for hearing discovery(.3); follow-up with K. Stickle (Cole Schotz) and A. Stromberg regarding same and process with UST (.3); communications with A. Stromberg and J. Skakkun regarding UST candidates, interview logistics and analysis regarding same (.4)	1.00
02/26/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review FFIC draft plan objection (.2); prepare for negotiations regarding same (.3); communications with ACC regarding same (.3)	.80
02/26/19	AF O'Neill	014		Call with S. Advani regarding plan tax issues	.20
02/26/19	AR Rovira	015		Review precedents and draft confirmation brief (2.1); mark with comments (.9)	3.00
02/26/19	J Schomberg	001		Research precedent FCR appointment applications (.3); monitor and review Duro Dyne docket for confirmation brief and order for internal circulation (.3); research and distribute precedent TDPs (.3)	.90
02/26/19	J Schomberg	017		Confer via telephone with former employee regarding bankruptcy questions and retirement impact	.20
02/26/19	JM Skakun	006		Analyze draft FCR candidate deposition outline from H. Sultanian, including preparing and	2.00



SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				conferring with her regarding revisions (1.6); review revised draft (.4)	
02/26/19	AR Stromberg	015		Prepare draft confirmation order	.90
02/26/19	AR Stromberg	001		Research factual and legal arguments regarding UST motion (4.9); draft objection to UST motion (2.3)	7.20
02/26/19	HB Sultanian	006		Meet with J. Skakun regarding preparation for depositions of FCR candidates (.3); Draft outline for depositions of FCR candidates (3.3).	3.60
02/26/19	BM Warner	015		Prepare proposed findings of fact, conclusions of law, confirmation order and modified plan (6.2); confer and strategize with A. Stromberg regarding plan and confirmation order revisions (1.0)	7.20
02/26/19	BM Warner	010		Correspond with Sidley, local counsel, FCR and ACC regarding update call	.20
02/27/19	DJ Lutes	007		Prepare monthly fee application materials (3.1); review monthly fee application issues (.9); emails with E. Branton regarding same (.1)	4.10
02/27/19	DJ Lutes	010		Review incoming key pleadings, notices and orders	.20
02/27/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review M. Fink (ACC) comments on stipulation and consider strategy with UST (.2); email comments to team and FCR counsel regarding same (.1); futher communications with E. Harron (FCR) and J. Skakun regarding same (.3)	.50
02/27/19	AF O'Neill	001		Meet with J. Skakun and A. Stromberg regarding discovery issues (.5); call with ACC and FCR regarding same (.3); and post-meeting with team regarding next steps (.1)	.90
02/27/19	AF O'Neill	001		Multiple communications with J. Skakun regarding approach with UST candidates, advice regarding same (.3); review communications with Connelly and Grier and communications with ACC/FCR regarding same (.2)	.50
02/27/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review revised stipulation and comment on same (.2); communications with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) and A. Stromberg regarding same (.1)	.30
02/27/19	AF O'Neill	015		Multiple communications with team regarding plan objections (.4); review A. Rovira preliminary comments to confirmation brief (.3)	.70
02/27/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review preliminary interview/deposition outline	.50

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

## Restructuring

<b>Date</b>	<b>Name</b>	<b>Task</b>	<b>Activity</b>	<b>Narrative</b>	<b>Hours</b>
				(.3); comment on same (.2)	
02/27/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review precedent UST confirmation objections (.7); analysis regarding same (.4)	1.10
02/27/19	AF O'Neill	005		Communications with FCR/ACC regarding lease assumption	.10
02/27/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review P. Abelman materials	.30
02/27/19	AF O'Neill	006		Communications regarding Duro Dyne precedent and new pleadings with J. Schomberg (.5); review materials regarding same (.7)	1.20
02/27/19	AF O'Neill	001		Further communications analysis regarding UST response on the FCR issues	.30
02/27/19	AF O'Neill	017		Prepare for call with FFIC (.1); call with E. Harron (FCR) and R. Brady (FCR) and L. Davis (FFIC) and A. Stromberg regarding FFIC Plan treatment (.4); and follow-up call with E. Harron and R. Brady (FCR) regarding same (.1)	.60
02/27/19	AR Rovira	015		Review draft Fireman's objection and provide comments (1.5); review Duro Dyne FCR objection, summary responses and consider for confirmation brief (2.5)	4.00
02/27/19	J Schomberg	001		Research Duro Dyne docket for confirmation brief and order for internal circulation (.3); summarize interesting takeaways regarding same (.5)	.80
02/27/19	J Schomberg	015		Confer with B. Warner regarding confirmation brief (.2); revise confirmation brief regarding same (3.5)	3.50
02/27/19	JM Skakun	006		Review initial and further comments on draft FCR appointment procedures stipulation from ACC counsel, and correspond with A. O'Neill and A. Stromberg regarding same (0.5); prepare and confer with A. O'Neill, A. Stromberg, FCR counsel, and ACC counsel regarding FCR appointment strategy and procedures (0.6); analyze deposition strategy for UST FCR candidates and revise general outline of key questions for all candidates (1.7); correspond with A. O'Neill, A. Stromberg, ACC counsel, and FCR counsel regarding same (.4); analyze Ableman Declaration and supplementary materials filed by UST and implications for deposition (1.9); correspond with A. O'Neill, A. Stromberg, and H. Sultanian regarding same (.4)	5.50

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

## Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
02/27/19	AR Stromberg	015		Call with counsel to FFIC and YCST regarding treatment of FFIC Agreement (.4); review and analyze potential plan objections (.8)	1.20
02/27/19	AR Stromberg	001		Call with A. O'Neill, J. Skakun, ACC and YCST regarding stipulation with UST and objection to motion (.5); conference with J. Skakun and A. O'Neill regarding objection (.5); review and revise stipulation with UST (1.0); research and draft objection to UST motion for appointment of FCR (6.0)	8.00
02/27/19	HB Sultanian	006		Draft outline for depositions of FCR candidates	1.90
02/27/19	BM Warner	015		Analyze precedent case regarding confirmation pleadings (.3); correspond with J. Schomberg regarding declaration, confirmation brief and revised order (1.3); confer with A. Stromberg regarding plan and confirmation tasks (.2); research for confirmation brief (3.1); revise brief regarding same (2.6); draft FCR declaration memorandum (.3)	7.80
02/27/19	BM Warner	001		Communications with A. O'Neill, J. Skakun, A. Stromberg, FCR and ACC regarding case status and FCR objection	.70
02/28/19	DJ Lutes	007		Prepare monthly fee application materials (.5); review monthly fee application issues (.4); emails with M. Byrne and A. O'Neill regarding same (.1)	1.00
02/28/19	DJ Lutes	001		Prepare FCR materials for electronic files (.2); review materials regarding same (.2)	.40
02/28/19	AF O'Neill	015		Analysis of open plan issues	.50
02/28/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review form of draft objections from A. Stromberg (.3); analyze approach and provide initial comments (.7)	1.00
02/28/19	AF O'Neill	001		Draft outline of preliminary statement for Plan brief, full draft of same and edit same (.9); communications with A. Stromberg and J. Skakun regarding process for finalizing draft for delivery to client (.4)	1.30
02/28/19	AF O'Neill	001		Multiple communications with UST, UST candidates, ACC and FCR and team regarding proposed candidates and process (.4); analyze issues regarding same and office conference with A. Stromberg regarding same and next steps (.2)	.60
02/28/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with B. Eilander (Company)	.20

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				regarding weekly call (.1); call with T. Chirillo (Company) regarding payment of ongoing environmental issues (.1)	
02/28/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review memo to FCR regarding potential evidentiary support for Plan including analysis regarding same	.30
02/28/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review draft form of confirmation order (.3) ; comment regarding same (.2)	.50
02/28/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review motion/reply regarding Patton for preparation for filing and depositions	1.00
02/28/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review comments to objection from J. Skakun (.2); comment on same (.3)	.50
02/28/19	AF O'Neill	007		Communications with M. Byrne, D. Lutes and B. Warner regarding upcoming fee applications	.20
02/28/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review trustee motion to amend, analysis and communications regarding same	.20
02/28/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review J. Skakun comments to preliminary statement (1.3); revised draft of pleading from A. Stromberg (.9); provide comments regarding clean, revised draft (1.1)	3.30
02/28/19	AF O'Neill	001		Multiple communications with Sidley team regarding depositions and strategy (.3); communications with J. Skakun regarding same (.2)	.50
02/28/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with Zurich issuance and review language and Plan and communications with A. Stromberg regarding same (.3); follow-up with ACC regarding same (.1)	.40
02/28/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review final changes to draft objection from B. Warner and make tweaks to same (.2); communications with team regarding same (.2); launch documents to clerk and local counsel for comment (.1)	.50
02/28/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review confirmation order for issues and analysis regarding same	1.00
02/28/19	AF O'Neill	001		Further communications regarding next steps for discovery and regarding strategic dynamics regarding FCR papers	.30
02/28/19	AF O'Neill	001		Follow-up communications with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) and J. Skakun regarding disinterestedness issues and steps regarding same (.3); analysis	.60

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
 Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

<b>Date</b>	<b>Name</b>	<b>Task</b>	<b>Activity</b>	<b>Narrative</b>	<b>Hours</b>
				regarding deposition testimony and questions (.3)	
02/28/19	J Schomberg	015		Revise confirmation brief to incorporate A. Rovira general edits (2.0); revise confirmation brief to incorporate B. Warner edits on solicitation (3.1); revise confirmation brief to incorporate B. Warner general edits (2.0); revise confirmation brief to incorporate B. Warner edits on asbestos discussion and conforming brief to order (4.0)	11.10
02/28/19	JM Skakun	006		Various correspondence with P. Ableman counsel, D. Connolly, A. O'Neill, ACC counsel, and FCR counsel regarding UST FCR candidate depositions (1.0); analyze first and revised drafts of objection to UST FCR motion (2.1); and correspond with A. O'Neill and A. Stromberg regarding comments (.6); analysis based on communications received from UST regarding withdrawing two FCR candidates (.5)	4.20
02/28/19	AR Stromberg	001		Prepare objection to UST motion to appoint FCR	3.50
02/28/19	AR Stromberg	015		Prepare sections of confirmation order	1.00
02/28/19	HB Sultanian	006		Revise outline for depositions of FCR candidates.	.20
02/28/19	BM Warner	009		Revise objection to UST FCR motion	1.60
02/28/19	BM Warner	015		Research plan treatment regarding claims (.5); revise confirmation order and plan (1.0); draft Anderson confirmation declaration (5.1)	6.60
				<b>Total Hours</b>	<b>731.50</b>

**Exhibit B**

**Expense Detail**

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

## EXPENSE DETAIL

<b>Date</b>	<b>Narrative</b>	<b>Amount</b>
01/25/19	01/22/19-01/23/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Jan 09, 2019 - John M. Skakun, III - One way economy airfare from Chicago to Philadelphia on 1/22/19 in connection with travel to Philadelphia and Wilmington for the Maremont Bankruptcy First Day Hearing. - United Airlines	\$328.46
01/25/19	01/22/19-01/23/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Jan 23, 2019 - John M. Skakun, III - One way economy airfare from Philadelphia to Chicago on 1/23/19 in connection with travel to Philadelphia and Wilmington for the Maremont Bankruptcy First Day Hearing. - American Airlines	346.30
01/25/19	01/22/19-01/23/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Jan 22, 2019 - John M. Skakun, III - Taxi/Car Service from residence to O'Hare airport on 1/22/19 in connection with travel to Philadelphia and Wilmington for the Maremont Bankruptcy First Day Hearing.	31.66
01/25/19	01/22/19-01/23/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Jan 23, 2019 - John M. Skakun, III - Taxi/Car Service from O'Hare airport to residence on 1/23/19 in connection with travel to Philadelphia and Wilmington for the Maremont Bankruptcy First Day Hearing.	50.31
01/25/19	01/22/19-01/23/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Jan 23, 2019 - John M. Skakun, III - Hotel - Breakfast for one attendee at hotel on 1/23/19 in connection with travel to Philadelphia and Wilmington for the Maremont Bankruptcy First Day Hearing. - Hotel DuPont	33.20
01/25/19	01/22/19-01/23/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Jan 23, 2019 - John M. Skakun, III - Lodging for one night in Wilmington on 1/22/19 includes \$359 room rate, \$28.72 State tax and \$7.18 City tax in connection with travel to Philadelphia and Wilmington for the Maremont Bankruptcy First Day Hearing. - Hotel DuPont	394.90
01/31/19	01/25/19 - Williams Lea - 0000905437-000 Reprographics	127.54
02/04/19	01/22/19-01/23/19 Chicago to New Philadelphia - Jan 04, 2019 - Andrew F. O'Neill - One way economy airfare from Chicago to Philadelphia on 1/22/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: first day hearing - American Airlines	328.46
02/04/19	01/22/19-01/23/19 Chicago to New Philadelphia - Jan 23, 2019 - Andrew F. O'Neill - One way economy airfare from Philadelphia to Chicago on 1/23/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: first day hearing - American Airlines	346.30
02/04/19	01/22/19-01/23/19 Chicago to New Philadelphia - Jan 23, 2019 - Andrew F. O'Neill - Economy Plus Fee from Philadelphia to Chicago in connection with travel to Delaware re: first day hearing - American Airlines	21.21
02/04/19	01/22/19-01/23/19 Chicago to New Philadelphia - Jan 23, 2019 - Blair M. Warner - Economy Plus Fee from Philadelphia to Chicago on 1/23/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: first day hearing - American Airlines	21.21

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631

Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

<b>Date</b>	<b>Narrative</b>	<b>Amount</b>
02/04/19	01/22/19-01/23/19 Chicago to New Philadelphia - Jan 09, 2019 - Blair M. Warner - One way economy airfare from Chicago to Philadelphia on 1/22/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: first day hearing - American Airlines	328.46
02/04/19	01/22/19-01/23/19 Chicago to New Philadelphia - Jan 23, 2019 - Blair M. Warner - One way economy airfare from Philadelphia to Chicago on 1/23/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: first day hearing - American Airlines	346.30
02/04/19	01/22/19-01/23/19 Chicago to New Philadelphia - Jan 22, 2019 - Blair M. Warner - Taxi/Car Service from Chicago office to residence on 1/22/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: first day hearing	30.74
02/04/19	01/22/19-01/23/19 Chicago to New Philadelphia - Jan 22, 2019 - Blair M. Warner - Taxi/Car Service from residence to O'Hare airport in connection with travel to Delaware re: first day hearing	29.74
02/04/19	01/22/19-01/23/19 Chicago to New Philadelphia - Jan 23, 2019 - Andrew F. O'Neill - Meals Other/lunch meeting after hearing for 4 attendees in Wilmington on 1/23/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: first day hearing. (Attendees include: Andrew F. O'Neill - Kate Stickle - Blair M. Warner - John M. Skakun, III)	50.00
02/04/19	01/22/19-01/23/19 Chicago to New Philadelphia - Jan 22, 2019 - Andrew F. O'Neill - Meals Other/evening meeting prior to hearing for 4 attendees at Wilmington hotel on 1/22/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: first day hearing - Hotel Dupont (Attendees include: Andrew F. O'Neill - Carl Anderson - Blair M. Warner - John M. Skakun, III)	64.00
02/04/19	01/22/19-01/23/19 Chicago to New Philadelphia - Jan 23, 2019 - Andrew F. O'Neill - Hotel - Breakfast for one attendee at Wilmington hotel on 1/23/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: first day hearing - Hotel DuPont (Breakfast meal was voluntarily reduced from \$47 to \$30)	30.00
02/04/19	01/22/19-01/23/19 Chicago to New Philadelphia - Jan 22, 2019 - Blair M. Warner - Meals Other/convenience water for one attendee at O'Hare airport prior to flight on 1/22/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: first day hearing	4.16
02/04/19	01/22/19-01/23/19 Chicago to New Philadelphia - Jan 23, 2019 - Blair M. Warner - Hotel - Breakfast for one attendee at hotel in Wilmington on 1/23/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: first day hearing - Hotel DuPont	8.20
02/04/19	01/22/19-01/23/19 Chicago to New Philadelphia - Jan 23, 2019 - Blair M. Warner - Hotel - Dinner for one attendee at hotel in Wilmington on 1/22/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: first day hearing - Hotel DuPont	23.20
02/04/19	01/22/19-01/23/19 Chicago to New Philadelphia - Jan 23, 2019 - Andrew F. O'Neill - Lodging for one night in Wilmington on 1/23/19 includes \$359 room rate, \$28.72 State tax and \$7.18 City tax in connection with travel to Delaware re: first day hearing - Hotel DuPont	394.90
02/04/19	01/22/19-01/23/19 Chicago to New Philadelphia - Jan 22, 2019 - Andrew F. O'Neill - Internet service charge to work while flying on 1/22/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: first day hearing	12.99



SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

<b>Date</b>	<b>Narrative</b>	<b>Amount</b>
02/04/19	01/22/19-01/23/19 Chicago to New Philadelphia - Jan 23, 2019 - Andrew F. O'Neill - Internet service charge to work while flying on 1/23/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: first day hearing	10.00
02/04/19	01/22/19-01/23/19 Chicago to New Philadelphia - Jan 22, 2019 - Blair M. Warner - Internet service charge to work while flying on 1/22/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: first day hearing	12.99
02/04/19	01/22/19-01/23/19 Chicago to New Philadelphia - Jan 23, 2019 - Blair M. Warner - Internet service charge to work while flying on 1/23/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: first day hearing	12.00
02/04/19	01/22/19-01/23/19 Chicago to New Philadelphia - Jan 23, 2019 - Blair M. Warner - Lodging for one night in Wilmington on 1/23/19 includes \$359 room rate, \$28.72 State tax and \$7.18 City tax in connection with travel to Delaware re: first day hearing - Hotel DuPont	394.90
02/22/19	02/14/19 - Williams Lea - 0000910282-000 Reprographics	7.59
02/27/19	02/04/19-02/04/19 Chicago to New Philadelphia - Jan 24, 2019 - Andrew F. O'Neill - One way economy airfare from Chicago to Philadelphia on 2/4/19 in connection with travel to/from Delaware for IDI and creditors committee formation meeting - United Airlines	346.30
02/27/19	02/04/19-02/04/19 Chicago to New Philadelphia - Jan 24, 2019 - Andrew F. O'Neill - One way economy airfare from Philadelphia to Chicago in connection with travel to/from Delaware for IDI and creditors committee formation meeting - United Airlines	328.46
02/27/19	02/04/19-02/04/19 Chicago to New Philadelphia - Feb 04, 2019 - Andrew F. O'Neill - Taxi/Car Service from Philadelphia airport to Wilmington on 2/4/19 in connection with travel to/from Delaware for IDI and creditors committee formation meeting	72.24
02/27/19	02/04/19-02/04/19 Chicago to New Philadelphia - Feb 04, 2019 - Andrew F. O'Neill - Taxi/Car Service from Wilmington to Philadelphia on 2/4/19 in connection with travel to/from Delaware for IDI and creditors committee formation meeting	40.57
02/27/19	02/04/19-02/04/19 Chicago to New Philadelphia - Feb 04, 2019 - Andrew F. O'Neill - Taxi/Car Service from O'Hare airport to residence on 2/4/19 in connection with travel to/from Delaware for IDI and creditors committee formation meeting	71.12
02/27/19	02/04/19-02/04/19 Chicago to New Philadelphia - Feb 04, 2019 - Andrew F. O'Neill - Taxi/Car Service from residence to O'Hare airport on 2/4/19 in connection with travel to/from Delaware for IDI and creditors committee formation meeting	59.74
02/27/19	02/04/19-02/04/19 Chicago to New Philadelphia - Feb 04, 2019 - Andrew F. O'Neill - Taxi/Car Service from residence to O'Hare airport on 2/4/19 in connection with travel to/from Delaware for IDI and creditors committee formation meeting (cancel fee)	5.00

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39008631  
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

<b>Date</b>	<b>Narrative</b>	<b>Amount</b>
02/27/19	02/04/19-02/04/19 Chicago to New Philadelphia - Feb 04, 2019 - Andrew F. O'Neill - Breakfast for one attendee at O'Hare airport on 2/4/19 in connection with travel to/from Delaware for IDI and creditors committee formation meeting	16.78
<b>Total</b>		<b>\$4,729.93</b>