

EXHIBIT A

Fee Statement

Robinson+Cole

DELIVERED BY EMAIL: mfink@rc.com

MAREMONT CORPORATION, OFFICIAL COMMITTEE
ATTN: PERRY BROWDER
CHAIR OF THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF ASBESTOS
CREDITORS
C/O SIMMONS HANLY CONROY
ONE COURT STREET
ALTON, IL 62002

March 7, 2019
Invoice 50269612

File # 38116.0001
Official Committee

Invoice Summary and Remittance Advice

Invoice attached and payable upon receipt

Please return this page or include invoice number with your remittance to:

Mailing Instructions

ROBINSON & COLE LLP
280 Trumbull Street
Hartford, CT 06103-3597

TEL # (860) 275-8200
FAX # (860) 275-8299
FEDERAL ID # 06-0512640

Wire Transfer Instructions

Bank of America
185 Asylum Street
Hartford, CT 06103

ABA Wire Routing # - 026009593
ACH Routing # - 011900254
Checking Account # - 000000154546

SUMMARY FOR INVOICE 50269612

Fees for Legal Services	\$ 99,152.00
Disbursements	466.61
Total Current Billing For this Matter	\$ 99,618.61

For Services through February 28, 2019

File # 38116.0001
Official Committee

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Phase -			
Task OCAC001 - CASE ADMIN & BUSNSS OPER-OFFCL CMTEE ASBESTOS CRDTRS			
02/04/19	L. A. Krepto	Reviewing bankruptcy pleadings.	0.50
02/04/19	L. A. Krepto	Discussing committee formation and follow-up documents with N. Ramsey.	0.20
02/04/19	N. D. Ramsey	Reviewing first day filings.	1.30
02/05/19	L. A. Krepto	Drafting committee bylaws.	0.80
02/07/19	N. D. Ramsey	Reviewing retention application and related documents for LAS (1.3) and RC (0.8).	2.10
02/12/19	N. D. Ramsey	Conferring with representatives of claims processing facility.	0.20
02/15/19	M. A. Fink	Research bylaws.	1.30
02/22/19	L. A. Krepto	Reviewing docket (.2); reviewing communications to Committee members (.1).	0.30
02/22/19	M. A. Fink	Communications with committee re status (0.3); correspondence with A. O'Neill re agreement (0.3); correspondence with N. Ramsey and L. Krepto re Committee status (0.3); review of potential agreement for Committee consideration (0.6).	1.50
02/25/19	M. A. Fink	Correspondence with A. O'Neill re confidentiality (0.2); finalize bylaws (0.3); multiple correspondence with Committee re status and next steps (0.6).	1.10
02/26/19	S. M. Seamans	(A102) Research bankruptcy court files for US Trustee Statement Regarding Application of Debtors for Appointment of Legal Representative in W.R. Grace case in Delaware.	0.30
02/26/19	M. A. Fink	Multiple calls and correspondence with Committee re bylaws and confidentiality agreements (0.7).	0.70
02/27/19	K. M. Fix	Attending committee meeting re FCR appointment strategy.	0.60
02/27/19	L. A. Krepto	Participating in committee call with N. Ramsey, M. Fink, K. Fix and Committee members.	0.60
02/27/19	M. A. Fink	Prepare for (0.3) and participate in committee call (0.6).	0.90
02/27/19	N. D. Ramsey	(A101) Prep for (.3); and participate in committee meeting (.6).	0.90
02/27/19	N. D. Ramsey	(A107) Participate in multiple calls; review and draft correspondence internally and with Debtors regarding status of UST Motion.	1.20
02/28/19	K. M. Fix	Drafting meeting minutes from 2-27 committee call.	0.70
Total fees for CASE ADMIN & BUSNSS OPER-OFFCL CMTEE ASBESTOS CRDTRS			\$ 11,149.50

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
-------------	-------------------	--------------------	--------------

Summary of Task OCAC001 - CASE ADMIN & BUSNSS OPER-OFFCL CMTEE ASBESTOS CRDTRS

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate/Hour</u>	<u>Dollars</u>
K. M. Fix	1.30	500	650.00
L. A. Krepto	2.40	550	1,320.00
S. M. Seamans	0.30	200	60.00
M. A. Fink	5.50	715	3,932.50
N. D. Ramsey	5.70	910	5,187.00

Total Fees for Task: CASE ADMIN & BUSNSS OPER-OFFCL CMTEE ASBESTOS CRDTRS 11,149.50

Task OCAC004 - PLAN OF REORGANIZATION & DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

02/06/19	N. D. Ramsey	Multiple communications regarding insurance, with A O'Neill, M Fink, E Harron (1.1); reviewing FCR application (.4); reviewing committee bylaws (.7).	2.20
02/11/19	M. A. Fink	Review of Charter (0.4); calls with B. Warner re same (0.3); review of bylaws (0.9); comment re records cooperation agreement (3.2); multiple correspondence re same (0.4).	5.20
02/12/19	M. A. Fink	Review of bylaws (1.4); correspondence re TAC (0.4); calls and correspondence re cooperation agreement (0.6); review of correspondence re insurance plan treatment (0.2); conferring with N. Ramsey re same (.2).	2.80
02/12/19	N. D. Ramsey	Reviewing report of telephone conversation with insurer counsel record regarding plan treatment.	0.20
02/12/19	N. D. Ramsey	Conferring with M Fink regarding preparation of plan supplement.	0.20
02/13/19	M. A. Fink	Review of Plan Materials (2.6); correspondence re same (0.3).	2.90
02/13/19	N. D. Ramsey	Multiple communications with debtors' counsel, FCR counsel, M Fink regarding plan supplement documents.	0.90
02/14/19	M. A. Fink	Review reused plan documents (1.0); correspondence with M. Raichle re TAC (0.2).	1.20
02/15/19	M. A. Fink	Finish review of Plan materials.	1.00
02/24/19	M. A. Fink	Review draft plan objection (0.4).	0.40
02/26/19	M. A. Fink	Calls with N. Ramsey, E. Harron and A. O'Neill re Plan issues (0.3).	0.30

Total fees for PLAN OF REORGANIZATION & DISCLOSURE STATEMENT \$ 13,052.00

Summary of Task OCAC004 - PLAN OF REORGANIZATION & DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate/Hour</u>	<u>Dollars</u>
M. A. Fink	13.80	715	9,867.00
N. D. Ramsey	3.50	910	3,185.00

Total Fees for Task: PLAN OF REORGANIZATION & DISCLOSURE STATEMENT 13,052.00

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Task OCAC008 - ASBESTOS MATTERS			
02/05/19	M. A. Fink	Multiple correspondence with A. O'Neill re reporting (0.3); review of underlying data (0.3).	0.60
02/06/19	M. A. Fink	Calls/correspondence re reporting of asbestos (0.3); review documents (0.2).	0.50
02/08/19	L. A. Krepto	Reviewing guidelines for trust.	0.10
02/08/19	M. A. Fink	Begin review of asbestos records agreement (1.8); conference with N. Ramsey re same (0.2).	2.00
02/08/19	N. D. Ramsey	Conference with M. Fink re asbestos records agreement (.2).	0.20
02/13/19	M. A. Fink	Work on materials re available documents for RCA (0.1); correspondence from R. Brady re available documents (0.3); correspondence with N. Ramsey re same (0.2).	0.60
02/26/19	S. M. Seamans	Conference with M. Fink regarding bylaws and Confidentiality Agreement.	0.20
02/26/19	S. M. Seamans	Review and organize bylaws and Confidentiality Agreement received from J. Boerschinger.	0.90
02/27/19	L. A. Krepto	Exchanging communications with M. Fink re TDPs.	0.10
02/27/19	S. M. Seamans	Review files re confidentiality agreements.	0.80
02/28/19	S. M. Seamans	Work on Appendix to objection.	0.60
Total fees for ASBESTOS MATTERS			\$ 3,437.50

Summary of Task OCAC008 - ASBESTOS MATTERS

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate/Hour</u>	<u>Dollars</u>
L. A. Krepto	0.20	550	110.00
S. M. Seamans	2.50	200	500.00
M. A. Fink	3.70	715	2,645.50
N. D. Ramsey	0.20	910	182.00

Total Fees for Task: ASBESTOS MATTERS 3,437.50**Task OCAC012 - LITIGATION & ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS**

02/20/19	N. D. Ramsey	Reviewing and revising response to UST objection to J Patton serving as FCR (2.8); multiple communications with client re same (.4).	3.20
02/21/19	N. D. Ramsey	Revising objection to UST motion to shorten time period with respect to appointment of an FCR.	0.80
02/25/19	S. M. Seamans	(A104) Research historical dockets for use in UST FCR Motion Objection.	1.10
02/25/19	N. D. Ramsey	Preparation for (.3) and participating in telephonic court appearance (.6) regarding appointment of an FCR; multiple communications regarding same with Debtors, FCR (.3).	1.20
Total fees for LITIGATION & ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS			\$ 4,952.00

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
-------------	-------------------	--------------------	--------------

Summary of Task OCAC012 - LITIGATION & ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate/Hour</u>	<u>Dollars</u>
S. M. Seamans	1.10	200	220.00
N. D. Ramsey	5.20	910	4,732.00

Total Fees for Task: LITIGATION & ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS 4,952.00

Task OCAC015 - PROFESSIONAL RETENTION & FEE ISSUES

02/05/19	L. A. Krepto	Drafting retention documents for LAS.	1.80
02/05/19	L. A. Krepto	Drafting retention documents for Robinson Cole.	2.20
02/05/19	L. A. Krepto	Analyzing retention issues (RC and LAS) (.3); discussing same with N. Ramsey and M. Fink (.2).	0.50
02/05/19	M. A. Fink	Calls/correspondence with N. Ramsey, M. Enright, L. Krepto re retention and next steps (1.0); review of retention papers for debtor and FCR (1.8).	2.80
02/06/19	L. A. Krepto	Reviewing and revising LAS retention documents and exhibits (1.8); exchanging communications (multiple) to LAS re same (.3).	2.10
02/06/19	L. A. Krepto	Discussing retention issues with N. Ramsey (.2); reviewing and revising RC retention documents and exhibits (2.8).	3.00
02/06/19	M. A. Fink	Work on retention issues (0.3).	0.30
02/07/19	L. A. Krepto	Exchanging communications with N. Ramsey re revisions to retention applications (.2); exchanging communications with LAS re retention application (.1).	0.30
02/07/19	M. A. Fink	Work on retention issues with N. Ramsey (0.3).	0.30
02/08/19	L. A. Krepto	Reviewing, revising and finalizing LAS retention documents (2.5); coordinating filing and service thereof (0.3).	2.80
02/08/19	L. A. Krepto	Reviewing, revising and finalizing RC retention documents (3.5) coordinating filing and service thereof (0.2).	3.70
02/11/19	L. A. Krepto	Reviewing updated list of names for conflict check and retention applications and coordinating review of same.	0.50
02/11/19	L. A. Krepto	Follow-up re service of retention applications and certificate of service.	0.50
02/13/19	M. A. Fink	Review comments from UST to interim compensation order (0.1); correspondence with N. Ramsey and counsel for debtors re same (0.3).	0.40
02/14/19	M. A. Fink	Begin review of UST Objection to FCR appointment (1.3).	1.30
02/15/19	M. A. Fink	Finish review of UST objection (1.8); research cases cited in support of UST position (2.4).	4.20
02/19/19	L. A. Krepto	Reviewing UST objection to appointment of Patton as FCR (.2); discussing response with N. Ramsey (.2); drafting response to UST objection (1.6).	2.00
02/19/19	L. A. Krepto	Researching and reviewing objections to appointment of FCR in asbestos cases.	2.30
02/19/19	M. A. Fink	Review documents re FCR dispute (0.8); continue research re historical FCR disputes (1.9); correspondence with committee re UST request and response (0.6).	3.30
02/20/19	K. M. Fix	Reviewing UST motion to appoint FCR (.6); reviewing proposed UST candidates for FCR (.6); conferring with M. Fink re objection (.2); researching issues re procedural aspect of UST motion (1.3);	5.60

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
02/20/19	L. A. Krepto	researching historical precedent re UST motion (1.5); reviewing motion practice re Patton FCR appointment (1.4). Reviewing UST motion to appoint FCR candidates and motion to shorten notice thereof (.6); reviewing draft response of ACC to motion to shorten (.2).	0.80
02/20/19	M. A. Fink	Work on reply in support of J. Patton (2.6); multiple correspondence with N. Ramsey re same (0.7); review of UST motion to shorten (0.2); and motion to appoint (1.2); prepare objection to Motion to shorten (2.5); review of replies in support of Patton (1.3).	8.50
02/21/19	K. M. Fix	Drafting objection to UST motion to appoint FCR.	4.70
02/21/19	L. A. Krepto	Reviewing UST motion to consider FCR candidates (.4); exchanging communications with N. Ramsey and M. Fink re same (.1).	0.50
02/21/19	L. A. Krepto	Coordinating filing of ACC objection to motion to shorten.	0.20
02/21/19	L. A. Krepto	Reviewing Debtors and FCR objections to motion to shorten time for UST motion to appoint FCR.	0.30
02/21/19	L. A. Krepto	Researching docket re status of motion to shorten notice (.2); drafting communication re same (.1).	0.30
02/21/19	M. A. Fink	Review and revise objection to motion to shorten (0.9); review debtors' objections (0.2); review FCR joinder (0.1); work on issues related to UST motion to appoint (3.8); multiple calls and emails with counsel to debtors (Strickles & O'Neill) re hearing (0.3).	5.30
02/22/19	K. M. Fix	Continuing drafting objection to UST motion to appoint FCR.	3.40
02/22/19	M. A. Fink	Work on issues arising from UST positions (2.6); conference with future claimants' representative and Debtor re same (0.4); conference with N. Ramsey (0.2).	3.20
02/22/19	N. D. Ramsey	Conferring with M. Fink re UST position re FCR appointment (.2)	0.20
02/24/19	M. A. Fink	Continue research re UST motion/opposition to J. Patton (3.7) correspondence with N. Ramsey re strategy (0.3).	4.00
02/24/19	N. D. Ramsey	Conferring with M. Fink re UST objection to J. Patton as FCR (.3)	0.30
02/25/19	K. M. Fix	Researching additional case dockets re FCR appointment (1.9); reviewing pleadings in Duro Dyne case (1.3); continuing drafting objection to UST motion to appoint FCR (2.3).	5.50
02/25/19	L. A. Krepto	Reviewing revised conflict check (.5); begin drafting supplemental declaration for N. Ramsey (.3).	0.80
02/25/19	L. A. Krepto	Reviewing docket (.2); discussing hearing on objection to Patton retention and Committee strategy with N. Ramsey (.3)	0.50
02/25/19	M. A. Fink	Prepare for (0.2) and attend (0.3) status conference re future claimant's representative issues; correspondence with debtors and future claimant's representative re stipulated order (0.5); review draft (0.2); research re UST issues (1.7).	2.90
02/26/19	K. M. Fix	Editing objection to UST motion for FCR appointment.	1.80
02/26/19	L. A. Krepto	Researching information on revised conflict check (.4); discussing with N. Ramsey (.3); revising supplemental declaration (.8)	1.50
02/26/19	M. A. Fink	Work on issues re UST Motion (2.7); conference with each of N. Ramsey, E. Harron and A. O'Neill re same (0.4); and with D. Wright re future claimants' representative (0.3).	3.40
02/27/19	M. A. Fink	Review of stipulation from UST and comment to same (0.3); correspondence with A. O'Neill re edits (0.2); work on objection to UST motion (6.7); correspondence (multiple) re depositions/declaration (1.3); calls with Debtors re next steps (0.8).	9.30
02/28/19	K. M. Fix	Researching case law re arguments made in opposition to UST	0.30

Robinson+Cole

Page: 7
 Date: March 7, 2019
 Invoice #: 50269612

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
02/28/19	K. M. Fix	Coordinating creation of appendix to objection (.4); reviewing relevant case transcripts (.6).	1.00
02/28/19	M. A. Fink	Revision of objection to UST motion (5.6); review of UST motion addendum (0.1); review various emails re declaration, depositions and future claimant representative candidates (1.5).	7.20

Total fees for PROFESSIONAL RETENTION & FEE ISSUES \$ 66,561.00

Summary of Task OCAC015 - PROFESSIONAL RETENTION & FEE ISSUES

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate/Hour</u>	<u>Dollars</u>
K. M. Fix	22.30	500	11,150.00
L. A. Krepto	26.60	550	14,630.00
M. A. Fink	56.40	715	40,326.00
N. D. Ramsey	0.50	910	455.00

Total Fees for Task: PROFESSIONAL RETENTION & FEE ISSUES 66,561.00

Summary of Phase -

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate/Hour</u>	<u>Dollars</u>
K. M. Fix	23.60	500	11,800.00
L. A. Krepto	29.20	550	16,060.00
S. M. Seamans	3.90	200	780.00
M. A. Fink	79.40	715	56,771.00
N. D. Ramsey	15.10	910	13,741.00

Total Fees for Phase: 99,152.00

Fees for Legal Services ----- \$ 99,152.00

Summary of Disbursements

	<u>Amount</u>
Local Travel: Non-Mileage	\$ 161.10
Meals	24.00
Telephone/Conference Services	60.00
Copy Black & White (4,347 pages @ 0.05 / pg)	217.35
Color Copy (32 pages @ 0.13 / pg)	4.16
Total Disbursements	\$ 466.61



Page:
Date:
Invoice #:

8
March 7, 2019
50269612

Summary for Invoice # 50269612

Official Committee

Fees for Legal Services	\$ 99,152.00
Disbursements	466.61
Total Current Billing For this Matter	\$ 99,618.61