

Exhibit A

Fees Statement

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

TIME DETAIL

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
03/01/19	NC Jenkins	006		Discuss with J. Skakun telephone depositions (.2); coordinate depositions for D. Connolly and P. Ableman (.3)	.50
03/01/19	DJ Lutes	007		Call M. Byrne regarding fee application materials (.2); prepare monthly fee application materials (.9); review expenses regarding same (.2)	1.30
03/01/19	DJ Lutes	001		Review objections to UST motion for FCR along with notices and deadlines (.4); prepare electronic files for Sidley team regarding same (.4)	.80
03/01/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review final draft of objection and comment regarding same	.30
03/01/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with Sidley team regarding Zurich language/next steps	.20
03/01/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) revisions to objection and make comments to same (.2); communications with team regarding same (.3); office conference with A. Stromberg regarding same (.2)	.70
03/01/19	AF O'Neill	009		Multiple communications with Sidley team regarding depositions (.2); office conference with A. Stromberg regarding same, and attention to issues regarding same, questions for same (.2)	.40
03/01/19	AF O'Neill	009		Review deposition notices and communications regarding approach	.20
03/01/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review communications from N. Pernick regarding DOJ request (.1); analyze same (.1); review reservation of rights language from precedents cases and discuss with A. Stromberg (.2); call with N. Pernick (office conference with A. Stromberg in part) regarding approach (.2); and communications with E. Harron regarding same (.2)	.80
03/01/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review precedent transcript cited in papers (.2); preparation for hearing on FCR (.3)	.50
03/01/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review/comment on plan modifications (.3); office conference with A. Stromberg regarding same (.2)	.50
03/01/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review/comment on FOF/COL	1.20

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
03/01/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review final comments to objection to UST Motion	.20
03/01/19	AF O'Neill	017		Finalize Zurich agreement and communications regarding same	.10
03/01/19	AR Rovira	015		Phone call with J. Schomberg regarding confirmation brief	.50
03/01/19	AR Rovira	015		Review revised confirmation order and mark with additional comments	2.30
03/01/19	J Schomberg	015		Revise confirmation brief regarding conforming brief to order (1.6); confer with B. Warner regarding same (.3); confer with A. Rovira regarding edits to confirmation brief (.5)	2.40
03/01/19	JM Skakun	006		Prepare for Ableman and Connolly depositions, including correspondence regarding depositions and regarding finalizing deposition notices (1.8); discuss telephone depositions with N. Jenkins (.2); prepare and confer with H. Sultanian, ACC counsel, and FCR counsel regarding Ableman and Connolly deposition strategy (.8); review and comment on Debtors' objection to UST FCR motion (1.2); review ACC objection to UST FCR motion, including attached transcripts (.5)	4.50
03/01/19	AR Stromberg	006		Review and revise objection to U.S. Trustee motion to appoint FCR (3.3); multiple office conferences with A. O'Neill regarding same (.4)	3.70
03/01/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review and analyze comments on plan and potential language for confirmation order to resolve comments (1.3); office conference with A. O'Neill regarding same (.2)	1.50
03/01/19	HB Sultanian	006		Revise outline for depositions of FCR candidates (.8); call with counsel for J. Patton and claimants regarding deposition strategy (.7)	1.50
03/01/19	BM Warner	015		Review emails and draft Anderson confirmation declaration (.8); meeting with J. Schomberg regarding confirmation brief revisions (.3)	1.10
03/02/19	DJ Lutes	007		Prepare monthly fee application materials (1.7); review fee application issues regarding same (.5)	2.20
03/02/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review plan objection issues from 524(g) cases and prepackaged cases	1.50
03/02/19	AR Rovira	015		Review and mark up revised confirmation brief	2.00
03/02/19	BM Warner	015		Draft Anderson confirmation declaration	1.10

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
03/03/19	DJ Lutes	007		Review fee application issues (.4); prepare monthly fee application materials (1.5)	1.90
03/03/19	J Schomberg	015		Revise confirmation brief as per A. Rovira and B. Warner conversations	2.20
03/03/19	JM Skakun	006		Revise Ableman and Connolly deposition outlines based on comments and questions from ACC counsel, on draft Connolly declaration, and on Ableman writings and speeches (2.6); circulate revised drafts of outlines to ACC counsel and FCR counsel (.2)	2.80
03/03/19	AR Stromberg	015		Revise plan of reorganization	.50
03/03/19	BM Warner	015		Review and analyze emails regarding plan and objection deadline	.30
03/03/19	BM Warner	009		Correspond with J. Skakun and prepare for depositions	.80
03/03/19	BM Warner	007		Review and revise monthly fee application	1.20
03/04/19	NC Jenkins	006		Coordinate deposition arrangements with vendors (.1); communications with J. Skakun regarding deposition exhibits (.4)	.50
03/04/19	DJ Lutes	007		Prepare monthly fee application materials (.5); review fee application issues (.4)	.90
03/04/19	DJ Lutes	006		Research case docket and incoming filings for supplemental declaration of retention application (.2); prepare materials for Sidley team regarding same (.3)	.50
03/04/19	DJ Lutes	015		Review UST objection to plan and disclosure statement (.3); prepare electronic files for Sidley team regarding same (.2)	.50
03/04/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review UST objection to Plan and communications with team regarding same (.7); review A. Stromberg summary regarding same (.3)	1.00
03/04/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications/call with US Attorney regarding plan objection extension	.20
03/04/19	AF O'Neill	001		Communications with J. Schomberg regarding case summaries (.3); review pleadings to complete list of cases for same (.3)	.60
03/04/19	AF O'Neill	015		Multiple communications with multiple parties regarding plan objection extensions and with client regarding same (.7); analysis regarding same (.3)	1.00

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
03/04/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with team regarding plan modification and approach including analysis regarding same	.30
03/04/19	AF O'Neill	009		Multiple communications with J. Skakun regarding deposition outlines (.7); review and synthesize same for order of importance/priority and analysis of goals for testimony and strategy for hearing (2.4)	2.10
03/04/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review committees suggested plan change (.1); analysis and communications with A. Stromberg regarding same (.2)	.30
03/04/19	JM Skakun	011		Non-working travel time in connection with Ableman and Connolly depositions, including transportation to Chicago airport and from Philadelphia airport (billed at half time)	1.20
03/04/19	JM Skakun	006		Prepare for Ableman and Connolly depositions, including (i) reviewing additional questions proposed by ACC counsel and FCR counsel, (ii) analyzing key trust agreement and trust distribution procedure provisions based on deponent materials, (iii) analyzing comments from A. O'Neill on strategy and priorities, and (iv) corresponding with UST and deponents (and their counsel) regarding depositions (3.2); prepare and confer with ACC counsel and FCR counsel regarding deposition strategy, and then with B. Warner regarding same (1.1); analyze plan and disclosure statement objection by US Trustee, including chart comparing trust distribution procedures to the Garlock case (1.6)	5.90
03/04/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review and analyze UST objection to plan (1.2); emails with counsel to ACC and FCR regarding TDP (.5); review proposed language for confirmation order and potential plan objections (1.2); communications with A. O'Neill regarding same (.2)	3.10
03/04/19	AR Stromberg	001		Review deposition outlines for UST candidates	.60
03/04/19	BM Warner	015		Draft plan, objection chart and summary (2.1); revise plan exhibits regarding comments (.4); review emails and correspondence with client regarding plan objection (.3); review and analyze plan objection (.5)	3.30
03/04/19	BM Warner	011		Non-working travel time to Delaware regarding	1.50

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				FCR depositions (billed at half time)	
03/04/19	BM Warner	009		Review and provide comments on FCR deposition outlines (1.0); call with J. Skakun and counsel for FCR and ACC regarding FCR deposition preparation (.8); call with local counsel regarding depositions and case preparations (.2)	2.00
03/05/19	NC Jenkins	006		Communications with court reporter agency regarding court reporter starting deposition late	.20
03/05/19	DJ Lutes	007		Prepare monthly fee application materials	.40
03/05/19	AF O'Neill	009		Review redline of Connolly declaration	.10
03/05/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with J. Holgado (PACE) regarding payments from FFIC and follow-up with T. Chirillo regarding same	.20
03/05/19	AF O'Neill	009		Analysis of Ableman and Connolly facts (.6); review rough drafts of deposition transcripts (.6)	1.20
03/05/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review communications with EPA and state of Ohio regarding environmental issues in Plan, and advise on same	.30
03/05/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications regarding plan objection research including review of same	.20
03/05/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review US Attorney proposed plan language, and communications with A. Stromberg regarding same	.20
03/05/19	AF O'Neill	017		Further communications with FCR and ACC regarding proposed changes to TDPs (.2); analysis regarding same (.1)	.30
03/05/19	AF O'Neill	009		Review multiple deposition updates and communications regarding same	1.20
03/05/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with client regarding plan memorandum and response to UST objection	.20
03/05/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review response to EPA including proposed changes and communications with team regarding same	.20
03/05/19	AR Rovira	015		Emails regarding TDP and confirmation issues	.50
03/05/19	J Schomberg	016		Draft summaries of cases cited in FCR motion in preparation for hearing (2.8); same for FCR response (4.5); same for Debtors' objection to UST FCR motion (1.2)	8.50
03/05/19	JM Skakun	011		Non-working travel time including travel to	1.20

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
 Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				Philadelphia airport and from Chicago airport (billed at half time)	
03/05/19	JM Skakun	006		Prepare and lead Ableman and Connolly depositions, including conferring and corresponding with A. O'Neill, A. Stromberg, B. Warner, K. Stickles, ACC counsel, and FCR counsel regarding strategy for and implications of depositions (5.5); analyze rough transcript of Ableman deposition, and correspond with A. O'Neill and A. Stromberg regarding key portions (0.5)	6.00
03/05/19	AR Stromberg	015		Analyze UST objection and identify areas of research (.5); emails with ACC and FCR regarding TDP (.4); review comments received on the plan and potential plan objections (.7)	1.60
03/05/19	AR Stromberg	001		Review summary of depositions and deposition transcripts for UST candidates (.8); review agenda for FCR Hearing (.2)	1.00
03/05/19	BM Warner	015		Draft and revise plan and objection chart and summary (.2); correspondence with interested parties regarding plan and case correspondence (.7)	.90
03/05/19	BM Warner	008		Correspondence with A. O'Neill regarding claim	.20
03/05/19	BM Warner	009		Prepare for depositions with J. Skakun, local counsel, counsel for FCR and ACC (1.0); attend and assist at FCR depositions with J. Skakun (3.8)	4.80
03/05/19	BM Warner	011		Return non-working travel time to Chicago regarding FCR depositions (billed at half time)	1.80
03/05/19	BM Warner	006		Review agenda (.1); correspond with J. Skakun and local counsel regarding revisions to same (.2)	.30
03/06/19	NC Jenkins	006		Communications with J. Skakun and court reporting vendor regarding receiving rough transcript and final expedited transcripts (.2); download and circulate final transcripts and errata sheets (.1); download and circulate D. Connolly's signed errata and signature page (.1)	.40
03/06/19	DJ Lutes	007		Prepare first monthly fee application and exhibits	7.30
03/06/19	DJ Lutes	001		Review Connolly declaration and electronic files regarding same (.2); review incoming key pleadings, notices and orders (.2)	.40
03/06/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with A. Boise (company) regarding article on case and UST objection,	.50

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				analysis regarding same	
03/06/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with company PR and Joelle Frank team regarding approach for response to UST objection press	.30
03/06/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review proposed plan objection language and review issues regarding same	.50
03/06/19	AF O'Neill	009		Review final deposition transcripts	1.00
03/06/19	AF O'Neill	009		Call with J. Skakun, B. Warner and A. Stromberg regarding depositions	.40
03/06/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with team regarding UST effective date and exculpation objection research and approach, analysis regarding same	.60
03/06/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review changes to confirmation order	.20
03/06/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with plan objectors regarding next steps and objection deadline	.30
03/06/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review US Attorney issue list and communications with team regarding same (.4); review precedent US Attorney objection regarding same (.1)	.50
03/06/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review and comment on Anderson Plan declaration (1.3); communications with team regarding same (.3)	1.60
03/06/19	AF O'Neill	008		Communications with B. Warner regarding proof of claim	.20
03/06/19	AF O'Neill	015		Respond to E. Slights (US Attorney) regarding objection and communications with B. Warner regarding response	.30
03/06/19	AF O'Neill	001		Communications regarding hearing preparation for FCR hearing	.40
03/06/19	AF O'Neill	001		Draft hearing argument sections	3.00
03/06/19	AR Rovira	015		Review confirmation declaration	2.00
03/06/19	J Schomberg	016		Draft chart in preparation of hearing regarding TDPs of all 524(g) cases confirmed since Garlock	4.60
03/06/19	JM Skakun	006		Prepare and confer with A. O'Neill, A. Stromberg, and B. Warner regarding key takeaways from Ableman and Connolly depositions, and regarding strategy for March 8 FCR appointment hearing (0.4); correspond with FCR and ACC counsel regarding Ableman and Connolly depositions, and	4.30

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528

Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				regarding strategy for March 8 FCR appointment hearing, and then correspond with UST regarding witness availability for March 8 FCR appointment hearing (0.8); analyze rough transcript of Connolly deposition, and correspond with A. O'Neill and A. Stromberg regarding key portions (0.6); prepare talking points regarding depositions for March 8 FCR appointment hearing (2.5)	
03/06/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review UST objection to plan and research potential arguments in response (3.7); draft sections of declaration in support of confirmation (1.1); draft sections of proposed confirmation order (1.3)	6.10
03/06/19	AR Stromberg	001		Call with A.O'Neill, B.Warner and J.Skakun regarding depositions and hearing preparation (.4); review agenda for FCR hearing (.2)	.60
03/06/19	BM Warner	016		Correspond with Sidley team regarding Duro Dyne confirmation hearing	.20
03/06/19	BM Warner	009		Call with A. O'Neill, J. Skakun and A. Stromberg regarding FCR depositions and strategy	.40
03/06/19	BM Warner	015		Research regarding plan treatment regarding UST objections (3.6); revise Anderson declaration (1.7); correspond with A. O'Neill and claims agent regarding party in interest plan inquiry (.5); revise confirmation order and circulate to Sidley team and ACC/FCR (2.1); research cases regarding exculpation (.3); review and revise confirmation brief (1.7)	9.90
03/07/19	DJ Lutes	007		Prepare first monthly fee application and exhibits (3.8); calls with M. Byrne regarding same (.4); prepare email summary report for A. O'Neill (.4)	4.60
03/07/19	DJ Lutes	001		Review incoming key pleadings, notices and orders	.30
03/07/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review T. Chirillo comments to Anderson declaration	.20
03/07/19	AF O'Neill	001		Communications with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding hearing needs	.20
03/07/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review A. Stromberg language for Anderson declaration (.2); comment regarding same (.1)	.30
03/07/19	AF O'Neill	001		Prepare for call with C. Anderson (meet with J. Skakun in part) regarding hearing (.6); call with C. Anderson and J. Skakun regarding same (.5)	1.10

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
03/07/19	AF O'Neill	001		Meet with J. Skakun, A. Stromberg and B. Warner regarding call with ACC/FCR and call with ACC/FCR counsel regarding hearings/confirmation (1.0); follow-up discussions with team regarding same and analyze next steps regarding same (.5)	1.50
03/07/19	AF O'Neill	001		Revise form of FCR agreement (1.2); review cases regarding same (.8)	2.00
03/07/19	AF O'Neill	001		Call with E. Harron regarding Dura Dyne and FCR hearing	.30
03/07/19	AF O'Neill	001		Multiple communications with J. Schomberg regarding Dura Dyne confirmation and discuss possible outcomes with J. Schomberg regarding same	.40
03/07/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review J. Schomberg memorandum regarding transcripts and cited sections of briefs (.4); incorporate in power point (.2)	.60
03/07/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with A. Rovira regarding plan review issues	.20
03/07/19	AF O'Neill	016		Prepare for FCR appointment hearing	2.50
03/07/19	AF O'Neill	011		Non-working travel time to Delaware for FCR Second Day Hearing (billed at half time)	.80
03/07/19	AF O'Neill	001		Further revise power point deck for hearing (.4); email same to J. Skakun (.1)	.50
03/07/19	AF O'Neill	001		Communications with C. Anderson regarding hearing preparation and analysis of approach for same	.50
03/07/19	AF O'Neill	009		Review J. Skakun hot button issues (.1); communications with Sidley team regarding preparation (.2)	.30
03/07/19	AF O'Neill	015		Calls with E. Slights (US Attorney) regarding plan provision including follow-up tasks regarding same	.40
03/07/19	AF O'Neill	015		Follow up call with E. Slights regarding United States issues and objection (.1); communications with client and team regarding same (.2)	.30
03/07/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review J. Schomberg memorandum regarding sources and uses (.5); make annotations regarding same for assignment (.6)	1.10
03/07/19	AF O'Neill	001		Communications/calls with E. Harron regarding	.50

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				Dura Dyne (.4); update client regarding same (.1)	
03/07/19	AF O'Neill	017		Multiple communications with ACC/FCR regarding hearing logistics and	.30
03/07/19	AF O'Neill	001		Preparation for hearing/review materials	1.00
03/07/19	AR Rovira	015		Emails with Sidley team regarding UST objection	.50
03/07/19	AR Rovira	015		Review and provide comments to confirmation memorandum of law	2.50
03/07/19	AR Rovira	015		Review revised plan, UST objection research and mark for discussion	2.00
03/07/19	J Schomberg	015		Research good faith plan objections regarding precedent 524(g) cases	2.00
03/07/19	J Schomberg	016		Attend Duro Dyne confirmation hearing via phone and take notes with regards to similar issues seen in Maremont case (5.3); confer with A. O'Neill regarding same (.2); draft summary of quotations used in Debtors' FCR pleadings (.7); revise TDP chart regarding 524(g) cases confirmed since Garlock (.2); research and distribute W.R. Grace objection in advance of hearing (.7)	7.10
03/07/19	JM Skakun	011		Non-working travel time, including transportation to Chicago airport and from Philadelphia airport (billed at half time)	1.40
03/07/19	JM Skakun	006		Prepare for Ableman cross examination and possible C. Anderson (Maremont) direct examination at March 8 FCR hearing, including analyzing Ableman deposition transcript and Anderson first day declaration regarding FCR appointment (3.1); prepare and confer with C. Anderson (Maremont) and A. O'Neill regarding March 8 FCR hearing strategy and preparation (0.5); prepare and confer with A. O'Neill, A. Stromberg, B. Warner, FCR counsel, and ACC counsel regarding strategy and next steps for March 8 FCR hearing, as well as for confirmation hearing (1.0); review and comment on draft argument by A. O'Neill for March 8 FCR hearing (1.8)	6.40
03/07/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review and comment on declaration in support of confirmation (1.6); research and draft sections of confirmation brief (7.7); call with YCST, ACC, and Sidley team regarding response to UST objection (.3)	9.60

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
03/07/19	AR Stromberg	001		Call with YCST, ACC, A. O'Neill, J. Skakun, B. Warner regarding FCR hearing and arguments (.4); conference with A. O'Neill, J. Skakun, B. Warner regarding same (.5)	.90
03/07/19	AR Stromberg	011		Non-working travel time to Wilmington for FCR hearing (billed at half time)	1.90
03/07/19	BM Warner	015		Review emails and correspond with Sidley team regarding confirmation and hearing (.3); revise confirmation brief and declaration (10.5); call with A. O'Neill, J. Skakun, A. Stromberg, FCR and ACC regarding FCR hearing and confirmation (1.0); revise modified plan (.5); correspond with A. Stromberg and J. Schomberg regarding confirmation brief and research (.3)	12.60
03/08/19	DJ Lutes	010		Review incoming pleadings, transcript requests and notices	.20
03/08/19	AF O'Neill	007		Attention to first monthly fee application and review for privilege	1.00
03/08/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review prepared order for FCR ruling and communications regarding same	.20
03/08/19	AF O'Neill	011		Non-working travel time from Philadelphia to Chicago (billed at half time)	.80
03/08/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review changed pages to Plan and to memorandum of law in support of confirmation	.80
03/08/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with ACC/FCR regarding plan objections	.30
03/08/19	AF O'Neill	001		Follow-up communications with client regarding FCR ruling	.50
03/08/19	AF O'Neill	015		Multiple communications with US Attorney and Ohio EPA and EPA regarding plan objections and language and review same, analysis regarding same (1.3); discuss plan issues with A. Stromberg (.3); emails with B. Warner regarding same (.1)	1.70
03/08/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with L. Shelko regarding environmental language	.20
03/08/19	AF O'Neill	016		Attend court hearing regarding FCR appointment	3.30
03/08/19	AF O'Neill	001		Review J. Skakun revisions to hearing script and communication regarding same (.8); communications with Sidley team regarding same and make final revisions to same (.3); communications with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz)	1.30

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				regarding filing and hearing preparation (.2)	
03/08/19	AF O'Neill	001		Meet with team and C. Anderson (Maremont) and discuss hearing strategy	1.00
03/08/19	AF O'Neill	001		Finalize hearing materials, consult with J. Skakun regarding same	1.00
03/08/19	AR Rovira	015		Assess various confirmation issues, UST objection, confirmation brief and revised plan exculpation issues (5.8); call with B. Warner regarding same (.7)	6.50
03/08/19	J Schomberg	015		Research good faith plan objections in precedent 524(g) cases	1.20
03/08/19	J Schomberg	016		Listen and take notes regarding FCR hearing via telephone	.30
03/08/19	JM Skakun	011		Non-working travel time including transportation to Philadelphia airport and from Chicago airport (billed at half time)	1.00
03/08/19	JM Skakun	016		Prepare and participate in FCR appointment hearing, including (i) conferring with C. Anderson, A. O'Neill, A. Stromberg, and K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) ahead of time regarding strategy for argument, potential affirmative evidence presentation, and cross-examination, (ii) cross-examining UST FCR candidate, and (iii) debriefing regarding strategy and next steps	5.80
03/08/19	AR Stromberg	011		Non-working travel time from Wilmington to Chicago following FCR hearing (billed at half time)	1.80
03/08/19	AR Stromberg	016		Attend bankruptcy court hearing in support of debtor's motion to appoint FCR and objection to UST motion to appoint FCR	3.00
03/08/19	AR Stromberg	001		Conference with A. O'Neill and J. Skakun regarding arguments in support of debtor's motion to appoint Jim Patton	1.00
03/08/19	AR Stromberg	015		Research and draft response to UST objection for confirmation brief (6.9); discuss plan issues with A. O'Neill (.3)	7.20
03/08/19	BM Warner	015		Research and revise confirmation brief (3.0); correspond with A. Rovira regarding plan modifications (.3); call with A. Rovira regarding the same (.7); revise plan, confirmation order and declaration (3.3)	7.30

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
03/09/19	AF O'Neill	015		Begin review of confirmation brief and provide comments to first portion of memorandum (2.1); communications with B. Warner regarding same (.4)	2.50
03/09/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review 524(g) portion of confirmation brief and arguments regarding UST objection (1.4); consider issues for J. Patton declaration (.9)	2.30
03/09/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review Anderson declaration and provide comments to same, communications with B. Warner regarding new sections to be drafted	1.00
03/09/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review revised draft of Anderson declaration and revise section	.50
03/09/19	AF O'Neill	007		Analyze fee applications issues, confidentiality approach and transmit comments regarding same to DJ Lutes	.40
03/09/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review Plan modifications and consider 1127 issues and next steps regarding same	.90
03/09/19	AR Rovira	015		Review additional comments to confirmation documents	2.00
03/09/19	J Schomberg	015		Research case law discussing 1125(e) limit of liability for inclusion in confirmation brief	3.00
03/09/19	JM Skakun	015		Preliminarily review confirmation brief for evidentiary issues	1.00
03/09/19	AR Stromberg	015		Draft response to UST objection for confirmation brief	6.70
03/09/19	BM Warner	015		Revise confirmation brief (.3); research regarding TDPs regarding confirmation brief (1.5); revise Anderson declaration (1.7)	3.50
03/10/19	DJ Lutes	007		Prepare monthly fee application materials (2.9); emails with A. O'Neill regarding same (.2); emails to M. Byrne regarding same (.2); review deadlines and next steps (.1)	3.40
03/10/19	AF O'Neill	015		Complete comments to confirmation brief and send to team (1.4); communications with ACC/FCR and US Attorney regarding reservation language (.6)	2.00
03/10/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review March 8 hearing transcript and communications with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding same (1.8); review and comment on revised draft findings and conclusions (1.7)	3.50
03/10/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with team regarding next steps	.80

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				(.4); consider evidentiary approach for appellate process (.4)	
03/10/19	AR Rovira	015		Review revised confirmation documents and provide comments (5.8); phone call with B. Warner regarding confirmation document comments (.2)	6.00
03/10/19	J Schomberg	015		Cite check and proofread confirmation brief	3.70
03/10/19	JM Skakun	015		Analyze and comment on draft confirmation brief, focusing on UST objection response evidentiary record / testimony issues	3.90
03/10/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review and revise draft confirmation brief	4.10
03/10/19	BM Warner	015		Review emails regarding confirmation (.3); revise and circulate declaration (.3); revise confirmation brief (4.1); call with A. Rovira regarding confirmation order (.2); revise declaration and plan exhibits (3.4)	8.30
03/11/19	DJ Lutes	007		Calls with M. Byrne regarding fee application issues (.3); emails with M. Byrne and A. O'Neill regarding invoice (.3); review fee application exhibits (.7); revise fee application materials (.9)	2.20
03/11/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review plan documents and comment on same and multiple communications with team regarding same	2.00
03/11/19	AF O'Neill	010		Prepare for and attend call with client regarding next steps	.70
03/11/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with L. Davis (FFIC) and E. Harron (FCR counsel) about FFIC settlement and next steps with stipulation and documentation including analysis regarding same	.30
03/11/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with US Attorney and A. Stromberg about language for FOF/COL addressing governmental agencies (.4); review and analysis regarding same (.1)	.50
03/11/19	AF O'Neill	015		Call with FCR counsel and A. Stromberg, B. Warner about Plan issues and evidentiary issues (.7); follow-up communications regarding open plan issues and finalizing settlement language (.8)	1.50
03/11/19	AR Rovira	015		Emails and discussions with A. O'Neill regarding confirmation issues	.50
03/11/19	AR Rovira	015		Review Anderson declaration and provide comments	1.80

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
03/11/19	AR Rovira	015		Review confirmation comments from FCR and provide comments	1.00
03/11/19	AR Rovira	015		Analyze confirmation issues, exculpation and revised documents	2.00
03/11/19	AR Rovira	015		Review confirmation brief and provide additional comments	3.50
03/11/19	J Schomberg	015		Cite check entire confirmation brief (.4); compile and organize documents for compendium of authorities to be filed with confirmation brief (3.0); draft TDP provision comparison chart to be filed as exhibit to the confirmation brief (4.5)	7.90
03/11/19	JM Skakun	015		Review and comment on draft Anderson declaration (2.8); review comments from FCR counsel on confirmation brief (0.5)	3.30
03/11/19	AR Stromberg	015		Call with UST regarding exculpation (.5); call with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding UST objections (.7); call with counsel to FCR, A. O'Neill and B. Warner regarding status of submissions in support of confirmation (.7); review, comment on and revise confirmation brief, declarations in support of confirmation, proposed confirmation order, and plan modifications (10.8); draft plan modifications (1.0); meeting with B. Warner regarding confirmation preparation (.3)	14.00
03/11/19	BM Warner	015		Review emails regarding confirmation (.3); draft and revise plan confirmation documents and revised plan exhibits (10.0); review and comment on FCR declaration (1.2); meeting with A. Stromberg regarding confirmation preparation (.3); review and analyze environmental statutes (.5); call with FCR, A. O'Neill, A. Stromberg regarding confirmation (.7); correspond with J. Skakun, S. Zieg (FCR counsel) and A. O'Neill regarding confirmation documents (.2)	13.20
03/12/19	DJ Lutes	007		Call with M. Byrne regarding fee application invoice (.1); emails with M. Byrne regarding same (.3); emails with B. Warner regarding fee application issues (.2); prepare fee application exhibits (.3)	.90
03/12/19	AF O'Neill	006		Communications with DJ Lutes, B. Warner and C. Anderson and K. Kwiatkowski (company) regarding fee applications	.20
03/12/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with L. Shelko regarding next	.20

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				steps	
03/12/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review multiple iterations of plan documents (1.5); multiple communications with team regarding same and filings (.9)	2.40
03/12/19	AF O'Neill	015		Call with B. Eilander and A. Stromberg and B. Warner regarding plan documents to be filed and next steps	.50
03/12/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review Patton declaration and analysis of proof issues (.9); communications with J. Skakun and A. Stromberg regarding same (.3)	1.20
03/12/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review changes to Anderson declaration and confirmation brief and communications with team regarding revisions	1.00
03/12/19	AF O'Neill	017		Call with A. Tannanbaum (EPA) and J. McConkle (US Attorney) regarding environmental and medicaid issues (.4); follow-up calls with E. Harron and A. Stromberg regarding same (.3); review language from J. McConkle and revise same and review issues from A. Stromberg regarding same (.3); communications with FCR counsel regarding same (.3)	1.30
03/12/19	AF O'Neill	015		Finalize language regarding Leslie Davis (FFIC) and US Attorney reservation of rights (.2); multiple communications with UST and with team regarding exculpation issues, including analysis regarding same (.3)	.50
03/12/19	AF O'Neill	017		Call with E. Harron and S. Zieg (counsel to FCR) regarding Medicaid issues for papers and follow-up with team regarding same	.40
03/12/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with FCR regarding cash position and with company regarding same (.2); follow-up regarding impact on documents (.2)	.40
03/12/19	AF O'Neill	009		Communications with company regarding weekly cash reporting from PACE	.20
03/12/19	AR Rovira	015		Review motion to exceed and provide comments	.50
03/12/19	AR Rovira	015		Review all final blacklines and provide any comments	1.50
03/12/19	AR Rovira	015		Analyze UST objection issues	1.50
03/12/19	AR Rovira	015		Review revised Patton declaration, comments and provide comments	1.50

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
03/12/19	AR Rovira	015		Review confirmation brief comments	1.50
03/12/19	J Schomberg	015		Prepare cited trust distribution procedures for compendium of authorities to be filed with confirmation brief (3.3); prepare cited confirmation orders for compendium of authorities to be filed with confirmation brief (2.0); prepare cited case management orders for compendium of authorities to be filed with confirmation brief (2.0); correspond with B. Warner regarding same (.1); revise exculpation provision comparison chart to be filed as exhibit to the confirmation brief (.7); prepare confirmation orders for the exculpation provision comparison chart exhibit (1.1); revise confirmation brief citations (.5)	9.70
03/12/19	JM Skakun	015		Correspond with A. O'Neill and A. Stromberg regarding strategy for FCR declaration in support of plan confirmation, review and comment on draft FCR declaration and on additional changes from FCR counsel (1.2); correspond with A. O'Neill and A. Stromberg regarding comments on FCR declaration and regarding confirmation brief (.6)	1.80
03/12/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review, comment on and revise confirmation brief, declarations in support of confirmation, proposed confirmation order, modified plan, and compendium of sources (14.2); call with A. O'Neill, B. Warner, and client regarding plan modifications (.5)	14.70
03/12/19	BM Warner	015		Revise and comment on declaration, confirmation order and FCR declaration (.5); review emails and correspond with FCR, A. O'Neill and A. Stromberg regarding confirmation (.3); revise and finalize confirmation documents and manage filing (13.1); call with A. O'Neill, A. Stromberg and C. Anderson (Maremont) regarding confirmation (.5)	14.40
03/12/19	BM Warner	007		Review and revise monthly fee application	.40
03/13/19	DJ Lutes	007		Prepare monthly fee application exhibits (1.1); emails to B. Warner regarding same (.2); call with B. Warner regarding same (.1)	1.40
03/13/19	DJ Lutes	015		Prepare conformed plan and disclosure statement related filings and responses for Sidley team	1.10
03/13/19	DJ Lutes	001		Prepare conformed FCR related pleadings for Sidley team	.50
03/13/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review emails regarding pleadings and final	1.40

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				versions of Plan	
03/13/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding agenda and review/comment on same	.20
03/13/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with company regarding MORs and with B. Warner regarding same (.4); review B. Warner summary of issues for same (.1)	.50
03/13/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with T. Kern (US Attorney) regarding filed order	.10
03/13/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with A. Stromberg and B. Warner regarding confirmation hearing	.20
03/13/19	AF O'Neill	015		Begin preparing confirmation presentation	1.30
03/13/19	J Schomberg	016		Review Duro Dyne confirmation hearing transcript in preparation for Maremont's confirmation hearing	1.40
03/13/19	AR Stromberg	015		Conference with B. Warner regarding preparation for confirmation hearing (.5); review and draft summary of argument in favor of exculpation (1.6)	2.10
03/13/19	BM Warner	015		Manage confirmation documents filing and revise compendium regarding confirmation brief (1.0); review emails and correspond regarding confirmation hearing preparation (.3); meeting with A. Stromberg regarding same (.5); draft confirmation outlines (3.3)	5.10
03/13/19	BM Warner	007		Review and revise fee application (.2); call with D. Lutes regarding same (.1)	.30
03/13/19	BM Warner	010		Review and comment on monthly operating report	1.30
03/14/19	DJ Lutes	001		Prepare conformed pleadings in electronic format for Sidley team (.3); review docket for updates (.2)	.50
03/14/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with B. Eilander regarding next steps	.20
03/14/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with B. Warner regarding MORs, next steps with same and retainer issues	.20
03/14/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications team regarding agenda items	.10
03/14/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review A. Stromberg memorandum regarding exculpation issues and hearing approach	.50
03/14/19	AF O'Neill	015		Analyze appellate issues and call with A. Rovira regarding same	.60
03/14/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review confirmation hearing transcripts for preparations	3.10

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
03/14/19	J Schomberg	015		Draft Garlock case write-up in preparation for Maremont's confirmation hearing	2.50
03/14/19	AR Stromberg	015		Draft exculpation argument summary (3.2); review argument outlines for confirmation hearing (.5)	3.70
03/14/19	BM Warner	016		Review and comment on confirmation hearing agenda (.3); correspond with Sidley team, client and local counsel regarding confirmation hearing status and monthly operating report (.7)	1.00
03/14/19	BM Warner	015		Draft confirmation outlines	2.40
03/14/19	BM Warner	010		Review monthly operating report and accounting (.9); teleconference with company team regarding same (.8); review and analyze revised monthly operating report (.3); call with local counsel regarding same (1.2)	3.20
03/14/19	BM Warner	010		Call with A. Rovira regarding appeal issues and research	.30
03/15/19	DJ Lutes	010		Research docket for key incoming pleadings, notices and orders	.20
03/15/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review memorandum regarding approach to district court affirmation issues, consider approach regarding same	.50
03/15/19	AF O'Neill	009		Communications with B. Warner regarding DRC testimony/court appearance	.20
03/15/19	AF O'Neill	015		Draft questions for team regarding UST arguments (.4); review responses from B. Warner and A. Stromberg (.3); and follow-up with B. Warner regarding case summaries and analysis regarding same (1.0); continue to review UST arguments for hearing (.5)	2.20
03/15/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review pleadings for hearing, B. Warner outlines regarding 1129 requirements and 524(g) requirements, and comment on same	2.10
03/15/19	AF O'Neill	009		Communications with J. Skakun regarding approach with witnesses at confirmation hearing and litigation issues for same and send materials for same	.40
03/15/19	AF O'Neill	010		Multiple communications with K. Kwiatkowski and B. Connolly (company) and B. Warner regarding MORs and approach regarding professional fees reporting, including analysis regarding same	.50

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528

Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
03/15/19	AF O'Neill	017		Review FFIC draft agreement and communications with A. Stromberg regarding same (.3); multiple communications with A. Stromberg and FCR counsel regarding same (.3); comments on FFIC revision strategy with L. Davis (FFIC) and for filing and revisions to order, consider same (.3)	.90
03/15/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review hearing preparation issues (.5); communications with B. Warner regarding outlines and memos for same (.4)	.90
03/15/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with C. Anderson (Maremont) regarding hearing logistics and preparation (.2); follow-up with J. Skakun and B. Warner regarding same and approach, including analysis regarding same (.3)	.50
03/15/19	AR Rovira	015		Correspondence with A. O'Neill and B. Warner regarding confirmation and appeal research issues	.50
03/15/19	J Schomberg	015		Draft comprehensive Garlock case write-up in preparation for confirmation hearing (3.7); research and draft analysis of bankruptcy appeals (1.1)	4.80
03/15/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review and comment on settlement agreement with FFIC and draft related plan and confirmation order revisions (3.6); communications with YCST regarding proposed settlement (.5); call with C. Anderson regarding same (.1); Call with L. Davis regarding same (.2); review and analyze arguments for confirmation hearing (3.5)	7.90
03/15/19	BM Warner	010		Call with local counsel and company accounting team regarding monthly operating report (.3); call with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding same (.2); correspond with T. Chirillo regarding same (.2)	.70
03/15/19	BM Warner	015		Draft and revise plan confirmation outlines	4.30
03/15/19	BM Warner	016		Correspond with claims and noticing agent regarding confirmation hearing	.10
03/15/19	BM Warner	010		Analyze research and summary from K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding district court affirmance (.4); revise appeals summary from J. Schomberg (.3); call with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding affirmance (.3); research regarding affirmance and draft summary to Sidley team (1.5)	2.50
03/15/19	BM Warner	015		Revise FFIC settlement agreement (.2); review plan revisions from A. Stromberg (.2)	.40

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
03/16/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review all materials needed for trip to Delaware for confirmation hearing	.50
03/16/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review Anderson declaration and annotate same for hearing	1.00
03/16/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review confirmation hearing transcripts and revise power point for same	2.00
03/16/19	AF O'Neill	015		Multiple communications with team regarding preparation issues and next steps	.50
03/16/19	AF O'Neill	015		Begin to draft hearing arguments for confirmation hearing	2.70
03/16/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review J. Schomberg memorandum regarding Garlock and consider issues for same	.70
03/16/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review A. Stromberg language regarding FFIC agreement and comment regarding same (.3); analysis regarding further plan modifications and order changes and communications with team regarding same (.4); review revised language in revised order and make further revisions to same and to confirmation order (.5)	1.20
03/16/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review A. Stromberg memorandum on UST arguments and respond regarding same	.20
03/16/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with B. Warner and J. Schomberg regarding data requests and memos to prepare for hearing	.30
03/16/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with E. Harron regarding approach with district court including discussions regarding hearing preparation and analysis regarding same	.50
03/16/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review additional B. Warner case summaries and review opinions regarding same	.80
03/16/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review J. Schomberg appellate memorandum	.20
03/16/19	AR Rovira	015		Review revisions to confirmation order and appeal timeline	.50
03/16/19	AR Rovira	015		Review confirmation order revisions	.50
03/16/19	J Schomberg	016		Review Maremont FCR hearing transcript in preparation for confirmation hearing	.30
03/16/19	JM Skakun	015		Prepare for confirmation hearing, including analyzing and commenting on draft outline of responses to UST objection, and corresponding with A. O'Neill, A. Stromberg, and B. Warner	3.80

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				regarding same, as well as reviewing B. Warner analysis of affirmance procedures for cistrict court	
03/16/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review changes to proposed confirmation order	.30
03/16/19	BM Warner	015		Correspond regarding confirmation document revisions and filing with Sidley team (.3); revise confirmation order (.5); research and draft analysis regarding UST objection case law (.8); revise and circulate confirmation order to Sidley team, local counsel and parties in interest (.5); correspond with A. O'Neill regarding pleadings and disclosure statement regarding confirmation (.3)	2.40
03/17/19	AF O'Neill	017		Multiple communications with team and L. Davis (FFIC counsel) regarding order and Plan language (.2); review and revise same (.1); analysis regarding next steps for hearing (.1)	.40
03/17/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with UST regarding exculpation (.1); review issues in order and plan and communications with A. Stromberg and ACC/FCR counsel regarding same (.2)	.30
03/17/19	AF O'Neill	017		Dinner meeting with E. Harron regarding hearing dynamics and approach	1.10
03/17/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review confirmation hearing examination outlines from FCR for Patton, Ankura and incorporate portions for arguments	1.70
03/17/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with A. Stromberg regarding plan, order sections of argument, allocating time at hearing and analysis regarding segments/ordering	.30
03/17/19	AF O'Neill	015		Analysis of certain TDP provisions and communications with FCR counsel and team regarding same	.70
03/17/19	AF O'Neill	015		Further analysis of District Court approach and communications with B. Warner regarding client update	.20
03/17/19	AF O'Neill	015		Analysis regarding stay waiver and impact on district court proceedings	.40
03/17/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review and analysis regarding J. Schomberg transcript analysis memo	.50
03/17/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with M. Freitag (Joelle Frank) regarding confirmation communications strategy and analysis regarding same	.20
03/17/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications regarding filing updated	.30

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				materials and agenda for hearing and review same	
03/17/19	AF O'Neill	011		Non-working travel time to DE for confirmation hearing (billed at half time)	.50
03/17/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review pleadings for argument issues	1.80
03/17/19	AF O'Neill	015		Revise and draft new sections of power point presentation for confirmation hearing	2.10
03/17/19	J Schomberg	015		Review Maremont FCR hearing transcript in preparation for confirmation hearing (1.3); review Duro Dyne confirmation hearing transcript in preparation for confirmation hearing (1.0); draft e-mail to A. O'Neill highlighting material quotes from both hearings for use at confirmation hearing (.6)	2.90
03/17/19	JM Skakun	011		Non-working travel time including transportation to Chicago airport and from Philadelphia airport (billed at half time)	1.00
03/17/19	JM Skakun	015		Prepare for confirmation hearing, including analyzing key issues from UST objection and Debtors' confirmation brief, analyzing strategy based on review of Duro Dyne confirmation arguments by UST, preparing for potential C. Anderson (Maremont) testimony regarding plan negotiations, and analyzing potential FCR and Ankura direct testimony outlines from FCR counsel	4.80
03/17/19	AR Stromberg	011		Non-working travel time to Delaware for confirmation hearing (billed at half time)	2.50
03/17/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review proposed confirmation order and revised plan (.7); review arguments and outlines for confirmation hearing (.8)	1.50
03/17/19	BM Warner	015		Correspond with Sidley team regarding confirmation revisions and revise documents for same (1.9); research and correspond with A. O'Neill regarding stay waiver (.5); draft summary regarding affirmance plan to client (.3)	2.70
03/17/19	BM Warner	011		Non-working travel time to Delaware regarding confirmation hearing (billed at half time)	2.10
03/18/19	DJ Lutes	007		Review monthly fee application issues	.20
03/18/19	DJ Lutes	010		Research docket for key pleadings, orders and notices for Sidley team	.40
03/18/19	AF O'Neill	015		Email updates to J. Conlan and B. Guzina	.30

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				regarding hearing and next steps	
03/18/19	AF O'Neill	015		Follow-up meetings with C. Anderson (Maremont) and team and with E. Harron, (call with B. Brady in part) (FCR counsel) regarding next steps	.80
03/18/19	AF O'Neill	011		Non-working travel time from Delaware to Chicago from hearing (billed at half time)	1.40
03/18/19	AF O'Neill	015		Update M. Hutchins (Kasowitz) on confirmation status	.10
03/18/19	AF O'Neill	015		Call with B. Eilander regarding hearing update	.20
03/18/19	AF O'Neill	015		Make final revisions to argument sections and refine arguments for same	.70
03/18/19	AF O'Neill	016		Attend confirmation hearing	2.40
03/18/19	AF O'Neill	010		Further communications with M. Freitag (Joelle Frank) regarding confirmation communications and analysis regarding same	.20
03/18/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review plan and disclosure statement arguments and revise same	1.30
03/18/19	AF O'Neill	015		Meet with team, Cole Schotz and C. Anderson (Maremont) to prepare for hearing	1.70
03/18/19	AF O'Neill	015		Meet with FCR and FCR counsel, ACC counsel and Ankura to prepare for hearing	1.60
03/18/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with L. Davis (FFIC) regarding agreement finalization	.20
03/18/19	AR Rovira	015		Review Duro Dyne appeal papers for potential appeal issues and strategy (.6); review revisions to confirmation order (.2); dial in for confirmation hearing (2.0)	2.80
03/18/19	JM Skakun	016		Prepare and participate in confirmation hearing, including conferring with A. O'Neill, A. Stromberg, and B. Warner regarding strategy, argument, and key evidentiary issues, preparing C. Anderson for potential testimony, and debriefing afterward	7.40
03/18/19	JM Skakun	011		Non-working travel time including transportation to Philadelphia airport and from Chicago airport (billed at half time)	1.00
03/18/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review arguments and outlines for confirmation hearing (4.7); analyze next steps with respect to confirmation (.8)	5.50

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
03/18/19	AR Stromberg	016		Attend hearing regarding confirmation of Debtors' plan and U.S. Trustee's objections to trust distribution procedures	2.30
03/18/19	AR Stromberg	011		Non-working return travel time from Delaware to Chicago following confirmation hearing (billed at half time)	2.80
03/18/19	BM Warner	016		Prepare for confirmation hearing and attend plan confirmation hearing (3.0); meeting at Cole Schotz regarding post-confirmation strategy (.5)	3.50
03/18/19	BM Warner	015		Prepare for confirmation hearing	.50
03/18/19	BM Warner	010		Research regarding appeals precedent	1.00
03/18/19	BM Warner	011		Non-working return travel time from Delaware to Chicago regarding confirmation hearing (billed at half time)	2.50
03/19/19	DJ Lutes	010		Research docket for key pleadings, orders and notices for Sidley team	.30
03/19/19	DJ Lutes	007		Review monthly fee application issues (.2); email M. Byrne regarding same (.1)	.30
03/19/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review transcript from confirmation hearing and draft outline of major takeaways, analysis regarding closure (2.1); communications with A. Stromberg regarding exact deal issues and strategy regarding same (.5)	2.60
03/19/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with L. Shelko and PACE regarding weekly reporting (.1); office conference with B. Warner regarding MOR status and estimation issues (.2); review communications regarding same (.1)	.40
03/19/19	BM Warner	010		Review and circulate headlines regarding confirmation hearing (.3); research regarding appeals precedent (1.2)	1.50
03/19/19	BM Warner	010		Research regarding monthly operating report precedent (.6); teleconferences with company team regarding monthly operating report (.4); analyze monthly operating report revisions (.3); office conference with A. O'Neill regarding same (.2); revise monthly operating report (.4)	1.90
03/19/19	BM Warner	006		Correspond with ACC, FCR and local counsel regarding professional fee estimates for client (.3); correspond with client regarding professional fees (.2)	.50

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
03/20/19	DJ Lutes	010		Prepare key pleadings and notices from docket for Sidley team	.30
03/20/19	AF O'Neill	015		Analysis regarding language for new deal (.6); communications with S. Zieg (FCR counsel) and A. Stromberg regarding same (.4)	1.00
03/20/19	AF O'Neill	015		Consider alternative approaches to confirmation and related analysis	3.20
03/20/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with A. Rovira regarding next steps, appeals, and analysis regarding same	1.10
03/20/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review language from R. Schepacarter regarding TDP and multiple communications regarding same (.7); revise language (.4); communications with A. Stromberg and ACC, FCR regarding next steps, review TDPs and consider alternatives (.7)	1.80
03/20/19	AF O'Neill	010		Office conference with B. Warner regarding MORs (.2); review filed revisions of same (.3)	.50
03/20/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review transcript of confirmation hearing (.5); revise proposed confirmation order and proposed TDP (3.2)	3.70
03/20/19	BM Warner	010		Research regarding appeals precedent (6.0); call with A. Rovira regarding appeals research (.2)	6.20
03/20/19	BM Warner	010		Final review and correspondence regarding monthly operating report (.3); review and finalize monthly operating report for filing (.4); meeting with A. O'Neill regarding same (.2)	.90
03/21/19	AF O'Neill	015		Discuss confirmation options with D. Twomey (.3); analyze Bestwall/Garlock issues for attention to structure (2.2)	2.50
03/21/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review ACC changes to order and communications with A. Stromberg regarding same (.2); analysis regarding same (.1)	.30
03/21/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review agenda and comments regarding same	.20
03/21/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with B. Eilander regarding weekly calls, status	.20
03/21/19	AF O'Neill	015		Follow-up regarding hearing and timing of filing revisions	.20
03/21/19	AF O'Neill	015		Office conference with A. Stromberg regarding confirmation strategy alternative	.20
03/21/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with B. Warner regarding	.30

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528

Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				precedent case summaries (.1); review same (.2)	
03/21/19	AF O'Neill	015		Multiple communications with A. Stromberg regarding removal/extension proceedings and strategic advantages of same (.3); review impact on potential deal (.1); review revised TDP/Order language and communications with A. Stromberg regarding same (.2); meet with A. Stromberg regarding same (.2)	.80
03/21/19	AF O'Neill	015		Comments from ACC and communications regarding process/sign-off and next steps	.30
03/21/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review and analyze developments in other asbestos bankruptcy cases (2.3); review comments on proposed confirmation order and revise order (1.1); emails with counsel to ACC and FCR regarding comments on order and proposed TDP (.4); office conference with A. O'Neill regarding confirmation strategy (.2); meet with A. O'Neill regarding TDP (.2)	4.20
03/21/19	BM Warner	015		Research regarding Bestwall case history (.4); research regarding appeals caselaw and precedent (5.5); communications with A. O'Neill regarding same (.3)	6.20
03/21/19	BM Warner	010		Review and comment on amended agenda	.30
03/21/19	BM Warner	007		Revise and finalize first monthly fee application	.30
03/22/19	AF O'Neill	015		Draft ACC update to company	.40
03/22/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review options and preliminary review of research regarding 327 and related continued issues	1.10
03/22/19	AF O'Neill	015		Analysis regarding confirmation issues (.6); communications with J. Conlan regarding same (.3); communications with B. Warner regarding research issues (.2); review plan provisions regarding modifications, conditions precedent and analysis regarding same (1.5)	2.60
03/22/19	AF O'Neill	015		Consider plan appellate issues and ACC specific dynamics	.50
03/22/19	AF O'Neill	015		Call with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) and follow-up emails regarding scheduling	.40
03/22/19	AF O'Neill	015		Call with N. Ramsey (ACC) regarding scheduling	.30
03/22/19	AF O'Neill	015		Call with E. Harron (FCR) regarding scheduling	.20
03/22/19	AF O'Neill	015		Call with FCR, ACC and A. Stromberg regarding	.50

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				scheduling	
03/22/19	AF O'Neill	015		Call with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) and A. Stromberg regarding scheduling	.30
03/22/19	AF O'Neill	015		Call with C. Anderson (Maremont) regarding status	.20
03/22/19	AF O'Neill	015		Call with R. Schepacarter (UST) regarding status	.20
03/22/19	AR Rovira	015		Review and consider appeal case summaries	1.30
03/22/19	J Schomberg	015		Research case law and code sections regarding plan modifications (4.7); confer with B. Warner regarding same (.2)	4.90
03/22/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review proposed revisions to confirmation order and TDP (.5); Call with counsel to FCR, ACC and A. O'Neill regarding proposed revisions to TDP (.8); call with A.O'Neill and K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding confirmation hearing dates and process (.4); review research on plan modifications (.5); review emails from K.Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding confirmation hearing (.1)	2.30
03/22/19	BM Warner	015		Draft research summary and analysis regarding appeals caselaw and precedent (2.5); correspondence with A. Rovira regarding appeals research update (.1); emails regarding case updates and research (.2); correspond with A. Stromberg and J. Schomberg regarding research regarding section 1127 plan modifications case precedent (2.6); confer with J. Schomberg regarding same (.2)	5.60
03/24/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with J. Skakun regarding continued hearing and analysis of potential litigation/evidentiary needs for continued hearing	.50
03/25/19	DJ Lutes	010		Prepare filed materials for Sidley team	.80
03/25/19	DJ Lutes	007		Finalize monthly fee application exhibits (2.3); emails with B. Warner and A. O'Neill regarding same (.2); emails with M. Byrne regarding same (.2); prepare second monthly fee application (.5); assess deadlines for interim/final fee application (.2); emails with B. Warner regarding same (.1); prepare spreadsheets for interim/final fee application (.7)	4.20
03/25/19	AF O'Neill	015		Draft summary update on status, continued hearing to client, analysis of issues	.50

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
03/25/19	AF O'Neill	015		Consider approach for plan amendment	.50
03/25/19	AF O'Neill	015		Analysis of committee issues, discuss same with team	.40
03/25/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with C. Anderson and T. Chirillo regarding post-petition payments	.10
03/25/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with B. Warner (office conference in part) regarding schedules and statements and 341 meeting (.2); review new critical dates calendar (.1); consider removal motion dynamics and communication with A. Stromberg regarding same (.3)	.60
03/25/19	AF O'Neill	006		Attention to fee application, make final comments and edits to same and communication with B. Warner regarding same	2.10
03/25/19	J Schomberg	010		Draft motion for the extension of removal deadline	2.20
03/25/19	AR Stromberg	010		Emails with B. Warner and A. O'Neill regarding schedules and removal extension motions	.50
03/25/19	BM Warner	010		Correspond with A. O'Neill and A. Stromberg and review emails regarding scheduling and case extension (.7); research regarding removal and schedules extension (.3); research regarding reasonable consent caselaw (5.3); analyze and comment on research from J. Schomberg regarding plan modifications (.5); review and analyze case deadlines (.2)	7.00
03/25/19	BM Warner	007		Revise first monthly fee application regarding comments from A. O'Neill (.2); review and finalize first monthly fee application for filing (.5); correspond with A. O'Neill and D. Lutes regarding timing of remaining fee applications (.3)	1.00
03/26/19	DJ Lutes	010		Prepare filed materials for Sidley team	.40
03/26/19	DJ Lutes	007		Prepare electronic Ledes file as per UST office request (.2); call with M. Byrne regarding same (.1); emails with B. Warner regarding same (.2); prepare second monthly fee application materials (.3); prepare spreadsheets for interim/final fee application (1.1); review UST comments for first monthly fee application (.3); review materials regarding same (.4); communications with B. Warner regarding same (.3)	2.90
03/26/19	AF O'Neill	007		Communications with UST and team regarding fee application (.1); follow-up and review issues	.20

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				regarding same (.1)	
03/26/19	AF O'Neill	009		Communications with A. Rovira regarding next steps and appellate issues	.50
03/26/19	AF O'Neill	010		Respond to K. Kwiatkowski regarding accounting issues and analysis regarding same	.30
03/26/19	AF O'Neill	007		Communications with B. Warner regarding UST fee application issues	.20
03/26/19	AF O'Neill	009		Follow-up from conversation with A. Rovira regarding appeals (.3), consider issues with regards to potential FCR appointment appeal (.2)	.50
03/26/19	AF O'Neill	010		Review UST fees and disbursements regarding same (.1); send B. Warner email regarding same (.1)	.20
03/26/19	AR Rovira	015		Update phone call with A. O'Neill on plan issues	.30
03/26/19	J Schomberg	010		Draft removal extension motion	3.20
03/26/19	J Schomberg	015		Research case law regarding plan modifications and Rule 3019	2.80
03/26/19	BM Warner	007		Review emails and correspond with A. O'Neill and D. Lutes regarding UST fee application informal comments (.7); analyze and discuss UST fee comments with Sidley team and D. Lutes (.5); research and draft response regarding same (.5)	1.70
03/26/19	BM Warner	010		Correspond with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding quarterly UST fees (.2); call with K. Stickles (Cole Schotz) regarding same (.3); draft correspondence to client and A. O'Neill regarding UST fee payment mechanics (.2); research regarding reasonable consent caselaw and precedent (2.1); draft and revise summary and analysis regarding same (1.6); draft schedules and SOFAs extension motion (.9)	5.30
03/27/19	DJ Lutes	010		Review case docket for key pleadings, notices and orders for Sidley team	.20
03/27/19	AF O'Neill	007		Review B. Warner analysis regarding UST email on fees and revise same (.3); email to R. Schepacarter (UST) and follow-up communications regarding same (.3)	.60
03/27/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with FCR regarding next steps	.20
03/27/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review B. Warner research regarding unreasonable withholding of consent and review	1.50

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				cases regarding same	
03/27/19	AF O'Neill	007		Office conference with B. Warner regarding professional issues (.1); communications with Kasowitz regarding same (.1)	.20
03/27/19	J Schomberg	010		Finalize and internally distribute motion for the extension of removal deadline	.20
03/27/19	J Schomberg	015		Research case law regarding plan modifications and Rule 3019	4.60
03/27/19	BM Warner	010		Review and revise motion to extend removal deadline	1.70
03/27/19	BM Warner	007		Research regarding 327(e) monthly fee application (.3); correspond with M. Hutchins (Kasowitz) regarding same (.2); office conference with A. O'Neill regarding same (.1)	.60
03/28/19	DJ Lutes	007		Prepare Kasowitz monthly fee application materials (.8); emails with B. Warner regarding same (.4); review UST fee reductions for hold backs and accounting (.2); prepare interim fee application spreadsheets for hold back reductions (.2)	1.60
03/28/19	AF O'Neill	007		Prepare for call with R. Schepacarter and call regarding comments to fee application (.2); follow-up with B. Warner regarding same and communications with R. Schepacarter regarding same and 341 hearing extension (.2); analysis regarding 341 hearing ask/timing (.1)	.50
03/28/19	AF O'Neill	009		Communications with A. Rovira and J. Skakun regarding appeal issues	.10
03/28/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with B. Eilander (company) regarding update call	.10
03/28/19	AF O'Neill	009		Multiple communications regarding FCR appeal and next steps	.20
03/28/19	AF O'Neill	009		Review and comment on removal motion (.3); communications with J. Schomberg regarding same (.2)	.50
03/28/19	AF O'Neill	007		Multiple communications regarding fee applications for professionals and communications with client regarding same	.20
03/28/19	J Schomberg	015		Draft and distribute internal write-up regarding plan modifications and Rule 3019	2.30

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
03/28/19	AR Stromberg	010		Review emails regarding removal extension motion	.30
03/28/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review plan modification research	.30
03/28/19	BM Warner	010		Research and review docket regarding appeals (.2); draft update to client regarding same (.1); draft schedules and statements extension motion (2.0); review and revise plan modifications research from J. Schomberg (.3)	2.60
03/28/19	BM Warner	007		Review invoice and correspond with M. Hutchins (Kasowitz) regarding 327(e) monthly fee application (.3); correspond with D. Lutes regarding same (.1); draft correspondence to client regarding monthly fee applications (.1); correspond with D. Lutes regarding fee applications and status (.4)	.90
03/29/19	DJ Lutes	007		Prepare second monthly fee application materials including review of costs for compliance (1.5); communications with B. Warner regarding fee applications and status (.4)	1.90
03/29/19	DJ Lutes	010		Prepare conformed filed pleadings for Sidley team (.3); review materials regarding same (.2)	.50
03/29/19	AF O'Neill	017		Consider approach for next steps with ACC	.50
03/29/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review and synthesize analysis from B. Warner and J. Schomberg regarding modifications, plan issues and unreasonably withhold cases	1.20
03/29/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with A. Stromberg regarding next steps with regards to pleadings	.10
03/29/19	AF O'Neill	006		Communications regarding debtor professional fee apps	.20
03/29/19	BM Warner	008		Review and correspond with Meritor team regarding tax claim	.30
03/29/19	BM Warner	007		Draft and file Kasowitz 327(e) monthly fee application	1.00
Total Hours					708.50

Exhibit B

Expense Detail

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528

Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

EXPENSE DETAIL

Date	Narrative	Amount
03/07/19	03/01/19 - Williams Lea - 0000913767-000 Reprographics in connection with deposition materials	\$41.79
03/12/19	03/04/19-03/05/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Feb 28, 2019 - John M. Skakun, III - One way economy airfare from Chicago to Philadelphia on 3/4/19 in connection with trip to Philadelphia and Wilmington for the Maremont Ableman and Connolly depositions. - United Airlines	328.46
03/12/19	03/04/19-03/05/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Feb 28, 2019 - John M. Skakun, III - One way economy airfare from Philadelphia to Chicago on 3/5/19 in connection with trip to Philadelphia and Wilmington for the Maremont Ableman and Connolly depositions. - American Airlines	346.30
03/12/19	03/04/19-03/05/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 05, 2019 - John M. Skakun, III - Taxi/Car Service from Chicago airport to residence on 3/5/19 in connection with trip to Philadelphia and Wilmington for the Maremont Ableman and Connolly depositions.	51.46
03/12/19	03/04/19-03/05/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 05, 2019 - John M. Skakun, III - Taxi/Car Service from Wilmington hotel to Philadelphia airport on 3/5/19 in connection with trip to Philadelphia and Wilmington for the Maremont Ableman and Connolly depositions.	50.25
03/12/19	03/04/19-03/05/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 04, 2019 - John M. Skakun, III - Hotel - Breakfast for one attendee at hotel on 3/5/19 in connection with trip to Philadelphia and Wilmington for the Maremont Ableman and Connolly depositions. - Courtyards	4.00
03/12/19	03/04/19-03/05/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 04, 2019 - John M. Skakun, III - Hotel - Breakfast for one attendee at hotel on 3/5/19 in connection with trip to Philadelphia and Wilmington for the Maremont Ableman and Connolly depositions. - Courtyards	3.00
03/12/19	03/04/19-03/05/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 04, 2019 - John M. Skakun, III - Hotel - Meals Other/convenience meal at Wilmington hotel on 3/5/19 in connection with trip to Philadelphia and Wilmington for the Maremont Ableman and Connolly depositions. - Courtyards	4.75
03/12/19	03/04/19-03/05/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 05, 2019 - John M. Skakun, III - Lodging for one night in Wilmington on 3/5/19 includes \$271 room rate, \$21.68 State tax and \$5.42 City tax in connection with trip to Philadelphia and Wilmington for the Maremont Ableman and Connolly depositions. - Courtyards	298.10
03/13/19	03/07/19 - Williams Lea - 0000914933-000 Reprographics in connection with hearing materials	7.59

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528
Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Narrative	Amount
03/14/19	03/07/19-03/08/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 04, 2019 - John M. Skakun, III - Round trip economy airfare between Chicago and Philadelphia in connection with trip to Philadelphia and Wilmington for the Maremont FCR Hearing. - United Airlines	656.92
03/14/19	03/06/19 - Williams Lea - 0000914856-000 Reprographics in connection with hearing materials	7.59
03/14/19	03/07/19-03/08/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 07, 2019 - John M. Skakun, III - Taxi/Car Service from Philadelphia airport to Wilmington on 3/7/19 in connection with trip to Philadelphia and Wilmington for the Maremont FCR Hearing.	33.49
03/14/19	03/07/19-03/08/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 08, 2019 - John M. Skakun, III - Parking at O'Hare airport in connection with trip to Philadelphia and Wilmington for the Maremont FCR Hearing.	69.00
03/14/19	03/07/19-03/08/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 08, 2019 - John M. Skakun, III - Hotel - Breakfast for one attendee at Wilmington hotel on 3/8/19 in connection with trip to Philadelphia and Wilmington for the Maremont FCR Hearing. - Hotel DuPont - (Voluntarily reduced charge from \$35.60 to \$25.00)	25.00
03/14/19	03/07/19-03/08/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 08, 2019 - John M. Skakun, III - Lodging for one night in Wilmington on 3/8/19 includes \$359 room rate, \$28.72 State tax and \$7.18 City tax in connection with trip to Philadelphia and Wilmington for the Maremont FCR Hearing. - Hotel DuPont	394.90
03/15/19	03/11/19 - Williams Lea - 0000915853-000 Reprographics in connection with hearing materials	33.07
03/18/19	Mar 07, 2019 - Joe Schomberg - Court Costs - Court hearing phone service to attend Duro Dyne confirmation hearing in connection with Maremont confirmation issues.	50.00
03/20/19	03/14/19 - Williams Lea - 0000916754-000 Reprographics in connection with hearing materials	7.88
03/20/19	03/14/19 - Williams Lea - 0000916799-000 Reprographics in connection with hearing materials	44.84
03/21/19	03/04/19-03/05/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 01, 2019 - Blair M. Warner - One way economy airfare from Chicago to Philadelphia on 3/4/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: FCR depositions - United Airlines	328.46
03/21/19	03/04/19-03/05/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 01, 2019 - Blair M. Warner - One way economy airfare from Philadelphia to Chicago on 3/5/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: FCR depositions - American Airlines	444.30
03/21/19	03/04/19-03/05/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 04, 2019 - Blair M. Warner - Taxi/Car Service from Philadelphia airport to Wilmington on 3/4/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: FCR depositions	40.94
03/21/19	03/04/19-03/05/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 05, 2019 - Blair M. Warner - Taxi/Car Service in Wilmington from hotel to deposition on 3/5/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: FCR depositions	9.75

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528

Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Narrative	Amount
03/21/19	03/04/19-03/05/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 05, 2019 - Blair M. Warner - Taxi/Car Service in Chicago to residence on 3/5/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: FCR depositions	12.57
03/21/19	03/04/19-03/05/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 04, 2019 - Blair M. Warner - Dinner for one attendee at O'Hare airport on 3/4/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: FCR depositions	13.94
03/21/19	03/04/19-03/05/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 05, 2019 - Blair M. Warner - Lodging for one night in Wilmington on 3/4/19 includes \$349 room rate, \$27.92 State tax and \$6.98 City tax in connection with travel to Delaware re: FCR depositions	383.90
03/26/19	03/07/19-03/08/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Feb 27, 2019 - Andrew F. O'Neill - Roundtrip economy airfare between Chicago and Philadelphia in connection with travel to Delaware re: FCR appointment hearing - United Airlines	676.91
03/26/19	03/17/19-03/18/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 11, 2019 - John M. Skakun, III - Roundtrip economy airfare between Chicago and Philadelphia in connection with trip to Philadelphia and Wilmington for the Maremont Confirmation Hearing. - United Airlines	728.26
03/26/19	03/07/19-03/08/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 07, 2019 - Andrew F. O'Neill - Taxi/Car Service from residence to O'Hare airport on 3/7/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: FCR appointment hearing	51.74
03/26/19	03/07/19-03/08/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 07, 2019 - Andrew F. O'Neill - Taxi/Car Service from Philadelphia airport to Wilmington on 3/7/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: FCR appointment hearing	57.36
03/26/19	03/07/19-03/08/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 08, 2019 - Andrew F. O'Neill - Taxi/Car Service from O'Hare airport to residence on 3/8/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: FCR appointment hearing	76.33
03/26/19	03/17/19-03/18/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 18, 2019 - John M. Skakun, III - Taxi/Car Service from Wilmington to Philadelphia airport on 3/18/19 in connection with trip to Philadelphia and Wilmington for the Maremont Confirmation Hearing.	48.72
03/26/19	03/17/19-03/18/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 18, 2019 - John M. Skakun, III - Parking at O'Hare airport in connection with trip to Philadelphia and Wilmington for the Maremont Confirmation Hearing.	65.00
03/26/19	03/07/19-03/08/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 07, 2019 - Andrew F. O'Neill - Hotel - Meals Other/late night arrival snack in hotel room for one attendee on 3/7/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: FCR appointment hearing - Hotel DuPont	8.00
03/26/19	03/07/19-03/08/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 07, 2019 - Andrew F. O'Neill - Hotel - Meals Other/late night arrival snack in hotel room for one attendee on 3/7/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: FCR appointment hearing - Hotel DuPont	6.00

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: 39014528

Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Narrative	Amount
03/26/19	03/07/19-03/08/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 08, 2019 - Andrew F. O'Neill - Lodging for one night in Wilmington on 3/8/19 includes \$359 room rate, \$28.77 State tax and \$7.18 City tax in connection with travel to Delaware re: FCR appointment hearing - Hotel DuPont	394.90
03/26/19	03/17/19-03/18/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 18, 2019 - John M. Skakun, III - Lodging for one night in Wilmington on 3/18/19 includes \$359 room rate, \$28.77 State tax and \$7.18 City tax in connection with trip to Philadelphia and Wilmington for the Maremont Confirmation Hearing. - Hotel DuPont	394.90
03/27/19	Court Reporter 3/20/19 - DTI TOPCO INC - M242119 - DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT	676.40
03/29/19	03/17/19-03/18/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 13, 2019 - Blair M. Warner - One way economy airfare from Chicago to Philadelphia on 3/17/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: confirmation hearing - United Airlines	389.81
03/29/19	03/17/19-03/18/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 18, 2019 - Blair M. Warner - One way economy airfare from Philadelphia to Chicago on 3/18/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: confirmation hearing - American Airlines	328.46
03/29/19	03/17/19-03/18/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 17, 2019 - Blair M. Warner - Taxi/Car Service from residence to O'Hare airport on 3/17/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: confirmation hearing	42.30
03/29/19	03/17/19-03/18/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 17, 2019 - Blair M. Warner - Taxi/Car Service from Philadelphia airport to Wilmington on 3/17/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: confirmation hearing	40.95
03/29/19	03/17/19-03/18/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 18, 2019 - Blair M. Warner - Taxi/Car Service from Wilmington to Philadelphia airport on 3/18/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: confirmation hearing	49.06
03/29/19	03/17/19-03/18/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 18, 2019 - Blair M. Warner - Taxi/Car Service O'Hare airport to residence on 3/18/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: confirmation hearing	46.80
03/29/19	03/17/19-03/18/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 18, 2019 - Blair M. Warner - Hotel - Breakfast for one attendee at hotel on 3/18/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: confirmation hearing - Hotel DuPont	13.60
03/29/19	03/17/19-03/18/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 17, 2019 - Blair M. Warner - Dinner for one attendee at O'Hare airport on 3/17/19 in connection with travel to Delaware re: confirmation hearing	11.35
03/29/19	03/17/19-03/18/19 Chicago to Philadelphia - Mar 18, 2019 - Blair M. Warner - Lodging for one night in Wilimington on 3/18/19 includes \$359 room rate, \$28.77 State tax and \$7.18 City tax in connection with travel to Delaware re: confirmation hearing - Hotel DuPont	394.90
Total		\$8,194.00