

EXHIBIT A

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

RODNEY SQUARE
1000 NORTH KING STREET
WILMINGTON, DELAWARE 19801

P.O. BOX 391
WILMINGTON, DELAWARE 19899-0391

(302) 571-6600
(800) 253-2234 (DE ONLY)

TAX I.D. NO. 51-0082644

(302) 571-1253 FAX
www.ycst.com

Writer's Direct Dial
(302) 571-6703

Writer's E-Mail
eharron@ycst.com

James L. Patton, Jr. as Future Claimants' Representative

Invoice Date: April 23, 2019
Invoice Number: 50004896
Matter Number: 076815.1001

Re: Maremont Corporation
For the period ending March 31, 2019

CURRENT INVOICE

Professional Services	\$	197,211.50
Disbursements	\$	<u>2,177.57</u>
Total Due This Invoice	\$	199,389.07

Patton, James L., Jr., Future Claimants' Representative

Invoice Date:

April 23, 2019

Invoice Number:

50004896

Matter Number:

076815.1001

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
03/01/19	CCATH	Download and circulate new pleadings	B001	0.10	28.50
03/01/19	CCATH	Update critical dates calendar	B001	0.10	28.50
03/04/19	CCATH	Download and circulate new pleadings	B001	0.10	28.50
03/04/19	CCATH	Prepare and circulate critical dates calendar	B001	0.10	28.50
03/04/19	RBRAD	Review critical dates calendar	B001	0.10	97.50
03/05/19	CCATH	Update service list	B001	0.10	28.50
03/06/19	CCATH	Download and circulate new pleadings	B001	0.10	28.50
03/06/19	LEDEN	Update electronic files re: recently filed correspondence	B001	0.10	28.50
03/07/19	LEDEN	Review Court docket; download and circulate incoming pleadings to working group	B001	0.10	28.50
03/07/19	LEDEN	Download and circulate incoming pleadings to working group	B001	0.20	57.00
03/08/19	CCATH	Update service list	B001	0.10	28.50
03/11/19	CCATH	Prepare and circulate critical dates calendar	B001	0.10	28.50
03/11/19	CCATH	Download and circulate new pleadings	B001	0.30	85.50
03/12/19	CCATH	Download and circulate new pleadings	B001	0.10	28.50
03/12/19	LEDEN	Review incoming correspondence; update electronic files re: same	B001	0.10	28.50
03/13/19	CCATH	Download and circulate new pleadings	B001	0.50	142.50
03/14/19	CCATH	Download and circulate new pleadings	B001	0.10	28.50
03/18/19	CCATH	Download and circulate new pleadings	B001	0.10	28.50
03/18/19	CCATH	Prepare and circulate critical dates calendar	B001	0.10	28.50
03/18/19	RBRAD	Review critical dates calendar	B001	0.10	97.50

Patton, James L., Jr., Future Claimants' Representative

Invoice Date:

April 23, 2019

Invoice Number:

50004896

Matter Number:

076815.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
03/19/19	CCATH	Update critical dates calendar	B001	0.10	28.50
03/19/19	CCATH	Download and circulate new pleadings	B001	0.10	28.50
03/21/19	CCATH	Download and circulate new pleadings	B001	0.10	28.50
03/22/19	CCATH	Download and circulate new pleadings	B001	0.20	57.00
03/26/19	LEDEN	Download incoming pleadings from Court docket; circulate same to working group	B001	0.10	28.50
03/27/19	LEDEN	Download incoming pleadings from Court docket; circulate same to working group	B001	0.10	28.50
03/28/19	LEDEN	Download incoming pleadings from Court docket; circulate same to working group	B001	0.10	28.50
03/02/19	EHARR	Prepare for hearing on FCR motion	B002	0.50	452.50
03/02/19	RBRAD	Conference with E. Harron re: strategy for hearing on FCR appointment motions	B002	0.30	292.50
03/03/19	RBRAD	Conference with E. Harron and J. Patton re: potential testimony for hearing on motion to appoint FCR	B002	0.20	195.00
03/06/19	CCATH	Assemble materials for 3/8/19 hearing	B002	1.00	285.00
03/06/19	EHARR	Prepare for hearing on FCR motion	B002	0.40	362.00
03/06/19	RBRAD	Review and comment on draft testimony outline for J. Patton as proposed FCR	B002	0.40	390.00
03/06/19	SZIEG	Meet with R.Brady and J.Patton re: 3/8/19 hearing on FCR appointment (.4); teleconference with Debtors and ACC re: same (.9); meet with R.Brady re: same (.2); research and preparation re: same (5.2)	B002	6.70	5,259.50
03/07/19	EHARR	Call with J. Patton, R. Brady, and S. Zieg re: hearing preparation for FCR appointment	B002	1.00	905.00
03/07/19	RBRAD	Conference call with E. Harron, S. Zieg, and J. Patton re: preparation for hearing on FCR appointment motions	B002	1.10	1,072.50
03/07/19	RBRAD	Prepare for (.5) and conference call with Debtors and ACC re: preparation and strategy for confirmation hearing (.9) and follow-up conference with S. Zieg re: same (.2)	B002	1.60	1,560.00

Patton, James L., Jr., Future Claimants' Representative

Invoice Date:

April 23, 2019

Invoice Number:

50004896

Matter Number:

076815.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
03/07/19	RBRAD	Conference with J. Patton and S. Zieg re: strategy for hearing on FCR appointment motions	B002	0.40	390.00
03/07/19	SZIEG	Teleconference with counsel for Debtors and ACC re: preparation for 3/8/19 hearing	B002	0.70	549.50
03/08/19	CCATH	Preparations for 3/8/19 hearing	B002	0.20	57.00
03/08/19	EHARR	Attend hearing re: FCR appointment	B002	2.90	2,624.50
03/08/19	JPATT	Attend FCR hearing	B002	2.80	3,710.00
03/08/19	JPATT	Prepare for hearing on retention	B002	1.50	1,987.50
03/08/19	RBRAD	Conference with J. Patton and E. Harron re: results from FCR appointment motion and next steps	B002	0.50	487.50
03/08/19	RBRAD	Conference with J. Patton, S. Zieg, and E. Harron re: preparation for hearing on FCR appointment motions	B002	0.70	682.50
03/14/19	RBRAD	Review agenda for disclosure statement/confirmation hearing	B002	0.10	97.50
03/15/19	JKOCH	Assist with confirmation hearing preparation	B002	2.40	780.00
03/16/19	JKOCH	Assist with confirmation hearing preparation	B002	0.60	195.00
03/18/19	CCATH	Preparations for 3/18/19 hearing	B002	0.70	199.50
03/18/19	EHARR	Prepare for (1.8), attend (2.2) and follow up (.2) re: confirmation hearing	B002	4.30	3,891.50
03/18/19	JPATT	Confirmation hearing and follow up re: outcome and next steps	B002	3.80	5,035.00
03/18/19	JPATT	Prepare for confirmation hearing	B002	3.10	4,107.50
03/18/19	SZIEG	Prepare for and attend hearing re: confirmation	B002	6.60	5,181.00
03/22/19	RBRAD	Review amended hearing agenda	B002	0.10	97.50
03/14/19	SZIEG	Teleconference with A. Brockman re: forecasting	B007	0.80	628.00
03/08/19	EHARR	Meet with J. Patton, R. Brady, and S. Zieg re: hearing preparation	B008	0.70	633.50
03/08/19	SZIEG	Meet with R. Brady, E. Harron and J. Patton re: preparation for 3/8/19 hearing	B008	1.00	785.00

Patton, James L., Jr., Future Claimants' Representative

Invoice Date:

April 23, 2019

Invoice Number:

50004896

Matter Number:

076815.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
03/11/19	EHARR	Meet with R. Brady and S. Zieg re: confirmation preparation	B008	0.50	452.50
03/12/19	EHARR	Meet with R. Brady and S. Zieg and call with A. O'Neill re: confirmation preparation	B008	0.50	452.50
03/14/19	EHARR	Meet with FCR team re: confirmation hearing preparation	B008	0.70	633.50
03/14/19	JKOCH	Attend meeting re: confirmation hearing preparation	B008	0.90	292.50
03/14/19	JPATT	Preparation meeting with team re: hearing confirmation	B008	0.90	1,192.50
03/14/19	SZIEG	Meet with E. Harron, J. Kochenash and J. Patton re: preparation for confirmation hearing (1.0); meet with J. Patton re: same (.6); preparation re: confirmation hearing (4.2); correspondence with E. Harron re: same (multiple) (.4)	B008	6.20	4,867.00
03/17/19	EHARR	Dinner meeting with A. O'Neill re: preparation for 3/18/19 hearing (billed at 1/2 time)	B008	0.50	452.50
03/01/19	EHARR	FFIC settlement follow-up	B012	0.20	181.00
03/01/19	RBRAD	Review revised language in Zurich plan treatment and correspondence re: same	B012	0.20	195.00
03/01/19	RBRAD	Review Debtors' draft objection to UST's FCR appointment motion	B012	0.30	292.50
03/02/19	RBRAD	Review settlement correspondence from FFIC re: plan treatment and conference with E. Harron re: same	B012	0.40	390.00
03/04/19	EHARR	Develop counter re: FFIC settlement negotiations	B012	0.30	271.50
03/04/19	RBRAD	Correspondence with E. Harron re: FFIC plan treatment negotiations	B012	0.20	195.00
03/04/19	RBRAD	Conference with Andy O'Neill re: ACC's requested change to TDPs	B012	0.20	195.00
03/04/19	RBRAD	Review correspondence with Debtors and ACC re: TDPs	B012	0.20	195.00
03/04/19	RBRAD	Review UST plan objection	B012	0.60	585.00
03/04/19	SKOHU	Analyze UST objections to plan and disclosure statement	B012	0.90	540.00
03/05/19	EHARR	Review UST's confirmation objection	B012	0.40	362.00
03/05/19	EHARR	Emails and calls re: FFIC negotiations	B012	0.30	271.50

Patton, James L., Jr., Future Claimants' Representative

Invoice Date:

April 23, 2019

Invoice Number:

50004896

Matter Number:

076815.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
03/05/19	RBRAD	Review declaration of D. Connolly re: FCR appointment motion and correspondence from R. Schepacarter re: hearing on FCR appointment motions (.3); correspondence with A. O'Neill and E. Harron re: hearing (.2)	B012	0.50	487.50
03/05/19	RBRAD	Review summaries of depositions of P. Ableman and D. Connolly re: FCR appointment motion (.3); conference with J. Patton re: same (.2)	B012	0.50	487.50
03/05/19	RBRAD	Review correspondence re: ACC requested change to TDPs	B012	0.20	195.00
03/05/19	RBRAD	Correspondence with ACC and Debtors re: TDPs (.2) and conference with J. Patton re: same (.2)	B012	0.40	390.00
03/06/19	EHARR	Emails re: TDP issues and confirmation preparation	B012	0.70	633.50
03/06/19	RBRAD	Review draft DOJ reservation of rights language for inclusion in confirmation order and review precedent re: same (.3); correspondence with E. Harron re: same (.2)	B012	0.50	487.50
03/06/19	RBRAD	Review transcript from Ableman deposition re: FCR appointment motions	B012	0.30	292.50
03/06/19	RBRAD	Review Ableman declaration re: FCR appointment motions	B012	0.40	390.00
03/06/19	RBRAD	Review correspondence from A. O'Neill re: negotiations with FFIC over plan treatment	B012	0.10	97.50
03/07/19	EHARR	Call re: FFIC negotiations	B012	0.40	362.00
03/07/19	JPATT	Review TDP and trust and plan review re: plan objection	B012	2.20	2,915.00
03/07/19	RBRAD	Teleconference with E. Harron re: plan settlement negotiations with FFIC	B012	0.20	195.00
03/08/19	EHARR	Call with committee, and emails with FFIC counsel and Debtor's counsel re: settlement negotiations	B012	0.50	452.50
03/08/19	RBRAD	Conference call with Committee re: FFIC plan negotiations and follow-up call and emails with counsel to FFIC re: same	B012	0.40	390.00
03/08/19	RBRAD	Review revised confirmation order language requested by DOJ and related emails	B012	0.30	292.50
03/09/19	RBRAD	Review draft confirmation order	B012	0.40	390.00

Patton, James L., Jr., Future Claimants' Representative

Invoice Date:

April 23, 2019

Invoice Number:

50004896

Matter Number:

076815.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
03/10/19	EHARR	Review affidavit in support of confirmation and follow-up emails re: same	B012	0.50	452.50
03/10/19	EHARR	Review plan edits	B012	0.50	452.50
03/10/19	RBRAD	Review further revised language from DOJ for confirmation order and correspondence with E. Harron and A. O'Neill re: same	B012	0.30	292.50
03/10/19	RBRAD	Review and comment on draft declaration from the Debtors in support of plan confirmation	B012	0.40	390.00
03/10/19	SZIEG	Draft and revise insert for reply re: confirmation	B012	2.80	2,198.00
03/10/19	SZIEG	Revise and comment re: numerous supplemental plan documents and filings related to 3/18/19 confirmation hearing	B012	2.30	1,805.50
03/11/19	EHARR	Review declaration in support of confirmation (1.0); review draft reply brief (.5); call with plan proponents re: confirmation preparation (.7)	B012	2.20	1,991.00
03/11/19	EHARR	Review edits to draft order extending 105 injunction	B012	0.30	271.50
03/11/19	EHARR	Calls re: FFIC settlement negotiations	B012	0.30	271.50
03/11/19	JPATT	Review Patton declaration and related materials	B012	2.10	2,782.50
03/11/19	RBRAD	Correspondence with E. Harron and Andy O'Neill re: FFIC plan treatment settlement	B012	0.20	195.00
03/11/19	RBRAD	Review further revised DOJ reservation of rights language for confirmation order and compare same to prior versions (.2); correspondence with E. Harron and A. Ross Stromberg re: same (.2)	B012	0.40	390.00
03/11/19	RBRAD	Review and consider proposed revised exculpation language to address UST issues and review plan and related documents to respond (.4); correspondence with A. Ross Stromberg re: same (.4)	B012	0.80	780.00
03/11/19	RBRAD	Conference call with Sidley and YCST teams re: preparation for plan confirmation and follow-up emails re: same	B012	0.80	780.00

Patton, James L., Jr., Future Claimants' Representative

Invoice Date:

April 23, 2019

Invoice Number:

50004896

Matter Number:

076815.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
03/11/19	RBRAD	Review draft brief in support of plan confirmation and comments from S. Zieg re: same	B012	0.60	585.00
03/11/19	RBRAD	Conference with E. Harron, S. Kohut and S. Zieg re: confirmation hearing preparation	B012	0.20	195.00
03/11/19	RBRAD	Review and comment on draft FCR appointment order and conference with E. Harron re: same	B012	0.30	292.50
03/11/19	RBRAD	Continue review and comment on Anderson declaration in support of plan confirmation	B012	0.60	585.00
03/11/19	RBRAD	Correspondence with E. Harron and A. O'Neill re: FFIC plan treatment negotiations (.2); review follow up correspondence with L. Davis re: agreement and next steps (.3)	B012	0.50	487.50
03/11/19	SZIEG	Meet with R. Brady and E. Harron re: preparation for confirmation (.5); draft, review and revise declaration in support of confirmation (6.8); review and revise reply re: confirmation (3.2); teleconference with counsel for Debtors and ACC re: preparation for hearing (.7)	B012	11.20	8,792.00
03/11/19	TBUCH	Prepare declaration in support of confirmation (2.7); meet with S. Zieg re: same (.1)	B012	2.80	1,484.00
03/11/19	TPAKR	Correspondence with S. Zieg re: Maremont CMO research (.1); research same (.6); correspondence with S. Zieg re: summary of same (.1)	B012	0.80	320.00
03/12/19	CCATH	Assemble confirmation-related materials for E. Harron	B012	0.60	171.00
03/12/19	EHARR	Review edits to confirmation order	B012	0.40	362.00
03/12/19	EHARR	Edit Patton declaration	B012	0.90	814.50
03/12/19	EHARR	Call with A. O'Neill re: Medicare reporting	B012	0.30	271.50
03/12/19	EHARR	Prepare for confirmation hearing	B012	1.40	1,267.00
03/12/19	EHARR	Review UST's plan objection	B012	0.30	271.50
03/12/19	EHARR	Emails re: UST's reservation of rights	B012	0.30	271.50
03/12/19	EHARR	Review edits to plan exculpation	B012	0.30	271.50

Patton, James L., Jr., Future Claimants' Representative

Invoice Date:

April 23, 2019

Invoice Number:

50004896

Matter Number:

076815.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
03/12/19	RBRAD	Correspondence with A. Ross Stromberg re: UST negotiations on exculpation provisions	B012	0.30	292.50
03/12/19	RBRAD	Review Patton declaration in support of plan confirmation and related emails re: revisions	B012	1.20	1,170.00
03/12/19	RBRAD	Review correspondence and plan language re: status of negotiations to resolve FFIC plan objection	B012	0.20	195.00
03/12/19	RBRAD	Review, comment and finalize several plan and confirmation related documents for filing: revised exculpation language for plan; revised DOJ language for confirmation order; revised confirmation order; revised Patton declaration in support of confirmation; and revised Debtors' brief in support of confirmation (2.2); multiple internal conferences with E. Harron and S. Zieg re: plan confirmation filings (.8); correspondence with and teleconferences with Sidley re: same (.6)	B012	3.60	3,510.00
03/12/19	SZIEG	Meet with R. Brady and E. Harron (and call with A. O'Neill) re: preparation for confirmation (.5); review, revise and correspondence re: reply brief in support of confirmation (1.4); teleconference with M. Fink re: same (.4); review, revise and correspondence re: confirmation order (1.7); review, revise and correspondence re: Patton declaration (1.3); prepare for testimony re: confirmation (2.2); review, revise and correspondence re: revised plan documents (1.2)	B012	8.70	6,829.50
03/13/19	EHARR	Work on Patton direct and oral argument re: confirmation hearing preparation	B012	1.60	1,448.00
03/13/19	RBRAD	Review draft outlines for potential testimony in support of plan confirmation and discuss same with E. Harron	B012	0.40	390.00
03/13/19	RBRAD	Review signed order appointing James Patton as FCR	B012	0.10	97.50
03/13/19	RBRAD	Review ACC reply to UST plan confirmation objection and in support of plan confirmation	B012	0.30	292.50
03/13/19	SZIEG	Prepare for 3/18/19 confirmation hearing (2.2); correspondence with B. Warner re: final plan and confirmation related documents (.2)	B012	2.40	1,884.00

Patton, James L., Jr., Future Claimants' Representative

Invoice Date:

April 23, 2019

Invoice Number:

50004896

Matter Number:

076815.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
03/14/19	CCATH	Assemble materials for confirmation hearing	B012	1.30	370.50
03/14/19	EHARR	Work on outline for confirmation argument and Patton proffer/direct testimony	B012	2.80	2,534.00
03/14/19	JPATT	Review confirmation issues with S. Zieg	B012	0.60	795.00
03/14/19	JPATT	Review materials re: confirmation preparation	B012	3.10	4,107.50
03/14/19	SKOHU	Pull materials on common interest privilege	B012	0.40	240.00
03/14/19	SKOHU	Confer with E. Harron re: confirmation preparation; email to J. Kochenash re: same	B012	0.30	180.00
03/15/19	CCATH	Research for confirmation hearing	B012	0.50	142.50
03/15/19	EHARR	Review draft FFIC agreement (.8); negotiate edits to FFIC agreement (.4); draft proffer in support of FFIC agreement (.4)	B012	1.60	1,448.00
03/15/19	EHARR	Prepare outline re: confirmation	B012	1.70	1,538.50
03/15/19	JPATT	Call from S. Zieg and follow up re: hearing preparation for confirmation	B012	0.80	1,060.00
03/15/19	JPATT	Review plan, disclosure statement trust agreement, TDP, and related materials re: hearing preparation for confirmation	B012	5.60	7,420.00
03/15/19	JPATT	Email to E. Harron re: hearing preparation, outlines, review and follow-up	B012	2.20	2,915.00
03/15/19	RBRAD	Review proposed plan changes to incorporate FFIC settlement	B012	0.30	292.50
03/15/19	RBRAD	Review and comment on draft FFIC plan settlement agreement and correspondence with E. Harron re: same (.5); review comments from Sidley and respond to same (.2); review initial comments from ACC and correspondence with E. Harron re: same (.2); review further revised FFIC settlement agreement and related follow-up emails re: same (.3); review final plan language and correspondence with ACC re: same (.3)	B012	1.50	1,462.50
03/15/19	SZIEG	Preparation re: confirmation hearing (5.5); teleconference with J. Patton re: same (.3); correspondence with A. Brockman re: same (multiple) (1.4)	B012	7.20	5,652.00

Patton, James L., Jr., Future Claimants' Representative

Invoice Date:

April 23, 2019

Invoice Number:

50004896

Matter Number:

076815.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
03/16/19	EHARR	Review responses to UST's confirmation objection	B012	1.20	1,086.00
03/17/19	EHARR	Review documents and prepare argument re: confirmation (2.5); call with N. Ramsey and emails with A. O'Neill re: same (.5); further prepare for hearing (.3)	B012	3.30	2,986.50
03/17/19	RBRAD	Review further revised plan and confirmation order from Sidley	B012	0.40	390.00
03/17/19	RBRAD	Correspondence with Andy O'Neill and E. Harron re: resolution of UST objection to exculpation provisions	B012	0.20	195.00
03/17/19	SZIEG	Prepare for confirmation hearing (4.2); correspondence with E. Harron re: same (.2); correspondence with A. Brockman re: payment percentage report (multiple) (.5)	B012	4.90	3,846.50
03/17/19	SZIEG	Review and comment re: revised confirmation order	B012	0.40	314.00
03/18/19	RBRAD	Teleconference with E. Harron and Andy O'Neill re: confirmation hearing and strategy going forward; follow-up emails re: same	B012	0.70	682.50
03/20/19	EHARR	Emails re: TDP edits and confirmation issues	B012	0.50	452.50
03/20/19	SZIEG	Review and revise revised plan documents; correspondence re: same	B012	0.80	628.00
03/21/19	JPATT	Review TDP changes and confirmation strategy	B012	1.70	2,252.50
03/21/19	RBRAD	Review further revised confirmation order and related correspondence re: comments and timing	B012	0.40	390.00
03/22/19	EHARR	Review edits to proposed findings of fact (.3); call with J. Patton (.3), call with A. O'Neill (.2), and call with plan group (.7) re: confirmation issues/strategy	B012	1.50	1,357.50
03/22/19	JPATT	Work on confirmation issues and strategy	B012	0.40	530.00
03/22/19	JPATT	Work on possible TDP changes	B012	1.30	1,722.50
03/22/19	RBRAD	Correspondence with S. Zieg and E. Harron re: confirmation order and next steps with the Committee	B012	0.20	195.00
03/22/19	RBRAD	Conference call with Debtors and ACC re: confirmation issues and strategy	B012	0.60	585.00
03/22/19	RBRAD	Conference with E. Harron re: confirmation issues and strategy	B012	0.20	195.00

Patton, James L., Jr., Future Claimants' Representative

Invoice Date:

April 23, 2019

Invoice Number:

50004896

Matter Number:

076815.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
03/22/19	SZIEG	Teleconference with N. Ramsey re: TDP revisions (.2); teleconference with J. Patton re: same (.5); teleconference with counsel for Debtors and counsel for ACC re: same (.6); correspondence and consider same (.6)	B012	1.90	1,491.50
03/01/19	CCATH	Research re: UST-proposed FCR candidates	B017	0.40	114.00
03/01/19	JSAZA	Research re: FCR appointment; emails with S. Zieg and T. Thomas re: same	B017	1.30	442.00
03/01/19	JSAZA	Emails with S. Zieg and V. Thomas re: FCR appointment	B017	0.60	204.00
03/01/19	SKOHU	Review draft response to UST motion	B017	0.20	120.00
03/01/19	SZIEG	Review pertinent documents re: UST's potential legal representative candidates (10.3); teleconference with N. Ramsey, D. Wright and J. Skakun re: depositions of legal representative candidates (.5)	B017	10.80	8,478.00
03/03/19	JKOCH	Draft outline of argument	B017	2.40	780.00
03/04/19	JPATT	Review materials from FCR candidates	B017	1.60	2,120.00
03/04/19	SKOHU	Analyze D. Connolly draft declaration	B017	0.50	300.00
03/04/19	SZIEG	Preparation re: D. Connelly deposition (5.7); teleconference with D. Wright and J. Skakun re: preparation for Connelly and Ableman depositions (.7)	B017	6.20	4,867.00
03/05/19	EHARR	Develop Patton direct re: FCR motion	B017	0.70	633.50
03/05/19	JPATT	Review reports and notes re: depositions of UST's FCR candidates	B017	1.30	1,722.50
03/05/19	LEDEN	Obtain and assemble documents re: depositions of Ableman and Connolly per attorney request	B017	0.50	142.50
03/05/19	LEDEN	Research re: FCR retention issues	B017	1.30	370.50
03/05/19	SKOHU	Confer with S. Zieg re: depositions of UST's FCR candidates	B017	0.50	300.00
03/05/19	SKOHU	Analyze S. Zieg summaries re: depositions of UST's FCR candidates	B017	0.50	300.00

Patton, James L., Jr., Future Claimants' Representative

Invoice Date:

April 23, 2019

Invoice Number:

50004896

Matter Number:

076815.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
03/05/19	SZIEG	Prepare for and attend depositions of P. Ableman and D. Connolly (5.5); draft summaries re: same (2.3); correspondence with E. Harron and R. Brady re: same (multiple) (.4)	B017	8.20	6,437.00
03/07/19	EHARR	Review deposition transcripts and case law re: FCR appointment	B017	0.50	452.50
03/07/19	JPATT	Hearing preparation call and follow-up	B017	2.80	3,710.00
03/07/19	JPATT	Review issues for testimony	B017	1.60	2,120.00
03/08/19	CCATH	Draft certificates of no objection re: YCST and Ankura retention applications	B017	0.20	57.00
03/08/19	SKOHU	Correspondence re: finalizing CNOs for YCST and Ankura retention papers	B017	0.20	120.00
03/11/19	CCATH	File certificates of no objection re: YCST and Ankura retention applications and submit same to chambers	B017	0.60	171.00
03/11/19	JPATT	Review retention order	B017	0.20	265.00
03/12/19	CCATH	Coordinate service of YCST and Ankura retention orders and prepare and file affidavit of service	B017	0.50	142.50
03/25/19	SZIEG	Review and draft summary of J. Patton testimony	B017	1.40	1,099.00
03/27/19	EHARR	Emails re: edits to FCR appeal brief	B017	0.30	271.50
03/12/19	EHARR	Review and edit YCST February fee statement re: fee application preparation	B018	0.30	271.50
03/19/19	LEDEN	Draft first combined monthly fee statement of YCST and J. Patton; email same to S. Kohut	B018	1.60	456.00
03/25/19	SKOHU	Analyze to finalize first monthly fee application for FCR and YCST	B018	1.00	600.00
03/26/19	EHARR	Review edits to YCST draft fee statement re: fee application preparation	B018	0.20	181.00
03/26/19	LEDEN	Update and revise YCST/J. Patton monthly fee statement for January-February 2019	B018	0.60	171.00
03/28/19	LEDEN	Further revisions, review, and updates to J. Patton / YCST monthly fee statement for January -February 2019 (includes time researching discrepancies with invoice)	B018	0.80	228.00
Total				227.50	\$197,211.50

Patton, James L., Jr., Future Claimants' Representative

Invoice Date:

April 23, 2019

Invoice Number:

50004896

Matter Number:

076815.1001

Timekeeper Summary

<u>Initials</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
CCATH	Casey Cathcart	Paralegal	8.50	285.00	2,422.50
EHARR	Edwin J. Harron	Partner	38.70	905.00	35,023.50
JPATT	James L. Patton Jr	Partner	39.60	1,325.00	52,470.00
JKOCH	Jared W. Kochenash	Associate	6.30	325.00	2,047.50
JSAZA	Jordan E. Sazant	Associate	1.90	340.00	646.00
LEDEN	Lisa M. Eden	Paralegal	5.60	285.00	1,596.00
RBRAD	Robert S. Brady	Partner	27.60	975.00	26,910.00
SKOHU	Sara Beth A.R. Kohut	Counsel	4.50	600.00	2,700.00
SZIEG	Sharon M. Zieg	Partner	91.20	785.00	71,592.00
TPAKR	Tara C. Pakrouh	Associate	0.80	400.00	320.00
TBUCH	Travis G. Buchanan	Associate	2.80	530.00	1,484.00
Total			227.50		\$197,211.50

Patton, James L., Jr., Future Claimants' Representative

Invoice Date:

April 23, 2019

Invoice Number:

50004896

Matter Number:

076815.1001

Task Summary**Task Code:B001****Case Administration**

<u>Name</u>	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Robert S. Brady	Partner	0.20	975.00	195.00
Casey Cathcart	Paralegal	2.50	285.00	712.50
Lisa M. Eden	Paralegal	0.80	285.00	228.00
Total		3.50		1,135.50

Task Code:B002**Court Hearings**

<u>Name</u>	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Edwin J. Harron	Partner	9.10	905.00	8,235.50
James L. Patton Jr	Partner	11.20	1,325.00	14,840.00
Robert S. Brady	Partner	5.40	975.00	5,265.00
Sharon M. Zieg	Partner	14.00	785.00	10,990.00
Jared W. Kochenash	Associate	3.00	325.00	975.00
Casey Cathcart	Paralegal	1.90	285.00	541.50
Total		44.60		40,847.00

Task Code:B007**Claims Analysis, Objections and Resolutions**

<u>Name</u>	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Sharon M. Zieg	Partner	0.80	785.00	628.00
Total		0.80		628.00

Task Code:B008**Meetings**

<u>Name</u>	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Edwin J. Harron	Partner	2.90	905.00	2,624.50
James L. Patton Jr	Partner	0.90	1,325.00	1,192.50
Sharon M. Zieg	Partner	7.20	785.00	5,652.00
Jared W. Kochenash	Associate	0.90	325.00	292.50
Total		11.90		9,761.50

Task Code:B012**Plan and Disclosure Statement**

<u>Name</u>	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Edwin J. Harron	Partner	24.70	905.00	22,353.50
James L. Patton Jr	Partner	20.00	1,325.00	26,500.00
Robert S. Brady	Partner	22.00	975.00	21,450.00
Sharon M. Zieg	Partner	42.60	785.00	33,441.00
Sara Beth A.R. Kohut	Counsel	1.60	600.00	960.00
Tara C. Pakrouh	Associate	0.80	400.00	320.00
Travis G. Buchanan	Associate	2.80	530.00	1,484.00
Casey Cathcart	Paralegal	2.40	285.00	684.00
Total		116.90		107,192.50

Patton, James L., Jr., Future Claimants' Representative

Invoice Date:

April 23, 2019

Invoice Number:

50004896

Matter Number:

076815.1001

Task Code:B017**Retention of Professionals/Fee Issues**

<u>Name</u>	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Edwin J. Harron	Partner	1.50	905.00	1,357.50
James L. Patton Jr	Partner	7.50	1,325.00	9,937.50
Sharon M. Zieg	Partner	26.60	785.00	20,881.00
Sara Beth A.R. Kohut	Counsel	1.90	600.00	1,140.00
Jared W. Kochenash	Associate	2.40	325.00	780.00
Jordan E. Sazant	Associate	1.90	340.00	646.00
Casey Cathcart	Paralegal	1.70	285.00	484.50
Lisa M. Eden	Paralegal	1.80	285.00	513.00
Total		45.30		35,739.50

Task Code:B018**Fee Application Preparation**

<u>Name</u>	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Edwin J. Harron	Partner	0.50	905.00	452.50
Sara Beth A.R. Kohut	Counsel	1.00	600.00	600.00
Lisa M. Eden	Paralegal	3.00	285.00	855.00
Total		4.50		1,907.50