

EXHIBIT A

Fee Statement

Robinson+Cole

DELIVERED BY EMAIL: mfink@rc.com

MAREMONT CORPORATION, OFFICIAL COMMITTEE
ATTN: PERRY BROWDER
CHAIR OF THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF ASBESTOS
CREDITORS
C/O SIMMONS HANLY CONROY
ONE COURT STREET
ALTON, IL 62002

April 26, 2019
Invoice 50273769

File # 38116.0001
Official Committee

Invoice Summary and Remittance Advice

Invoice attached and payable upon receipt

Please return this page or include invoice number with your remittance to:

Mailing Instructions

ROBINSON & COLE LLP
280 Trumbull Street
Hartford, CT 06103-3597

TEL # (860) 275-8200
FAX # (860) 275-8299
FEDERAL ID # 06-0512640

Wire Transfer Instructions

Bank of America
185 Asylum Street
Hartford, CT 06103

ABA Wire Routing # - 026009593
ACH Routing # - 011900254
Checking Account # - 000000154546

SUMMARY FOR INVOICE 50273769

Fees for Legal Services	\$ 164,991.00
Disbursements	2,419.55
Total Current Billing For this Matter	\$ 167,410.55

For Services through March 31, 2019

File # 38116.0001
Official Committee

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Phase -			
Task OCAC001 - CASE ADMIN & BUSNSS OPER-OFFCL CMTEE ASBESTOS CRDTRS			
02/16/19	K. M. Fix	Reviewing committee bylaws	0.40
02/20/19	L. A. Krepto	Revising response to UST objection to Patton as FCR (.8); reviewing revisions and communications re same (.5)	1.30
03/02/19	M. A. Fink	Preparation of memorandum for Committee (2.5); begin preparation of agreement for use by Committee (4.8)	7.30
03/05/19	L. A. Krepto	Discussing case administration and calendaring of dates with paralegal	0.30
03/08/19	L. A. Krepto	Telephone call with Committee to discuss hearing on objection to FCR and plan objection issues	0.20
03/08/19	M. A. Fink	Attend Committee meeting (1.0)	1.00
03/11/19	M. A. Fink	Correspondence with Committee member representatives re future claimants' representatives hearing and plan status (0.3)	0.30
03/13/19	S. M. Seamans	(A108) Review local rules; call Case Administrator re: Order	0.50
03/13/19	S. M. Seamans	Update Pleadings Index	1.70
03/22/19	M. A. Fink	Conference with committee re status (.8).	0.80
03/25/19	L. A. Krepto	Monitoring pleadings	0.20
03/26/19	K. M. Fix	Coordinating update of pleading index	0.40
03/28/19	L. A. Krepto	Monitoring pleadings	0.20
Total fees for CASE ADMIN & BUSNSS OPER-OFFCL CMTEE ASBESTOS CRDTRS			\$ 8,771.00

Summary of Task OCAC001 - CASE ADMIN & BUSNSS OPER-OFFCL CMTEE ASBESTOS CRDTRS

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate/Hour</u>	<u>Dollars</u>
K. M. Fix	0.80	500	400.00
L. A. Krepto	2.20	550	1,210.00
S. M. Seamans	2.20	200	440.00
M. A. Fink	9.40	715	6,721.00

Total Fees for Task: CASE ADMIN & BUSNSS OPER-OFFCL CMTEE ASBESTOS CRDTRS 8,771.00

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
Task OCAC004 - PLAN OF REORGANIZATION & DISCLOSURE STATEMENT			
03/01/19	M. A. Fink	Review of trust distribution procedures in light of comments received (0.4)	0.40
03/01/19	N. D. Ramsey	Reviewing draft Declaration of Dennis Connolly (.3); email correspondence with D. Wright re same (.2); email correspondence with members of the plaintiffs' bar regarding Judge Abelman in preparation for her deposition (.4)	0.90
03/02/19	M. A. Fink	Review correspondence re open issues (0.2)	0.20
03/04/19	N. D. Ramsey	Email communications with L. Krepto re TDP amendments	0.20
03/05/19	M. A. Fink	Conference with N. Ramsey re UST Objection (0.3); begin review of same (1.2); correspondence (multiple) re FFIC (0.8)	2.30
03/05/19	N. D. Ramsey	Conference with M. Fink re UST Objections (.3); begin review of same (1.2); correspondence (multiple) re Plan issues (.8)	2.30
03/06/19	L. A. Krepto	Reviewing pleadings including plan documents (.5); discussing same with N. Ramsey (.2)	0.70
03/06/19	N. D. Ramsey	Multiple communications regarding deposition, interview of UST candidates, preparation of response to US Trustee objection to plan, with internal working group (.8), Debtors' counsel and FCR counsel (.5); email communications with E. Harron regarding plan issues (.2); communication with Committee re plan objection (.3)	1.80
03/06/19	N. D. Ramsey	Reviewing pleadings including plan documents (.5); discussing same with L. Krepto (.2)	0.70
03/07/19	L. A. Krepto	Reviewing UST objection to plan and communications re same (.8); discussing response to same with N. Ramsey (.2); researching applicable information for response (.3)	1.30
03/07/19	N. D. Ramsey	Communications with L. Krepto and M. Fink re response to US Trustee's objection to plan (.4); participating in telephone call with Debtors' counsel, FCR counsel re same (.4)	0.80
03/08/19	L. A. Krepto	Reviewing changes to TDPs and Trust Agreement from FCR (.2); drafting communication to Committee re same (.1)	0.30
03/08/19	L. A. Krepto	Telephone call with N. Ramsey and D. Wright to discuss response to UST to objection to plan	0.40
03/08/19	L. A. Krepto	Researching cases and pleadings for response to UST objection to plan (3.8); begin drafting response to UST objection to plan (1.0) discussing issues with D. Wright (.2)	5.00
03/08/19	N. D. Ramsey	Conferring with L Krepto and D Wright regarding confirmation briefing, response to UST objection (.4); reviewing specific Trust provisions raised by the UST and analyzing same (.5)	0.90
03/08/19	N. D. Ramsey	Reviewing (.2) and email exchange (.1) with A O'Neil regarding UST proposal to resolve its objection to the Plan	0.30
03/08/19	D. Wright	Review UST plan objection (1.2)	1.20
03/09/19	L. A. Krepto	Drafting response to UST objection to plan (5.2); discussing same with N. Ramsey (.3)	5.50
03/11/19	L. A. Krepto	Researching issues for responses to UST objection to Plan	1.80
03/11/19	L. A. Krepto	Drafting response to UST objection to plan	6.20
03/11/19	M. A. Fink	Review of Confirmation Brief (2.8); Confirmation Order (1.9); research re UST Objections (2.5); correspondence with Debtors and N. Ramsey (multiple) re Exculpation language (0.5)	7.70
03/11/19	D. Wright	Reviewing US Trustee objection to disclosure statement and plan (.9); reviewing Trust Agreement filed with plan (1.2); reviewing Trust	12.60

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		Distribution Procedures filed with plan (1.3); reviewing trust distribution procedures of other recently formed asbestos trusts (2.3); research cases and materials relied upon by US Trustee in objection (2.8); revise Committee response to US Trustee confirmation objection (4.1)	
03/12/19	L. A. Krepto	Reviewing revised plan documents (multiple revisions) and responding to various communications re plan documents	2.00
03/12/19	L. A. Krepto	Reviewing revised response to UST objection to plan and revising Committee response to same	2.60
03/12/19	M. A. Fink	Review/comment on multiple drafts of Patton declaration (1.5); correspondence and conference with S. Zieg re same (0.3); review/comment to multiple drafts of confirmation order (3.3); review/comment multiple drafts of confirmation brief (3.0); review/comment to Committee reply to UST objection (1.1); conference with B. Warner (Sidley) re status (0.1); correspondence with Sidley re timing (0.2); correspondence with K. Stickles re future claimants' representative order (0.1); correspondence re 1125(e) language (0.2)	9.70
03/12/19	N. D. Ramsey	Reviewing and revising committee brief in response to UST objection (1.2); reviewing debtor brief (.5); reviewing plan and document changes and related communications with Debtors, FCR (1.1)	2.80
03/12/19	D. Wright	Revise response to US Trustee objection (3.3); draft communication to committee members regarding objection (.2)	3.50
03/12/19	D. Wright	Continue revising Committee response to UST objection regarding Garlock and TDPs (2.9); confer with N. Ramsey regarding edits (.2)	3.10
03/13/19	M. A. Fink	Review of Anderson Declaration (1.7)	1.70
03/13/19	D. Wright	Reviewing modified plan (1.2); reviewing blackline of modified exhibits to plan (1.1); reviewing confirmation brief (2.1); reviewing supporting declarations (1.8); preparing comments for confirmation hearing (2.0)	8.20
03/14/19	N. D. Ramsey	Conferring with M Fink re preparing for hearing on Disclosure Statement and Plan	0.20
03/15/19	L. A. Krepto	Reviewing pleadings and agenda for confirmation hearing	1.20
03/15/19	M. A. Fink	Work on materials for confirmation hearing (1.6); correspondence with Committee re status of open matters in preparation for confirmation (0.6)	2.20
03/16/19	M. A. Fink	Correspondence with Committee re Plan issues (0.4)	0.40
03/16/19	N. D. Ramsey	Preparing for confirmation hearing	1.60
03/17/19	M. A. Fink	Review comment on revised form of confirmation order (0.3); prepare for hearing (0.8)	1.10
03/17/19	N. D. Ramsey	Reviewing plan documents in preparation for confirmation hearing	3.50
03/19/19	M. A. Fink	Calls/correspondence re TDP (0.6); begin work on TDP markup based on 3/18 hearing (0.8)	1.40
03/20/19	N. D. Ramsey	Telephone call with S. Zieg regarding proposed resolution to UST Objection to plan (.2); reviewing communications regarding proposed language to address same (.2)	0.40
03/21/19	L. A. Krepto	Discussing TDP and plan related issues with N. Ramsey	0.30
03/21/19	L. A. Krepto	Reviewing proposed changes to TDPs and communication re same	0.10
03/21/19	M. A. Fink	Prepare summary for ACC of recent events (1.0); review/comment to Conference Order edits (0.4); conference with N. Ramsey and P. Browder re status (0.8)	2.20
03/22/19	L. A. Krepto	Reviewing communication exchange re TDP issue among Debtors, FCR and Committee	0.20

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
03/22/19	L. A. Krepto	Reviewing Garlock CRPs due to UST Objection	0.30
03/22/19	L. A. Krepto	Telephone call with N. Ramsey, M. Fink, and FCR and Debtors' counsel re TDPs	0.80
03/22/19	L. A. Krepto	Reviewing Garlock CRPs and drafting analysis of same to N. Ramsey and M. Fink	0.80
03/22/19	L. A. Krepto	Participating in Committee call re confirmation and TDP issues	0.80
03/22/19	M. A. Fink	Status call with debtors and future claimants' representative (0.6); research re plan issue (1.7); additional correspondence with the Committee re Plan issue (0.7)	3.00
03/22/19	M. A. Fink	Telephone call with N. Ramsey re TDP (.4)	0.40
03/22/19	N. D. Ramsey	Telephone call with S. Zieg re UST TDP-related plan objection (.2); participation in committee meeting regarding UST objection, with M. Fink, L. Krepto (.8); telephone call with A. O'Neill re same (.4); telephone call with M. Fink re same (2x) (.4); telephone call with J. Cooney re same (.2); email exchange with M. Fink and L. Krepto re same (.2); participating in telephone call among Debtors' counsel (A. O'Neill, A. Stromberg), FCR counsel (J. Patton, R. Brady, E. Harron, S. Zieg) and Committee counsel (with M. Fink, L. Krepto) re same (.7); email communications among counsel regarding rescheduling of confirmation hearing (.2); email correspondence among committee members, RC, re plan objection (.2)	2.90
03/26/19	M. A. Fink	Calls and correspondence re TDP issues (.7)	0.70
03/27/19	M. A. Fink	TDP issues (.5) begin review of TDP (1.8)	2.30
03/28/19	M. A. Fink	Correspondence with Committee member re status (.4)	0.40
03/29/19	L. A. Krepto	Reviewing TDP proposed changes for meeting (.3); participating in meeting with N. Ramsey & M. Fink regarding TDPS	1.20
03/29/19	M. A. Fink	Call with S. Zieg (.2); internal strategy call re TDP issues (Krepto, Ramsey, Fink) (1.0)	1.20
03/31/19	M. A. Fink	Review (.4) and comment (.2) re latest version of PROTECT Amendment	0.60
Total fees for PLAN OF REORGANIZATION & DISCLOSURE STATEMENT			\$ 81,291.50

Summary of Task OCAC004 - PLAN OF REORGANIZATION & DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate/Hour</u>	<u>Dollars</u>
L. A. Krepto	31.50	550	17,325.00
M. A. Fink	37.90	715	27,098.50
N. D. Ramsey	19.30	910	17,563.00
D. Wright	28.60	675	19,305.00

Total Fees for Task: PLAN OF REORGANIZATION & DISCLOSURE STATEMENT 81,291.50

Task OCAC007 - COURT HEARINGS

03/08/19	M. A. Fink	Attend hearing on future claimants' representative retention issues (3.5)	3.50
03/08/19	D. Wright	Prepare for hearing on cross-motions to appoint an FCR (3.6); attend hearing on cross-motions to appoint (3.5); confer with N. Ramsey	7.90

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
03/11/19	S. M. Seamans	regarding hearing result (.8) (A110) Review and file hearing transcript	0.20
03/11/19	S. M. Seamans	(A107) Call court reporter regarding hearing transcript	0.20
03/18/19	L. A. Krepto	Telephonic attendance at confirmation hearing	2.30
03/18/19	M. A. Fink	Preparation for Confirmation Hearing (2.0)	2.00
03/18/19	M. A. Fink	Attend Confirmation Hearing (2.8)	2.80
03/18/19	N. D. Ramsey	Meeting with representatives of the Debtors, FCR in preparation for confirmation hearing (.4); appearance at confirmation hearing (2.8)	3.20
Total fees for COURT HEARINGS			\$ 15,524.00

Summary of Task OCAC007 - COURT HEARINGS

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate/Hour</u>	<u>Dollars</u>
L. A. Krepto	2.30	550	1,265.00
S. M. Seamans	0.40	200	80.00
M. A. Fink	8.30	715	5,934.50
N. D. Ramsey	3.20	910	2,912.00
D. Wright	7.90	675	5,332.50

Total Fees for Task: COURT HEARINGS 15,524.00**Task OCAC008 - ASBESTOS MATTERS**

03/01/19	D. Wright	Confer with N. Ramsey, J. Skakun, and S. Zieg regarding depositions of P. Ableman and D. Connolly (.9); prep for P. Ableman deposition (1.0); confer with N. Ramsey regarding deposition (.3); review draft declaration of D. Connolly (.8); review declaration of P. Ableman (1.2); review Patton declaration in support of FCR retention (.9); prepare questions for deposition of P. Ableman (.8); prepare questions for deposition of D. Connolly (.7)	6.60
03/03/19	D. Wright	Reviewing information from FCR regarding deposition of P. Ableman (1.0); review information from Debtors regarding deposition of P. Ableman and D. Connolly (1.2); prepare for deposition of P. Ableman (2.6)	4.80
03/04/19	L. A. Krepto	Revising TDPs (.2); drafting communication to debtor's counsel and FCR counsel re same (.1)	0.30
03/04/19	S. M. Seamans	Telephone conference with L. Krepto regarding Supplemental Declaration	0.20
03/04/19	S. M. Seamans	Research and update service list per M. Fink's instruction	0.30
03/04/19	S. M. Seamans	File Supplemental Declaration	0.70
03/04/19	D. Wright	Prepare for deposition of Dennis Connolly (1.6); prepare for deposition of Peggy Ableman (2.9); review articles and testimony by P. Ableman (3.8) review first day declaration in preparation for deposition (.7); review trust distribution procedures in preparation for deposition (1.3); confer with counsel for Debtor and proposed FCR regarding deposition related issues (.9)	11.20

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
03/05/19	L. A. Krepto	Exchanging communications re change to TDPs (.2); discussing same with N. Ramsey (.1)	0.10
03/05/19	N. D. Ramsey	Depositions of Peggy Ableman (1.6) and Dennis Connolly (1.3)	2.90
03/05/19	D. Wright	Preparing for depositions (2.6); taking deposition of P. Ableman (1.5); taking deposition of D. Connolly (1.4); conferring with various counsel regarding preparation (1.0)	6.50
03/08/19	N. D. Ramsey	Meeting with M Fink and D Wright re court ruling (.3); conducting committee meeting re same (.4)	0.70
03/13/19	S. M. Seamans	(TSK1) Various discussions and emails regarding filing procedures	1.00
03/21/19	S. M. Seamans	Order transcript	0.20
03/24/19	S. M. Seamans	(A102) Research issues arising from Plan objection	0.40
Total fees for ASBESTOS MATTERS			\$ 23,698.50

Summary of Task OCAC008 - ASBESTOS MATTERS

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate/Hour</u>	<u>Dollars</u>
L. A. Krepto	0.40	550	220.00
S. M. Seamans	2.80	200	560.00
N. D. Ramsey	3.60	910	3,276.00
D. Wright	29.10	675	19,642.50

Total Fees for Task: ASBESTOS MATTERS 23,698.50**Task OCAC012 - LITIGATION & ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS**

03/06/19	D. Wright	Preparing for hearing on future claimants' representative issues (1.8); reviewing deposition transcript of P. Ableman (.9)	2.70
03/07/19	D. Wright	Prepare for hearing through review of deposition transcripts (1.3); review of Trustee's objection to FCR (.8); review of Debtor's response (.9); review of Committee's response (.8); preparing argument (2.9)	6.70
03/13/19	S. M. Seamans	(TSK1) Draft Amended Certificate of No Objection	0.70
Total fees for LITIGATION & ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS			\$ 6,485.00

Summary of Task OCAC012 - LITIGATION & ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate/Hour</u>	<u>Dollars</u>
S. M. Seamans	0.70	200	140.00
D. Wright	9.40	675	6,345.00

Total Fees for Task: LITIGATION & ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS 6,485.00**Task OCAC015 - PROFESSIONAL RETENTION & FEE ISSUES**

03/01/19	K. M. Fix	Editing Appendix to objection UST to appoint FCR (.4); editing objection to UST to appoint FCR (1.1); finalizing objection (.4)	1.90
----------	-----------	---	------

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
03/01/19	S. M. Seamans	Draft Index for Appendix and prepare for filing	0.50
03/01/19	M. A. Fink	Finalize objection to UST future claimants' representative motion (3.9); multiple calls and correspondence with K. Fix and N. Ramsey re same (0.7); correspondence with debtors re status and next steps (0.2); review materials re two remaining candidates (2.3); prep call re depositions with N. Ramsey and D. Wright (0.7)	7.80
03/03/19	M. A. Fink	Calls and correspondence with N. Ramsey, D. Wright and K. Fix regarding depositions (0.7)	0.70
03/04/19	L. A. Krepto	Coordinating filing and service of supplemental Ramsey declaration and revised service list with S. Seamans	0.60
03/04/19	M. A. Fink	Conference with D. Wright re depositions (0.3); correspondence with S. Zieg re same (0.1); correspondence with debtor re logistics and status of Connolly declaration (0.3)	0.70
03/06/19	L. A. Krepto	Discussing hearing on preparation for objection to UST motion to appoint FCR with N. Ramsey (.2); discussing same with D. Wright (.1); reviewing deposition transcripts and drafting committee email re same (3.0)	3.30
03/06/19	M. A. Fink	Review of transcripts for Ableman (0.5) and Connolly (0.5)	1.00
03/07/19	M. A. Fink	Participate in call re hearing preparation with counsel for Debtor and future claimants' representative (0.7); prepare for hearing with future claimants' representative (1.0)	1.70
03/08/19	M. A. Fink	Prepare for hearing on future claimants' representative retention motions (3.0)	3.00
03/11/19	M. A. Fink	Review/comment on orders re dueling future claimants' representatives motions (0.2); correspondence re same (0.2)	0.40
03/12/19	L. A. Krepto	Coordinating and reviewing certificates of no objections to retention applications to Committee professionals	0.20
03/13/19	L. A. Krepto	Addressing inquiries re CNO to retention applications	0.20
03/13/19	D. Wright	Attending to issue regarding entry of committee professional retention orders (.3)	0.30
03/25/19	K. M. Fix	Reviewing fee app	0.60
Total fees for PROFESSIONAL RETENTION & FEE ISSUES			\$ 14,857.00

Summary of Task OCAC015 - PROFESSIONAL RETENTION & FEE ISSUES

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate/Hour</u>	<u>Dollars</u>
K. M. Fix	2.50	500	1,250.00
L. A. Krepto	4.30	550	2,365.00
S. M. Seamans	0.50	200	100.00
M. A. Fink	15.30	715	10,939.50
D. Wright	0.30	675	202.50

Total Fees for Task: PROFESSIONAL RETENTION & FEE ISSUES 14,857.00

Task OCAC016 - FEE APPLICATION PREPARATION

03/07/19	M. A. Fink	Finalize fee statement for RC February fees (0.6)	0.60
03/12/19	S. M. Seamans	Work on Fee Application	1.40

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
03/13/19	S. M. Seamans	Work on Fee Application	0.70
03/20/19	S. M. Seamans	Work on fee applications	2.70
03/21/19	S. M. Seamans	Continue drafting fee application documents.	5.70
03/22/19	K. M. Fix	Editing fee application for R&C	4.20
03/23/19	K. M. Fix	Continuing editing fee application for R&C (1.3); editing fee application summary for R&C (1.8)	3.10
03/26/19	M. A. Fink	Calls/correspondence with K. Fix and S. Seamans re fee application (.6)	0.60
03/27/19	M. A. Fink	Review of application (.3)	0.30
03/27/19	M. A. Fink	Work on materials for RC 1st monthly application (1.2)	1.20
03/28/19	K. M. Fix	Editing summary charts for RC fee application	2.00
03/28/19	S. M. Seamans	Final revisions to Fee Application	2.50
03/31/19	K. M. Fix	Reviewing case compensation order (.2); drafting correspondence to S. Seamans and M. Fink re application (.3)	0.50
03/31/19	M. A. Fink	Review/revise 1st monthly (.6)	0.60
Total fees for FEE APPLICATION PREPARATION			\$ 9,859.50

Summary of Task OCAC016 - FEE APPLICATION PREPARATION

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate/Hour</u>	<u>Dollars</u>
K. M. Fix	9.80	500	4,900.00
S. M. Seamans	13.00	200	2,600.00
M. A. Fink	3.30	715	2,359.50

Total Fees for Task: FEE APPLICATION PREPARATION 9,859.50**Task OCAC017 - NONWORKING TRAVEL**

03/08/19	M. A. Fink	NYC to Wilmington for hearing (1.2); Wilmington to NYC following hearing (2.6)	3.80
03/18/19	M. A. Fink	Non working Travel to (0.7); and returning from (1.8) Wilmington for Confirmation Hearing	2.50

Total fees for NONWORKING TRAVEL \$ 4,504.50

Summary of Task OCAC017 - NONWORKING TRAVEL

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate/Hour</u>	<u>Dollars</u>
M. A. Fink	6.30	715	4,504.50

Total Fees for Task: NONWORKING TRAVEL 4,504.50**Summary of Phase -**

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate/Hour</u>	<u>Dollars</u>
K. M. Fix	13.10	500	6,550.00

Robinson+Cole

Page: 10
 Date: April 26, 2019
 Invoice #: 50273769

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>			<u>Hours</u>
		L. A. Krepto	40.70	550	22,385.00
		S. M. Seamans	19.60	200	3,920.00
		M. A. Fink	80.50	715	57,557.50
		N. D. Ramsey	26.10	910	23,751.00
		D. Wright	75.30	675	50,827.50
		Total Fees for Phase:			164,991.00
	Fees for Legal Services				\$ 164,991.00

Summary of Disbursements

	<u>Amount</u>
Delivery Services	\$ 54.42
Deposition Transcripts	868.00
Federal Express Delivery Charge	60.28
Local Travel: Non-Mileage	181.28
Meals	11.47
Online Research: Lexis	353.50
Outside Printing	194.40
Telephone/Conference Services	79.00
Travel: Air/Rail	585.00
Travel: Non-Mileage	30.00
Print Black & White (44 pages @ 0.05 / pg)	2.20
Total Disbursements	\$ 2,419.55

Summary for Invoice # 50273769

Official Committee	
Fees for Legal Services	\$ 164,991.00
Disbursements	2,419.55
Total Current Billing For this Matter	\$ 167,410.55