

**EXHIBIT A**

**Compensation Summary**

**MAREMONT CORPORATION, et al.****COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY  
MARCH 1, 2019 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2019**

<b>Project Category</b>	<b>Total Hours</b>	<b>Total Fees</b>
Case Administration	5.9	\$3,150.50
Fee Application Matters/Objections	10.1	\$5,658.00
Preparation for and Attendance at Hearings	32.7	\$21,744.50
Reorganization Plan	55.8	\$38,553.00
Reports; Statements and Schedules	3.3	\$2,289.50
Retention Matters	16.5	\$11,714.50
U.S. Trustee Matters and Meetings	0.7	\$535.50
Budgeting (Case)	0.1	\$76.50
<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>125.1</b>	<b>\$83,722.00</b>

Cole Schotz P.C.

New York

New Jersey

Maryland

Texas

Florida

MAREMONT CORPORATION  
ATTENTION: CARL D. ANDERSON, II  
2135 WEST MAPLE ROAD  
TROY, MI 48084Re: Client/Matter No. 58686-0001  
MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11

Invoice No. 834897

April 24, 2019

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH MARCH 31, 2019

<u>DATE</u>	<u>NARRATIVE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
	<b>CASE ADMINISTRATION</b>		<b>5.90</b>	<b>\$3,150.50</b>
03/01/19	REVIEW CRITICAL DATES CALENDAR RE: CASE MANAGEMENT	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/01/19	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND B. WARNER RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES CHART	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/03/19	REVIEW EMAIL FROM A. O'NEILL E: EXTENSION OF CONFIRMATION OBJECTION DEADLINE	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/04/19	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND B. WARNER RE: TRANSCRIPT FROM FEBRUARY 25, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/05/19	UPDATE CRITICAL DATES CHART	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/08/19	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND B. WARNER RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES CHART	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/08/19	EMAIL FROM AND TO K. STICKLES AND TELEPHONE TO G. MATTHEWS RE: EXPEDITED TRANSCRIPT FROM MARCH 8, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/10/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH A. O'NEILL, INCLUDING BRIEF REVIEW OF HEARING TRANSCRIPT	JKS	0.40	306.00
03/11/19	EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH A. O'NEILL RE: FCR ORDER AND CONFIRMATION HEARING	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/11/19	UPDATE CRITICAL DATES CHART RE: FILING DEADLINES RE: MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT AND DEADLINES TO PAY UST FEES	PVR	0.40	118.00
03/11/19	CONFERENCE WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: CRITICAL DATES CHARTS AND MORS	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/11/19	EMAIL FROM AND TO B. WARNER RE: REVISION TO CRITICAL DATES CHART	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/11/19	EMAIL FROM AND TO G. MATTHEWS RE: TRANSCRIPT FROM MARCH 8, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.10	29.50

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11  
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice No. 834598  
April 10, 2019  
Page 2

---

03/12/19	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM B. WARNER RE: ANTICIPATED FILINGS AND TASKS FOR COMPLETION	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/14/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH M. FINK RE: HEARING AGENDA	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/15/19	EMAIL TO A. ROVIRA RE: COURTCALL APPEARANCE	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/15/19	EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH B. EILANDER RE: APPEARANCE AT COMBINED HEARING	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/18/19	EMAIL TO AND FROM G. MATTHEWS RE: TRANSCRIPT OF MARCH 18, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/19/19	EMAIL FROM G. MATTHEWS AND TO K. STICKLES, B. WARNER, A. O'NEILL AND A. STROMBERG RE: TRANSCRIPT OF MARCH 18, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/22/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH R. SCHEPACARTER RE: MARCH 26 HEARING	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/22/19	EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH A. O'NEILL, S. ZIEG, M. FINK ET AL RE: RESCHEDULED CONFIRMATION HEARING	JKS	0.30	229.50
03/22/19	EMAIL TO E. HARRON ET AL RE: CONTINUANCE OF HEARING AND FORWARDING AMENDED AGENDA	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/22/19	REVIEW CRITICAL DATES CALENDAR RE: CASE MANAGEMENT	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/22/19	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND B. WARNER RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES CHART	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/22/19	REVIEW EMAIL FROM A. O'NEILL RE: SCHEDULING	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/22/19	UPDATE CRITICAL DATES CHART RE: NEW HEARING DATE FOR COMBINED CONFIRMATION HEARING AND APPLICABLE DEADLINES	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/25/19	EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH B. WARNER RE: MOTION TO EXTEND DEADLINE TO FILE SCHEDULES AND STATEMENTS AND MOTION TO EXTEND REMOVAL DEADLINE	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/25/19	UPDATE CHART OF PROFESSIONAL FEES	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/25/19	UPDATE CASE CALENDAR RE: CONTINUED COMBINED CONFIRMATION HEARING AND NEW DEADLINE TO FILE NOTICE OF AGENDA	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/25/19	EMAIL TO B. WARNER AND K. STICKLES RE: FILED SIDLEY FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/26/19	UPDATE CRITICAL DATES CHART	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/27/19	EMAIL FROM AND TO K. STICKLES RE: MODIFICATIONS TO DRAFT COLE SCHOTZ FEE APPLICATION	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/27/19	REVIEW CRITICAL DATES CALENDAR AND EMAIL TO P. RATKOWIAK RE: ADDITIONAL CASE DEADLINES FOR CALENDARING	JKS	0.20	153.00

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11  
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice No. 834598  
April 10, 2019  
Page 3

03/28/19	EMAIL FROM AND TO K. STICKLES AND UPDATE CRITICAL DATES CHART AND CASE CALENDAR RE: DEADLINE TO PAY US TRUSTEE QUARTERLY FEES	PVR	0.20	59.00
03/28/19	CONFERENCE WITH B. WARNER RE: DEADLINE TO FILE REMOVAL MOTION AND MOTION TO EXTEND TIME TO FILE STATEMENTS AND SCHEDULES	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/28/19	REVIEW CASE CALENDAR RE: FILING DATE AND RELATED DEADLINES FOR APRIL HEARING	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/28/19	UPDATE CHART OF PROFESSIONAL FEES	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/28/19	UPDATE CASE CALENDAR AND CRITICAL DATES CHART RE: OBJECTION DEADLINE FOR COLE SCHOTZ FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/29/19	REVIEW UPDATED CRITICAL DATES CHART RE: CASE MANAGEMENT	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/29/19	UPDATE CHART OF PROFESSIONAL FEES	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/29/19	UPDATE CASE CALENDAR AND CRITICAL DATES CHART RE: OBJECTION DEADLINE FOR KASOWITZ BENSON FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/29/19	EMAIL TO B. WARNER AND K. STICKLES RE: FILED FEE APPLICATION FOR KASOWITZ BENSON	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/29/19	EMAIL TO B. WARNER AND K. STICKLES RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES CHART	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/29/19	EMAIL TO AND FROM K. STICKLES RE: APPROVAL TO FILE KASOWITZ BENSON FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	PVR	0.10	29.50
	<b>FEE APPLICATION MATTERS/OBJECTIONS</b>		<b>10.10</b>	<b>\$5,658.50</b>
03/14/19	REVIEW DRC SECOND MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION AND EXECUTE NOTICE FOR FILING	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/14/19	EFILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF DRC FEBRUARY FEE APPLICATION	PVR	0.20	59.00
03/14/19	PREPARE NOTICE RE: DRC FEBRUARY FEE APPLICATION	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/14/19	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES RE: APPROVAL TO FILE DRC FEBRUARY FEE APPLICATION	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/15/19	REVIEW EXHIBIT TO COLE SCHOTZ APPLICATION RE: CONFIDENTIALITY AND PRIVILEGE AND COMPLIANCE WITH LOCAL RULES AND GUIDELINES	JKS	2.10	1,606.50
03/19/19	REVIEW AND FINALIZE EXHIBIT TO COLE SCHOTZ FIRST FEE APPLICATION	JKS	1.10	841.50
03/19/19	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: PROFESSIONAL FEE ESTIMATE	JKS	0.10	76.50

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11  
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice No. 834598  
April 10, 2019  
Page 4

03/22/19	PREPARE CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: DONLIN RECANO JANUARY FEE APPLICATION	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/22/19	EFILE CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: DONLIN RECANO JANUARY FEE APPLICATION	PVR	0.20	59.00
03/22/19	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND A. LOGAN RE: FILED CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: DONLIN RECANO JANUARY FEE APPLICATION	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/25/19	EFILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF SIDLEY FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	PVR	0.30	88.50
03/25/19	EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: FILING SIDLEY FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/25/19	CONFERENCE WITH, EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND DRAFT NOTICE RE: SIDLEY FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	PVR	0.20	59.00
03/26/19	CONFERENCE WITH K. STICKLES AND FINALIZE COLE SCHOTZ FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	PVR	1.90	560.50
03/27/19	REVIEW AND REVISE COLE SCHOTZ FIRST FEE APPLICATION AND EXHIBITS	JKS	1.20	918.00
03/27/19	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: FEE INQUIRY	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/28/19	REVIEW AND FINALIZE COLE SCHOTZ FIRST FEE APPLICATION, INCLUDING CONVERSATION WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: FILING	JKS	0.30	229.50
03/28/19	EFILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF COLE SCHOTZ FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	PVR	0.30	88.50
03/28/19	REVIEW EMAIL FROM A. O'NEILL RE: SIDLEY FEE APPLICATION	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/28/19	EMAIL TO B. WARNER RE: CNO FOR SIDLEY FEE APPLICATION	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/28/19	EMAIL FROM AND TO K. STICKLES AND REVIEW AND REVISE COLE SCHOTZ FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	PVR	0.30	88.50
03/29/19	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: KASOWITZ MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/29/19	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: KASOWITZ MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/29/19	REVIEW AND EXECUTE NOTICE RE: KASOWITZ MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION, INCLUDING COMMUNICATION WITH P. RATKOWIAK	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/29/19	EFILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF KASOWITZ BENSON FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	PVR	0.30	88.50
03/29/19	EMAIL FROM B. WARNER AND PREPARE NOTICE FOR KASOWITZ BENSON FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	PVR	0.20	59.00

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11  
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001Invoice No. 834598  
April 10, 2019  
Page 5

---

<b>PREPARATION FOR AND ATTENDANCE AT HEARINGS</b>			<b>32.70</b>	<b>\$21,744.50</b>
03/01/19	REVIEW AND REVISE BINDERS RE: MARCH 8TH HEARING AND EMAIL TO PARCELS RE: DUPLICATION OF BINDER	PVR	0.20	59.00
03/04/19	REVISE NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR MARCH 18, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/04/19	EMAIL FROM AND TO K. STICKLES AND B. WARNER RE: TELEPHONIC APPEARANCE AT MARCH 8, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/04/19	TELEPHONE TO AND EMAIL FROM COURTCALL RE: TELEPHONIC APPEARANCE FOR B. WARNER AT MARCH 8, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/04/19	REVISE NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR MARCH 8, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.20	59.00
03/04/19	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES RE: DRAFT NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR MARCH 8, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/05/19	CONFERENCE WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: MODIFICATIONS TO MARCH 8 HEARING AGENDA	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/05/19	REVIEW AND REVISE HEARING BINDERS FOR MARCH 8, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.40	118.00
03/05/19	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND B. WARNER AND REVISED NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR MARCH 8, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.30	88.50
03/06/19	COORDINATE SUBMISSION OF NOTICE OF AGENDA AND HEARING BINDERS TO CHAMBERS	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/06/19	FINALIZE MARCH 8 HEARING AGENDA, INCLUDING MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH B. WARNER AND P. RATKOWIAK RE: AGENDA	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/06/19	REVIEW 3/8 HEARING AGENDA	NLP	0.10	94.00
03/06/19	EFILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR MARCH 8, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.30	88.50
03/06/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH A. O'NEILL RE: MARCH 8 HEARING AND COURTCALL RESERVATIONS	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/06/19	REVIEW MARCH 8 HEARING AGENDA AND CONFERENCE WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: REVISIONS TO THE AGENDA	JKS	0.30	229.50
03/06/19	UPDATE HEARING BINDERS RE: MARCH 8, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.40	118.00
03/06/19	EMAIL FROM AND TO B. WARNER AND K. STICKLES AND REVISE NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR MARCH 8, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.20	59.00
03/07/19	REVIEW DEBTORS AND UST'S FCR MOTIONS, RELATED RESPONSES, DECLARATIONS AND DEPOSITIONS RE: PREPARATION FOR MARCH 8 HEARING	JKS	3.40	2,601.00
03/07/19	EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH A. O'NEILL AND J. SKAKUN RE: PREPARATIONS FOR MARCH 8 HEARING	JKS	0.20	153.00

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11  
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice No. 834598  
April 10, 2019  
Page 6

---

03/08/19	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND HEARING, INCLUDING PRE- AND POST-HEARING CONFERENCE WITH CO-COUNSEL	JKS	5.30	4,054.50
03/08/19	CONFERENCE WITH K. STICKLES RE: 3/8 HEARING REPORT	NLP	0.20	188.00
03/08/19	CONFERENCE WITH A. O'NEILL RE: 3/8 HEARING STATUS AND STRATEGY	NLP	0.20	188.00
03/12/19	CONFERENCE WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: PREPARATION OF HEARING AGENDA	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/12/19	EMAIL TO N. HUNT RE: SCHEDULED MARCH 18 COMBINED HEARING	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/12/19	REVIEW EMAIL FROM N. HUNT RE: TIME ALLOCATED FOR MARCH 18 HEARING AND EMAIL TO A. O'NEILL RE: HEARING	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/13/19	EMAIL TO A. O'NEILL, A. STROMBERG, B. WARNER AND K. STICKLES RE: DRAFT NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR MARCH 18, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/13/19	CONFERENCE WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: UPDATED AGENDA FOR COMBINED HEARING	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/13/19	REVIEW AND REVISE UPDATED AGENDA RE: COMBINED HEARING	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/13/19	EMAIL TO A. O'NEILL RE: AGENDA FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/13/19	REVIEW EMAIL FROM A. O'NEILL RE: MARCH 18 HEARING AGENDA	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/13/19	REVIEW AND REVISE NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR MARCH 18, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.40	118.00
03/14/19	CONFERENCE WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: HEARING BINDER AND HEARING PREPARATIONS	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/14/19	CONFERENCE WITH K. STICKLES AND COORDINATE PRODUCTION OF EXTRA BINDERS FOR HEARING ON MARCH 18, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/14/19	MULTIPLE EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH B. WARNER AND A. STROMBERG RE: CONFIRMATION HEARING PREPARATIONS AND PRESENTATION	JKS	0.40	306.00
03/14/19	REVIEW 3/18 HEARING AGENDA	NLP	0.10	94.00
03/14/19	COMMUNICATIONS WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: MODIFICATIONS TO NOTICE OF AGENDA RE: COMBINED HEARING	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/14/19	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: COMBINED HEARING AGENDA	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/14/19	REVIEW AND FINALIZE NOTICE OF AGENDA RE: COMBINED HEARING FOR FILING	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/14/19	COMMUNICATIONS WITH K. STICKLES, A. O'NEILL, A. STROMBERG AND B. WARNER RE: AGENDA	PVR	0.30	88.50
03/14/19	EFILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR MARCH 18, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.40	118.00
03/14/19	REVIEW AND REVISE HEARING BINDERS RE: MARCH 18, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.70	206.50



Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11  
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice No. 834598  
April 10, 2019  
Page 7

---

03/15/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH K. STICKLES AND EMAIL PARCELS RE: PREPARATION OF HEARING BINDERS	PVR	0.60	177.00
03/15/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH A. STROMBERG AND B. WARNER RE: HEARING PREPARATIONS	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/15/19	CONFERENCE WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: HEARING BINDERS	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/17/19	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND PREPARE AMENDED NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR MARCH 18, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.20	59.00
03/17/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH K. STICKLES AND EFILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF AMENDED NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR MARCH 18, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.20	59.00
03/18/19	CONFERENCES WITH K. STICKLES, A. STROMBERG AND B. WARNER RE: PREPARATION FOR MARCH 18, 2019 HEARING AND RE: REVISED CONFIRMATION ORDER	PVR	0.90	265.50
03/18/19	PREPARE FOR OMNIBUS HEARING, INCLUDING MEETING WITH CO-COUNSEL, AND ATTEND COMBINED HEARING	JKS	7.40	5,661.00
03/18/19	PREPARATION FOR AND ATTENDANCE AT CONFIRMATION HEARING	NLP	2.90	2,726.00
03/18/19	EMAIL TO AND FROM J. SCHOMBERG RE: COURTCALL CONFIRMATION FOR MARCH 18, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/18/19	CONFERENCE WITH K. STICKLES AND UPDATE CASE CALENDAR RE: CONTINUED HEARING TO MARCH 26, 2019	PVR	0.20	59.00
03/18/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH J. SCHOMBERG RE: TELEPHONIC APPEARANCE AT MARCH 18, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/18/19	TELEPHONE TO AND EMAIL FROM COURTCALL RE: APPEARANCE FOR J. SCHOMBERG AT MARCH 18, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.20	59.00
03/21/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH D. GROTTINI RE: MARCH 26 HEARING AGENDA AND BINDERS	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/21/19	REVIEW AND UPDATED CONFIRMATION HEARING AGENDA	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/21/19	EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH A. O'NEILL AND B. WARNER RE: AGENDA FOR CONTINUED CONFIRMATION HEARING	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/22/19	REVIEW 3/26 HEARING AGENDA	NLP	0.10	94.00
03/22/19	EMAIL TO AND CONFERENCE WITH N. HUNT RE: CONTINUANCE OF CONFIRMATION HEARING	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/22/19	REVIEW, REVISE AND EXECUTE NOTICE OF AGENDA RE: MARCH 26 HEARING FOR FILING	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/22/19	CONFERENCE WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: MARCH 26 HEARING PREPARATIONS	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/22/19	FOLLOW-UP EMAIL TO N. HUNT RE: MARCH 26 HEARING AMENDED AGENDA	JKS	0.10	76.50

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11  
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice No. 834598  
April 10, 2019  
Page 8

03/22/19	REVIEW, REVISE AND EXECUTE NOTICE OF AGENDA CONTINUING MARCH 26 HEARING FOR FILING, INCLUDING CONFERENCE WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: FILING AND SERVICE OF AMENDED AGENDA	JKS	0.30	229.50
03/22/19	CONFERENCE WITH K. STICKLES RE: NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR MARCH 26, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/22/19	EFILE AND COORDINATE SUBMISSION OF NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR MARCH 26, 2019 HEARING TO CHAMBERS	PVR	0.30	88.50
03/22/19	EMAIL TO AND FROM D. GROTTINI RE: UPDATING HEARING BINDERS FROM MARCH 18, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/22/19	EMAIL FROM K. STICKLES RE: NEW HEARING DATE RE: COMBINED CONFIRMATION HEARING	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/22/19	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND PREPARE AMENDED NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR MARCH 26, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.30	88.50
03/22/19	CONFERENCE WITH K. STICKLES RE: AMENDED NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR MARCH 26, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/22/19	EFILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF AMENDED NOTICE OF AGENDA RE: MARCH 26, 2019 HEARING	PVR	0.30	88.50
	<b>REORGANIZATION PLAN</b>		<b>55.80</b>	<b>\$38,553.00</b>
03/01/19	REVIEW EMAILS FROM E. SLIGHTS, N. PERNICK AND A. O'NEILL RE: PLAN AND OBJECTION DEADLINE	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/01/19	REVIEW EMAIL FROM A. TENENBAUM RE: PLAN	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/01/19	EMAILS FROM/TO E. SLIGHTS, A. TENENBAUM, A. O'NEILL RE: EXTENSION OF CONFIRMATION OBJECTION DEADLINE	NLP	0.40	376.00
03/01/19	CONFERENCE WITH A. O'NEILL, A. STROMBERG RE: SLIGHTS REQUEST FOR EXTENSION OF CONFIRMATION OBJECTION DEADLINE	NLP	0.40	376.00
03/04/19	REVIEW A. O'NEILL, A. TENENBAUM 3/3, 3/4 EMAILS RE: EPA POTENTIAL CONFIRMATION OBJECTIONS	NLP	0.20	188.00
03/04/19	REVIEW AND ANALYZE EMAIL FROM B. WARNER TO EPA RE: THIRD PARTY RELEASE AND JURISDICTION	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/04/19	REVIEW EMAIL FROM A. TENENBAUM RE: EPA CONFIRMATION OBJECTION	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/04/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE AND CONFERENCE WITH B. WARNER RE: PLAN REVISIONS AND SUPPLEMENT	JKS	0.40	306.00
03/04/19	REVIEW EMAILS FROM R. SCHEPACARTER AND REVIEW AND ANALYZE OBJECTIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND JOINT PREPACKAGED PLAN, INCLUDING REVIEW OF TDPS	JKS	2.90	2,218.50

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11  
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice No. 834598  
April 10, 2019  
Page 9

03/04/19	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES, A. O'NEILL, A. STROMBERG AND B. WARNER RE: UST'S OBJECTION TO THE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND JOINT PREPACKAGED PLAN OF REORGANIZATION AND RETRIEVE SAME	PVR	0.20	59.00
03/05/19	REVIEW EMAILS FROM A. O'NEILL AND A. TENENBAUM RE: PLAN ISSUES	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/05/19	REVIEW OUST OBJECTION TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND PLAN	NLP	1.10	1,034.00
03/05/19	REVIEW A. TENENBAUM, B. WARNER 3/5 EMAILS RE: EPA CONFIRMATION OBJECTION	NLP	0.20	188.00
03/05/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH B. WARNER RE: VARIOUS EXTENSIONS TO DEADLINE TO OBJECT TO CONFIRMATION OF PLAN AND EMAIL TO P. RATKOWIAK RE: EXTENSIONS FOR AGENDA	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/06/19	REVIEW EMAIL FROM E. SLIGHTS AND ANALYZE OBJECTIONS TO CONFIRMATION	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/06/19	REVIEW EMAILS FROM A. O'NEILL, B. WARNER, ET AL RE: OBJECTION TO CONFIRMATION	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/06/19	RESEARCH RE: OPEN PLAN AND CONFIRMATION ISSUES	JKS	3.20	2,448.00
03/06/19	REVIEW A. O'NEILL, B. WARNER 3/6 EMAILS RE: PREVIEW OF DOJ PLAN OBJECTIONS	NLP	0.30	282.00
03/07/19	REVIEW B. WARNER, A. O'NEILL 3/6 EMAILS RE: POSSIBLE RESPONSE TO DOJ CONFIRMATION OBJECTIONS	NLP	0.20	188.00
03/07/19	PREPARATION FOR HEARING	JKS	2.30	1,759.50
03/08/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH A. STROMBERG RE: US TRUSTEE OBJECTIONS TO PLAN	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/08/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH R. SCHEPACARTER RE: PLAN OBJECTIONS	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/11/19	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM A. STROMBERG RE: NEGOTIATIONS WITH US TRUSTEE RE: PLAN PROVISIONS	JKS	0.40	306.00
03/11/19	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE WITH A. STROMBERG AND R. SCHEPACARTER RE: PLAN ISSUES	JKS	0.50	382.50
03/11/19	CONFERENCE WITH A. STROMBERG AND RESEARCH RE: SCOPE OF EXCULPATION IN PREPACK CHAPTER 11 CASES	JKS	1.90	1,453.50
03/11/19	EMAIL EXCHANGES AND CONFERENCE WITH A. STROMBERG RE: PLAN ISSUES, INCLUDING REVIEW OF R. SCHEPACARTER EMAILS AND REVIEW OF DRAFT LANGUAGE	JKS	0.70	535.50
03/11/19	EXCULPATION RESEARCH, INCLUDING EMAIL FROM A. STROMBERG RE: RESEARCH	JKS	1.20	918.00
03/12/19	CONFERENCE WITH K. STICKLES RE: CONFIRMATION BRIEF AND ORDER	NLP	0.20	188.00
03/12/19	REVIEW BLACKLINE REVISIONS TO CONFIRMATION ORDER	JKS	0.70	535.50

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11  
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice No. 834598  
April 10, 2019  
Page 10

03/12/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH B. WARNER AND P. RATKOWIAK RE: FILING OF PROPOSED CONFIRMATION ORDER	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/12/19	REVIEW BLACKLINE CONFIRMATION MEMORANDUM	JKS	0.60	459.00
03/12/19	REVIEW EXHIBITS TO CONFIRMATION MEMORANDUM	JKS	0.50	382.50
03/12/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH A. STROMBERG RE: MODIFICATION	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/12/19	RESEARCH RULINGS AND TRANSCRIPTS FOR INCLUSION IN CONFIRMATION BRIEF AND COMPENDIUM AND TRANSMIT TO A. STROMBERG	JKS	1.40	1,071.00
03/12/19	REVIEW EMAILS FROM R. SCHEPACARTER AND A. STROMBERG RE: PROPOSED MODIFICATION OF PLAN PROVISIONS RE: EFFECTIVE DATE AND EXCULPATION	JKS	0.30	229.50
03/12/19	REVIEW FOLLOW-UP EMAIL FROM A. STROMBERG AND ANALYZE PROPOSED PLAN LANGUAGE	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/12/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH A. STROMBERG RE: CONTENTS AND FILING OF COMPENDIUM	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/12/19	REVIEW AND ANALYZE FURTHER REVISED EXCULPATION PROVISION	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/12/19	REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. SCHEPACARTER RE: EXCULPATION	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/12/19	REVIEW AND REVISE NOTICE OF FILING MODIFIED PLAN	JKS	0.40	306.00
03/12/19	REVIEW AND REVISE NOTICE OF FILING BLACKLINE PLAN	JKS	0.60	459.00
03/12/19	REVIEW AND REVISE NOTICE OF FILING PROPOSED CONFIRMATION ORDER	JKS	0.40	306.00
03/12/19	CONFERENCE AND EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH B. WARNER RE: NOTICE OF FILING BLACKLINE PLAN	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/12/19	REVIEW ANDERSON DECLARATION IN SUPPORT OF THE ADEQUACY OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND CONFIRMATION OF MODIFIED JOINT PREPACKAGED PLAN	JKS	0.40	306.00
03/12/19	REVIEW PATTON DECLARATION IN SUPPORT OF THE ADEQUACY OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND CONFIRMATION OF MODIFIED JOINT PREPACKAGED PLAN FOR FILING	JKS	0.40	306.00
03/12/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH A. STROMBERG, A. O'NEILL ET AL RE: STATUS OF CONFIRMATION OBJECTION	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/12/19	FURTHER REVIEW OF CONFIRMATION BRIEF	JKS	1.40	1,071.00
03/12/19	CONFERENCE WITH, AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM, B. WARNER RE: PROPOSED CONFIRMATION ORDER	JKS	0.30	229.50
03/12/19	REVIEW FURTHER REVISED PROPOSED CONFIRMATION ORDER	JKS	1.20	918.00
03/12/19	DRAFT MOTION TO EXCEED PAGE LIMITS FOR CONFIRMATION BRIEF	JKS	0.80	612.00

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11  
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice No. 834598  
April 10, 2019  
Page 11

03/12/19	EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH B. WARNER RE: PROPOSED REVISION TO DRAFT MOTION	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/12/19	EMAIL FROM AND TO K. STICKLES AND B. WARNER RE: ANDERSON AND PATTON DECLARATIONS	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/12/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH K. STICKLES, A. STROMBERG AND B. WARNER RE: NOTICE OF FILING OF CONFIRMATION ORDER AND PREPARE SAME FOR FILING	PVR	0.30	88.50
03/12/19	EFILE NOTICE OF FILING OF CONFIRMATION ORDER	PVR	0.40	118.00
03/12/19	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES, A. STROMBERG, B. WARNER AND J. SCHOMBERG RE: FILED ACC RESPONSE TO UST OBJECTION TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND PLAN	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/12/19	EMAIL FROM AND TO K. STICKLES AND DRAFT NOTICE OF FILING OF MODIFIED PLAN	PVR	0.50	147.50
03/12/19	EMAIL FROM AND TO K. STICKLES AND DRAFT NOTICE OF FILING OF BLACKLINE PLAN AND CERTAIN REVISED EXHIBITS	PVR	0.60	177.00
03/12/19	EMAIL FROM AND TO K. STICKLES AND DRAFT NOTICE OF FILING OF CONFIRMATION ORDER	PVR	0.40	118.00
03/12/19	EFILE ANDERSON CONFIRMATION DECLARATION	PVR	0.30	88.50
03/12/19	EFILE PATTON CONFIRMATION DECLARATION	PVR	0.30	88.50
03/12/19	EFILE NOTICE OF FILING OF MODIFIED PLAN	PVR	0.30	88.50
03/12/19	EFILE NOTICE OF FILING OF BLACKLINE PLAN	PVR	0.30	88.50
03/12/19	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES, B. WARNER, A. STROMBERG AND J. SCHOMBERG RE: FILED MODIFIED PLAN, NOTICE OF FILING OF MODIFIED PLAN, NOTICE OF FILING OF BLACKLINE OF MODIFIED PLAN, ANDERSON CONFIRMATION DECLARATION AND PATTON CONFIRMATION DECLARATION	PVR	0.20	59.00
03/12/19	RETRIEVE ACC RESPONSE TO UST OBJECTION TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND PLAN	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/12/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH K. STICKLES AND B. WARNER AND PREPARE MODIFIED PLAN FOR FILING	PVR	0.40	118.00
03/12/19	EFILE MODIFIED PLAN	PVR	0.40	118.00
03/12/19	EMAIL FROM AND TO B. WARNER AND UPDATE NOTICES OF FILING OF: MODIFIED PLAN, BLACKLINE PLAN, AND CONFIRMATION ORDER	PVR	0.40	118.00
03/13/19	REVIEW SIGNED ORDER AUTHORIZING EXTENSION OF PAGE LIMITATION RE: CONFIRMATION MEMORANDUM	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/13/19	EMAIL FROM K. STICKLES AND TO R. SCHEPACARTER RE: FILED CONFIRMATION PLEADINGS	PVR	0.10	29.50

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11  
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice No. 834598  
April 10, 2019  
Page 12

03/13/19	COMMUNICATIONS WITH A. STROMBERG AND B. WARNER RE: FINALIZED CONFIRMATION MEMORANDUM FOR FILING	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/13/19	CONFERENCE WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: FILING CONFIRMATION MEMORANDUM	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/13/19	REVIEW, REVISE AND EXECUTE MOTION TO EXCEED PAGE LIMITATION FOR FILING, INCLUDING EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH A. STROMBERG RE: MOTION	JKS	0.50	382.50
03/13/19	REVIEW COMPENDIUM FOR FILING, INCLUDING COMMUNICATIONS WITH B. WARNER AND P. RATKOWIAK RE: CONTENT AND FILING OF SAME	JKS	1.40	1,071.00
03/13/19	CONFERENCE AND EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: SERVICE OF PLAN-RELATED DOCUMENTS	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/13/19	EMAIL FROM AND TO N. PERNICK RE: FILED CONFIRMATION PLEADINGS	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/13/19	RETRIEVE ORDER GRANTING EX PARTE MOTION FOR LEAVE TO EXCEED PAGE LIMIT AND EMAIL TO DRC RE: SERVICE	PVR	0.20	59.00
03/13/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH K. STICKLES RE: SERVICE OF NOTICES, CONFIRMATION BRIEF, EX PARTE MOTION	PVR	0.30	88.50
03/13/19	EMAIL TO DRC RE: SERVICE OF 3 NOTICES, CONFIRMATION BRIEF, EX PARTE MOTION, AND COMPENDIUM	PVR	0.20	59.00
03/13/19	EMAILS FROM A. STROMBERG AND B. WARNER RE: CONFIRMATION BRIEF(.2); EFILE CONFIRMATION BRIEF (.2); EMAIL FROM K. STICKLES RE: EX PARTE MOTION TO EXCEED PAGE LIMIT RE: CONFIRMATION BRIEF (.2); REVIEW AND EFILE EX PARTE MOTION AND COORDINATE SUBMISSION TO CHAMBERS (.8); EMAILS FROM A. STROMBERG RE: COMPENDIUM (.1); PREPARE AND EFILE COMPENDIUM (.9)	PVR	2.40	708.00
03/14/19	REVIEW DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	NLP	1.10	1,034.00
03/14/19	REVIEW MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN SUPPORT OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND CONFIRMATION	NLP	0.90	846.00
03/14/19	REVIEW 3/13 ANDERSON DECLARATION IN SUPPORT OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND CONFIRMATION	NLP	0.30	282.00
03/14/19	REVIEW PATTON DECLARATION IN SUPPORT OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND CONFIRMATION	NLP	0.30	282.00
03/14/19	REVIEW RESPONSE OF ACC TO TRUSTEE CONFIRMATION OBJECTION	NLP	0.50	470.00
03/14/19	REVIEW PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW	NLP	0.30	282.00
03/15/19	RESEARCH AND PREPARE DRAFT DOCUMENTS RE: DISTRICT COURT AFFIRMANCE OF CONFIRMATION ORDER AND TRANSMIT TO B. WARNER	JKS	2.60	1,989.00

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11  
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice No. 834598  
April 10, 2019  
Page 13

03/15/19	CONFERENCE WITH B. WARNER RE: DISTRICT COURT AFFIRMANCE OF CONFIRMATION ORDER	JKS	0.30	229.50
03/15/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH B. WARNER AND A. STROMBERG RE: FILING OF REVISED PROPOSED CONFIRMATION ORDER AND BLACKLINED PLAN	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/15/19	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: PRECEDENT FOR DISTRICT COURT APPROVAL OF CONFIRMATION ORDER, INCLUDING RESEARCH	JKS	0.80	612.00
03/17/19	EFILE NOTICE OF FILING OF REVISED PROPOSED CONFIRMATION ORDER	PVR	0.30	88.50
03/17/19	EMAIL TO DRC RE: SERVICE OF NOTICE OF FILING OF BLACK LINE MODIFIED JOINT PREPACKAGED PLAN AND NOTICE OF FILING REVISED CONFIRMATION ORDER	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/17/19	EMAILS TO AND FROM K. STICKLES AND REVIEW AND REVISE NOTICE OF FILING OF BLACK LINE OF MODIFIED JOINT PREPACKAGED PLAN AND EXHIBITS	PVR	0.20	59.00
03/17/19	PREPARE NOTICE OF FILING OF BLACKLINE OF MODIFIED JOINT PREPACKAGED PLAN AND EXHIBITS FOR FILING	PVR	0.20	59.00
03/17/19	EFILE NOTICE OF FILING OF BLACK LINE OF MODIFIED JOINT PREPACKAGED PLAN	PVR	0.30	88.50
03/17/19	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES RE: FILED NOTICE OF FILING OF BLACK LINE OF MODIFIED JOINT PREPACKAGED PLAN AND NOTICE OF FILING REVISED CONFIRMATION ORDER	PVR	0.30	88.50
03/17/19	TELEPHONE FROM AND EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND DRAFT NOTICE OF WITHDRAWAL	PVR	0.20	59.00
03/17/19	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND PREPARE BLACKLINE OF REVISED CONFIRMATION ORDER	PVR	0.20	59.00
03/17/19	EMAIL TO AND FROM K. STICKLES AND EMAIL TO R. SCHEPACARTER RE: FILED BLACKLINE MODIFIED JOINT PREPACKAGED PLAN AND REVISED CONFIRMATION ORDER	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/17/19	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND PREPARE PDF'S OF NOTICE OF FILING REVISED CONFIRMATION ORDER AND EXHIBITS	PVR	0.30	88.50
03/17/19	EFILE NOTICE OF WITHDRAWAL OF NOTICE OF FILING	PVR	0.20	59.00
03/17/19	EFILE UPDATED NOTICE OF FILING REVISED CONFIRMATION ORDER AND EXHIBITS	PVR	0.20	59.00
03/17/19	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND B. WARNER RE: FILED NOTICE OF FILING OF BLACK LINE OF MODIFIED JOINT PREPACKAGED PLAN AND NOTICE OF FILING REVISED CONFIRMATION ORDER	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/17/19	EMAILS FROM AND TO K. STICKLES AND REVIEW AND REVISE NOTICE OF FILING OF REVISED PROPOSED CONFIRMATION ORDER AND EXHIBITS	PVR	0.20	59.00

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11  
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice No. 834598  
April 10, 2019  
Page 14

03/17/19	PREPARE NOTICE OF FILING OF REVISED PROPOSED CONFIRMATION ORDER AND EXHIBITS FOR FILING	PVR	0.20	59.00
03/18/19	REVIEW K. STICKLES 3/18 EMAIL RE: OPEN TRUSTEE CONFIRMATION OBJECTIONS	NLP	0.10	94.00
03/18/19	CONFERENCES WITH A. O'NEILL, K. STICKLES RE: CONFIRMATION HEARING STRATEGY AND FOLLOW-UP	NLP	0.80	752.00
03/18/19	REVIEW FURTHER MODIFIED AMENDED PLAN AND CONFIRMATION ORDER	NLP	0.50	470.00
03/20/19	REVIEW FURTHER REVISED CONFIRMATION ORDER	JKS	0.60	459.00
03/20/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH B. WARNER AND REVIEW FINAL MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT AND EMAIL TO P. RATKOWIAK RE: FILING AND SERVICE OF REPORT	JKS	0.30	229.50
03/20/19	REVIEW EMAILS FROM R. SCHEPACARTER AND A. O'NEILL RE: PROPOSED REVISIONS TO TDP	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/20/19	REVIEW AND ANALYZE VERSIONS OF PROPOSED REVISIONS TO TDP	JKS	0.40	306.00
03/20/19	REVIEW EMAILS FROM A. STROMBERG, A. O'NEILL AND S.ZIEG RE: TDP MODIFICATIONS	JKS	0.30	229.50
03/21/19	REVIEW AND ANALYZE EMAIL FROM A. STROMBERG RE: PLAN AND TDP	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/21/19	REVIEW EMAIL FROM S. ZIEG RE: MODIFICATIONS TO CONFIRMATION ORDER	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/21/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH A. O'NEILL RE: REVISED PLEADINGS FOR CONTINUED CONFIRMATION HEARING	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/21/19	REVIEW EMAIL FROM M. FINK RE: PLAN	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/21/19	REVIEW REVISED PROPOSED CONFIRMATION ORDER	JKS	0.60	459.00
03/21/19	REVIEW ACC'S COMMENTS TO REVISED DRAFT CONFIRMATION ORDER	JKS	0.30	229.50
03/22/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE AND CONFERENCE WITH A. O'NEILL RE: STATUS OF DISCUSSIONS RE: TDP AND HEARING	JKS	0.30	229.50
	<b>REPORTS; STATEMENTS AND SCHEDULES</b>		<b>3.30</b>	<b>\$2,289.50</b>
03/14/19	CONFERENCE WITH B. WARNER RE: PROPOSED MODIFICATIONS TO MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT	JKS	1.10	841.50
03/14/19	REVIEW DRAFT MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT AND EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH B. WARNER RE: SAME	JKS	0.50	382.50
03/15/19	CONFERENCE WITH RE: P. BURKS, ET AL. RE: DRAFT MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT	JKS	0.30	229.50



Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11  
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice No. 834598  
April 10, 2019  
Page 15

03/15/19	FOLLOW-UP CONFERENCE AND EMAILS WITH B. WARNER RE: MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/15/19	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. WARNER AND A. O'NEILL RE: RESOLUTION OF OPEN QUESTIONS RE: MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/20/19	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. WARNER AND FURTHER REVISED MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT	JKS	0.30	229.50
03/20/19	EMAIL TO B. WARNER AND K. STICKLES RE: FILED FEBRUARY MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/20/19	EMAIL FROM B. WARNER AND K. STICKLES RE:FEBRUARY MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/20/19	EFILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF FEBRUARY MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT	PVR	0.30	88.50
03/22/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH A. O'NEILL RE: DEFERMENT OF FILING STATEMENTS AND SCHEDULES	JKS	0.20	153.00
	<b>RETENTION MATTERS</b>		<b>16.50</b>	<b>\$11,714.50</b>
03/01/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: FILING AND SERVICE OF NOTICES OF DEPOSITIONS	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/01/19	REVIEW FINAL OBJECTION TO US TRUSTEE MOTION TO APPOINT FCR FOR FILING	JKS	0.50	382.50
03/01/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE AND CONFERENCE WITH A. STROMBERG RE: FILING OF OBJECTION TO US TRUSTEE MOTION TO APPOINT FCR	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/01/19	EMAIL TO AND CONFERENCE WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: FILING AND SERVICE OF OBJECTION TO US TRUSTEE MOTION TO APPOINT FCR	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/01/19	REVIEW ACC OBJECTION TO US TRUSTEE MOTION TO APPOINT FCR	JKS	0.60	459.00
03/01/19	REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. SCHEPACARTER AND REVIEW AND ANALYZE DRAFT CONNOLLY DECLARATION IN SUPPORT OF US TRUSTEE MOTION	JKS	0.50	382.50
03/01/19	REVIEW COMMITTEE RESPONSE IN SUPPORT OF FCR	NLP	0.40	376.00
03/01/19	CONFERENCES WITH K. STICKLES RE: DEBTORS OBJECTION TO TRUSTEE FCR MOTION	NLP	0.30	282.00
03/01/19	EMAILS FROM/TO K. STICKLES, A. STROMBERG RE: DEBTORS OBJECTION TO OUST FCR MOTION	NLP	0.20	188.00
03/01/19	REVIEW PATTON JOINDER IN SUPPORT OF DEBTORS MOTION TO APPOINT FCR	NLP	0.20	188.00
03/01/19	REVIEW TRUSTEE AMENDMENT TO MOTION TO APPOINT FCR	NLP	0.20	188.00
03/01/19	REVIEW DEBTORS OBJECTION TO TRUSTEE'S MOTION TO APPOINT FCR	NLP	0.90	846.00
03/01/19	REVIEW EMAIL FROM J. SKAKUN RE: DEPOSITIONS	JKS	0.10	76.50

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11  
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice No. 834598  
April 10, 2019  
Page 16

03/01/19	PREPARE NOTICES OF DEPOSITION RE: ABELMAN AND CONNOLLY DEPOSITIONS	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/01/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH J. SKAKUN RE: NOTICES OF DEPOSITION	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/01/19	REVIEW REVISED NOTICES OF DEPOSITION AND FOLLOW-UP EMAIL AND CONFERENCE WITH J. SKAKUN RE: DEPOSITIONS	JKS	0.40	306.00
03/01/19	EMAIL TO DRC RE: SERVICE OF OBJECTION TO UST FCR MOTION	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/01/19	EMAIL FROM K. STICKLES RE: SERVICE OF NOTICES OF DEPOSITION AND PREPARE EMAIL SERVICE ADDRESSES	PVR	0.20	59.00
03/01/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH K. STICKLES, J. SKAKUN AND B. WARNER RE: SERVICE PARTIES RE: NOTICES OF DEPOSITION	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/01/19	REVIEW EMAIL FROM J. SKAKUN RE: NOTICES OF DEPOSITION AND PREPARE SAME FOR FILING	PVR	0.20	59.00
03/01/19	EFILE NOTICE OF DEPOSITION OF P. ABLEMAN	PVR	0.20	59.00
03/01/19	EFILE NOTICE OF DEPOSITION OF D. CONNOLLY	PVR	0.20	59.00
03/01/19	COORDINATE SERVICE OF NOTICES OF DEPOSITION OF P. ABLEMAN AND D. CONNOLLY	PVR	0.30	88.50
03/01/19	EMAIL TO J. SKAKUN, B. WARNER AND K. STICKLES RE: FILED NOTICE OF DEPOSITION OF P. ABLEMAN AND NOTICE OF DEPOSITION OF D. CONNOLLY	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/01/19	EMAIL FROM AND TO A. STROMBERG RE: FILING OBJECTION TO UST FCR MOTION	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/01/19	EFILE AND SERVE OBJECTION TO UST FCR MOTION	PVR	0.30	88.50
03/01/19	EMAIL TO A. STROMBERG, K. STICKLES AND N. PERNICK RE: FILED OBJECTION TO UST FCR MOTION	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/03/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH B. WARNER RE: DOCUMENTS FOR SERVICE	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/04/19	EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH J. SKAKAN RE: PREPARATIONS FOR DEPOSITION OF FCR CANDIDATES	JKS	0.30	229.50
03/04/19	COMMUNICATIONS WITH B. WARNER RE: DEPOSITION ATTENDEES AND PREPARATIONS	JKS	0.30	229.50
03/04/19	REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. SCHEPACARTER RE: DEPOSITIONS	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/05/19	REVIEW OUST 3/1 DRAFT DECLARATION OF D. CONNOLLY	NLP	0.30	282.00
03/05/19	ATTEND DEPOSITION OF P. ABLEMAN AND D. CONNOLLY, INCLUDING CONFERENCE WITH CO-COUNSEL	JKS	4.90	3,748.50
03/06/19	REVIEW EMAILS FROM S. ZIEG AND J. SKAKUN RE: DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPTS	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/07/19	REVIEW J. SKAKUN 3/6 EMAIL RE: 3/8 HEARING WITNESSES	NLP	0.10	94.00

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11  
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice No. 834598  
April 10, 2019  
Page 17

03/08/19	REVIEW AND REVISE PROPOSED ORDER GRANTING DEBTORS FCR MOTION AND DENYING TRUSTEE FCR MOTION AND EMAIL PROPOSED ORDER TO A. O'NEILL	JKS	0.60	459.00
03/11/19	REVIEW SIGNED ORDERS RETAINING AND EMPLOYING ANKURA CONSULTING GROUP AND YOUNG CONAWAY	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/11/19	EMAILS TO E. HARRON, M. FINK AND R. SCHEPACARTER RE: PROPOSED ORDER APPOINTING FCR	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/12/19	EMAIL TO AND FROM R. SCHEPACARTER RE: ACC AND FCR CONSENT TO PROPOSED ORDER	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/12/19	EMAIL FROM K. STICKLES RE: FILING CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL RE: APPOINTMENT OF FCR	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/12/19	REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. SCHEPACARTER REQUESTING MODIFICATION TO PROPOSED ORDER	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/12/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH E. HARRON AND M. FINK RE: PROPOSED REVISION TO APPOINTMENT ORDER	JKS	0.20	153.00
03/12/19	REVISE CERTIFICATION AND PROPOSED ORDER APPOINTING FCR, PREPARE BLACKLINE ORDER AND TRANSMIT TO R. SCHEPACARTER, E. HARRON, M. FINK AND A. O'NEILL FOR COMMENT	JKS	0.30	229.50
03/12/19	EMAIL TO P. RATKOWIAK RE: FILING OF CERTIFICATION AND TRANSMITTAL OF PROPOSED ORDER TO COURT	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/12/19	EFILE CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL RE: APPOINTMENT OF FCR AND COORDINATE DELIVERY OF FILED CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL AND ORDER TO CHAMBERS FOR DISPOSITION	PVR	0.30	88.50
03/12/19	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES RE: FILED CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL RE: APPOINTMENT OF FCR	PVR	0.10	29.50
03/13/19	REVIEW SIGNED ORDERS APPROVING RETENTION OF ACC'S PROFESSIONALS	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/13/19	EMAIL TO M. FINK RE: SUBMISSION OF CERTIFICATIONS RE: RETENTION OF ACC PROFESSIONALS TO CHAMBERS	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/13/19	RETRIEVE ORDER APPOINTING JAMES L. PATTON, JR., AS FCR AND EMAIL DRC RE: SERVICE	PVR	0.20	59.00
03/13/19	REVIEW SIGNED ORDER APPROVING FCR RETENTION	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/15/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH P. RATKOWIAK AND A. STROMBERG RE: STROMBERG PRO HAC VICE MOTION	JKS	0.10	76.50
03/15/19	EMAIL FROM AND TO K. STICKLES AND A. STROMBERG AND EFILE PRO HAC MOTION FOR A. STROMBERG	PVR	0.20	59.00
03/18/19	EMAIL TO A. STROMBERG RE: PRO HAC ORDER	PVR	0.10	29.50

**COLE SCHOTZ P.C.**

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11  
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice No. 834598  
April 10, 2019  
Page 18

**U.S. TRUSTEE MATTERS AND MEETINGS** **0.70** **\$535.50**

03/27/19	RESEARCH AND EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH B. WARNER RE: US TRUSTEE STATUTORY FEES AND PAYMENT	JKS	0.50	382.50
03/28/19	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH B. WARNER RE: US TRUSTEE CONSENT TO FURTHER DEFERRED 341 MEETING OF CREDITORS	JKS	0.20	153.00

**BUDGETING (CASE)** **0.10** **\$76.50**

03/28/19	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: PROFESSIONAL FEE BUDGET	JKS	0.10	76.50
----------	--	-----	------	-------

TOTAL HOURS 125.10

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES: \$ 83,722.50

<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>STAFF LEVEL</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>RATE</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
NORMAN L. PERNICK	MEMBER	14.00	940.00	13,160.00
J. KATE STICKLES	MEMBER	80.40	765.00	61,506.00
PAULINE Z. RATKOWIAK	PARALEGAL	30.70	295.00	9,056.50

**EXHIBIT B**

**Expense Summary**

**MAREMONT CORPORATION, et al.****EXPENSE SUMMARY  
MARCH 1, 2019 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2019**

<b>Expense Category</b>	<b>Service Provider (if applicable)</b>	<b>Total Expenses</b>
Photocopying/Printing/Scanning (2,115 pages @ \$0.10/page)		\$211.50
Telephonic Appearances	CourtCall	\$402.00
Travel Expenses (Transportation)		\$135.00
Overtime	Secretarial	\$66.23
Filing Fees ( <i>Pro Hac Vice</i> Motion)	USDC	\$25.00
Outside Printing	Parcels, Inc.	\$705.65
Messenger Service	Parcels, Inc.	\$110.00
Working Meals	Purebread	\$417.70
<b>TOTAL</b>		<b>\$2,073.08</b>

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11  
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice No. 834897  
April 24, 2019  
Page 19

COSTS ADVANCED

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
03/01/19	OUTSIDE PRINTING - PARCELS, INC.	262.89
03/04/19	COURTCALL CONFERENCE – B. WARNER - MARCH 8, 2019 HEARING	30.00
03/05/19	OVERTIME (R. DEELY) RE: DEPOSITION PREPARATION	66.23
03/05/19	LUNCHEON/DINNER CONFERENCE - PUREBREAD IV – WORKING BREAKFAST MEETING WITH J. SKAKUN, B. WARNER AND K. STICKLES RE: DEPOSITIONS	53.00
03/05/19	LUNCHEON/DINNER CONFERENCE – URBAN CAFÉ – WORKING LUNCH FOR J. SKAKUN, B. WARNER, K. STICKLES, S. ZIEG, D. WRIGHT AND N. RAMSEY RE: DEPOSITIONS	145.20
03/07/19	DELIVERY SERVICES/COURIERS - PARCELS, INC.	22.50
03/07/19	PHOTOCOPYING / PRINTING / SCANNING Qty: 980	98.00
03/07/19	PHOTOCOPYING / PRINTING / SCANNING Qty: 1134	113.40
03/11/19	DELIVERY SERVICES/COURIERS - PARCELS, INC.	17.50
03/11/19	DELIVERY SERVICES/COURIERS - PARCELS, INC.	17.50
03/11/19	COURTCALL CONFERENCE B. WARNER - MARCH 8, 2019 HEARING	77.00
03/11/19	COURTCALL CONFERENCE B. EILENDER - MARCH 8, 2019 HEARING	100.00
03/12/19	LUNCHEON/DINNER CONFERENCE – WORKING DINNER – K. STICKLES AND P. RATKOWIAK RE: FILING MODIFIED JOINT PREPACKAGED PLAN OF REORGANIZATION, DECLARATION OF C. ANDERSON, DECLARATION OF J. PATTON, NOTICE OF FILING OF PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT, CONCLUSIONS OF LAW AND ORDER APPROVING DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND CONFIRMATION OF MODIFIED JOINT PREPACKAGED PLAN, CONFIRMATION BRIEF AND COMPENDIUM OF AUTHORITIES	37.00
03/14/19	DELIVERY SERVICES/COURIERS - PARCELS, INC.	7.50
03/14/19	TRAVEL - CAR SERVICE – ROADRUNNER – TRANSPORTATION FOR A. O'NEILL, J. SKAKUN, AND A. STROMBERG FROM COLE SCHOTZ OFFICE TO PHL AIRPORT RE: MARCH 8, 2019 HEARING	135.00
03/15/19	DELIVERY SERVICES/COURIERS - PARCELS, INC.	22.50
03/15/19	FILING FEES - PRO HAC VICE MOTION FILING FEE - A. STROMBERG	25.00
03/15/19	OUTSIDE PRINTING – PARCELS, INC.	442.76
03/18/19	PHOTOCOPYING / PRINTING / SCANNING Qty: 1	0.10
03/19/19	COURTCALL CONFERENCE - A. ROVIRA, B. EILANDER AND J. SCHOMBERG - MARCH 18, 2019 HEARING	195.00
03/21/19	LUNCHEON/DINNER CONFERENCE - PUREBREAD IV – WORKING BREAKFAST MEETING A. O'NEILL, J. SKAKUN, A. STROMBERG, B. WARNER, C. ANDERSON AND K. STICKLES RE: MARCH 18, 2019 HEARING	72.50
03/21/19	LUNCHEON/DINNER CONFERENCE – URBAN CAFÉ - WORKING LUNCH FOR A. O'NEILL, J. SKAKUN, A. STROMBERG, B. WARNER, C. ANDERSON AND K. STICKLES RE: MARCH 18, 2019 HEARING	110.00
03/25/19	DELIVERY SERVICES/COURIERS - PARCELS, INC.	22.50
	TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED:	\$ 2,073.08
	TOTAL SERVICES AND COSTS:	\$ 85,795.5