

# **EXHIBIT A**

# Robinson+Cole

DELIVERED BY EMAIL: mfink@rc.com

MAREMONT CORPORATION, OFFICIAL COMMITTEE  
ATTN: PERRY BROWDER  
CHAIR OF THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF ASBESTOS  
CREDITORS  
C/O SIMMONS HANLY CONROY  
ONE COURT STREET  
ALTON, IL 62002

May 17, 2019  
Invoice 50276609

File # 38116.0001  
Official Committee

### Invoice Summary and Remittance Advice

Invoice attached and payable upon receipt

Please return this page or include invoice number with your remittance to:

**Mailing Instructions**  
ROBINSON & COLE LLP  
280 Trumbull Street  
Hartford, CT 06103-3597

TEL # (860) 275-8200  
FAX # (860) 275-8299  
FEDERAL ID # 06-0512640

**Wire Transfer Instructions**  
Bank of America  
185 Asylum Street  
Hartford, CT 06103

ABA Wire Routing # - 026009593  
ACH Routing # - 011900254  
Checking Account # - 000000154546

### SUMMARY FOR INVOICE 50276609

Fees for Legal Services	\$ 37,158.50
Disbursements	58.00
<b>Total Current Billing For this Matter</b>	<b>\$ 37,216.50</b>

For Services through April 30, 2019

File # 38116.0001  
Official Committee

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
-------------	-------------------	--------------------	--------------

**Phase -****Task OCAC001 - CASE ADMIN & BUSNSS OPER-OFFCL CMTEE ASBESTOS CRDTRS**

04/18/19	L. A. Krepto	Review agenda for hearing and coordinate court call appearance	0.10
----------	--------------	--	------

Total fees for CASE ADMIN & BUSNSS OPER-OFFCL CMTEE ASBESTOS CRDTRS			\$ 55.00
---	--	--	----------

**Summary of Task OCAC001 - CASE ADMIN & BUSNSS OPER-OFFCL CMTEE ASBESTOS CRDTRS**

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate/Hour</u>	<u>Dollars</u>
L. A. Krepto	0.10	550	55.00

<b>Total Fees for Task: CASE ADMIN &amp; BUSNSS OPER-OFFCL CMTEE ASBESTOS CRDTRS</b>	55.00
--	-------

**Task OCAC004 - PLAN OF REORGANIZATION & DISCLOSURE STATEMENT**

04/01/19	L. A. Krepto	Reviewing proposed TDP changes and communications re same	0.10
04/02/19	N. D. Ramsey	Drafting memorandum to committee re proposed resolution of TDP language	0.80
04/05/19	L. A. Krepto	Meeting with N. Ramsey, M. Fink re UST objections to TDPs	0.30
04/05/19	M. A. Fink	Prepare for and call re TDP issues (.4); call with Debtors and FCR (.4); correspondence with ACC re status (.6)	1.40
04/05/19	N. D. Ramsey	Prepare for (.2) and correspondence re TDP issues (.2) for call with Debtors and FCR re same (.4); draft, revise and exchange of correspondence with committee members re same (.8)	1.60
04/05/19	N. D. Ramsey	Participate in telephone call with A O'Neill, B Warner, A Stromberg, E Harron, S Zieg re US Trustee objection	0.50
04/09/19	L. A. Krepto	Exchange communications re language for TDP	0.30
04/09/19	N. D. Ramsey	Work on resolution of US trustee objection (.5); email correspondence with A O'Neill re same (.1)	0.60
04/10/19	L. A. Krepto	Review TDP for subsection for N. Ramsey (.2); reviewing communications and suggested language re TDP (.3)	0.50
04/11/19	L. A. Krepto	Participate in telephonic meeting with Committee, N. Ramsey and M. Fink re TDP (.4); review communication to Committee re proposed language to TDP (.1); telephone call to M. Fink re proposed language issue (.1); review TDP and draft communication to N. Ramsey re proposed changes to language (.9)	1.50
04/11/19	L. A. Krepto	Telephone call with N. Ramsey, M. Fink re proposed TDP changes	0.40

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
04/11/19	M. A. Fink	Calls/correspondence (multiple) re schedules/statements (.2) and removal (.2)	0.40
04/11/19	N. D. Ramsey	Conducting meeting of committee re TDP amendments (.4); further revisions (.1); email correspondence with the committee re same (.1); telephone call with other representatives re same (.2)	0.80
04/12/19	L. A. Krepto	Discuss TDP with N. Ramsey (.1); review and revise TDP (1.2)	1.30
04/12/19	L. A. Krepto	Participate in telephone call with N. Ramsey and M. Fink re changes to TDPs	0.30
04/12/19	M. A. Fink	Calls/correspondence re TDP (.7); review of TDP (1.8)	2.50
04/12/19	N. D. Ramsey	Telephone call with M. Fink and L. Krepto re changes to TDP (.3); work on TDP issues (.7)	1.00
04/15/19	M. A. Fink	Multiple correspondence re plan issues and next steps (.9); collection of materials in connection with same (.7)	1.60
04/15/19	N. D. Ramsey	Correspondence re TDP	0.60
04/16/19	L. A. Krepto	Review historical TDP language (.5); draft communication to N. Ramsey and M. Fink re same (.2); discuss same with N. Ramsey (.4); draft communication to M. Fink re comments for next steps (.3)	1.40
04/16/19	L. A. Krepto	Review email exchanges re proposed changes to TDP (.2); review draft cross-audit procedures and draft communication to N. Ramsey and M. Fink re proposed language on cross-audit procedures (.8); exchange communications with N. Ramsey re same (.2)	1.20
04/16/19	M. A. Fink	Calls/correspondence (multiple) with FCR and Debtors re UST Objection and next steps	0.70
04/16/19	N. D. Ramsey	Review proposed language to address United States Trustee objection and confer with L Krepto re same	0.40
04/17/19	L. A. Krepto	Review and exchange communications re proposed TDP changes with counsel for Debtor and FCR	0.20
04/17/19	L. A. Krepto	Telephone call with N. Ramsey, M. Fink, and counsel for FCR and Debtor re TDP change (.3); follow-up discussion with N. Ramsey and M. Fink re same (.2); follow-up call with all parties re same (.5); review communication to Committee re status (.1)	1.10
04/17/19	M. A. Fink	Multiple correspondence re TDP issues with FCR and Debtors (.6); participate in calls (2x) with FCR and Debtors (.8); telephone call with L. Krepto and N. Ramsey re next steps (.3); follow up with M. Fink and L. Krepto re same (.2)	1.90
04/17/19	N. D. Ramsey	Telephone call with M. Fink., L. Krepto and counsel for FCR and Debtor re TDP changes (.3); follow-up discussion with M. Fink and L. Krepto re same (.2); follow-up call with all parties re same (.5); report to Committee re status (.3); review and exchange communications re proposed TDP changes with counsel for Debtor and FCR (.2)	1.50
04/17/19	N. D. Ramsey	Draft memorandum to the Committee regarding efforts to resolve the UST objection to the Plan, Trust (.6); email correspondence with Committee re same (.3)	0.90
04/18/19	I. D. Densmore	Review agenda for status conference on 4/23/2019	0.10
04/18/19	M. A. Fink	Calls/correspondence re plan status	0.40
04/19/19	L. A. Krepto	Review proposed changes to audit procedures in TDP by UST	0.20
04/20/19	L. A. Krepto	Exchange communications re proposed cross audit language by UST for TDP	0.20
04/20/19	M. A. Fink	Multiple correspondence re TDP language (.4); review of other TDP (.8)	1.20

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
04/20/19	N. D. Ramsey	Calls/communications re TDP language	0.70
04/22/19	L. A. Krepto	Exchange communications with N. Ramsey re revisions to TDP and coordinate same (.2); attend meeting with M. Fink and N. Ramsey re same (.2); discuss proposed changes to cross audit procedures with N. Ramsey (.2); review communication to Committee with proposed changes to cross audit procedures (.2)	0.80
04/22/19	M. A. Fink	Work on issues re TDP	1.10
04/22/19	N. D. Ramsey	Calls/communications with L. Krepto re revisions to TDP (.2); attend meeting with M. Fink and L. Krepto re same (.2)	0.40
04/22/19	N. D. Ramsey	Review and revise TDP	1.00
04/23/19	L. A. Krepto	Participate in telephone call with M. Fink re revised TDP language (.3); reviewing revised proposed language re cross audit procedures (.1)	0.40
04/23/19	M. A. Fink	Multiple calls/correspondence re TDP language (1.1); attend status hearing (.3); provide update (.4)	1.80
04/23/19	N. D. Ramsey	Participate in status conference with Debtors, FCR re TDP objection (.3); participate in court status conference re confirmation (.2); telephone conference with team (.3)	0.80
04/23/19	N. D. Ramsey	Participate in call re TDP (.4); follow up from same (.8)	1.20
04/24/19	L. A. Krepto	Review communication exchanges re revisions to TDP	0.10
04/25/19	M. A. Fink	Additional work on Plan issues (.8); correspondence re same (.3)	1.10
04/29/19	M. A. Fink	Exchange correspondence re TDP	0.70
04/29/19	N. D. Ramsey	Revise proposed TDP language (.8); email correspondence with FCR re same (.1)	0.90
04/30/19	L. A. Krepto	Review email exchange re revised proposed language to TDP re cross-audit procedure and request for meeting	0.20

Total fees for PLAN OF REORGANIZATION & DISCLOSURE STATEMENT \$ 28,849.00

#### Summary of Task OCAC004 - PLAN OF REORGANIZATION & DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate/Hour</u>	<u>Dollars</u>
L. A. Krepto	10.50	550	5,775.00
I. D. Densmore	0.10	250	25.00
M. A. Fink	14.80	715	10,582.00
N. D. Ramsey	13.70	910	12,467.00

**Total Fees for Task: PLAN OF REORGANIZATION & DISCLOSURE STATEMENT** 28,849.00

#### Task OCAC007 - COURT HEARINGS

04/23/19	L. A. Krepto	Participate in telephonic hearing re confirmation status	0.30
04/23/19	I. D. Densmore	Address hearing schedule	0.10
04/24/19	I. D. Densmore	Coordinate with Judge's Chambers, Debtors' Counsel re: change of confirmation hearing date per N. Ramsey	0.10

Total fees for COURT HEARINGS \$ 215.00

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
<b>Summary of Task OCAC007 - COURT HEARINGS</b>			
	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate/Hour</u>
	L. A. Krepto	0.30	550
	I. D. Densmore	0.20	250
			<u>Dollars</u>
			165.00
			50.00
		<b>Total Fees for Task: COURT HEARINGS</b>	215.00
<b>Task OCAC008 - ASBESTOS MATTERS</b>			
04/05/19	L. A. Krepto	Reviewing communication and follow-up to Committee re proposed revisions to TDP	0.20
		Total fees for ASBESTOS MATTERS	\$ 110.00
<b>Summary of Task OCAC008 - ASBESTOS MATTERS</b>			
	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate/Hour</u>
	L. A. Krepto	0.20	550
			<u>Dollars</u>
			110.00
		<b>Total Fees for Task: ASBESTOS MATTERS</b>	110.00
<b>Task OCAC016 - FEE APPLICATION PREPARATION</b>			
04/01/19	S. M. Seamans	Revise fee application per instruction of M. Fink	1.80
04/02/19	K. M. Fix	Confer with S. Seamans re RC fee application	0.20
04/02/19	S. M. Seamans	Work on fee issues	0.50
04/02/19	S. M. Seamans	Revise fee application	2.00
04/05/19	K. M. Fix	Correspondence with S. Seamans re orders and notices for fee application	0.30
04/05/19	S. M. Seamans	Finalize Maremont fee application for February	2.30
04/07/19	M. A. Fink	Review RC invoice for March	2.80
04/11/19	M. A. Fink	Calls/correspondence re RC February fee statement (.2); work on materials for March fee statement (.8)	1.00
04/12/19	K. M. Fix	Finalize RC application for filing (.3); draft notice of filing for RC application (.3); filing RC application (.2)	0.80
04/19/19	K. M. Fix	Review bill (.2); edit RC fee application (1.2); correspondence to S. Seamans re fee application (.2)	1.60
04/19/19	S. M. Seamans	Work on monthly fee application	2.70
04/22/19	S. M. Seamans	Finalize notice, summary and fee application and forward to M. Fink	0.50
04/24/19	S. M. Seamans	Begin drafting first interim fee application.	2.20
04/24/19	M. A. Fink	Work on fee issues for RC (.5)	0.50
04/25/19	S. M. Seamans	Continue drafting First Interim Fee Application.	3.00

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
04/26/19	K. M. Fix	Edit RC monthly fee application	0.40
04/26/19	I. D. Densmore	Review, finalize RC 2nd monthly fee application	0.30
04/26/19	I. D. Densmore	File RC 2nd monthly fee application with the Court, arrange for service of same	0.20
04/26/19	S. M. Seamans	Additional revision to fee application for filing.	0.40

Total fees for FEE APPLICATION PREPARATION \$ 7,929.50

**Summary of Task OCAC016 - FEE APPLICATION PREPARATION**

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate/Hour</u>	<u>Dollars</u>
K. M. Fix	3.30	500	1,650.00
I. D. Densmore	0.50	250	125.00
S. M. Seamans	15.40	200	3,080.00
M. A. Fink	4.30	715	3,074.50

**Total Fees for Task: FEE APPLICATION PREPARATION 7,929.50**

**Summary of Phase -**

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate/Hour</u>	<u>Dollars</u>
K. M. Fix	3.30	500	1,650.00
L. A. Krepto	11.10	550	6,105.00
I. D. Densmore	0.10	250	25.00
I. D. Densmore	0.70	250	175.00
S. M. Seamans	15.40	200	3,080.00
M. A. Fink	19.10	715	13,656.50
N. D. Ramsey	13.70	910	12,467.00

**Total Fees for Phase: 37,158.50**

Fees for Legal Services ..... \$ 37,158.50

**Summary of Disbursements**

	<u>Amount</u>
Meals	\$ 28.00
Other	30.00
<b>Total Disbursements</b>	<b>\$ 58.00</b>



Page: 7  
Date: May 17, 2019  
Invoice #: 50276609

**Summary for Invoice # 50276609**

Official Committee

Fees for Legal Services	\$ 37,158.50
Disbursements	58.00
<b>Total Current Billing For this Matter</b>	<b>\$ 37,216.50</b>