

EXHIBIT A

Fees Statement

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: *****

Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

TIME DETAIL

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
05/01/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with FCR regarding status/next steps	.10
05/02/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with client regarding payment of March and status	.20
05/02/19	AF O'Neill	017		Calls/communications with E. Harron regarding ACC process/next steps	.30
05/02/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with ACC regarding Plan language and review revisions to same	.30
05/02/19	AF O'Neill	015		Revise ACC language and compare to UST	.30
05/02/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with A. Stromberg regarding plan issues and approach	.20
05/02/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review response from ACC regarding Plan language and respond (.3); send update to client regarding same (.1)	.40
05/02/19	AF O'Neill	015		Draft cover note to advisors regarding cumulative Plan comments and launch same	.20
05/02/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review proposed revisions to TDP and provide comments	1.10
05/03/19	DJ Lutes	010		Research for key pleadings, notices, and orders (.2); prepare file stamped materials for Sidley team regarding same (.2)	.40
05/03/19	AF O'Neill	010		Multiple follow-up communications with B. Warner, K. Stickles, L. Shelko, and L. Holland regarding UST fees/payments	.20
05/03/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with ACC regarding Plan language	.20
05/03/19	AF O'Neill	010		Call with L. Shelko and L. Holland regarding UST fees	.10
05/03/19	AF O'Neill	015		Call with N. Ramsey to review language and process issues regarding transmission to UST and consider next steps and review and revise documents to address same (.6); communications with Sidley team regarding same (.2)	.80
05/03/19	AF O'Neill	015		Prepare materials for client regarding Plan revisions and summary of next steps	.40

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: *****

Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
05/03/19	AF O'Neill	015		Discuss transcript review with J. Schomberg and next steps with A. Stromberg (.2); review J. Schomberg hearing transcript analysis and consider options for timing and strategy regarding same (.2)	.40
05/03/19	J Schomberg	015		Review transcript from confirmation hearing regarding discussion of audit procedures	.70
05/03/19	BM Warner	010		Correspond with A. O'Neill and client regarding UST fee invoices	.30
05/06/19	DJ Lutes	007		Emails with M. Byrne regarding monthly fee application materials (.1); review monthly fee application materials and exhibits (.2)	.30
05/06/19	AF O'Neill	015		Follow-up communications on Plan language, analyze next steps	.50
05/06/19	AF O'Neill	010		Review issues regarding UST Fees/reporting	.20
05/06/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with team regarding next steps	.20
05/06/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review revised proposed language for TDP	.20
05/06/19	BM Warner	010		Confer with K. Stickles regarding UST fees inquiry	.20
05/07/19	DJ Lutes	007		Prepare monthly fee application materials (2.6); emails with M. Byrne regarding same (.1)	2.70
05/07/19	AF O'Neill	017		Send update to all parties regarding Plan/TDPs and analysis and follow up communications regarding same	.20
05/07/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with Maremont regarding update	.10
05/07/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with A. Stromberg regarding next steps and issues regarding same (.2); consider documents to be filed and hearing issues (.1)	.30
05/07/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review TDP/Plan language and comment regarding same	.20
05/07/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with ACC regarding next steps/UST issues	.20
05/07/19	AR Stromberg	015		Revise Plan and TDP (1.8); review communications between UST and ACC regarding TDP negotiations (.5); review developments in precedent cases to inform strategy (.4)	2.70
05/08/19	DJ Lutes	007		Prepare 3rd monthly fee application materials (1.3); review fee application issues (.3); emails with M. Byrne regarding same (.2); emails with A.	1.90

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: *****

Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				O'Neill regarding same (.1)	
05/08/19	AF O'Neill	015		Further communications with UST regarding process/approach	.10
05/08/19	AF O'Neill	017		Further review ACC explanations regarding language choices and analyze potential issues regarding same	.20
05/08/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review language for TDP from R. Schepacarter and analysis of same	.30
05/08/19	AF O'Neill	015		Call with R. Schepacarter regarding TDP proposal	.20
05/08/19	AF O'Neill	015		Prepare potential strawman revised TDP language (.2); review documents regarding same (.1)	.30
05/08/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with creditors regarding Plan/TDP language and next steps	.20
05/08/19	AF O'Neill	007		Review April fees/comments regarding confidentiality and strategic issues for same	1.10
05/08/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review proposed revisions to TDP and communications between UST and ACC regarding same	1.10
05/09/19	DJ Lutes	007		Prepare monthly fee application materials (.2); review fee application issues (.2); calls and emails to M. Byrne (.3); email to A. O'Neill regarding same (.1)	.80
05/09/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications regarding CNOs/LOC with client	.10
05/09/19	AF O'Neill	009		Communications with J. Skakun regarding hearing, call regarding same	.30
05/09/19	AF O'Neill	017		Follow-up with FCR regarding TDP's and call with E. Harron regarding same	.20
05/09/19	AF O'Neill	007		Communications with Sidley team regarding fee application issues	.10
05/09/19	AF O'Neill	017		Multiple follow-up with ACC and FCR, analyze ACC language changes and compare to UST language	.50
05/09/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review further changes to draft confirmation order	.10
05/09/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review proposed TDP language and communications with a Stromberg regarding same	.20
05/09/19	AF O'Neill	016		Review agenda/communications with K. Stickles regarding same	.20
05/09/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review changes to confirmation order and revise	.40

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: *****

Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				same (.2); review transcript regarding same (.2)	
05/09/19	AF O'Neill	015		Office conference with A. Stromberg regarding order language and next steps regarding filing	.20
05/09/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with FCR regarding next steps/revised potential language for same	.30
05/09/19	AF O'Neill	015		Multiple communications with UST regarding revisions to documents and create multiple drafts of same, reply regarding comments and communications with A. Stromberg regarding progression of changes	1.00
05/09/19	JM Skakun	009		Confer and correspond with A. O'Neill regarding upcoming May 14 hearing, including regarding negotiations regarding TDP changes and potential disputed issues	.30
05/09/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review proposed TDP language and analyze potential alternative resolutions (.9); office conference with A. O'Neill regarding order language and next steps (.2); review potential filings in advance of confirmation hearing (.5) communications with UST regarding proposed TDP language (1.2); call with K.Stickles regarding potential filings (.4)	3.20
05/09/19	BM Warner	015		Revise proposed confirmation order and modified plan (1.8); confer regarding fees (.2); further revise confirmation order (.2)	2.20
05/10/19	DJ Lutes	007		Prepare monthly fee application materials (.8); emails with M. Byrne regarding same (.2)	1.00
05/10/19	AF O'Neill	015		Provide additional language for FCR	.10
05/10/19	AF O'Neill	017		Call with ACC/FCR and review language and multiple communications regarding same	.60
05/10/19	AF O'Neill	017		Follow-up with N. Ramsey regarding process/timing	.10
05/10/19	AF O'Neill	015		Slightly review TDP language and send to ACC and communications regarding next steps	.20
05/10/19	AF O'Neill	017		Review UST response to ACC, analyze same, and multiple communications with ACC/FCR regarding same	.50
05/10/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with T. Chirillo regarding environmental costs and review issues	.20
05/10/19	AF O'Neill	015		Prepare for call with company to provide update and call regarding Plan process (.4); meet with A.	.60

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: *****

Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				Stromberg regarding next steps (.2)	
05/10/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with UST/ACC regarding intent of language for TDP, review same (.3); call to FCR regarding next steps with ACC and analysis regarding same (.2)	.50
05/10/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with L. Shelko regarding fee issues and claim issue	.20
05/10/19	AF O'Neill	016		Multiple communications regarding agenda and review drafts of same	.20
05/10/19	AR Stromberg	015		Call with client regarding status of confirmation hearing and TDP (.7); emails with Cole Schotz regarding language for agenda (.3); review proposed TDP language (.6); call with ACC and FCR regarding proposed TDP language (.5); meet with A. O'Neill regarding next steps (.2)	2.30
05/10/19	BM Warner	016		Review and analyze agenda regarding confirmation hearing	.20
05/11/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with N. Ramsey regarding next steps with UST and consider hearing issues	.20
05/12/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review ACC email to UST regarding language	.10
05/12/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review email from ACC to UST regarding TDP language	.20
05/13/19	DJ Lutes	007		Review monthly fee application issues (.5); prepare monthly fee application (.6); call with M. Byrne regarding same (.1); email with A. O'Neill regarding same (.1); email to B. Warner regarding same (.1)	1.40
05/13/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with UST regarding ACC language	.10
05/13/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with A. Stromberg and B. Warner regarding prep of filing documents	.10
05/13/19	AF O'Neill	007		Finalize review of April time for strategic issues	.30
05/13/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with client regarding update	.20
05/13/19	AF O'Neill	017		Review and respond to multiple communications regarding ACC language including analysis regarding same	.20
05/13/19	AF O'Neill	007		Email with DJ Lutes regarding next steps with April fee application	.10
05/13/19	AF O'Neill	009		Communications with J. Skakun regarding	.20

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: *****

Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				litigation aspects/issues for hearing	
05/13/19	AF O'Neill	016		Communications with Cole Schotz regarding hearing	.20
05/13/19	AF O'Neill	016		Call with N. Ramsey regarding hearing (.3); draft hearing update to client and analysis regarding next steps (.4)	.70
05/13/19	JM Skakun	009		Prepare for 5/14 hearing, including analyzing key proposed TDP revisions and potential evidentiary issues	1.00
05/13/19	AR Stromberg	015		Revise Plan, confirmation order and plan exhibits for filing and confirmation hearing (1.9); review proposed revisions to TDP (.5); meet with A. O'Neill regarding next steps (.2); call with B. Warner regarding confirmation tasks (.2)	2.80
05/13/19	AR Stromberg	017		Call with ACC and FCR regarding hearing	.50
05/13/19	AR Stromberg	016		Call with K.Stickles regarding process for confirmation hearing	.50
05/13/19	BM Warner	015		Review emails and analyze procedure regarding district court affirmance (.3); conference call with A. Stromberg regarding confirmation tasks (.2); analyze and revise modified plan exhibits (1.3)	1.80
05/14/19	DJ Lutes	007		Emails with B. Warner regarding monthly fee application issues (.1); email with A. O'Neill regarding same (.1)	.20
05/14/19	DJ Lutes	016		Review confirmation hearing agenda items and incoming notices (.3); prepare key pleadings and materials for Sidley team (.4)	.70
05/14/19	AF O'Neill	015		Consider plan approach and draft email to UST regarding language and next steps	.50
05/14/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with ACC and FCR regarding language, committee support, and approach with UST	.20
05/14/19	AF O'Neill	015		Office conference with A. Stromberg regarding communications, review plan language and finalize same	.20
05/14/19	AF O'Neill	016		Communications with client regarding hearing/filing tactics	.20
05/14/19	AF O'Neill	015		Discuss other plan exhibits to be filed with A. Stromberg and filing mechanics	.20
05/14/19	AF O'Neill	016		Further communications with team, UST and	.50

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: *****

Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				ACC/FCR regarding hearing issues	
05/14/19	AF O'Neill	016		Draft comments for hearing and revise same	1.70
05/14/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with E. Harron regarding Plan	.20
05/14/19	AF O'Neill	016		Follow-up regarding filings for hearing and send to team and UST	.50
05/14/19	AF O'Neill	016		Meet with K. Stickles and A. Stromberg regarding hearing prep and needed documents	.50
05/14/19	AF O'Neill	016		Go to hearing and participate in same and return to offices, follow-up regarding various issues related to same	.70
05/14/19	AF O'Neill	015		Analysis regarding next steps for confirmation	.20
05/14/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with ACC/FCR regarding TDP language and with R. Schepacarter regarding same and review path	.30
05/14/19	AF O'Neill	011		Non-working travel time from hearing in Delaware to Chicago (time billed at half time)	1.00
05/14/19	AF O'Neill	011		Non-working travel time from Chicago to Delaware (time billed at half time)	.30
05/14/19	J Schomberg	016		Take notes regarding hearing for confirmation of the Plan	.40
05/14/19	JM Skakun	016		Attend confirmation hearing by phone	.50
05/14/19	AR Stromberg	011		Non-working travel time to and from Delaware for Confirmation Hearing (time billed at half time)	3.30
05/14/19	AR Stromberg	016		Attend Confirmation Hearing	1.00
05/14/19	AR Stromberg	015		Prepare for materials for confirmation hearing and revise proposed confirmation order and plan documents (1.9); office conference with A. O'Neill regarding plan issues (.2); draft presentation for confirmation hearing regarding plan changes and confirmation order changes (1.1); communications with UST and ACC regarding revised TDP (.5); email ACC and FCR regarding revised TDP language (.3)	4.00
05/14/19	BM Warner	016		Review emails and revise modified plan exhibits regarding confirmation hearing (1.6); review notices and coordinate with local counsel regarding filings (.3); research regarding UST plan objection (.4); telephonically attend confirmation hearing regarding modified plan and take notes regarding confirmation issues (.6)	2.90

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: *****
 Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
05/15/19	DJ Lutes	007		Calls and emails with B. Warner regarding interim fee application issues (.4); prepare first interim fee application and exhibits (2.2); review interim fee application issues and exemplars (.8); prepare spreadsheets and calculations (.4)	3.80
05/15/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with UST regarding added Plan language process	.20
05/15/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with ACC regarding added Plan language process	.50
05/15/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review A. Stromberg transmission to UST, revise same and communications with UST regarding same	.20
05/15/19	AF O'Neill	007		Meet with B. Warner on interim fee application correspondence and multiple emails regarding timing of same	.20
05/15/19	AF O'Neill	010		Send communications to client regarding fees/PR issues	.10
05/15/19	AF O'Neill	010		Review Cole Schotz/DRC interim application	.10
05/15/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review and analyze proposed revisions to TDP and related emails between FCR and ACC regarding same	.90
05/15/19	AR Stromberg	015		Draft email to UST regarding revisions to TDP	.50
05/15/19	BM Warner	007		Confer with client and professionals regarding professional fee estimates (.3); confer with professionals and Sidley team regarding interim fee applications (.6); confer with D. Lutes regarding interim fee application (.4)	1.30
05/16/19	DJ Lutes	007		Prepare interim fee application and exhibits (3.6); review monthly fee application materials, issues and status (.7); prepare spreadsheets for monthly and interim fee applications (.7); emails with B. Warner regarding interim fee application issues (.4); email with M. Bryne regarding same (.2); reconcile recent payment information for interim and monthly fee applications (.2)	5.80
05/16/19	AF O'Neill	007		Review interim fee apps and communications with B. Warner regarding same	.30
05/16/19	AF O'Neill	010		Review April MORs and comment regarding same	.20
05/16/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with UST regarding Plan language and with group regarding same	.20

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: *****

Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
05/16/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review revised confirmation order and communications with regarding same	.20
05/16/19	AF O'Neill	017		Further multiple communications with UST, FCR and ACC regarding sign-off	.30
05/16/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with E. Harron and team regarding CNO and process (.2); update client regarding same (.1)	.30
05/16/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with client regarding confirmation order	.10
05/16/19	AF O'Neill	008		Review new claim filed in cases	.10
05/16/19	AF O'Neill	015		Follow-up communications with UST regarding timing/language issues	.20
05/16/19	AF O'Neill	015		Call with B. Eilander regarding effective date mechanics	.10
05/16/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review and analyze plan provisions	.50
05/16/19	AR Stromberg	015		Revise TDP and draft confirmation order	1.30
05/16/19	BM Warner	008		Confer with client regarding proof of claim	.10
05/16/19	BM Warner	010		Review and analyze April monthly operating report	1.00
05/16/19	BM Warner	007		Review and revise Sidley interim fee application (.8); review and revise third monthly fee application (.5)	1.30
05/17/19	DJ Lutes	010		Prepare materials and electronic files for Sidley team (.3); review for key pleadings, notices and orders (.3)	.60
05/17/19	DJ Lutes	007		Prepare fee application materials from 3rd monthly fee application (.4); prepare spreadsheets for interim fee application (.3)	.70
05/17/19	AF O'Neill	015		Finalize various work streams on Plan and confirmation order	.50
05/17/19	AF O'Neill	007		Review fee apps (.1); communications with B. Warner regarding same (.1)	.20
05/17/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with client regarding confirmation	.20
05/17/19	AF O'Neill	010		Final adjustment to MORs and communications regarding same and filing	.20
05/17/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review final language tweaks to TDPs (.2); comment and communications with Sidley team	.30

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: *****

Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				regarding same (.1)	
05/17/19	AF O'Neill	015		Meet with A. Stromberg regarding timing and analysis regarding effective date issues	.30
05/17/19	AF O'Neill	010		Multiple communications with Cole Schotz and internal team regarding filing and timing issues	.50
05/17/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review and revise certification of counsel, confirmation order, and finalized plan for submission to court (1.4); meet with A. O'Neill regarding effective date issues (.3)	1.70
05/17/19	BM Warner	007		Revise and circulate fee applications for filing (.6); correspond with client regarding interim and monthly fee applications (.1)	.70
05/17/19	BM Warner	010		Confer with A. O'Neill regarding April monthly operating report (.2); confer with client regarding claims and April monthly operating report (.3); review and correspond with client regarding revised April monthly operating report (.3)	.80
05/17/19	BM Warner	015		Revise modified plan exhibits for filing	.40
05/18/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with L. Shelko and team regarding confirmation issues (.3); analysis regarding same (.2)	.50
05/20/19	DJ Lutes	010		Prepare materials and electronic files for Sidley team (.3); review for key pleadings, notices and orders (.2)	.50
05/20/19	DJ Lutes	007		Prepare fee application spreadsheets for interim fee application (.4); emails with M. Byrne regarding Ledes files (.1); review fee application materials and next deadlines (.1)	.60
05/20/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with UST regarding ACC language	.10
05/20/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with A. Stromberg and B. Warner regarding prep of filing documents	.10
05/20/19	AF O'Neill	007		Finalize review of April time	.30
05/20/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with client regarding process	.20
05/20/19	AF O'Neill	017		Review and respond to multiple communications regarding ACC language and analysis regarding same	1.00
05/20/19	AF O'Neill	017		Call with E. Harron regarding TDP language	.20
05/20/19	AF O'Neill	006		Email with DJ Lutes regarding next steps with	.10

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: *****

Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				April fee application	
05/20/19	AF O'Neill	009		Communications with J. Skakun regarding litigation aspects/issues	.10
05/20/19	AF O'Neill	015		Call with N. Ramsey regarding hearing approach (.3); draft update to client and analysis regarding language and next steps (.4)	.70
05/20/19	AF O'Neill	016		Communications with Cole Schotz regarding hearing	.10
05/20/19	AR Stromberg	015		Conference with B. Warner regarding District Court procedures	.40
05/20/19	BM Warner	010		Review and revise April monthly operating report (.4); conference call with K. Stickles regarding case deadlines and next steps (.4)	.80
05/20/19	BM Warner	015		Meet with A. Stromberg regarding Plan confirmation and affirmance (.5); review and analyze Plan affirmance timing (.8); draft summary and analysis of the same (.5); review and revise slip sheet regarding service of confirmation order (.3)	2.10
05/21/19	AF O'Neill	010		Provide final comments regarding MORs	.10
05/21/19	AF O'Neill	015		Office conference with B. Warner regarding next steps with District Court approval	.10
05/21/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with team regarding District Court process	.10
05/21/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications to E. Harron and N. Ramsey regarding Trust set-up	.10
05/21/19	BM Warner	015		Analyze and revise certification of counsel and proposed transmittal order and procedure letter to clerk (3.4); office conference with A. O'Neill regarding next steps for District Court (.1)	3.50
05/22/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with B. Warner regarding District Court approval (.1); meet with B. Warner regarding same and effective date closing issues (.3)	.40
05/22/19	AF O'Neill	010		Review follow-up communications from B. Warner and local counsel regarding documents to be filed and form and review COC for filing	.30
05/22/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review all materials for District Court analysis and prepare to engage with creditors on same	.30
05/22/19	AF O'Neill	010		Draft update on confirmation process and effective	.20

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: *****

Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				date timing for client	
05/22/19	AF O'Neill	015		Call with B. Warner, ACC and FCR in part on Plan affirmance issues	.20
05/22/19	AF O'Neill	010		Review preliminary closing checklist and cross- reference plan and confirmation order regarding same	.30
05/22/19	AF O'Neill	009		Review transcript from May 14 hearing	.10
05/22/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review materials for effective date closing list	.50
05/22/19	BM Warner	017		Call with A. O'Neill, ACC and FCR regarding effective date and affirmance plan	.30
05/22/19	BM Warner	007		Confer with T. Chirillo and Cole Schotz regarding CNOs regarding fee applications	.30
05/22/19	BM Warner	010		Call with K. Stickles regarding case tasks (.1); review affirmance documents and confer with A. O'Neill and K. Stickles regarding process (.2); draft effective date checklist (3.3); meet with A. O'Neill regarding affirmance and effective date tasks (.3); review and analyze revisions to district court procedure letter (.2)	4.10
05/23/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with team regarding process for approval of COC and multiple communications with UST and ACC/FCR regarding same	.20
05/23/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with B. Eilander regarding update call and agenda included analysis regarding same	.20
05/23/19	AF O'Neill	010		Further communications with company team regarding process and timing for effective date (.2) and review agenda for call (.1)	.30
05/23/19	AF O'Neill	010		Review revised closing checklist and comment regarding same	.30
05/23/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with company regarding UST fee issues	.10
05/23/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with K. Stickles regarding assignment of Judge Silberstein and consequences of same (.2); communications with team and client regarding same (.1)	.30
05/23/19	AF O'Neill	015		Consider UST response issues	.20
05/23/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review and comment on effective date closing list	1.00
05/23/19	BM Warner	010		Revise COC and draft emails to A. O'Neill, K.	1.70

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: *****

Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				Stickles and UST regarding affirmance pleadings (.5); confer with K. Stickles regarding UST fees, hearing date and affirmance pleadings (.6); call with K. Stickles regarding affirmance order and case assignment changes (.2); review and comment on revised draft of proposed record transfer order (.2); draft district court motion to affirm (.2)	
05/24/19	AF O'Neill	010		Prepare for call with company /review next steps for same and review closing checklist	1.00
05/24/19	AF O'Neill	010		Follow-up communications regarding closing checklist, review same	.10
05/24/19	AF O'Neill	017		Communications with M. Fink and B. Warner regarding ACC payments	.20
05/24/19	AF O'Neill	015		Multiple communications regarding filing of COC on Plan and update client regarding same	.20
05/24/19	BM Warner	010		Review and revise effective date checklist regarding comments from A. Stromberg (.7); confer with Meritor and A. O'Neill regarding fees payment status (.2)	.90
05/24/19	BM Warner	015		Draft motion to affirm Plan (.4); confer with Cole Schotz, A. O'Neill and U.S. Trustee regarding filing of COC and proposed order to transmit confirmation record (.2); draft District Court motion to affirm confirmation order (4.2); research precedent regarding District Court motion to affirm confirmation order (1.0)	5.80
05/28/19	DJ Lutes	015		Review plan confirmation materials and transmission order to District Court (.2); prepare electronic materials for Sidley team (.2)	.40
05/28/19	DJ Lutes	007		Review monthly fee application materials and issues (.2); email to M. Byrne regarding same (.1)	.30
05/28/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with team regarding order and strategy regarding Dist. Ct. and analysis/follow-up regarding same	.30
05/28/19	AF O'Neill	017		Review email from M. Fink regarding fees; follow-up regarding same	.20
05/28/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with K. Stickles regarding motion for District Court and review same	.20
05/28/19	AF O'Neill	010		Review critical dates calendar update	.10
05/28/19	BM Warner	010		Call with T. Chirillo and K. Kwiatkowski regarding payment of professional fees (.2); draft	1.90

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: *****

Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				professional fees summary for client (1.7)	
05/28/19	BM Warner	015		Review and revise motion to affirm confirmation order	1.10
05/29/19	DJ Lutes	010		Review plan confirmation materials including prep of electronic materials for Sidley team	.20
05/29/19	AF O'Neill	015		Multiple communications regarding entry of District Court docket, assigned Judge, analysis regarding same	.30
05/29/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review and revise updated drafts of letter and motion to District Court (.40); review communications regarding same (.20); meet with B. Warner regarding same (.20)	.80
05/29/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with B. Warner regarding appeal period and timing of letter directing courts	.20
05/29/19	AF O'Neill	010		Multiple communications regarding checklist, cooperation agreement and closing items with team	.30
05/29/19	AF O'Neill	010		Review fee chart (.10); and communications regarding fee applications in Delaware (.10)	.20
05/29/19	BM Warner	015		Confer with K. Stickles and Sidley team regarding District Court process and case strategy (.9); revise District Court motion to affirm confirmation order (.3)	1.20
05/29/19	BM Warner	017		Confer with Sidley team and ACC/FCR regarding effective date items and case updates (.6); confer with client and creditor professionals regarding fees status (.3)	.90
05/29/19	BM Warner	015		Meet with A. O'Neill regarding District Court pleadings revisions and research (.2); research and analyze precedent regarding District Court affirmance strategy (1.0); draft implementation steps plan (1.8)	3.00
05/30/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review B. Warner draft implementation step plan and comment regarding same	.30
05/30/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with K. Stickles regarding District Court judge question	.10
05/30/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with B. Warner regarding letter and motion to District Court and review revised versions of same (.30); analysis regarding affirmation requirements (.40)	.70
05/30/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications with B. Eilander regarding	.10

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: *****

Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

Date	Name	Task	Activity	Narrative	Hours
				weekly meeting	
05/30/19	AR Stromberg	015		Review letter to clerk regarding affirmance of bankruptcy court order	.30
05/30/19	BM Warner	015		Revise District Court motion to affirm confirmation order and procedure letter (1.1); review and circulate plan and trust documents to Trustee counsel (.3)	1.40
05/30/19	BM Warner	010		Call with Trustee counsel regarding case status (.3); correspondence to A. Stromberg regarding case status (.2)	.50
05/31/19	AF O'Neill	015		Further revise letter to clerk and send final revisions to K. Stickles (.2); follow-up with K. Stickles regarding same, judge appointment (.1)	.30
05/31/19	AF O'Neill	010		Follow-up regarding filed letter and with B. Eilander regarding same	.10
05/31/19	AF O'Neill	010		Communications regarding pro hac vice filing in Dist. Ct.	.10
05/31/19	AF O'Neill	007		Communications with K. Stickles and others regarding UST interim fee-app request	.10
05/31/19	AF O'Neill	015		Communications with B. Eilander regarding District Court issues	.10
05/31/19	AF O'Neill	010		Attention to appeal deadline issues and deadline, next steps with District Court	.20
05/31/19	AF O'Neill	015		Review draft step plan sent to B. Eilander	.20
05/31/19	BM Warner	015		Revise and circulate implementation step plan to client	1.00
Total Hours					142.80

EXHIBIT B

Expense Detail

SIDLEY AUSTIN LLP

Invoice Number: *****

Maremont Corporation

Restructuring

EXPENSE DETAIL

Date	Narrative	Amount
04/29/19	Other 4/23/19 - COURTCALL LLC - CCDA0726040419 - COURT SERVICES	\$100.00
	Total	\$100.00