

EXHIBIT A

Compensation Summary for Monthly Period

**COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY
FOR COMBINED MONTHLY PERIOD APRIL 1, 2019 THROUGH JULY 9, 2019**

Project Category	Total Hours	Total Fees
Case Administration	18.5	\$9,964.50
Fee Application Matters/Objections	29.2	\$15,663.00
Litigation/General (Except Automatic Stay Relief)	2.2	\$935.00
Preparation for and Attendance at Hearings	19.6	\$10,128.00
Reorganization Plan	33.9	\$21,884.00
Reports; Statements and Schedules	14.0	\$9,445.00
Retention Matters	1.3	\$624.00
U.S. Trustee Matters and Meetings	0.8	\$612.00
Budgeting (Case)	0.3	\$229.50
TOTAL	119.8	\$69,485.00

MAREMONT CORPORATION
 ATTENTION: CARL D. ANDERSON, II
 2135 WEST MAPLE ROAD
 TROY, MI 48084

Invoice Date: July 15, 2019
 Invoice Number: 840009
 Matter Number: 58686-0001

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH MAY 31, 2019

BUDGETING (CASE) **0.30** **229.50**

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
04/01/19	JKS	FOLLOW-UP EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: PROFESSIONAL FEES AND FEE ESTIMATE	0.10	76.50
04/01/19	JKS	CONFERENCE WITH B. WARNER RE: CASE STATUS AND MONTHLY FEE ESTIMATE	0.20	153.00

CASE ADMINISTRATION **9.20** **4,426.00**

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
04/01/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: CASE CALENDAR	0.10	76.50
04/04/19	PVR	UPDATE CASE CALENDAR AND CRITICAL DATES CHART RE: OBJECTION DEADLINE RE: COMBINED 1ST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION FOR J. PATTON, JR., LEGAL REPRESENTATIVE FOR FCR AND YCST, COUNSEL TO LEGAL REPRESENTATIVE FOR FCR	0.10	29.50
04/05/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM B. WARNER AND UPDATE CRITICAL DATES CHART RE: 341 MEETING OF CREDITORS, DEADLINE TO FILE SCHEDULES AND STATEMENTS AND EXPIRATION OF REMOVAL DEADLINE	0.10	29.50
04/08/19	JKS	CONFERENCE WITH B. WARNER RE: SUPPLEMENTS TO CASE CALENDAR	0.10	76.50
04/08/19	JCW	SEND CALENDAR INVITES RE: OBJECTION DEADLINE FOR SCHEDULES EXTENSION MOTION AND REMOVAL EXTENSION MOTION	0.30	61.50
04/08/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: MOTIONS TO BE FILED	0.10	76.50
04/08/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH E. CALDERON RE: SERVICE INSTRUCTIONS FOR MOTIONS	0.20	153.00
04/08/19	JKS	REVIEW AND REVISE CASE CALENDAR RE: CASE MANAGEMENT AND FORWARD TO B. WARNER	0.40	306.00
04/09/19	JKS	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM R. SCHEPACARTER REQUESTING COPY OF PLEADINGS	0.10	76.50

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice Number 840009
July 15, 2019
Page 2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
04/09/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH B. WARNER RE: ADDITIONAL MODIFICATION TO CASE CALENDAR	0.20	153.00
04/10/19	PVR	REVISE CRITICAL DATES CHART	0.20	59.00
04/12/19	PVR	UPDATE CASE CALENDAR AND CRITICAL DATES CHART RE: OBJECTION DEADLINE RE: ROBINSON & COLE FEBRUARY FEE APPLICATION	0.10	29.50
04/12/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND B. WARNER RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES CHART	0.10	29.50
04/12/19	JKS	REVIEW UPDATED CRITICAL DATES CALENDAR RE: CASE MANAGEMENT	0.10	76.50
04/18/19	PVR	UPDATE CASE CALENDAR AND CRITICAL DATES CHART RE: OBJECTION DEADLINE RE: SIDLEY MARCH FEE APPLICATION	0.10	29.50
04/18/19	PVR	UPDATE CHART OF PROFESSIONAL FEES	0.10	29.50
04/22/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: COURTCALL REGISTRATIONS FOR APRIL 23 HEARING	0.10	76.50
04/22/19	PVR	UPDATE CASE CALENDAR AND CRITICAL DATES CHART RE: DEADLINE TO FILE SCHEDULES AND STATEMENTS AND REMOVAL PERIOD	0.10	29.50
04/23/19	JKS	EMAIL TO P. RATKOWIAK RE: UPDATES FOR CASE CALENDAR	0.10	76.50
04/24/19	PVR	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH K. STICKLES RE: KASOWITZ 1ST FEE APPLICATION AND CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION	0.10	29.50
04/24/19	PVR	UPDATE CHART OF PROFESSIONAL FEES	0.10	29.50
04/25/19	PVR	UPDATE CASE CALENDAR AND CRITICAL DATES CHART	0.10	29.50
04/26/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND B. WARNER RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES CHART	0.10	29.50
04/26/19	PVR	UPDATE CHART OF PROFESSIONAL FEES	0.10	29.50
04/29/19	PVR	PREPARE CUMULATIVE CHART OF COLE SCHOTZ FEES AND EXPENSES RE: INTERIM FEE APPLICATION	0.60	177.00
04/29/19	PVR	UPDATE CASE CALENDAR AND CRITICAL DATES CHART RE: OBJECTION DEADLINE RE: MARCH FEE APPLICATIONS	0.20	59.00
04/29/19	PVR	EMAIL TO A. LOGAN AND K. STICKLES RE: FILED DONLIN RECANO MARCH FEE APPLICATION	0.10	29.50
04/29/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES RE: FILED COLE SCHOTZ MARCH FEE APPLICATION	0.10	29.50
04/29/19	PVR	UPDATE CHART OF PROFESSIONAL FEES	0.10	29.50
04/29/19	PVR	EMAIL TO B. WARNER AND K. STICKLES RE: FILED CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: KASOWITZ FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	0.10	29.50
04/29/19	PVR	EFILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF COLE SCHOTZ MARCH FEE APPLICATION	0.30	88.50
05/03/19	PVR	UPDATE CRITICAL DATES CHART AND EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND B. WARNER RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES CHART	0.20	59.00
05/03/19	JKS	REVIEW CASE CALENDAR RE: CASE MANAGEMENT	0.10	76.50
05/09/19	PVR	UPDATE CHART OF PROFESSIONAL FEES	0.10	29.50

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice Number 840009
July 15, 2019
Page 3

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
05/10/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND B. WARNER RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES CHART	0.10	29.50
05/13/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM K. STICKLES AND UPDATE CASE CALENDAR AND CRITICAL DATES CHART RE: EXCLUSIVITY DEADLINES	0.20	59.00
05/15/19	JKS	COMMUNICATIONS WITH B. WARNER RE: PROFESSIONAL FEE ESTIMATE	0.20	153.00
05/15/19	PVR	UPDATE CASE CALENDAR AND CRITICAL DATES CHART RE OBJECTION DEADLINE RE: COLE SCHOTZ AND DONLIN RECANO FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATIONS	0.10	29.50
05/15/19	PVR	RETRIEVE COMBINED FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION FOR FCR AND YOUNG CONAWAY AND UPDATE CASE CALENDAR AND CRITICAL DATES CHART RE: OBJECTION DEADLINE	0.10	29.50
05/15/19	PVR	UPDATE CHART OF PROFESSIONAL FEES	0.10	29.50
05/17/19	PVR	EMAL TO K. STICKLES AND B. WARNER RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES CHART	0.10	29.50
05/17/19	PVR	UPDATE CASE CALENDAR AND CRITICAL DATES CHART RE: OBJECTION DEADLINES RE: SIDLEYAND ROBINSON & COLE FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION AND APRIL MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	0.20	59.00
05/17/19	PVR	UPDATE CHART OF PROFESSIONAL FEES	0.10	29.50
05/17/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM AND TO DONLIN RECANO RE: SERVICE PARTIES FOR INTERIM AND MONTHLY FEE APPLICATIONS	0.10	29.50
05/20/19	JKS	CONFERENCE WITH B. WARNER RE: OPERATING REPORT, CONFIRMATION ORDER, FEE APPLICATIONS AND OTHER OPEN TASKS	0.30	229.50
05/20/19	JKS	EMAIL TO P. RATKOWIAK RE: STATUS AND ACTION ITEMS	0.20	153.00
05/20/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM AND TO K. STICKLES RE: FILING APRIL MOR AND RE: 2002 SERVICE LIST AND RESEARCH SAME	0.10	29.50
05/20/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM K. STICKLES AND UPDATE CASE CALENDAR AND CRITICAL DATES CHART RE: DEADLINE TO FILE INTERIM FEE APPLICATION FOR SECOND INTERIM FEE PERIOD	0.10	29.50
05/21/19	PVR	UPDATE CHART OF PROFESSIONAL FEES	0.10	29.50
05/22/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM AND TO K. STICKLES REQUESTING TRANSCRIPTS FROM APRIL 23, 2019 AND MAY 14, 2019 HEARINGS	0.10	29.50
05/22/19	PVR	UPDATE CHART OF PROFESSIONAL FEES	0.10	29.50
05/22/19	PVR	TELEPHONE TO AND EMAIL FROM G. MATTHEWS RE: TRANSCRIPTS FROM APRIL 23, 2019 AND MAY 14, 2019 HEARINGS	0.10	29.50
05/22/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM P. RATKOWIAK RE: APRIL AND MAY HEARING TRANSCRIPTS	0.10	76.50
05/22/19	JKS	EMAIL TO B. WARNER RE: TRANSCRIPTS FOR RECORD ON APPEAL	0.10	76.50
05/22/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH P. RATKOWIAK REQUESTING TRANSCRIPT FOR APRIL AND MAY HEARING FOR DISTRICT COURT RECORD	0.10	76.50

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice Number 840009
July 15, 2019
Page 4

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
05/23/19	JKS	REVIEW NOTICE OF JUDGE REASASIGNMENT AND COMMUNICATION WITH A. STROMBERG RE: JUDGE ASSIGNMENT AND ADDITIONAL REVISION TO DRAFT PLEADINGS	0.10	76.50
05/23/19	JKS	EMAIL TO B. WARNER RE: MAY HEARING TRANSCRIPT	0.10	76.50
05/23/19	PVR	RETRIEVE ORDER OF REASSIGNMENT OF JUDGE AND TRANSMIT TO DONLIN FOR SERVICE	0.10	29.50
05/24/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND B. WARNER RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES CHART	0.10	29.50
05/24/19	JKS	REVIEW UPDATED CASE CALENDAR RE: CASE MANAGEMENT	0.10	76.50
05/31/19	JKS	MULTIPLE EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH A. O'NEILL ET AL RE: APPEARANCE AND PRO HAC MOTIONS FOR FILING IN DISTRICT COURT	0.30	229.50
05/31/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND B. WARNER RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES CHART	0.10	29.50
05/31/19	JKS	REVIEW CASE CALENDAR RE: CASE MANAGEMENT	0.10	76.50
05/31/19	JKS	REVIEW, REVISE AND EXECUTE CERTIFICATION AND PROPOSED ORDER RE: OMNIBUS HEARING DATE, INCLUDING EMAIL WITH P. RATKOWIAK	0.10	76.50
05/31/19	JKS	CONFERENCE WITH AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM P. RATKOWIAK RE: SCEDULING HEARINGS	0.10	76.50
05/31/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: FILING AND SERVICE OF LETTER AND PRO HAC MOTIONS	0.20	153.00

FEE APPLICATION MATTERS/OBJECTIONS

20.90 10,535.50

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
04/04/19	PVR	UPDATE CHART OF PROFESSIONAL FEES	0.10	29.50
04/05/19	PVR	EFILE CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: DONLIN RECANO FEBRUARY FEE APPLICATION	0.20	59.00
04/05/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES RE: CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: DONLIN RECANO FEBRUARY FEE APPLICATION	0.10	29.50
04/05/19	PVR	UPDATE CHART OF PROFESSIONAL FEES	0.10	29.50
04/05/19	JKS	REVIEW AND EXECUTE CNO RE: DRC APPLICATION FOR FILING	0.10	76.50
04/05/19	PVR	PREPARE CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: DONLIN RECANO FEBRUARY FEE APPLICATION	0.10	29.50
04/09/19	JKS	REVIEW EXHIBIT TO COLE SCHOTZ MARCH FEE APPLICATION FOR PRIVILEGE, CONFIDENTIALITY AND COMPLIANCE WITH LOCAL RULES	1.30	994.50
04/12/19	JKS	REVIEW EXHIBIT TO COLE SCHOTZ FEE APPLICATION RE: PRIVILEGE, CONFIDENTIALITY, AND COMPLIANCE WITH LOCAL RULES	1.20	918.00
04/12/19	PVR	RETRIEVE ROBINS ON & COLE FEE APPLICATION AND UPDATE CHART OF PROFESSIONAL FEES	0.10	29.50

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice Number 840009
July 15, 2019
Page 5

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
04/15/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL EXCHANGE RE: SIDLEY FEE APPLICATION AND CALCULATE DEDUCTIONS	0.20	153.00
04/15/19	JKS	REVISE AND EXECUTE CERTIFICATION RE: SIDLEY 1ST FEE APPLICATION FOR FILING	0.20	153.00
04/15/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH A. O'NEILL RE: FEE AND EXPENSE REDUCTION	0.20	153.00
04/15/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: SIDLEY FEE APPLICATION	0.10	76.50
04/16/19	JKS	REVIEW AND EXECUTE AMENDED CERTIFICATION RE: DRC FEES FOR FILING	0.10	76.50
04/16/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: PAYMENT OF PROFESSIONAL FEES	0.10	76.50
04/16/19	PVR	EFILE AMENDED CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: DONLIN RECANO JANUARY FEE APPLICATION	0.20	59.00
04/16/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM AND TO K. STICKLES AND DRAFT CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: SIDLEY 1ST FEE APPLICATION TO REFLECT VOLUNTARY FEE AND EXPENSE REDUCTIONS	0.30	88.50
04/16/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES RE: FILED CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: SIDLEY FIRST FEE APPLICATION	0.10	29.50
04/16/19	JKS	REVIEW AND EXECUTE CERTIFICATION RE: SIDLEY FEE APPLICATION FOR FILING	0.10	76.50
04/16/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH B. WARNER RE: AGREED REDUCTION TO SIDLEY FEE APPLICATION	0.10	76.50
04/16/19	JKS	REVIEW AND REVISE CERTIFICATION RE: SIDLEY FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION AND FORWARD TO B. WARNER	0.10	76.50
04/16/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: REVISED CERTIFICATION RE: SIDLEY FEE APPLICATION	0.10	76.50
04/16/19	PVR	EFILE CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: SIDLEY FIRST FEE APPLICATION	0.20	59.00
04/16/19	PVR	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH K. STICKLES AND DRAFT AMENDED CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: DONLIN RECANO 1ST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	0.30	88.50
04/16/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH B. WARNER RE: DRC FEE REQUEST AND FILED CNO AND FOLLOW-UP WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: SAME	0.20	153.00
04/16/19	PVR	UPDATE CHART OF PROFESSIONAL FEES	0.10	29.50
04/17/19	JKS	REVIEW RESPONSIVE EMAIL FROM T. CHIRILLO RE: PROFESSIONAL FEE PAYMENTS	0.10	76.50
04/18/19	JKS	REVIEW AND EXECUTE CNO RE: COLE SCHOTZ FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION FOR FILING	0.10	76.50
04/18/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM B. WARNER AND PREPARE SIDLEY MARCH FEE APPLICATION FOR FILING	0.20	59.00
04/18/19	JKS	REVIEW SIDLEY SECOND FEE APPLICATION FOR FILING AND SERVICE	0.10	76.50

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice Number 840009
July 15, 2019
Page 6

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
04/18/19	PVR	EFILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF SIDLEY MARCH FEE APPLICATION	0.30	88.50
04/18/19	PVR	DRAFT CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: COLE SCHOTZ JANUARY - FEBRUARY FEE APPLICATION	0.10	29.50
04/18/19	PVR	EFILE CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: COLE SCHOTZ JANUARY - FEBRUARY FEE APPLICATION	0.20	59.00
04/22/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. SCHEPACARTREER RE: FCR AND YCST FEE APPLICATION	0.10	76.50
04/23/19	PVR	PREPARE CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: KASOWITZ FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	0.10	29.50
04/24/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM P. RATKOWIAK AND CERTIFICATION RE: KASOWITZ FIRST FEE APPLICATION AND RESPOND TO SAME	0.10	76.50
04/24/19	PVR	PREPARE COLE SCHOTZ MARCH FEE APPLICATION	1.70	501.50
04/24/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH B. WARNER RE: PAYMENT OF PROFESSIONAL FEES AND APPLICATION OF RETAINER	0.20	153.00
04/28/19	NLP	REVIEW AND REVISE EXHIBIT TO COLE SCHOTZ APRIL FEE APPLICATION RE: PRIVILEGE, CONFIDENTIALITY AND COMPLIANCE WITH LOCAL RULES	0.80	752.00
04/29/19	PVR	CONFERENCE WITH K. STICKLES AND REVIEW AND REVISE COLE SCHOTZ MARCH FEE APPLICATION	1.10	324.50
04/29/19	PVR	CONFERENCE WITH K. STICKLES AND FURTHER REVISE COLE SCHOTZ MARCH FEE APPLICATION AND PREPARE FOR FILING	0.20	59.00
04/29/19	PVR	EFILE CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: KASOWITZ FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	0.20	59.00
04/29/19	JKS	REVIEW AND REVISE EXHIBIT TO COLE SCHOTZ SECOND FEE APPLICATION, INCLUDING CONFERENCE WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: COMPLIANCE WITH US TRUSTEE REQUIREMENTS	0.30	229.50
04/29/19	JKS	REVIEW, REVISE AND EXECUTE COLE SCHOTZ SECOND MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION FOR FILING	0.90	688.50
04/29/19	JKS	REVIEW AND EXECUTE CERTIFICATION RE: KASOWITZ FIRST FEE APPLICATION	0.10	76.50
04/29/19	PVR	PREPARE NOTICE FOR DONLIN RECANO MARCH FEE APPLICATION	0.10	29.50
04/29/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM A. LOGAN RE: DONLIN RECANO MARCH FEE APPLICATION	0.10	29.50
04/29/19	PVR	EFILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF DONLIN RECANO MARCH FEE APPLICATION	0.30	88.50
04/29/19	PVR	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH K. STICKLES RE: CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: KASOWITZ FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	0.10	29.50
04/29/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM A. LOGAN RE: DRC THIRD FEE APPLICATION	0.10	76.50
04/29/19	JKS	REVIEW DRC THIRD FEE APPLICATION FOR FILING, INCLUDING EXECUTION OF NOTICE OF APPLICATION	0.20	153.00

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice Number 840009
July 15, 2019
Page 7

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
04/29/19	JKS	CONFERENCE WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: FILING AND SERVICE OF FEE APPLICATION	0.10	76.50
05/06/19	PVR	DRAFT COLE SCHOTZ APRIL FEE APPLICATION	0.30	88.50
05/09/19	PVR	DRAFT COLE SCHOTZ 1ST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION	0.90	265.50
05/09/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND PREPARE CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: SIDLEY MARCH FEE APPLICATION	0.20	59.00
05/09/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM K. STICKLES AND EFILE CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: SIDLEY MARCH FEE APPLICATION	0.20	59.00
05/09/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM A. LOGAN AND TO K. STICKLES RE: DRAFT DRC INTERIM FEE APPLICATION AND REVIEW AND REVISE SAME	0.40	118.00
05/10/19	PVR	CONFERENCE WITH K. STICKLES AND FINALIZE COLE SCHOTZ 1ST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION	0.60	177.00
05/14/19	PVR	EMAIL TO AND FROM A. LOGAN RE: DRAFT DRC INTERIM FEE APPLICATION	0.10	29.50
05/15/19	PVR	EFILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF COLE SCHOTZ FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION	0.30	88.50
05/15/19	PVR	PREPARE NOTICE FOR DONLN RECANO FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION	0.10	29.50
05/15/19	PVR	EFILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF DONLIN RECANO FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION	0.40	118.00
05/15/19	PVR	EMAIL TO AND FROM A. LOGAN RE FILING DONLIN RECANO FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION	0.10	29.50
05/15/19	PVR	EMAIL TO AND FROM K. STICKLES RE: APPROVAL TO FILE COLE SCHOTZ AND DONLIN RECANO FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATIONS	0.10	29.50
05/16/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH B. WARNER RE: PROFESSIONAL FEES	0.20	153.00
05/17/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: KASOWITZ FEES	0.10	76.50
05/17/19	JKS	REVIEW SIDLEY'S INTERIM AND MONTHLY FEE APPLICATIONS	0.10	76.50
05/17/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: FEE APPLICATION	0.10	76.50
05/17/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM AND TO B. WARNER RE: SIDLEY'S INTERIM AND MONTHLY FEE APPLICATIONS	0.10	29.50
05/17/19	PVR	EFILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF SIDLEY APRIL FEE APPLICATION	0.30	88.50
05/17/19	PVR	EFILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF SIDLEY FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION	0.30	88.50
05/21/19	JKS	REVIEW AND EXECUTE CERTIFICATION RE: COLE SCHOTZ SECOND FEE APPLICATION, INCLUDING EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: PREPARATION OF CERTIFICATION	0.10	76.50
05/21/19	JKS	REVIEW AND EXECUTE CERTIFICATION RE: DRC THIRD FEE APPLICATION, INCLUDING COMMUNICATION WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: PREPARATION AND FILING OF CERTIFICATION	0.10	76.50
05/21/19	PVR	PREPARE CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE COLE SCHOTZ MARCH FEE APPLICATION	0.10	29.50

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice Number 840009
July 15, 2019
Page 8

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
05/21/19	PVR	PREPARE CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: DONLIN RECANO MARCH FEE APPLICATION	0.10	29.50
05/21/19	PVR	EFILE CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE COLE SCHOTZ MARCH FEE APPLICATION	0.20	59.00
05/21/19	PVR	EFILE CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE DONLIN RECANO MARCH FEE APPLICATION	0.20	59.00
05/22/19	PVR	EFILE AMENDED CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: DONLIN RECANO MARCH FEE APPLICATION	0.20	59.00
05/22/19	JKS	REVIEW AND EXECUTE AMENDED CNO RE: DRC APPLICATION FOR FILING	0.10	76.50
05/22/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: DRC CNO AND FORWARD TO P. RATKOWIAK FOR CORRECTION	0.10	76.50
05/22/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM AND TO K. STICKLES AND DRAFT AMENDED CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: DONLIN RECANO MARCH FEE APPLICATION	0.10	29.50
05/31/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH A. O'NEILL, E. HARRON, M. FINK AND A. LOGAN RE: EXTENSION OF RESPONSE DEADLINE AND FOLLOW-UP EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH R. SCHEPACARTER RE: CONSENT TO EXTENSION	0.20	153.00
05/31/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH M. FINK ET AL RE: FIRST INTERIM FEE HEAGING AND FOLLOW-UP EMAIL TO P. RATKOWIAK RE: NOTICE	0.20	153.00
05/31/19	JKS	REVIEW DOCKET RE: STATUS OF VARIOUS PROFESSIONALS' MONTHLY AND INTERIM FEE APPLICATIONS	0.30	229.50
05/31/19	JKS	REVEIW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM R. SCHEPACARTER RE: INTERIM FEE APPLICATIONS, INCLUDING PREPARATION OF CHART OF DEADLINES	0.10	76.50
LITIGATION/ GEN. (EXCEPT AUTOMATIC STAY RELIEF)			2.20	935.00

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
04/08/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH J. WHITWORTH RE: FILING AND SERVICE OF REMOVAL MOTION	0.20	153.00
04/08/19	JKS	REVIEW AND REVISE NOTICE RE: REMOVAL MOTION FOR FILING	0.10	76.50
04/08/19	JKS	REVIEW MOTION FOR ORDER EXTENDING THE PERIOD WITHIN WHICH DEBTORS MAY REMOVE ACTIONS	0.30	229.50
04/08/19	JCW	REVIEW NOTICE RE: REMOVAL EXTENSION MOTION AND PREPARE FOR FILING	0.40	82.00
04/08/19	JCW	FILE REMOVAL EXTENSION MOTION	0.60	123.00
04/17/19	PVR	PREPARE CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: MOTION EXTENDING REMOVAL PERIOD	0.10	29.50
04/17/19	PVR	EFILE CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: MOTION EXTENDING REMOVAL PERIOD	0.20	59.00
04/17/19	JKS	REVIEW AND EXECUTE CERTIFICATION RE: REMOVAL MOTION	0.10	76.50

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice Number 840009
July 15, 2019
Page 9

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
04/22/19	PVR	RETRIEVE ORDER EXTENDING REMOVAL PERIOD DEADLINE AND EMAIL TO DRC RE: SERVICE	0.10	29.50
04/22/19	JKS	REVIEW ORDER EXTENDING TIME TO REMOVE ACTIONS AND COMMUNICATION WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: SERVICE OF ORDER	0.10	76.50
PREPARATION FOR AND ATTENDANCE AT HEARINGS			16.50	9,213.50
<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
04/09/19	PVR	PREPARE NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR APRIL 23, 2019 HEARING	0.30	88.50
04/16/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH A. STROMBERG RE: AGENDA FOR APRIL 23 HEARING	0.10	76.50
04/17/19	PVR	CONFERENCE WITH K. STICKLES AND COORDINATE PRODUCTION OF CHAMBERS' BINDER RE: COMPENDIUM OF CASES	0.30	88.50
04/17/19	JKS	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT AGENDA RE: APRIL 23 HEARING	0.30	229.50
04/17/19	JKS	CONFERENCE WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: DRAFT AGENDA AND HEARING BINDERS	0.20	153.00
04/17/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES RE: DRAFT NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR APRIL 23, 2019 COMBINED CONFIRMATION HEARING	0.10	29.50
04/17/19	PVR	REVISE NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR APRIL 23, 2019 HEARING RE: FILED CERTIFICATIONS OF NO OBJECTION	0.10	29.50
04/18/19	PVR	COORDINATE SUBMISSION OF FILED NOTICE OF AGENDA AND 4 BINDERS FOR TELEPHONIC HEARING ON APRIL 23, 2019	0.20	59.00
04/18/19	PVR	EFILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR TELEPHONIC HEARING ON APRIL 23, 2019	0.30	88.50
04/18/19	PVR	EMAIL TO N. HUNT AND D. GROTTINI RE: FILED NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR TELEPHONIC HEARING ON APRIL 23, 2019	0.10	29.50
04/18/19	PVR	CONFERENCE WITH K. STICKLES RE: NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR TELEPHONIC HEARING ON APRIL 23, 2019	0.10	29.50
04/18/19	JKS	FOLLOW-UP CONFERENCE WITH D. GROTTINI RE: FILING OF HEARING AGENDA	0.10	76.50
04/18/19	PVR	EMAIL TO A. O'NEILL, A. STROMBERG AND B. WARNER RE: FILED NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR APRIL 23, 2019 TELEPHONIC HEARING	0.10	29.50
04/18/19	JKS	CONFERENCE WITH D. GROTTINI RE: SCHEDULED APRIL 23 HEARING	0.20	153.00
04/18/19	JKS	REVIEW, REVISE AND EXECUTE NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR FILING, INCLUDING COMMUNICATIONS WITH A. STROMBERG AND B. WARNER RE: MODIFICATIONS TO AGENDA	0.40	306.00
04/18/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM D. GROTTINI RE: NOTICE OF AGENDA	0.10	76.50
04/22/19	PVR	EMAIL TO AND FROM K. STICKLES RE: TELEPHONIC APPEARANCES FOR SIDLEY AT APRIL 23, 2019 TELEPHONIC HEARING	0.10	29.50

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice Number 840009
July 15, 2019
Page 10

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
04/22/19	PVR	TELEPHONE TO AND EMAIL FROM COURTCALL RE: TELEPHONIC APPEARANCE OF A. O'NEILL AT APRIL 23, 2019 TELEPHONIC HEARING	0.20	59.00
04/22/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES RE: COURTCALL CONFIRMATION AND TELEPHONE TO AND EMAIL FROM COURTCALL RE: TELEPHONIC APPEARANCE OF K. STICKLES AT APRIL 23, 2019 TELEPHONIC HEARING	0.20	59.00
04/22/19	PVR	EMAIL TO A. O'NEILL RE: COURTCALL CONFIRMATION RE: TELEPHONIC APPEARANCE AT APRIL 23, 2019 TELEPHONIC HEARING	0.10	29.50
04/22/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH A. O'NEILL RE: APRIL 23 HEARING	0.20	153.00
04/23/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM K. STICKLES AND TELEPHONE TO COURTCALL RE: TELEPHONIC APPEARANCE OF B. EILANDER AT APRIL 23, 2019 TELEPHONIC HEARING	0.20	59.00
04/23/19	JKS	ATTEND STATUS CONFERENCE RE: CONTINUED CONFIRMATION HEARING	0.30	229.50
04/23/19	NLP	ATTEND TELEPHONIC STATUS CONFERENCE	0.30	282.00
04/24/19	PVR	DRAFT NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR MAY 14, 2019 CONFIRMATION HEARING	0.20	59.00
04/24/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM AND TO K. STICKLES RE: REVISED NOTICE OF CONTINUED COMBINED HEARING	0.10	29.50
04/24/19	PVR	FURTHER REVISE NOTICE OF CONTINUED COMBINED HEARING AND PREPARE FOR FILING	0.10	29.50
04/24/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM AND TO K. STICKLES AND DRAFT NOTICE OF RESCHEDULED COMBINED CONFIRMATION HEARING	0.20	59.00
04/24/19	PVR	EFILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF NOTICE OF CONTINUED COMBINED HEARING	0.30	88.50
04/24/19	PVR	UPDATE NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR MAY 14, 2019 HEARING RE: FILED NOTICE OF CONTINUED COMBINED HEARING	0.10	29.50
05/09/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND REVIEW NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR MAY 14, 2019 HEARING	0.20	59.00
05/10/19	PVR	EFILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR MAY 14, 2019 HEARING	0.30	88.50
05/10/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM K. STICKLES AND TO A. O'NEILL, A. STROMBERG AND B. WARNER RE: UPDATES TO NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR MAY 14, 2019 HEARING	0.20	59.00
05/10/19	PVR	EMAILS FROM K. STICKLES AND A. STROMBERG AND UPDATE NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR MAY 14, 2019 HEARING	0.20	59.00
05/10/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES, A. O'NEILL, A. STROMBERG AND B. WARNER RE: UPDATED DRAFT NOTICE OF AGENDA	0.10	29.50
05/10/19	PVR	TELEPHONE TO D. GROTTINI RE: HEARING BINDERS FOR MAY 14, 2019 HEARING	0.10	29.50
05/10/19	JKS	REVIEW AND REVISE AGENDA RE: CONFIRMATION HEARING	0.20	153.00
05/10/19	PVR	PREPARE NOTICE OF AGENDA DATA SOURCE RE: SERVICE OF MAY 14, 2019 HEARING	0.20	59.00

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice Number 840009
July 15, 2019
Page 11

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
05/10/19	PVR	COORDINATE SUBMISSION OF NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR MAY 14, 2019 HEARING AND HEARING BINDERS TO CHAMBERS	0.10	29.50
05/10/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM A. STROMBERG RE: REVISED NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR MAY 14, 2019 HEARING	0.10	29.50
05/10/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES, A. O'NEILL, A. STROMBERG AND B. WARNER RE: FILED NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR MAY 14, 2019 HEARING	0.10	29.50
05/10/19	PVR	UPDATE HEARING BINDERS FOR CHAMBERS RE: MAY 14, 2019 HEARING	0.30	88.50
05/10/19	PVR	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH K. STICKLES AND A. STROMBERG RE: FURTHER UPDATE NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR MAY 14, 2019 HEARING	0.20	59.00
05/13/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM B. WARNER AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH COURTCALL RE: TELEPHONIC APPEARANCE AT MAY 14, 2019 HEARING	0.20	59.00
05/14/19	PVR	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH N. PERNICK RE: HEARING AND EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH COURTCALL RE: TELEPHONIC APPEARANCE AT MAY 14, 2019 HEARING	0.20	59.00
05/14/19	PVR	EFILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF AMENDED NOTICE OF AGENDA	0.40	118.00
05/14/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM AND TO B. WARNER RE: REVISED PLAN EXHIBIT DOCUMENTS AND PREPARE SAME FOR HEARING	0.40	118.00
05/14/19	NLP	ATTENDANCE AT CONTINUED CONFIRMATION HEARING	0.90	846.00
05/14/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND PREPARE AMENDED NOTICE OF AGENDA	0.30	88.50
05/14/19	JKS	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONTINUED CONFIRMATION HEARING, INCLUDING PRE-HEARING CONFERENCES WITH CO-COUNSEL	5.20	3,978.00
05/14/19	JKS	REVIEW, REVISE AND EXECUTE NOTICE OF AMENDED AGENDA FOR FILING	0.10	76.50
05/14/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH N. HUNT RE: HEARING, INCLUDING AND FOLLOW-UP WITH CO-COUNSEL AND FCR COUNSEL RE: HEARING	0.20	153.00
05/14/19	PVR	COORDINATE SUBMISSION OF FILED NOTICE OF FILING OF REVISED PROPOSED CONFIRMATION ORDER AND FILED NOTICE OF FILING OF BLACK LINE OF MODIFIED JOINT PREPACKAGED PLAN TO CHAMBERS RE: MAY 14, 2019 HEARING	0.20	59.00
05/15/19	PVR	EMAIL TO AND FROM K. STICKLES RE: HEARING DATE FOR FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION	0.10	29.50
05/31/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND DRAFT CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL AND PROPOSED ORDER RE: JULY 22, 2019 HEARING DATE	0.20	59.00
05/31/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM AND TO L. JOHNSON AND K. STICKLES RE: JULY 22, 2019 HEARING DATE	0.10	29.50

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice Number 840009
July 15, 2019
Page 12

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
05/31/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM K. STICKLES RE: SCHEDULING FEE HEARING AND EMAIL TO L. JOHNSON REQUESTING FEE HEARING	0.10	29.50

REORGANIZATION PLAN**20.20 12,590.50**

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
04/02/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM AND CONFERENCE WITH A. O'NEILL RE: STATUS AND STRATEGY	0.40	306.00
04/10/19	JKS	REVIEW AND ANALYZE EMAIL FROM A. STROMBERG, WITH ATTACHMENTS, RE: REVISIONS TO TDP TO ADDRESS UST'S OBJECTIONS	0.30	229.50
04/11/19	NLP	CONFERENCE WITH K. STICKLES RE: STATUS	0.60	564.00
04/16/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAILS FROM R. SCHEPACARTER AND A. O'NEILL RE: PROPOSED AUDIT PROCESS	0.20	153.00
04/17/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE AND CONFERENCE WITH A. STROMBERG RE: STATUS OF PLAN AND TDP DISCUSSIONS	0.40	306.00
04/17/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE AND CONFERENCE WITH A. O'NEILL AND A. STROMBERG RE: APRIL 23 HEARING AND STRATEGY	0.50	382.50
04/18/19	JKS	COMMUNICATIONS WITH A. O'NEILL RE: STATUS OF DISCUSSIONS RE: TDP AND SCHEDULED STATUS CONFERENCE	0.20	153.00
04/22/19	JKS	REVIEW AND ANALYZE US TRUSTEE'S PROPOSED MODIFICATION TO TDP LANGUAGE	0.20	153.00
04/22/19	JKS	REVIEW MAIL FROM A. O'NEILL RE: TDP	0.10	76.50
04/23/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAILS FROM N. RAMSEY, A. O'NEILL, R. SCHEPACARTER AND E. HARRON, AND RESPOND TO SAME, RE: RESCHEDULING CONTINUED CONFIRMATION HEARING	0.10	76.50
04/23/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH A. O'NEILL AND B. EILANDER RE: STATUS HEARING RE: CONFIRMATION	0.20	153.00
04/24/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM N. RAMSEY RE: COMBINED HEARING	0.10	76.50
04/24/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH A. O'NEILL RE: NOTICE OF CONTINUED HEARING FOR FILING	0.10	76.50
04/24/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH A. O'NEILL RE: CONTINUED COMBINED HEARING AND NOTICING OF SAME	0.20	153.00
04/24/19	JKS	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM I. DENSMORE RE: COMBINED HEARING	0.10	76.50
04/24/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: PREPARATION OF NOTICE OF CONTINUED COMBINED HEARING	0.10	76.50
04/24/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAILS FROM R. SCHEPACARTER AND A. O'NEILL RE: PROPOSED TDP REVISIONS	0.30	229.50
04/24/19	JKS	REVIEW AND RE-DRAFT NOTICE OF CONTINUED COMBINED HEARING, INCLUDING INCORPORATION OF DOCUMENTS AND DOCKET REFERENCES	0.30	229.50
04/24/19	JKS	EMAIL TO P. RATKOWIAK RE: FILING AND SERVICE OF NOTICE OF CONTINUED HEARING	0.10	76.50

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice Number 840009
July 15, 2019
Page 13

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
05/08/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH A. O'NEILL RE: STATUS OF TDP NEGOTIATIONS	0.20	153.00
05/10/19	JKS	COMMUNICATIONS WITH A. O'NEILL ET AL RE: CONFIRMATION HEARING	0.30	229.50
05/13/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: DISTRICT COURT AFFIRMANCE STRATEGY	0.10	76.50
05/13/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH A. STROMBERG RE: STATUS OF DISCUSSIONS RE: TDP	0.20	153.00
05/13/19	JKS	CONFERENCE WITH A. STROMBERG RE: CONTINUED CONFIRMATION HEARING, STATUS AND PREPARATIONS	0.40	306.00
05/13/19	NLP	REVIEW A. O'NEILL, K. STICKLES 5/13 EMAILS RE: CONFIRMATION STATUS	0.20	188.00
05/14/19	PVR	EFILE NOTICE OF FILING OF REVISED PROPOSED CONFIRMATION ORDER	0.30	88.50
05/14/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES RE: APPROVAL TO FILE MODIFIED PLAN TDP AND PREPARE FOR SAME FOR FILING	0.40	118.00
05/14/19	NLP	REVIEW TDP CHANGED PAGES	0.30	282.00
05/14/19	JKS	REVIEW BLACKLINE PLAN, INCLUDING TDP, AND EXECUTE NOTICE FOR FILING	0.40	306.00
05/14/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAILS FROM A. O'NEILL AND R. SCHEPACARTER RE: REVISIONS TO TDP	0.20	153.00
05/14/19	JKS	REVIEW BLACKLINE CONFIRMATION ORDER AND EXECUTE NOTICE FOR FILING	0.30	229.50
05/14/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH A. O'NEILL, A. STROMBERG AND B. WARNER RE: FILING OF BLACKLINE CONFIRMATION ORDER AND PLAN	0.50	382.50
05/14/19	PVR	CONFERENCE WITH K. STICKLES AND EMAIL TO B. WARNER RE: DRAFT NOTICES OF FILING RE: (I) MODIFIED PLAN AND (II) REVISED PROPOSED CONFIRMATION ORDER	0.30	88.50
05/14/19	PVR	EFILE NOTICE OF FILING OF BLACK LINE OF MODIFIED JOINT PREPACKAGED PLAN	0.30	88.50
05/14/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND DRAFT NOTICE OF FILING MODIFIED PLAN AND REVISED CONFIRMATION ORDER	0.40	118.00
05/14/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM B. WARNER AND K. STICKLES AND REVISE NOTICE OF FILING MODIFIED PLAN RE: COMPLETE BLACKLINE	0.30	88.50
05/17/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM A. STROMBERG AND CHANGED PAGES FOR THE TDP AND CONFIRMATION ORDER	0.20	153.00
05/17/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM AND TO A. STROMBERG AND K. STICKLES RE: CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL RE: REVISED CONFIRMATION ORDER AND EXHIBITS AND PREPARE DRAFT	0.50	147.50
05/17/19	PVR	EFILE AND COORDINATE SUBMISSION TO CHAMBERS RE: CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL RE: REVISED CONFIRMATION ORDER AND EXHIBITS	0.40	118.00

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice Number 840009
July 15, 2019
Page 14

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
05/17/19	PVR	EMAIL TO A. STROMBERG, A. O'NEILL, B. WARNER AND K. STICKLES RE: FILED CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL RE: REVISED CONFIRMATION ORDER	0.20	59.00
05/17/19	PVR	CONFERENCE WITH K. STICKLES AND EMAIL TO A. STROMBERG RE: DRAFT CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL TO FILE REVISED CONFIRMATION ORDER	0.20	59.00
05/20/19	PVR	CONFERENCE WITH K. STICKLES AND EMAIL TO B. WARNER AND A. STRMOBERG RE: SERVICE OF CONFIRMATION ORDER EXHIBITS	0.30	88.50
05/20/19	PVR	EMAILS FROM A. STROMBERG AND B. WARNER SERVICE OF CONFIRMATION ORDER EXHIBITS	0.30	88.50
05/20/19	PVR	EMAIL TO DONLIN RECANO RE: SERVICE OF CONFIRMATION ORDER	0.20	59.00
05/20/19	PVR	EMAIL TO AND FROM DONLIN RECANO RE: SERVICE OF CONFIRMATION ORDER AND SERVICE CONTACT	0.10	29.50
05/20/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND DRAFT EXHIBIT MARKER FOR SERVICE	0.30	88.50
05/20/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES RE REVISED EXHIBIT MARKER IN LIEU OF CONFIRMATION ORDER EXHIBITS	0.10	29.50
05/21/19	JKS	EMAIL TO B. WARNER RE: DRAFT CERTIFICATION AND PROPOSED TRANSMITTAL ORDER	0.10	76.50
05/21/19	JKS	DRAFT CERTIFICATION RE: PROPOSED ORDER DIRECTING BANKRUPTCY CLERK TRANSMIT RECORD TO DISTRICT COURT	0.60	459.00
05/23/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH B. WARNER RE: PROPOSED CERTIFICATION AND PROPOSED ORDER FOR CIRCULATION TO PARTIES IN INTEREST	0.20	153.00
05/23/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAILS FROM M. FINK AND A. O'NEILL RE: CERTIFICATION RE: PROPOSED TRANSMITTAL ORDER AND REVISE THE SAME	0.20	153.00
05/23/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH R. SCHEPACARTER RE: DRAFT CERTIFICATION RE: PROPOSED TRANSMITTAL ORDER	0.10	76.50
05/23/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH B. WARNER RE: PROPOSED DESIGNATION AND CITATION TO TRANSCRIPTS	0.20	153.00
05/23/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH A. O'NEILL RE: DRAFT PROPOSED TRANSMITTAL ORDER	0.20	153.00
05/23/19	JKS	REVIEW REVISED PROPOSED DESIGNATION OF RECORD AND FOLLOW-UP RE: STATUS OF HEARING TRANSCRIPTS FOR INCLUSION IN DESIGNATION	0.30	229.50
05/24/19	PVR	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH B. WARNER RE: CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL RE: PROPOSED ORDER DIRECTING BANKRUPTCY CLERK TO TRANSMIT RECORD	0.10	29.50
05/24/19	PVR	EFILE CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL RE: PRPOSED ORDER DIRECTING BANKRUPTCY CLERK TO TRANSMIT RECORD AND SUBMIT TO CHAMBERS	0.50	147.50

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice Number 840009
July 15, 2019
Page 15

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
05/24/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. SCHEPACARTER RE: CONSENT TO CERTIFICATION AND PROPOSED TRANSMITTAL ORDER	0.10	76.50
05/24/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH B. WARNER ET AL RE: FILING OF CERTIFICATION AND PROPOSED ORDER RE: TRANSMITTAL OF RECORD TO DISTRICT COURT	0.20	153.00
05/24/19	PVR	EMAIL TO B. WARNER, A. O'NEILL, A. STROMBER AND K. STICKLES RE: FILED CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL	0.10	29.50
05/28/19	JKS	FURTHER REVIEW AND REVISION OF DRAFT MOTION RE: AFFIRMANCE OF CHANNELING INJUNCTION	0.50	382.50
05/28/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH A. O'NEILL AND B. WARNER RE: MOTION TO AFFIRM AND PROPOSED ORDER	0.30	229.50
05/28/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES, A. O'NEILL, A. STROMBERG AND B. WARNER AND RETREIVE ORDER DIRECTING CLERK OF BANKRUPTCY COURT TO TRANSMIT RECORD REGARDING CONFIRMATION OF PLAN TO DISTRICT COURT	0.10	29.50
05/28/19	JKS	EMAIL TO AND FROM A. O'NEILL RE: TRANSMITTAL OF RECORD TO DISTRICT COURT	0.10	76.50
05/29/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE AND CONFERENCE WITH B. WARNER RE: TIMING AND STRATEGY RE: DISTRICT COURT AFFIRMANCE OF CHANNELING INJUNCTION	0.20	153.00
05/29/19	JKS	REVIEW TRANSMITTAL OF RECORD; DOCKETING OF CASE IN DISTRICT COURT; AND NOTICE OF CASE SUBMISSION FOR JUDICIAL CASE ASSIGNMENT	0.20	153.00
05/29/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM AND TO K. STICKLES AND DRAFT NOTICE OF APPEARANCE AND PRO HAC MOTIONS FOR A. O'NEILL, A. STROMBERG AND B. WARNER RE: DISTRICT COURT MATTER	0.40	118.00
05/29/19	JKS	FURTHER REVISION OF MOTION FOR AFFIRMANCE AND EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH B. WARNER RE: SAME	0.60	459.00
05/29/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAILS FROM B. WARNER AND FURTHER REVISED MOTION AND LETTER	0.40	306.00
05/30/19	JKS	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: DISTRICT COURT CASE	0.20	153.00
05/30/19	JKS	REVIEW REVISED AFFIRMANCE MOTION AND LETTER TO DISTRICT COURT RE: AFFIRMANCE OF CHANNELING INJUNCTION	0.40	306.00
05/31/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH A. O'NEILL RE: DISTRICT COURT AFFIRMANCE OF FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW	0.20	153.00
05/31/19	JKS	REVISE AND FINALIZE LETTER TO CLERK OF COURT FOR FILING, INCLUDING COMMUNICATIONS WITH A. O'NEILL RE: LETTER	0.60	459.00
05/31/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM K. STICKLES RE: EFILING LETTER TO CLERK RE: SECTION 524(G) OF THE BANKRUPTCY CODE	0.10	29.50
05/31/19	PVR	EFILE AND COORDINATE SUBMISSION TO DISTRICT COURT RE: LETTER TO CLERK RE: SECTION 524(G) OF THE BANKRUPTCY CODE	0.30	88.50

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice Number 840009
July 15, 2019
Page 16

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
05/31/19	PVR	EMAIL FILED LETTER TO K. STICKLES, A. O'NEILL, A. STROMBERG AND B. WARNER	0.10	29.50
05/31/19	PVR	EMAIL SERVICE TO NOTICE PARTIES RE: FILED LETTER TO CLERK	0.20	59.00

REPORTS; STATEMENTS AND SCHEDULES **12.20** **8,256.00**

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
04/02/19	JKS	EMAIL TO B. WARNER RE: FEE ESTIMATE	0.10	76.50
04/05/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: US TRUSTEE QUARTERLY FEES	0.10	76.50
04/08/19	JKS	REVIEW MOTION FOR ORDER FURTHER EXTENDING DEBTORS' TIME TO FILE SCHEDULES AND STATEMENTS FOR FILING	0.40	306.00
04/08/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH J. WHITWORTH RE: FILING AND SERVICE OF MOTION FOR ORDER EXTENDING TIME TO FILE SCHEDULES AND STATEMENTS	0.20	153.00
04/08/19	JKS	REVIEW AND REVISE NOTICE OF EXTENSION MOTION FOR FILING	0.20	153.00
04/08/19	JCW	FILE SCHEDULES EXTENSION MOTION	0.60	123.00
04/08/19	JCW	REVIEW NOTICE RE: EXTENSION MOTION AND PREPARE FOR FILING	0.40	82.00
04/11/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM P. BURKS AND REVIEW AND ANALYZE DRAFT MARCH MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT	0.50	382.50
04/15/19	JKS	REVIEW AND ANALYZE EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: DRAFT MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT	0.20	153.00
04/15/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH B. WARNER RE: METHOD OF PAYMENT OF US TRUSTEE FEES AND EMAIL TO M. WEST RE: PAYMENT	0.20	153.00
04/15/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM A. O'NEILL AND B. WARNER RE: CALCULATION OF US TRUSTEE FEES	0.20	153.00
04/16/19	JKS	CONFERENCE WITH P. BURKS ET AL RE: DRAFT MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT	0.60	459.00
04/16/19	JKS	REVIEW AND ANALYZE DRAFT MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT	0.50	382.50
04/16/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM J. HECK RE: QUARTERLY FEES AND EMAIL TO B. WARNER RE: PAYMENT	0.10	76.50
04/16/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: UPDATED MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT	0.10	76.50
04/17/19	PVR	EFILE CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: MOTION EXTENDING TIME TO FILE SCHEDULES AND STATEMENTS	0.20	59.00
04/17/19	JKS	REVIEW AND EXECUTE CERTIFICATION RE: MOTION TO EXTEND TIME TO FILE STATEMENTS AND SCHEDULES	0.10	76.50
04/17/19	PVR	PREPARE CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: MOTION EXTENDING TIME TO FILE SCHEDULES AND STATEMENTS	0.10	29.50
04/18/19	JKS	REVIEW MARCH OPERATING REPORT FOR FILING	0.20	153.00

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice Number 840009
July 15, 2019
Page 17

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
04/18/19	PVR	EMAIL TO B. WARNER AND K. STICKLES RE: FILED MARCH MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT	0.10	29.50
04/18/19	PVR	EFILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF MARCH MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT	0.30	88.50
04/18/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: FILING MARCH MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT	0.10	29.50
04/22/19	JKS	REVIEW ORDER EXTENDING TIME TO FILE SCHEDULES OF ASSETS AND LIABILITIES AND STATEMENTS OF FINANCIAL AFFAIRS	0.10	76.50
04/22/19	PVR	RETRIEVE ORDER EXTENDING DEADLINE TO FILE SCHEDULES AND STATEMENTS AND EMAIL TO DRC FOR SERVICE	0.10	29.50
04/23/19	JKS	FOLLOW-UP EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH T. CHIRILLO RE: US TRUSTEE INVOICES AND PAYMENT OBLIGATIONS	0.20	153.00
04/24/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAILS FROM T. CHIRILLO AND B. WARNER RE: PAYMENT OF US TRUSTEE FEES	0.20	153.00
04/25/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL EXCHANGES FROM A. O'NEILL AND B. WARNER RE: US TRUSTEE FEES	0.20	153.00
05/03/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAILS FROM A. O'NEILL AND B. WARNER, INCLUDING REVIEW OF US TRUSTEE FEE STATEMENTS RE: QUARTERLY FEES	0.40	306.00
05/17/19	JKS	CONFERENCES WITH JUDGE CAREY'S CHAMBER RE: FILED PROPOSED CONFIRMATION ORDER	0.20	153.00
05/17/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM P. BURKS AND REVIEW AND ANALYZE DRAFT APRIL MOR	0.40	306.00
05/17/19	JKS	REVIEW AND ANALYZE M. THOMAS COMMENTS RE: APRIL MOR	0.10	76.50
05/17/19	JKS	REVIEW DOCKETED CONFIRMATION ORDER WITH EXHIBITS	0.10	76.50
05/17/19	JKS	FOLLOW-UP EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH A. STROMBERG RE: CERTIFICATION RE: PROPOSED CONFIRMATION ORDER	0.10	76.50
05/17/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: APRIL MOR	0.10	76.50
05/17/19	JKS	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT CERTIFICATION RE: SUBMISSION OF PROPOSED CONFIRMATION ORDER	0.20	153.00
05/17/19	JKS	CONFERENCE WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: SERVICE OF CONFIRMATION ORDER	0.10	76.50
05/17/19	JKS	CONFERENCE WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: ANTICIPATED SUBMISSION OF CONFIRMATION ORDER	0.10	76.50
05/17/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: MAY 20 FILING OF MOR	0.10	76.50
05/17/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH A. STROMBERG RE: PROPOSED CONFIRMATION ORDER	0.20	153.00
05/20/19	JKS	REVIEW AND REVISE NOTICE RE: EXHIBITS TO CONFIRMATION ORDER	0.10	76.50
05/20/19	JKS	EMAILS TO B. WARNER RE: DISTRICT COURT AFFIRMATION OF CONFIRMATION ORDER AND CERTIFICATION	0.20	153.00

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice Number 840009
July 15, 2019
Page 18

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
05/20/19	JKS	CONFERENCE WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: SERVICE OF CONFIRMATION ORDER	0.10	76.50
05/20/19	JKS	EMAIL TO P. RATKOWIAK RE: FILING OF APRIL MOR	0.10	76.50
05/20/19	JKS	REVIEW APRIL OPERATING REPORT FOR FILING AND EMAIL TO P. RATKOWIAK FOR FILING AND SERVICE	0.30	229.50
05/20/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH A. STROMBERG AND B. WARNER RE: SERVICE OF CONFIRMATION ORDER	0.20	153.00
05/20/19	JKS	DRAFT CERTIFICATION RE: PROPOSED ORDER TRANSMITTING RECORD	0.80	612.00
05/20/19	JKS	REVIEW PROPOSED TRANSMITTAL ORDER	0.10	76.50
05/20/19	JKS	REVIEW AND UPDATE PROPOSED RECORD FOR TRANSMITTAL, INCLUDING REVIEW OF DOCKET	0.40	306.00
05/20/19	JKS	REVIEW PLAN AND CONFIRMATION ORDER PROVISIONS RE: DISTRICT COURT AFFIRMANCE	0.50	382.50
05/20/19	JKS	REVIEW AND ANALYZE NOTICES RE: AFFIRMANCE PROCESS	0.30	229.50
05/20/19	PVR	EFILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF APRIL MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT	0.20	59.00
05/22/19	JKS	REVISE LETTER TO DISTRICT COURT RE: AFFIRMANCE OF DISTRICT COURT DECISION	0.20	153.00
05/22/19	JKS	CONFERENCE WITH B. WARNER RE: DISTRICT COURT AFFIRMANCE OF CONFIRMATION ORDER	0.30	229.50

RETENTION MATTERS**1.20 594.50**

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
05/09/19	NLP	REVIEW JUDGE SILVERSTEIN 5/8 BENCH RULING IN IMERY'S TALC AMERICA RE: STANDARD FOR FUTURES REP RETENTION	0.30	282.00
05/29/19	JKS	REVIEW PRO HAC MOTIONS FOR ATTORNEYS O'NEILL, WARNER AND STROMBERG AND EMAIL TO B. WARNER RE: SAME	0.10	76.50
05/31/19	PVR	EFILE PRO HAC MOTION FOR B. WARNER RE: USDC MATTER	0.20	59.00
05/31/19	PVR	EFILE PRO HAC MOTION FOR A. O'NEILL RE: USDC MATTER	0.20	59.00
05/31/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM AND TO K. STICKLES RE: FILING PRO HAC MOTIONS FOR A. O'NEILL, A. STROMBERG AND B. WARNER RE: USDC MATTER	0.10	29.50
05/31/19	PVR	EFILE PRO HAC MOTION FOR A. STROMBERG RE: USDC MATTER	0.20	59.00
05/31/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES RE: 3 FILED PRO HAC MOTIONS	0.10	29.50

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice Number 840009
July 15, 2019
Page 19

U.S. TRUSTEE MATTERS AND MEETINGS**0.80****612.00**

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
04/23/19	JKS	RESEARCH RE: US TRUSTEE FEE AND EMAIL TO B. WARNER ET AL.	0.30	229.50
04/23/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: US TRUSTEE FEES	0.10	76.50
05/06/19	JKS	CONFERENCE WITH B. WARNER RE: UST FEE STATEMENTS AND REVIEW SAME	0.20	153.00
05/20/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM AND CONFERENCE WITH B. WARNER RE: APRIL OPERATING REPORT	0.20	153.00
TOTAL HOURS			83.50	

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES:

\$47,392.50

TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY

<u>NAME</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER TITLE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>RATE</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
J. Kate Stickles	Member	44.20	765.00	33,813.00
John Whitworth	Paralegal	2.30	205.00	471.50
Norman L. Pernick	Member	3.40	940.00	3,196.00
Pauline Z. Ratkowiak	Paralegal	33.60	295.00	9,912.00
Total		83.50		\$47,392.50

MAREMONT CORPORATION
 ATTENTION: CARL D. ANDERSON, II
 2135 WEST MAPLE ROAD
 TROY, MI 48084

Invoice Date: July 10, 2019
 Invoice Number: 839395
 Matter Number: 58686-0001

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH JUNE 30, 2019

CASE ADMINISTRATION			4.70	1,856.50
<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
06/03/19	PVR	UPDATE CASE CALENDAR AND CRITICAL DATES CHART RE: JULY 22, 2019 FEE HEARING	0.20	59.00
06/04/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND REVISE CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL RE: OMNIBUS HEARING DATE ON JULY 22, 2019	0.20	59.00
06/04/19	PVR	UPDATE CASE CALENDAR AND CRITICAL DATES CHART RE: HEARING ON INTERIM FEE APPLICATIONS	0.10	29.50
06/04/19	JKS	REVIEW JUDGE ASSIGNMENT AND EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH A. O'NEILL RE: JUDGE ASSIGNMENT AND STATUS	0.20	153.00
06/04/19	PVR	EFILE CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL RE: OMNIBUS HEARING DATE, UPLOAD ORDER AND COORDINATE SUBMISSION OF PROPOSED ORDER TO CHAMBERS	0.30	88.50
06/05/19	JKS	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM B. WARNER A. O'NEILL RE: DISTRICT COURT CASE	0.20	153.00
06/07/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND B. WARNER RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES CHART	0.10	29.50
06/07/19	PVR	TELEPHONE FROM AND EMAIL TO K. STICKLES RE: 2002 SERVICE LIST AND RETRIEVE SAME	0.10	29.50
06/10/19	PVR	REVIEW DOCKET AND DRAFT CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: DONLIN RECANO FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION	0.10	29.50
06/10/19	PVR	REVIEW DOCKET AND DRAFT CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: SIDLEY AUSTIN APRIL FEE APPLICATION	0.10	29.50
06/10/19	PVR	REVIEW DOCKET AND DRAFT CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: COLE SCHOTZ FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION	0.10	29.50
06/10/19	PVR	REVIEW DOCKET AND DRAFT CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION RE: SIDLEY AUSTIN FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION	0.10	29.50
06/10/19	PVR	EFILE CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: SIDLEY AUSTIN APRIL FEE APPLICATION	0.20	59.00

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice Number 839395
July 10, 2019
Page 2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
06/10/19	PVR	UPDATE CHART OF PROFESSIONAL FEES	0.10	29.50
06/10/19	PVR	EMAIL TO AND CONFERENCE WITH K. STICKLES RE: EXTENSION FOR US TRUSTEE TO OBJECT TO INTERIM FEE APPLICATIONS	0.10	29.50
06/11/19	PVR	UPDATE CASE CALENDAR AND CRITICAL DATES CHART RE: EXTENDED OBJECTION DEADLINE FOR US TRUSTEE RE: FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATIONS FOR SIDLEY AUSTIN, DONLIN RECANO AND COLE SCHOTZ	0.10	29.50
06/11/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM B. WARNER AND TO US DISTRICT COURT RE: E- NOTICING REGISTRATION FORM FOR B. WARNER	0.10	29.50
06/11/19	PVR	TELEPHONE FROM K. STICKLES, EMAIL TO B. WARNER AND PREPARE E-NOTICING REGISTRATION FORMS FOR A. O'NEILL, A. STROMBERG AND B. WARNER RE: DISTRICT COURT MATTER	0.50	147.50
06/13/19	PVR	UPDATE CASE CALENDAR AND CRITICAL DATES CHART RE: OBJECTION DEADLINE FOR SIDLEY MAY FEE APPLICATION	0.10	29.50
06/13/19	PVR	UPDATE CHART OF PROFESSIONAL FEES	0.10	29.50
06/14/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND B. WARNER RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES CHART	0.10	29.50
06/25/19	PVR	RETRIEVE FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION FOR ANKURA CONSULTING GROUP AND UPDATE CHART OF PROFESSIONAL FEES	0.10	29.50
06/25/19	PVR	UPDATE CASE CALENDAR AND CRITICAL DATES CHART RE: OBJECTION DEADLINE RE: ANKURA CONSULTING GROUP MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	0.10	29.50
06/25/19	PVR	UPDATE CHART OF PROFESSIONAL FEES	0.10	29.50
06/26/19	PVR	RETRIEVE CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL RE: COMBINED FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION FOR FCR AND FOR YCST, UPDATE CHART OF PROFESSIONAL FEES AND UPDATE INDEX FOR FEE BINDER	0.20	59.00
06/27/19	PVR	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH C. CATHCART RE: SCHEDULING ANKURA CONSULTING GROUP INTERIM FEE APPLICATION FOR JULY 22, 2019 FEE HEARING	0.10	29.50
06/28/19	JKS	REVIEW UPDATED CASE CALENDAR	0.10	76.50
06/28/19	JKS	REVIEW DRC AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE AND EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: FILING OF AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE/CERTIFICATE OR SERVICE IN USDC AND USBC RE: AFFIRMANCE ORDER	0.20	153.00
06/28/19	JKS	CONFERENCE WITH B. WARNER RE: MODIFICATIONS TO TDP; OPERATING REPORTS AND PROJECTED EFFECTIVE DATE	0.30	229.50
06/28/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND B. WARNER RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES CHART	0.10	29.50
06/28/19	PVR	RETRIEVE ANKURA CONSULTING AMENDED INTERIM FEE APPLICATION AND UPDATE CASE CALENDAR AND CRITICAL DATES CHART RE: OBJECTION DEADLINE	0.20	59.00

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice Number 839395
July 10, 2019
Page 3

FEE APPLICATION MATTERS/OBJECTIONS			5.10	3,337.50
<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
06/04/19	JKS	REVIEW AND REVISE NOTICE OF FEE HEARING FOR FILING, INCLUDING CONFERENCE WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: NOTICE	0.20	153.00
06/05/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. SCHEPACARTER RE: FEE HEARING AND OBJECTION DEADLINE	0.10	76.50
06/06/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH CASE PROFESSIONALS RE: EXTENSION FOR US TRUSTEE TO OBJECT TO FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATIONS	0.20	153.00
06/10/19	JKS	REVIEW AND EXECUTE CERTIFICATION RE: SIDLEY APRIL FEE APPLICATION FOR FILING, INCLUDING CONFERENCE WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: CERTIFICATION	0.10	76.50
06/13/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM B. WARNER AND PREPARE NOTICE FOR SIDLEY MAY 2019 FEE APPLICATION	0.20	59.00
06/13/19	PVR	EFILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF SIDLEY MAY FEE APPLICATION	0.30	88.50
06/13/19	JKS	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: SIDLEY FOURTH FEE APPLICATION, INCLUDING REVIEW OF APPLICATION FOR FILING AND SERVICE	0.30	229.50
06/19/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAILS FROM B. WARNER AND M. FINK RE: PROFESSIONAL FEE RESERVE AND RESPND TO SAME	0.20	153.00
06/21/19	JKS	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM R. SCHEPACTER RE: STATUS OF PROFESSIONAL FEE REVIEW	0.10	76.50
06/25/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH R. SCHEPACARTER RE: YOUNG CONAWAY FEE APPLICATION	0.10	76.50
06/25/19	JKS	REVIEW AND EXECUTE CERTIFICATION RE: DRC FIRST INTERIM APPLICATION	0.10	76.50
06/25/19	PVR	EFILE CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: COLE SCHOTZ FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION	0.20	59.00
06/25/19	PVR	EFILE CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: SIDLEY AUSTIN FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION	0.20	59.00
06/25/19	PVR	EFILE CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: DONLIN RECANO FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION	0.20	59.00
06/25/19	PVR	REVIEW CERTIFICATIONS OF NO OBJECTION RE: COLE SCHOTZ, SIDLEY AUSTIN AND DONLIN RECANO FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATIONS	0.10	29.50
06/25/19	JKS	REVIEW AND EXECUTE CERTIFICATION RE: SIDLEY FIRST INTERIM APPLICATION	0.10	76.50
06/25/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH R. SCHEPACARTER RE: DEBTOR PROFESSIONALS' INTERIM FEE APPLICATIONS	0.10	76.50
06/25/19	JKS	REVIEW AND EXECUTE CERTIFICATION RE: COLE SCHOTZ FIRST INTERIM APPLICATION	0.10	76.50
06/27/19	JKS	REVIEW EXHIBIT TO COLE SCHOTZ APRIL FEE APPLICATIONS RE: CONFIDENTIALITY AND PRIVILEGE AND COMPLIANCE WITH LOCAL RULES	0.90	688.50

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice Number 839395
July 10, 2019
Page 4

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
06/27/19	JKS	REVIEW EXHIBIT TO COLE SCHOTZ MAY FEE APPLICATIONS RE: CONFIDENTIALITY AND PRIVILEGE AND COMPLIANCE WITH LOCAL RULES	1.10	841.50
06/28/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAILS FROM B. WARNER AND M. FINK RE: PROFESSIONAL FEE ESTIMATE	0.20	153.00

PREPARATION FOR AND ATTENDANCE AT HEARINGS **2.40** **708.00**

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
06/04/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND DRAFT NOTICE OF HEARING RE: INTERIM FEE APPLICATIONS	0.70	206.50
06/04/19	PVR	PREPARE INDEX OF FEE APPLICATIONS AND CERTIFICATIONS OF NO OBJECTION RE: HEARING ON FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION PERIOD	0.80	236.00
06/04/19	PVR	EFILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF NOTICE OF HEARING ON INTERIM FEE APPLICATIONS	0.30	88.50
06/25/19	PVR	UPDATE INDEX AND FEE BINDER RE: JULY 22, 2019 FEE HEARING	0.20	59.00
06/27/19	PVR	UPDATE INDEX AND FEE BINDER RE: JULY 22, 2019 FEE HEARING	0.40	118.00

REORGANIZATION PLAN **7.90** **5,232.50**

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
06/05/19	JKS	REVIEW FURTHER REVISED DRAFT MOTION TO AFFIRM	0.30	229.50
06/05/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH B. WARNER AND A. O'NEILL RE: DRAFT MOTION TO AFFIRM	0.20	153.00
06/07/19	PVR	EFILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF MOTION TO AFFIRM CONFIRMATION ORDER	0.40	118.00
06/07/19	JKS	FINALIZE AFFIRMANCE MOTION AND CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE FOR FILING, INCLUDING COMMUNICATIONS WITH B. WARNER RE: MOTION AND SERVICE	1.10	841.50
06/19/19	JKS	CONFERENCE WITH B. WARNER RE: STATUS OF MOTION FOR DISTRICT COURT AFFIRMANCE OF CONFIRMATION ORDER AND PROCESS	0.30	229.50
06/20/19	JKS	REVIEW DISTRICT COURT DOCKET AND FEDERAL RULES AND DRAFT LETTER TO DISTRICT COURT JUDGE RE: DISPOSITION OF AFFIRMANCE MOTION	0.70	535.50
06/20/19	JKS	EMAIL TO B. WARNER RE: PROPOSED LETTER TO DISTRICT COURT RE: STATUS OF AFFIRMANCE MOTION	0.10	76.50
06/21/19	JKS	REVIEW PLAN RE: IMPLEMENTATION STEP PLAN AND RESEARCH FORM OF NOTICE	0.70	535.50
06/21/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: IMPLEMENTATION STEP PLAN	0.10	76.50
06/21/19	JKS	PREPARE DRAFT NOTICE OF FILING RE: IMPLEMENTATION STEP PLAN	0.40	306.00

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice Number 839395
July 10, 2019
Page 5

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
06/21/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE AND CONFERENCE WITH K. LABRADA RE: FILING OF NOTICE OF FILING IMPLEMENTATION STEP PLAN	0.20	153.00
06/21/19	KLL	EFILE NOTICE OF FILING IMPLEMENTATION STEP PLAN	0.30	76.50
06/21/19	JKS	COMMUNICATIONS WITH DRC RE: SERVICE OF NOTICE OF FILING OF IMPLEMENTATION STEP PLAN	0.10	76.50
06/21/19	JKS	EMAILS TO AND CONFERENCE WITH B. WARNER RE: DRAFT NOTICE OF FILING IMPLEMENTATION STEP PLAN	0.20	153.00
06/25/19	JKS	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: PENDING AFFIRMANCE MOTION	0.10	76.50
06/26/19	JKS	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM A. O'NEILL RE: LETTER TO DISTRICT COURT RE: AFFIRMANCE OF CONFIRMATION ORDER	0.20	153.00
06/26/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: FILING OF LETTER WITH DISTRICT COURT RE: DISPOSITION OF AFFIRMANCE MOTION	0.20	153.00
06/26/19	JKS	REVIEW AND REVISE LETTER TO JUDGE CONNOLLY RE: AFFIRMANCE OF CONFIRMANCE ORDER	0.40	306.00
06/26/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH B. WARNER RE: DRAFT LETTER TO DISTRICT COURT RE: AFFIRMANCE OF CONFIRMATION ORDER	0.20	153.00
06/26/19	JKS	FINALIZE AND EXECUTE LETTER TO DISTRICT COURT RE: AFFIRMANCE OF CONFIRMATION ORDER, INCLUDING INCLUSION OF MOTION AND PROPOSED ORDER	0.30	229.50
06/26/19	PVR	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH K. STICKLES AND R. DEELY AND EFILE AND SERVE LETTER TO JUDGE CONNOLLY RE: AFFIRMANCE MOTION	0.40	118.00
06/27/19	PVR	EMAIL TO DONLIN RECANO RE: SERVICE OF USDC ORDER AFFIRMING CONFIRMATION ORDER AND RESEARCH RE: SERVICE PARTIES	0.10	29.50
06/27/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH B. WARNER AND A. O'NEILL RE: ORDER AFFIRMING THE BANKRUPTCY COURT'S FINDINGS OF FACT, CONCLUSIONS OF LAW, AND ORDER CONFIRMING THE MODIFIED JOINT PREPACKAGED PLAN OF REORGANIZATION OF MAREMONT CORPORATION AND ITS DEBTOR AFFILIATES	0.20	153.00
06/27/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: SERVICE OF AFFIRMANCE ORDER	0.10	76.50
06/28/19	JKS	REVEIW NOTICE OFF CHANGE IN APPOINTMENT OF MEMBERS TO TRUST ADVISORY COMMITTEE	0.10	76.50
06/28/19	PVR	EFILE CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE RE: DONLIN RECANO SERVICE OF USDC ORDER AFFIRMING CONFIRMATION ORDER, EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND RETRIEVE SAME	0.20	59.00
06/28/19	PVR	EMAIL FROM DONLIN RECANO AND TO K. STICKLES RE: FILING AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE RE: SERVICE OF USDC ORDER AFFIRMING CONFIRMATION ORDER	0.10	29.50

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice Number 839395
July 10, 2019
Page 6

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
06/28/19	PVR	Email FROM AND TO K. STICKLES AND DRAFT CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE RE: DONLIN RECANO SERVICE OF USDC ORDER AFFIRMING CONFIRMATION ORDER AND EMAIL TO DONLIN RECANO RE: FILING AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE IN BANKRUPTCY CASE	0.20	59.00

REPORTS; STATEMENTS AND SCHEDULES **1.10** **653.50**

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
06/17/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM P. BURKE AND MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT	0.30	229.50
06/17/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT	0.10	76.50
06/20/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES RE: FILED MAY MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT	0.10	29.50
06/20/19	PVR	EFILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE OF MAY MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT, INCLUDING EMAIL FROM K. STICKIES RE: FILING	0.30	88.50
06/20/19	JKS	REVIEW MAY MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT FOR FILING	0.30	229.50

RETENTION MATTERS **0.10** **29.50**

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
06/06/19	PVR	EMAIL TO A. O'NEILL, S. STROMBERG AND B. WARNER RE: APPROVAL OF PRO HAC MOTIONS IN DISTRICT COURT MATTER	0.10	29.50

TOTAL HOURS 21.30

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES: \$11,817.50

TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY

<u>NAME</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER TITLE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>RATE</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
J. Kate Stickles	Member	11.80	765.00	9,027.00
Kerri L. LaBrada	Paralegal	0.30	255.00	76.50
Pauline Z. Ratkowiak	Paralegal	9.20	295.00	2,714.00
Total		21.30		\$11,817.50

MAREMONT CORPORATION
 ATTENTION: CARL D. ANDERSON, II
 2135 WEST MAPLE ROAD
 TROY, MI 48084

Invoice Date: July 19, 2019
 Invoice Number: 840204
 Matter Number: 58686-0001

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH JULY 9, 2019

CASE ADMINISTRATION **4.60** **3,682.00**

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
07/03/19	PVR	RETRIEVE ORDER APPROVING ROBINSON & COLE FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION AND UPDATE CHART OF PROFESSIONAL FEES	0.10	29.50
07/03/19	JKS	CONFERENCE WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: ANTICIPATED EFFECTIVE DATE AND CASE CLOSURE PREPARATIONS	0.20	153.00
07/03/19	JKS	REVIEW CASE CALENDAR RE: SCHEDULED FEE HEARING	0.10	76.50
07/08/19	JKS	FOLLOW-UP CONFERENCE WITH B. WARNER RE: POST-EFFECTIVE DATE TASKS AND CASE CLOSURE	0.30	229.50
07/08/19	JKS	REVIEW CASE CALENDAR RE: CASE MANAGEMENT	0.10	76.50
07/08/19	NLP	CONFERENCE WITH K. STICKLES RE: POST-EFFECTIVE DATE TASKS AND BUDGET	0.20	188.00
07/08/19	NLP	REVIEW K. STICKLES 7/8 EMAIL RE: POST-EFFECTIVE DATE TASKS AND BUDGET	1.00	940.00
07/08/19	JKS	CONFERENCE AND EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH B. WARNER RE: PROFESSIONAL FEE RESERVE AND BUDGET FOR POST-EFFECTIVE DATE TASKS	0.90	688.50
07/08/19	JKS	REVIEW PLAN AND MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH B. WARNER RE: POST-CONFIRMATION TASKS AND CASE WIND-DOWN/CLOSURE	1.30	994.50
07/09/19	JKS	CONFERENCE WITH A. O'NEILL RE: ANTICIPATED EFFECTIVE DATE AND POST-CONFIRMATION TASKS FOR CASE CLOSURE	0.40	306.00

FEE APPLICATION MATTERS/OBJECTIONS **3.20** **1,790.00**

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
07/03/19	JKS	REVIEW DOCKET RE: STATUS OF FEE APPLICATIONS AND CONFERENCE WITH P. RATKOWIAK RE: FEE APPLICATIONS AND PREPARATIONS FOR SCHEDULED FEE HEARING	0.30	229.50
07/03/19	JKS	REVIEW EXHIBIT TO JUNE FEE APPLICATION RE: PRIVILEGE, CONFIDENTIALITY AND COMPLIANCE WITH RULES	0.70	535.50
07/07/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: PROFESSIONAL FEE ESTIMATE	0.10	76.50

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice Number 840204
July 19, 2019
Page 2

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
07/08/19	PVR	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH K. STICKLES AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: PROFESSIONAL FEE RESERVE AMOUNT	0.60	177.00
07/08/19	PVR	EMAIL TO B. WARNER RE: FILED CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: SIDLEY AUSTIN MAY FEE APPLICATION AND UPDATE CHART OF PROFESSIONAL FEES	0.10	29.50
07/08/19	PVR	EFILE CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: SIDLEY AUSTIN MAY FEE APPLICATION	0.20	59.00
07/08/19	JKS	REVIEW AND FINALIZE EXHIBIT FOR COLE SCHOTZ FEE APPLICATION	0.40	306.00
07/08/19	PVR	EMAIL TO K. STICKLES AND PREPARE CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: SIDLEY AUSTIN MAY FEE APPLICATION	0.10	29.50
07/08/19	PVR	RETRIEVE FILED CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION RE: ROBINSON & COLE MAY FEE APPLICATION AND UPDATE CHART OF PROFESSIONAL FEES	0.10	29.50
07/08/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH P. RATKOWIAK AND REVIEW AND EXECUTE CERTIFICATION RE: SIDLEY'S MAY FEE APPLICATION	0.10	76.50
07/09/19	JKS	EMAIL TO R. SCHEPACARTER RE: FINAL FEE APPLICATIONS	0.10	76.50
07/09/19	JKS	EMAIL TO CASE PROFESSIONALS RE: DEADLINE TO FILE FINAL FEE APPLICATIONS AND SCHEDULING OF FINAL FEE HEARING	0.10	76.50
07/09/19	PVR	DRAFT CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL AND PROPOSED ORDER RE: FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION PERIOD	0.30	88.50

PREPARATION FOR AND ATTENDANCE AT HEARINGS **0.70** **206.50**

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
07/03/19	PVR	UPDATE INDEX, COURT'S FEE BINDER AND OMNIBUS FEE ORDER FOR JULY 22, 2019 FEE HEARING	0.70	206.50

REORGANIZATION PLAN **5.80** **4,061.00**

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
07/03/19	JKS	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO L. JOHNSON EMAIL RE: DOCKETING OF DISTRICT COURT AFFIRMANCE ORDER	0.20	153.00
07/03/19	JKS	REVIEW DOCKETED USDC AFFIRMANCE ORDER AND TRANSMIT TO B. WARNER	0.10	76.50
07/03/19	JKS	TELEPHONE TO L. JOHNSON RE: DOCKETING OF DISTRICT COURT AFFIRMANCE ORDER IN THE BANKRUPTCY COURT, AND FOLLOW-UP EMAIL TO B. WARNER RE: REQUEST	0.20	153.00
07/08/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: POST-EFFECTIVE DATE SERVICES	0.10	76.50
07/09/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH R. SCHEPACARTER RE: SECOND INTERIM AND FINAL FEE PERIOD	0.20	153.00
07/09/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH B. WARNER RE: EFFECTIVE DATE TASKS	0.20	153.00

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001Invoice Number 840204
July 19, 2019
Page 3

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
07/09/19	JKS	EMAIL TO B. WARNER RE: PROPOSED DRAFT NOTICE OF EFFECTIVE DATE	0.10	76.50
07/09/19	JKS	REVIEW CONFIRMATION ORDER RE: BAR DATES AND DEADLINES AND PREPARE REVISED NOTICE OF EFFECTIVE DATE	1.60	1,224.00
07/09/19	JKS	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO MAIL FROM A. O'NEILL RE: LETTER AGREEMENT AND POST-EFFECTIVE DATE FEES	0.30	229.50
07/09/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH B. WARNER RE: STATUS OF EFFECTIVE DATE AND FILING OF NOTICE	0.20	153.00
07/09/19	JKS	EMAILS WITH F. PISANO AND DRC RE: ANTICIPATED SERVICE OF NOTICE OF EFFECTIVE DATE	0.10	76.50
07/09/19	JKS	CONFERENCE AND EMAILS WITH F. PISANO RE: FILING OF NOTICE OF EFFECTIVE DATE	0.20	153.00
07/09/19	JKS	FINALIZE NOTICE OF EFFECTIVE DATE FOR FILING, INCLUDING MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH B. WARNER AND INCORPORATING B. WARNER AND A. O'NEILL COMMENTS	1.40	1,071.00
07/09/19	JKS	EMAIL TO DRC RE: SERVICE OF NOTICE OF EFFECTIVE DATE	0.10	76.50
07/09/19	PVR	CONFERENCE WITH K. STICKLES AND PROOF READ DRAFT NOTICE OF EFFECTIVE DATE	0.30	88.50
07/09/19	FP	CONFORM AND EFILE NOTICE FOR ENTRY OF ORDER APPROVING ADEQUACY OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT/NOTICE OF EFFECTIVE DATE; DOWNLOAD FILED COPY AND CIRCULATE TO ATTORNEYS	0.50	147.50

REPORTS; STATEMENTS AND SCHEDULES **0.70** **535.50**

<u>DATE</u>	<u>INITIALS</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
07/01/19	JKS	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. WARNER RE: REPORTING REQUIREMENTS AND RESEARCH SAME	0.30	229.50
07/03/19	JKS	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH B. WARNER RE: REPORTING REQUIREMENTS	0.20	153.00
07/03/19	JKS	REVIEW US TRUSTEE REPORTING GUIDELINES	0.20	153.00

TOTAL HOURS 15.00

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES: \$10,275.00

TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY

<u>NAME</u>	<u>TIMEKEEPER TITLE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>RATE</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
Frances Pisano	Paralegal	0.50	295.00	147.50
J. Kate Stickles	Member	10.80	765.00	8,262.00
Norman L. Pernick	Member	1.20	940.00	1,128.00
Pauline Z. Ratkowiak	Paralegal	2.50	295.00	737.50
Total		15.00		\$10,275.00

EXHIBIT B

Expense Summary for Monthly Period

**EXPENSE SUMMARY FOR COMBINED MONTHLY PERIOD
APRIL 1, 2019 THROUGH JULY 9, 2019**

Expense Category	Service Provider (if applicable)	Total Expenses
Telephonic Appearances	CourtCall	\$180.00
Overtime	Secretarial	\$102.66
Court Fees	PACER Service Center	\$50.20
Transcripts	Reliable	\$1,297.95
Outside Printing	Parcels, Inc.	\$2,110.01
Messenger Service	Parcels, Inc.	\$210.50
Working Meals	Purebread	\$73.90
TOTAL		\$4,025.22

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice Number 840009
July 15, 2019
Page 20

COST DETAIL

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>QUANTITY</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
03/07/19	DEPOSITIONS TRANSCRIPT - RELIABLE WILMINGTON	1.00	101.85
03/11/19	COURT FEES	18.00	1.80
03/12/19	COURT FEES	29.00	2.90
03/12/19	COURT FEES	30.00	3.00
03/12/19	COURT FEES	30.00	3.00
03/12/19	COURT FEES	111.00	11.10
03/12/19	COURT FEES	30.00	3.00
03/12/19	COURT FEES	58.00	5.80
03/12/19	COURT FEES	30.00	3.00
03/12/19	COURT FEES	110.00	11.00
03/15/19	DEPOSITIONS TRANSCRIPT - RELIABLE WILMINGTON	1.00	761.25
03/15/19	COURT FEES	4.00	0.40
03/15/19	COURT FEES	13.00	1.30
03/15/19	COURT FEES	4.00	0.40
03/20/19	OUTSIDE PRINTING- PARCELS, INC	1.00	559.44
03/20/19	DEPOSITIONS TRANSCRIPT - RELIABLE WILMINGTON	1.00	413.25
03/21/19	OUTSIDE PRINTING- PARCELS, INC	1.00	1,343.30
03/22/19	COURT FEES	4.00	0.40
03/22/19	COURT FEES	30.00	3.00
04/18/19	OUTSIDE PRINTING - PARCELS, INC	1.00	207.27
04/19/19	DELIVERY SERVICES/COURIERS - PARCELS, INC	1.00	27.50
04/23/19	COURTCALL - CONFERENCE CALL ON APRIL 23, 2019 WITH JUDGE CAREY AND K. STICKLES, A. O'NEILL AND B. EILANDER	1.00	90.00
05/08/19	WORKING MEAL - PUREBREAD - WORKING DINNER FOR K. STICKLES AND K. DEVANNEY	1.00	40.00
05/13/19	DELIVERY SERVICES/COURIERS	1.00	22.50
05/13/19	DELIVERY SERVICES/COURIERS	1.00	22.50
05/14/19	DELIVERY SERVICES/COURIERS	1.00	22.50
05/14/19	WORKING MEAL - PUREBREAD - WORKING LUNCH FOR K. STICKLES AND A. STROMBERG BEFORE HEARING	1.00	15.95
05/14/19	DELIVERY SERVICES/COURIERS	1.00	22.50
05/14/19	DELIVERY SERVICES/COURIERS	1.00	22.50
05/14/19	OVERTIME	1.55	102.66
05/14/19	COURTCALL - CONFERENCE CALL ON MAY 14, 2019 WITH JUDGE CAREY AND B. WARNER, B. EILANDER AND N. PERNICK	1.00	90.00
05/16/19	WORKING MEAL - PUREBREAD - WORKING LUNCH FOR K. STICKLES	1.00	17.95
05/17/19	DELIVERY SERVICES/COURIERS- PARCELS, INC	1.00	7.50
05/28/19	DELIVERY SERVICES/COURIERS- PARCELS, INC	1.00	18.00
05/30/19	COURT FEES	1.00	0.10

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice Number 840009
July 15, 2019
Page 21

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>QUANTITY</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
05/31/19	DELIVERY SERVICES/COURIERS- PARCELS, INC	1.00	22.50
Total			\$3,981.12

TOTAL SERVICES AND COSTS:	\$ 51,373.62
PREVIOUS BALANCE DUE:	\$ <u>47,091.30</u>
TOTAL DUE THIS INVOICE:	\$ <u>98,464.92</u>

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice Number 839395
July 10, 2019
Page 7

COST DETAIL

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>QUANTITY</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
05/24/19	DEPOSITIONS TRANSCRIPT - RELIABLE WILMINGTON	1.00	21.60
06/04/19	DELIVERY SERVICES/COURIERS - PARCELS, INC	1.00	7.50
06/10/19	DELIVERY SERVICES/COURIERS - PARCELS, INC	1.00	7.50
Total			\$36.60

TOTAL SERVICES AND COSTS:	\$ 11,854.10
PREVIOUS BALANCE DUE:	\$ <u>86,700.82</u>
TOTAL DUE THIS INVOICE:	\$ <u>98,554.92</u>

COLE SCHOTZ P.C.

Re: MAREMONT / CHAPTER 11
Client/Matter No. 58686-0001

Invoice Number 840204
July 19, 2019
Page 4

COST DETAIL

<u>DATE</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>QUANTITY</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
06/26/19	DELIVERY SERVICES/COURIERS – PARCELS, INC.	1.00	7.50
		Total	\$7.50

TOTAL SERVICES AND COSTS:	\$	10,282.50
PREVIOUS BALANCE DUE:	\$	<u>98,464.92</u>
TOTAL DUE THIS INVOICE:	\$	<u>108,747.42</u>