

EXHIBIT A

YOUNG CONAWAY STARGATT & TAYLOR, LLP

RODNEY SQUARE
1000 NORTH KING STREET
WILMINGTON, DELAWARE 19801

P.O. BOX 391
WILMINGTON, DELAWARE 19899-0391

(302) 571-6600
(800) 253-2234 (DE ONLY)

TAX I.D. NO. 51-0082644

(302) 571-1253 FAX
www.ycst.com

Writer's Direct Dial
(302) 571-6703

Writer's E-Mail
eharron@ycst.com

James L. Patton, Jr. as Future Claimants' Representative

Invoice Date: August 5, 2019
Invoice Number: 50007462
Matter Number: 076815.1001

Re: Maremont Corporation
For the period ending July 9, 2019

CURRENT INVOICE

Professional Services	\$	8,355.00
Disbursements	\$	<u>916.67</u>
Total Due This Invoice	\$	9,271.67

Remaining Trust Amount	\$	0.00
------------------------	----	------

Patton, James L., Jr., Future Claimants' Representative

Invoice Date:

August 5, 2019

Invoice Number:

50007462

Matter Number:

076815.1001

Time Detail

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
06/04/19	CCATH	Download and circulate new pleadings	B001	0.20	57.00
06/14/19	CCATH	Download and circulate new pleadings	B001	0.20	57.00
06/20/19	CCATH	Download and circulate new pleadings	B001	0.10	28.50
06/20/19	LEDEN	Update critical dates	B001	0.10	28.50
06/21/19	CCATH	Download and circulate new pleadings	B001	0.10	28.50
06/24/19	CCATH	Download and circulate new pleadings	B001	0.20	57.00
06/26/19	CCATH	Download and circulate new pleadings	B001	0.10	28.50
06/26/19	LEDEN	Review incoming pleadings from Court docket	B001	0.10	28.50
06/27/19	CCATH	Download and circulate new pleadings	B001	0.10	28.50
07/01/19	CCATH	Download and circulate new pleadings	B001	0.10	28.50
07/02/19	LEDEN	Review incoming pleadings and correspondence	B001	0.10	28.50
07/02/19	PPUSZ	Organize filed Certificate of Trust - Maremont Asbestos Personal Injury Trust	B001	0.20	42.00
07/02/19	PPUSZ	E-mail to S. Kohut re: filed Certificate of Trust - Maremont Asbestos Personal Injury Trust	B001	0.10	21.00
07/02/19	PPUSZ	Telephone to S. Kohut re: filing of Certificate of Trust of Maremont Asbestos Personal Injury Trust	B001	0.10	21.00
07/02/19	PPUSZ	File Certificate of Trust of Maremont Asbestos Personal Injury Trust w/Delaware Secretary of State	B001	0.30	63.00
07/03/19	CCATH	Download and circulate new pleadings	B001	0.10	28.50
07/03/19	LEDEN	Review incoming pleadings and correspondence; update electronic files re: same	B001	0.10	28.50
07/09/19	CCATH	Download and circulate new pleadings	B001	0.10	28.50
07/09/19	LEDEN	Review incoming pleadings and Court docket	B001	0.10	28.50

Patton, James L., Jr., Future Claimants' Representative

Invoice Date:

August 5, 2019

Invoice Number:

50007462

Matter Number:

076815.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
06/05/19	SKOHU	Analyze proposed motion for District Court confirmation	B012	0.20	120.00
06/05/19	SKOHU	Telephone call with E. Harron, A. Ducayet and J. Brumbaugh re: preparation for closing and trust start-up	B012	0.40	240.00
06/21/19	EHARR	Review trustee's proposed amendments to trust agreement (.3) and meet with S. Kohut re: same (.2)	B012	0.50	452.50
06/21/19	RBRAD	Review filing of Implementation Step Plan	B012	0.20	195.00
06/21/19	SKOHU	Correspondence with A. Ducayet re: trust start-up	B012	0.20	120.00
06/25/19	LEDEN	Review and compare trust agreement drafts; email same to S. Kohut	B012	0.30	85.50
06/25/19	SKOHU	Analyze proposed revisions to trust documents for trust start-up	B012	0.30	180.00
06/26/19	EHARR	Evaluate trust start-up issues (.2); emails with A. Ducayet and S. Kohut re: same (.3)	B012	0.50	452.50
06/26/19	SKOHU	Correspondence with V. Thomas re trust start-up process	B012	0.40	240.00
06/26/19	SKOHU	Analyze proposed revisions to trust agreement	B012	0.20	120.00
06/26/19	SKOHU	Telephone call with A. Ducayet re trust start-up	B012	0.30	180.00
06/27/19	RBRAD	Review District Court order affirming confirmation order and email re: timing of effective date	B012	0.10	97.50
06/28/19	SKOHU	Correspondence with A. Ducayet, E. Harron and J. Patton re: trust start-up	B012	0.30	180.00
07/01/19	SKOHU	Correspondence to A. Ducayet re: DE SOS filing fees for certificate of trust	B012	0.10	60.00
07/01/19	SKOHU	Correspondence with A. Ducayet and J. Patton re: finalizing trust agreement	B012	0.50	300.00
07/02/19	EHARR	Emails re: trust start-up	B012	0.30	271.50
07/02/19	SKOHU	Correspondence with A. Ducayet and J. Patton re: finalizing trust agreement; coordinate filing of certificate of trust	B012	0.50	300.00
07/08/19	EHARR	Call with S. Esserman re: trust-start-up (.2); emails re: same (.1)	B012	0.30	271.50
06/13/19	LEDEN	Finalize, file and serve certificate of no objection re: FCR/YCST's April fee statement	B017	0.20	57.00

Patton, James L., Jr., Future Claimants' Representative

Invoice Date:

August 5, 2019

Invoice Number:

50007462

Matter Number:

076815.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
06/13/19	LEDEN	Draft certificate of no objection re: FCR/YCST's April 2019 fee statement	B017	0.10	28.50
06/18/19	BFELD	Research re: requirements of "large case fee guidelines" for Ankura fee application (.6); call with S. Kohut re: same (.1)	B017	0.70	238.00
06/18/19	CCATH	Research re: potential disclosures to be made by YCST	B017	0.10	28.50
06/18/19	LEDEN	Update Ankura's first monthly fee statement; email same to S. Kohut	B017	0.40	114.00
06/18/19	LEDEN	Review incoming correspondence re: May 2019 fee statements	B017	0.10	28.50
06/18/19	LEDEN	Confer with S. Kohut re: Ankura's first monthly fee statement	B017	0.20	57.00
06/18/19	SKOHU	Analyze for privilege Ankura first monthly fee statement; review and revise certification for same	B017	0.90	540.00
06/19/19	CCATH	Draft YCST's second supplemental disclosure declaration	B017	0.20	57.00
06/19/19	LEDEN	Update and revise Ankura's first monthly fee statement	B017	0.30	85.50
06/20/19	CCATH	Finalize YCST's second supplemental disclosure declaration and prepare for filing and service	B017	0.20	57.00
06/20/19	LEDEN	Follow-up with E. Harron and S. Kohut re: Ankura's first monthly fee statement	B017	0.10	28.50
06/21/19	CCATH	File and coordinate service of YCST's second supplemental disclosure declaration	B017	0.20	57.00
06/24/19	CCATH	Finalize, file, and coordinate service of Ankura's first monthly fee application	B017	0.80	228.00
06/27/19	CCATH	Confer with P. Ratkowiak (Cole Schotz) and L. Eden re: fee applications	B017	0.70	199.50
06/27/19	LEDEN	Prepare amended fee statement of Ankura for March 2019	B017	0.70	199.50
06/27/19	LEDEN	Prepare Ankura's first quarterly fee statement	B017	0.50	142.50
06/27/19	LEDEN	Confer with C. Cathcart and P. Ratkowiak of Cole Schotz re: hearing on first quarterly fee statements	B017	0.30	85.50
06/27/19	LEDEN	Email to and from A. Brockman re: Ankura's amended March 2019 fee statement and first quarterly fee statement for the period January-March 2019	B017	0.10	28.50
06/27/19	SKOHU	Correspondence with V. Thomas re trust start-up process	B017	1.00	600.00

Patton, James L., Jr., Future Claimants' Representative

Invoice Date:

August 5, 2019

Invoice Number:

50007462

Matter Number:

076815.1001

<u>Date</u>	<u>Initials</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Task</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
07/02/19	LEDEN	Confer with J. Forbes re: YCST's voluntary reduction in fees for first quarterly period	B017	0.10	28.50
06/13/19	LEDEN	Draft May 2019 fee statement of FCR/YCST	B018	1.20	342.00
06/14/19	CCATH	Finalize, file, and serve FCR/YCST fourth monthly fee application	B018	0.70	199.50
06/25/19	CCATH	Draft certification of counsel and proposed order re: FCR/YCST first quarterly fee application	B018	0.90	256.50
06/26/19	CCATH	Edit and file certification of counsel re: FCR/YCST first quarterly fee application	B018	0.20	57.00
07/09/19	LEDEN	Update and revise certificate of no objection re: May 2019 fee statement of FCR/YCST	B018	0.10	28.50
07/09/19	LEDEN	Finalize and file certificate of no objection regarding May 2019 fee statement of YCST and FCR	B018	0.20	57.00
Total				19.30	\$8,355.00

Patton, James L., Jr., Future Claimants' Representative

Invoice Date:

August 5, 2019

Invoice Number:

50007462

Matter Number:

076815.1001

Timekeeper Summary

<u>Initials</u>	<u>Name</u>	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
BFELD	Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	0.70	340.00	238.00
CCATH	Casey Cathcart	Paralegal	5.30	285.00	1,510.50
EHARR	Edwin J. Harron	Partner	1.60	905.00	1,448.00
LEDEN	Lisa M. Eden	Paralegal	5.40	285.00	1,539.00
PPUSZ	Paul Puskarczyk	Paralegal	0.70	210.00	147.00
RBRAD	Robert S. Brady	Partner	0.30	975.00	292.50
SKOHU	Sara Beth A.R. Kohut	Counsel	5.30	600.00	3,180.00
Total			19.30		\$8,355.00

Patton, James L., Jr., Future Claimants' Representative

Invoice Date:

August 5, 2019

Invoice Number:

50007462

Matter Number:

076815.1001

Task Summary**Task Code:B001****Case Administration**

<u>Name</u>	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Casey Cathcart	Paralegal	1.30	285.00	370.50
Lisa M. Eden	Paralegal	0.50	285.00	142.50
Paul Puskarczyk	Paralegal	0.70	210.00	147.00
Total		2.50		660.00

Task Code:B012**Plan and Disclosure Statement**

<u>Name</u>	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Edwin J. Harron	Partner	1.60	905.00	1,448.00
Robert S. Brady	Partner	0.30	975.00	292.50
Sara Beth A.R. Kohut	Counsel	3.40	600.00	2,040.00
Lisa M. Eden	Paralegal	0.30	285.00	85.50
Total		5.60		3,866.00

Task Code:B017**Retention of Professionals/Fee Issues**

<u>Name</u>	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Sara Beth A.R. Kohut	Counsel	1.90	600.00	1,140.00
Betsy L. Feldman	Associate	0.70	340.00	238.00
Casey Cathcart	Paralegal	2.20	285.00	627.00
Lisa M. Eden	Paralegal	3.10	285.00	883.50
Total		7.90		2,888.50

Task Code:B018**Fee Application Preparation**

<u>Name</u>	<u>Timekeeper Title</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Casey Cathcart	Paralegal	1.80	285.00	513.00
Lisa M. Eden	Paralegal	1.50	285.00	427.50
Total		3.30		940.50