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Pachulski Stang Ziehl &Jones LLP
919 North Market Street

17th Floor
Wilmington, DE 19801

November 30, 2018

Open Road Creditors' Committee Invoice 120853
Client 64202
Matter 00002

RJF
RE: Committee Representation

STATEMENT OF PROFESSIONAL SE~2VICES RENDERED THROUGH 11/30/2018

FEES $103,004.00

EXPENSES $2,562.69

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES $105,566.69

BALANCE FORWARD $307,611.56

LAST PAYMENT $91,535.61.

TOTAL BALANCE DUE $321,642.64
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Pachulski Stang Ziehl &Jones LLP Page: 2

Open Road Films p.C.C. Invoice 120853

64202 00002 November 30, 2018

Summai-v of Services by Task Code

Task Code Desc~tion Hours Amount

AC Avoidance Actions 28.50 $19,624.50

AD Asset Disposition [B130] 45.80 $38,780.00

BL Bankruptcy Litigation [L430] 0.20 $159.00

CA Case Administration [B110] 19.20 $7,406.00

CO Claims Admin/Objections[B310J x•80 $636.00

CPO Comp. of Prof./Others 2•~~ $1,473.50

EC Executory Contracts [B185] ~•~~ $684.50

FN Financing [B230] 6 20 $5,305.00

HE Hearing 10.90 $7,849.50

II Insurance Issues 5.20 $4,732.00

MC Meeting of Creditors [B150] 10.90 $9,359.50

NT Non-Working Travel 4.00 $2,190.00

PC PSZ&J Compensation 8.90 $3,775.50

SL Stay Litigation [B140] 1.40 $1,029.00

145.40 $103,004.00

Summary of Services by Professional

ID Name Title Rate Hours Amount

AWC Caine, Andrew W. Partner 995.00 0.30 $298.50

BMK Koveleski, Beatrice M. Case Man. Asst. 295.00 3.50 $1,032.50

CJB Bouzoukis, Charles J. Case Man. Asst. 295.00 3.20 $944.00

CRR Robinson, Colin R. Counsel 750.00 2•g~ $2,100.00

DG Grass~reen, Debra I. Partner 995.00 3.30 $3,283.50

IAWN Nasatir, Iain A. W. Partner 925.00 4.60 $4,255.00

JAM Morris, John A. Partner 975.00 1.40 $1,365.00

JHR Rosell, Jason H. Associate 595.00 18.80 $11,186.00

JWD Dulberg, Jeffrey W. Partner 795.00 18.30 $14,548.50

JWL Lucas, John W. Partner 725.00 1.50 $1,087.50

KSN Neil, Karen S. Case Man. Asst. 295.00 5.30 $1,563.50

LAF Forrester, Leslie A. Other 395.00 1.60 $632.00

LSC Canty, La Asia S. Paralegal 375.00 11.20 $4,200.00

MBL Litvak, Maxim B. Partner 875.00 30.70 $26,862.50
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Pachulski Stang Ziehl &Jones LLP Page: 3

Open Road Films O.C.C. Invoice 120853

64202 00002 November 30, 2018

PEC Cuniff, Patricia E. Paralegal 375.00 7.50 $2,812.50

PJJ Jeffries, Patricia J. Paralegal 375.00 6.00 $2,250.00

RJF Feinstein, RoUert 7. Partner 547.50 4.00 $2,190.00

RJF Feinstein, Robert J. Partner 1095.00 18.00 $19,710.00

SLH Hazan, Scott L. Partner 1095.00 2.10 $2,299.50

SLP Pitman, L. Sheryle Case Man. Asst. 295.00 1.30 $383.50

145.40 $103,004.00

Summary of Expenses

Description Amount

Auto Travel Expense [E109] $8.76

Bloomberg $20.00

Conference Call [E105] $70.96

Delivery/Courier Service $187.50

Lexis/Nexis- Legal Research [E $322.10

Miscellaneous [E124] $100.00

Outside Services $366.67

Pacer -Court Research $420.00
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Pachulski Stang Ziehl &Jones LLP Page: 4

Open Road Films O.C.C. Invoice 120853

64202 00002 November 30, 2018

Summary of Expenses

Description Amount

Postage [E108] $19.80

Reproduction Expense [E101] $403.20

Reproduction/ Scan Copy $551.70

Travel Expense [E110] $92.00

$2,562.69
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Pachulski Stang Ziehl &Jones LLP

Open Road Films p.C.C.

64202 00002

Page: 5

Invoice 120853
November 30, 2018

Hours Rate Amount

Avoidance Actions

11/O1/20l 8 AWC AC Emails with team regarding potential avoidance 0.30 995.00 $298.50
action.

11/01/2018 MBL AC Call with BofA counsel re document production 0.90 875.00 $787.50
issues (0.4); propose revised document requests and
coordinate with team re same (0.5).

11/02/2018 MBL AC Emails with BofA counsel re discovery issues and 0.50 875.00 $437.50
search parameters; follow-up with team re same.

11/02/2018 JHR AC Research re: section 547 issues. 1.70 595.00 $1,011.50

11/05/2018 JWL AC Research regarding avoidance of perfected copyright 1.50 '725.00 $1,087.50
issues and discussion with J. Rosen and M. Litvak
regarding same.

11/05/2018 M$L AC Review and comment on draft protective order with 0.80 875.00 $700.00
BofA.

11/05/2018 MBL AC Confer with team re BofA preference issues and 0.50 875.00 $437.50
review applicable law.

11/05/2018 JHR AC Research re section 547 issues. 1.30 595.00 $773.50

11/06/2018 MBL AC Call with J. Morris re comments to protective order 0.30 875.00 $262.50
and case status.

11/06/2018 MBL AC Revise draft protective order with BofA (0.8); email 0.90 875.00 $787.50
opposing counsel re same (0.1),

11/06/2018 JAM AC Review draft Confidentiality Agreement (1.0); 1.40 975.00 $1,365.00
telephone conference with M. Litvak re
Confidentiality, litigation, status (.2); e-mail to M.
Litvak re Confidentiality Agreement (.2).

11/07/2018 MBL AC Ernails with BofA counsel re protective order; 0.20 875.00 $175.00
follow-up with J. Morris re same.

11/09/2018 MBL AC Call with 7. Rosen re document review and 0.50 875.00 $437.50
follow-up emails with team re same.

11/09/2018 MBL AC Emails with BofA counsel re final confidentiality 0.50 875.00 $437.50
stipulation, document production, and challenge
extension and review final stipulation.

11/09/2018 JI-IR AC Call with M. Litvak re: lender document review and 0.40 595.00 $238.00
production

11/10/2018 MBL AC Attention to BofA document production and 0.20 875.00 $175.00
coordinate same with team.

1 1/ 10/2018 JHR AC Prepare BAML document production for review 0.30 595.00 $178.50

1 1/ 15/2018 MBL AC Attention to BofA production review and 020 875.00 $175.00
miscellaneous case issues.

11/15/201S JHR AC Prepare BAML document production for review. 0.30 595.00 $178.50

1 1/ 15/2018 JHR AC Conduct BAML document review 2.00 595.00 $1,190.00
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Pachulski Stang Ziehl &Jones LLP Page: 6

Open Road Films O.C.C. Invoice 120853

64202 00002 November 30, 2018

Hours Rate Amount

11/16/2018 JHR AC Conduct BAML document review 0.40 595.00 $238.00

11/17/2018 JHR AC Conduct BAML document review 3.30 595.00 $1,963.50

1 1/ 18/2018 JHR AC Conduct BAML document review 4.00 595.00 $2,380.00

1 1/ 19/2018 MBL AC Confer with J. Rosell and emails with team re BofA 0.20 875.00 $175.00
document production.

11/19/2018 JHR AC Conduct BAML, document review 1.30 595.00 $773.50

1 1/ 19/2018 JHR AC Conduct BAML document review 2.74 595.00 $1,606.50

11/20/2018 MBL AC Attention to BofA production and perfection issues; 0.30 g'75.00 $262.50
mails with team re same.

11/20/2018 JHR AC Correspondence with M. Litvak re: BAML 0.70 595.00 $416.50
document production

11/20/2018 JHR AC Review BAML document requests 0.20 595.00 $119.00

1 1/21/2018 JHR AC Call with M. Litvak re: foreclosure 0.20 595.00 $119.00

1 1/26/2018 MBL AC Review selected documents from BofA production 0.50 875.00 $437.50
and email summary from J. Rosell re same.

28.50 $19,624.50

Asset Disposition [B130]

11/01/2018 PJJ AD Prepare summary of sale and cure objections. 1.10 375.00 $412.50

11/01/2018 JWD AD Review various emails re sale and bidding 0.40 795.00 $318.00
procedure, work on Committee agenda, and emails
re Raven issues

11/01/2018 JWD AD Review executory contract objections and emails 0.30 795.00 $238.50
with P Jeffries re same

11/02/2018 PJJ AD Update sale/cure objection summary. 2.20 375.00 $825.00

11/02/2018 JWD AD Participate on call with Debtors' counsel re sale 0.50 795.00. $397.50

11/02/2018 JWD AD Call with Dundon re sale and wind down issues. 0.80 795.00 $636.00

11/02/2018 JWD AD Call with W Holt and draft email summary re same 0.40 795.00 $318.00

11/02/2018 MBL AD Review update re Endgame status; review 0.30 875.00 $262.50
reservation of rights.

11/02/2018 MBL AD Review Debtor sale update and coordinate same 0.10 875.00 $87.50
with team.

11/02/2018 RJF AD Call with Jeffrey Dulberg, Dundon regarding sale, 1.10 1095.00 $1,204.50
wind -down, eta

11/02/2018 MBL AD Call with Debtors' counsel and R. Feinstein re 0.50 875.00 $437.50
wind -down and post -sale issues.

11/03/2018 MBL AID Review supplemental sale -related filings (0.8); 1.00 875.00 $875.00
emails with P. Hurwitz re same (0.2).

11/04/2018 MBL AD Review Dundon distribution analysis and comment 0.50 g~5.00 $437.50
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Pachulski Stang Ziehl &Jones LLP

Qpen Road Films O.C.C.

64202 00002

Page: 7

Invoice 120853

November 30, 2018

Hours Rate Amount

re same.

11/05/2018 DG AD Review and respond to emails re: sale status 0.20 995.00 $199.00

11/05/2018 PJJ AD Summarize miscellaneous sales procedures motion. 0.40 375.00 $150.00

11/05/2018 PJJ AD Update sale objection chart. 0.20 375.00 $75.00

11/05/2018 JWD AD Review issues re miscellaneous asset sale motion 0.40 795.00 $318.00
and emails re same with Debtors' counsel and
Committee professionals.

11/05/2018 JWD AD Review summary of sale objections and emails re 0.20 795.00 $159.00
same

11/05/2018 JWD AD Call with P Hurwitz re sale issues. 0.30 795.00 $238.50

11/05/2018 JWD AD Review pleadings re sale and emails re same 0.30 795.00 $238.50

11/05/2018 MBL AD Review sale objection summary and variance 0.30 875.00 $262.50
information.

11/05/2018 MBL AD Call with Debtors' counsel re sale and wind -down 0.40 875.00 $350.00
issues.

11/05/2018 SLH AD Review Entertainment One objection to sale. 0.20 1095.00 $219.00

11/05/2018 SLH AD Review Lincoln limited objection to sale. 0.20 1095.00 $219.00

11/05/2018 SLH AD Review Turner limited objection to sale. 0.10 1095.00 $109.50

11/05/2018 JWD AD Review waterfall analysis. 0.10 795.00 $79.50

11/06/2018 PJJ AD Update sale motion objection summaries. 1.30 375.00 $487.50

11/06/2018 JWD AD Review additional sale objections and emails re 0.30 795.00 $238.50
same for chart

11/06/2018 MBL AD Emails with team and Debtors' counsel re sale 0.20 875.00 $175.00
issues.

11/06/2018 MBL AD Review Endgame and Showtime sale objections and 0.80 875.00 $700.00
coordinate with Dundon re same.

11/06/2018 RJF AD Telephone conference with Lipkind regarding 0.30 1095.00 $328.50
Global, etc. issues.

11/07/2018 DG AD Review Waterfall analysis (.3); participate on call to 0.80 995.00 $796.00
discuss same (.5)

11/07/2018 JWD AD Review additional sale objections and emails re 0.30 795.00 $238.50
changes to chart summary

11/07/2018 MBL AD Call with Dundon and team re waterfall analysis 1.60 875.00 $1,400.00
(1.2); review, comment re, and prepare for call
regarding the same (0.4).

11/07/2018 MBL AD Follow-up emails with team and Debtors' counsel re 0.50 875.00 $437.50
administrative claims and wind -down costs.

11/07/2018 MBL AD Follow-up call with P. Hurwitz and emails with team 0.80 875.00 $700.00
re revised waterfall and next steps (0.5); review
revised waterfall (0.3).
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Pachulski Stang Ziehl &Jones LLP

Qpen Road Films O.C.C.

64202 00002

Page: 8
Invoice 120853
November 30, 2018

Hours Rate Amount

11/07/2018 MBL AD Review additional details re unencumbered titles. 0.20 875.00 $175.00

11/07/2018 RJF AD Call with Dundon regarding recovery analysis. 0.50 1095.00 $547.50

11/07/2018 JWD AD Call with I)undon team re waterfall 0.50 795.00 $397.50

11/07/2018 JWD AD Emails with P Hurwitz re Viacom 0.20 795.00 $159.00

11/07/2018 JWD AD Review updated waterfall 0.20 795.00 $159.00

11/08/2018 PJJ AD Update sale motion objections summary. 0.60 375.00 $225.00

11/08/2018 MBL AD Follow-up with team and P. Hurwitz re next steps; 0.30 8'75.00 $262.50
review revised waterfall.

11/11/2018 MBL AD Attention to sale update from Debtors. 0.10 875.00 $87.50

11/12/2018 MBL AD Attention to sale status and emails with team re same 0.40 8'75.00 $350.00
(0.2); call with P. Hurwitz re pending issues (0.2).

11/12/2018 RJF AD Review initial waterfall draft. 0.20 1095.00 $219.00

11/12/2018 RJF AD Emails with Dundon group and J. Dulberg regarding 0.30 1095.00 $328.50
waterfall.

11/12/2018 RJF AD Telephone conference with Hurwitz regarding 0.30 1095.00 $328.50
~€aterfall.

11/12/2018 SLH AD Review update to Committee re sale. 0.20 1095:00 $219.00

11/12/2018 SLH AD Review Viacom order. 0.20 1095.00 $219.00

11/12/2018 JWD AD Review emails re sale status and possible 0.30 795.00 $238.50
continuance and emails re Committee call.

11/13/2018 JWD AD Review various orders re Viacom and sale and 0.30 795.00 $238.50
emails re same

11/13/2018 JWD AD Emails re sale and next Committee meeting 0.20 795.00 $159.00

11/15/2018 RJF AD Review draft Dundon waterfall analysis (.4); call 1.30 1095.00 $1,423.50
with Debors' counsel, FTI and Dundon regarding
waterfall, case closing (.9).

11/15/2018 MBL AD Review draft waterfall and revised versions thereof 0.50 875.00 $437.50
(0.3); emails with Dundon and team re same and
other status matters (0.2).

11/16/2018 MBL AD Attention to Dundon waterfall analysis. 0.20 875.00 $175.00

11/18/2018 RJF AD Email Hurwitz regarding Endgame. 0.20 1095.00 $219.00

11/19/2018 SLH AD Attention to 11/20/18 auction issues. 0.20 1095.00 $219.00

11/19/2018 JWD AD Review various pleadings re cure disputes and 0.50 795.00 $397.50
Debtors' sale reply

11/19/2018 JWD AD Review sale reply x•20 795.00 $159.00

11/19/2018 MBL AD Call with Debtors' counsel re sale update and update 0.50 875.00 $437.50
team re same.

11/19/2018 RJF AD Review revised Waterfall. 0.10 1095.00 $109.50

11/20/2018 JWD AD Email corrrespondence re Chef issues 0.30 795.00 $238.50
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Pachulski Stang Ziehl &Jones LLP

Open Road Films O.C.C.
44202 00002

Page: 9
Invoice 120853
November 30, 2018

Hours Rate Amount

11/20/2018 MBL AD Review proposed redline of sale order. 0.20 875.00 $175.00

11/20/2018 MBL AD Attention to revised waterfall and winddown budget 0.20 875.00 $175.00
from FTI; coordinate same with Committee.

11/20/2018 MBL AD Call with P. Hurwitz re sale issues. 0.20 875.00 $175.00

11/20/2018 SLH AD Review Sous supplemental objection. 0.10 1095.00 $109.50

11/20/2018 SLH AD Review proposed sale order. 0.20 1095.00 $219.00

11/21/2018 JWD AD Call with PSZJ team and P Hurwitz re sale issues 0.50 795.00 $397.50

11/21/2018 JWD AD Participate on call with Debtors' counsel re sale and 1.30 795.00 $1,033.50
post closing

11/21/2018 MBL AD Participate on call with Dundon and team re sale 0.50 875.00 $437.50
issues (partial).

11/21/2018 MBL AD Call with Debtors' professionals and team re sale 1.30 875.00 $1,137.50
issues.

11/21/2018 MBL AD Calls with BofA counsel and team re sale issues; 1.00 875.00 $875.00
emails re same.

11/21/2018 RJF AD Internal call regarding Chef (.4); call with Klee 2.60 1095.00 $2,847.00
Tuchin, FTI regarding sale issues (1.4); call with
Tenzer, M.Zitvak regarding Raven, Chef (.8)

11/21/2018 SLH AD Review sale contract. x•20 1095.00 $219.00

11/26/2018 JWD AD Work on issues re E&O review re Chef and emails 0.80 795.00 $636.00
re same

11/26/2018 MBL AD Call with Debtors' and BofA counsel re sale issues. 1.50 g~5.00 $1,312.50

11/26/2018 MBL AD Review agreements relating to Chef. 0.40 g~5.00 $350.00

11/26/2018 MBL AD Follow-up call with R. Feinstein re sale issues; email 0.10 875.00 $87.50
D. Grassgreen re same.

11/26/2018 RJF AD Emails regarding Loft/Raven. 0.20 1095.00 $219.00

11/26/2018 RJF AD Call with Tenzer, Debtors' regarding Chef. 1.50 1095.00 $1,642.50

11/26/2018 RJF AD Call with M. Litvak regarding Chef. 0.10 1095.00 $109.50

11/26/2018 CRR AD Review email communication from Raven re Loft 0.40 750.00 $300.00
and email correspondence to R. Feinstein re same

11/27/2018 DG AD Call with Max Litvak re: Chef. 0.30 995.00 $298.50

11/27/2018 JWD AD Prepare for and conduct call re Chef issues 0.50 795.00 $397.50

11/27/2018 JWD AD Review status report re sale hearing and emails re 0.20 795.00 $159.00
same

11/27/2018 MBL AD Call with D. Grassgreen re Chef issues (0.2); review 0.60 875.00 $525.00
applicable agreements and relevant briefing re same
(0.4).

11/27/2018 MBL AD Call with P. Hurwitz re sale issues. ~.2~ 875.00 $175.00

11/27/2018 MBL AD Emails with Committee and team re sale status 0.30 875.00 $262.50
issues.
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Pachulski Stang Ziehl &Jones LLP

Open Road Films O.C.C.

64202 00002

Page: 10

Invoice 120853
November 30, 2018

Hours Rate Amount

11/27/2018 RJF AD Telephone conference with Raven's counsel, C. 0.20 1095.00 $219.00
Robinson regarding Loft, other sale issues.

11/27/2018 RJF AD Email correspondence regarding adjourment of sale 0.10 1095.00 $109.50
hearing.

11/27/2018 RJF AD Emails with Klee Tuchin regarding adjourned sale 0.20 1095.00 $219.00
hearing.

11/27/2018 MBL AD Miscellaneous emails with Debtors' counsel re sale 0.10 8'75.00 $87.50
hearing.

11/28/2018 JWD AD Review Chef agreement 0.70 795.00 $556.50

11/29/2018 JWD AD Review de minimis sale notice and emails re same 0.20 795.00 $159.00

11/29/2018 CRR AD Review notice re proposed sale of miscellaneous 0.20 750.00 $150.00
assets

11/30/2018 MBL AD Attention to emails with team, Dundon, and 0.10 875.00 $87.50
Debtors' counsel re Chef status.

11/30/2018 RJF AD Participate on telephone conference with Hurwitz 0.20 1095.00 $219.00
regarding Loft, other issues.

45.80 $38,780.00

Bankruptcy Litigation [L430]

11/23/2018 JWD BL Review draft motion to extend removal deadline and 0.20 795.00 $159.00
emails re same

0.20 $159.00

Case Administration (B110]

11/01/2018 BMK CA Prepare daily memo narrative and coordinate client 0.20 295.00 $59.00
distribution.

11/01/2018 PEC CA Review daily correspondence and pleadings and 0.20 375.00 $75.00
circulate to the appropriate parties

11/01/2018 SLP CA Maintain document control. 0.10 295.00 $29.50

11/01/2018 LSC CA Update critical dates memo and WIP list; calendar 0.30 375.00 $112.50
entries and reminders.

11/02/2018 RJF CA Call with Debtors' counsel regarding case ending 0.50 1095.00 $547.50
issues

11/02/2018 PEC CA Review daily correspondence and pleadings and 0.20 375.00 $75.00
circulate to the appropriate parties

11/02/2018 SLP CA Maintain document control. 0.10 295.00 $29.50

11/02/2018 KSN CA Maintain document control. 0.40 295.00 $118.00

11/02/2018 BMK CA Prepare daily memo narrative and coordinate client 0.40 295.00 $118.00
distribution.

11/02/2018 LSC CA Update critical dates memo and WIP list; calendar 0.20 375.00 $75.00

Case 18-12012-LSS    Doc 488-2    Filed 12/20/18    Page 11 of 35



Pachulski Stang Ziehl &Jones LLP

Open Road Films O.C.C.

64202 00002

Page: 11

Invoice 120853
November 30, 2018

Hours Rate Amount

entries and reminders.

11/05/2018 BMK CA Prepare daily memo narrative and coordinate client 0.40 295.00 $118.00
distribution.

11/05/2018 PEC CA Review daily correspondence and pleadings and 0.20 375.00 $75.00
circulate to the appropriate parties

11/05/2018 SLP CA Maintain document control. 0.10 295.00 $29.50

11/05/2018 RJF CA Participate on case closing call with Klee Tuchin. 0.40 1095.00 $438.00

11/05/2018 KSN CA Maintain document control. 0.60 295.00 $177.00

11/05/2018 LSC CA Update critical dates memo and WIP list; calendar 0.60 375.00 $225.00
entries and reminders.

11/05/2018 JVVD CA Call with Debtors' counsel re case update. 0.60 795.00 $477.00

11/06/2018 PEC CA Review daily correspondence and pleadings and 0.20 375.00 $75.00
circulate to the appropriate parties

11/06/2018 JWD CA Review Rule 2019 statement 0.10 795.00 $79.50

11/06/2018 KSN CA Maintain document control. 0.10 295.00 $29.50

11/07/2018 PEC CA Review daily correspondence and pleadings and 0.20 375.00 $75.00
circulate to the appropriate parties

11/07/2018 KSN CA Maintain document control. 0.20 295.00 $59.00

11/07/2018 BMK CA Prepare daily memo narrative and coordinate client 0.50 295.00 $147.50
distribution.

11/07/2018 LSC CA Update critical dates memo and WIP list; calendar 0.60 375.00 $225.00
entries and reminders.

11/08/2018 PEC CA Review daily correspondence and pleadings and 0.20 375.00 $75.00
circulate to the appropriate parties

11/08/2018 SLP CA Maintain document control. 0.10 295.00 $29.50

11/08/2018 BMK CA Prepare daily memo narrative and coordinate client 0.10 295.00 $29.50
distribution.

11/09/2018 PEC CA Review Daily correspondence and pleadings and 0.20 375.00 $75.00
circulate to the appropriate parties

11/09/2018 SLP CA Maintain document control. 0.10 295.00 $29.50

11/09/2018 BMK CA Prepare daily memo narrative and coordinate client 0.20 295.00 $59.00
distribution.

1 1/ 12/2018 PEC CA Review Daily correspondence and pleadings and 0.20 375.00 $75.00
circulate to the appropriate parties

11/12/2018 KSN CA Maintain document control. 1.00 295.00 $295.00

1 1/ 12/2018 BMK CA Prepare daily memo narrative and coordinate client 0.10 295.00 $29.50
distribution.

11/12/2018 LSC CA Update critical dates memo and WIP list; calendar 0.40 375.00 $150.00
entries and reminders.

11/12/2018 SLH CA Review case pleadings. 0.10 1095.00 $109.50
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Pachulski Stang Ziehl &Jones LLP

Open Road Films O.C.C.

64202 00002

Page: 12

Invoice 120853
November 30, 2018

Hours Rate Amount

1 1/ 13/2018 PEC CA Review Daily correspondence and pleadings and 0.20 375.00 $75.00
circulate to the appropriate parties

11/13/2018 SLP CA Maintain document control. 0.10 295.00 $29.50

11/13/2018 KSN CA Maintain document control. 0.40 295.00 $118.00

1 1/ 13/2018 BMK CA Prepare daily memo narrative and coordinate client 0.10 295.00 $29.50
distribution.

11/13/2018 LSC CA Update critical dates memo and WIP list; calendar 0.30 375.00 $112.50
entries and reminders.

1 1/ 14/201.8 PEC CA Review daily correspondence and pleadings and 0.20 35.00 $75.00
circulate to the appropriate parties

11/14/2018 SLP CA Maintain document control. 0.10 295.00 $29.50

11/14/2018 KSN CA Maintain document control. 4.20 295.00 $59.00

11/14/2018 BMK CA Prepare daily memo narrative and coordinate client 0.20 295.00 $59.00
distribution.

11/15/2018 PEC CA Review daily correspondence and pleadings and 0.20 375.00 $75.00
circulate to the appropriate parties

1 1/ 15/2018 SLP CA Maintain document control. 0.10 295.00 $29.50

1 1/ 15/2018 KSN CA Maintain document control. 0.20 295.00 $59.00

11/15/2018 BMK CA Prepare daily memo narrative and coordinate client 0.10 295.00 $29.50
distribution.

1 1/ 16/2018 PEC CA Review daily correspondence and pleadings and 0.20 375.00 $75.00
circulate to the appropriate parties

1 1/ 16/2018 KSN CA Maintain document control. 0.30 295.00 $88.50

1 1/ 16/2018 BMK CA Prepare daily memo narrative and coordinate client 0.10 295.00 $29.50
distribution.

1 1/ 19/2018 BMK CA Prepare daily memo narrative and coordinate client 0.20 295.00 $59.00
distribution.

11/19/2018 PEC CA Review daily correspondence and pleadings and 0.20 35.00 $75.00
circulate to the appropriate parties

1 1/ 19/2018 SLP CA Maintain document control. 0.10 295.00 $29.50

1 1/ 19/2018 KSN CA Maintain document control. 0.40 295.00 $118.00

1 1/ 19/2018 LSC CA Update critical dates memo and WIP list; calendar 0.40 375.00 $150.00
entries and reminders.

1 1/20/2018 PEC CA Review daily correspondence and pleadings and 0.20 375.00 $75.00
circulate to the appropriate parties

1 1/20/2018 SLP CA Maintain document control. 0.10 295.00 $29.50

1 1/20/2018 BMK CA Prepare daily memo narrative and coordinate client 0.10 295.00 $29.50
distribution.

11/21/2018 PEC CA Review daily correspondence and pleadings and 0.20 375.00 $75.00
circulate to the appropriate parties
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Open Road Films O.C.C. Invoice 120853

64202 00002 November 30, 2018

Hours Rate Amount

11/21/2018 SLP CA Maintain document control. 0.10 295.00 $29.50

11/21/2018 LSC CA Update critical dates memo and WIP list; calendar 0.30 375.00 $112.50
entries and reminders.

11/26/2018 PEC CA Review daily correspondence and pleadings and 0.20 375.00 $75.00
circulate to the appropriate parties

11/26/2018 KSN CA Maintain document control. 0.10 295.00 $29.50

11/26/2018 BMK CA Prepare daily memo narrative and coordinate client 0.40 295.00 $118.00
distribution.

11/27/2018 PEC CA Review daily correspondence and pleadings and 0.20 375.00 $75.00
circulate to the appropriate parties

11/27/2018 SLP CA Maintain document control. 0.10 295.00 $29.50

11/27/2018 KSN CA Maintain document control. 0.80 295.00 $236.00

11/27/2018 BMK CA Prepare daily memo narrative and coordinate client 0.10 295.00 $29.50
istribution.

11/28/2018 SLP CA Maintain document control. 0.10 295.00 $29.50

11/28/2018 KSN CA Maintain document control. 0.30 295.00 $88.50

11/28/2018 BMK CA Prepare daily memo narrative and coordinate client 0.10 295.00 $29.50
distribution.

11/29/2018 PEC CA Review daily correspondence and pleadings and 0.20 375.00 $75.00
circulate to the appropriate parties

11/29/2018 KSN CA Maintain document control. 0.30 295.00 $88.50

11/29/2018 BMK CA Prepare daily memo narrative and coordinate client 0.10 295.00 $29.50
distribution.

i 1/29/2018 LSC CA Update critical dates memo and WIP list; calendar 0.50 375.00 $187.50
entries and reminders.

11/30/2018 PEC CA Review daily correspondence and pleadings and 0.20 375.00 $75.00
circulate to the appropriate parties

11/30/2018 BMK CA Prepare daily memo narrative and coordinate client 0.10 295.00 $29.50
distribution.

19.20 $7,406.00

Claims Admin/Objections[B310]

11/06/2018 JWD CO Call with creditor EI Paso Films re status 0.20 795.00 $159.00

11/07/2018 JWD CO Calls with two creditors re case updates and claim 0.30 795.00 $238.50
filing

11/23/2018 JWD CO Review bar date pleadings and emails re same 0.30 795.00 $238.50

0.80 $636.00
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Hours Rate Amount

Comp. of Prof./Others

11/05/2018 JWD CPO Emails re Committee member expenses 0.10 795.00 $79.50

11/06/2018 PEC CPO Draft Notice of the First Committee Expense 0.60 375.0 $225.00
Reimbursement Request and Certificate of Service
(.4); Prepare Application for filing and service (.2)

11/07/2018 JWD CPO Emails re Committee expense reimbursements 0.20 795.00 $159.00

1 1/ 16/2018 LSC CPO Correspondence regarding monthly application/fee 0.30 375.00 $112.50
issues.

1 1/ 19/2018 JWD CPO Call with P Hurwitz re fee applications and emails re 0.20 795.00 $159.00
same.

1 1/27/2018 PEC CPO Drag Certificate of No Objection Regarding 0.30 375.00 $112.50
Committee's First Expense Reimbursement
Application (.2); Prepare for filing (.1)

1 1/27/2018 PEC CPO Draft Certificate of No Objection Regarding Wilson 0.40 375.00 $150.00
Sonsini September 2018 Monthly Fee Application
(.2); Prepare for filing and service (.2)

11/27/2018 JWD CPO Emails re status of monthly fee applications. 020 795.00 $159.00

1 1/29/2018 JWD CPO Email correspondence regarding fees. 0.10 795.00 $79.50

11/29/2018 MBL CPO Coordinate with Debtors' re fees payments. 0.10 875.00 $87.50

1 1/30/2018 CRR CPO Email communication with US Trustee re 0.20 750.00 $150.00
Committee expense reimbursement

2.70 $1,473.50

Executory Contracts [B185]

11/05/2018 MBL EC Review draft response to Redrover motion to
compel.

11/27/2018 DG EC Research re: executory contract analysis (.6)

Financing [8230]

11/01/2018 MBL FN

11/05/2018 DG FN

11/07/2018 MBL FN

11/07/2018 JWD FN

1 1/ 12/2018 PEC FN

11/12/2018 MBL FN

Review draft wind -down budget; emails with team
and Dundon re same.

Review variance report

Review draft stipulation extending challenge period.

Call with P Hurwitz re wind down issues

Draft Notice of Filing Stipulation Extending
Challenge Deadline and Certificate of Service (.2);
Prepare for filing and service (.2)

Coordinate regarding stipulation to extend challenge

0.10 875.00 $87.50

0.60 995.00 $597.00

0.70 $684.50

0.40 875.00 $350.00

0.20 995.00 $199.00

1.50 875.00 $1,312.50

0.20 795.00 $159.00

0.40 375.00 $150.00

0.10 875.00 $87.50
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11/13/2018 SLH FN

11/14/2018 JWD FN

11/15/2018 MBL FN

11/17/2018 MBL FN

11/18/2018 RJF FN

11/18/2018 MBL FN

11/19/2018 MBL FN

11/27/2018 MBL FN

11/27/2018 MBL FN

11/29/2018 MBL FN

Hearing

10/01/2018 CRR ~

11/09/2018 PEC ~

11 /09/2018 CJB HE

11/12/2018 CJB ~

11/13/2018 PEC ~

11/19/2018 C7B ~

11/19/2018 PEC HE

11/19/2018 RJF ~

11/20/2018 SLH ~

11/20/2018 RJF ~

11/21/2018 LSC. ~

11/26/2018 LSC ~

Hours Rate Amount

deadline.

Review financial report. 4.24 1095.00 $219.00

Review variance report 0.20 795.00 $159.00

Call with Debtors' professionals re wind -down 0.90 875.00 $787.50
issues.

Review and consider wind -down budget and 0.50 875.00 $437.50
waterfall from FTI; coordinate with team and
Dundon re same.

Emails regarding wind down budget. 0.20 1095.00 $219.00

Emails with Dundon re winddown and waterfall 0.30 875.00 $262.50
budget issues.

Emails with team and FTI re winddown budget. 0.20 875.00 $175.00

Draft second stipulation extending challenge 0.40 875.00 $350.00
deadline; coordinate same with lender counsel.

Review proposed budget for extended pre -sale 0.40 8'75.00 $350.00
period ,amendment to cash collateral order and
emails with team and Dundon re same.

Emails with lender counsel re extension of challenge 0.10 875.00 $87.50
period.

6.20 $5,305.00

Review amended agenda, prepare for hearing and 1.10 750.00 $825.00
email with D. Grassgreen re same

Review agenda for 11/14/18 hearing and circulate 0.20 375.00 $75.00
(.1); coordinate binder preparation (.1)

Prepare hearing binder for hearing on 11/14/18. 1.80 295.00 $531.00

Prepare hearing binder for hearing on 11/14/18. 0.40 295.00 $118.00

Review Notice of Rescheduled Hearing on 11/14/18 0.20 375.00 $75.00
and circulate

Prepare hearing binders for hearing on 11/20/18. 1.00 295.00 $295.00

Revise 11/20/18 Hearing Binders 0.30 375.00 $112.50

Prepare for sale hearing, including review of agenda, 1.00 1095.00 $1,095.00
objections.

Review hearing agenda. 0.10 1095.00 $109.50

Prepare for sale hearing en route to Delaware (1.0); 3.00 1095.00 $3,285.00
attend sale hearing (2.0).

Coordinate attorneys' appearance for telephonic 0.30 375.00 $112.50
status conference.

Coordinate attorney's appearance for telephonic 0.20 375.00 $75.00
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Hours Rate Amount

status conference.

11/27/2018 MBL ~ Attend court status conference re sale (via phone). 0.50 875.00 $437.50

11/27/2018 RJF ~ Participate on telephonic status conference. 0.30 1095.00 $328.50

11/27/2018 CRR HE Attend telephonic hearing re status of sale 0.50 750.00 $375.00
objections, order

10.90 $7,849.50

Insurance Issues

11/23/2018 JWD II Emails re insurance coverage issues 0.40 795.00 $318.00

11/26/2018 IAWN II Exchange emails and telephone conference re 0.30 925.00 $277.50
insurance issues with Jeff Dulberg

11/27/2018 JWD II Emaiis re insurance coverage issues 0.20 795.00 $159.00

11/27/2018 IAWN II Review insurance materials in preparation for call 3.30 925.00 $3,052.50

11/28/2018 IAWN II Prepare for and attend conference call with client re 1.00 925.00 $925.00
missing information and open issues

5.20 $4,732.00

Meeting of Creditors [B150]

11/05/2018 JWD MC Prepare updated agenda and emails re same 0.20 795.00 $159.00

11/05/2018 JWD MC Emails re Committee agenda issues 0.20, 795.00 $159.00

11/05/2018 JWD MC Prepare for Committee call. 0.20 795.00 $159.00

11/05/2018 JWD MC Participate on Committee call. 0.80 795.00 $636.00

11/05/2018 MBL MC Emails with team re waterfall slides for Committee 0.50 875.00 $437.50
and review comments to same.

11/05/2018 MBL MC Participate on Committee update call. 0.80 875.00 $700.00

11/05/2018 DG MC Review slide deck for Committee meeting (.3); and 0.40 995.00 $398.00
Max Litvak comments re: same (.1)

11/05/2018 DG MC Participate on weekly Committee call 0.80 995.00 $796.00

11/05/2018 RJF MC Prepare for Committee call, including commenting 0.50 1095.00 $547.50
on Dundon deck.

11/05/2018 RJF MC Participate on Committee call. 0.80 1095.00 $876.00

11/07/2018 RJF MC Emails regarding next Committee call. 0.20 1095.00 $219.00

11/12/2018 LAF MC Update creditor website. 0.30 395.00 $118.50

11/12/2018 RJF MC Respond to creditor inquiry regarding IM Global, 0.30 1095.00 $328.50
related emails.

11/12/2018 RTF MC Telephone conference with Jeffrey W. Dulberg 0.10 1095.00 $109.50
regarding next meeting.

11/12/2018 RJF MC Email to Committee regarding next meeting. 0.10 1095.00 $109.50
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November 30, 2018

Hours Rate Amount

11/13/2018 LAF MC Update creditor website. 1.30 395.00 $513.50

11/14/2018 SLH MC Attention to Committee scheduling issues. 0.10 1095.00 $109.50

11/19/2018 JWD MC Prepare Committee call agenda and emails re same 0.40 795.00 $318.00

11/19/2018 JWD MC Participate on Committee call and follow up emails 0.60 795.00 $477.00
re same

11/19/2018 MBL MC Participate on Committee call (0.5); prepare for 1.50 875.00 $1,312.50
Committee call/review applicable filings and other
documents (1.0).

11/19/2018 RJF MC Participate in telephonic Committee meeting. 0.50 1095.00 $547.50

11/27/2018 RJF MC Review status update to Committee. 0.10 1095.00 $109.50

11/28/2018 RJF MC Internal emails regarding agenda for next meeting. 0.20 1095.00 $219.00

10.90 $9,359.50

Non-Working Travel

11/20/2018 RJF NT Non working travel to and from DE for sale hearing. 4.00 547.50 $2,190.00
(Billed at 1/2 normal rate)

4.00 $2,190.00

PSZ&J Compensation

11/05/2018 RJF PC Review and provide comments to monthly fee 0.40 1095.00 $438.00
application.

11/06/2018 PEC pC Draft Notice of PSZ&J LLP's First Monthly Fee 1.00 375.00 $375.00
Application for the Period of September 1, 2018
Through September 30, 2018 and Certificate of
Service (.5); Prepare Fee Application Service List
(.3); Prepare Application for filing and service (.2)

11/06/2018 LSC PC Revise and finalize monthly fee statement and 2.30 375.00 $862.50
exhibits.

11/26/2018 LSC pC Begin drafting October monthly fee statement. 0.50 375.00 $187.50

11/27/2018 PEC PC Draft Certificate of No Objection Regarding PSZ&J 0.30 375.00 $112.50
LLP's First Monthly Fee Application (.2); Prepare
for filing (.1)

1 U27/2018 CRR PC Review draft monthly fee applications and email 0.20 750.00 $150.00
from L. Canty re same

11/27/2018 LSC pC Continue drafting October monthly statement and 4.00 375.00 $1,500.00
correspondence regarding the same.

1 1/28/2018 CRR pC Email communication w ith Debtors' re CNO on 0.20 750.00 $150.00
payment of PSZJ fees

8.90 $3,775.50
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64202 00002

Stay Litigation [8140]

11/04/2018 JWD SL

11/05/2018 PJJ SL

11/05/2018 JWD SL

11/05/2018 JWD SL

11/05/2018 JWD SL

Review Viacom stay relief motion

Summarize Viacom stay relief motion.

Emails with Debtors' counsel re Viacom stay relief
motion

Review issues re Viacom stay relief motion

Call with J Weiss re Viacom stay relief motion and
emails with team re same

TOTAL SERVICES FOR THIS MATTER:

Hours

0.50
0.20

0.10

0.30

0.30

1.40

Page: 18
Invoice 120853
November 30, 2018

Rate Amount

795.00 $397.50

375.00 $75.00

795.00 $79.50

795.00 $238.50

795.00 $238.50

$1,029.00

$103,004,00
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Expenses

09/15/2018 AT Auto Travel Expense [E109] Taxi Service, RJF 8.76

09/15/2018 TE Travel Expense [E110] Amtrak, Tkt 2574597079153, 92.00
DENY, RJF

10/01/2018 CC Conference Call [E105] AT&T Conference Call, JWD 12.83

10/08/2018 CC Conference Call [E105] AT&T Conference Call, JWD 12.76

10/16/2018 CC Conference Call [E105] AT&T Conference Call, JWD 23.42

10/23/2018 CC Conference Call [E105] AT&T Conference Call, JWD 18.26

10/26/2018 CC Conference Call [E105] AT&T Conference Call, MBL 3.69

11/01/2018 RE (75 @0.10 PER PG) 7.50

11/01/2018 RE (461 @0.10 PER PG) 46.10

11/01/2018 RE (1 @0.10 PER PG) 0.10

11/01/201.8 RE2 SCAN/COPY (6 @0.10 PER PG) 0.60

11/01/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (104 @0.10 PER PG) 10.40

11/01/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (20 @0.10 PER PG) 2.00

11/02/2018 BB 64202.00002 Bloomberg Charges for 11-02-18 5.00

11/02/2018 LN 64202.00002 Lexis Charges for 11-02-18 65.42

11/02/2018 RE (297 @0.10 PER PG) 29.70

11/02/2018 RE (21 @0.10 PER PG) 2.10

11/02/2018 RE (6 @0.10 PER PG) 0.60

11/02/2018 RE (1 @0.10 PER PG) 0.10

11/02/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (6 @0.10 PER PG) 0.60
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11/02/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (18 @0.10 PER PG) 1.g~

11/02/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (176 @0.10 PER PG) 17.60

11/02/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (10 @0.10 PER PG) 1.00

11/02/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (184 @0.10 PER PG) 18.40

11/02/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (30 @0.10 PER PG) 3.00

11/05/2018 LN 64202.00002 Lexis Charges for 11-OS-18 142.15

11/05/2018 LN 64202.00002 Lexis Charges for 11-OS-18 114.53

11/05/2018 RE (1 @0.10 PER PG) 0.10

11/05/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (6 @0.10 PER PG) 0.60

11/05/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (234 @0.10 PER PG) 23.40

11/05/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (18 @0.10 PER PG) 1.80

11/05/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (40 @0.10 PER PG) 4.00

11/05/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (14 @0.10 PER PG) 1.40

11/05/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (46 @0.10 PER PG) 4.60

11/05/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (6 @0.10 PER PG) 0.60

11/05/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (12 @0.10 PER PG) 1.20

11/05/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (22 @0.10 PER PG) 2.20

11/05/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (24 @0.10 PER PG) 2.40

11/05/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (12 @0.10 PBR PG) 1.20

11/05/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (40 @0.10 PER PG) 4.00

11/05/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (20 @0.10 PER PG) 2.00

11/05/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (43 @0.10 PER PG) 4.30
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11/05/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (10 @0.10 PER PG) 1.00

11/06/2018 PO 64202.00001 :Postage Charges for 11-06-18 10.50

11/06/2018 DC 64202.00002 Advita Charges for'11-06-18 25.00

11/06/2018 RE (1 @0.10 PER PG) 0.10

11/06/2018 RE (134 @0.10 PER PG) 13.40

11/06/2018 RE (3 @0.10 PER PG) 0.30

11/06/2018 RE (462 @0.10 PER PG) 46.20

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (18 @0.10 PER PG) 1.80

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (3 @0.10 PER PG) 0.30

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (6 @0.10 PER PG) 0.60

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (3 @0.10 PER PG) 0.30

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (2 @0.10 PER PG) 0.20

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (1 @0.10 PER PG) 0.10

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (3 @0.10 PER PG) 0.30

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (3 @0.10 PER PG) 0.30

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (2 @0.10 PER PG) 0.20

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (12 @0.10 PER PG) 1.20

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (2 @0.10 PER PG) 0.20

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (9 @0.10 PER PG) 0.90

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (3 @0.10 PER PG) 0.30

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (Z @0.10 PER PG) 0.20
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11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (3 @0.10 PER PG) 0.30

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (3 @0.10 PER PG) 0.30

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (7 @0.10 PER PG) 0.70

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (2 @0.10 PER PG) 0.20

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (8 @0.10 PER PG) 0.80

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (5 @0.10 PER PG) 0.50

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (4 @0.10 PER PG) 0.40

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (1 @0.10 PER PG) 0.10

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (1 @0.10 PER PG) 0.10

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (3 @0.10 PER PG) 0.30

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (3 @0.10 PER PG) 0.30

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (11 @0.10 PER PG) 1.10

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (4 @0.10 PER PG) 0.40

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (3 @0.10 PER PG) 0.30

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (3 @0.10 PER PG) 0.30

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (1 @0.10 PER PG) 0.10

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (3 @0.10 PER PG) 0.30

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (7 @0.10 PER PG) 0.70

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (6 @0.10 PER PG) 0.60

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (2 @0.10 PER PG) 0.20

11/06/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (3 @0.10 PER PG) 0.30
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11/07/2018 DC 64202.00002 Advita Charges for 11-07-18 7.50

11/07/2018 RE (83 @O.lp PER PG) 8.30

11/07/2018 RE (3 @0.10 PER PG) 0.30

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (6 @0.10 PER PG) 0.60

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (36 @0.10 PER PG) 3.60

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (16 @0.10 PER PG) 1.60

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (28 @0.10 PER PG) 2.80

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (6 @0.10 PER PG) 0.60

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (18 @0.10 PER PG) 1.80

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (92 @0.10 PER PG) 9.20

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (14 @0.10 PER PG) 1.40

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (26 @0.10 PER PG) 2.60

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (6 @0.10 PER PG) 0.60

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (24 @0.10 PER PG) 2.40

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (10 @0.10 PER PG) 1.00

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (8 @0.10 PER PG) 0.80

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (28 @0.10 PER PG) 2•g~

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (74 @0.10 PER PG) 7.40

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (52 @0.10 PER PG) 5.20

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (8 @0.10 PER PG) 0.80

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (28 @0.10 PER PG) 2•g~
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11/07/2018 REZ SCAN/COPY (44 @0.10 PER PG) 4.40

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (28 @0.10 PER PG) 2•g~

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (8 @0.10 PER PG) 0.80

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (8 @0.10 PER PG) 0.80

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (96 @0.10 PER PG) 9.60

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (26 @0.10 PER PG) 2•~~

11/07/2018 REZ SCAN/COPY (12 @0.10 PER PG) 1.20

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (8 @0.10 PER PG) 0.80

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (20 @0.10 PER PG) 2.00

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (6 @0.10 PER PG) 0.60

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (68 @0.10 PER PG) 6.80

11/07/2018 REZ SCAN/COPY (50 @0.10 PER PG) 5.00

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (14 @0.10 PER PG) 1.40

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (22 @0.10 PER PG) 2.2~

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (6 @0.10 PER PG) 0.60

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (24 @0.10 PER PG) 2.40

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (26 @0.10 PER PG) 2.60

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (8 @0.10 PER PG) 0.80

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (12 @0.10 PER PG) 1.20

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (10 @0.10 PER PG) 1.00

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (26 @0.10 PER PG) 2.60
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Page: 25
Invoice 120853
November 30, 2018

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (26 @0.10 PER PG) 2.60

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (14 @0.10 PER PG) 1.40

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/CQPY (8 @0.10 PER PG) 0.80

11/07/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (6 @0.10 PER PG) 0.60

11/07/2018 REZ SCAN/COPY (16 @0.10 PER PG) 1.60

11/08/2018 MC Miscellaneous [E124] Expensess for hearing, DIG 100.00

11/08/2018 RE (1 @0.10 PER PG) 0.10

11/08/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (24 @0.10 PER PG) 2.40

11/09/2018 BB 64202.00002 Bloomberg Charges for 11-09-18 5.00

11/09/2018 RE (3 @0.10 PER PG) 0.30

11/09/2018 RE (196 @0.10 PER PG) 19.60

11/09/2018 RE (53 @0.10 PER PG) 5.30

11/09/2018 RE (369 @0.10 PER PG) 36.90

11/09/2018 RE (5 @0.10 PER PG) 0.50

11/09/2018 RE (7 @0.10 PER PG) 0.70

11/09/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (19 @0.10 PER PG) 1.90

11/09/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (50 @0.10 PER PG) 5.00

11/09/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (110 @0.10 PER PG) 11.00

11/09/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (2 @0.10 PER PG) 0.20

11/09/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (6 @0.10 PER PG) 0.60

11/09/2018 RE2 SCAN/COPY (27 @0.10 PER PG) 2.70
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