

EXHIBIT B

Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
<u>Matter 1 - Asset Analysis/Recovery</u>				
07/21/2017	SJT	REVIEW WALKER NELL'S ANALYSIS OF DEBTOR'S PROPOSED ASSUMPTION OF LEASE WITH PLAY AND LEARN	0.50	\$325.00
Total Matter 1 - Asset Analysis/Recovery			<u>0.50</u>	<u>\$325.00</u>
<u>Matter 3 - Business Operations</u>				
07/18/2017	SJT	REVIEW DEBTORS' LEASE WITH PLAY AND LEARN AND PROPOSED AMENDMENTS	1.50	\$975.00
Total Matter 3 - Business Operations			<u>1.50</u>	<u>\$975.00</u>
<u>Matter 4 - Case Administration</u>				
07/17/2017	SJT	PREPARE COMMITTEE BY-LAWS AND CONTACT LIST	2.50	\$1,625.00
07/17/2017	SJT	REVIEW DEBTOR'S FIRST DAY MOTIONS AND ORDERS	1.50	975.00
07/20/2017	SJT	TELEPHONE DISCUSSION WITH B. POLLACK RE: WORK STREAMS	0.50	325.00
07/21/2017	SJT	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. POLLACK RE: LEASE ASSUMPTION, ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONALS, DEBTORS' BUDGET, AND FINANCING MOTION	0.50	325.00
07/21/2017	BP	REVIEW FILED MOTIONS AND DOCUMENTS	3.00	1,575.00
07/24/2017	AP	LEGAL RESEARCH AND CASE LAW ANALYSIS RE LEASE REJECTION ISSUE	1.90	522.50
07/25/2017	AP	CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH RE LEASE REJECTION ISSUE. DRAFT RESEARCH MEMORANDUM TO BONNIE POLLACK RE THE SAME	1.90	522.50
07/25/2017	SJT	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. CIANCIULLI RE: TOMORROW'S HEARING AND STATUS.	0.50	325.00
07/25/2017	SJT	REVIEW INTERNAL MEMO RE: CRITICAL DATES	0.20	130.00
07/25/2017	SJT	REVIEW PLEADINGS AND PREPARE FOR TOMORROW'S HEARING	1.50	975.00
07/25/2017	BP	REVIEW LEASE ASSUMPTION ORDER AND PROVIDE COMMENTS TO SAME	0.20	105.00
Total Matter 4 - Case Administration			<u>14.20</u>	<u>\$7,405.00</u>
<u>Matter 7 - Fee/Employment Applications</u>				
07/20/2017	SJT	REVIEW DEBTORS' MOTION TO RETAIN ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONALS	0.30	\$195.00
07/21/2017	SJT	REVIEW CONFLICT SEARCH RESULTS TO PREPARE RETENTION DECLARATION	0.80	520.00
07/21/2017	NS	DRAFT CULLEN & DYKMAN AND WALKER NELL RETENTION APPLICATIONS, DECLARATIONS AND PROPOSED ORDERS	4.20	2,415.00
07/21/2017	SJT	REVIEW AND REVISE CULLEN AND DYKMAN EMPLOYMENT APPLICATION AND DECLARATION	1.50	975.00
07/25/2017	SJT	REVIEW PRO HAC VICE APPLICATIONS	0.30	195.00
07/25/2017	BP	REVIEW PRO HAC VICE DOCUMENTS	0.20	105.00
Total Matter 7 - Fee/Employment Applications			<u>7.30</u>	<u>\$4,405.00</u>

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Time Narrative</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>Matter 9 - Financing</u>				
07/17/2017	SJT	REVIEW DIP FINANCING MOTION AND BUDGET; PREPARE LIST OF POTENTIAL OBJECTIONS	2.00	\$1,300.00
07/17/2017	SJT	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH W. WALKER RE: DEBTORS' BUDGET	0.50	325.00
07/18/2017	SJT	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DEBTORS' COUNSEL RE: DIP FINANCING ISSUES AND GENERAL MATTERS	0.80	520.00
07/19/2017	BP	DISCUSSION WITH J. TEELE AND FINANCIAL ADVISORS RE DIP ISSUES (.5); CALL WITH DEBTOR'S COUNSEL RE SAME AND STATUS OF VARIOUS MATTERS (.7)	1.20	630.00
07/19/2017	SJT	PREPARE OBJECTION TO DIP FINANCING MOTION	3.50	2,275.00
07/19/2017	SJT	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH W. WALKER RE: DEBTORS' BUDGET	1.50	975.00
07/20/2017	SJT	CONTINUE DRAFTING DIP FINANCING OBJECTION	1.00	650.00
07/20/2017	SJT	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO DEBTORS' COUNSEL DESCRIBING COMMITTEE'S OBJECTIONS TO DIP FINANCING AND LEASE ASSUMPTION	2.00	1,300.00
07/20/2017	SJT	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH THE COMMITTEE RE: STATUS AND DIP FINANCING	0.80	520.00
07/20/2017	SJT	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH W. WALKER RE: HIS DISCUSSION WITH M. KAUFMAN OF GETZLER HENRICH	0.30	195.00
07/21/2017	SJT	REVIEW INFORMATION RE: DIP FINANCING AND BUDGET FOR DIP FINANCING OBJECTION AND NEGOTIATIONS	2.00	1,300.00
07/21/2017	BP	REVIEW DIP MOTION	0.50	262.50
07/24/2017	BP	CALL WITH DEBTORS' COUNSEL RE DIP ISSUES (.5); LENGTHY DISCUSSION WITH DIP LENDER COUNSEL RE DIP ORDER (1.3); DISCUSSION WITH ACCOUNTANTS RE BUDGET ISSUES (.3); REVISE DIP ORDER PER ALL DISCUSSIONS (1.9)	4.00	2,100.00
07/24/2017	SJT	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DEBTORS' COUNSEL RE: DIP FINANCING	1.00	650.00
07/24/2017	SJT	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH THE COMMITTEE RE: STATUS OF DIP FINANCING NEGOTIATIONS AND OBJECTION	0.80	520.00
07/24/2017	SJT	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR THE DIP LENDER RE: RESOLVING THE COMMITTEE'S OBJECTIONS	1.50	975.00
07/25/2017	SJT	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH COUNSEL FOR THE DEBTORS AND DIP LENDER RE: DIP FINANCING AGREEMENTS	1.00	650.00
07/25/2017	SJT	REVIEW AND REVISE DIP FINANCING ORDER INCORPORATING AGREEMENTS RESOLVING THE COMMITTEE'S OBJECTIONS	2.50	1,625.00
07/25/2017	SJT	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH THE COMMITTEE RE: DIP FINANCING AGREEMENTS	0.50	325.00
07/25/2017	SJT	PREPARE RESERVATION OF RIGHTS RE: DIP FINANCING	0.30	195.00
07/25/2017	BP	REVIEW DIP LENDER CHANGES TO ORDER (.2); NUMEROUS EMAILS AND DISCUSSIONS WITH DEBTOR COUNSEL, DIP LENDER COUNSEL, ACCOUNTANTS RE DIP ORDER ISSUES (1.8); DISCUSSION WITH COMMITTEE RE DIP ORDER, THOUGHTS, ISSUES (.5); EMAILS AND DISCUSSIONS RE BUDGET CONCERNS (.7); DRAFT LANGUAGE FOR DIP ORDER RE BUDGET CONCERNS (.4); SEVERAL EMAILS AND DISCUSSIONS RE NEW LANGAUGE (.7); EMAIL TO COMMITTEE RE STATUS, REQUEST FOR APPROVAL (.3)	4.60	2,415.00
Total Matter 9 - Financing			<u>32.30</u>	<u>\$19,707.50</u>

Date	Timekeeper	Time Narrative	Hours	Amount
<u>Matter 11 - Meetings of and Communications with Creditors</u>				
07/17/2017	SJT	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH THE COMMITTEE	1.00	\$650.00
07/18/2017	NS	PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN COMMITTEE CALL AND FOLLOW-UP CALL WITH WALKER NELL	1.40	805.00
07/18/2017	SJT	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH COMMITTEE MEMBERS RE: THEIR QUESTIONS ABOUT DIP FINANCING, SUBCONTRACTOR PAYMENTS AND LEASE ASSUMPTION	1.00	650.00
07/18/2017	SJT	PREPARE MEMORANDUM TO THE COMMITTEE RE: STATUS UPDATES AND STRATEGY RECOMMENDATIONS	1.00	650.00
Total Matter 11 - Meetings of and Communications with Creditors			4.40	\$2,755.00
TOTAL ALL MATTERS			60.20	\$35,572.50