

**EXHIBIT A**

Summary of Compensation by Project Category for the Period  
 October 1, 2017 through October 31, 2017

<b>Task Code</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Fees</b>
B110	Case Administration	15.00	\$2,250.00
B140	Stay Relief/Adequate Protection Proceedings	.50	\$262.50
B150	Meetings of and Communications with Creditors	8.10	\$4,252.50
B160	Fee/Employment Applications	12.70	\$3,457.50
B185	Assumption/Rejection of Leases/Contracts	9.80	\$4,289.50
B190	Other Contested Matters	2.80	\$1,470.00
B310	Claims Administration And Objections	3.30	\$1,732.50
B320	Plan And Disclosure Statement	.60	\$315.00
	<b>Total Fees</b>		<b>\$18,029.50</b>
	<b>Less 20% Discount</b>		<b>-\$3,605.90</b>
	<b>Discounted Total</b>		<b>\$14,423.60</b>

**CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP**

The Legal Center  
One Riverfront Plaza  
Newark, New Jersey 07102  
Telephone (973) 849-0220 Facsimile (973)849-2020

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.

Control # 5851592  
November 27, 2017  
Page 2

For Professional Services Rendered Through October 31, 2017 regarding:

**Client Number - 35008 - 000 GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.**

**Matter Number - 00001 IN RE WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al  
REPRESENT OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF  
UNSECURED CREDITORS IN CHAPTER 11  
PROCEEDING  
Potential Client E .00**

DATE	INIT	TASK	ACTVYDESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
CASE ADMINISTRATION					
B110 CASE ADMINISTRATION					
10/03/17	KL	B110	PREPARE CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE RE: RESPONSE OF COMMITTEE TO ASSUMPTION OF HENRY AVENUE	.40	60.00
10/03/17	KL	B110	TEND TO SERVICE RE: RESPONSE OF COMMITTEE TO ASSUMPTION OF HENRY AVENUE	.20	30.00
10/03/17	KL	B110	ELECTRONICALLY FILE CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE RE: RESPONSE OF COMMITTEE TO ASSUMPTION OF HENRY AVENUE	.30	45.00
10/03/17	KL	B110	ORGANIZE AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE RESPONSE OF COMMITTEE TO ASSUMPTION OF HENRY AVENUE	.70	105.00
10/03/17	KL	B110	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. POLLACK RE: FILING AND SERVICE OF RESPONSE OF COMMITTEE TO ASSUMPTION OF HENRY AVENUE	.20	30.00
10/03/17	KL	B110	REVIEW EMAIL FROM N. STEFANELLI	.10	15.00

**Founded 1850**

BROOKLYN

LONG ISLAND

MANHATTAN

WASHINGTON, D.C.

ALBANY

NEW JERSEY

**CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP**

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.  
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5851592  
November 27, 2017  
Page 3

10/03/17	KL	B110	RE: RESPONSE OF COMMITTEE TO ASSUMPTION OF HENRY AVENUE EMAIL TO TEAM RE: FILED RESPONSE OF COMMITTEE TO ASSUMPTION OF HENRY AVENUE	.20	30.00
10/03/17	KL	B110	CONTINUED EXTENSIVE REVISIONS TO FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION TIME ENTRIES	1.80	270.00
10/04/17	KL	B110	REVIEW DOCKET RE: CRITICAL DATES	.80	120.00
10/04/17	KL	B110	UPDATE CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.90	135.00
10/11/17	KL	B110	REVIEW DOCKET AND PLEADINGS RE: CRITICAL DATES	1.00	150.00
10/11/17	KL	B110	UPDATE CRITICAL DATES MEMO AND DEPARTMENT CALENDAR RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES	1.10	165.00
10/11/17	KL	B110	EMAIL TO TEAM RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.20	30.00
10/11/17	KL	B110	REVIEW FILED FIRST MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT FOR CULLEN AND DYKMAN	.30	45.00
10/16/17	KL	B110	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES, INTERIM COMP ORDER; RETENTION ORDER	1.00	150.00
10/16/17	KL	B110	UPDATE CRITICAL DATES MEMO	1.00	150.00
10/16/17	KL	B110	EMAIL TO TEAM RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES MEMO AND TEND TO CALENDARING NEW EVENTS	.60	90.00
10/17/17	KL	B110	ORGANIZE WORDSWORTH FEE APPLICATION FILE	.30	45.00
10/17/17	KL	B110	REVIEW DOCKET RE: FEE APPLICATION FILED IN PREPARATION TO ORGANIZE FEE APPLICATION FILE	.40	60.00
10/17/17	KL	B110	PREPARE PRO HAC VICE APPLICATION FOR T. POWERS	.50	75.00
10/20/17	KL	B110	REVIEW ORGANIZE AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION RE: EMPLOYMENT OF CULLEN AND DYKMAN	.60	90.00
10/20/17	KL	B110	TELEPHONE CALL TO JUDGE'S CHAMBERS RE: FILED CERTIFICATE OF NO	.20	30.00

**Founded 1850**

**CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP**

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.  
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5851592  
November 27, 2017  
Page 4

10/24/17	KL	B110	OBJECTION ORGANIZE, ELECTRONICALLY FILE AND TEND TO SERVICE OF RESPONSE OF THE UNSECURED CREDITORS' COMMITTEE TO THE MOTION OF LIST ASSOCIATES, L.P. FOR ALLOWANCE OF ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM	.60	90.00
10/25/17	KL	B110	REVIEW DOCKET RE: CRITICAL DATES	.60	90.00
10/25/17	KL	B110	UPDATE CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.60	90.00
10/25/17	KL	B110	TEND TO CALENDARING CRITICAL DATES IN ELECTRONIC CALENDAR	.40	60.00
SUB TOTAL TIME					2,250.00
RELIEF FR STAY/ADEQUATE PROTECTION PRCED					
B140 RELIEF FR STAY/ADEQUATE PROTECTION PRCED					
10/13/17	BLP	B140	REVIEW STIPULATION VACATING STAY AS TO ADDITIONAL CLAIMANTS AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH DEBTOR COUNSEL RE SAME	.50	262.50
SUB TOTAL TIME					262.50
MEETINGS OF & COMMUNICATIONS W/ CREDITOR					
B150 MEETINGS OF & COMMUNICATIONS W/ CREDITOR					
10/02/17	BLP	B150	CONFERENCE WITH J. TEELE RE COMMITTEE CALL AND AGENDA AND EMAIL TO COMMITTEE RE AGENDA FOR CALL	.50	262.50
10/04/17	BLP	B150	CONFERENCE WITH S. TEELE RE REVISED PLAN	.20	105.00
10/05/17	BLP	B150	CALL WITH COMMITTEE RE PLAN, MOTIONS, OPERATIONAL ISSUES	.50	262.50
10/05/17	BLP	B150	CALLS WITH FINANCIAL ADVISORS RE PLAN ISSUES, OPERATIONAL ISSUES PRIOR TO AND AFTER COMMITTEE CALL	.50	262.50
10/05/17	BLP	B150	REVIEW 2 VERSIONS OF REVISED PLAN,	2.10	1,102.50

**Founded 1850**

**CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP**

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.  
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5851592  
November 27, 2017  
Page 5

		DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND LIQUIDATION ANALYSIS		
10/06/17	BLP B150	CORRESPONDENCE WITH CREDITORS RE QUESTIONS ON CLAIMS BAR DATE	.20	105.00
10/06/17	BLP B150	PREPARE EMAIL TO COMMITTEE RE PLAN PROCESS	.20	105.00
10/06/17	BLP B150	DISCUSSION WITH DEBTOR COUNSEL RE CHANGES REQUESTED TO PLAN DOCUMENTS	.20	105.00
10/07/17	BLP B150	EMAIL TO COMMITTEE RE BY-LAWS, PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	.30	157.50
10/10/17	BLP B150	FIELD CREDITOR QUESTIONS RE CLAIM PROCESS	.30	157.50
10/10/17	BLP B150	REVIEW MOTION RE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT, PROCEDURES AND PROPOSED NOTICES	.80	420.00
10/11/17	BLP B150	EMAIL TO COMMITTEE RE BAR DATE, PLAN, STATUS CALL	.20	105.00
10/12/17	BLP B150	RESPOND TO SEVERAL CREDITOR INQUIRIES RE CLAIMS, BAR DATE, FILING LOGISTICS	.50	262.50
10/13/17	BLP B150	EMAIL TO COMMITTEE RE PLAN ISSUES AND CALL TO GO OVER SAME	.20	105.00
10/16/17	BLP B150	EMAILS WITH COMMITTEE MEMBERS RE CALL TO DISCUSS PLAN AND DISCUSSION WITH FINANCIAL ADVISORS RE PLAN AND STATUS OF CASE	.40	210.00
10/17/17	BLP B150	CONFERENCE CALL WITH COMMITTEE RE PLAN ISSUES	.50	262.50
10/24/17	BLP B150	CORRESPONDENCE WITH COMMITTEE MEMBER RE PLAN PROCESS	.10	52.50
10/31/17	BLP B150	EMAILS WITH COMMITTEE AND FINANCIAL ADVISORS RE PLAN ISSUES, INCREASE IN PAYMENT TO GUCCS, CLAIMS RECONCILIATIONS	.40	210.00
		SUB TOTAL TIME		4,252.50

FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS

**Founded 1850**

BROOKLYN

LONG ISLAND

MANHATTAN

WASHINGTON, D.C.

ALBANY

NEW JERSEY

**CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP**

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.  
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5851592  
November 27, 2017  
Page 6

## B160 FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS

10/02/17	NS	B160	FINALIZE MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION OF CULLEN AND DYKMAN RETENTION ORDER AND COORDINATE WITH K. LAFIURA RE: FILING AND SERVICE OF SAME	.30	180.00
10/02/17	KL	B160	REVIEW, ORGANIZE AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION FOR RETENTION OF CULLEN AND DYKMAN	.80	120.00
10/02/17	KL	B160	TEND TO SERVICE OF MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION FOR RETENTION OF CULLEN AND DYKMAN	.30	45.00
10/02/17	KL	B160	PREPARE CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE RE: MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION	.50	75.00
10/02/17	KL	B160	ELECTRONICALLY FILE CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE RE: MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION	.50	75.00
10/02/17	KL	B160	BEGIN REVISIONS TO TIME ENTRIES FOR FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	.90	135.00
10/03/17	NS	B160	CALL WITH K. LAFIURA RE: FEE APPLICATION	.10	60.00
10/04/17	NS	B160	REVIEW AND REVISE FIRST MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT AND TIME ENTRIES	2.80	1,680.00
10/05/17	KL	B160	REVIEW, REVISE, ORGANIZE AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE CULLEN AND DYKMAN LLP'S AUGUST 2017 MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	1.00	150.00
10/05/17	KL	B160	ORGANIZE AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE RE: CULLEN AND DYKMAN LLP'S AUGUST 2017 MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	.50	75.00
10/05/17	KL	B160	TEND TO SERVICE OF CULLEN AND DYKMAN LLP'S AUGUST 2017 MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	.30	45.00
10/09/17	BLP	B160	PREPARE CERTIFICATE OF COUNSEL RE RECONSIDERATION MOTION	.30	157.50
10/19/17	KL	B160	REVIEW LOCAL RULES RE: OBJECTION	.60	90.00

**Founded 1850**

**CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP**

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.  
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5851592  
November 27, 2017  
Page 7

10/20/17	KL	B160	DEADLINE FOR FEE APPLICATIONS PREPARE SEPTEMBER MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	1.00	150.00
10/20/17	KL	B160	PREPARE ORDER RE: SECOND MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	.50	75.00
10/20/17	KL	B160	PREPARE NOTICE RE: SECOND MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	.40	60.00
10/23/17	KL	B160	REVISE SEPTEMBER MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	.30	45.00
10/23/17	KL	B160	REVISE ORDER RE: SEPTEMBER MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	.20	30.00
10/23/17	KL	B160	PREPARE NOTICE RE: SEPTEMBER MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	.40	60.00
10/27/17	KL	B160	CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION RE: FIRST REQUEST FOR MONTHLY COMPENSATION	.60	90.00
10/27/17	KL	B160	EMAIL TO TEAM RE: CNO RE: FIRST MONTHLY REQUEST FOR FEES	.20	30.00
10/27/17	KL	B160	EMAIL TO TEAM RE: CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION TO FIRST REQUEST FOR FEES	.20	30.00
SUB TOTAL TIME					3,457.50

## ASSUMPTION/REJECTION OF LEASES &amp; CONTRAC

## B185 ASSUMPTION/REJECTION OF LEASES &amp; CONTRAC

10/02/17	BLP	B185	PREPARE RESPONSE TO MOTION TO ASSUME HENRY STREET LEASES	2.90	1,522.50
10/02/17	BLP	B185	REVIEW REVISIONS TO HENRY STREET ASSUMPTION	.40	210.00
10/02/17	NS	B185	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH J. TEELE AND B. POLLACK RE: LEASE ASSUMPTION MOTION	.30	180.00
10/02/17	TP	B185	STRATEGY CONFERENCE REGARDING REPLY TO MOTION TO ASSUME UNEXPIRED LEASE	.20	77.00
10/02/17	AC	B185	SHEPARDIZE KLEIN SLEEP PRODUCTS (2D CIR CASE) AND SEARCHED FOR 3D	2.30	529.00

**Founded 1850**

**CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP**

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.  
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5851592  
November 27, 2017  
Page 8

		CIR CASES RE: REJECTION OF AN ASSUMED LEASE RESULTING IN ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM		
10/03/17	BLP	B185	FINALIZE HENRY STREET OBJECTION	.40 210.00
10/03/17	BLP	B185	REVIEW MOTION TO EXTEND TIME TO ASSUME/REJECT AND CHART OUT PENDING MOTIONS	.50 262.50
10/03/17	NS	B185	REVIEW AND FINALIZE RESPONSE TO MOTION TO ASSUME HENRY AVENUE LEASE	.70 420.00
10/17/17	BLP	B185	CONFERENCES AND EMAILS RE HENRY AVENUE ASSUMPTION ISSUES	.20 105.00
10/17/17	BLP	B185	CONFERENCE WITH T. POWERS RE PREPARATION FOR HEARING ON ASSUMPTION MOTION, BACKGROUND	.30 157.50
10/17/17	TP	B185	ANALYSIS OF PLEADINGS FILED IN CONNECTION WITH DEBTOR'S MOTION TO ASSUME UNEXPIRED LEASES AND CASE LAW CITED THEREIN	1.30 500.50
10/17/17	TP	B185	STRATEGY CONFERENCE RE: DEBTOR'S MOTION TO ASSUME UNEXPIRED LEASE	.30 115.50
		SUB TOTAL TIME		4,289.50
		OTHER CONTESTED MATTERS(EX ASSUMP/REJECT B190 OTHER CONTESTED MATTERS(EX ASSUMP/REJECT		
10/04/17	BLP	B190	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND HEARINGS IN CASE RE CEO SALARY	2.40 1,260.00
10/04/17	BLP	B190	CONFERENCE WITH S. TEELE RE OUTCOME OF HEARING ON COMPENSATION, RETENTION ISSUES RAISED BY COURT	.20 105.00
10/16/17	BLP	B190	DISCUSSION WITH DEBTORS COUNSEL RE STAY STIPULATIONS, ASSUMPTION MOTION, STATUS	.20 105.00
		SUB TOTAL TIME		1,470.00

**Founded 1850**



**CULLENandDYKMANLLP**

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.  
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5851592  
November 27, 2017  
Page 9

## CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION AND OBJECTIONS

## B310 CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION AND OBJECTIONS

10/13/17	BLP	B310	CORRESPONDENCE WITH DEBTOR COUNSEL RE SETTLEMENT WITH LIST ASSOC. RE ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM	.40	210.00
10/13/17	BLP	B310	CONFERENCE WITH S. TEELE RE LIST ASSOC. ISSUES	.20	105.00
10/18/17	BLP	B310	DISCUSSION WITH COUNSEL RE REVIEW OF CLAIMS FILED IN CASE BY SUBCONTRACTORS	.20	105.00
10/19/17	BLP	B310	REVIEW CLAIMS REGISTERS	.30	157.50
10/24/17	BLP	B310	PREPARE RESPONSE TO LIST ASSOC. MOTION RE ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM	.40	210.00
10/24/17	BLP	B310	REVIEW MOTION FOR PAYMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM BY HENRY AVE LANDLORD	.20	105.00
10/24/17	BLP	B310	REVIEW PROPOSED STIPULATION WITH LIST ASSOC. AND DISCUSSION WITH DEBTOR COUNSEL RE SAME	.30	157.50
10/25/17	BLP	B310	SEVERAL EMAILS AND DISCUSSIONS RE CLAIMS RECONCILIATION PROCESS	.40	210.00
10/26/17	BLP	B310	CONFERENCE RE S. TEELE RE CLAIMS ISSUES AND PROCESS	.20	105.00
10/31/17	BLP	B310	PREPARE FOR HEARING ON LIST ASSOC MOTION	.50	262.50
10/31/17	BLP	B310	DISCUSSION WITH S. BOSE RE SUBCONTRACTOR CLAIMS AND PAYMENTS	.20	105.00
SUB TOTAL TIME					1,732.50

## PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT(INCL BUSIN

## B320 PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT(INCL BUSIN

10/17/17	BLP	B320	DISCUSSIONS WITH FINANCIAL ADVISORS AND DEBTOR COUNSEL RE CHANGES REQUESTED BY COMMITTEE RE PLAN REGARDING DISTRIBUTIONS TO GUCCS	.30	157.50
----------	-----	------	---	-----	--------

**Founded 1850**

**CULLENandDYKMANLLP**

---

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.  
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5851592  
November 27, 2017  
Page 10

10/24/17	BLP	B320	DISCUSSION WITH DEBTOR COUNSEL RE PLAN CHANGES REQUESTED	.10	52.50
10/24/17	BLP	B320	EMAILS RE COMMITTEE REQUESTS RE PLAN DISTRIBUTIONS AND CLAIMS RECONCILIATIONS PROCESS	.20	105.00
SUB TOTAL TIME					315.00
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES					18,029.50
LESS DISCOUNT					-3,605.90
NET PROFESSIONAL SERVICES					14,423.60

***Founded 1850***