

EXHIBIT A

Summary of Compensation by Project Category for the Period
November 1, 2017 through November 30, 2017

Task Code	Description	Hours	Fees
B110	Case Administration	3.90	585.00
B140	Stay Relief/Adequate Protection Proceedings	.10	52.50
B150	Meetings of and Communications with Creditors	4.20	2,287.50
B160	Fee/Employment Applications	11.90	2,265.00
B310	Claims Administration And Objections	.30	157.50
B320	Plan And Disclosure Statement	14.40	7,867.50
B410	General Bankruptcy Advice	.20	120.00
B430A	Court Hearings	6.60	3,465.00
	Total Fees		\$16,800.00
	Less 20% Discount		-\$3,360.00
	Discounted Total		\$13,440.00

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

The Legal Center
 One Riverfront Plaza
 Newark, New Jersey 07102
 Telephone (973) 849-0220 Facsimile (973)849-2020

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.

Control # 5887980
 December 20, 2017
 Page 2

For Professional Services Rendered Through November 30, 2017 regarding:

Client Number - 35008 - 000 GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.

Matter Number - 00001 IN RE WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al
 REPRESENT OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF
 UNSECURED CREDITORS IN CHAPTER 11
 PROCEEDING
 Potential Client E .00

DATE	INIT	TASK ACTVY	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
CASE ADMINISTRATION					
B110 CASE ADMINISTRATION					
11/06/17	KL	B110	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES	.50	75.00
11/06/17	KL	B110	UPDATE CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.50	75.00
11/06/17	KL	B110	EMAIL TO TEAM RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.20	30.00
11/15/17	KL	B110	REVIEW DOCKET RE: CRITICAL DATES	.60	90.00
11/15/17	KL	B110	UPDATE CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.80	120.00
11/15/17	KL	B110	EMAIL TO TEAM RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.10	15.00
11/15/17	KL	B110	TEND TO CALENDARING CRITICAL DATES IN TEAM CALENDAR	.30	45.00
11/28/17	KL	B110	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.40	60.00
11/28/17	KL	B110	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES	.50	75.00
SUB TOTAL TIME					585.00

Founded 1850

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5887980
December 20, 2017
Page 3

RELIEF FR STAY/ADEQUATE PROTECTION PRCED
B140 STAY RELIEF/ADEQUATE PROTECTION PROC.

11/27/17	BLP	B140	EMAILS WITH DEBTORS COUNSEL RE ADDITIONAL VACATE STAY STIPULATION	.10	52.50
SUB TOTAL TIME					52.50

MEETINGS OF & COMMUNICATIONS W/ CREDITOR
B150 MEETINGS OF & COMMUNICATIONS W/CREDITORS

11/01/17	BLP	B150	DISCUSSIONS AND EMAILS WITH COMMITTEE AS A WHOLE AND VARIOUS MEMBERS RE PLAN ISSUES	2.10	1,102.50
11/01/17	SJT	B150	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH THE COMMITTEE RE: PLAN STATUS AND CLAIMS RECONCILIATION	1.10	660.00
11/09/17	BLP	B150	LENGTHY RESPONSE TO COMMITTEE QUESTIONS RE PLAN AND OTHER ISSUES	.40	210.00
11/13/17	BLP	B150	FINALIZE AND SEND LENGTHY EMAIL RE COMMITTEE PLAN ISSUES, CONCERNS	.20	105.00
11/22/17	BLP	B150	EMAILS WITH COMMITTEE MEMBER RE PLAN QUESTION	.20	105.00
11/29/17	BLP	B150	DISCUSSION WITH S. LACKS (CREDITOR) RE QUESTIONS ON CLAIMS, TIMING OF OBJECTIONS, ETC.	.20	105.00
SUB TOTAL TIME					2,287.50

FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS
B160 FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS

11/02/17	BLP	B160	DISCUSSION WITH J. CIANCULLI RE RECONSIDERATION OF RETENTION APPROVAL, STATUS OF CASE	.20	105.00
11/06/17	KL	B160	ORGANIZE AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION RE: CULLEN AND DYKMAN'S FIRST MONTHLY	.40	60.00

Founded 1850

BROOKLYN

LONG ISLAND

MANHATTAN

WASHINGTON, D.C.

ALBANY

NEW JERSEY

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5887980
December 20, 2017
Page 4

		FEE APPLICATION		
11/06/17	KL	B160	EMAIL TO TEAM RE: FILED	.20 30.00
			CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION	
11/14/17	NS	B160	REVIEW AND REVISE SEPTEMBER AND	.70 420.00
			OCTOBER INVOICES TO ENSURE	
			COMPLIANCE WITH US TRUSTEE	
			GUIDELINES	
11/20/17	KL	B160	PREPARE NOTICE RE: OCTOBER 2017	.30 45.00
			MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	
11/20/17	KL	B160	PREPARE ORDER RE: OCTOBER 2017	.20 30.00
			MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	
11/20/17	KL	B160	PREPARE OCTOBER 2017 MONTHLY FEE	.40 60.00
			APPLICATION	
11/21/17	NS	B160	REVIEW REVISED TIME ENTRIES TO	.20 120.00
			ENSURE COMPLIANCE WITH UST	
			GUIDELINES	
11/29/17	KL	B160	PREPARATION OF SECOND MONTHLY	3.60 540.00
			(SEPTEMBER 2017) FEE APPLICATION	
			WITH EXHIBITS	
11/29/17	KL	B160	PREPARATION OF OCTOBER MONTHLY FEE	1.50 225.00
			APPLICATION AND EXHIBITS	
11/30/17	KL	B160	EMAIL TO N. STEFANELLI AND J.	.30 45.00
			TEELE RE: SEPTEMBER MONTHLY FEE	
			APPLICATION FOR REVIEW, TOGETHER	
			WITH EXHIBITS TO SAME	
11/30/17	KL	B160	REVIEW AND REVISES SEPTEMBER	.60 90.00
			MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT AND EXHIBITS	
11/30/17	KL	B160	PREPARATION OF NOTICE RE: THIRD	.40 60.00
			MONTHLY FEE APPLICATIONS (OCTOBER	
			2017)	
11/30/17	KL	B160	PREPARATION OF ORDER RE: THIRD	.40 60.00
			MONTHLY FEE APPLICATIONS (OCTOBER	
			2017)	
11/30/17	KL	B160	PREPARATION OF APPLICATION RE:	1.40 210.00
			THIRD MONTHLY FEE APPLICATIONS	
			(OCTOBER 2017)	
11/30/17	KL	B160	PREPARATION OF EXHIBIT B RE: THIRD	.30 45.00
			MONTHLY FEE APPLICATIONS (OCTOBER	
			2017)	

Founded 1850

BROOKLYN

LONG ISLAND

MANHATTAN

WASHINGTON, D.C.

ALBANY

NEW JERSEY

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5887980
December 20, 2017
Page 5

11/30/17	KL	B160	PREPARATION OF EXHIBIT A RE: THIRD MONTHLY FEE APPLICATIONS (OCTOBER 2017)	.50	75.00
11/30/17	KL	B160	EMAIL TO TEAM RE: THIRD MONTHLY FEE APPLICATIONS (OCTOBER 2017)	.30	45.00
SUB TOTAL TIME					2,265.00

CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION AND OBJECTIONS
B310 CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION AND OBJECTIONS

11/25/17	BLP	B310	REVIEW MOTION FOR PAYMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM BY SUBCONTRACTOR AND EMAILS WITH DEBTOR COUNSEL RE SAME	.30	157.50
SUB TOTAL TIME					157.50

PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (INCL BUSIN
B320 PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

11/01/17	BLP	B320	DISCUSSION WITH CITY ATTORNEY RE PLAN PAYMENTS	.20	105.00
11/02/17	BLP	B320	DISCUSSION WITH P. HUGHES RE COMMITTEE FINAL PLAN ISSUES	.20	105.00
11/03/17	BLP	B320	DISCUSSION WITH P. HUGHES RE FINAL OPEN COMMITTEE ISSUE (.1); EMAIL TO COMMITTEE RE SAME (.2)	.30	157.50
11/04/17	BLP	B320	REVIEW 3 OBJECTIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	.80	420.00
11/07/17	BLP	B320	SEVERAL EMAILS AND DISCUSSIONS WITH DEBTORS, COMMITTEE MEMBERS, LOCAL COUNSEL RE SUPPORT OF PLAN, OPEN ISSUES, DS OBJECTIONS, HEARING	1.30	682.50
11/08/17	BLP	B320	PREPARE FOR DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING	1.50	787.50
11/08/17	BLP	B320	EMAIL TO J. TEELE RE OUTCOME OF HEARING (.2); REVIEW AMENDMENTS TO	.50	262.50

Founded 1850

BROOKLYN

LONG ISLAND

MANHATTAN

WASHINGTON, D.C.

ALBANY

NEW JERSEY

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
 35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5887980
 December 20, 2017
 Page 6

11/08/17	BLP	B320	ORDER AND EMAILS RE SAME (.3) REVIEW AND COMMENT ON SEVERAL VERSIONS OF AMENDED PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	2.40	1,260.00
11/08/17	SJT	B320	CORRESPOND WITH B. POLLACK RE: DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND PLAN	.30	180.00
11/08/17	SJT	B320	REVIEW REVISED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND PLAN ORDER	1.20	720.00
11/09/17	BLP	B320	REVIEW SEVERAL DRAFTS OF REVISED PLAN RELATED DOCUMENTS	1.20	630.00
11/09/17	BLP	B320	EMAILS AND DISCUSSIONS RE PLAN REVISIONS	.30	157.50
11/09/17	SJT	B320	CORRESPONDENCE FROM DEBTOR'S COUNSEL RE: DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	.20	120.00
11/09/17	SJT	B320	REVIEW ADDITIONAL REVISIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND PLAN	.90	540.00
11/16/17	BLP	B320	PREPARE PLAN SUPPORT LETTER	.60	315.00
11/17/17	BLP	B320	REVIEW PLAN SUPPORT LETTER AND EMAILS WITH COMMITTEE RE SAME	.30	157.50
11/20/17	BLP	B320	REVISE AND SEND PLAN SUPPORT LETTER	.20	105.00
11/27/17	BLP	B320	DISCUSSION WITH LOCAL COUNSEL RE STATUS WITH PLAN, M&T (.2); EMAILS WITH DEBTORS COUNSEL RE SAME (.1)	.30	157.50
11/29/17	BLP	B320	REVIEW OBJECTION TO CONFIRMATION	.20	105.00
11/04/18	SJT	B320	REVIEW THREE OBJECTIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	.60	360.00
11/08/18	SJT	B320	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. POLLACK RE: OUTCOME OF HEARING	.10	60.00
11/08/18	SJT	B320	REVIEW AMENDMENTS TO ORDER AND EMAILS RE: SAME	.20	120.00
11/16/18	SJT	B320	REVIEW PLAN SUPPORT LETTER	.40	240.00
11/29/18	SJT	B320	REVIEW OBJECTION TO CONFIRMATION	.20	120.00
SUB TOTAL TIME					7,867.50

GENERAL BANKRUPTCY ADVICE/OPINIONS
 B410 GENERAL BANKRUPTCY ADVICE

Founded 1850

BROOKLYN

LONG ISLAND

MANHATTAN

WASHINGTON, D.C.

ALBANY

NEW JERSEY

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5887980
December 20, 2017
Page 7

11/08/17	SJT B410	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. POLLACK RE: TODAY'S HEARING	.20	120.00
SUB TOTAL TIME				120.00
COURT HEARINGS				
B430A COURT HEARINGS				
11/01/17	BLP B430A	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND HEARINGS IN CASE- VARIOUS MOTIONS INCLUDING LIST ASSOCIATES	3.80	1,995.00
11/08/17	BLP B430A	ATTEND HEARING ON DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	2.80	1,470.00
SUB TOTAL TIME				3,465.00
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES				16,800.00
LESS DISCOUNT				-3,360.00
NET PROFESSIONAL SERVICES				13,440.00

Founded 1850

BROOKLYN

LONG ISLAND

MANHATTAN

WASHINGTON, D.C.

ALBANY

NEW JERSEY