

# Exhibit A

**WEIR & PARTNERS LLP**

SUITE 500  
THE WIDENER BUILDING  
1339 CHESTNUT STREET  
PHILADELPHIA, PA 19107

(215) 665-8181  
FAX (215) 665-8464

Federal Tax I.D. 23-2830271

January 19, 2018

CULLEN & DYKMAN LLP  
S. JASON TEELE, ESQ/BONNIE POLLACK, ESQ/NICOLE STEFANELLI, ESQ.  
ONE RIVERFRONT PLAZA  
NEWARK, NJ 07102

Re: 6006 0001

WORDSWORTH ACADEMY BANKRUPTCY

Bill Number: 88912579

Professional Services through January 18, 2018

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Rate	Description	Amount
JSC	07/26/2017	3.50	460.00	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND HEARINGS ON DIP FINANCING AND RELATED MATTERS AND MEETING WITH CO COUNSEL TO DISCUSS STATUS	\$1,610.00
JSC	07/27/2017	0.20	460.00	REVIEW EMAILS WITH DEBTOR COUNSEL REGARDING CONFLICT ISSUES	\$92.00
JSC	07/27/2017	0.30	460.00	REVIEW ORDERS ENTERED ON FIRST DAY MOTIONS	\$138.00
JSC	07/27/2017	1.20	460.00	CONDUCT INVESTIGATION RELATING TO EXTENT, PRIORITY AND VALIDITY OF M&T LIENS	\$552.00
JSC	07/28/2017	2.10	460.00	PREPARE ENGAGEMENT APPLICATION	\$966.00
JSC	07/28/2017	0.60	460.00	ANALYZE M&T MORTGAGE AND UCC-1 FILINGS	\$276.00
JSC	07/28/2017	0.10	460.00	EMAIL TO COUNSEL TO M&T REQUESTING LOAN DOCUMENTS AND SECURITY AGREEMENT	\$46.00
JSC	07/28/2017	1.00	460.00	ATTEND TO ENGAGEMENT APPLICATIONS FOR CULLEN AND FINANCIAL ADVISORS	\$460.00
JSC	07/28/2017	0.20	460.00	EMAILS WITH COUNSEL TO DEBTORS AND M&T REQUESTING EXTENSION OF TIME TO OBJECT TO USE OF CASH	\$92.00

6006	0001									2
LNS	07/31/2017	0.70	300.00	RESEARCH RE: 552 AND EFFECT ON UNPERFECTED SECURITY AGREEMENT					\$210.00	
LNS	07/31/2017	0.10	300.00	CONFER WITH JSC RE: 552 AND EFFECT ON UNPERFECTED SECURITY AGREEMENT					\$30.00	
JSC	08/01/2017	3.20	460.00	REVIEW MOTION AND PROPOSED ORDER REGARDING CASH COLLATERAL					\$1,472.00	
JSC	08/01/2017	0.80	460.00	CALL WITH AARON TO DISCUSS CASH COLLATERAL					\$368.00	
JSC	08/01/2017	0.70	460.00	FINALIZE ENGAGEMENT APPLICATIONS					\$322.00	
KEA	08/02/2017	2.00	480.00	REVIEW OF BANK'S CASH COLLATERAL ORDER AND DRAFT REVISED ORDER					\$960.00	
JSC	08/02/2017	2.00	460.00	CALL WITH AARON AND SCHWIMMER TO DISCUSS PROPOSED CASH COLLATERAL ORDER					\$920.00	
JSC	08/02/2017	1.30	460.00	LOAN DOCUMENT REVIEW FOR M&T					\$598.00	
LNS	08/02/2017	2.00	300.00	REVIEW CASH COLLATERAL ORDER AND CONFER WITH KEA AND JSC RE: SUGGESTED CHANGES					\$600.00	
LNS	08/02/2017	0.50	300.00	REVIEW LOAN DOCUMENTS BETWEEN DEBTORS AND M&T BANK					\$150.00	
KEA	08/03/2017	0.40	480.00	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT OCC LIMITED OBJECTION TO MOTION FOR CASH COLLATERAL					\$192.00	
KEA	08/03/2017	0.20	480.00	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON BANK'S COUNSEL'S ISSUES REGARDING CASH COLLATERAL ORDER PROPOSED BY OCC					\$96.00	
KEA	08/03/2017	0.20	480.00	CONFER WITH LS RE ISSUES FOR OBJECTION TO BANK'S PROPOSED CASH COLLATERAL O					\$96.00	
JSC	08/03/2017	0.60	460.00	PREPARE OBJECTION TO CASH COLLATERAL ORDER					\$276.00	
JSC	08/03/2017	0.70	460.00	CALLS WITH COUNSEL TO BANK TO DISCUSS CASH COLLATERAL ORDER					\$322.00	
JSC	08/03/2017	0.30	460.00	REVIEW UST OBJECTION TO ENGAGEMENT APPLICATION AND EMAIL TO UST					\$138.00	
JSC	08/03/2017	0.50	460.00	CALLS AND EMAILS WITH COUNSEL TO M&T REGARDING CASH COLLATERAL					\$230.00	
LNS	08/03/2017	0.10	300.00	REVIEW OBJECTION TO COMMITTEE COUNSEL'S APPLICATION					\$30.00	
LNS	08/03/2017	0.60	300.00	REVIEW REVISED CASH COLLATERAL ORDER					\$180.00	
LNS	08/03/2017	0.60	300.00	LOAN DOCUMENT REVIEW					\$180.00	
LNS	08/03/2017	0.80	300.00	REVIEW LATEST DRAFT OF CASH COLLATERAL ORDER AND PHONE CALL WITH J. CIANCIULLI RE: REVISED CASH					\$240.00	

6006	0001								3
								COLLATERAL AGREEMENT	
LNS	08/03/2017	2.20	300.00					PHONE CALL TO JSC (.3); DRAFT LIMITED CASH COLLATERAL OBJECTION (1.7); CONFER WITH KEA (.2)	\$660.00
JSC	08/04/2017	0.50	460.00					EMAILS WITH VARIOUS COUNSEL REGARDING STATUS OF CASH COLLATERAL ORDER	\$230.00
JSC	08/04/2017	0.40	460.00					CONTINUED NEGOTIATION OF CASH COLLATERAL ORDER	\$184.00
JSC	08/04/2017	0.30	460.00					REVIEW DEBTOR COMMENTS TO CASH COLLATERAL ORDER	\$138.00
JSC	08/07/2017	0.80	460.00					PREPARE FOR HEARING ON CASH COLLATERAL	\$368.00
JSC	08/07/2017	1.30	460.00					REVIEW BANKRUPTCY SCHEDULES	\$598.00
JSC	08/07/2017	1.70	460.00					PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND HEARING ON CASH COLLATERAL	\$782.00
JSC	08/07/2017	2.10	460.00					PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING OF CREDITORS	\$966.00
JSC	08/07/2017	0.20	460.00					CALL WITH STEELE TO DISCUSS MEETING OF CREDITORS	\$92.00
JSC	08/08/2017	0.20	460.00					CALL WITH STEELE TO DISCUSS REPORT TO COMMITTEE ON CASH COLLATERAL AND MEETING WITH DEBTORS AND ENGAGEMENT OBJECTION	\$92.00
JSC	08/08/2017	0.90	460.00					DRAFT STATUS REPORT TO COMMITTEE MEMBERS RELATING TO CASH COLLATERAL HEARING AND MEETING OF CREDITORS	\$414.00
JSC	08/08/2017	0.40	460.00					FINALIZE STATUS REPORT TO COMMITTEE MEMBERS	\$184.00
JSC	08/08/2017	0.10	460.00					REVIEW ORDER GRANTING EXPEDITED CONSIDRATION OF HEALTHCARE OMBUDSMAN MOTION	\$46.00
JSC	08/09/2017	0.20	460.00					EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH COMMITTEE MEMBERS REGARDING STATUS	\$92.00
JSC	08/09/2017	1.00	460.00					PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH COMMITTEE TO PROVIDE STATUS ON CASH COLLATERAL AND MEETING OF CREDITORS AND DIP FINANCING	\$460.00
LNS	08/10/2017	0.30	300.00					REVIEW LOCAL RULES ON NOTICES OF COMPENSATION AND EMAIL JSC RE: SAME	\$90.00
JSC	08/14/2017	0.30	460.00					REVIEW LOCAL RULE REGARDING OFFICER COMPENSATION AND EMAIL TO COMMITTEE COUNSEL	\$138.00
JSC	08/14/2017	0.30	460.00					REVIEW DRAFT JOINDER IN HEALTHCARE	\$138.00

6006	0001						
					OMBUDSMAN AND EMAIL TO COUNSEL TO COMMITTEE		
JSC	08/15/2017	0.30	460.00		ATTEND TO ISSUES WITH ENGAGEMENT APPLICATIONS AND STATUS		\$138.00
JSC	08/15/2017	0.20	460.00		EMAILS WITH COUNSEL REGARDING ENGAGEMENT APPLICATIONS		\$92.00
JSC	08/16/2017	0.20	460.00		CALL WITH POLLACK TO DISCUSS STATUS OF ENGAGEMENT APPLICATIONS		\$92.00
JSC	08/16/2017	0.40	460.00		ATTEND TO CNO FOR ENGAGEMENT APPLICATIONS AND EMAILS TO POLLACK		\$184.00
JSC	08/16/2017	0.10	460.00		REVIEW ORDER GRANTING DEBTOR MOTION ON HEALTHCARE OMBUDSMAN		\$46.00
JSC	08/22/2017	0.10	460.00		CALL WITH COURT REGARDING PROPOSED ORDERS ON ENGAGEMENT APPLICATIONS		\$46.00
JSC	08/29/2017	0.50	460.00		CALL WITH STEEL TO DISCUSS DIP HEARING AND ENGAGEMENT APPLICATIONS		\$230.00
JSC	08/30/2017	1.60	460.00		PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND HEARING ON OBJECTION TO ENGAGEMENT APPLICATION		\$736.00
JSC	09/01/2017	0.30	460.00		PREPARE NOTICE OF HEARING ON ENGAGEMENT APPLICATIONS		\$138.00
JSC	09/05/2017	0.20	460.00		REVIEW NOTICE OF BAR DATE AND PROVIDE COPY TO CO-COUNSEL		\$92.00
JSC	09/13/2017	0.20	460.00		REVIEW OBJECTION OF LACKS TO MOTION TO INCREASE CEO SALARY		\$92.00
JSC	09/19/2017	0.30	460.00		PREPARE FOR HEARING ON DIP FINANCING AND ENGAGEMENT APPLICATIONS		\$138.00
JSC	09/19/2017	0.80	460.00		RESEARCH REGARDING STANDARD FOR NUNC PRO TUNC RELIEF AND PREPARE FOR HEARING		\$368.00
JSC	09/19/2017	0.20	460.00		CALL WITH COUNSEL TO COMMITTEE REGARDING ENGAGEMENT APPLICATIONS		\$92.00
LNS	09/19/2017	0.20	300.00		PREPARE FOR HEARING ON NUNC PRO TUNC RELIEF (WORDSWORHT BANKRUPTCY)		\$60.00
JSC	09/20/2017	2.20	460.00		PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND HEARING ON ENGAGEMENT APPLICATION		\$1,012.00
JSC	09/26/2017	0.40	460.00		REVIEW PLAN OF REORGANIZATION RELATING TO TREATMENT OF SECURED CREDITOR		\$184.00
JSC	10/02/2017	1.70	460.00		REVIEW BANK DOCUMENTATION		\$782.00
JSC	11/02/2017	1.20	460.00		ANALYZE PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT		\$552.00
JSC	11/06/2017	0.80	460.00		REVIEW M&T OBJECTION TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT		\$368.00

Case No.	Date	Time	Rate	Description	Amount
6006	0001				5
JSC	11/07/2017	3.50	460.00	PREPARE FOR DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING IN RELATION TO OBJECTION OF M&T BANK AND CLAIMS OF UNSECURED CLAIMS AS TO CERTAIN DEBTORS	\$1,610.00
JSC	11/07/2017	0.30	460.00	CALL WITH COUNSEL TO BANK TO DISCUSS ISSUES WITH OBJECTION TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	\$138.00
KEA	11/08/2017	0.30	480.00	TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH JEFF C RE M&T BANK OBJECTION TO DISCLOSURER STATEMENT	\$144.00
JSC	11/08/2017	3.00	460.00	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND HEARING ON DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	\$1,380.00
JSC	11/08/2017	0.60	460.00	REVIEW PROPOSED FORM OF DISCLOSURE STATEMETN ORDER, BALLOTS AND CONFIRMATION HEARING NOTICE	\$276.00
JSC	11/08/2017	1.20	460.00	REVIEW REVISED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND PLAN AND EMAILS WITH COUNSEL	\$552.00
KEA	11/09/2017	0.40	480.00	DISCUSS DISCLOSURE AND PLAN TREATMENT ALTERATIVES FOR M&T WITH JEFF C	\$192.00
JSC	11/09/2017	0.40	460.00	REVIEW VARIOUS EMAILS FROM COUNSEL RELATING TO PROPOSED AMENDED PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	\$184.00
JSC	11/09/2017	0.30	460.00	EMAILS WITH POLLACK RELATING TO AMENDED PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	\$138.00
JSC	11/09/2017	0.20	460.00	REVIEW STATUS OF POTENTIAL CALL WITH JUDGE AND CALL WITH AARONSON REGARDING DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND CLAIM OBJECTION ISSUES	\$92.00
JSC	11/09/2017	0.40	460.00	CONTINUE NEGOTIATIONS RELATING TO LANGUAGE IN DISCLOSURE STATEMENT RELATING TO M&T UNSECURED CLAIM AND TREATMENT	\$184.00
JSC	11/09/2017	0.30	460.00	EMAILS WITH COUNSEL FOR DEBTOR AND INTERESTED PARTIES REGARDING LANGUAGE OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	\$138.00
JSC	11/09/2017	0.80	460.00	RESEARCH REGARDING TREATMENT OF CREDITOR CLAIM AS SECURED AND/OR UNSECURED	\$368.00
JSC	11/10/2017	0.40	460.00	REVIEW ORDER APPROVING DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND RELATED PROCEDURES AND DEADLINES	\$184.00
BRG	11/13/2017	1.60	460.00	REVIEW DISCLOSURE STATEMENT RE TREATMENT OF M&T; CONSOLIDATION ORDER; DOCKET; OBJECTION TO PLAN	\$736.00

6006	0001					6
JSC	11/13/2017	0.60	460.00	RESEARCH REGARDING TREATMENT OF BANK CLAIMS IN JOINT PLAN		\$276.00
JSC	11/22/2017	0.10	460.00	EMAIL TO POLLACK TO DISCUSS PLAN/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND VOTING ISSUES		\$46.00
JSC	11/27/2017	0.20	460.00	CALL WITH POLLACK TO DISCUSS STATUS AND PLAN CONFIRMATION ISSUES		\$92.00
BRG	11/28/2017	1.90	460.00	REVIEW PLAN TREATMENT, CLASSIFICATION, VALUATION ISSUES RE PLAN		\$874.00
JSC	11/29/2017	0.30	460.00	REVIEW OBJECTION TO PLAN CONFIRMATION		\$138.00
JSC	12/08/2017	0.20	460.00	CALL TO COUNSEL TO BANK AND COUNSEL TO DEBTOR TO INQUIRE REGARDING STATUS OF SETTLEMENT		\$92.00
JSC	12/08/2017	0.40	460.00	REVIEW OBJECTION TO PLAN CONFIRMATION FILED BY LANDLORD		\$184.00
JSC	12/11/2017	0.40	460.00	REVIEW OBJECTION TO PLAN OF CONFIRMATION FROM DELTA		\$184.00
JSC	12/12/2017	1.30	460.00	ANALYZE PLAN, DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND REVISIONS REQUESTED BY PARTIES IN INTEREST		\$598.00
JSC	12/12/2017	2.10	460.00	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING WITH PARTIES IN INTEREST TO FINALIZE TERMS OF AND CONCERNS RELATED TO PLAN		\$966.00
JSC	12/18/2017	2.80	460.00	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFIRMATION HEARING		\$1,288.00
JSC	12/18/2017	0.20	460.00	REVIEW ORDER CONFIRMING PLAN		\$92.00
TLM	01/11/2018	3.30	175.00	RESEARCH EDPA PROCEDURE/FORMS AND LOCAL RULES ON FIRST AND FINAL APPLICATION FOR FEES. SPOKE WITH CONTROLLER AND OBTAINED PRE-BILLS WITH FEES AND EXPENSES. BEGAN PREPARING APPLICATION		\$577.50
TLM	01/12/2018	1.00	175.00	CONTINUED PREPARING FIRST AND FINAL APPLICATION FOR FEES AND EXPENSES		\$175.00
TLM	01/16/2018	2.50	175.00	COMPLETED PREPARATION OF FIRST AND FINAL APPLICATION FOR FEES AND EXPENSES		\$437.50
JSC	01/17/2018	2.10	520.00	PREPARE FEE APPLICATION		\$1,092.00
TLM	01/17/2018	2.40	175.00	EDITS AND CHANGES TO DRAFT OF APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION PER ATTORNEY INSTRUCTION		\$420.00
						\$36,804.00

BRG 3.50 hrs at 460.00 /hour \$1,610.00

6006 0001

7

JSC	61.70 hrs at	460.00 /hour	\$28,382.00
JSC	2.10 hrs at	520.00 /hour	\$1,092.00
KEA	3.50 hrs at	480.00 /hour	\$1,680.00
LNS	8.10 hrs at	300.00 /hour	\$2,430.00
TLM	9.20 hrs at	175.00 /hour	\$1,610.00

Disbursements through January 18, 2018

08/25/2017	AMEX; PA BCCO Corporation; UCC Images	\$6.00
08/25/2017	AMEX; Montgomery County Recorder; E-Certification Fee	\$11.50
09/07/2017	Jeffrey S. Cianciulli; Local Travel	\$5.44
09/25/2017	Jeffrey S. Cianciulli; Local Travel	\$6.24
01/18/2018	PACER Online Research	\$155.30
01/18/2018	Printing & Duplication	\$581.75
01/18/2018	Westlaw OnLine Research	\$28.89
	Total Disbursements	\$795.12

Total Services	\$36,804.00
Total Disbursements	\$795.12
Total Services and Disbursements	\$37,599.12
Balance Due	\$37,599.12