

EXHIBIT A

Summary of Compensation by Project Category for the Period
 July 17, 2017 through November 30, 2017

Task Code	Description	Hours	Fees
B110	Case Administration	82.20	\$26,815.00
B120	Asset Analysis and Recovery	.90	\$540.00
B140	Stay Relief/Adequate Protection Proceedings	.80	\$420.00
B150	Meetings of and Communications with Creditors	28.90	\$15,930.00
B160	Fee/Employment Applications	129.20	\$41,676.50
B165	Fee/Employment Applications – Others	.50	\$262.50
B185	Assumption/Rejection of Leases/Contracts	11.30	\$5,077.00
B190	Other Contested Matters	5.50	\$5,955.00
B210	Business Operations	7.40	\$4,140.00
B230	Financing/Cash Collections	75.10	\$41,827.50
B310	Claims Administration And Objections	3.80	\$1,995.00
B320	Plan And Disclosure Statement	23.90	\$12,585.00
B410	General Bankruptcy Advice	.20	\$120.00
B430A	Court Hearings	11.80	\$6,435.00
B440	Statements and Schedules	.90	\$472.50
	Total Fees		\$161,251.00
	Less 20% Discount		\$32,250.20
	Discounted Total		\$129,000.80

CULLENandDYKMANLLP

The Legal Center
 One Riverfront Plaza
 Newark, New Jersey 07102
 Telephone (973) 849-0220 Facsimile (973)849-2020

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.

Control # 5886404

October 5, 2017

Page 2

For Professional Services Rendered Through November 30, 2017 regarding:

Client Number - 35008 - 000 GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.

Matter Number - 00001

IN RE WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al
 REPRESENT OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF
 UNSECURED CREDITORS IN CHAPTER 11
 PROCEEDING

Potential Client E .00

DATE	INIT	TASK	ACTVYDESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
CASE ADMINISTRATION					
B110 CASE ADMINISTRATION					
7/17/17	SJT	B110	PREPARE COMMITTEE BY-LAWS AND CONTACT LIST	2.50	1,500.00
7/17/17	SJT	B110	REVIEW DEBTOR'S FIRST DAY MOTIONS AND ORDERS	1.50	900.00
7/20/17	SJT	B110	TELEPHONE DISCUSSION WITH B. POLLACK RE: WORK STREAMS	.50	300.00
7/21/17	BLP	B110	REVIEW FILED MOTIONS AND DOCUMENTS	3.00	1,575.00
7/21/17	SJT	B110	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. POLLACK RE: LEASE ASSUMPTION, ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONALS, DEBTORS' BUDGET, AND FINANCING MOTION	.50	300.00
7/24/17	AP	B110	LEGAL RESEARCH AND CASE LAW ANALYSIS RE LEASE REJECTION ISSUE	1.90	522.50
7/25/17	BLP	B110	REVIEW LEASE ASSUMPTION ORDER AND PROVIDE COMMENTS TO SAME	.20	105.00
7/25/17	AP	B110	CONTINUE LEGAL RESEARCH RE LEASE	1.90	522.50

Founded 1850

BROOKLYN

LONG ISLAND

MANHATTAN

WASHINGTON, D.C.

ALBANY

NEW JERSEY

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5886404
October 5, 2017
Page 3

		REJECTION ISSUE. DRAFT RESEARCH MEMORANDUM TO BONNIE POLLACK RE THE SAME		
7/25/17	SJT B110	REVIEW PLEADINGS AND PREPARE FOR TOMORROW'S HEARING	1.50	900.00
7/25/17	SJT B110	REVIEW INTERNAL MEMO RE: CRITICAL DATES	.20	120.00
7/25/17	SJT B110	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. CIANCIULLI RE: TOMORROW'S HEARING AND STATUS	.50	300.00
7/27/17	BLP B110	PREPARE TASK LIST	.20	105.00
7/27/17	BLP B110	EMAIL RE PROFFER	.10	52.50
7/27/17	SJT B110	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM U.S. TRUSTEE TO COMMITTEE MEMBERS	.20	120.00
7/31/17	SJT B110	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. CIANCIULLI RE: GENERAL STATUS	.50	300.00
8/07/17	BLP B110	REVIEW DOCKET AND EMAILS RE QUESTIONS ON STATUS	.30	157.50
8/08/17	BLP B110	ATTEND MEETING WITH DEBTORS' COUNSEL AND FINANCIAL ADVISORS	3.70	1,942.50
8/08/17	SJT B110	MEETING WITH DEBTOR'S PROFESSIONALS RE: ALL ASPECTS OF CASE	3.70	2,220.00
8/15/17	BLP B110	DISCUSSION WITH J.TEELE RE WEDNESDAY HEARINGS	.20	105.00
8/15/17	BLP B110	PREPARE FOR HEARING ON HEALTH CARE BUSINESS MOTION	.40	210.00
8/15/17	BLP B110	PREPARE FOR HEARING ON OCP MOTION	.30	157.50
8/16/17	BLP B110	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND HEARINGS IN CASE	4.30	2,257.50
8/21/17	BLP B110	REVIEW DOCKET FOR RECENT FILINGS	.20	105.00
8/22/17	BLP B110	CONFERENCE RE STATUS OF ALL MATTERS	.20	105.00
8/22/17	BLP B110	SET UP BILLING CATEGORIES FOR CASE	.20	105.00
8/27/17	BLP B110	REVIEW AND CATEGORIZE JULY/AUGUST TIME	.30	157.50
8/27/17	BLP B110	CALL WITH J.TEELE/N.STEFANELLI RE STATUS OF ALL MATTERS, DIP OBJECTION	.50	262.50

Founded 1850

CULLENandDYKMANLLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5886404
October 5, 2017
Page 4

8/27/17	SJT	B110	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE W/ B.POLLACK RE: DIP OBJECTION AND PENDING MOTIONS	.50	300.00
8/29/17	KL	B110	REVIEW DOCKET RE: CRITICAL DATES	1.80	270.00
8/29/17	KL	B110	REVIEW ENTERED INTERIM ORDERS RE: CRITICAL DATES	1.10	165.00
8/29/17	KL	B110	PREPARE INITIAL CRITICAL DATES MEMO	2.00	300.00
8/29/17	KL	B110	REVIEW CASH COLLATERAL ORDER RE: CRITICAL DATES	.80	120.00
8/29/17	KL	B110	EMAIL TO J. TEELE AND N. STEFANELLI RE: INITIAL CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.10	15.00
8/30/17	NS	B110	REVIEW DRAFT CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.10	60.00
8/31/17	BLP	B110	REVIEW BAR DATE MOTION/ORDER	.30	157.50
8/31/17	BLP	B110	MEMO TO COMMITTEE RE DIP, BAR DATE	.40	210.00
SUB TOTAL TIME					17,005.00

ASSET ANALYSIS AND RECOVERY
B120 ASSET ANALYSIS AND RECOVERY

7/21/17	SJT	B120	REVIEW WALKER NELL'S ANALYSIS OF DEBTOR'S PROPOSED ASSUMPTION OF LEASE WITH PLAY AND LEARN	.50	300.00
8/09/17	NS	B120	REVIEW FT. WASHINGTON APPRAISAL	.40	240.00
SUB TOTAL TIME					540.00

RELIEF FR STAY/ADEQUATE PROTECTION PRCED
B140 STAY RELIEF/ADEQUATE PROTECTION PROC.

8/27/17	BLP	B140	REVIEW STIPULATION VACATING STAY ON PI CLAIMS	.20	105.00
SUB TOTAL TIME					105.00

MEETINGS OF & COMMUNICATIONS W/ CREDITOR
B150 MEETINGS OF & COMMUNICATIONS W/CREDITORS

Founded 1850

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5886404
October 5, 2017
Page 5

7/17/17	SJT	B150	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH THE COMMITTEE	1.00	600.00
7/18/17	NS	B150	PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN COMMITTEE CALL AND FOLLOW-UP CALL WITH WALKER NELL	1.40	840.00
7/18/17	SJT	B150	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH COMMITTEE MEMBERS RE: THEIR QUESTIONS ABOUT DIP FINANCING, SUBCONTRACTOR PAYMENTS AND LEASE ASSUMPTION	1.00	600.00
7/18/17	SJT	B150	PREPARE MEMORANDUM TO THE COMMITTEE RE: STATUS UPDATES AND STRATEGY RECOMMENDATIONS	1.00	600.00
8/08/17	NS	B150	REVIEW COMMITTEE UPDATE E-MAIL FROM J. CIANCIULLI	.10	60.00
8/09/17	BLP	B150	CALL WITH COMMITTEE RE VARIOUS MATTERS	.80	420.00
8/09/17	SJT	B150	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COMMITTEE	.80	480.00
8/18/17	BLP	B150	LENGTHY EMAIL TO COMMITTEE MEMBERS RE UPDATES ON ALL MATTERS	.30	157.50
8/22/17	BLP	B150	EMAILS AND DISCUSSIONS WITH COMMITTEE RE STATUS, ALL MATTERS	.50	262.50
8/28/17	BLP	B150	CONFERENCE CALL WITH COMMITTEE RE DIP ISSUES, MOTION TO INCREASE CFO COMPENSATION	.80	420.00
8/28/17	SJT	B150	COMMITTEE CALL RE: DIP, ETC.	.80	480.00
8/29/17	BLP	B150	CONFERENCE CALL WITH COMMITTEE RE DIP OBJECTIONS, ADDITIONS TO SAME	.50	262.50
8/29/17	SJT	B150	FURTHER COMMITTEE CALL RE: DIP	.50	300.00
SUB TOTAL TIME					5,482.50

FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS

B160 FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS

7/20/17	SJT	B160	REVIEW DEBTORS' MOTION TO RETAIN ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONALS	.30	180.00
---------	-----	------	--	-----	--------

Founded 1850

BROOKLYN

LONG ISLAND

MANHATTAN

WASHINGTON, D.C.

ALBANY

NEW JERSEY

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5886404
October 5, 2017
Page 6

7/21/17	NS	B160	DRAFT CULLEN & DYKMAN AND WALKER NELL RETENTION APPLICATIONS, DECLARATIONS AND PROPOSED ORDERS	4.20	2,520.00
7/21/17	SJT	B160	PREPARE CULLEN AND DYKMAN EMPLOYMENT APPLICATION AND DECLARATION	1.50	900.00
7/21/17	SJT	B160	REVIEW CONFLICT SEARCH RESULTS TO PREPARE RETENTION DECLARATION	.80	480.00
7/25/17	BLP	B160	REVIEW PRO HAC VICE DOCUMENTS	.20	105.00
7/25/17	SJT	B160	REVIEW PRO HAC VICE APPLICATIONS	.30	180.00
7/28/17	SJT	B160	FINALIZE EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS AND CORRESPOND WITH THE COMMITTEE RE: SAME	.50	300.00
8/01/17	NS	B160	REVIEW MULTIPLE E-MAILS RE: RETENTION APPLICATIONS	.10	60.00
8/07/17	BLP	B160	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON OCP MOTION	.50	262.50
8/07/17	NS	B160	REVIEW MULTIPLE E-MAILS RE: OCP MOTION	.20	120.00
8/09/17	BLP	B160	DISCUSSION WITH DEBTOR COUNSEL RE OCP COMMENTS	.20	105.00
8/09/17	NS	B160	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH J. TEELE RE: OCP MOTION ISSUE RAISED BY COMMITTEE MEMBER	.10	60.00
8/11/17	BLP	B160	REVIEW REVISED OCP ORDER AND YANOFF AFFIDAVIT AND EMAILS RE SAME	.30	157.50
8/14/17	BLP	B160	EMAILS RE OCP ORDER AND AFFIDAVIT; REVIEW DOCKET FOR FILED DOCUMENTS	.30	157.50
8/15/17	BLP	B160	PREPARE FOR STATUS OF RETENTION MOTIONS	.50	262.50
8/15/17	BLP	B160	EMAILS RE WALKER DECLARATION	.20	105.00
8/21/17	BLP	B160	REVIEW REQUEST OF DEBTOR COUNSEL FOR PAYMENT OF FEES	.30	157.50
8/22/17	BLP	B160	REVIEW WEIR RETENTION DOCUMENTS	.20	105.00
8/29/17	BLP	B160	DISCUSSIONS RE RETENTION ISSUES INCLUDING WEIR HEARING AND NUNC PRO TUNC ISSUES	.60	315.00
8/29/17	SJT	B160	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE RE: NUNC PRO TUNC REQUEST; WEIR APPLICATION	.60	360.00

Founded 1850

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5886404
October 5, 2017
Page 7

8/29/17	KL	B160	DOCKET RESEARCH RE: RETENTION ISSUES	1.10	165.00
8/29/17	KL	B160	EMAIL TO J. TEELE AND N. STEFANELLI RE: FINDING OF DOCKET RESEARCH FOR RETENTION ISSUES	.10	15.00
8/29/17	KL	B160	RESEARCH RE: FEE APPLICATIONS	.20	30.00
SUB TOTAL TIME					7,102.50

BUSINESS OPERATIONS

B210 BUSINESS OPERATIONS

7/18/17	SJT	B210	REVIEW DEBTORS' LEASE WITH PLAY AND LEARN AND PROPOSED AMENDMENTS	1.50	900.00
7/26/17	SJT	B210	REVIEW INTERNAL MEMO RE: PATIENT CARE OMBUDSMAN	.30	180.00
7/27/17	BLP	B210	EMAIL RE HEALTHCARE DOCUMENTS	.10	52.50
7/27/17	BLP	B210	REVIEW EMAIL FROM DEBTORS RE HEALTHCARE ISSUE	.20	105.00
7/27/17	SJT	B210	REVIEW DEBTORS' RESPONSES TO U.S. TRUSTEE'S INQUIRIES RE: PATIENT CARE OMBUDSMAN	1.00	600.00
8/08/17	NS	B210	REVIEW PCO MOTION	.40	240.00
8/09/17	BLP	B210	REVIEW HEALTH CARE BUSINESS MOTION	.30	157.50
8/10/17	BLP	B210	PREPARE JOINDER RE HEALTH CARE MOTION	.50	262.50
8/11/17	BLP	B210	REVIEW REVISED HEALTH CARE JOINDER AND EMAIL WITH COMMITTEE RE SAME	.30	157.50
8/11/17	NS	B210	REVIEW DRAFT JOINDER TO DEBTORS' PCO MOTION AND E-MAILS RE: SAME	.20	120.00
SUB TOTAL TIME					2,775.00

FINANCING/CASH COLLECTIONS

B230 FINANCING/CASH COLLATERAL

7/17/17	SJT	B230	REVIEW DIP FINANCING MOTION AND BUDGET; PREPARE LIST OF POTENTIAL OBJECTIONS	2.00	1,200.00
---------	-----	------	--	------	----------

Founded 1850

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5886404
October 5, 2017
Page 8

7/17/17	SJT	B230	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH W. WALKER RE: DEBTORS' BUDGET	.50	300.00
7/18/17	SJT	B230	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DEBTORS' COUNSEL RE: DIP FINANCING ISSUES AND GENERAL MATTERS	.80	480.00
7/19/17	BLP	B230	DISCUSSION WITH J.TEELE AND FINANCIAL ADVISORS RE DIP ISSUES	.50	262.50
7/19/17	BLP	B230	CALL WITH DEBTOR'S COUNSEL RE SAME AND STATUS OF VARIOUS MATTERS	.70	367.50
7/19/17	SJT	B230	PREPARE OBJECTION TO DIP FINANCING MOTION	3.50	2,100.00
7/19/17	SJT	B230	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH W. WALKER RE: DEBTORS' BUDGET	1.50	900.00
7/20/17	SJT	B230	CONTINUE DRAFTING DIP FINANCING OBJECTION	1.00	600.00
7/20/17	SJT	B230	DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO DEBTORS' COUNSEL DESCRIBING COMMITTEE'S OBJECTIONS TO DIP FINANCING AND LEASE ASSUMPTION	2.00	1,200.00
7/20/17	SJT	B230	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH THE COMMITTEE RE: STATUS AND DIP FINANCING	.80	480.00
7/20/17	SJT	B230	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH W. WALKER RE: HIS DISCUSSION WITH M. KAUFMAN OF GETZLER HENRICH	.30	180.00
7/21/17	BLP	B230	REVIEW DIP MOTION	.50	262.50
7/21/17	SJT	B230	REVIEW INFORMATION RE: DIP FINANCING AND BUDGET FOR DIP FINANCING OBJECTION AND NEGOTIATIONS	2.00	1,200.00
7/24/17	BLP	B230	CALL WITH DEBTORS' COUNSEL RE DIP ISSUES	.50	262.50
7/24/17	BLP	B230	LENGTHY DISCUSSION WITH DIP LENDER COUNSEL RE DIP ORDER	1.30	682.50
7/24/17	BLP	B230	DISCUSSION WITH ACCOUNTANTS RE BUDGET ISSUES	.30	157.50
7/24/17	BLP	B230	REVISE DIP ORDER PER ALL DISCUSSIONS	1.90	997.50
7/24/17	SJT	B230	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DEBTORS'	1.00	600.00

Founded 1850

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5886404
October 5, 2017
Page 9

7/24/17	SJT	B230	COUNSEL RE: DIP FINANCING TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR THE DIP LENDER RE: RESOLVING THE COMMITTEE'S OBJECTIONS	1.50	900.00
7/24/17	SJT	B230	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH THE COMMITTEE RE: STATUS OF DIP FINANCING NEGOTIATIONS AND OBJECTION	.80	480.00
7/25/17	BLP	B230	REVIEW DIP LENDER CHANGES TO ORDER	.20	105.00
7/25/17	BLP	B230	NUMEROUS EMAILS AND DISCUSSIONS WITH DEBTOR COUNSEL, DIP LENDER COUNSEL, ACCOUNTANTS RE DIP ORDER ISSUES	1.80	945.00
7/25/17	BLP	B230	DISCUSSION WITH COMMITTEE RE DIP ORDER, THOUGHTS, ISSUES	.50	262.50
7/25/17	BLP	B230	EMAILS AND DISCUSSIONS RE BUDGET CONCERNS	.70	367.50
7/25/17	BLP	B230	DRAFT LANGUAGE FOR DIP ORDER RE BUDGET CONCERNS	.40	210.00
7/25/17	BLP	B230	SEVERAL EMAILS AND DISCUSSIONS RE NEW LANGUAGE	.70	367.50
7/25/17	BLP	B230	EMAIL TO COMMITTEE RE STATUS, REQUEST FOR APPROVAL	.30	157.50
7/25/17	SJT	B230	PREPARE RESERVATION OF RIGHTS RE: DIP FINANCING	.30	180.00
7/25/17	SJT	B230	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH THE COMMITTEE RE: DIP FINANCING AGREEMENTS	.50	300.00
7/25/17	SJT	B230	REVIEW AND REVISE DIP FINANCING ORDER INCORPORATING AGREEMENTS RESOLVING THE COMMITTEE'S OBJECTIONS	2.50	1,500.00
7/25/17	SJT	B230	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH COUNSEL FOR THE DEBTORS AND DIP LENDER RE: DIP FINANCING AGREEMENTS	1.00	600.00
7/26/17	BLP	B230	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND DIP/LEASE HEARINGS	4.80	2,520.00
7/26/17	SJT	B230	APPEAR IN COURT FOR HEARING	1.00	600.00
7/26/17	SJT	B230	CORRESPOND WITH THE COMMITTEE RE:	.50	300.00

Founded 1850

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5886404
October 5, 2017
Page 10

		DIP FINANCING ORDER, TODAY'S HEARING, AND GENERAL STATUS UPDATE		
7/26/17	SJT B230	REVIEW FURTHER REVISED DIP FINANCING ORDER AND BUDGET	.80	480.00
8/08/17	NS B230	REVIEW MULTIPLE E-MAILS RE: SIENA DIP	.20	120.00
8/14/17	BLP B230	REVIEW EXTENSIVE SIENNA DIP LOAN AGREEMENT AND SCHEDULES	3.20	1,680.00
8/14/17	BLP B230	EMAILS RE BUDGETS RE DIP LOAN	.20	105.00
8/14/17	NS B230	REVIEW MULTIPLE E-MAILS RE: SIENA DIP, INCLUDING CASH REPORT AND CASH COLLATERAL BUDGET	.40	240.00
8/15/17	BLP B230	EMAILS RE ISSUES WITH DIP	.30	157.50
8/15/17	NS B230	REVIEW DIP ISSUES LIST	.20	120.00
8/15/17	SJT B230	REVIEW EMAILS RE: DIP ISSUES	.20	120.00
8/17/17	BLP B230	REVIEW DEBTOR CHANGES TO DIP AND ADD/REMOVE COMMENTS BASED ON SAME	1.20	630.00
8/17/17	NS B230	REVIEW MULTIPLE E-MAILS RE: SIENA DIP INCLUDING REDLINE OF LOAN AGREEMENT	.60	360.00
8/17/17	SJT B230	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DIP LOAN AGREEMENT	.90	540.00
8/18/17	BLP B230	REVIEW J.TEELE COMMENTS TO DIP AND ADD TO OUTLINE	.70	367.50
8/18/17	BLP B230	LENGTHY EMAIL TO DEBTOR COUNSEL WITH COMMENTS TO DIP	1.00	525.00
8/18/17	BLP B230	DISCUSSION WITH J.TEELE RE EMAIL TO COUNSEL PRIOR TO SENDING SAME	.30	157.50
8/18/17	NS B230	REVIEW COMMITTEE UPDATE E-MAIL FROM B. POLLACK RE: SIENA DIP	.20	120.00
8/22/17	BLP B230	LENGTHY CALL WITH DEBTOR PROFESSIONALS RE COMMENTS AND ISSUES WITH SIENA DIP	1.00	525.00
8/22/17	BLP B230	EXTENSIVE MARK UP OF DIP AGREEMENT TO ADDRESS COMMITTEE CONCERNS	2.60	1,365.00
8/22/17	NS B230	REVIEW B. POLLACK DIP MARK-UP AND MULTIPLE E-MAILS RE: SAME	.40	240.00
8/23/17	BLP B230	CONFERENCE WITH J.TEELE/N.STEFANELLI RE DIP ISSUES	.30	157.50

Founded 1850

CULLENandDYKMANLLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5886404
October 5, 2017
Page 11

8/23/17	BLP	B230	DISCUSSION WITH M&T COUNSEL RE DIP	.30	157.50
8/23/17	NS	B230	CONFERENCE WITH J. TEELE AND B. POLLACK RE: DIP ISSUES AND DISCUSSION WITH M&T COUNSEL RE: SAME	.60	360.00
8/23/17	NS	B230	REVIEW SIENA DIP MOTION	.90	540.00
8/23/17	SJT	B230	CONFERENCE RE: OUTSTANDING DIP ISSUES	.30	180.00
8/24/17	BLP	B230	LENGTHY CALL WITH DEBTOR AND SIENA COUNSEL RE COMMENTS TO DIP ORDER/AGREEMENT	1.00	525.00
8/24/17	BLP	B230	BEGIN OUTLINE OF REMAINING DIP ISSUES	.30	157.50
8/25/17	BLP	B230	CONTINUED WITH OUTLINE OF OPEN DIP ISSUES	.50	262.50
8/27/17	BLP	B230	WORK ON DIP OBJECTION	1.70	892.50
8/27/17	NS	B230	CALL WITH J. TEELE AND B. POLLACK RE: SIENA DIP	.50	300.00
8/27/17	SJT	B230	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE RE: DIP MATTERS	.50	300.00
8/28/17	BLP	B230	EXTENSIVE WORK ON DIP OBJECTION	4.20	2,205.00
8/28/17	BLP	B230	CALL WITH FAS RE BUDGET ISSUES AND FINANCIAL DOCUMENT EXCLUSION	.50	262.50
8/29/17	BLP	B230	DISCUSSION WITH FA RE BUDGET ISSUES	.30	157.50
8/29/17	BLP	B230	REVISE OBJECTION TO DIP MOTION	1.30	682.50
8/29/17	BLP	B230	PREPARATION FOR DIP HEARINGS	2.30	1,207.50
8/29/17	BLP	B230	REVIEW M&T OBJECTION TO DIP MOTION	.30	157.50
8/29/17	BLP	B230	FURTHER DISCUSSIONS WITH FINANCIAL ADVISORS RE HEARING PREP	.70	367.50
8/29/17	BLP	B230	CONFERENCE WITH J. TEELE RE SAME	.20	105.00
8/29/17	SJT	B230	CONFERENCE RE: DIP HEARING PREP	.20	120.00
8/31/17	BLP	B230	REVIEW FURTHER CHANGES TO DIP ORDER AND EMAILS RE SAME	.30	157.50
SUB TOTAL TIME					39,135.00
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES					72,145.00

Founded 1850

CULLENandDYKMANLLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5886404
October 5, 2017
Page 12

LESS DISCOUNT

-14,429.00

NET PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

57,716.00

Founded 1850

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

The Legal Center
 One Riverfront Plaza
 Newark, New Jersey 07102
 Telephone (973) 849-0220 Facsimile (973)849-2020

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.

Control # 5869645

October 31, 2017

Page 2

For Professional Services Rendered Through September 30, 2017 regarding:

Client Number - 35008 - 000 GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.

**Matter Number - 00001 IN RE WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al
 REPRESENT OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF
 UNSECURED CREDITORS IN CHAPTER 11
 PROCEEDING
 Potential Client E .00**

DATE	INIT	TASK	ACTVYDESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
CASE ADMINISTRATION					
B110 CASE ADMINISTRATION					
9/05/17	BLP	B110	EMAIL TO COMMITTEE WITH BAR DATE ORDER	.20	105.00
9/05/17	BLP	B110	TEAM MEETING RE CASE ISSUES	.30	157.50
9/05/17	KL	B110	UPDATE CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.80	120.00
9/05/17	KL	B110	EMAIL TO B. POLLACK REGARDING UPDATED CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.10	15.00
9/05/17	KL	B110	REVIEW DOCKET REGARDING CRITICAL DATES	1.00	150.00
9/05/17	KL	B110	REVIEW EMAILS FROM B. POLLACK REGARDING ADDITIONAL CRITICAL DATES THAT NEED TO BE ADDED TO THE CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.20	30.00
9/05/17	KL	B110	EMAIL TO B. POLLACK REGARDING UPDATED CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.10	15.00
9/07/17	KL	B110	PREPARE AND ORGANIZE CASE FILE	.50	75.00
9/07/17	KL	B110	RESEARCH OF DOCKET FOR PETITION AND CONSOLIDATED TOP 20 CREDITORS;	.50	75.00

Founded 1850

BROOKLYN

LONG ISLAND

MANHATTAN

WASHINGTON, D.C.

ALBANY

NEW JERSEY

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5869645
October 31, 2017
Page 3

		REVIEW SAME		
9/11/17	BLP B110	REVIEW CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.20	105.00
9/11/17	BLP B110	CONFERENCE WITH JT RE STATUS OF ALL MATTERS IN CASE	.30	157.50
9/11/17	KL B110	EMAIL TO B. POLLACK RE:CRITICAL DATES MEMO APPROVAL	.10	15.00
9/11/17	KL B110	OFFICE MEETING WITH B. POLLACK RE: CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.10	15.00
9/11/17	KL B110	RESEARCH DOCKET RE: CRITICAL DATES	.90	135.00
9/11/17	KL B110	REVIEW DOCUMENTS FILED RE: CRITICAL DATES	.70	105.00
9/11/17	KL B110	UPDATE CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.90	135.00
9/11/17	KL B110	EMAIL/CALENDAR MAINTENANCE OF TEAM RE: CRITICAL DATES	.70	105.00
9/12/17	KL B110	REVIEW DOCKET REGARDING CRITICAL DATES	.20	30.00
9/12/17	KL B110	REVIEW CRITICAL DATES MEMO AND CALENDAR ENTRIES	.30	45.00
9/13/17	BLP B110	REVIEW DRAFT PLAN	1.00	525.00
9/13/17	KL B110	PREPARE EXHIBITS TO MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION FOR FILING; REVIEW DOCKET RE: SERVICE OF SAME; PROPOSED ORDER AND NOTICE;	1.00	150.00
9/14/17	SJT B110	REVIEW REVISED PLAN	.50	300.00
9/15/17	KL B110	PREPARE ORDER RE: FIRST REQUEST FOR PAYMENT OF MONTHLY EXPENSES (AUGUST 2017)	1.00	150.00
9/15/17	KL B110	PREPARE CERTIFICATION OF SERVICE RE: FIRST REQUEST FOR PAYMENT OF MONTHLY EXPENSES (AUGUST 2017)	.70	105.00
9/15/17	KL B110	PREPARE CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE EXHIBIT A (SERVICE LIST) TO SAME	1.50	225.00
9/15/17	KL B110	PREPARE NOTICE RE: FIRST REQUEST FOR PAYMENT (AUGUST 2017)	.70	105.00
9/15/17	KL B110	REVIEW DOCKET RE: FORM OF ORDER AND NOTICE; REVIEW DOCKET RE: PREPARATION OF SERVICE OF FEE APPLICATION	1.10	165.00
9/18/17	KL B110	REVIEW DOCKET REGARDING CRITICAL	.80	120.00

Founded 1850

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5869645
October 31, 2017
Page 4

		DATES		
9/18/17	KL B110	UPDATE CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.80	120.00
9/21/17	SJT B110	REVIEW RESEARCH RE: NUNC PRO TUNC RETENTIONS	.80	480.00
9/22/17	SJT B110	REVIEW MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION OF ORDER GRANTING RETENTION APPLICATION	.50	300.00
9/22/17	SJT B110	REVIEW AND REVISE RESPONSE TO DEBTORS' MOTION TO INCREASE CEO COMPENSATION	.30	180.00
9/22/17	KL B110	PREPARE AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE REGARDING RESPONSE TO MOTION TO INCREASE SALARY	.70	105.00
9/22/17	KL B110	ORGANIZE, ELECTRONICALLY FILE AND TEND TO SERVICE OF RESPONSE TO MOTION TO INCREASE SALARY	.60	90.00
9/25/17	KL B110	REVIEW EMAIL FROM N. STEFANELLI RE: FILING OF RESPONSE TO SALARY INCREASE	.10	15.00
9/25/17	KL B110	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. POLLACK RE: FILING OF RESPONSE TO SALARY INCREASE MOTION	.10	15.00
9/25/17	KL B110	REVIEW DOCKET REGARDING CRITICAL DATES	.40	60.00
9/25/17	KL B110	UPDATE CRITICAL DATES MEMO AND TEND TO CRITICAL DATE CALENDAR	1.10	165.00
9/26/17	BLP B110	REVIEW PLAN FOR COMMENT	.90	472.50
9/26/17	SJT B110	CLOSE REVIEW OF LIQUIDATION ANALYSIS AND SUPPORTING INFORMATION AND PLAN	1.30	780.00
9/26/17	KL B110	REVIEW DOCKET RE: CRITICAL DATES	.30	45.00
9/29/17	BLP B110	EMAIL TO AND DISCUSSION WITH DEBTOR COUNSEL RE SCHEDULING OF MOTION TO ASSUME HENRY AVE LEASES	.30	157.50
9/29/17	BLP B110	REVIEW LANDLORD MOTION FOR ALLOWANCE OF ADMIN CLAIM	.20	105.00
SUB TOTAL TIME				6,525.00

Founded 1850

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5869645
October 31, 2017
Page 5

MEETINGS OF & COMMUNICATIONS W/ CREDITOR

B150 MEETINGS OF & COMMUNICATIONS W/CREDITORS

9/07/17	SJT	B150	CONFERENCE WITH B. POLLACK RE: DEBTORS' MOTION TO INCREASE CFO COMPENSATION	.20	120.00
9/08/17	BLP	B150	EMAIL TO COMMITTEE RE CEO SALARY MOTION	.20	105.00
9/12/17	BLP	B150	EMAILS WITH COMMITTEE MEMBER RE CLAIMS	.20	105.00
9/14/17	BLP	B150	DISCUSSION WITH S. BOSE RE PLAN	.20	105.00
9/20/17	BLP	B150	PREPARE EMAIL TO COMMITTEE RE PLAN, MOTION TO ASSUME, CEO MOTION	.40	210.00
9/22/17	BLP	B150	EMAIL TO COMMITTEE RE MOTION TO RECONSIDER, RESPONSE TO COMPENSATION MOTION	.30	157.50
9/22/17	NS	B150	CALL WITH B. POLLACK RE: COMMITTEE RESPONSE TO CEO SALARY INCREASE MOTION	.10	60.00
9/25/17	SJT	B150	CORRESPONDENCE FROM DEBTORS' COUNSEL RE: PLAN, LIQUIDATION ANALYSIS AND SCHEDULING CALL	.10	60.00
9/26/17	BLP	B150	DISCUSSION WITH COMMITTEE FINANCIAL ADVISORS RE PLAN AND LIQUIDATION ANALYSIS	.30	157.50
9/26/17	BLP	B150	CONFERENCE WITH J. TEELE RE PLAN COMMENTS	.40	210.00
9/26/17	BLP	B150	DISCUSSION WITH P. HUGHES RE PLAN	.20	105.00
9/26/17	BLP	B150	PREPARE EMAIL TO DEBTORS WITH PLAN COMMENTS	.60	315.00
9/26/17	SJT	B150	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WALKER NELL PARTNERS RE: LIQUIDATION ANALYSIS AND PLAN	.80	480.00
9/26/17	SJT	B150	OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH B. POLLACK RE: PLAN	.50	300.00
9/26/17	SJT	B150	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DEBTORS' PROFESSIONALS RE: PLAN	.70	420.00
9/27/17	BLP	B150	CONFERENCE WITH J. TEELE RE	.40	210.00

Founded 1850

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5869645
October 31, 2017
Page 6

		COMMENTS TO SALE ORDER		
9/27/17	BLP B150	CALL WITH DEBTOR PROFESSIONALS RE PLAN COMMENTS	1.00	525.00
9/27/17	BLP B150	DISCUSSION WITH S. BOSE RE CALL WITH DEBTORS, FINANCIAL ISSUES RE PLAN	.20	105.00
SUB TOTAL TIME				3,750.00

FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS

B160 FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS

9/05/17	BLP B160	EMAILS RE RETENTION HEARINGS	.20	105.00
9/05/17	BLP B160	WORK ON APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION	1.00	525.00
9/07/17	BLP B160	WORK ON COMPENSATION APPLICATION	.80	420.00
9/11/17	BLP B160	CONTINUED WORK ON COMPENSATION APPLICATION	1.10	577.50
9/12/17	NS B160	REVIEW AND REVISE FIRST MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT	1.20	720.00
9/14/17	NS B160	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH K. LAFIURA RE: FIRST MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT	.10	60.00
9/15/17	BLP B160	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON ORDER RE FIRST COMPENSATION APPLICATION	.30	157.50
9/19/17	BLP B160	SEVERAL DISCUSSIONS WITH JT, JC, WW RE RETENTION HEARING PREPARATION	1.10	577.50
9/20/17	BLP B160	DISCUSSIONS RE OUTCOME OF HEARING, POSSIBLE MOTION TO RECONSIDER	.30	157.50
9/20/17	NS B160	MULTIPLE CALLS AND OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH A. CHEN RE: RESEARCH NEEDED FOR RETENTION ISSUE	.40	240.00
9/20/17	NS B160	REVIEW LOCAL RULES AND NUMEROUS RECENT CASES RE: RETENTION ISSUE AND MULTIPLE E-MAILS WITH J. TEELE AND B. POLLACK RE: SAME	1.20	720.00
9/20/17	NS B160	REVIEW RESULTS OF RESEARCH RE: NUNC PRO TUNC RETENTION AND	.40	240.00

Founded 1850

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5869645
October 31, 2017
Page 7

		COORDINATE WITH A. CHEN RE: FURTHER RESEARCH NEEDED		
9/20/17	AC B160	SEARCHED FOR COMMITTEE CASES IN THE CHAPTER 11 CASES PENDING BEFORE THIRD CIRCUIT. SPECIFICALLY LOOKED TO SEE HOW MUCH TIME ELAPSED IN BETWEEN THE FORMATION OF A COMMITTEE AND THE DATE COMMITTEE COUNSEL FILED THEIR APPLICATION FOR RETENTION TO THE COURT	5.40	1,242.00
9/21/17	AC B160	BEGIN DRAFTING MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION RE: RETENTION	8.20	1,886.00
9/22/17	BLP B160	DISCUSSION WITH JT RE RECONSIDERATION OF RETENTION ORDER	.30	157.50
9/22/17	NS B160	MULTIPLE OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH K. LAFIURA RE: MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT	.50	300.00
9/22/17	NS B160	REVIEW AND REVISE TIME ENTRIES FOR COMPLIANCE WITH UST GUIDELINES	.40	240.00
9/22/17	KL B160	SEVERAL MEETINGS WITH NS REGARDING PREPARATION OF FEE APPLICATION	.50	75.00
9/22/17	KL B160	CONTINUED PREPARATION OF CULLEN AND DYKMAN FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	3.00	450.00
9/22/17	AC B160	DRAFT EMAIL TO THE COMMITTEE RE: DENIAL OF RETENTION APPLICATION	.60	138.00
9/22/17	AC B160	PREPARE EXCEL SPREADSHEET OF ALL CHAPTER 11 COMMITTEE CASES PENDING BEFORE E.D.PENN, D.NJ., AND D.DE . AS AN EXHIBIT ATTACHED TO OUR MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION	6.70	1,541.00
9/25/17	NS B160	REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION OF CULLEN AND DYKMAN RETENTION ORDER	.80	480.00
9/25/17	NS B160	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH J. TEELE RE: FEE APPLICATION	.10	60.00
9/25/17	KL B160	REVIEW ORDER AUTHORIZING RETENTION OF CULLEN AND DYKMAN LLP	.30	45.00

Founded 1850

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5869645
October 31, 2017
Page 8

9/25/17	AC	B160	REVISE EXHIBIT TO RECONSIDERATION MOTION	2.50	575.00
9/26/17	NS	B160	CONTINUE REVISING MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION OF CULLEN AND DYKMAN RETENTION ORDER	5.10	3,060.00
9/26/17	AC	B160	FURTHER RESEARCH RE: CASES TO BE INCLUDED IN EXHIBIT TO RECONSIDERATION MOTION AND REVISE SAME	10.30	2,369.00
9/27/17	NS	B160	CONTINUE REVISIONS TO MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION OF CULLEN AND DYKMAN RETENTION ORDER	2.30	1,380.00
9/27/17	AC	B160	FURTHER REVISE EXHIBIT TO RECONSIDERATION MOTION	2.50	575.00
9/28/17	BLP	B160	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION AND SEVERAL EMAILS RE SAME	1.10	577.50
9/28/17	NS	B160	CALL WITH J. TEELE RE: MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION OF CULLEN AND DYKMAN RETENTION ORDER	.30	180.00
9/28/17	NS	B160	REVISE EXHIBITS TO MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION OF CULLEN AND DYKMAN RETENTION ORDER	1.90	1,140.00
9/28/17	NS	B160	REVIEW J. TEELE EDITS TO MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION OF CULLEN AND DYKMAN RETENTION ORDER, INCORPORATE AND CIRCULATE TO COMMITTEE	.90	540.00
9/28/17	KL	B160	EXTENSIVE REVISIONS TO EXHIBIT A TO THE MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION OF THE RETENTION APPLICATION OF CULLEN AND DYKMAN	3.50	525.00
9/28/17	KL	B160	OFFICE MEETING WITH N. STEFANELLI RE: REVISIONS TO EXHIBIT A TO THE MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION	.30	45.00
9/28/17	KL	B160	REVIEW CULLEN AND DYKMAN RETENTION ORDER	.50	75.00
9/28/17	AC	B160	RESEARCH RE: DEFINATION OF "REASONABLE TIME" FOR FILING	7.10	1,633.00

Founded 1850

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5869645
October 31, 2017
Page 9

9/29/17	BLP	B160	RETENTION APPLICATION CONFERENCES RE SCHEDULING MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION	.30	157.50
9/29/17	NS	B160	FINALIZE MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION OF CULLEN AND DYKMAN RETENTION ORDER	1.80	1,080.00
9/29/17	NS	B160	CALLS WITH J. TEELE RE: MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION OF CULLEN AND DYKMAN RETENTION ORDER	.40	240.00
9/29/17	NS	B160	CALL WITH CHAMBERS RE: HEARING DATE FOR: MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION OF CULLEN AND DYKMAN RETENTION ORDER	.10	60.00
9/29/17	TP	B160	REVISIONS TO MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION.	.40	154.00
9/29/17	AC	B160	EDITS TO NOTICE OF MOTION AND PROPOSED ORDER FOR MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION	2.20	506.00

SUB TOTAL TIME 25,986.50

FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATION - OTHERS

B165 FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS - OTHERS

9/12/17	BLP	B165	REVIEW YANOFF INVOICES	.20	105.00
9/12/17	BLP	B165	REVIEW BLANK ROME INVOICES	.30	157.50

SUB TOTAL TIME 262.50

ASSUMPTION/REJECTION OF LEASES & CONTRAC

B185 ASSUMPTION/REJECTION OF LEASES/CONTRACTS

9/13/17	BLP	B185	REVIEW MOTION TO ASSUME HENRY AVE LEASE AND EMAIL TO DEBTOR REQUESTING COPIES OF LEASES	.40	210.00
9/15/17	BLP	B185	REVIEW LANDLORD OBJECTION TO MOTION TO ASSUME	.20	105.00
9/19/17	BLP	B185	EMAILS RE MOTION TO ASSUME LEASES	.20	105.00
9/19/17	BLP	B185	REVIEW MOTION TO EXTEND TIME TO	.30	157.50

Founded 1850

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5869645
October 31, 2017
Page 10

		REMOVE		
9/19/17	BLP B185	DISCUSSION WITH JT RE MOTION TO ASSUME LEASE	.20	105.00
9/26/17	BLP B185	REVIEW MOTION TO ASSUME FOOD SERVICE CONTRACTS	.20	105.00
SUB TOTAL TIME				787.50

OTHER CONTESTED MATTERS (EX ASSUMP/REJECT
B190 OTHER CONTESTED MATTERS

9/13/17	BLP B190	REVIEW LACKS OBJECTION TO CEO MOTION AND EMAIL TO COMMITTEE RE SAME	.40	210.00
9/22/17	BLP B190	PREPARE RESPONSE TO CEO COMPENSATION MOTION	1.40	735.00
9/22/17	NS B190	REVIEW COMMITTEE RESPONSE TO CEO SALARY INCREASE MOTION, FINALIZE AND COORDINATE FILING AND SERVICE OF SAME	.40	240.00
9/22/17	SJT B190	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. POLLACK RE: DEBTORS' PLAN, MOTION TO INCREASE CEO COMPENSATION, AND CASE STRATEGY	.50	300.00
SUB TOTAL TIME				1,485.00

BUSINESS OPERATIONS

B210 BUSINESS OPERATIONS

9/01/17	BLP B210	EMAIL TO DEBTORS' COUNSEL RE COMMITTEE QUESTIONS RE OPERATIONS	.20	105.00
9/07/17	BLP B210	REVIEW MOTION TO INCREASE SALARY TO CEO	.30	157.50
9/19/17	BLP B210	REVIEW LEASES FOR HEADQUARTERS	.60	315.00
9/26/17	BLP B210	REVIEW MANAGEMENT AGREEMENTS	.40	210.00
9/26/17	BLP B210	REVIEW AFFILIATION AGREEMENT	1.10	577.50
SUB TOTAL TIME				1,365.00

Founded 1850

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5869645
October 31, 2017
Page 11

FINANCING/CASH COLLECTIONS

B230 FINANCING/CASH COLLATERAL

9/12/17	BLP	B230	EMAILS RE DIP HEARING, OBJECTIONS	.20	105.00
9/12/17	SJT	B230	REVIEW SIENNA DIP ORDER	.60	360.00
9/12/17	SJT	B230	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM DEBTORS' COUNSEL RE: DIP HEARING AND DISCUSS SAME WITH B. POLLACK	.30	180.00
9/15/17	BLP	B230	EMAILS RE REVISED BUDGET	.20	105.00
9/15/17	BLP	B230	REVIEW FINAL DIP ORDER	.70	367.50
9/15/17	BLP	B230	EMAILS AND DISCUSSIONS RE FINAL DIP ORDER AND VARIOUS CHANGES PROPOSED	.60	315.00
9/18/17	BLP	B230	REVIEW M&T CASH COLLATERAL ORDER AND PLAY AND LEARN AGREEMENT AND ORDER WITH REFERENCE TO FINAL DIP ORDER	.90	472.50
9/18/17	BLP	B230	EMAILS RE CHANGES TO FINAL DIP ORDER	.20	105.00
9/18/17	BLP	B230	REVIEW M&T COMMENTS TO FINAL DIP ORDER	.20	105.00
9/19/17	BLP	B230	SEVERAL EMAILS RE FINAL DIP ORDER	.30	157.50
9/20/17	SJT	B230	REVIEW PLEADINGS AND PREPARE FOR HEARING RE: SIENNA DIP FINANCING AND EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS	.70	420.00
SUB TOTAL TIME					2,692.50

PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT(INCL BUSIN
B320 PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

9/19/17	BLP	B320	DISCUSSION WITH DEBTORS COUNSEL RE REASON FOR ASSUMPTION PRE-PLAN AND PLAN STATUS	.30	157.50
SUB TOTAL TIME					157.50

COURT HEARINGS

Founded 1850

BROOKLYN

LONG ISLAND

MANHATTAN

WASHINGTON, D.C.

ALBANY

NEW JERSEY

CULLENandDYKMANLLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5869645
October 31, 2017
Page 12

B430A COURT HEARINGS

9/20/17	SJT	B430A	APPEAR IN COURT FOR HEARING RE: SIENNA DIP FINANCING AND EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS	1.50	900.00
9/25/17	SJT	B430A	APPEAR IN COURT FOR HEARING ON COMMITTEE PROFESSIONALS' RETENTION APPLICATIONS AND FINAL HEARING WITH RESPECT TO SIENNA DIP FINANCING	1.00	600.00
9/25/17	SJT	B430A	REVIEW PLEADINGS AND NOTES TO PREPARE FOR HEARING	.70	420.00
SUB TOTAL TIME					1,920.00
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES					44,931.50
LESS DISCOUNT					-8,986.30
NET PROFESSIONAL SERVICES					35,945.20

Founded 1850

CULLENandDYKMANLLP

The Legal Center
 One Riverfront Plaza
 Newark, New Jersey 07102
 Telephone (973) 849-0220 Facsimile (973)849-2020

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.

Control # 5851592
 November 27, 2017
 Page 2

For Professional Services Rendered Through October 31, 2017 regarding:

Client Number - 35008 - 000 GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.

**Matter Number - 00001 IN RE WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al
 REPRESENT OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF
 UNSECURED CREDITORS IN CHAPTER 11
 PROCEEDING
 Potential Client E .00**

DATE	INIT	TASK	ACTVYDESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
CASE ADMINISTRATION					
B110 CASE ADMINISTRATION					
10/03/17	KL	B110	PREPARE CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE RE: RESPONSE OF COMMITTEE TO ASSUMPTION OF HENRY AVENUE	.40	60.00
10/03/17	KL	B110	TEND TO SERVICE RE: RESPONSE OF COMMITTEE TO ASSUMPTION OF HENRY AVENUE	.20	30.00
10/03/17	KL	B110	ELECTRONICALLY FILE CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE RE: RESPONSE OF COMMITTEE TO ASSUMPTION OF HENRY AVENUE	.30	45.00
10/03/17	KL	B110	ORGANIZE AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE RESPONSE OF COMMITTEE TO ASSUMPTION OF HENRY AVENUE	.70	105.00
10/03/17	KL	B110	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. POLLACK RE: FILING AND SERVICE OF RESPONSE OF COMMITTEE TO ASSUMPTION OF HENRY AVENUE	.20	30.00
10/03/17	KL	B110	REVIEW EMAIL FROM N. STEFANELLI	.10	15.00

Founded 1850

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5851592
November 27, 2017
Page 3

10/03/17	KL	B110	RE: RESPONSE OF COMMITTEE TO ASSUMPTION OF HENRY AVENUE EMAIL TO TEAM RE: FILED RESPONSE OF COMMITTEE TO ASSUMPTION OF HENRY AVENUE	.20	30.00
10/03/17	KL	B110	CONTINUED EXTENSIVE REVISIONS TO FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION TIME ENTRIES	1.80	270.00
10/04/17	KL	B110	REVIEW DOCKET RE: CRITICAL DATES	.80	120.00
10/04/17	KL	B110	UPDATE CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.90	135.00
10/11/17	KL	B110	REVIEW DOCKET AND PLEADINGS RE: CRITICAL DATES	1.00	150.00
10/11/17	KL	B110	UPDATE CRITICAL DATES MEMO AND DEPARTMENT CALENDAR RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES	1.10	165.00
10/11/17	KL	B110	EMAIL TO TEAM RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.20	30.00
10/11/17	KL	B110	REVIEW FILED FIRST MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT FOR CULLEN AND DYKMAN	.30	45.00
10/16/17	KL	B110	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES, INTERIM COMP ORDER; RETENTION ORDER	1.00	150.00
10/16/17	KL	B110	UPDATE CRITICAL DATES MEMO	1.00	150.00
10/16/17	KL	B110	EMAIL TO TEAM RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES MEMO AND TEND TO CALENDARING NEW EVENTS	.60	90.00
10/17/17	KL	B110	ORGANIZE WORDSWORTH FEE APPLICATION FILE	.30	45.00
10/17/17	KL	B110	REVIEW DOCKET RE: FEE APPLICATION FILED IN PREPARATION TO ORGANIZE FEE APPLICATION FILE	.40	60.00
10/17/17	KL	B110	PREPARE PRO HAC VICE APPLICATION FOR T. POWERS	.50	75.00
10/20/17	KL	B110	REVIEW ORGANIZE AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION RE: EMPLOYMENT OF CULLEN AND DYKMAN	.60	90.00
10/20/17	KL	B110	TELEPHONE CALL TO JUDGE'S CHAMBERS RE: FILED CERTIFICATE OF NO	.20	30.00

Founded 1850

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5851592
November 27, 2017
Page 4

10/24/17	KL	B110	OBJECTION ORGANIZE, ELECTRONICALLY FILE AND TEND TO SERVICE OF RESPONSE OF THE UNSECURED CREDITORS' COMMITTEE TO THE MOTION OF LIST ASSOCIATES, L.P. FOR ALLOWANCE OF ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM	.60	90.00
10/25/17	KL	B110	REVIEW DOCKET RE: CRITICAL DATES	.60	90.00
10/25/17	KL	B110	UPDATE CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.60	90.00
10/25/17	KL	B110	TEND TO CALENDARING CRITICAL DATES IN ELECTRONIC CALENDAR	.40	60.00
SUB TOTAL TIME					2,250.00
RELIEF FR STAY/ADEQUATE PROTECTION PRCED					
B140 RELIEF FR STAY/ADEQUATE PROTECTION PRCED					
10/13/17	BLP	B140	REVIEW STIPULATION VACATING STAY AS TO ADDITIONAL CLAIMANTS AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH DEBTOR COUNSEL RE SAME	.50	262.50
SUB TOTAL TIME					262.50
MEETINGS OF & COMMUNICATIONS W/ CREDITOR					
B150 MEETINGS OF & COMMUNICATIONS W/ CREDITOR					
10/02/17	BLP	B150	CONFERENCE WITH J. TEELE RE COMMITTEE CALL AND AGENDA AND EMAIL TO COMMITTEE RE AGENDA FOR CALL	.50	262.50
10/04/17	BLP	B150	CONFERENCE WITH S. TEELE RE REVISED PLAN	.20	105.00
10/05/17	BLP	B150	CALL WITH COMMITTEE RE PLAN, MOTIONS, OPERATIONAL ISSUES	.50	262.50
10/05/17	BLP	B150	CALLS WITH FINANCIAL ADVISORS RE PLAN ISSUES, OPERATIONAL ISSUES PRIOR TO AND AFTER COMMITTEE CALL	.50	262.50
10/05/17	BLP	B150	REVIEW 2 VERSIONS OF REVISED PLAN,	2.10	1,102.50

Founded 1850

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5851592
November 27, 2017
Page 5

		DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND LIQUIDATION ANALYSIS		
10/06/17	BLP B150	CORRESPONDENCE WITH CREDITORS RE QUESTIONS ON CLAIMS BAR DATE	.20	105.00
10/06/17	BLP B150	PREPARE EMAIL TO COMMITTEE RE PLAN PROCESS	.20	105.00
10/06/17	BLP B150	DISCUSSION WITH DEBTOR COUNSEL RE CHANGES REQUESTED TO PLAN DOCUMENTS	.20	105.00
10/07/17	BLP B150	EMAIL TO COMMITTEE RE BY-LAWS, PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	.30	157.50
10/10/17	BLP B150	FIELD CREDITOR QUESTIONS RE CLAIM PROCESS	.30	157.50
10/10/17	BLP B150	REVIEW MOTION RE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT, PROCEDURES AND PROPOSED NOTICES	.80	420.00
10/11/17	BLP B150	EMAIL TO COMMITTEE RE BAR DATE, PLAN, STATUS CALL	.20	105.00
10/12/17	BLP B150	RESPOND TO SEVERAL CREDITOR INQUIRIES RE CLAIMS, BAR DATE, FILING LOGISTICS	.50	262.50
10/13/17	BLP B150	EMAIL TO COMMITTEE RE PLAN ISSUES AND CALL TO GO OVER SAME	.20	105.00
10/16/17	BLP B150	EMAILS WITH COMMITTEE MEMBERS RE CALL TO DISCUSS PLAN AND DISCUSSION WITH FINANCIAL ADVISORS RE PLAN AND STATUS OF CASE	.40	210.00
10/17/17	BLP B150	CONFERENCE CALL WITH COMMITTEE RE PLAN ISSUES	.50	262.50
10/24/17	BLP B150	CORRESPONDENCE WITH COMMITTEE MEMBER RE PLAN PROCESS	.10	52.50
10/31/17	BLP B150	EMAILS WITH COMMITTEE AND FINANCIAL ADVISORS RE PLAN ISSUES, INCREASE IN PAYMENT TO GUCCS, CLAIMS RECONCILIATIONS	.40	210.00
		SUB TOTAL TIME		4,252.50

FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS

Founded 1850

BROOKLYN

LONG ISLAND

MANHATTAN

WASHINGTON, D.C.

ALBANY

NEW JERSEY

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5851592
November 27, 2017
Page 6

B160 FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS

10/02/17	NS	B160	FINALIZE MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION OF CULLEN AND DYKMAN RETENTION ORDER AND COORDINATE WITH K. LAFIURA RE: FILING AND SERVICE OF SAME	.30	180.00
10/02/17	KL	B160	REVIEW, ORGANIZE AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION FOR RETENTION OF CULLEN AND DYKMAN	.80	120.00
10/02/17	KL	B160	TEND TO SERVICE OF MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION FOR RETENTION OF CULLEN AND DYKMAN	.30	45.00
10/02/17	KL	B160	PREPARE CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE RE: MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION	.50	75.00
10/02/17	KL	B160	ELECTRONICALLY FILE CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE RE: MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION	.50	75.00
10/02/17	KL	B160	BEGIN REVISIONS TO TIME ENTRIES FOR FIRST MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	.90	135.00
10/03/17	NS	B160	CALL WITH K. LAFIURA RE: FEE APPLICATION	.10	60.00
10/04/17	NS	B160	REVIEW AND REVISE FIRST MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT AND TIME ENTRIES	2.80	1,680.00
10/05/17	KL	B160	REVIEW, REVISE, ORGANIZE AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE CULLEN AND DYKMAN LLP'S AUGUST 2017 MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	1.00	150.00
10/05/17	KL	B160	ORGANIZE AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE RE: CULLEN AND DYKMAN LLP'S AUGUST 2017 MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	.50	75.00
10/05/17	KL	B160	TEND TO SERVICE OF CULLEN AND DYKMAN LLP'S AUGUST 2017 MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	.30	45.00
10/09/17	BLP	B160	PREPARE CERTIFICATE OF COUNSEL RE RECONSIDERATION MOTION	.30	157.50
10/19/17	KL	B160	REVIEW LOCAL RULES RE: OBJECTION	.60	90.00

Founded 1850

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5851592
November 27, 2017
Page 7

10/20/17	KL	B160	DEADLINE FOR FEE APPLICATIONS PREPARE SEPTEMBER MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	1.00	150.00
10/20/17	KL	B160	PREPARE ORDER RE: SECOND MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	.50	75.00
10/20/17	KL	B160	PREPARE NOTICE RE: SECOND MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	.40	60.00
10/23/17	KL	B160	REVISE SEPTEMBER MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	.30	45.00
10/23/17	KL	B160	REVISE ORDER RE: SEPTEMBER MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	.20	30.00
10/23/17	KL	B160	PREPARE NOTICE RE: SEPTEMBER MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	.40	60.00
10/27/17	KL	B160	CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION RE: FIRST REQUEST FOR MONTHLY COMPENSATION	.60	90.00
10/27/17	KL	B160	EMAIL TO TEAM RE: CNO RE: FIRST MONTHLY REQUEST FOR FEES	.20	30.00
10/27/17	KL	B160	EMAIL TO TEAM RE: CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION TO FIRST REQUEST FOR FEES	.20	30.00
SUB TOTAL TIME					3,457.50

ASSUMPTION/REJECTION OF LEASES & CONTRAC

B185 ASSUMPTION/REJECTION OF LEASES & CONTRAC

10/02/17	BLP	B185	PREPARE RESPONSE TO MOTION TO ASSUME HENRY STREET LEASES	2.90	1,522.50
10/02/17	BLP	B185	REVIEW REVISIONS TO HENRY STREET ASSUMPTION	.40	210.00
10/02/17	NS	B185	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH J. TEELE AND B. POLLACK RE: LEASE ASSUMPTION MOTION	.30	180.00
10/02/17	TP	B185	STRATEGY CONFERENCE REGARDING REPLY TO MOTION TO ASSUME UNEXPIRED LEASE	.20	77.00
10/02/17	AC	B185	SHEPARDIZE KLEIN SLEEP PRODUCTS (2D CIR CASE) AND SEARCHED FOR 3D	2.30	529.00

Founded 1850

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5851592
November 27, 2017
Page 8

		CIR CASES RE: REJECTION OF AN ASSUMED LEASE RESULTING IN ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM		
10/03/17	BLP B185	FINALIZE HENRY STREET OBJECTION	.40	210.00
10/03/17	BLP B185	REVIEW MOTION TO EXTEND TIME TO ASSUME/REJECT AND CHART OUT PENDING MOTIONS	.50	262.50
10/03/17	NS B185	REVIEW AND FINALIZE RESPONSE TO MOTION TO ASSUME HENRY AVENUE LEASE	.70	420.00
10/17/17	BLP B185	CONFERENCES AND EMAILS RE HENRY AVENUE ASSUMPTION ISSUES	.20	105.00
10/17/17	BLP B185	CONFERENCE WITH T. POWERS RE PREPARATION FOR HEARING ON ASSUMPTION MOTION, BACKGROUND	.30	157.50
10/17/17	TP B185	ANALYSIS OF PLEADINGS FILED IN CONNECTION WITH DEBTOR'S MOTION TO ASSUME UNEXPIRED LEASES AND CASE LAW CITED THEREIN	1.30	500.50
10/17/17	TP B185	STRATEGY CONFERENCE RE: DEBTOR'S MOTION TO ASSUME UNEXPIRED LEASE	.30	115.50
		SUB TOTAL TIME		4,289.50
		OTHER CONTESTED MATTERS (EX ASSUMP/REJECT		
		B190 OTHER CONTESTED MATTERS (EX ASSUMP/REJECT		
10/04/17	BLP B190	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND HEARINGS IN CASE RE CEO SALARY	2.40	1,260.00
10/04/17	BLP B190	CONFERENCE WITH S. TEELE RE OUTCOME OF HEARING ON COMPENSATION, RETENTION ISSUES RAISED BY COURT	.20	105.00
10/16/17	BLP B190	DISCUSSION WITH DEBTORS COUNSEL RE STAY STIPULATIONS, ASSUMPTION MOTION, STATUS	.20	105.00
		SUB TOTAL TIME		1,470.00

Founded 1850

CULLENandDYKMANLLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5851592
November 27, 2017
Page 9

CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION AND OBJECTIONS

B310 CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION AND OBJECTIONS

10/13/17	BLP	B310	CORRESPONDENCE WITH DEBTOR COUNSEL RE SETTLEMENT WITH LIST ASSOC. RE ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM	.40	210.00
10/13/17	BLP	B310	CONFERENCE WITH S. TEELE RE LIST ASSOC. ISSUES	.20	105.00
10/18/17	BLP	B310	DISCUSSION WITH COUNSEL RE REVIEW OF CLAIMS FILED IN CASE BY SUBCONTRACTORS	.20	105.00
10/19/17	BLP	B310	REVIEW CLAIMS REGISTERS	.30	157.50
10/24/17	BLP	B310	PREPARE RESPONSE TO LIST ASSOC. MOTION RE ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM	.40	210.00
10/24/17	BLP	B310	REVIEW MOTION FOR PAYMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM BY HENRY AVE LANDLORD	.20	105.00
10/24/17	BLP	B310	REVIEW PROPOSED STIPULATION WITH LIST ASSOC. AND DISCUSSION WITH DEBTOR COUNSEL RE SAME	.30	157.50
10/25/17	BLP	B310	SEVERAL EMAILS AND DISCUSSIONS RE CLAIMS RECONCILIATION PROCESS	.40	210.00
10/26/17	BLP	B310	CONFERENCE RE S. TEELE RE CLAIMS ISSUES AND PROCESS	.20	105.00
10/31/17	BLP	B310	PREPARE FOR HEARING ON LIST ASSOC MOTION	.50	262.50
10/31/17	BLP	B310	DISCUSSION WITH S. BOSE RE SUBCONTRACTOR CLAIMS AND PAYMENTS	.20	105.00
SUB TOTAL TIME					1,732.50

PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT(INCL BUSIN

B320 PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT(INCL BUSIN

10/17/17	BLP	B320	DISCUSSIONS WITH FINANCIAL ADVISORS AND DEBTOR COUNSEL RE CHANGES REQUESTED BY COMMITTEE RE PLAN REGARDING DISTRIBUTIONS TO GUCCS	.30	157.50
----------	-----	------	---	-----	--------

Founded 1850

CULLENandDYKMANLLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5851592
November 27, 2017
Page 10

10/24/17	BLP	B320	DISCUSSION WITH DEBTOR COUNSEL RE PLAN CHANGES REQUESTED	.10	52.50
10/24/17	BLP	B320	EMAILS RE COMMITTEE REQUESTS RE PLAN DISTRIBUTIONS AND CLAIMS RECONCILIATIONS PROCESS	.20	105.00
SUB TOTAL TIME					315.00
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES					18,029.50
LESS DISCOUNT					-3,605.90
NET PROFESSIONAL SERVICES					14,423.60

Founded 1850

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

The Legal Center
One Riverfront Plaza
Newark, New Jersey 07102
Telephone (973) 849-0220 Facsimile (973)849-2020

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.

Control # 5887980
December 20, 2017
Page 2

For Professional Services Rendered Through November 30, 2017 regarding:

Client Number - 35008 - 000 GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.

Matter Number - 00001 IN RE WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al
REPRESENT OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF
UNSECURED CREDITORS IN CHAPTER 11
PROCEEDING
Potential Client E .00

DATE	INIT	TASK ACTVY	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
CASE ADMINISTRATION					
B110 CASE ADMINISTRATION					
11/06/17	KL	B110	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES	.50	75.00
11/06/17	KL	B110	UPDATE CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.50	75.00
11/06/17	KL	B110	EMAIL TO TEAM RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.20	30.00
11/15/17	KL	B110	REVIEW DOCKET RE: CRITICAL DATES	.60	90.00
11/15/17	KL	B110	UPDATE CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.80	120.00
11/15/17	KL	B110	EMAIL TO TEAM RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.10	15.00
11/15/17	KL	B110	TEND TO CALENDARING CRITICAL DATES IN TEAM CALENDAR	.30	45.00
11/28/17	KL	B110	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.40	60.00
11/28/17	KL	B110	REVIEW DOCKET RE: UPDATED CRITICAL DATES	.50	75.00
SUB TOTAL TIME					585.00

Founded 1850

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5887980
December 20, 2017
Page 3

RELIEF FR STAY/ADEQUATE PROTECTION PRCED
B140 STAY RELIEF/ADEQUATE PROTECTION PROC.

11/27/17	BLP	B140	EMAILS WITH DEBTORS COUNSEL RE ADDITIONAL VACATE STAY STIPULATION	.10	52.50
SUB TOTAL TIME					52.50

MEETINGS OF & COMMUNICATIONS W/ CREDITOR
B150 MEETINGS OF & COMMUNICATIONS W/CREDITORS

11/01/17	BLP	B150	DISCUSSIONS AND EMAILS WITH COMMITTEE AS A WHOLE AND VARIOUS MEMBERS RE PLAN ISSUES	2.10	1,102.50
11/01/17	SJT	B150	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH THE COMMITTEE RE: PLAN STATUS AND CLAIMS RECONCILIATION	1.10	660.00
11/09/17	BLP	B150	LENGHTY RESPONSE TO COMMITTEE QUESTIONS RE PLAN AND OTHER ISSUES	.40	210.00
11/13/17	BLP	B150	FINALIZE AND SEND LENGHTY EMAIL RE COMMITTEE PLAN ISSUES, CONCERNS	.20	105.00
11/22/17	BLP	B150	EMAILS WITH COMMITTEE MEMBER RE PLAN QUESTION	.20	105.00
11/29/17	BLP	B150	DISCUSSION WITH S. LACKS (CREDITOR) RE QUESTIONS ON CLAIMS, TIMING OF OBJECTIONS, ETC.	.20	105.00
SUB TOTAL TIME					2,287.50

FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS
B160 FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS

11/02/17	BLP	B160	DISCUSSION WITH J. CIANCULLI RE RECONSIDERATION OF RETENTION APPROVAL, STATUS OF CASE	.20	105.00
11/06/17	KL	B160	ORGANIZE AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION RE: CULLEN AND DYKMAN'S FIRST MONTHLY	.40	60.00

Founded 1850

BROOKLYN

LONG ISLAND

MANHATTAN

WASHINGTON, D.C.

ALBANY

NEW JERSEY

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5887980
December 20, 2017
Page 4

		FEE APPLICATION		
11/06/17	KL	B160	EMAIL TO TEAM RE: FILED	.20 30.00
			CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION	
11/14/17	NS	B160	REVIEW AND REVISE SEPTEMBER AND	.70 420.00
			OCTOBER INVOICES TO ENSURE	
			COMPLIANCE WITH US TRUSTEE	
			GUIDELINES	
11/20/17	KL	B160	PREPARE NOTICE RE: OCTOBER 2017	.30 45.00
			MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	
11/20/17	KL	B160	PREPARE ORDER RE: OCTOBER 2017	.20 30.00
			MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	
11/20/17	KL	B160	PREPARE OCTOBER 2017 MONTHLY FEE	.40 60.00
			APPLICATION	
11/21/17	NS	B160	REVIEW REVISED TIME ENTRIES TO	.20 120.00
			ENSURE COMPLIANCE WITH UST	
			GUIDELINES	
11/29/17	KL	B160	PREPARATION OF SECOND MONTHLY	3.60 540.00
			(SEPTEMBER 2017) FEE APPLICATION	
			WITH EXHIBITS	
11/29/17	KL	B160	PREPARATION OF OCTOBER MONTHLY FEE	1.50 225.00
			APPLICATION AND EXHIBITS	
11/30/17	KL	B160	EMAIL TO N. STEFANELLI AND J.	.30 45.00
			TEELE RE: SEPTEMBER MONTHLY FEE	
			APPLICATION FOR REVIEW, TOGETHER	
			WITH EXHIBITS TO SAME	
11/30/17	KL	B160	REVIEW AND REVISES SEPTEMBER	.60 90.00
			MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT AND EXHIBITS	
11/30/17	KL	B160	PREPARATION OF NOTICE RE: THIRD	.40 60.00
			MONTHLY FEE APPLICATIONS (OCTOBER	
			2017)	
11/30/17	KL	B160	PREPARATION OF ORDER RE: THIRD	.40 60.00
			MONTHLY FEE APPLICATIONS (OCTOBER	
			2017)	
11/30/17	KL	B160	PREPARATION OF APPLICATION RE:	1.40 210.00
			THIRD MONTHLY FEE APPLICATIONS	
			(OCTOBER 2017)	
11/30/17	KL	B160	PREPARATION OF EXHIBIT B RE: THIRD	.30 45.00
			MONTHLY FEE APPLICATIONS (OCTOBER	
			2017)	

Founded 1850

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5887980
December 20, 2017
Page 5

11/30/17	KL	B160	PREPARATION OF EXHIBIT A RE: THIRD MONTHLY FEE APPLICATIONS (OCTOBER 2017)	.50	75.00
11/30/17	KL	B160	EMAIL TO TEAM RE: THIRD MONTHLY FEE APPLICATIONS (OCTOBER 2017)	.30	45.00
SUB TOTAL TIME					2,265.00

CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION AND OBJECTIONS
B310 CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION AND OBJECTIONS

11/25/17	BLP	B310	REVIEW MOTION FOR PAYMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM BY SUBCONTRACTOR AND EMAILS WITH DEBTOR COUNSEL RE SAME	.30	157.50
SUB TOTAL TIME					157.50

PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (INCL BUSIN
B320 PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

11/01/17	BLP	B320	DISCUSSION WITH CITY ATTORNEY RE PLAN PAYMENTS	.20	105.00
11/02/17	BLP	B320	DISCUSSION WITH P. HUGHES RE COMMITTEE FINAL PLAN ISSUES	.20	105.00
11/03/17	BLP	B320	DISCUSSION WITH P. HUGHES RE FINAL OPEN COMMITTEE ISSUE (.1); EMAIL TO COMMITTEE RE SAME (.2)	.30	157.50
11/04/17	BLP	B320	REVIEW 3 OBJECTIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	.80	420.00
11/07/17	BLP	B320	SEVERAL EMAILS AND DISCUSSIONS WITH DEBTORS, COMMITTEE MEMBERS, LOCAL COUNSEL RE SUPPORT OF PLAN, OPEN ISSUES, DS OBJECTIONS, HEARING	1.30	682.50
11/08/17	BLP	B320	PREPARE FOR DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING	1.50	787.50
11/08/17	BLP	B320	EMAIL TO J. TEELE RE OUTCOME OF HEARING (.2); REVIEW AMENDMENTS TO	.50	262.50

Founded 1850

BROOKLYN

LONG ISLAND

MANHATTAN

WASHINGTON, D.C.

ALBANY

NEW JERSEY

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.

35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5887980

December 20, 2017

Page 6

11/08/17	BLP	B320	ORDER AND EMAILS RE SAME (.3) REVIEW AND COMMENT ON SEVERAL VERSIONS OF AMENDED PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	2.40	1,260.00
11/08/17	SJT	B320	CORRESPOND WITH B. POLLACK RE: DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND PLAN	.30	180.00
11/08/17	SJT	B320	REVIEW REVISED DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND PLAN ORDER	1.20	720.00
11/09/17	BLP	B320	REVIEW SEVERAL DRAFTS OF REVISED PLAN RELATED DOCUMENTS	1.20	630.00
11/09/17	BLP	B320	EMAILS AND DISCUSSIONS RE PLAN REVISIONS	.30	157.50
11/09/17	SJT	B320	CORRESPONDENCE FROM DEBTOR'S COUNSEL RE: DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	.20	120.00
11/09/17	SJT	B320	REVIEW ADDITIONAL REVISIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND PLAN	.90	540.00
11/16/17	BLP	B320	PREPARE PLAN SUPPORT LETTER	.60	315.00
11/17/17	BLP	B320	REVIEW PLAN SUPPORT LETTER AND EMAILS WITH COMMITTEE RE SAME	.30	157.50
11/20/17	BLP	B320	REVISE AND SEND PLAN SUPPORT LETTER	.20	105.00
11/27/17	BLP	B320	DISCUSSION WITH LOCAL COUNSEL RE STATUS WITH PLAN, M&T (.2); EMAILS WITH DEBTORS COUNSEL RE SAME (.1)	.30	157.50
11/29/17	BLP	B320	REVIEW OBJECTION TO CONFIRMATION	.20	105.00
11/04/18	SJT	B320	REVIEW THREE OBJECTIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	.60	360.00
11/08/18	SJT	B320	REVIEW EMAIL FROM B. POLLACK RE: OUTCOME OF HEARING	.10	60.00
11/08/18	SJT	B320	REVIEW AMENDMENTS TO ORDER AND EMAILS RE: SAME	.20	120.00
11/16/18	SJT	B320	REVIEW PLAN SUPPORT LETTER	.40	240.00
11/29/18	SJT	B320	REVIEW OBJECTION TO CONFIRMATION	.20	120.00

SUB TOTAL TIME

7,867.50

GENERAL BANKRUPTCY ADVICE/OPINIONS

B410 GENERAL BANKRUPTCY ADVICE

Founded 1850

BROOKLYN

LONG ISLAND

MANHATTAN

WASHINGTON, D.C.

ALBANY

NEW JERSEY

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5887980
December 20, 2017
Page 7

11/08/17	SJT	B410	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. POLLACK RE: TODAY'S HEARING	.20	120.00
SUB TOTAL TIME					120.00

COURT HEARINGS
B430A COURT HEARINGS

11/01/17	BLP	B430A	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND HEARINGS IN CASE- VARIOUS MOTIONS INCLUDING LIST ASSOCIATES	3.80	1,995.00
11/08/17	BLP	B430A	ATTEND HEARING ON DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	2.80	1,470.00
SUB TOTAL TIME					3,465.00

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES	16,800.00
LESS DISCOUNT	-3,360.00
NET PROFESSIONAL SERVICES	13,440.00

Founded 1850

BROOKLYN

LONG ISLAND

MANHATTAN

WASHINGTON, D.C.

ALBANY

NEW JERSEY

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

The Legal Center
 One Riverfront Plaza
 Newark, New Jersey 07102
 Telephone (973) 849-0220 Facsimile (973)849-2020

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.

Control # 5888720

January 16, 2018

Page 2

For Professional Services Rendered Through December 31, 2017 regarding:

Client Number - 35008 - 000 GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.

Matter Number - 00001

IN RE WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al
 REPRESENT OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF
 UNSECURED CREDITORS IN CHAPTER 11
 PROCEEDING

Potential Client E .00

DATE	INIT	TASK	ACTVYDESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
CASE ADMINISTRATION					
B110 CASE ADMINISTRATION					
12/08/17	KL	B110	REVIEW DOCKET RE: CRITICAL DATES	.20	30.00
12/18/17	BLP	B110	CONFERENCE WITH J. TEELE RE: OUTCOME OF HEARING	.20	105.00
12/18/17	SJT	B110	CONFERENCE WITH B. POLLACK RE: OUTCOME OF HEARING	.20	120.00
12/21/17	KL	B110	REVIEW DOCKET RE: CRITICAL DATES	.20	30.00
12/21/17	KL	B110	UPDATE CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.40	60.00
12/21/17	KL	B110	EMAIL TO TEAM RE: CRITICAL DATES	.40	60.00
12/28/17	KL	B110	REVIEW DOCKET RE: CRITICAL DATES	.30	45.00
SUB TOTAL TIME					450.00
MEETINGS OF & COMMUNICATIONS W/ CREDITOR					
B150 MEETINGS OF & COMMUNICATIONS W/CREDITORS					
12/18/17	BLP	B150	CORRESPONDENCE TO COMMITTEE RE CONFIRMATION HEARING, OUTCOME,	.30	157.50

Founded 1850

BROOKLYN

LONG ISLAND

MANHATTAN

WASHINGTON, D.C.

ALBANY

NEW JERSEY

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5888720
January 16, 2018
Page 3

ESTIMATED EFFECTIVE DATE

SUB TOTAL TIME 157.50

FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS

B160 FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS

12/06/17	KL	B160	REVISE SECOND MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION, NOTICE, ORDER AND EXHIBITS	.90	135.00
12/06/17	KL	B160	EMAIL TO N. STEFANELLI RE: REVISED SECOND MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	.20	30.00
12/06/17	KL	B160	EMAIL TO N. STEFANELLI RE: REVISED THIRD MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	.20	30.00
12/06/17	KL	B160	REVISE THIRD MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION, NOTICE, ORDER AND EXHIBITS	.90	135.00
12/08/17	NS	B160	REVIEW AND REVISE SECOND AND THIRD MONTHLY FEE STATEMENTS, INCLUDING CALLS WITH J. TEELE AND K. LAFIURA RE: SAME	1.80	1,080.00
12/08/17	KL	B160	ORGANIZE, ELECTRONICALLY FILE AND TEND TO SERVICE OF SECOND MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	.90	135.00
12/08/17	KL	B160	ORGANIZE, ELECTRONICALLY FILE AND TEND TO SERVICE OF THIRD MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	.90	135.00
12/11/17	KL	B160	PREPARE CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE RE: SECOND AND THIRD REQUEST FOR PAYMENT OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES	.70	105.00
12/11/17	KL	B160	EMAIL TO N. STEFANELLI RE: CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE FOR SECOND AND THIRD REQUEST FOR PAYMENT OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES	.20	30.00
12/11/17	KL	B160	UPDATE FEE APPLICATION CHART	.50	75.00
12/12/17	KL	B160	ORGANIZE AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE RE: SECOND	.60	90.00

Founded 1850

CULLENandDYKMANLLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5888720
January 16, 2018
Page 4

		AND THIRD REQUEST FOR COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES		
12/14/17	KL B160	PREPARATION OF FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION	1.90	285.00
12/14/17	KL B160	PREPARATION OF EXHIBIT A RE: FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION	.80	120.00
12/14/17	KL B160	PREPARATION OF EXHIBIT B RE: FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION	.40	60.00
12/14/17	KL B160	PREPARATION OF EXHIBIT C RE: FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION	.40	60.00
12/14/17	KL B160	PREPARATION PROPOSED ORDER RE: FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION	.40	60.00
12/14/17	KL B160	PREPARATION OF NOTICE RE: FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION	.40	60.00
12/18/17	BLP B160	REVIEW DOCKET RE: FEE APPLICATIONS FILED AFTER COURT INQUIRY	.20	105.00
12/21/17	NS B160	EXCHANGE E-MAILS WITH TEAM RE: INTERIM AND FINAL FEE APPLICATIONS	.10	60.00
12/28/17	KL B160	REVIEW PLAN RE: FINAL APPLICATIONS FOR PROFESSIONALS DUE DATE	.50	75.00

SUB TOTAL TIME 2,865.00

CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION AND OBJECTIONS

B310 CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION AND OBJECTIONS

12/13/17	BLP B310	REVIEW AMENDED DOL CLAIM	.20	105.00
----------	----------	--------------------------	-----	--------

SUB TOTAL TIME 105.00

PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT(INCL BUSIN

B320 PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

12/07/17	BLP B320	DISCUSSION WITH DEBTORS COUNSEL RE: STATUS OF PLAN NEGOTIATIONS, INCLUDING EMAILS RE: BALLOTS, ETC.	.40	210.00
12/09/17	BLP B320	REVIEW CHANGES TO PLAN AND EMAILS RE: SAME	.30	157.50
12/09/17	BLP B320	REVIEW LANDLORD OBJECTION TO PLAN	.20	105.00

Founded 1850

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5888720
January 16, 2018
Page 5

12/09/17	SJT	B320	REVIEW CHANGES TO PLAN AND EMAILS RE: SAME	.20	120.00
12/09/17	SJT	B320	REVIEW LANDLORD OBJECTION TO PLAN	.20	120.00
12/12/17	BLP	B320	ATTEND MEETING IN PA RE PLAN CHANGES, CONFIRMATION ISSUES	2.70	1,417.50
12/12/17	BLP	B320	REVIEW REVISED PLAN AND CONFIRMATION ORDER AND EMAILS RE CHANGES SUGGESTED	.80	420.00
12/12/17	SJT	B320	REVIEW REVISED PLAN AND CONFIRMATION ORDER AND EMAILS RE: CHANGES SUGGESTED	.60	360.00
12/13/17	BLP	B320	REVIEW FURTHER DRAFTS OF REVISIONS TO PLAN DOCUMENTS AND EMAILS RE SAME	.60	315.00
12/13/17	SJT	B320	REVIEW FURTHER DRAFTS OF REVISIONS TO PLAN DOCUMENTS AND EMAILS RE: SAME	.40	240.00
12/18/17	BLP	B320	PREPARE FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING INCLUDING REVIEW OF REPORT OF BALLOTING AND BRIEF, AND PLAN DOCUMENTS	1.20	630.00
12/21/17	KL	B320	REVIEW PLAN	.50	75.00
12/28/17	KL	B320	REVIEW PLAN CONFIRMATION ORDER	.30	45.00
12/28/17	KL	B320	EMAIL TO S. TEELE RE: PLAN EFFECTIVE DATE AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION DEADLINE	.20	30.00

SUB TOTAL TIME 4,245.00

COURT HEARINGS

B430A COURT HEARINGS

12/18/17	BLP	B430A	ATTEND CONFIRMATION HEARING	2.00	1,050.00
SUB TOTAL TIME					1,050.00

SCHEDULES AND STATEMENTS

B440 SCHEDULES AND STATEMENTS

Founded 1850

BROOKLYN

LONG ISLAND

MANHATTAN

WASHINGTON, D.C.

ALBANY

NEW JERSEY

CULLEN and DYKMAN LLP

GUCC - WORDSWORTH ACADEMY, et al.
35008 - 000 / 1

Control # 5888720
January 16, 2018
Page 6

12/13/17	BLP	B440	SEVERAL DISCUSSIONS RE: PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO SCHEDULES, TIMING, ETC.	.50	262.50
12/27/17	BLP	B440	REVIEW AMENDMENTS TO SCHEDULES, INCLUDING EMAIL TO COMMITTEE RE: SAME	.40	210.00
SUB TOTAL TIME					472.50
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES					9,345.00
LESS DISCOUNT					-1,869.00
NET PROFESSIONAL SERVICES					7,476.00

Founded 1850