

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
HOUSTON DIVISION**

| | | |
|---------------------------------------------------------|---|-------------------------|
| In re: |) | |
| |) | Chapter 11 |
| WESTMORELAND COAL COMPANY, <i>et al.</i> , ¹ |) | Case No. 18-35672 (DRJ) |
| |) | |
| Debtors. |) | (Jointly Administered) |
| |) | |

NOTICE OF FEE APPLICATION

TO: (I) THE OFFICE OF THE U.S. TRUSTEE; (II) THE DEBTORS; (III) COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that Morrison & Foerster LLP (the “Applicant”) has filed its *Third Monthly Fee Application of Morrison & Foerster LLP for Compensation for Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Expenses as Counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors for the Period from December 1, 2018 through December 31, 2018* (the “Application”) with the Court. The Application seeks allowance of fees in the amount of \$1,211,792.00, less a twenty percent (20%) holdback in the amount of \$242,358.40 for a total fee request of \$969,433.60, plus reimbursement of expenses in the amount of \$23,741.70.

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that objections to the Application, if any, are required to be filed on or before **March 12, 2019 at 4:00 p.m. (CT)** (the “Objection Deadline”) with the Clerk of the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District of Texas, United States Courthouse, 515 Rusk Avenue, Houston, TX 77002. You must also serve any such objection so as to be received by the following on or before the Objection Deadline: (i) the Debtors, Westmoreland Coal Company, 9540 South Maroon Circle, Suite 300, Englewood, Colorado 80112, Attn: Jennifer Grafton (jgrafton@westmoreland.com); (ii) counsel to the Debtors, Kirkland & Ellis LLP, 300 North LaSalle, Chicago, Illinois 60654, Attn: Gregory F. Pesce (gregory.pesce@kirkland.com) and Timothy R. Bow (timothy.bow@kirkland.com); (iii) co-counsel for the Debtors, Jackson Walker LLP, 1401 McKinney Street, Suite 1900, Houston, Texas 77010 Attn: Patricia B. Tomasco (ptomasco@jw.com), Matthew D. Cavanaugh (mcavanaugh@jw.com) and Jennifer F. Wertz (jwertz@jw.com); (iv) counsel to the ad hoc group of secured creditors of Westmoreland Coal Company, Kramer Levin Naftalis & Frankel LLP, 1177 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10036, Attn.: Thomas Moers Mayer (tmayer@kramerlevin.com) and Stephen Zide (szide@kramerlevin.com); (v) counsel to the ad hoc

¹ Due to the large number of debtors in these chapter 11 cases, for which joint administration has been granted, a complete list of the debtors and the last four digits of their tax identification, registration, or like numbers is not provided herein. A complete list of such information may be obtained on the website of the Debtors’ claims and noticing agent in these chapter 11 cases at www.donlinrecano.com/westmoreland. Westmoreland Coal Company’s service address for the purposes of these chapter 11 cases is 9540 South Maroon Circle, Suite 300, Englewood, Colorado 80112.

group of secured creditors of Westmoreland Resource Partners, LP, Schulte Roth & Zabel LLP, 919 Third Avenue, New York, New York 10022, Attn.: David M. Hillman (david.hillman@srz.com) and Kristine G. Manoukian (kristine.manoukian@srz.com); (vi) counsel to the Conflicts Committee of the Board of Directors for Westmoreland Resource Partners GP, LLC, and conflicts counsel for the WMLP Debtors, Jones Day, 77 W. Wacker Dr., Chicago, Illinois 60601, Attn.: Timothy Hoffmann (thoffmann@jonesday.com), Jones Day, 901 Lakeside Ave, Cleveland, OH 44114 Attn.: Heather Lennox (hlennox@jonesday.com); (vii) counsel to any statutory committee appointed in these cases; and (viii) the Office of the United States Trustee, 515 Rusk Street Houston, Texas 77002.

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE THAT PURSUANT TO THE ORDER ESTABLISHING PROCEDURES FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES OF PROFESSIONALS [DOCKET NO. 495], IF NO OBJECTIONS ARE FILED AND SERVED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE ABOVE PROCEDURES, THE DEBTORS WILL BE AUTHORIZED TO PAY 80% OF THE FEES AND 100% OF THE EXPENSES REQUESTED IN THE APPLICATION, WITHOUT FURTHER ORDER OF THE COURT.

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE THAT ONLY IF AN OBJECTION IS PROPERLY AND TIMELY FILED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE ABOVE PROCEDURES AND CANNOT BE CONSENSUALLY RESOLVED WILL A HEARING BE HELD ON THE APPLICATION.

Dated: February 19, 2019

/s/ Michael D. Warner
Michael D. Warner, Esq. (TX Bar No. 00792304)
COLE SCHOTZ P.C.
301 Commerce Street, Suite 1700
Fort Worth, Texas 76102
Telephone: (817) 810-5250
Facsimile: (817) 810-5255
mwarner@coleschotz.com

-and-

Lorenzo Marinuzzi, Esq. (Admitted *Pro Hac Vice*)
Todd Goren, Esq. (Admitted *Pro Hac Vice*)
Jennifer L. Marines, Esq. (Admitted *Pro Hac Vice*)
MORRISON & FOERSTER LLP
250 West 55th Street
New York, New York 10019
Telephone: (212) 468-8000
Facsimile: (212) 468-7900
lmarinuzzi@mofocom
tgoren@mofocom
jmarines@mofocom

Counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
HOUSTON DIVISION**

| | | |
|---------------------------------------------------------|---|-------------------------|
| In re: |) | |
| |) | Chapter 11 |
| WESTMORELAND COAL COMPANY, <i>et al.</i> , ¹ |) | Case No. 18-35672 (DRJ) |
| |) | |
| Debtors. |) | (Jointly Administered) |
| |) | |

**THIRD MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION OF MORRISON & FOERSTER
LLP FOR COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND
REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS COUNSEL TO THE OFFICIAL
COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS FOR THE PERIOD
FROM DECEMBER 1, 2018 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2018**

| | | |
|---------------------------------------------------------------------|-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|----------------------|
| Name of Applicant: | Morrison & Foerster LLP (“ <u>Morrison & Foerster</u> ”) | |
| Applicant’s Role in Case: | Counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the “ <u>Committee</u> ”) | |
| Date Order of Employment Signed: | 11/28/2018 [Docket No. 621] | |
| | Beginning of Period | End of Period |
| Time period covered by this Application: | 12/01/2018 | 12/31/2018 |
| Time period(s) covered by prior Applications: | 11/01/2018 | 11/30/18 |
| Total amounts awarded in all prior Applications: | \$817,872.28 | |
| Total fees requested in this Application: | \$1,211,792.00 (80% = \$969,433.60) | |
| Total professional fees requested in this Application: | \$1,148,814.00 | |
| Total actual professional hours covered by this Application: | 1,658.10 | |
| Average hourly rate for professionals: | \$692.85 | |
| Total paraprofessional fees requested in this Application: | \$62,978.00 | |

¹ Due to the large number of debtors in these chapter 11 cases, for which joint administration has been granted, a complete list of the debtors and the last four digits of their tax identification, registration, or like numbers is not provided herein. A complete list of such information may be obtained on the website of the Debtors’ claims and noticing agent in these chapter 11 cases at www.donlinrecano.com/westmoreland. Westmoreland Coal Company’s service address for the purposes of these chapter 11 cases is 9540 South Maroon Circle, Suite 300, Englewood, Colorado 80112.

| | |
|-------------------------------------------------------------------------|-------------|
| Total actual paraprofessional hours covered by this Application: | 180.90 |
| Average hourly rate for paraprofessionals: | \$348.14 |
| Reimbursable expenses sought in this application: | \$23,741.70 |

SUMMARY OF FEE/EXPENSE ALLOCATION²

WMLP Debtors

Direct Fees (Net of 20% Holdback): \$83,539.60

Direct Expenses: \$5,588.54

Share of Collective Fees (Net of 20% Holdback): \$170,998.56

Share of Collective Expenses: \$2,686.84

Fee/Expense Request for WMLP Debtors: \$262,813.54

WLB Debtors

Direct Fees (Net of 20% Holdback): \$315,898.80

Direct Expenses: \$9,197.02

Share of Collective Fees (Net of 20% Holdback): \$398,996.64

Share of Collective Expenses: \$6,269.30

Fee/Expense Request for WLB Debtors: \$730,361.76

Morrison & Foerster LLP (“Morrison & Foerster” or the “Applicant”) hereby files its Third Monthly Fee Application (the “Application”) as counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the “Committee”) for allowance of compensation for professional services rendered and reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses incurred for the period from December 1, 2018 through December 31, 2018 (the “Compensation Period”). Morrison & Foerster files this

² In light of the *Debtors’ Emergency Motion for Entry of an Order Authorizing and Approving Intercompany Settlement Term Sheet* [Docket No. 1367] currently pending before the Court, Morrison & Foerster has allocated (a) 70% of its joint fees and expenses to the WLB Debtors and (b) 30% of such fees and expenses to the WMLP Debtors.

Application pursuant to sections 330, 331 and 1103 of title 11 of the United States Code (the “Bankruptcy Code”), rule 2016(a) of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the “Bankruptcy Rules”), rule 2016-1 of the Local Rules of Bankruptcy Practice and Procedure of the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District of Texas (the “Local Rules”), the *Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals* [Docket No. 495] (the “Interim Compensation Order”), and the *Order Approving Application for Approval of the Employment of Morrison & Foerster LLP as Counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors, Effective October 22, 2018* [Docket No. 621] (the “Retention Order”). Morrison & Foerster makes this Application for allowance of compensation for professional services rendered in the amount of \$1,211,792.00, less a twenty percent (20%) holdback in the amount of \$242,358.40, for a total fee request of \$969,433.60, and reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses incurred in the amount of \$23,741.70, as counsel to the Committee during the Compensation Period.

Itemization of Services Rendered and Disbursements Incurred

1. In support of this Monthly Fee Statement, attached are the following exhibits:
 - **Exhibit A** is a schedule of the number of hours expended by Morrison & Foerster attorneys and paraprofessionals who rendered professional services on behalf of the Committee during the Compensation Period;
 - **Exhibit B** is a schedule of the blended rates for Morrison & Foerster attorneys and paraprofessionals who rendered professional services on behalf of the Committee during the Compensation Period;
 - **Exhibit C** is a schedule setting forth the professional services rendered by project category by Morrison & Foerster on behalf of the Committee during the Compensation Period;
 - **Exhibit D** is a schedule of the expenses incurred by Morrison & Foerster during the Compensation Period for which Morrison & Foerster is seeking reimbursement; and

- **Exhibit E** consists of Morrison & Foerster's records of fees and expenses incurred by Morrison & Foerster on behalf of the Committee during the Compensation Period.

CONCLUSION

WHEREFORE, Morrison & Foerster respectfully requests that allowance be made for compensation in the amount of \$1,211,792.00, less a twenty percent (20%) holdback in the amount of \$242,358.40, for a total fee request of \$969,433.60 together with reimbursement of expenses in the amount of \$23,741.70, and further requests such other and further relief as this Court deems necessary and just.

Dated: February 19, 2019

/s/ Michael D. Warner
Michael D. Warner, Esq. (TX Bar No. 00792304)
COLE SCHOTZ P.C.
301 Commerce Street, Suite 1700
Fort Worth, Texas 76102
Telephone: (817) 810-5250
Facsimile: (817) 810-5255
mwarner@coleschotz.com

-and-

Lorenzo Marinuzzi, Esq. (Admitted *Pro Hac Vice*)
Todd Goren, Esq. (Admitted *Pro Hac Vice*)
Jennifer L. Marines, Esq. (Admitted *Pro Hac Vice*)
MORRISON & FOERSTER LLP
250 West 55th Street
New York, New York 10019
Telephone: (212) 468-8000
Facsimile: (212) 468-7900
lmarinuzzi@mofocom
tgoren@mofocom
jmarines@mofocom

Counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors

EXHIBIT A

**SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED
BY MORRISON & FOERSTER ON BEHALF OF THE
COMMITTEE DURING THE COMPENSATION PERIOD**

The Morrison & Foerster attorneys and paraprofessionals who rendered professional services in these cases during the Compensation Period are:

| Name of Professional Person | Title, Department & Earliest Licensure / Experience | Hourly Billing Rate | WMLP Debtors | | WLB Debtors | | Joint Matters ¹ | |
|--------------------------------|-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|---------------------|--------------------|--------------------|--------------------|--------------------|----------------------------|--------------------|
| | | | Total Billed Hours | Total Compensation | Total Billed Hours | Total Compensation | Total Billed Hours | Total Compensation |
| Partners and Of Counsel | | | | | | | | |
| Bell, Jeffery | Title: Partner Dep't: Corporate Admission: 2001 | \$1,025.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 5.00 | \$5,125.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 |
| Carbone, Anthony J. | Title: Partner Dep't: Tax Admission: 1982 | \$1,500.00 | 1.00 | \$1,500.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 |
| Doufekias, Demme | Title: Partner Dep't: Litigation Admission: 2003 | \$975.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 22.70 | \$22,132.50 | 90.20 | \$87,945.00 |
| Goren, Todd M. | Title: Partner Dep't: Business, Restructuring & Insolvency Group ² Admission: 2003 | \$1,075.00 | 3.50 | \$3,762.50 | 58.20 | \$62,565.00 | 31.30 | \$33,647.50 |

¹ The "Joint Matters" fees and expenses are Collective Fees and, pursuant to the terms of the Interim Compensation Order, shall be allocated between WMLP Debtors and the WLB Debtors in the same proportion that the amount of Direct Fees incurred by Morrison & Forester for each group of Debtors bears to the total amount of Direct Fees incurred by Morrison & Forester with respect to all Debtors. As set forth in the Interim Compensation Order, all parties in interest, including all official committees appointed in these cases as well as the U.S. Trustee and any fee examiner appointed in these cases, has the right to object to any proposed allocation in connection with any interim or final fee application.

² Hereinafter referred to as "BRIG".

| Name of Professional Person | Title, Department & Earliest Licensure / Experience | Hourly Billing Rate | WMLP Debtors | | WLB Debtors | | Joint Matters ¹ | |
|---------------------------------|-------------------------------------------------------------|---------------------|--------------------|--------------------|--------------------|--------------------|----------------------------|--------------------|
| | | | Total Billed Hours | Total Compensation | Total Billed Hours | Total Compensation | Total Billed Hours | Total Compensation |
| Marines, Jennifer L. | Title: Partner Dep't: BRIG Admission: 2005 | \$1,025.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 20.20 | \$20,705.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 |
| Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | Title: Partner Dep't: BRIG Admission: 1996 | \$1,195.00 | 3.30 | \$3,943.50 | 34.60 | \$41,347.00 | 62.40 | \$74,568.00 |
| Dopsch, Peter C. | Title: Senior Counsel Dep't: Finance Admission: 1987 | \$1,075.00 | 3.70 | \$3,977.50 | 3.50 | \$3,762.50 | 25.00 | \$26,875.00 |
| Richards, Erica J. | Title: Of Counsel Dep't: BRIG Admission: 2007 | \$875.00 | 2.70 | \$2,362.50 | 24.80 | \$21,700.00 | 32.40 | \$28,350.00 |
| Associates and Attorneys | | | | | | | | |
| Adeseye, Tola | Title: Associate Dep't: Litigation Admission: 2016 | \$575.00 | 1.70 | \$977.50 | 2.60 | \$1,495.00 | 52.70 | \$30,302.50 |
| Anabi, Andrew Issa | Title: Associate Dep't: Finance Admission: Pending | \$475.00 | 1.30 | \$617.50 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 47.90 | \$22,752.50 |
| Bell, Mike | Title: Associate Dep't: Litigation Admission: 2018 | \$715.00 | 1.60 | \$1,144.00 | 2.70 | \$1,930.50 | 33.90 | \$24,238.50 |
| Butterfield, Benjamin | Title: Associate Dep't: BRIG Admission: 2014 | \$725.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 51.00 | \$36,975.00 | 7.20 | \$5,220.00 |
| Fayyad, Khaled Salam | Title: Associate Dep't: Litigation Admission: Pending | \$475.00 | 13.50 | \$6,412.50 | 56.50 | \$26,837.50 | 0.00 | \$0.00 |
| Frost, Alison | Title: Associate Dep't: Litigation Admission: Pending | \$460.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 35.70 | \$16,422.00 |

| Name of Professional Person | Title, Department & Earliest Licensure / Experience | Hourly Billing Rate | WMLP Debtors | | WLB Debtors | | Joint Matters ¹ | |
|-----------------------------|----------------------------------------------------------------------|---------------------|--------------------|--------------------|--------------------|--------------------|----------------------------|--------------------|
| | | | Total Billed Hours | Total Compensation | Total Billed Hours | Total Compensation | Total Billed Hours | Total Compensation |
| Gambier, Lauren | Title: Associate Dep't: Litigation Admission: 2013 | \$775.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 23.60 | \$18,290.00 | 66.80 | \$51,770.00 |
| Harris, Daniel J. | Title: Associate Dep't: BRIG Admission: 2008 | \$875.00 | 16.10 | \$14,087.50 | 32.30 | \$28,262.50 | 37.00 | \$32,375.00 |
| Heo, Min W. J. | Title: Associate Dep't: Finance Admission: 2015 | \$660.00 | 10.40 | \$6,864.00 | 16.90 | \$11,154.00 | 21.50 | \$14,190.00 |
| Jensen, Sofie | Title: Visiting Int'l Attorney Dep't: Finance Experience: 2018 | \$275.00 | 2.90 | \$797.50 | 20.90 | \$5,747.50 | 0.00 | \$0.00 |
| Kagel, Benjamin S. | Title: Associate Dep't: Litigation Admission: 2017 | \$460.00 | 1.30 | \$598.00 | 1.90 | \$874.00 | 22.40 | \$10,304.00 |
| Kissner, Andrew | Title: Associate Dep't: BRIG Admission: 2017 | \$525.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 20.20 | \$10,605.00 | 45.50 | \$23,887.50 |
| Mahyera, Rohani | Title: Associate Dep't: Finance Admission: 2013 | \$725.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 6.90 | \$5,002.50 |
| Masykanova, Aisulu | Title: Associate Dep't: Finance Admission: 2013 | \$775.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 |
| Mateo, Kat E. | Title: Associate Dep't: Litigation Admission: 2017 | \$600.00 | 26.50 | \$15,900.00 | 45.00 | \$27,000.00 | 1.70 | \$1,020.00 |
| Mbakwe, Jason N. | Title: Associate Dep't: Litigation Admission: 2017 | \$535.00 | 3.60 | 1,926.00 | 4.80 | \$2,568.00 | 168.70 | \$90,254.50 |

| Name of Professional Person | Title, Department & Earliest Licensure / Experience | Hourly Billing Rate | WMLP Debtors | | WLB Debtors | | Joint Matters ¹ | |
|-----------------------------|----------------------------------------------------------|---------------------|--------------------|--------------------|--------------------|--------------------|----------------------------|--------------------|
| | | | Total Billed Hours | Total Compensation | Total Billed Hours | Total Compensation | Total Billed Hours | Total Compensation |
| Miriyala, Arvind S. | Title: Associate Dep't: Litigation Admission: 2018 | \$460.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 3.30 | \$1,518.00 |
| Pundeff, Karina N. | Title: Associate Dep't: Litigation Admission: 2018 | \$460.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 7.90 | \$3,634.00 |
| Radzinski, Julian N. | Title: Associate Dep't: Litigation Admission: 2014 | \$725.00 | 3.10 | \$2,247.50 | 6.80 | \$4,930.00 | 37.70 | \$27,332.50 |
| Richardson Arnould, Kat | Title: Associate Dep't: BRIG Admission: 2018 | \$475.00 | 51.70 | \$24,557.50 | 48.10 | \$22,847.50 | 16.60 | \$7,885.00 |
| Rosenberg, Adam N. | Title: Associate Dep't: Litigation Admission: 2018 | \$460.00 | 19.50 | \$8,970.00 | 4.30 | \$1,978.00 | 62.80 | 28,888.00 |
| Sassoon, Harriet | Title: Associate Dep't: Litigation Admission: 2015 | \$600.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 12.00 | \$7,200.00 |
| Scheinok, Brittany | Title: Associate Dep't: Litigation Admission: 2015 | \$550.00 | 1.40 | \$770.00 | 2.10 | \$1,155.00 | 15.00 | \$8,250.00 |
| Wang, Jenny | Title: Associate Dep't: Corporate Admission: 2011 | \$800.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 9.70 | \$7,760.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 |
| Zidel, Max Phillip | Title: Associate Dep't: Litigation Admission: 2017 | \$475.00 | 5.20 | \$2,470.00 | 7.30 | \$3,467.50 | 13.90 | \$6,602.50 |

| Paraprofessionals | | | | | | | | |
|-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|----------|---------------|---------------------|---------------|---------------------|-----------------|---------------------|
| Bergelson, Vadim | Title: eDiscovery Project Manager Dep't: Litigation Experience: 9.5 years | \$330.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 1.90 | \$627.00 | 40.50 | \$13,365.00 |
| Braun, Danielle E. | Title: Paralegal Dep't: BRIG Experience: 5 years | \$340.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 25.60 | \$8,704.00 | 6.00 | \$2,040.00 |
| Effendowicz, Alexander | Title: Trainee Solicitor Dep't: Finance Experience: 5 months | \$385.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 10.80 | \$4,158.00 |
| Konjuhi, Alex | Title: Paralegal Dep't: Litigation Experience: 1.5 years | \$385.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 71.80 | \$27,643.00 |
| Musto, Michael | Title: Paralegal Dep't: Real Estate Experience: 6 months | \$245.00 | 2.20 | \$539.00 | 2.30 | \$563.50 | 0.30 | \$73.50 |
| Zaccarelli, Monet D. | Title: Paralegal Dep't: Finance Experience: 3.5 years | \$270.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 19.50 | \$5,265.00 |
| Total Incurred: | | | 176.20 | \$104,424.50 | 555.50 | \$401,108.50 | 1,107.30 | \$722,979.00 |
| Less Client Accommodation for Non-Working Travel (50% of Fees Incurred): | | | | (\$0.00) | | (\$6,235.00) | | (\$8,962.50) |
| Less Client Accommodation for Time Entry Review (100% of Fees Incurred): | | | | (\$0.00) | | (\$0.00) | | (\$1,522.50) |
| Total Requested: | | | 176.20 | \$104,424.50 | 555.50 | \$394,873.50 | | \$712,494.00 |

EXHIBIT B

Blended Rates

| Professionals | WMLP Debtors | | | WLB Debtors | | | Joint Matters | | |
|--------------------------------------------------------------------------|-----------------|--------------------|---------------------|-----------------|--------------------|---------------------|-----------------|--------------------|---------------------|
| | Blended Rates | Total Hours Billed | Total Compensation | Blended Rates | Total Hours Billed | Total Compensation | Blended Rates | Total Hours Billed | Total Compensation |
| Partners and Counsel | \$1,094.79 | 14.20 | \$15,546.00 | \$1,049.33 | 169.00 | \$177,337.00 | \$1,029.00 | 244.30 | \$251,385.50 |
| Associates and Attorneys | \$552.81 | 159.80 | \$88,339.50 | \$599.60 | 356.70 | \$213,877.00 | \$584.37 | 717.10 | \$419,049.00 |
| Total Incurred by All Attorneys: | \$597.04 | 174.00 | \$103,885.50 | \$744.18 | 525.70 | \$391,214.00 | \$697.35 | 961.40 | \$670,434.50 |
| Less Client Accommodation for Non-Working Travel (50% of Fees Incurred): | | | (\$0.00) | | | (\$6,235.00) | | | (\$8,962.50) |
| Less Client Accommodation for Time Entry Review (100% of Fees Incurred): | | | (\$0.00) | | | (\$0.00) | | | (\$1,522.50) |
| Blended Attorney Rate: | \$597.04 | 174.00 | 103,885.50 | \$732.32 | 525.70 | \$384,979.00 | \$686.45 | 961.40 | \$659,949.50 |
| Paraprofessionals and Non-Legal Staff | | | | | | | | | |
| Total Requested: | \$245.00 | 2.20 | \$539.00 | \$332.03 | 29.80 | \$9,894.50 | \$352.88 | 148.90 | \$52,544.50 |

EXHIBIT C

**SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED BY PROJECT CATEGORY BY
MORRISON & FOERSTER ON BEHALF OF THE COMMITTEE DURING THE COMPENSATION PERIOD¹**

| Project Category | Description | WMLP Debtors | | WLB Debtors | | Joint Matters | |
|---------------------------------------------------------------------------------|--------------------------------------------------|---------------|---------------------|---------------|---------------------|-----------------|---------------------|
| | | Hours | Fees | Hours | Fees | Hours | Fees |
| 001 | Asset Analysis and Recover | 97.50 | \$56,762.00 | 147.90 | \$78,548.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 |
| 002 | Asset Dispositiony | 1.60 | \$1,828.00 | 23.00 | \$21,893.50 | 0.00 | \$0.00 |
| 003 | Assumption and Rejection of Leases and Contracts | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 45.30 | \$23,851.50 |
| 006 | Business Operations | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 0.80 | \$908.00 |
| 007 | Case Administration | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 21.40 | \$14,507.00 |
| 008 | Claims Administration and Objections | 1.60 | \$1,720.00 | 4.30 | \$3,852.50 | 11.30 | \$12,619.50 |
| 010 | Employee Benefits and Pensions | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 16.00 | \$12,340.00 | 9.70 | \$9,853.50 |
| 011 | Employment and Fee Applications | 0.30 | \$358.50 | 3.30 | \$1,731.00 | 47.50 | \$39,615.50 |
| 012 | Employment and Fee Applications Objections | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 6.00 | \$6,834.00 |
| 013 | Financing and Cash Collateral | 4.40 | \$3,024.00 | 9.20 | \$6,661.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 |
| 015 | Meetings and Communications with Creditors | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 51.30 | \$43,840.50 |
| 016 | Non-Working Travel | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 11.60 | \$12,470.00 | 15.00 | \$17,925.00 |
| 017 | Plan and Disclosure Statement | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 149.60 | \$131,709.00 | 1.80 | \$1,995.00 |
| 018 | Real Estate | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 33.70 | \$15,015.00 |
| 021 | Tax | 1.00 | \$1,500.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 |
| 023 | Discovery | 14.90 | \$8,111.50 | 67.10 | \$47,614.00 | 665.80 | \$373,024.00 |
| 024 | Hearings | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 3.70 | \$2,490.00 | 26.40 | \$24,127.00 |
| 026 | Claims Investigation | 23.40 | \$13,339.00 | 38.40 | \$32,280.50 | 98.60 | \$77,178.00 |
| 027 | Lien Investigation | 31.50 | \$17,781.50 | 81.40 | \$49,519.00 | 69.80 | \$60,163.00 |
| 032 | Time Entry Review | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 0.00 | \$0.00 | 2.90 | \$1,522.50 |
| Total Incurred: | | 176.20 | \$104,424.50 | 555.50 | \$401,108.50 | 1,107.30 | \$722,979.00 |
| Less Client Accommodation for Non-Working Travel (50% of Fees Incurred): | | | (\$0.00) | | (\$6,235.00) | | (\$8,962.50) |
| Less Client Accommodation for Time Entry Review (100% of Fees Incurred): | | | (\$0.00) | | (\$0.00) | | (\$1,522.50) |
| Total Requested: | | 176.20 | \$104,424.50 | 555.50 | \$394,873.50 | | \$712,494.00 |

¹ The subject matter of certain time entries may be appropriate for more than one project category. In such cases, time entries generally have been included in the most appropriate category. Time entries do not appear in more than one category.

EXHIBIT D

**SUMMARY OF ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES
INCURRED BY MORRISON & FOERSTER ON BEHALF
OF THE DEBTORS DURING THE COMPENSATION PERIOD**

| Expense Category | Total Expenses | | |
|--------------------------------------------------------------|-------------------|-------------------|-------------------|
| | WMLP Debtors | WLB Debtors | Joint Matters |
| Search Fees | \$172.89 | \$0.00 | \$0.00 |
| Travel | \$0.00 | \$741.72 | \$6,495.37 |
| On-line Research – LEXIS | \$0.00 | \$653.80 | \$1.40 |
| On-line Research – WESTLAW | \$5,402.60 | \$7,757.40 | \$0.00 |
| Epiq eDiscovery Managed Services | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$1,913.88 |
| Business Meals | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$180.00 |
| Travel Meals | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$120.00 |
| Miscellaneous Disbursement – Internet (Travel to Hearing) | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | \$18.99 |
| Meals | \$13.05 | \$20.00 | \$100.00 |
| Transportation | \$0.00 | \$24.10 | \$126.50 |
| Total: | \$5,588.54 | \$9,197.02 | \$8,956.14 |

EXHIBIT E

MORRISON | FOERSTER

PO BOX 742335
LOS ANGELES
CALIFORNIA 90074-2335

TELEPHONE: 415 268 7000
FACSIMILE: 415 268 7522

WWW.MOFO.COM

MORRISON & FOERSTER LLP
NEW YORK, SAN FRANCISCO,
LOS ANGELES, WASHINGTON, D.C.,
SAN DIEGO, PALO ALTO, BOSTON,
DENVER, NORTHERN VIRGINIA

TOKYO, BEIJING, SHANGHAI,
HONG KONG, SINGAPORE

LONDON, BRUSSELS, BERLIN

Westmoreland Coal Company
9540 S. Maroon Circle
Suite 300
Englewood, Colorado 80112

Taxpayer ID # [REDACTED]
Invoice Number: 5797281
Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

Client/Matter Number: 016291-0000001

Matter Name: WLB DEBTORS

RE: WLB DEBTORS

For Professional Services Rendered and Disbursements Incurred through December 31, 2018

| | <u>U.S.Dollars</u> |
|-----------------------------------------------|-------------------------------|
| Current Fees | 401,108.50 |
| Client Accommodation - 1/2 Non-Working Travel | (6,235.00) |
| Current Fees Value | <hr/> 394,873.50 |
| Current Disbursements | <hr/> 9,197.02 |
| Total This Invoice | <hr/> 404,070.52 <hr/> |

Payment may be made by Electronic Funds transfer to the firm's account

ACH (preferred method of payment): [REDACTED]

Wire: [REDACTED]

Our billing statements are due and payable within thirty days of receipt.
Billing questions may be directed to our Billing Hotline at (415) 268-2594 or (866) 314-5320

MORRISON | FOERSTERMatter Number: 016291-0000001
Matter Name: WLB DEBTORSInvoice Number: 5797281
Invoice Date: February 14, 2019**Time Detail**

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|------------------------------------|--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|------------------------|--------------|--------------|
| Asset Analysis and Recovery | | | | |
| 01-Dec-18 | Analyze summary of excluded property (.6); analyze preliminary research on certain coal lease lien issues (.2); correspond with K. Richardson regarding same (.1). | Richards, Erica J. | 0.90 | 787.50 |
| 02-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding coal leases (1.1); draft memorandum regarding same (.3); conduct legal research regarding coal and mineral leases (1.1). | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 2.50 | 1,187.50 |
| 03-Dec-18 | Analyze bridge loan documents (.8), note documents (.7) and term loan documents (.8); revise summary of excluded property (1.9). | Jensen, Sofie | 4.20 | 1,155.00 |
| 03-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding coal leases (1.7); analyze case precedent regarding licensing and coal leases (1.1). | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 2.80 | 1,330.00 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Meet with internal working group regarding excluded property (1.0); analyze revisions to list of excluded property (1.8); discuss same with M. Zidel (.6); analyze questions to Debtors regarding excluded property (2.3). | Jensen, Sofie | 5.70 | 1,567.50 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Meet with internal working group regarding excluded property. | Richards, Erica J. | 1.00 | 875.00 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding coal leases. | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 1.50 | 712.50 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Analyze and revise updated excluded property summary (.7); prepare for meeting with bankruptcy team on excluded property and appropriate follow up (.8); meet with internal working group regarding excluded property (1.0); discuss revisions to list of excluded property with S. Jensen (.6). | Zidel, Max Phillip | 3.10 | 1,472.50 |
| 05-Dec-18 | Analyze term loan agreement and schedules (.9); revise list of newly included secured property (.7); correspond with E. Richards regarding same (.4); meet with P. Dopsch and M. Zidel regarding list of property secured under term loan financing (.2). | Jensen, Sofie | 2.20 | 605.00 |
| 05-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding coal leases and security interests (2.4); correspond with P. Dopsch regarding further research leads (.4). | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 2.80 | 1,330.00 |
| 05-Dec-18 | Analyze perfection rules on general partnerships (.5); meet with P. Dopsch and S. Jensen regarding additional collateral from 2018 (.2); conduct legal research regarding coal leases and security interests (.4). | Zidel, Max Phillip | 1.10 | 522.50 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000001

Matter Name: WLB DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797281

Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------|-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|------------------------|--------------|--------------|
| 06-Dec-18 | Meet with P. Dopsch and M. Zidel regarding excluded accounts and status (.3); correspond with E. Richards regarding accounts excluded from collateral granted under bridge loan financing (.3). | Jensen, Sofie | 0.60 | 165.00 |
| 07-Dec-18 | Analyze indenture and bridge schedules regarding excluded real property and draft list of properties for comparison. | Braun, Danielle Eileen | 2.00 | 680.00 |
| 07-Dec-18 | Correspond with E. Richards regarding identification of previously excluded real properties. | Jensen, Sofie | 0.20 | 55.00 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Correspond with internal working group regarding status and next steps. | Jensen, Sofie | 0.30 | 82.50 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Analyze list of real property interests including previously unencumbered parcels. | Marines, Jennifer L. | 0.70 | 717.50 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Draft memorandum for E. Richards regarding security interests in coal lease proceeds. | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 1.80 | 855.00 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Draft memorandum regarding coal lease proceeds. | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 1.70 | 807.50 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Correspond with D. Harris regarding coal lease provisions. | Dopsch, Peter C. | 1.00 | 1,075.00 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Correspond with internal working group regarding leases and excluded collateral under financing documents. | Heo, Min W. | 0.70 | 462.00 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Draft and revise memorandum regarding coal lease proceeds. | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 2.50 | 1,187.50 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Analyze mortgages, Debtors' schedules and UCC-1 statements regarding unencumbered leases (3.5); discuss same with D. Harris regarding same (.3). | Braun, Danielle Eileen | 3.80 | 1,292.00 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Correspond with P. Dopsch regarding research on adequacy of definition of excluded accounts. | Jensen, Sofie | 0.30 | 82.50 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Analyze coal leases and anti-encumbrance language (.4); analyze granting clause provisions and Committee financing statement review (.2). | Dopsch, Peter C. | 0.60 | 645.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Meet with D. Harris and K. Mateo regarding case background and review strategy (.5); analyze documents produced by Debtors with respect to unencumbered assets (7.0). | Fayyad, Khaled Salam | 7.50 | 3,562.50 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors with respect to unencumbered assets. | Mateo, Kat E. | 12.20 | 7,320.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Draft memorandum regarding coal lease proceeds. | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 3.30 | 1,567.50 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Call with D. Harris regarding coal leases (.5); correspond with internal working group regarding production of coal leases (.6). | Doufekias, Demme | 1.10 | 1,072.50 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000001
 Matter Name: WLB DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797281
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|------------------------|--------------|--------------|
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze coal leases (7.0); meet with D. Harris and K. Mateo to discuss progress and next steps for lease review (.5). | Fayyad, Khaled Salam | 7.50 | 3,562.50 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze select leases relating to coal lease review (1.1); correspond with D. Braun regarding mortgage review (.3); meet with K. Fayyad and K. Mateo regarding next steps for lease review (.5). | Harris, Daniel J. | 1.90 | 1,662.50 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Revise excluded collateral memorandum. | Jensen, Sofie | 0.50 | 137.50 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze coal leases (11.8); meet with D. Harris and K. Fayyad regarding status of lease review (.5). | Mateo, Kat E. | 12.30 | 7,380.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze OH, ND and NM coal leases. | Fayyad, Khaled Salam | 9.80 | 4,655.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze materials regarding coal lease review. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.60 | 645.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze results of mortgage searches (.6); correspond with D. Braun regarding same (.3). | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.90 | 787.50 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Revise memorandum on attachment and perfection, including amendments to executive summary of excluded collateral (.3); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.2). | Jensen, Sofie | 0.50 | 137.50 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Correspond with D. Harris and K. Fayyad regarding lease review (.3); analyze coal leases produced in connection with Committee investigation (8.7). | Mateo, Kat E. | 9.00 | 5,400.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Revise memorandum regarding coal lease proceeds. | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 2.00 | 950.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze documents regarding coal lease analysis. | Dopsch, Peter C. | 0.50 | 537.50 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Call with D. Harris regarding coal leases. | Doufekias, Demme | 0.60 | 585.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Meet with D. Harris and K. Mateo regarding lease review and next steps (.6); analyze leases in dataroom (5.8). | Fayyad, Khaled Salam | 6.40 | 3,040.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Call with D. Doufekias regarding coal leases (.6); meet with K. Fayyad and K. Mateo regarding lease review and next steps (.6); analyze results of initial coal lease review (.9); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.3); correspond with D. Doufekias regarding missing leases (.3). | Harris, Daniel J. | 2.70 | 2,362.50 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Draft outline of coal lease analysis. | Heo, Min W. | 1.60 | 1,056.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze coal leases produced in connection with Committee investigation (5.3); meet with D. Harris and K. Fayyad regarding same (.6). | Mateo, Kat E. | 5.90 | 3,540.00 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze coal leases in dataroom. | Fayyad, Khaled Salam | 8.10 | 3,847.50 |
| 24-Dec-18 | Analyze dataroom leases. | Fayyad, Khaled Salam | 6.40 | 3,040.00 |
| 24-Dec-18 | Consolidate coal analysis flow chart. | Heo, Min W. | 1.40 | 924.00 |
| 26-Dec-18 | Correspond with P. Dopsch regarding combine coal analysis flow chart (.2); revise coal analysis flow chart (.2). | Heo, Min W. | 0.40 | 264.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000001
Matter Name: WLB DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797281
Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|---------------------------------------------|-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|-----------------------|---------------|------------------|
| 27-Dec-18 | Correspond with M. Heo regarding excluded collateral definition (.3); analyze research (.5). | Dopsch, Peter C. | 0.80 | 860.00 |
| Total: 001 | Asset Analysis and Recovery | | 147.90 | 78,548.00 |
| Asset Disposition | | | | |
| 05-Dec-18 | Analyze sale status and timeline (.4); correspond with S. Zide (Kramer) and G. Pesce (Kirkland) regarding timing of draft sale agreement (.4); analyze term sheet for excluded assets and liabilities (.5). | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 1.30 | 1,553.50 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze documents regarding asset purchase agreement. | Bell, Jeffery | 1.70 | 1,742.50 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Correspond with J. Bell regarding asset purchase agreement. | Richards, Erica J. | 0.10 | 87.50 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze form asset purchase agreement for sale. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 1.40 | 1,673.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze draft asset purchase agreement and related documents (4.3); draft agreement summary (2.3). | Wang, Jenny | 6.60 | 5,280.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze draft asset purchase agreement and terms summary (1.4); correspond with J. Wang regarding same (.4). | Bell, Jeffery | 1.80 | 1,845.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze coal leases regarding encumbrance status. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.90 | 967.50 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Revise agreement summary (2.7); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.4). | Wang, Jenny | 3.10 | 2,480.00 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze Kirkland draft motion (.7) and Buckingham asset purchase agreement (.8). | Bell, Jeffery | 1.50 | 1,537.50 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze draft motion to sell Buckingham mine (.4); correspond with Jefferies regarding same (.2). | Goren, Todd M. | 0.60 | 645.00 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Call with G. Pesce (Kirkland) regarding sale of Buckingham (.4); revise memorandum regarding same (.3); analyze draft sale papers regarding same (.6). | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 1.30 | 1,553.50 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Draft summary of Buckingham transaction. | Butterfield, Benjamin | 0.60 | 435.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Analyze WLB stalking horse asset purchase agreement. | Richards, Erica J. | 1.30 | 1,137.50 |
| 28-Dec-18 | Review Buckingham sale papers and liabilities. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.80 | 956.00 |
| Total: 002 | Asset Disposition | | 23.00 | 21,893.50 |
| Claims Administration and Objections | | | | |
| 12-Dec-18 | Analyze draft claims analysis prepared by Debtors. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.40 | 430.00 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Analyze draft claims analysis prepared by Debtors. | Kissner, Andrew | 0.40 | 210.00 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Analyze unsecured claims analysis (.8); consider case strategy in light of same (.3). | Goren, Todd M. | 1.10 | 1,182.50 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Correspond with internal working group regarding claims analysis. | Kissner, Andrew | 0.20 | 105.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000001

Matter Name: WLB DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797281

Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|---------------------------------------|-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|--------------------|--------------|------------------|
| 14-Dec-18 | Call with professionals regarding claims estimate (.5); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.3). | Kissner, Andrew | 0.80 | 420.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze claims analysis (.6); call with Debtors' advisors regarding same (.8). | Goren, Todd M. | 1.40 | 1,505.00 |
| Total: 008 | Claims Administration and Objections | | 4.30 | 3,852.50 |
| Employee Benefits and Pensions | | | | |
| 05-Dec-18 | Analyze notice regarding direct certification of Coal Act Funds motion. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.20 | 215.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Correspond with Kirkland regarding IUOE deal and status. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.30 | 322.50 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze Coal Act. | Kissner, Andrew | 2.30 | 1,207.50 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze research regarding Coal Act fund claims against Debtors. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.80 | 956.00 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze draft motion to appoint Coal Act retiree guardian. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.50 | 537.50 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze draft motion to appoint guardian ad litem for retirees. | Kissner, Andrew | 1.10 | 577.50 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze motion to appoint guardian ad litem for 1114. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.60 | 717.00 |
| 24-Dec-18 | Analyze Coal Act (.9); analyze docket in Walter Energy (.6); draft memorandum to internal working group regarding Coal Act liabilities (1.2). | Kissner, Andrew | 2.70 | 1,417.50 |
| 26-Dec-18 | Analyze motion to appoint Coal Act guardian. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.40 | 430.00 |
| 26-Dec-18 | Analyze emergency motion to appoint representative for retiree matters. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.60 | 717.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Analyze 11th circuit decision in Walter Energy regarding retiree benefits (1.1); analyze retiree Committee motion (.9). | Kissner, Andrew | 2.00 | 1,050.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Analyze Coal Act appeal decision out of 11th circuit. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 1.00 | 1,195.00 |
| 28-Dec-18 | Analyze Coal Act Funds' opposition to retiree motion. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.40 | 430.00 |
| 28-Dec-18 | Analyze Coal Act Funds' response to guardian ad litem motion. | Kissner, Andrew | 0.70 | 367.50 |
| 28-Dec-18 | Analyze Coal Act Funds' objection to emergency motion to appoint representative for retirees. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.50 | 597.50 |
| 30-Dec-18 | Analyze Coal Act retiree pleadings. | Kissner, Andrew | 0.80 | 420.00 |
| 31-Dec-18 | Analyze draft retiree motion reply (.4); analyze opinion regarding retiree benefits (.7). | Goren, Todd M. | 1.10 | 1,182.50 |
| Total: 010 | Employee Benefits and Pensions | | 16.00 | 12,340.00 |

Employment and Fee Applications

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000001

Matter Name: WLB DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797281

Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|--------------------------------------|---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|------------------------|--------------|------------------|
| 14-Dec-18 | Draft declaration regarding rate changes for 2019. | Braun, Danielle Eileen | 0.40 | 136.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Correspond with F. Yudkin regarding fee applications. | Kissner, Andrew | 0.70 | 367.50 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Draft second monthly fee statement for November. | Braun, Danielle Eileen | 0.50 | 170.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze proposed modification to fee statement. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.30 | 322.50 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Correspond with L. Marinuzzi and T. Goren regarding October fee allocation among professionals (.6); analyze correspondence from Kramer team regarding same (.8). | Kissner, Andrew | 1.40 | 735.00 |
| Total: 011 | Employment and Fee Applications | | 3.30 | 1,731.00 |
| Financing and Cash Collateral | | | | |
| 03-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding standards for motion to reconsider prior orders (.8); draft and revise same (5.8). | Harris, Daniel J. | 6.60 | 5,775.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Analyze prepetition loan documents. | Musto, Michael | 0.20 | 49.00 |
| 28-Dec-18 | Analyze prepetition loan documents. | Musto, Michael | 2.10 | 514.50 |
| 31-Dec-18 | Analyze amendments to DIP order milestones. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.30 | 322.50 |
| Total: 013 | Financing and Cash Collateral | | 9.20 | 6,661.00 |
| Non-Working Travel | | | | |
| 17-Dec-18 | Travel to Texas for disclosure statement hearing. | Goren, Todd M. | 5.90 | 6,342.50 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Return travel from disclosure statement hearing. | Goren, Todd M. | 5.70 | 6,127.50 |
| Total: 016 | Non-Working Travel | | 11.60 | 12,470.00 |
| Plan and Disclosure Statement | | | | |
| 01-Dec-18 | Correspond with internal working group regarding disclosure statement and plan issues. | Butterfield, Benjamin | 0.60 | 435.00 |
| 01-Dec-18 | Analyze and revise plan issues list, including confirmation milestones. | Marines, Jennifer L. | 0.50 | 512.50 |
| 03-Dec-18 | Draft Committee letter in opposition to chapter 11 plan (2.4); analyze Debtors' disclosure statement (.7); draft inserts to same (.6); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.6). | Butterfield, Benjamin | 4.30 | 3,117.50 |
| 03-Dec-18 | Meet with internal working group regarding disclosure statement objection (.9); analyze and revise draft inserts for disclosure statement (.7); correspond with Kirkland regarding disclosure statement objection (.3); analyze same (1.2). | Goren, Todd M. | 3.10 | 3,332.50 |
| 03-Dec-18 | Meet with internal working group regarding disclosure statement objection (.9); draft disclosure statement inserts related to Committee investigation (1.9). | Marines, Jennifer L. | 2.80 | 2,870.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000001
 Matter Name: WLB DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797281
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------|-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|-----------------------|--------------|--------------|
| 03-Dec-18 | Meet with internal working group regarding disclosure statement objection (.9); analyze updated list of concerns regarding same (.8). | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 1.70 | 2,031.50 |
| 03-Dec-18 | Draft proposed disclosure statement language regarding Committee investigations (.9); draft alternative disclosure statement objection arguments (5.2). | Richards, Erica J. | 6.10 | 5,337.50 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Analyze revisions to disclosure statement (.5); draft Committee statement regarding disclosure statement (4.2). | Butterfield, Benjamin | 4.70 | 3,407.50 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Call with S. Williams (counsel to UMWA) regarding disclosure statement objections (.3); analyze and revise updated draft of disclosure statement (1.2); correspond with Kirkland regarding same (.4); analyze memorandum regarding open items on disclosure statement (.3). | Goren, Todd M. | 2.20 | 2,365.00 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Analyze and revise draft motion to reconsider DIP order and bidding procedures order (3.7); conduct legal research regarding same (.5); analyze revised draft of disclosure statement (.3); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.4). | Harris, Daniel J. | 4.90 | 4,287.50 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Analyze revised disclosure statement. | Marines, Jennifer L. | 2.00 | 2,050.00 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Analyze UMWA disclosure statement objection. | Richards, Erica J. | 1.10 | 962.50 |
| 05-Dec-18 | Draft Committee statement regarding disclosure statement (.9); revise Committee objection to disclosure statement (2.7); discuss same with L. Marinuzzi (.3); analyze revised plan documents from Debtors (.9). | Butterfield, Benjamin | 4.80 | 3,480.00 |
| 05-Dec-18 | Analyze and revise draft disclosure statement (1.8); correspond with Kirkland regarding same (.4). | Goren, Todd M. | 2.20 | 2,365.00 |
| 05-Dec-18 | Analyze and comment on statement regarding disclosure statement. | Kissner, Andrew | 0.70 | 367.50 |
| 05-Dec-18 | Analyze and revise disclosure statement response (1.5); analyze status of investigation regarding disclosure statement inserts (.4). | Marines, Jennifer L. | 1.90 | 1,947.50 |
| 05-Dec-18 | Analyze and revise draft Committee objection to disclosure statement (.5); discuss same with B. Butterfield (.3); analyze updated draft of disclosure statement (1.3). | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 2.10 | 2,509.50 |
| 05-Dec-18 | Analyze draft Committee statement regarding disclosure statement motion. | Richards, Erica J. | 0.10 | 87.50 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000001
 Matter Name: WLB DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797281
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------|--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|-----------------------|--------------|--------------|
| 06-Dec-18 | Participate on call with Kirkland team regarding disclosure statement issues (.4); correspond with Committee regarding same (.5); analyze legal issue related to disclosure statement issue list (.7); revise latest draft of disclosure statement (1.1); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.6); revise Committee objection to disclosure statement (1.2). | Butterfield, Benjamin | 4.50 | 3,262.50 |
| 06-Dec-18 | Analyze updated drafts of plan (.8) and disclosure statement (1.9); participate on call with Kirkland team regarding same (.4); analyze bidding procedures order regarding plan and disclosure statement deadlines (.8). | Goren, Todd M. | 3.90 | 4,192.50 |
| 06-Dec-18 | Analyze revised disclosure statement (.3); participate on call with Debtors regarding open issues on disclosure statement (.5). | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.80 | 700.00 |
| 06-Dec-18 | Analyze objections to disclosure statement. | Kissner, Andrew | 0.40 | 210.00 |
| 06-Dec-18 | Analyze Committee statement regarding plan (.3); analyze and revise litigation insert regarding investigations (.6). | Marines, Jennifer L. | 0.90 | 922.50 |
| 06-Dec-18 | Analyze SEC objection to disclosure statement (.1); analyze draft litigation insert for disclosure statement (.1). | Richards, Erica J. | 0.20 | 175.00 |
| 07-Dec-18 | Analyze updated drafts of plan and disclosure statement. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.80 | 860.00 |
| 07-Dec-18 | Analyze revised drafts of plan and disclosure statement. | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.60 | 525.00 |
| 07-Dec-18 | Analyze disclosure statement objections. | Kissner, Andrew | 0.70 | 367.50 |
| 07-Dec-18 | Analyze revised disclosure statement. | Marines, Jennifer L. | 1.00 | 1,025.00 |
| 07-Dec-18 | Analyze revised plan and disclosure statement. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 1.70 | 2,031.50 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Analyze legal issues regarding plan (.6); analyze revised disclosure statement and plan (3.2); revise Committee statement regarding disclosure statement (.9); correspond with internal working group regarding discovery status insert to disclosure statement (.6); draft same (.4); meet with L. Marinuzzi regarding filing of disclosure statement (.2); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.7); call with Debtors' counsel regarding same (.3). | Butterfield, Benjamin | 6.90 | 5,002.50 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Analyze revised drafts of plan (.9) and disclosure statement (1.2); analyze and revise draft statement regarding disclosure statement (.7). | Goren, Todd M. | 2.80 | 3,010.00 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Analyze K. Richardson memorandum regarding disclosure statement objections (.8); analyze Committee statement regarding approval of disclosure statement (.4). | Kissner, Andrew | 1.20 | 630.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000001

Matter Name: WLB DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797281

Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------|-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|------------------------|--------------|--------------|
| 10-Dec-18 | Analyze and revise disclosure statement issues list (1.0); analyze revised disclosure statement from Debtor (.4); analyze disclosure statement objection and related investigation issues (.5). | Marines, Jennifer L. | 1.90 | 1,947.50 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Analyze revised disclosure statement (1.2); analyze and revise statement on plan (.7). | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 1.90 | 2,270.50 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Draft memorandum regarding disclosure statement objections. | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 4.30 | 2,042.50 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Call with Kirkland regarding disclosure statement issues list (.1); analyze liquidation analysis (.2); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.2). | Butterfield, Benjamin | 0.50 | 362.50 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Analyze revised draft of plan (.4) and disclosure statement (.6); discuss plan strategy with L. Marinuzzi (.4); analyze and revise summary of disclosure statement objections (.5). | Goren, Todd M. | 1.90 | 2,042.50 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Analyze and revise summary of objections to disclosure statement (.6); analyze revised versions of plan (.4). | Harris, Daniel J. | 1.00 | 875.00 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Analyze (.6) and revise (.3) K. Richardson memorandum regarding disclosure statement objections; draft sections of same (1.2). | Kissner, Andrew | 2.10 | 1,102.50 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Analyze disclosure statement objections (2.2); analyze and revise Committee summary of disclosure statement objections (.5); discuss plan strategy with T. Goren (.4). | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 3.10 | 3,704.50 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Analyze further updated drafts of plan (.6) and disclosure statement (.8); call with S. Zide (Kramer) regarding potential plan structures (.3). | Goren, Todd M. | 1.70 | 1,827.50 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Analyze liquidation analysis. | Marines, Jennifer L. | 0.50 | 512.50 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Discuss confirmation issues with T. Goren (.4); correspond with Kirkland regarding disclosure statement (.2); analyze revised disclosure statement (.4); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.2); draft letter from Committee regarding plan voting (5.4). | Butterfield, Benjamin | 6.60 | 4,785.00 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Analyze and revise updated draft of disclosure statement (.8); call with C. Koenig (Kirkland) regarding same (.3); correspond with G. Pesce (Kirkland) regarding disclosure statement language (.4); discuss confirmation issues with B. Butterfield (.4). | Goren, Todd M. | 1.90 | 2,042.50 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Correspond with internal working group regarding revisions to disclosure statement (.3); correspond with T. Goren regarding same (.3). | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.60 | 525.00 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Analyze revised disclosure statement. | Marines, Jennifer L. | 0.50 | 512.50 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000001

Matter Name: WLB DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797281

Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------|-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|-----------------------|--------------|--------------|
| 14-Dec-18 | Draft letter from Committee regarding plan voting (4.6); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.8); analyze plan in connection with drafting of Committee letter (1.9). | Butterfield, Benjamin | 7.30 | 5,292.50 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Analyze revised drafts of plan (.6) and disclosure statement (1.2); analyze draft disclosure statement order (.8); analyze initial draft of Committee letter regarding plan (.3); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.2). | Goren, Todd M. | 3.10 | 3,332.50 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Analyze revised drafts of plan and disclosure statement. | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.40 | 350.00 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Analyze revised plan (.3) and disclosure statement (.2); analyze and revise Committee letter relating to same (.6); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.3). | Kissner, Andrew | 1.40 | 735.00 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Analyze revised plan (1.3) and disclosure statement (2.1); analyze proposed edits from company regarding suggested disclosure statement inserts (.5). | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 3.90 | 4,660.50 |
| 16-Dec-18 | Analyze solicitation procedures order (1.3); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.2). | Butterfield, Benjamin | 1.50 | 1,087.50 |
| 16-Dec-18 | Analyze proposed comments to disclosure statement order. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.50 | 537.50 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Revise Committee letter (1.4); discuss same with T. Goren (.2); correspond with Committee regarding same (.3); revise solicitation procedures order (.7); correspond with Kirkland regarding same (.2). | Butterfield, Benjamin | 2.80 | 2,030.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Revise draft letter from Committee regarding plan (.8); discuss same with B. Butterfield (.2); analyze proposed comments to disclosure statement order (.7); analyze revised drafts of plan (.9) and disclosure statement (1.2); analyze plan status with L. Marinuzzi (1.2); correspond with G. Pesce (Kirkland) regarding plan objection deadline (.3). | Goren, Todd M. | 5.30 | 5,697.50 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Analyze revised Committee letter regarding disclosure statement. | Kissner, Andrew | 0.20 | 105.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Analyze updated plan with T. Goren (1.2); analyze disclosure statement (.5); revise Committee letter in opposition to plan (.4); update timeline for investigation/presentation (1.3); correspond with D. Doufekias regarding plan objection deadline and discovery timeline (.4); revise updated disclosure statement order (.9); correspond with B. Butterfield regarding same (.4); analyze Debtors' omnibus reply (.8). | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 5.90 | 7,050.50 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000001
 Matter Name: WLB DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797281
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------------|--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|------------------------|---------------|-------------------|
| 18-Dec-18 | Revise Committee letter (.2); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.1); correspond with Kirkland team regarding filing of same (.2); analyze revisions to chapter 11 plan (.6); revise plan issues analysis (1.0). | Butterfield, Benjamin | 2.10 | 1,522.50 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze revised drafts of disclosure statement order (.5) and Committee letter (.3); meet with M. Warner (Cole Schotz) and L. Marinuzzi regarding preparation for disclosure statement hearing (2.9). | Goren, Todd M. | 3.70 | 3,977.50 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Call with J. Dai (Jefferies) regarding plan recovery mechanics. | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.80 | 700.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze solicitation version of disclosure statement. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.50 | 537.50 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding releases (3.4); draft memorandum regarding same (1.4). | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 4.80 | 2,280.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze case law regarding releases (2.7); draft memorandum regarding same (1.1). | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 3.80 | 1,805.00 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze status of plan objections. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.90 | 1,075.50 |
| Total: 017 | Plan and Disclosure Statement | | 149.60 | 131,709.00 |
| Discovery | | | | |
| 04-Dec-18 | Participate on discovery call with Debtors' counsel. | Richards, Erica J. | 0.60 | 525.00 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Prepare discovery and document production requests relating to missing lien investigation documents and excluded property. | Zidel, Max Phillip | 0.70 | 332.50 |
| 05-Dec-18 | Analyze correspondence regarding open discovery requests. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.40 | 430.00 |
| 07-Dec-18 | Correspond with internal working group regarding status of valuation discovery. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.40 | 430.00 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Analyze chart regarding status of Committee requests and responses. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.70 | 752.50 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Analyze reports of dataroom updates. | Richards, Erica J. | 0.30 | 262.50 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Correspond with N. Brannick (Cole Schotz) regarding discovery from ad hoc group. | Doufekias, Demme | 0.40 | 390.00 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Correspond with internal working group regarding additional document requests. | Zidel, Max Phillip | 0.40 | 190.00 |
| 15-Dec-18 | Analyze responses to document requests relating to lien investigation. | Zidel, Max Phillip | 0.30 | 142.50 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Update Relativity with newly received US Bank production documents. | Bergelson, Vadim | 1.90 | 627.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Kagel, Benjamin S. | 1.90 | 874.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 4.80 | 2,568.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000001
 Matter Name: WLB DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797281
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------|-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|----------------------|--------------|--------------|
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Radzinski, Julian N. | 1.70 | 1,232.50 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Rosenberg, Adam N. | 4.30 | 1,978.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Scheinok, Brittany | 2.10 | 1,155.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Adeseye, Tola | 2.60 | 1,495.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Bell, Mike | 2.70 | 1,930.50 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Correspond with Debtors' counsel regarding discovery (.7); draft 30(b)(6) notice (1.1); analyze and revise search term proposal for Centerview and Alvarez email (1.2); collect comments to same, revise and provide to Debtors' counsel (.8); correspond with internal working group regarding various discovery-related matters (.9). | Doufekias, Demme | 4.70 | 4,582.50 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Finalize 30(b)(6) deposition notice to Debtors (.4); correspond with Debtors regarding discovery (1.2); analyze draft standing motion (1.9). | Doufekias, Demme | 3.50 | 3,412.50 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze deposition notice to Debtors (.3); correspond with internal working group regarding deposition notice (.2). | Gambier, Lauren M. | 0.50 | 387.50 |
| 24-Dec-18 | Correspond with Cole Schotz and internal working group regarding discovery strategy (.8); analyze documents and prepare for Debtor depositions (4.4). | Doufekias, Demme | 5.20 | 5,070.00 |
| 26-Dec-18 | Analyze documents and prepare for Debtor depositions. | Doufekias, Demme | 3.50 | 3,412.50 |
| 26-Dec-18 | Analyze dataroom leases. | Fayyad, Khaled Salam | 3.80 | 1,805.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Analyze dataroom leases. | Fayyad, Khaled Salam | 4.30 | 2,042.50 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Analyze coal leases produced in connection with Committee investigation. | Mateo, Kat E. | 5.10 | 3,060.00 |
| 28-Dec-18 | Participate on call with Cole Schotz team regarding discovery strategy (.7); meet and confer with Debtors' counsel regarding rule 30(b)(6) deposition notice (.5). | Doufekias, Demme | 1.20 | 1,170.00 |
| 28-Dec-18 | Analyze remaining leases in dataroom. | Fayyad, Khaled Salam | 2.70 | 1,282.50 |
| 28-Dec-18 | Call with G. Pesce (Kirkland) regarding discovery process and depositions (.4); correspond with D. Doufekias regarding document production (.2); correspond with G. Pesce regarding same (.1). | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.70 | 836.50 |
| 28-Dec-18 | Analyze correspondence from Cole Schotz regarding status of discovery (2.5); call with Cole Schotz regarding preparations of upcoming depositions (.6). | Richards, Erica J. | 3.10 | 2,712.50 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000001

Matter Name: WLB DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797281

Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-----------------------------|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|------------------------|--------------|------------------|
| 30-Dec-18 | Analyze documents and prepare for Debtor depositions. | Doufekias, Demme | 2.50 | 2,437.50 |
| 31-Dec-18 | Analyze Debtors' response to deposition notice. | Richards, Erica J. | 0.10 | 87.50 |
| Total: 023 | Discovery | | 67.10 | 47,614.00 |
| Hearings | | | | |
| 14-Dec-18 | Draft index and prepare hearing binder for December 18 hearing. | Braun, Danielle Eileen | 0.50 | 170.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Attend disclosure statement hearing (partial) (2.8); correspond with Committee regarding same (.4). | Butterfield, Benjamin | 3.20 | 2,320.00 |
| Total: 024 | Hearings | | 3.70 | 2,490.00 |
| Claims Investigation | | | | |
| 03-Dec-18 | Analyze preliminary memorandum regarding claims versus third parties and related entities. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.90 | 1,075.50 |
| 03-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding potential estate claims. | Radzinski, Julian N. | 1.80 | 1,305.00 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding potential estate claims. | Radzinski, Julian N. | 3.30 | 2,392.50 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Analyze status of investigation (.4); meet with internal working group regarding same (1.0). | Goren, Todd M. | 1.40 | 1,505.00 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Meet with internal working group regarding status of investigation (partial) (.5); analyze correspondence regarding same (.4). | Marines, Jennifer L. | 0.90 | 922.50 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Prepare for (.2) and attend (.4) meeting with BRG team regarding claims against San Juan. | Butterfield, Benjamin | 0.60 | 435.00 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Analyze theories of liability for Kemmerer drop down (.9); analyze damage assessment and historical materials on Kemmerer mine transaction (1.3). | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 2.20 | 2,629.00 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding standing motion (2.6); draft same (.8). | Gambier, Lauren M. | 3.40 | 2,635.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research in connection with standing motion (3.1); draft same (1.1); call with J. Dai (Jefferies) regarding insolvency analysis (.1); call with Jefferies team regarding insolvency analysis (.4). | Gambier, Lauren M. | 4.70 | 3,642.50 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Meet with K. Fayyad and K. Mateo regarding case background and review strategy. | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.50 | 437.50 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Meet with D. Harris and K. Fayyad regarding case background and review strategy. | Mateo, Kat E. | 0.50 | 300.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research in connection with standing motion (6.2); draft same (1.2). | Gambier, Lauren M. | 7.40 | 5,735.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000001

Matter Name: WLB DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797281

Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|---------------------------|----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|------------------------|--------------|------------------|
| 19-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research in connection with standing motion (5.1); draft same (1.3). | Gambier, Lauren M. | 6.40 | 4,960.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Revise draft memorandum regarding possible claims associated with bridge loan transaction. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 1.30 | 1,553.50 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Revise draft standing motion. | Gambier, Lauren M. | 1.20 | 930.00 |
| 25-Dec-18 | Analyze and provide comments on draft Committee presentation regarding claims investigation. | Richards, Erica J. | 1.10 | 962.50 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Analyze research regarding bridge loan transaction claims. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.80 | 860.00 |
| Total: 026 | Claims Investigation | | 38.40 | 32,280.50 |
| Lien Investigation | | | | |
| 01-Dec-18 | Analyze lien perfection analysis. | Richards, Erica J. | 0.40 | 350.00 |
| 02-Dec-18 | Analyze lien perfection analysis. | Marines, Jennifer L. | 0.60 | 615.00 |
| 03-Dec-18 | Analyze investigation memorandum and related correspondence from finance team (1.8); analyze research regarding coal leases (2.3). | Marines, Jennifer L. | 4.10 | 4,202.50 |
| 07-Dec-18 | Analyze investigation requests related to valuation (.4); analyze status of document review (.2); analyze documents related to mortgage leases (.5). | Marines, Jennifer L. | 1.10 | 1,127.50 |
| 07-Dec-18 | Correspond with financial advisors regarding lien investigation follow up. | Richards, Erica J. | 1.20 | 1,050.00 |
| 07-Dec-18 | Analyze perfection rules on general partnerships (.1); meet with P. Dopsch and S. Jensen regarding excluded accounts and status (.3). | Zidel, Max Phillip | 0.40 | 190.00 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Correspond with J. Mbakwe regarding coal lease and coal supply agreement review (.2); analyze draft list of new real estate collateral (.4); analyze research by K. Richardson regarding scope of coal lease liens (1.6); meet with internal working group regarding status of lien investigation (1.0). | Richards, Erica J. | 3.20 | 2,800.00 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Meet with internal working group regarding excluded real property and mortgages (partial). | Zidel, Max Phillip | 0.70 | 332.50 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Draft attachment and perfection memorandum summarizing lien investigation. | Zidel, Max Phillip | 0.60 | 285.00 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Coordinate review of mortgages in connection with lien investigation. | Marines, Jennifer L. | 0.80 | 820.00 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Analyze select mortgages relating to lien review process (.4); discuss same with D. Braun (.3). | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.70 | 612.50 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Analyze potential defendants to lien challenge complaints | Richards, Erica J. | 2.10 | 1,837.50 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding proceeds of coal leases (2.2); analyze leases (1.4); revise memorandum regarding same (.7). | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 4.30 | 2,042.50 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000001

Matter Name: WLB DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797281

Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|------------------------|--------------|--------------|
| 15-Dec-18 | Analyze coal leases to assess anti-assignment provisions. | Harris, Daniel J. | 4.10 | 3,587.50 |
| 16-Dec-18 | Analyze coal leases to assess anti-assignment provisions (1.9); correspond with internal working group regarding conclusions (1.5). | Harris, Daniel J. | 3.40 | 2,975.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Analyze mortgages and UCC-1 statements regarding unencumbered leases and track same within Debtors' schedules (6.2); correspond with D. Harris regarding same (.6). | Braun, Danielle Eileen | 6.80 | 2,312.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Correspond with internal working group regarding coal leases (.3); meet with review team regarding same (.6); follow-up correspondence regarding same (.4); conduct brief research regarding assignment of leases (.7); correspond with M. Heo regarding same (.4). | Harris, Daniel J. | 2.40 | 2,100.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Search filings and registrations for liens on rolling stock (.7); analyze chart listing all equipment owned by WLB and categorize equipment that requires additional perfection measures (1.4); correspond with P. Dopsch regarding anti-assignment provisions in coal leases (.2); analyze Bankruptcy Code sections 363 and 365 regarding same (.7); meet with review team regarding perfection memorandum, coal leases and rolling stock (.6); analyze UCC-1 filings against WLB and subsidiaries (1.2). | Heo, Min W. | 4.80 | 3,168.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Meet with review team regarding coal leases (.6); revise memorandum regarding attachment and perfection (.2); draft table summary overview of excluded collateral (.2). | Jensen, Sofie | 1.00 | 275.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Correspond with D. Harris regarding coal leases. | Kissner, Andrew | 0.40 | 210.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze mortgages and UCC-1 statements regarding unencumbered leases and track same within Debtors' schedules. | Braun, Danielle Eileen | 5.00 | 1,700.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Correspond with Kramer team regarding status of coal leases. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.40 | 430.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Revise perfection memorandum (1.1); analyze excluded collateral language in WLB term loan and bridge loan (.7); analyze list of items provided in discovery and highlight relevant financing documents to be requested (1.0). | Heo, Min W. | 2.80 | 1,848.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Correspond with P. Dopsch and M. Heo regarding memorandum on attachment and perfection. | Jensen, Sofie | 0.40 | 110.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Revise memorandum regarding coal lease proceeds. | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 6.10 | 2,897.50 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000001

Matter Name: WLB DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797281

Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------------|-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|------------------------|---------------------|-------------------|
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze mortgages and UCC-1 statements regarding unencumbered leases and track same within Debtors' schedules (2.8); draft list of leases and owned properties without mortgages/UCCs (1.6); correspond with D. Harris regarding same (.4). | Braun, Danielle Eileen | 4.80 | 1,632.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze deposit account control agreement with CIBC. | Heo, Min W. | 0.40 | 264.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze draft lien perfection memorandum regarding WLB issues (.4); prepare talking points regarding same (.7). | Richards, Erica J. | 1.10 | 962.50 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Compile all mortgages and UCC-1 statements (1.2); correspond with internal working group regarding second tier review regarding same (.6). | Braun, Danielle Eileen | 1.80 | 612.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding collateral and excluded accounts in bridge loan agreement (3.7); draft memorandum regarding same (1.3). | Jensen, Sofie | 5.00 | 1,375.00 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze issues regarding equipment collateral and certificate of title issues (.5); correspond with M. Heo regarding same (.1). | Dopsch, Peter C. | 0.60 | 645.00 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze research regarding surety bond collateral. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.40 | 430.00 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Call with D. Harris regarding summary of coal lease analysis (.1); analyze Clark's treatise on secured transactions (1.0); meet with internal working group regarding status of lien investigation (1.2); draft lien investigation slide for presentation to Committee (2.5). | Heo, Min W. | 4.80 | 3,168.00 |
| 25-Dec-18 | Revise memorandum regarding perfection of lien on proceeds of excluded collateral. | Richards, Erica J. | 0.80 | 700.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Revise memorandum regarding lien analysis on coal leases. | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 0.80 | 380.00 |
| 28-Dec-18 | Revise memorandum regarding lien analysis on coal leases. | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 3.10 | 1,472.50 |
| Total: 027 | Lien Investigation | | 81.40 | 49,519.00 |
| | | | Current Fees | 394,873.50 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000001

Matter Name: WLB DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797281

Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

Timekeeper Summary

| No. | Timekeeper | Rate | Hours | Value |
|------------|----------------------------|-------------|---------------|-------------------|
| 15632 | Bell, Jeffery | 1,025.00 | 5.00 | 5,125.00 |
| 12270 | Doufekias, Demme | 975.00 | 22.70 | 22,132.50 |
| 14140 | Goren, Todd M. | 1,075.00 | 58.20 | 62,565.00 |
| 17456 | Marines, Jennifer L. | 1,025.00 | 20.20 | 20,705.00 |
| 14116 | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 1,195.00 | 34.60 | 41,347.00 |
| 18365 | Adeseye, Tola | 575.00 | 2.60 | 1,495.00 |
| 22806 | Bell, Mike | 715.00 | 2.70 | 1,930.50 |
| 20018 | Butterfield, Benjamin | 725.00 | 51.00 | 36,975.00 |
| 21830 | Fayyad, Khaled Salam | 475.00 | 56.50 | 26,837.50 |
| 19802 | Gambier, Lauren M. | 775.00 | 23.60 | 18,290.00 |
| 18102 | Harris, Daniel J. | 875.00 | 32.30 | 28,262.50 |
| 22117 | Heo, Min W. | 660.00 | 16.90 | 11,154.00 |
| 20380 | Kagel, Benjamin S. | 460.00 | 1.90 | 874.00 |
| 19671 | Kissner, Andrew | 525.00 | 20.20 | 10,605.00 |
| 19999 | Mateo, Kat E. | 600.00 | 45.00 | 27,000.00 |
| 19117 | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 535.00 | 4.80 | 2,568.00 |
| 22265 | Radzinski, Julian N. | 725.00 | 6.80 | 4,930.00 |
| 21823 | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 475.00 | 48.10 | 22,847.50 |
| 21715 | Rosenberg, Adam N. | 460.00 | 4.30 | 1,978.00 |
| 18947 | Scheinok, Brittany | 550.00 | 2.10 | 1,155.00 |
| 14959 | Wang, Jenny | 800.00 | 9.70 | 7,760.00 |
| 20402 | Zidel, Max Phillip | 475.00 | 7.30 | 3,467.50 |
| 08676 | Dopsch, Peter C. | 1,075.00 | 3.50 | 3,762.50 |
| 14078 | Richards, Erica J. | 875.00 | 24.80 | 21,700.00 |
| 18387 | Braun, Danielle Eileen | 340.00 | 25.60 | 8,704.00 |
| 23251 | Musto, Michael | 245.00 | 2.30 | 563.50 |
| 23415 | Jensen, Sofie | 275.00 | 20.90 | 5,747.50 |
| 15029 | Bergelson, Vadim | 330.00 | 1.90 | 627.00 |
| | Client Accommodation - 1/2 | | | |
| | Non-Working Travel | | | (6,235.00) |
| | TOTAL | | 555.50 | 394,873.50 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000001
 Matter Name: WLB DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797281
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

Task Code Summary

| Task Code | Description | Hours | Value |
|------------------|-----------------------------------------------|---------------|-------------------|
| 001 | Asset Analysis and Recovery | 147.90 | 78,548.00 |
| 002 | Asset Disposition | 23.00 | 21,893.50 |
| 008 | Claims Administration and Objections | 4.30 | 3,852.50 |
| 010 | Employee Benefits and Pensions | 16.00 | 12,340.00 |
| 011 | Employment and Fee Applications | 3.30 | 1,731.00 |
| 013 | Financing and Cash Collateral | 9.20 | 6,661.00 |
| 016 | Non-Working Travel | 11.60 | 12,470.00 |
| 017 | Plan and Disclosure Statement | 149.60 | 131,709.00 |
| 023 | Discovery | 67.10 | 47,614.00 |
| 024 | Hearings | 3.70 | 2,490.00 |
| 026 | Claims Investigation | 38.40 | 32,280.50 |
| 027 | Lien Investigation | 81.40 | 49,519.00 |
| | Client Accommodation - 1/2 Non-Working Travel | | (6,235.00) |
| | TOTAL | 555.50 | 394,873.50 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000001
 Matter Name: WLB DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797281
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

Disbursement Detail

| Date | Description | Value |
|------------------------------|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|-----------------|
| 31-Dec-18 | On-line Research - LEXIS | 653.80 |
| 31-Dec-18 | On-line Research - WESTLAW | 7,757.40 |
| 05-Dec-18 | Travel, plane, L. Marinuzzi, travel to/from Houston, TX to attend meetings with clients, 12/17/18 | 659.50 |
| 31-Dec-18 | Local travel, taxi/car service, J. Mbakwe, 10:39 pm, 12/10/18 | 82.22 |
| 27-Nov-18 | Local meals, J. Wang, dinner, OT meal, 9:02 pm, 11/27/18 | 20.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Local travel, taxi/car service, L. Gambier, 10:28 pm, 12/19/18 | 24.10 |
| Current Disbursements | | 9,197.02 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000001
Matter Name: WLB DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797281
Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

Invoice Summary

| | <u>U.S.Dollars</u> |
|-------------------------|-------------------------------------|
| Total Fees | 394,873.50 |
| Total Disbursements | 9,197.02 |
| Total Amount Due | <hr/> 404,070.52 <hr/> <hr/> |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000001
 Matter Name: WLB DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797281
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

For your convenience, we have listed below previous invoices on this matter which our records show as outstanding and the total balance due on this account. If you have already submitted payment, we appreciate your promptness. If your records are not in agreement, or if we can provide additional assistance, please call our Billing Department at (415) 268-6446 or (866) 314-5320

| Date | Invoice Number | Currency | Original Invoice Amount | Payments Applied | Amount Outstanding |
|------------------|-----------------------|-----------------|--------------------------------|-------------------------|---------------------------|
| 29-Nov-18 | 5779750 | USD | 148,242.00 | 118,593.60 | 29,648.40 |
| 23-Jan-19 | 5792343 | USD | 198,289.23 | 0.00 | 198,289.23 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

PO BOX 742335
LOS ANGELES
CALIFORNIA 90074-2335

TELEPHONE: 415 268 7000
FACSIMILE: 415 268 7522

WWW.MOFO.COM

MORRISON & FOERSTER LLP
NEW YORK, SAN FRANCISCO,
LOS ANGELES, WASHINGTON, D.C.,
SAN DIEGO, PALO ALTO, BOSTON,
DENVER, NORTHERN VIRGINIA

TOKYO, BEIJING, SHANGHAI,
HONG KONG, SINGAPORE

LONDON, BRUSSELS, BERLIN

Westmoreland Coal Company
9540 S. Maroon Circle
Suite 300
Englewood, Colorado 80112

Taxpayer ID # [REDACTED]
Invoice Number: 5797282
Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

Client/Matter Number: 016291-0000002

Matter Name: WMLP DEBTORS

RE: WMLP DEBTORS

For Professional Services Rendered and Disbursements Incurred through December 31, 2018

| | <u>U.S.Dollars</u> |
|---------------------------|--------------------|
| Current Fees | 104,424.50 |
| Current Disbursements | 5,588.54 |
| Total This Invoice | 110,013.04 |

Payment may be made by Electronic Funds transfer to the firm's account

ACH (preferred method of payment) [REDACTED]

Wire: [REDACTED]

Our billing statements are due and payable within thirty days of receipt.
Billing questions may be directed to our Billing Hotline at (415) 268-2594 or (866) 314-5320

MORRISON | FOERSTERMatter Number: 016291-0000002
Matter Name: WMLP DEBTORSInvoice Number: 5797282
Invoice Date: February 14, 2019**Time Detail**

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|------------------------------------|-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|------------------------|--------------|--------------|
| Asset Analysis and Recovery | | | | |
| 02-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding coal leases (1.2); draft memorandum regarding same (.3); conduct legal research regarding coal and mineral leases (1.0). | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 2.50 | 1,187.50 |
| 03-Dec-18 | Analyze loan documents and revise summary of excluded property. | Jensen, Sofie | 1.20 | 330.00 |
| 03-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding coal leases (1.7); analyze case precedent regarding licensing and coal leases (1.1). | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 2.80 | 1,330.00 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Analyze questions to Debtors regarding excluded property. | Jensen, Sofie | 0.30 | 82.50 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding coal leases. | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 1.60 | 760.00 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Analyze and revise updated excluded property summary (.7); prepare for meeting with bankruptcy team on excluded property and appropriate follow up (.7). | Zidel, Max Phillip | 1.40 | 665.00 |
| 05-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding coal leases and security interests (2.5); correspond with P. Dopsch regarding further research leads (.3). | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 2.80 | 1,330.00 |
| 05-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding coal leases and security interests. | Zidel, Max Phillip | 0.40 | 190.00 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Analyze security interests in bank accounts (.6); follow up on excluded accounts (.2). | Zidel, Max Phillip | 0.80 | 380.00 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Analyze select coal leases contained in dataroom. | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.60 | 525.00 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Draft memorandum for E. Richards regarding security interests in coal lease proceeds. | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 1.70 | 807.50 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Analyze dataroom and compile all relevant coal leases and real property interests (.9); call with D. Doufekias regarding same (.4). | Zidel, Max Phillip | 1.30 | 617.50 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Draft memorandum regarding coal lease proceeds. | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 1.60 | 760.00 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Draft and revise memorandum regarding coal lease proceeds. | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 2.50 | 1,187.50 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding proceeds of coal leases (2.1); analyze leases (1.4); revise memorandum regarding same (.7). | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 4.20 | 1,995.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Analyze coal leases and anti-encumbrance language (.5); analyze granting clause provisions and Committee financing statement review (.1). | Dopsch, Peter C. | 0.60 | 645.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000002
 Matter Name: WMLP DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797282
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------|----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|------------------------|--------------|--------------|
| 17-Dec-18 | Draft memorandum regarding coal lease proceeds. | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 3.20 | 1,520.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Correspond with L. Marinuzzi regarding coal lease count (.4); call with D. Doufekias regarding same (.5); correspond with Kirkland and Schulte teams regarding coal leases (.3). | Harris, Daniel J. | 1.20 | 1,050.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze excluded collateral language in term loan and bridge loan. | Heo, Min W. | 0.30 | 198.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Revise memorandum regarding excluded collateral. | Jensen, Sofie | 0.20 | 55.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Revise memorandum regarding coal lease proceeds. | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 6.10 | 2,897.50 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze materials regarding coal lease review. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.30 | 322.50 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze memorandum regarding excluded collateral. | Jensen, Sofie | 0.10 | 27.50 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Revise memorandum regarding coal lease proceeds. | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 1.90 | 902.50 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Draft outline of coal lease analysis. | Heo, Min W. | 1.60 | 1,056.00 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze issues regarding equipment collateral and certificate of title issues (.6); correspond with M. Heo regarding same (.1). | Dopsch, Peter C. | 0.70 | 752.50 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Prepare coal lease analysis decision tree for discussion with internal working group (1.1); meet with internal working group regarding coal lease analysis and open issues (.8). | Harris, Daniel J. | 1.90 | 1,662.50 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Correspond with internal working group regarding status of lease review (.2); analyze coal leases produced in connection with the Committee investigation (9.7). | Mateo, Kat E. | 9.90 | 5,940.00 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Meet with internal working group regarding coal lease analysis and open issues (.8); draft inserts for same (1.4). | Richards, Erica J. | 2.20 | 1,925.00 |
| 22-Dec-18 | Analyze memorandum on legal analysis of excluded property. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.60 | 717.00 |
| 22-Dec-18 | Analyze coal leases produced in connection with Committee investigation. | Mateo, Kat E. | 12.40 | 7,440.00 |
| 23-Dec-18 | Analyze coal leases in dataroom. | Fayyad, Khaled Salam | 5.10 | 2,422.50 |
| 24-Dec-18 | Call with internal working group regarding coal lease review process (.5); call with P. Dopsch and M. Heo regarding state law research (.8). | Anabi, Andrew Issa | 1.30 | 617.50 |
| 24-Dec-18 | Call with A. Anabi and M. Heo regarding state law research. | Dopsch, Peter C. | 0.80 | 860.00 |
| 24-Dec-18 | Call with internal working group regarding coal lease review process. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.50 | 537.50 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000002
 Matter Name: WMLP DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797282
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|---------------------------------------------|--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|------------------------|--------------|------------------|
| 24-Dec-18 | Call with internal working group regarding coal lease review process (.5); correspond with M. Heo regarding same (.3). | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.80 | 700.00 |
| 24-Dec-18 | Call with internal working group regarding coal lease review process (.5); call with P. Dopsch and A. Anabi regarding state law research (.8); consolidate coal analysis flow chart (1.4). | Heo, Min W. | 2.70 | 1,782.00 |
| 24-Dec-18 | Call with internal working group regarding coal lease review process. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.50 | 597.50 |
| 24-Dec-18 | Call with internal working group regarding coal lease review process. | Richards, Erica J. | 0.50 | 437.50 |
| 26-Dec-18 | Analyze dataroom leases. | Fayyad, Khaled Salam | 2.90 | 1,377.50 |
| 26-Dec-18 | Correspond with P. Dopsch regarding combine coal analysis flow chart (.3); revise coal analysis flow chart (.1). | Heo, Min W. | 0.40 | 264.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Correspond with M. Heo regarding excluded collateral definition (.3); analyze research (.5). | Dopsch, Peter C. | 0.80 | 860.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Analyze dataroom leases. | Fayyad, Khaled Salam | 3.70 | 1,757.50 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Analyze updated results from coal lease review. | Harris, Daniel J. | 1.70 | 1,487.50 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Analyze coal leases produced in connection with Committee investigation. | Mateo, Kat E. | 4.20 | 2,520.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Revise memorandum regarding liens on coal leases. | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 0.90 | 427.50 |
| 28-Dec-18 | Analyze remaining leases in dataroom. | Fayyad, Khaled Salam | 1.80 | 855.00 |
| Total: 001 | Asset Analysis and Recovery | | 97.50 | 56,762.00 |
| Asset Disposition | | | | |
| 05-Dec-18 | Analyze memorandum regarding asset purchase agreement summaries and concerns. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.70 | 752.50 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Call with H. Lennox (Jones Day) regarding sale process and timeline (.3); draft memorandum to internal working group regarding same (.2). | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.50 | 597.50 |
| 28-Dec-18 | Correspond with C. Speckhart (Wolcott) regarding liabilities at Oxford. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.40 | 478.00 |
| Total: 002 | Asset Disposition | | 1.60 | 1,828.00 |
| Claims Administration and Objections | | | | |
| 12-Dec-18 | Analyze draft claims analysis prepared by Debtors. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.70 | 752.50 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Analyze draft claims analysis prepared by Debtors (.6); consider case strategy in light of same (.3). | Goren, Todd M. | 0.90 | 967.50 |
| Total: 008 | Claims Administration and Objections | | 1.60 | 1,720.00 |
| Employment and Fee Applications | | | | |

MORRISON | FOERSTERMatter Number: 016291-0000002
Matter Name: WMLP DEBTORSInvoice Number: 5797282
Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|--------------------------------------|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|-----------------------|--------------|-----------------|
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze Jones Day November fee statement. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.30 | 358.50 |
| Total: 011 | Employment and Fee Applications | | 0.30 | 358.50 |
| Financing and Cash Collateral | | | | |
| 05-Dec-18 | Analyze invoices for lenders' professionals. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.50 | 597.50 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Analyze issues related to cash collateral order. | Dopsch, Peter C. | 0.30 | 322.50 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Analyze issues related to cash collateral order. | Dopsch, Peter C. | 0.50 | 537.50 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze draft stipulation extending milestones. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.40 | 430.00 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze stipulation extending milestones (.3); correspond with H. Lennox (Jones Day) regarding same (.2). | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.50 | 597.50 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Analyze prepetition loan documents. | Musto, Michael | 0.20 | 49.00 |
| 28-Dec-18 | Analyze prepetition loan documents. | Musto, Michael | 2.00 | 490.00 |
| Total: 013 | Financing and Cash Collateral | | 4.40 | 3,024.00 |
| Tax | | | | |
| 17-Dec-18 | Analyze cancellation of debt tax consequences. | Carbone, Anthony J. | 0.50 | 750.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze cancellation of debt structure and tax consequences (.2); call with Jones Day regarding same (.3). | Carbone, Anthony J. | 0.50 | 750.00 |
| Total: 021 | Tax | | 1.00 | 1,500.00 |
| Discovery | | | | |
| 04-Dec-18 | Draft updated discovery requests (.4); correspond with E. Richards regarding same (.2). | Zidel, Max Phillip | 0.60 | 285.00 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Analyze responses to document requests (.4); draft follow up requests (.3). | Zidel, Max Phillip | 0.70 | 332.50 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Kagel, Benjamin S. | 1.30 | 598.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 3.60 | 1,926.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Radzinschi, Julian N. | 0.90 | 652.50 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Rosenberg, Adam N. | 3.10 | 1,426.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Scheinok, Brittany | 1.40 | 770.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Adeseye, Tola | 1.70 | 977.50 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Bell, Mike | 1.60 | 1,144.00 |
| Total: 023 | Discovery | | 14.90 | 8,111.50 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000002
 Matter Name: WMLP DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797282
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-----------------------------|--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|----------------------|--------------|------------------|
| Claims Investigation | | | | |
| 01-Dec-18 | Revise draft memorandum regarding claims against lenders. | Harris, Daniel J. | 2.40 | 2,100.00 |
| 02-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding potential claims against lenders. | Rosenberg, Adam N. | 2.80 | 1,288.00 |
| 03-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding potential claims. | Radzinski, Julian N. | 0.60 | 435.00 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding potential claims. | Radzinski, Julian N. | 1.60 | 1,160.00 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding potential claims against lenders. | Rosenberg, Adam N. | 4.70 | 2,162.00 |
| 05-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding potential claims against lenders. | Rosenberg, Adam N. | 3.20 | 1,472.00 |
| 06-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding potential claims against lenders. | Rosenberg, Adam N. | 2.80 | 1,288.00 |
| 07-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding potential claims against lenders. | Rosenberg, Adam N. | 2.90 | 1,334.00 |
| 28-Dec-18 | Draft and revise standing motion (1.3); analyze precedent regarding same (1.1). | Harris, Daniel J. | 2.40 | 2,100.00 |
| Total: 026 | Claims Investigation | | 23.40 | 13,339.00 |
| Lien Investigation | | | | |
| 13-Dec-18 | Attend meeting with internal working group regarding lien investigation. | Heo, Min W. | 0.20 | 132.00 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Attend meeting with internal working group regarding lien investigation. | Jensen, Sofie | 1.00 | 275.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Search filings and registrations for liens on rolling stock (.2); analyze chart listing all owned equipment (1.0); meet with P. Dopsch regarding section 363 and 365 on anti-assignment provisions in coal leases (.2); analyze sections 363 and 365 (.5); meet with internal working group regarding perfection memorandum, coal leases and rolling stock (.2); analyze UCC-1 filings against WMLP and its subsidiaries (.5). | Heo, Min W. | 2.60 | 1,716.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Revise memorandum regarding attachment and perfection. | Jensen, Sofie | 0.10 | 27.50 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Revise perfection memorandum (.8); analyze list of items provided in discovery and highlight relevant financing documents to be requested (1.0). | Heo, Min W. | 1.80 | 1,188.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000002
 Matter Name: WMLP DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797282
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------------|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|---------------------------|---------------------|-------------------|
| 19-Dec-18 | Meet with lien investigation team regarding excluded coal leases (.6); discuss open legal points relating to investigation and various coal lease workstreams with internal working group (.4); review correspondence and cases from internal working group regarding assignment provisions (.7); analyze and revise updated claims memorandum (.4); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.4). | Harris, Daniel J. | 2.50 | 2,187.50 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze deposit control agreements for Westmoreland Kemmerer (.3) and Oxford Mining (.4); update list of accounts without control agreements (.1). | Heo, Min W. | 0.80 | 528.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Meet with K. Richardson to discuss lien challenge (.5); draft and revise presentation to Committee regarding status of investigations (2.1). | Harris, Daniel J. | 2.60 | 2,275.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze agreements and draft complaint to determine validity of property interests (4.0); discuss same with D. Harris (.5). | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 4.50 | 2,137.50 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze agreements and draft complaint to determine validity of property interests (4.9); discuss same with D. Harris (.4); meet with internal working group regarding same (.7); analyze agreements and draft complaint to determine validity of property interests (2.1). | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 8.10 | 3,847.50 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Analyze agreements and draft complaint to challenge validity of property interests. | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 4.20 | 1,995.00 |
| 28-Dec-18 | Revise memorandum regarding liens on coal leases. | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 3.10 | 1,472.50 |
| Total: 027 | Lien Investigation | | 31.50 | 17,781.50 |
| | | | Current Fees | 104,424.50 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000002
 Matter Name: WMLP DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797282
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

Timekeeper Summary

| No. | Timekeeper | Rate | Hours | Value |
|------------|------------------------|-------------|---------------|-------------------|
| 22793 | Carbone, Anthony J. | 1,500.00 | 1.00 | 1,500.00 |
| 14140 | Goren, Todd M. | 1,075.00 | 3.50 | 3,762.50 |
| 14116 | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 1,195.00 | 3.30 | 3,943.50 |
| 18365 | Adeseye, Tola | 575.00 | 1.70 | 977.50 |
| 21822 | Anabi, Andrew Issa | 475.00 | 1.30 | 617.50 |
| 22806 | Bell, Mike | 715.00 | 1.60 | 1,144.00 |
| 21830 | Fayyad, Khaled Salam | 475.00 | 13.50 | 6,412.50 |
| 18102 | Harris, Daniel J. | 875.00 | 16.10 | 14,087.50 |
| 22117 | Heo, Min W. | 660.00 | 10.40 | 6,864.00 |
| 20380 | Kagel, Benjamin S. | 460.00 | 1.30 | 598.00 |
| 19999 | Mateo, Kat E. | 600.00 | 26.50 | 15,900.00 |
| 19117 | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 535.00 | 3.60 | 1,926.00 |
| 22265 | Radzinski, Julian N. | 725.00 | 3.10 | 2,247.50 |
| 21823 | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 475.00 | 51.70 | 24,557.50 |
| 21715 | Rosenberg, Adam N. | 460.00 | 19.50 | 8,970.00 |
| 18947 | Scheinok, Brittany | 550.00 | 1.40 | 770.00 |
| 20402 | Zidel, Max Phillip | 475.00 | 5.20 | 2,470.00 |
| 08676 | Dopsch, Peter C. | 1,075.00 | 3.70 | 3,977.50 |
| 14078 | Richards, Erica J. | 875.00 | 2.70 | 2,362.50 |
| 23251 | Musto, Michael | 245.00 | 2.20 | 539.00 |
| 23415 | Jensen, Sofie | 275.00 | 2.90 | 797.50 |
| | TOTAL | | 176.20 | 104,424.50 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000002
 Matter Name: WMLP DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797282
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

Task Code Summary

| Task Code | Description | Hours | Value |
|------------------|--------------------------------------|---------------|-------------------|
| 001 | Asset Analysis and Recovery | 97.50 | 56,762.00 |
| 002 | Asset Disposition | 1.60 | 1,828.00 |
| 008 | Claims Administration and Objections | 1.60 | 1,720.00 |
| 011 | Employment and Fee Applications | 0.30 | 358.50 |
| 013 | Financing and Cash Collateral | 4.40 | 3,024.00 |
| 021 | Tax | 1.00 | 1,500.00 |
| 023 | Discovery | 14.90 | 8,111.50 |
| 026 | Claims Investigation | 23.40 | 13,339.00 |
| 027 | Lien Investigation | 31.50 | 17,781.50 |
| | TOTAL | 176.20 | 104,424.50 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000002
Matter Name: WMLP DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797282
Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

Disbursement Detail

| Date | Description | Value |
|------------------------------|-----------------------------------------------------------|------------------------|
| 31-Dec-18 | On-line Research - WESTLAW | 5,402.60 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Search fees, CT Corporation, lien searches | 172.89 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Local meals, M. Zidel, dinner, OT meal, 8:13 pm, 12/11/18 | 13.05 |
| Current Disbursements | | <u>5,588.54</u> |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000002
Matter Name: WMLP DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797282
Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

Invoice Summary

| | <u>U.S.Dollars</u> |
|-------------------------|--------------------|
| Total Fees | 104,424.50 |
| Total Disbursements | 5,588.54 |
| Total Amount Due | 110,013.04 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000002
 Matter Name: WMLP DEBTORS

Invoice Number: 5797282
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

For your convenience, we have listed below previous invoices on this matter which our records show as outstanding and the total balance due on this account. If you have already submitted payment, we appreciate your promptness. If your records are not in agreement, or if we can provide additional assistance, please call our Billing Department at (415) 268-6446 or (866) 314-5320

| Date | Invoice Number | Currency | Original Invoice Amount | Payments Applied | Amount Outstanding |
|------------------|-----------------------|-----------------|--------------------------------|-------------------------|---------------------------|
| 29-Nov-18 | 5779751 | USD | 24,013.00 | 19,210.40 | 4,802.60 |
| 23-Jan-19 | 5792344 | USD | 137,970.32 | 0.00 | 137,970.32 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

PO BOX 742335
 LOS ANGELES
 CALIFORNIA 90074-2335

 TELEPHONE: 415 268 7000
 FACSIMILE: 415 268 7522

 WWW.MOFO.COM

MORRISON & FOERSTER LLP
 NEW YORK, SAN FRANCISCO,
 LOS ANGELES, WASHINGTON, D.C.,
 SAN DIEGO, PALO ALTO, BOSTON,
 DENVER, NORTHERN VIRGINIA

 TOKYO, BEIJING, SHANGHAI,
 HONG KONG, SINGAPORE

 LONDON, BRUSSELS, BERLIN

Westmoreland Coal Company
 9540 S. Maroon Circle
 Suite 300
 Englewood, Colorado 80112

Taxpayer ID # [REDACTED]
 Invoice Number: 5797283
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

 Client/Matter Number: 016291-0000003

Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

RE: JOINT MATTERS

For Professional Services Rendered and Disbursements Incurred through December 31, 2018

| | <u>U.S.Dollars</u> |
|---------------------------------------------|--------------------|
| Current Fees | 722,979.00 |
| Client Accommodation – ½ Non-Working Travel | (8,962.50) |
| Client Accommodation – Time Entry Review | (1,522.50) |
| Current Fees Value | 712,494.00 |
| Current Disbursements | 8,956.14 |
| Total This Invoice | 721,450.14 |

Payment may be made by Electronic Funds transfer to the firm's account

ACH (preferred method of payment): [REDACTED]

Wire: [REDACTED]

Our billing statements are due and payable within thirty days of receipt.
 Billing questions may be directed to our Billing Hotline at (415) 268-2594 or (866) 314-5320

MORRISON | FOERSTERMatter Number: 016291-0000003
Matter Name: JOINT MATTERSInvoice Number: 5797283
Invoice Date: February 14, 2019**Time Detail**

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|---------------------------------------------------------|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|--------------------|--------------|--------------|
| Assumption and Rejection of Leases and Contracts | | | | |
| 17-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding anti-assignment provisions. | Anabi, Andrew Issa | 1.50 | 712.50 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research (1.8) and draft memorandum (2.7) regarding anti-assignment provisions. | Anabi, Andrew Issa | 4.50 | 2,137.50 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze legal research by A. Anabi regarding enforcement of anti-assignment provisions in lease agreements in Ohio (.6); analyze case law regarding Ohio court's treatment of assignments in contravention to lease language (.4). | Heo, Min W. | 1.00 | 660.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Research Montana and North Dakota case law on validity anti-assignment provisions. | Anabi, Andrew Issa | 4.50 | 2,137.50 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding case law on validity of assignment in violation of anti-assignment provisions (8.9); meet with P. Dopsch and M. Heo regarding research update (.5). | Anabi, Andrew Issa | 9.40 | 4,465.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Meet with A. Anabi and M. Heo regarding research update (.5); follow up on state law analysis and legal research relating to the same in connection with anti-assignment provisions (1.2). | Dopsch, Peter C. | 1.70 | 1,827.50 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Correspond with finance team regarding state law research on anti-assignment provisions (.3); brief review of legal research regarding same (.3). | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.60 | 525.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze case law research regarding enforcement of anti-assignment provisions in lease agreements (2.1); meet with P. Dopsch and A. Anabi regarding coal lease analysis (.5). | Heo, Min W. | 2.60 | 1,716.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze stipulation with Caterpillar financial on disclosures of contracts and assets. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.40 | 478.00 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding anti-assignment provisions. | Anabi, Andrew Issa | 8.60 | 4,085.00 |
| 22-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding validity anti-assignment provisions. | Anabi, Andrew Issa | 3.20 | 1,520.00 |
| 23-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding validity of assignment in violation of anti-assignment provisions. | Anabi, Andrew Issa | 3.00 | 1,425.00 |
| 24-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding validity of assignment in violation of anti-assignment provisions. | Anabi, Andrew Issa | 1.70 | 807.50 |
| 24-Dec-18 | Analyze leases and conflict with anti-assignment provisions in lease documentation. | Dopsch, Peter C. | 0.20 | 215.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTERMatter Number: 016291-0000003
Matter Name: JOINT MATTERSInvoice Number: 5797283
Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|----------------------------|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|------------------------|--------------|------------------|
| 26-Dec-18 | Draft memorandum regarding validity of anti-assignment provisions. | Anabi, Andrew Issa | 1.40 | 665.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Draft memorandum on validity of anti-assignment provisions. | Anabi, Andrew Issa | 1.00 | 475.00 |
| Total: 003 | Assumption and Rejection of Leases and Contracts | | 45.30 | 23,851.50 |
| Business Operations | | | | |
| 12-Dec-18 | Analyze BRG presentation on post petition performance. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.40 | 478.00 |
| 31-Dec-18 | Analyze November monthly operating report. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.40 | 430.00 |
| Total: 006 | Business Operations | | 0.80 | 908.00 |
| Case Administration | | | | |
| 03-Dec-18 | Analyze dockets and circulate update to internal working group with substantial filings for attorney review. | Braun, Danielle Eileen | 0.30 | 102.00 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Analyze dockets and circulate update to internal working group with substantial filings for attorney review (.2); update calendar and circulate same (.4). | Braun, Danielle Eileen | 0.60 | 204.00 |
| 05-Dec-18 | Analyze dockets and circulate update to internal working group with substantial filings for attorney review. | Braun, Danielle Eileen | 0.20 | 68.00 |
| 06-Dec-18 | Analyze dockets and circulate update to internal working group with substantial filings for attorney review (.2); obtain various sections of Colliers regarding valuation (.4). | Braun, Danielle Eileen | 0.60 | 204.00 |
| 07-Dec-18 | Analyze dockets and circulate same to internal working group with substantial filings for attorney review (.2); update calendar with new deadlines and circulate same (.3); analyze dataroom and circulate dataroom update to internal working group (.2). | Braun, Danielle Eileen | 0.70 | 238.00 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Analyze dockets and circulate update to internal working group with substantial filings for attorney review. | Braun, Danielle Eileen | 0.30 | 102.00 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Analyze dockets and circulate update to internal working group with substantial filings for attorney review (.2); update calendar and circulate same (.3). | Braun, Danielle Eileen | 0.50 | 170.00 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Analyze dockets and circulate update to internal working group with substantial filings for attorney review. | Braun, Danielle Eileen | 0.20 | 68.00 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Participate on professionals' call regarding case status. | Butterfield, Benjamin | 0.60 | 435.00 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Prepare for (.4) and participate on (.6) professionals' call regarding case status. | Doufekias, Demme | 1.00 | 975.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003

Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283

Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------|--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|------------------------|--------------|--------------|
| 12-Dec-18 | Participate on professionals' call regarding case status. | Gambier, Lauren M. | 0.60 | 465.00 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Prepare for (.2) and participate on (.6) professionals' call regarding case status. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.80 | 860.00 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Participate on professionals' call regarding case status. | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.60 | 525.00 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Participate on professionals' call regarding case status. | Kissner, Andrew | 0.60 | 315.00 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Attend meeting with internal working group regarding case status and next steps. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.50 | 597.50 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Prepare for (.5) and participate on (.6) professionals' call regarding case status. | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 1.10 | 588.50 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Attend meeting with internal working group regarding case status and next steps. | Richards, Erica J. | 0.50 | 437.50 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Analyze dockets and circulate update to internal working group with substantial filings for attorney review (.2); retrieve files regarding recorded documents and leases (.4). | Braun, Danielle Eileen | 0.60 | 204.00 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Call with F. Yudkin (Cole Schotz) regarding fee allocation between estates. | Kissner, Andrew | 0.30 | 157.50 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Analyze dockets and circulate update to internal working group with substantial filings for attorney review (.2); update calendar and circulate same (.2); analyze and retrieve report of uploaded documents to dataroom (.2). | Braun, Danielle Eileen | 0.60 | 204.00 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Analyze protective order with IUOE. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.60 | 717.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Analyze dockets and circulate update to internal working group with substantial filings for attorney review (.2); compile and send all leases to Kirkland for review (.2). | Braun, Danielle Eileen | 0.40 | 136.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze dockets and circulate update to internal working group with substantial filings for attorney review (.2); update calendar and circulate same (.3). | Braun, Danielle Eileen | 0.50 | 170.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze dockets and circulate update to internal working group with substantial filings (.2); update calendar regarding extension for confirmation objection (.1). | Braun, Danielle Eileen | 0.30 | 102.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Participate on weekly professionals' call regarding case update. | Butterfield, Benjamin | 0.60 | 435.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Participate on weekly professionals' call regarding case status and update. | Doufekias, Demme | 0.50 | 487.50 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Participate on weekly professionals' call regarding case update. | Gambier, Lauren M. | 0.60 | 465.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Participate on weekly professionals' call regarding case update. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.60 | 645.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTERMatter Number: 016291-0000003
Matter Name: JOINT MATTERSInvoice Number: 5797283
Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|---------------------------------------------|----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|------------------------|--------------|------------------|
| 19-Dec-18 | Participate on weekly professionals' call regarding case status and strategy (.6); follow-up correspondence with internal group regarding same (.1). | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.70 | 612.50 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Participate on weekly professionals' call regarding case status and update. | Kissner, Andrew | 0.50 | 262.50 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Prepare for (.4) and participate on (.6) weekly professionals' call regarding case update. | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 1.00 | 535.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Participate on weekly professionals' call regarding case status and update. | Richards, Erica J. | 0.50 | 437.50 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze dockets and circulate update to internal working group with substantial filings for attorney review. | Braun, Danielle Eileen | 0.20 | 68.00 |
| 25-Dec-18 | Correspond with R. Ferraioli regarding upcoming Committee workstreams (.2); correspond with professionals regarding scheduling of calls (.2). | Kissner, Andrew | 0.40 | 210.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Participate on weekly professionals' call regarding case status. | Butterfield, Benjamin | 0.40 | 290.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Participate on weekly professionals' call regarding case status. | Dopsch, Peter C. | 0.40 | 430.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Participate on weekly professionals' call regarding case status. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.40 | 430.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Participate on weekly professionals' call regarding case status. | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.40 | 350.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Participate on weekly professionals' call regarding case status. | Heo, Min W. | 0.40 | 264.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Participate on weekly professionals' call regarding case status. | Richards, Erica J. | 0.40 | 350.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Participate on weekly professionals' call regarding case status. | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 0.40 | 190.00 |
| Total: 007 | Case Administration | | 21.40 | 14,507.00 |
| Claims Administration and Objections | | | | |
| 13-Dec-18 | Analyze research regarding black lung claims (.6); correspond with professionals regarding meeting to discuss claims analyses (.5). | Goren, Todd M. | 1.10 | 1,182.50 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Analyze Debtors' claims analysis (.9); analyze claim treatment for categories of claims (.9); correspond with BRG regarding claims analysis (.5); call with Kirkland regarding same (.4); begin claim settlement analysis for secured lender asks (1.2). | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 3.90 | 4,660.50 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Call with BRG and Jefferies regarding claims analysis. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.50 | 537.50 |

MORRISON | FOERSTERMatter Number: 016291-0000003
Matter Name: JOINT MATTERSInvoice Number: 5797283
Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|---------------------------------------|---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|--------------------|--------------|------------------|
| 14-Dec-18 | Call with BRG and Jefferies regarding claims estimates. | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.50 | 437.50 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Correspond with T. Goren regarding claims estimates (.3); correspond with G. Pesce (Kirkland) regarding claims and information session (.4); analyze treatment of retiree/black lung claims (.5); analyze DSG notice of secured claim (.3). | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 1.50 | 1,792.50 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Correspond with Debtors regarding claims meeting. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.30 | 322.50 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Correspond with G. Pesce (Kirkland), Alvarez and Committee advisors regarding claims call. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.40 | 430.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Call with Debtors' advisors regarding initial claims analysis (.8); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.6). | Harris, Daniel J. | 1.40 | 1,225.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Participate on call with Debtors' advisors and BRG to review claims materials. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.80 | 956.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Analyze summary of schedules to determine claim allocations and value flow. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.90 | 1,075.50 |
| Total: 008 | Claims Administration and Objections | | 11.30 | 12,619.50 |
| Employee Benefits and Pensions | | | | |
| 10-Dec-18 | Analyze and revise draft presentation regarding KERP. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.60 | 645.00 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Analyze BRG KERP presentation (.7); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.3); correspond with J. Surdoval (BRG) regarding same (.2). | Kissner, Andrew | 1.20 | 630.00 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Analyze and revise KERP presentation by BRG (.9); correspond with BRG regarding same (.4). | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 1.30 | 1,553.50 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Analyze further updated draft of KERP presentation. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.40 | 430.00 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Analyze and revise BRG analysis of KERP. | Kissner, Andrew | 0.80 | 420.00 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Analyze draft presentation for Committee regarding KERP (.5); call with H. Duran regarding KERP (.2); draft memorandum to internal working group regarding same (.2). | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.90 | 1,075.50 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Analyze KERP presentation (.4); analyze potential concerns regarding same (.3); analyze release regarding CFO resignation (.2). | Goren, Todd M. | 0.90 | 967.50 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Call with G. Pesce (Kirkland) regarding KERP (.2); analyze KERP deck from BRG (.3). | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.50 | 597.50 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Analyze UMWA objection to KERP. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.30 | 322.50 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Correspond with Kirkland and counsel to UMWA regarding KERP motion. | Kissner, Andrew | 0.20 | 105.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003
Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283
Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|----------------------------------------|-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|--------------------|--------------|-----------------|
| 17-Dec-18 | Analyze UMWA objection to KERP/joinder (.6); analyze declaration in support of KERP (.5); analyze Committee KERP analysis for hearing (.4). | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 1.50 | 1,792.50 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze IOEU term sheet (.5); analyze correspondence from G. Pesce (Kirkland) regarding ratification vote failure (.2). | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.70 | 836.50 |
| 26-Dec-18 | Analyze update from G. Pesce (Kirkland) regarding labor matters. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.40 | 478.00 |
| Total: 010 | Employee Benefits and Pensions | | 9.70 | 9,853.50 |
| Employment and Fee Applications | | | | |
| 01-Dec-18 | Prepare direct examination of C. Keal for retention hearing and materials for preparation of witnesses. | Doufekias, Demme | 2.30 | 2,242.50 |
| 03-Dec-18 | Prepare outline for testimony at retention hearing (2.6); analyze materials related to same (1.8); meet with internal working group regarding potential objections and status of negotiations on retention orders (.4). | Doufekias, Demme | 4.80 | 4,680.00 |
| 03-Dec-18 | Analyze research regarding employment of financial advisor and investment banker (.6); correspond with internal working group regarding BRG/Jefferies' retention status (.3). | Goren, Todd M. | 0.90 | 967.50 |
| 03-Dec-18 | Meet with internal working group regarding potential objections and status of negotiations on retention orders. | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.40 | 350.00 |
| 03-Dec-18 | Draft reply in support of investment banker and financial advisor retention applications (5.8); conduct legal research in support of same (1.3); analyze transcripts from Seadrill (.7), Linn (.6) and C&J (.2); meet with internal working group regarding status of retention negotiations (.4); correspond with L. Marinuzzi regarding retention standards (.2); conduct legal research regarding same (.9). | Kissner, Andrew | 10.10 | 5,302.50 |
| 03-Dec-18 | Analyze case authority and prepare outline for hearing regarding BRG and Jefferies retention (.9); analyze investigation topics and investment banker vs financial advisor tasks for narrative (2.1); calls with S. Zide (Kramer) (.5), L. Szlezinger (Jefferies) (.7) and E. Ordway (BRG) (.3) regarding possible resolution of objections from lenders. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 4.50 | 5,377.50 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Prepare materials for retention hearing (6.4); meet with Committee professionals and witness regarding same (.6). | Doufekias, Demme | 7.00 | 6,825.00 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Analyze and revise updated drafts of BRG and Jefferies orders (.7); correspond with professionals regarding same (.6). | Goren, Todd M. | 1.30 | 1,397.50 |

MORRISON | FOERSTERMatter Number: 016291-0000003
Matter Name: JOINT MATTERSInvoice Number: 5797283
Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|--------------------------------------------------|---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|--------------------|--------------|------------------|
| 04-Dec-18 | Correspond with internal working group regarding BRG and Jefferies' revised retention orders. | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.70 | 612.50 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Call with Sidley team regarding proposed changes to BRG and Jefferies retention orders (.7); draft and revise reply in support of same (2.9); conduct legal research regarding same (2.3); call with Schulte regarding retention orders (.3); revise BRG retention order (.6); correspond with BRG team regarding same (.2); correspond with Debtors and lenders' counsel regarding retentions (.3); draft and revise supplement declaration in support of MoFo retention application (.6); analyze and revise supplemental declaration in support of BRG retention (.2). | Kissner, Andrew | 8.10 | 4,252.50 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Meet in Houston to prepare witness and prepare argument (2.4); call with S. Zide (Kramer) and Schulte to resolve objections (.8); analyze and revise several drafts of revised retention orders (1.3). | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 4.50 | 5,377.50 |
| 05-Dec-18 | Analyze proposed Ernst & Young retention order. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.40 | 478.00 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Analyze and revise supplemental Marinuzzi declaration. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.40 | 430.00 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Draft supplemental Marinuzzi declaration in support of retention (.8); revise same per comments of internal working group (.3); call with M. Warner (Cole Schotz) regarding same (.3); revise notice of rate change (.3). | Kissner, Andrew | 1.70 | 892.50 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze and revise correspondence regarding reallocation of fees. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.40 | 430.00 |
| Total: 011 | Employment and Fee Applications | | 47.50 | 39,615.50 |
| Employment and Fee Application Objections | | | | |
| 10-Dec-18 | Analyze motion regarding hearing on McKinsey retention. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.40 | 430.00 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Analyze MarBow motion for status conference on McKinsey application (.4); analyze MarBow objection (.4) | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.80 | 956.00 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Analyze McKinsey reply to Mar-Bow objection. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.60 | 645.00 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Analyze U.S. Trustee objection to McKinsey retention. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.60 | 645.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Analyze Mar-Bow's response to McKinsey retention. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.70 | 752.50 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Analyze Mar Bow reply on McKinsey objection (.7); analyze supplemental McKinsey declaration of disinterestedness (.5); analyze status update from McKinsey (.5) | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 1.70 | 2,031.50 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003
Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283
Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|---------------------------------------------------|--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|-----------------------|--------------|-----------------|
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze McKinsey regarding hearing statement. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.50 | 537.50 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze motion/cross-motion on McKinsey discovery and depositions (.5); analyze order requiring depositions by certain date (.2). | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.70 | 836.50 |
| Total: 012 | Employment and Fee Application Objections | | 6.00 | 6,834.00 |
| Meetings and Communications with Creditors | | | | |
| 04-Dec-18 | Correspond with Committee regarding retention status (.3); call with IUOE counsel regarding case questions (.4). | Goren, Todd M. | 0.70 | 752.50 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Draft correspondence to Committee regarding disclosure statement, retentions and case updates. | Kissner, Andrew | 0.70 | 367.50 |
| 05-Dec-18 | Correspond with Committee members regarding retention and scheduling of Committee call. | Kissner, Andrew | 0.30 | 157.50 |
| 06-Dec-18 | Analyze and revise correspondence to Committee regarding plan and disclosure statement update. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.20 | 215.00 |
| 07-Dec-18 | Correspond with internal working group regarding Committee member claims. | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.50 | 437.50 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Analyze and revise correspondence to Committee regarding bar date. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.20 | 215.00 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Correspond with Committee members regarding bar date. | Kissner, Andrew | 0.30 | 157.50 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Correspond with A. Kissner regarding upcoming agenda items (.1); analyze agenda (.3). | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.40 | 350.00 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Draft and revise agenda for weekly Committee call (.7); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.2); correspond with Committee regarding same (.2). | Kissner, Andrew | 1.10 | 577.50 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Prepare for (.1) and participate on (.7) weekly Committee call regarding case status and update. | Butterfield, Benjamin | 0.80 | 580.00 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Participate on weekly Committee call regarding case status and update. | Doufekias, Demme | 0.80 | 780.00 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Analyze BRG presentation in preparation for Committee call (.8); participate on weekly Committee call regarding case status and update (.7). | Goren, Todd M. | 1.50 | 1,612.50 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Participate on weekly Committee call regarding case status and update. | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.70 | 612.50 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Prepare for (.4) and participate on (.7) weekly Committee call regarding case status and update. | Kissner, Andrew | 1.10 | 577.50 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Prepare for (.4) and participate on (.7) weekly Committee call regarding case status and update. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 1.10 | 1,314.50 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Participate on weekly Committee call regarding case status and update. | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 0.70 | 374.50 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003
 Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------|-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|-----------------------|--------------|--------------|
| 12-Dec-18 | Prepare for (.5) and participate on (.7) weekly Committee call regarding case status and update. | Richards, Erica J. | 1.20 | 1,050.00 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Participate on weekly Committee call regarding case status and update. | Rosenberg, Adam N. | 0.70 | 322.00 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Call with M. Stollo (PBGC) regarding plan process, Committee investigation and sale. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.40 | 478.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Correspond with C. Speckhart (Wolcott) regarding case status. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.30 | 358.50 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze and revise correspondence to Committee regarding hearing update. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.30 | 322.50 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze and comment on BRG presentation to Committee regarding schedules, statements, and claims (.6); call with J. Geraghty (BRG) regarding same (.2); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.1); analyze Jefferies cash flow presentation to Committee (.3). | Kissner, Andrew | 1.20 | 630.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Prepare for (.3) and participate on (.7) weekly Committee call regarding case update. | Butterfield, Benjamin | 1.00 | 725.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze BRG and Jefferies presentation in preparation for Committee call (.8); participate on weekly Committee call regarding case update (.8); follow-up correspondence with internal working group regarding same (.4); call with PBGC regarding case status and strategy (.5). | Goren, Todd M. | 2.50 | 2,687.50 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Prepare for (.2) and participate on (.7) weekly Committee call regarding case update; draft lien challenge update for Committee call (.5). | Harris, Daniel J. | 1.40 | 1,225.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Participate on weekly Committee call regarding case update. | Kissner, Andrew | 0.90 | 472.50 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Prepare for (.9) and participate on (.7) weekly Committee call regarding case update; analyze Jefferies report on sale process (.4); analyze upcoming deadlines and investigation discussion points (.5); call with J. Baker (Nelson Bros.) regarding Committee call (.3). | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 2.80 | 3,346.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Participate on weekly Committee call regarding case update. | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 0.70 | 374.50 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Participate on weekly Committee call regarding case update. | Richards, Erica J. | 0.90 | 787.50 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Correspond with D. Sparks and J. Baker regarding Committee call (.2); analyze correspondence with Debtors regarding IUOE vote (.4); analyze motion to extend exclusivity period (.4); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.2). | Kissner, Andrew | 1.20 | 630.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Correspond with D. Sparks (Christian & Small) regarding status of Committee decision items. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.30 | 358.50 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003

Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283

Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------------|----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|------------------------|--------------|------------------|
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze recent filings and drafts of upcoming filings from Debtors (1.7); correspond with Committee regarding same (.4). | Butterfield, Benjamin | 2.10 | 1,522.50 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze and revise correspondence to Committee members regarding recent filings. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.60 | 645.00 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Correspond with Committee summarizing recent filings. | Kissner, Andrew | 0.70 | 367.50 |
| 23-Dec-18 | Analyze draft of Committee presentation for upcoming Committee call. | Dopsch, Peter C. | 1.00 | 1,075.00 |
| 26-Dec-18 | Prepare and revise presentation for Committee regarding status of investigations (2.9); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.7). | Harris, Daniel J. | 3.60 | 3,150.00 |
| 26-Dec-18 | Draft agenda for weekly Committee call (.4); correspond with D. Harris regarding same (.2); correspond with BRG (.1) and Jefferies (.2) regarding Committee call materials. | Kissner, Andrew | 0.90 | 472.50 |
| 26-Dec-18 | Revise agenda and updates for Committee call. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.40 | 478.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Participate on weekly Committee call regarding case status and strategy. | Butterfield, Benjamin | 0.80 | 580.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Participate on weekly Committee call regarding case status and strategy. | Dopsch, Peter C. | 0.80 | 860.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Prepare for (.3) and participate on (.8) weekly Committee call regarding case status and strategy; analyze and revise presentation for same (1.3). | Goren, Todd M. | 2.40 | 2,580.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Finalize presentation for Committee regarding claims investigations (1.4); participate on weekly Committee call regarding case status and strategy (.8). | Harris, Daniel J. | 2.20 | 1,925.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Prepare for (.1) and participate on (.8) weekly Committee call regarding case status and strategy | Heo, Min W. | 0.90 | 594.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Analyze Committee presentation materials regarding investigations (.7); draft correspondence to Committee regarding call (.2); prepare for (.5) and participate on (.8) weekly Committee call to discuss case update and status. | Kissner, Andrew | 2.20 | 1,155.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Analyze Committee update regarding status of investigations and next steps (1.1); prepare for (.7) and participate on (.8) weekly Committee call regarding case status and strategy. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 2.60 | 3,107.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Revise Committee presentation on claims investigation (1.6); participate on weekly Committee call regarding case status and strategy (.8). | Richards, Erica J. | 2.40 | 2,100.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Participate on weekly Committee call regarding case status and strategy. | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 0.80 | 380.00 |
| Total: 015 | Meetings and Communications with Creditors | | 51.30 | 43,840.50 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003
 Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|--------------------------------------|----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|----------------------|--------------|------------------|
| Non-Working Travel | | | | |
| 04-Dec-18 | Travel to and from Houston for retention hearing. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 9.60 | 11,472.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Return travel from Houston following omnibus hearing. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 5.40 | 6,453.00 |
| Total: 016 | Non-Working Travel | | 15.00 | 17,925.00 |
| Plan and Disclosure Statement | | | | |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze motion to extend exclusivity. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.40 | 430.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze motion to extend exclusivity (.3); analyze potential plan structures for potential GUC resolutions (.6). | Goren, Todd M. | 0.90 | 967.50 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze motion to extend exclusivity. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.50 | 597.50 |
| Total: 017 | Plan and Disclosure Statement | | 1.80 | 1,995.00 |
| Real Estate | | | | |
| 06-Dec-18 | Correspond with C. Delson regarding issues related to real property analysis. | Dopsch, Peter C. | 0.90 | 967.50 |
| 07-Dec-18 | Correspond with E. Richards and D. Harris regarding newly included real property issues. | Zidel, Max Phillip | 0.40 | 190.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze real property schedules (.3); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.1); analyze applicable rules on anti-assignment provisions and lien validity (.4). | Zidel, Max Phillip | 0.80 | 380.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze mortgages with respect to real property. | Anabi, Andrew Issa | 0.90 | 427.50 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze liens on owned real estate. | Mahyera, Rohani | 0.80 | 580.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Correspond with internal working group regarding mortgage collateral documents. | Zaccarelli, Monet D. | 0.50 | 135.00 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze mortgages to confirm owned and leased properties are not listed. | Anabi, Andrew Issa | 0.20 | 95.00 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze mortgages against list of owned and leased real estate. | Mahyera, Rohani | 2.10 | 1,522.50 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze mortgages on property for R. Mahyera. | Zaccarelli, Monet D. | 5.50 | 1,485.00 |
| 22-Dec-18 | Analyze mortgages to confirm owned properties are not listed. | Anabi, Andrew Issa | 1.30 | 617.50 |
| 23-Dec-18 | Analyze mortgages on property for R. Mahyera. | Zaccarelli, Monet D. | 8.50 | 2,295.00 |
| 24-Dec-18 | Analyze mortgages to confirm owned and leased properties are not listed. | Anabi, Andrew Issa | 2.10 | 997.50 |
| 24-Dec-18 | Analyze mortgages against unsecured property. | Mahyera, Rohani | 3.70 | 2,682.50 |
| 24-Dec-18 | Analyze mortgages on property for R. Mahyera. | Zaccarelli, Monet D. | 2.00 | 540.00 |
| 25-Dec-18 | Analyze mortgages to confirm owned and leased properties are not listed. | Anabi, Andrew Issa | 3.00 | 1,425.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003
Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283
Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------------|-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|-----------------------|--------------|------------------|
| 26-Dec-18 | Analyze mortgages to confirm owned and leased properties are not listed. | Anabi, Andrew Issa | 0.50 | 237.50 |
| 26-Dec-18 | Analyze updated mortgage analysis to assess unperfected properties. | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.50 | 437.50 |
| Total: 018 | Real Estate | | 33.70 | 15,015.00 |
| Discovery | | | | |
| 01-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigation. | Rosenberg, Adam N. | 2.30 | 1,058.00 |
| 02-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigation. | Konjuhi, Alex | 5.00 | 1,925.00 |
| 02-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigation. | Radzinschi, Julian N. | 2.40 | 1,740.00 |
| 03-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigation. | Adeseye, Tola | 5.80 | 3,335.00 |
| 03-Dec-18 | Download dataroom documents and update Relativity. | Bergelson, Vadim | 1.70 | 561.00 |
| 03-Dec-18 | Call with L. Gambier regarding discovery (.3); correspond with Debtors regarding meet and confer (.2). | Doufekias, Demme | 0.50 | 487.50 |
| 03-Dec-18 | Call with internal working group and Jefferies team regarding status of discovery (.8); analyze and draft summary key documents identified in review (2.3); draft agenda for and summary of document review status (.6); correspond with J. Mbakwe and J. Radzinschi regarding document review and legal research issues (.3); draft summary of outstanding discovery requests in preparation for meet and confer (.6). | Gambier, Lauren M. | 4.60 | 3,565.00 |
| 03-Dec-18 | Participate on call with internal working group and Jefferies team regarding status of discovery and identification of potential claims. | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.80 | 700.00 |
| 03-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigation. | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 3.90 | 2,086.50 |
| 03-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigation. | Radzinschi, Julian N. | 0.50 | 362.50 |
| 03-Dec-18 | Analyze correspondence regarding status of discovery requests (.1); call with internal working group and Jefferies team regarding status of discovery (.8). | Richards, Erica J. | 0.90 | 787.50 |
| 03-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigation. | Rosenberg, Adam N. | 3.80 | 1,748.00 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's claims and lien investigation (1.2); meet and confer with Debtor's counsel (.8). | Bell, Mike | 2.00 | 1,430.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003
 Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------|---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|--------------------|--------------|--------------|
| 04-Dec-18 | Download dataroom documents and update Relativity. | Bergelson, Vadim | 1.50 | 495.00 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Meet and confer with Debtors' counsel (.8); follow-up correspondence with internal working group and Cole Schotz team regarding same (.8); analyze materials regarding Debtors' discovery (.5); analyze key documents identified by document review team (1.2). | Doufekias, Demme | 3.30 | 3,217.50 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Meet and confer with Debtors' counsel (.8); correspond with J. Radzinski regarding legal research in connection with claims investigation (.1). | Gambier, Lauren M. | 0.90 | 697.50 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Prepare for (.4) and participate on (.8) meet and confer with Debtor's counsel. | Harris, Daniel J. | 1.20 | 1,050.00 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Correspond with D. Doufekias and N. Brannick regarding discovery and document requests. | Kissner, Andrew | 0.40 | 210.00 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's claims and lien investigation. | Konjuhi, Alex | 6.80 | 2,618.00 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigation (2.4); draft document review protocol (1.0). | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 3.40 | 1,819.00 |
| 05-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's claims and lien investigation. | Adeseye, Tola | 4.70 | 2,702.50 |
| 05-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's claims and lien investigation. | Bell, Mike | 1.70 | 1,215.50 |
| 05-Dec-18 | Call with Cole Schotz team regarding discovery strategy (1.0); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.9); review key documents identified by document review team (5.1); call with J. Aycock (Kirkland) and M. Holden (Kirkland) regarding outstanding discovery issues (1.1). | Doufekias, Demme | 8.10 | 7,897.50 |
| 05-Dec-18 | Call with Cole Schotz regarding Debtor discovery issues (1.0); call with J. Mbakwe regarding document review (.5); correspond with internal working group regarding work product to be developed in connection with document review (.5); draft outline of potential legal claims and elements thereof for guidance to document review team (1.0); conduct legal research in connection with and editing draft memorandum summarizing potential legal claims (1.1). | Gambier, Lauren M. | 4.10 | 3,177.50 |
| 05-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's claims investigation. | Konjuhi, Alex | 6.10 | 2,348.50 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003
 Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------|-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|--------------------|--------------|--------------|
| 05-Dec-18 | Analyze Debtor response to Committee discovery demand (.4); correspond with D. Doufekias regarding discovery process and timeline (.4); consider discovery process overlap with plan process (.5); analyze overall discovery and document demand milestones (.6). | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 1.90 | 2,270.50 |
| 05-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigation (3.5); call with L. Gambier regarding document review (.5); draft email production proposal Debtors' advisors (2.8). | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 6.80 | 3,638.00 |
| 06-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's claims and lien investigation. | Adeseye, Tola | 1.20 | 690.00 |
| 06-Dec-18 | Analyze key documents identified by review team. | Doufekias, Demme | 4.50 | 4,387.50 |
| 06-Dec-18 | Draft third set of requests for production to Debtors (.5); correspond with D. Doufekias regarding document requests (.1). | Gambier, Lauren M. | 0.60 | 465.00 |
| 06-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's claims and lien investigation. | Konjuhi, Alex | 0.80 | 308.00 |
| 07-Dec-18 | Analyze legal claims outline (.3); collate key documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's claims and lien investigation (.3). | Adeseye, Tola | 0.60 | 345.00 |
| 07-Dec-18 | Analyze and coordinate uploads in Relativity. | Bergelson, Vadim | 3.20 | 1,056.00 |
| 07-Dec-18 | Correspond with internal working group regarding document production issues. | Gambier, Lauren M. | 0.20 | 155.00 |
| 07-Dec-18 | Correspond with internal working group regarding discovery matters. | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.40 | 350.00 |
| 07-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigation. | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 3.30 | 1,765.50 |
| 08-Dec-18 | Analyze and coordinate document uploads in Relativity. | Bergelson, Vadim | 3.20 | 1,056.00 |
| 08-Dec-18 | Correspond with D. Doufekias and J. Mbakwe regarding document production and review. | Gambier, Lauren M. | 0.20 | 155.00 |
| 09-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigation. | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 2.10 | 1,123.50 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigation. | Bell, Mike | 2.30 | 1,644.50 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Export documents for Jefferies (1.1); assist with Relativity review (1.2). | Bergelson, Vadim | 2.30 | 759.00 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Participate on call with internal working group regarding status of discovery (1.1); analyze documents identified by document review team (1.3); | Doufekias, Demme | 2.40 | 2,340.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003
 Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------|----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|----------------------|--------------|--------------|
| 10-Dec-18 | Correspond with D. Doufekias and J. Mbakwe regarding document review status (.4); revise chart summarizing status of Committee discovery requests (.6); participate on call with internal working group regarding status of discovery (1.1). | Gambier, Lauren M. | 2.10 | 1,627.50 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Participate on call with internal working group regarding status of discovery. | Harris, Daniel J. | 1.10 | 962.50 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigation (8.4); participate on call with internal working group regarding status of discovery (1.1). | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 9.50 | 5,082.50 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigation. | Radzinski, Julian N. | 0.90 | 652.50 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Analyze report of new diligence materials. | Richards, Erica J. | 0.20 | 175.00 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigation. | Rosenberg, Adam N. | 4.00 | 1,840.00 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigation. | Adeseye, Tola | 7.80 | 4,485.00 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigation. | Bell, Mike | 0.80 | 572.00 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Download and update Relativity with dataroom documents. | Bergelson, Vadim | 1.40 | 462.00 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Participate in meet and confer with M. Holden (Kirkland) regarding second set of Committee's document requests and Debtors' upcoming production. | Doufekias, Demme | 0.60 | 585.00 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Correspond with E. Richards and M. Zidel regarding outstanding document requests. | Gambier, Lauren M. | 0.30 | 232.50 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Correspond with M. Zidel regarding status of discovery received from Kirkland (.4); analyze status of dataroom documents (.3); correspond with M. Zidel regarding same (.4). | Harris, Daniel J. | 1.10 | 962.50 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Correspond with D. Doufekias regarding status of discovery. | Kissner, Andrew | 0.30 | 157.50 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigation. | Konjuhi, Alex | 2.60 | 1,001.00 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigation. | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 6.80 | 3,638.00 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigation. | Radzinski, Julian N. | 5.50 | 3,987.50 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigation. | Rosenberg, Adam N. | 3.90 | 1,794.00 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigation. | Sassoon, Harriet | 4.10 | 2,460.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003
 Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|----------------------|--------------|--------------|
| 12-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Adeseye, Tola | 7.20 | 4,140.00 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Bell, Mike | 1.40 | 1,001.00 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Assist with document review (.4); identify select records in Relativity (.3). | Bergelson, Vadim | 0.70 | 231.00 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Analyze pleadings regarding standing motion (1.3); analyze key documents identified by document review team (1.4). | Doufekias, Demme | 2.70 | 2,632.50 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Correspond with internal working group regarding outstanding document requests. | Gambier, Lauren M. | 0.30 | 232.50 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Correspond with lien review and discovery teams regarding open requests. | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.50 | 437.50 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Konjuhi, Alex | 10.50 | 4,042.50 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 11.80 | 6,313.00 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Radzinski, Julian N. | 3.90 | 2,827.50 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Rosenberg, Adam N. | 4.00 | 1,840.00 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Sassoon, Harriet | 6.70 | 4,020.00 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Adeseye, Tola | 3.30 | 1,897.50 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Bell, Mike | 3.80 | 2,717.00 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Setup new users in Relativity (1.1); update Relativity workspace with newly received production documents (1.3). | Bergelson, Vadim | 2.40 | 792.00 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Analyze key documents identified by document review team (2.4); call with L. Gambier and J. Mbakwe regarding document review and expanding review team (.8); identify additional document review resources (.4); draft email to Debtors' regarding Committee's second set of discovery responses (.7); call with M. Zidel regarding same (.3). | Doufekias, Demme | 4.60 | 4,485.00 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Analyze document review protocol memorandum. | Frost, Alison | 1.30 | 598.00 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Call with D. Doufekias and J. Mbakwe regarding document review and expanding review team (.8); correspond with internal working group regarding document review in connection with claims investigation (.6); analyze key documents identified in review in connection with claims investigation (1.2). | Gambier, Lauren M. | 2.60 | 2,015.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003
 Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------|-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|-----------------------|--------------|--------------|
| 13-Dec-18 | Correspond with internal working group regarding status of document requests. | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.50 | 437.50 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Konjuhi, Alex | 4.50 | 1,732.50 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations (6.6); call with D. Doufekias and L. Gambier regarding document review and expanding review team (.8). | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 7.40 | 3,959.00 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Radzinschi, Julian N. | 3.40 | 2,465.00 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Rosenberg, Adam N. | 6.30 | 2,898.00 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Analyze updated document requests (.8); call with D. Doufekias regarding discovery (.3). | Zidel, Max Phillip | 1.10 | 522.50 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Adeseye, Tola | 9.40 | 5,405.00 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Bell, Mike | 4.50 | 3,217.50 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Download and analyze incoming document production (1.5); update Relativity workspace with newly received documents (1.9). | Bergelson, Vadim | 3.40 | 1,122.00 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Correspond with N. Brannick (Cole Schotz) regarding lender discovery (.5); analyze and revise deficiency letter (.4); correspond with V. Bergelson regarding upcoming document production (.3); draft discovery update to Debtors' counsel and respond to follow-up emails regarding same (1.6). | Doufekias, Demme | 2.80 | 2,730.00 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Analyze protocol memorandum regarding document review (.3); call with L. Gambier and J. Mbakwe regarding document review training (.4). | Frost, Alison | 0.70 | 322.00 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Call with J. Mbakwe and document review team regarding document review procedures and training (.4); analyze document review protocol in advance of call (.3); correspond with document review team regarding document requests (.2); analyze key documents identified in review of claims investigation document (.4). | Gambier, Lauren M. | 1.30 | 1,007.50 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Konjuhi, Alex | 5.10 | 1,963.50 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Analyze document review protocol (1.1); call with L. Gambier and J. Mbakwe regarding document review project training (.4). | Mateo, Kat E. | 1.50 | 900.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003
 Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------|----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|------------------------|--------------|--------------|
| 14-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations (9.3); call with L. Gambier and document review team to provide training to new members of review team (.4). | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 9.70 | 5,189.50 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Call with L. Gambier and J. Mbakwe regarding document review protocol and training (.4); analyze same (.4). | Miriyala, Arvind S. | 0.80 | 368.00 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Radzinski, Julian N. | 1.60 | 1,160.00 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Rosenberg, Adam N. | 6.50 | 2,990.00 |
| 15-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Radzinski, Julian N. | 1.20 | 870.00 |
| 15-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Rosenberg, Adam N. | 2.40 | 1,104.00 |
| 16-Dec-18 | Analyze and draft summary of key documents identified in course of claims investigation document review (1.0); correspond with D. Doufekias and J. Mbakwe regarding key documents (.2). | Gambier, Lauren M. | 1.20 | 930.00 |
| 16-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Konjuhi, Alex | 4.00 | 1,540.00 |
| 16-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 6.10 | 3,263.50 |
| 16-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Radzinski, Julian N. | 1.00 | 725.00 |
| 16-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with the Committee's investigation. | Rosenberg, Adam N. | 1.20 | 552.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Adeseye, Tola | 6.40 | 3,680.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Bell, Mike | 2.50 | 1,787.50 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Finalize Relativity update with production documents. | Bergelson, Vadim | 1.40 | 462.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Correspond with M. Holden (Kirkland) regarding Debtors' discovery responses (.4); draft summary of same (.4); analyze key document summary and address follow-up items related to same (2.1); call with J. Mbakwe and L. Gambier regarding discovery responses and document review (.5); call with Cole Schotz regarding discovery responses (.8); analyze correspondence regarding discovery responses (1.6). | Doufekias, Demme | 5.80 | 5,655.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Effendowicz, Alexander | 5.40 | 2,079.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003
 Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------|---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|------------------------|--------------|--------------|
| 17-Dec-18 | Analyze and summarize protocol memorandum regarding document review (2.6); analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations (.5). | Frost, Alison | 3.10 | 1,426.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Draft summary of key documents identified in review (.9); call with D. Doufekias and J. Mbakwe regarding key documents (.5); call with J. Mbakwe and B. Scheinok regarding document review (.2); correspond with D. Doufekias and J. Mbakwe regarding key documents identified in review (.3); revise chart of discovery received in connection with claims investigation (.6). | Gambier, Lauren M. | 2.50 | 1,937.50 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Konjuhi, Alex | 6.40 | 2,464.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations (12.3); call with L. Gambier and D. Doufekias regarding discovery responses and document review (.5). | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 12.80 | 6,848.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Radzinski, Julian N. | 1.50 | 1,087.50 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Analyze correspondence regarding most recent production from Debtors. | Richards, Erica J. | 1.60 | 1,400.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Rosenberg, Adam N. | 3.90 | 1,794.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Sassoon, Harriet | 1.20 | 720.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Analyze document review protocol (1.8); call with L. Gambier and J. Mbakwe regarding document review (.2). | Scheinok, Brittany | 2.00 | 1,100.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Analyze and download documents from dataroom for M. Heo. | Zaccarelli, Monet D. | 3.00 | 810.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Adeseye, Tola | 6.20 | 3,565.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Bell, Mike | 5.00 | 3,575.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Assist with document review (1.1); update Relativity with newly received production documents (1.2). | Bergelson, Vadim | 2.30 | 759.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Effendowicz, Alexander | 1.50 | 577.50 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations (2.1); correspond with L. Gambier and J. Mbakwe regarding key documents (.4). | Frost, Alison | 2.50 | 1,150.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003
 Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|----------------------|--------------|--------------|
| 18-Dec-18 | Call with internal working group regarding document review in connection with claims investigation (.3); correspond with D. Doufekias and J. Dai (Jefferies) regarding key documents identified in review (.2); analyze key documents identified in review (.6). | Gambier, Lauren M. | 1.10 | 852.50 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze document review protocol (1.2); call with internal working group regarding document review in connection with claims investigation (.3). | Kagel, Benjamin S. | 1.50 | 690.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Call with internal working group regarding document review in connection with claims investigation. | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 0.30 | 160.50 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze correspondence from internal working group regarding status of discovery requests. | Richards, Erica J. | 0.50 | 437.50 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Download and update Relativity with production documents (1.9); coordinate document export from Relativity (1.2). | Bergelson, Vadim | 3.10 | 1,023.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Correspond with L. Gambier and J. Mbakwe regarding key documents. | Frost, Alison | 0.10 | 46.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze chronology of key documents identified in review (.5); correspond with internal working group regarding review of documents in connection with claims investigation (.3). | Gambier, Lauren M. | 0.80 | 620.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Correspond with internal working group regarding status of discovery requests. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.40 | 430.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Correspond with J. Mbakwe and V. Bergelson regarding document production. | Heo, Min W. | 0.60 | 396.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Kagel, Benjamin S. | 0.40 | 184.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Konjuhi, Alex | 1.70 | 654.50 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 10.50 | 5,617.50 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Pundeff, Karina N. | 0.40 | 184.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Radzinski, Julian N. | 1.00 | 725.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze proposed email search terms. | Richards, Erica J. | 0.50 | 437.50 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Rosenberg, Adam N. | 5.80 | 2,668.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Scheinok, Brittany | 2.40 | 1,320.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Adeseye, Tola | 0.10 | 57.50 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003
Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283
Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|------------------------|--------------|--------------|
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Bell, Mike | 6.00 | 4,290.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Download and update Relativity with production documents (1.6); export select documents from Relativity (.8). | Bergelson, Vadim | 2.40 | 792.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Correspond with L. Marinuzzi regarding discovery matters. | Doufekias, Demme | 0.40 | 390.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Effendowicz, Alexander | 3.90 | 1,501.50 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Frost, Alison | 4.40 | 2,024.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Correspond with internal working group regarding status of discovery requests. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.40 | 430.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Heo, Min W. | 1.30 | 858.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Kagel, Benjamin S. | 3.30 | 1,518.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Konjuhi, Alex | 2.00 | 770.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 11.60 | 6,206.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Miriyala, Arvind S. | 1.30 | 598.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Pundeff, Karina N. | 0.90 | 414.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Radzinschi, Julian N. | 2.60 | 1,885.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Rosenberg, Adam N. | 5.80 | 2,668.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Scheinok, Brittany | 2.90 | 1,595.00 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Bell, Mike | 2.00 | 1,430.00 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Download and update Relativity with production documents (2.1); download incoming document production (1.1). | Bergelson, Vadim | 3.20 | 1,056.00 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Participate on call with internal working group regarding claims memorandum (.7); correspond with Debtors' counsel regarding outstanding discovery (1.2); analyze key documents identified by review team (3.6). | Doufekias, Demme | 5.50 | 5,362.50 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Frost, Alison | 3.80 | 1,748.00 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Kagel, Benjamin S. | 6.20 | 2,852.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003
 Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------|--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|-----------------------|--------------|--------------|
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Konjuhi, Alex | 4.20 | 1,617.00 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze status of Debtors' document production and open items. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.80 | 956.00 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 9.30 | 4,975.50 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Miriyala, Arvind S. | 0.50 | 230.00 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Pundeff, Karina N. | 5.20 | 2,392.00 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Radzinschi, Julian N. | 2.00 | 1,450.00 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Rosenberg, Adam N. | 5.20 | 2,392.00 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Scheinok, Brittany | 0.60 | 330.00 |
| 22-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Kagel, Benjamin S. | 1.70 | 782.00 |
| 22-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 4.20 | 2,247.00 |
| 23-Dec-18 | Download incoming document production and update Relativity workspace. | Bergelson, Vadim | 1.20 | 396.00 |
| 23-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Konjuhi, Alex | 5.50 | 2,117.50 |
| 23-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 6.10 | 3,263.50 |
| 23-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Pundeff, Karina N. | 1.40 | 644.00 |
| 23-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Scheinok, Brittany | 2.80 | 1,540.00 |
| 24-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Frost, Alison | 3.20 | 1,472.00 |
| 24-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Heo, Min W. | 4.20 | 2,772.00 |
| 24-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Konjuhi, Alex | 6.60 | 2,541.00 |
| 24-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 8.30 | 4,440.50 |
| 24-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Rosenberg, Adam N. | 3.20 | 1,472.00 |
| 24-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Scheinok, Brittany | 0.80 | 440.00 |
| 25-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Heo, Min W. | 4.50 | 2,970.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003
 Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------|--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|----------------------|--------------|--------------|
| 25-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 3.20 | 1,712.00 |
| 26-Dec-18 | Download and update Relativity with dataroom documents (1.5); generate review statistics (1.1). | Bergelson, Vadim | 2.60 | 858.00 |
| 26-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee investigations. | Frost, Alison | 3.20 | 1,472.00 |
| 26-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee investigations. | Heo, Min W. | 3.80 | 2,508.00 |
| 26-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee investigations. | Kagel, Benjamin S. | 4.30 | 1,978.00 |
| 26-Dec-18 | Correspond with A. Jenkins and M. Musto regarding document review. | Mateo, Kat E. | 0.20 | 120.00 |
| 26-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee investigations. | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 4.50 | 2,407.50 |
| 26-Dec-18 | Correspond with internal working group regarding document review. | Musto, Michael | 0.30 | 73.50 |
| 26-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee investigations. | Radzinski, Julian N. | 2.60 | 1,885.00 |
| 26-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee investigations. | Rosenberg, Adam N. | 3.30 | 1,518.00 |
| 26-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee investigations. | Scheinok, Brittany | 1.10 | 605.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Bell, Mike | 1.60 | 1,144.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Download and update Relativity with dataroom documents (1.5); generate review statistics (1.1). | Bergelson, Vadim | 2.60 | 858.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Participate on call with internal working group and Cole Schotz team regarding Debtor discovery. | Doufekias, Demme | 0.80 | 780.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee investigations. | Frost, Alison | 5.70 | 2,622.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Participate on call with internal working group and Cole Schotz team regarding Debtor discovery (.8); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.2); analyze key documents identified in review (.6). | Gambier, Lauren M. | 1.60 | 1,240.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Participate on call with internal working group and Cole Schotz team regarding Debtor discovery. | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.80 | 700.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Kagel, Benjamin S. | 3.40 | 1,564.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 4.50 | 2,407.50 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Miriyala, Arvind S. | 0.70 | 322.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTERMatter Number: 016291-0000003
Matter Name: JOINT MATTERSInvoice Number: 5797283
Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------------|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|----------------------|---------------|-------------------|
| 27-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Radzinski, Julian N. | 0.50 | 362.50 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Rosenberg, Adam N. | 0.50 | 230.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Scheinok, Brittany | 2.20 | 1,210.00 |
| 28-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Bell, Mike | 0.30 | 214.50 |
| 28-Dec-18 | Assist with document review and prepare review batches. | Bergelson, Vadim | 1.90 | 627.00 |
| 28-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Frost, Alison | 7.70 | 3,542.00 |
| 28-Dec-18 | Participate on call with Cole Schotz team regarding discovery strategy. | Gambier, Lauren M. | 0.70 | 542.50 |
| 28-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Kagel, Benjamin S. | 1.60 | 736.00 |
| 28-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 4.50 | 2,407.50 |
| 28-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Scheinok, Brittany | 0.20 | 110.00 |
| 29-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 8.30 | 4,440.50 |
| 30-Dec-18 | Analyze key documents identified by document reviewers. | Doufekias, Demme | 2.80 | 2,730.00 |
| 31-Dec-18 | Analyze documents produced by Debtors in connection with Committee's investigations. | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 3.50 | 1,872.50 |
| Total: 023 | Discovery | | 665.80 | 373,024.00 |
| Hearings | | | | |
| 14-Dec-18 | Analyze proposed agenda for December 18 hearing (.3); correspond with D. Braun and Cole Schotz regarding preparation for same (.3); prepare materials and presentation outline for same (1.2). | Kissner, Andrew | 1.80 | 945.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Call with counsel in preparation for omnibus hearing (1.2); analyze correspondence and draft discovery summary for L. Marinuzzi in preparation for omnibus hearing (2.1). | Doufekias, Demme | 3.30 | 3,217.50 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Attend (telephonically) omnibus hearing (partial). | Doufekias, Demme | 2.00 | 1,950.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Prepare for (.8) and attend (4.1) omnibus hearing. | Goren, Todd M. | 4.90 | 5,267.50 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Attend (telephonically) omnibus hearing. | Harris, Daniel J. | 4.10 | 3,587.50 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Attend (telephonically) omnibus hearing (4.1); correspond with Committee regarding same (.6). | Kissner, Andrew | 4.70 | 2,467.50 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Prepare for (1.5) and attend (4.1) omnibus hearing. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 5.60 | 6,692.00 |
| Total: 024 | Hearings | | 26.40 | 24,127.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTERMatter Number: 016291-0000003
Matter Name: JOINT MATTERSInvoice Number: 5797283
Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-----------------------------|---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|-----------------------|--------------|--------------|
| Claims Investigation | | | | |
| 01-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding memorandum of legal standards for potential claims (3.9); draft same (2.2); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.5). | Gambier, Lauren M. | 6.60 | 5,115.00 |
| 01-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding potential bankruptcy claims. | Radzinschi, Julian N. | 3.50 | 2,537.50 |
| 02-Dec-18 | Analyze and revise memorandum addressing legal analysis of claims. | Doufekias, Demme | 1.30 | 1,267.50 |
| 05-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding potential claims. | Radzinschi, Julian N. | 3.60 | 2,610.00 |
| 06-Dec-18 | Revise draft memorandum summarizing potential legal claims (2.5); review correspondence from D. Harris regarding valuation issues (.1). | Gambier, Lauren M. | 2.60 | 2,015.00 |
| 06-Dec-18 | Call with J. Dai (Jefferies) regarding potential claims (.4); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.3). | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.70 | 612.50 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Analyze correspondence regarding claims investigation and related matters (.7); analyze pleadings regarding standing motion (2.1); analyze case law related to claims investigation (1.3). | Doufekias, Demme | 4.10 | 3,997.50 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Call with J. Mbakwe and J. Dai (Jefferies) regarding claims investigation issues (.4); correspond with N. Brannick regarding legal research in support of potential claims (.3); conduct legal research in connection with and editing draft memorandum summarizing potential legal claims (2.9). | Gambier, Lauren M. | 3.60 | 2,790.00 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Participate on call with internal working group and Jefferies regarding status of claims investigation. | Richards, Erica J. | 1.00 | 875.00 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Analyze draft memorandum analyzing claims (1.3); call with L. Gambier regarding standing motion and complaints (.4); correspond with L. Marinuzzi regarding claims investigation (.5); analyze standing motions from similar cases (1.8). | Doufekias, Demme | 4.00 | 3,900.00 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research in connection with and updating memorandum on potential claims (3.7); call with D. Doufekias regarding claims investigation (.5). | Gambier, Lauren M. | 4.20 | 3,255.00 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Correspond with M. Zidel (.2) and D. Harris (.1) regarding claims investigation issues; revise memorandum regarding potential claims (4.9). | Gambier, Lauren M. | 5.20 | 4,030.00 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Analyze related pleadings and work regarding standing motion (2.1); meet with internal working group regarding lien investigation status (.7). | Doufekias, Demme | 2.80 | 2,730.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003
 Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------|-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|--------------------|--------------|--------------|
| 13-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research in connection with potential claims (7.4); correspond with D. Harris regarding claims investigation (.1); correspond with J. Dai (Jefferies) regarding solvency issues in connection with claims investigation (.2); correspond with internal working group regarding memorandum on potential claims (.1). | Gambier, Lauren M. | 7.80 | 6,045.00 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Correspond with internal working group regarding standing motions. | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.60 | 525.00 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Call with internal working group regarding preparation of standing motion (.8); analyze potential defendants in connection with same (3.2). | Richards, Erica J. | 4.00 | 3,500.00 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Analyze and revise legal claims memorandum (1.2); correspond with L. Gambier regarding same (.4). | Doufekias, Demme | 1.60 | 1,560.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Call with D. Harris regarding status of claims investigation (.3); call with E. Richards and Jefferies regarding solvency analysis (.4). | Doufekias, Demme | 0.70 | 682.50 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Participate on call regarding status of claims investigation (.8); follow-up call with D. Doufekias regarding same (.3); correspond with J. Dai (Jefferies) regarding same (.3). | Harris, Daniel J. | 1.40 | 1,225.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Participate on call regarding status of claims investigation. | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 0.80 | 428.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Analyze updated claims investigation memorandum (.7); call with D. Doufekias and Jefferies regarding solvency analysis (.4). | Richards, Erica J. | 1.10 | 962.50 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze and revise claims memorandum (.8); call with J. Dai (Jefferies) regarding documents identified in discovery (.4); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.3); analyze documents and other materials related to claims (1.3). | Doufekias, Demme | 2.80 | 2,730.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Revise memorandum of legal analysis of potential claims. | Gambier, Lauren M. | 0.80 | 620.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze and revise updated litigation memorandum regarding potential claims against secured lenders. | Richards, Erica J. | 0.50 | 437.50 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Call with D. Harris regarding presentation to client on status of claims investigation (.3); draft summary of legal claims for claims investigation presentation (3.6). | Gambier, Lauren M. | 3.90 | 3,022.50 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Analyze documents regarding status of investigation and standing motion. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.80 | 860.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Call with L. Gambier regarding presentation to client on status of claims investigation. | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.30 | 262.50 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003
 Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------------|----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|------------------------|--------------|------------------|
| 21-Dec-18 | Call with internal working group regarding claims memorandum (.7); correspond with D. Harris regarding same (.1); revise memorandum (2.1). | Gambier, Lauren M. | 2.90 | 2,247.50 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Call with internal working group regarding claims memorandum (.7); correspond with L. Gambier regarding same (.3); draft presentation regarding update on investigations for Committee (.5). | Harris, Daniel J. | 1.50 | 1,312.50 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Call with internal working group regarding claims analysis. | Richards, Erica J. | 0.70 | 612.50 |
| 26-Dec-18 | Review draft and presentation related to claims investigation. | Doufekias, Demme | 3.20 | 3,120.00 |
| 26-Dec-18 | Analyze draft presentation to Committee regarding status of claims investigation (.3); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.2). | Gambier, Lauren M. | 0.50 | 387.50 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding fraudulent transfer claims. | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 3.50 | 1,662.50 |
| 28-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding relevant TUFTA provisions and precedents (4.7); draft memorandum regarding same (1.7). | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 6.40 | 3,040.00 |
| 29-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research concerning relevant TUFTA provisions and precedents (4.3); draft memorandum regarding same (1.2). | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 5.50 | 2,612.50 |
| 31-Dec-18 | Revise joint standing motion. | Richards, Erica J. | 4.10 | 3,587.50 |
| Total: 026 | Claims Investigation | | 98.60 | 77,178.00 |

Lien Investigation

| | | | | |
|-----------|-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|--------------------|------|----------|
| 02-Dec-18 | Correspond with internal working group regarding perfection analysis. | Zidel, Max Phillip | 1.00 | 475.00 |
| 03-Dec-18 | Correspond with internal working group regarding attachment and perfection analysis. | Zidel, Max Phillip | 0.30 | 142.50 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Meet with internal working group regarding status of lien analysis and action items (1.0); analyze procedure for review of security documents and excluded collateral (.5). | Dopsch, Peter C. | 1.50 | 1,612.50 |
| 05-Dec-18 | Review draft analysis of Committee security agreement review (1.0); follow up on checklist of lien review procedures (1.0). | Dopsch, Peter C. | 2.00 | 2,150.00 |
| 06-Dec-18 | Call with M. Zidel regarding perfection issues (.5); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.4). | Dopsch, Peter C. | 0.90 | 967.50 |
| 06-Dec-18 | Correspond with lien analyze team regarding excluded assets and further discovery requests. | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.40 | 350.00 |
| 06-Dec-18 | Analyze correspondence from lien review team and follow up regarding same. | Richards, Erica J. | 1.40 | 1,225.00 |
| 06-Dec-18 | Call with P. Dopsch regarding perfection issues. | Zidel, Max Phillip | 0.50 | 237.50 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003

Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283

Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------|------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|-----------------------|--------------|--------------|
| 10-Dec-18 | Meet with lien review team regarding status of investigation. | Dopsch, Peter C. | 0.70 | 752.50 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Meet with lien review team regarding status of investigation. | Doufekias, Demme | 0.70 | 682.50 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Meet with lien review team regarding status of investigation. | Gambier, Lauren M. | 0.70 | 542.50 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Meet with lien review team regarding status of investigation. | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.70 | 612.50 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Meet with lien review team regarding status of investigation (.7); call with L. Gambier and J. Dai (Jefferies) regarding claims investigation issues (.4). | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 1.10 | 588.50 |
| 10-Dec-18 | Meet with lien review team regarding status of lien review and next steps. | Richards, Erica J. | 0.70 | 612.50 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Attend meeting with internal working group regarding lien investigation. | Butterfield, Benjamin | 0.90 | 652.50 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Further review of report relating to lien analysis (1.8); attend meeting with internal working group regarding lien investigation (.9). | Dopsch, Peter C. | 2.70 | 2,902.50 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Attend meeting (telephonically) with internal working group regarding lien investigation. | Doufekias, Demme | 0.90 | 877.50 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Attend meeting with internal working group regarding lien investigation. | Gambier, Lauren M. | 0.90 | 697.50 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Prepare for (.5) and attend (.9) meeting with internal working group regarding lien investigation; correspond with D. Doufekias regarding same (.3). | Harris, Daniel J. | 1.70 | 1,487.50 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Participate on call with internal working group regarding status of lien investigation. | Kissner, Andrew | 0.90 | 472.50 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Prepare for (.8) and attend (.9) meeting with internal working group regarding lien investigation. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 1.70 | 2,031.50 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Attend meeting (telephonically) with internal working group regarding lien investigation. | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 0.90 | 481.50 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Prepare for (.5) and attend (.9) meeting with internal working group regarding lien investigation. | Zidel, Max Phillip | 1.40 | 665.00 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Call with M. Zidel regarding initial report on lien evaluation and review of security documents and financing statements. | Dopsch, Peter C. | 1.00 | 1,075.00 |
| 12-Dec-18 | Correspond with D. Harris regarding lien investigation issues. | Richards, Erica J. | 0.30 | 262.50 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003
 Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------|----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|--------------------|--------------|--------------|
| 12-Dec-18 | Call with P. Dopsch regarding partnership perfection, missing documents for attachment analysis and conduct cash flow analysis (1.0); draft attachment and perfection memorandum summarizing lien investigation (2.6); correspond with internal working group regarding outstanding attachment and perfection issues (.8). | Zidel, Max Phillip | 4.40 | 2,090.00 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Meet with internal working group regarding lien investigation status. | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.70 | 612.50 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Draft attachment and perfection memorandum (3.6); correspond with internal working group regarding status of remaining perfection and attachment issues (.4). | Zidel, Max Phillip | 4.00 | 1,900.00 |
| 14-Dec-18 | Follow up on claims analysis and additional information requested from Debtors. | Dopsch, Peter C. | 1.00 | 1,075.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Meet with internal working group regarding status of lien investigation. | Dopsch, Peter C. | 0.80 | 860.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Meet with internal working group regarding status of lien investigation. | Doufekias, Demme | 0.80 | 780.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Meet with internal working group regarding status of lien investigation. | Gambier, Lauren M. | 0.80 | 620.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Meet with internal working group regarding status of lien investigation. | Harris, Daniel J. | 0.80 | 700.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Prepare for (.3) and attend (.8) meeting with internal working group regarding status of lien investigation. | Richards, Erica J. | 1.10 | 962.50 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze draft of lien analysis memorandum. | Dopsch, Peter C. | 1.50 | 1,612.50 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Analyze and provide comments to draft lien perfection memorandum. | Richards, Erica J. | 1.60 | 1,400.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Follow up on collateral description analysis and general lien review (.5); review results of research relating to stable analysis of anti-assignment provisions (.9); consider issues related to lien review analysis (1.1). | Dopsch, Peter C. | 2.50 | 2,687.50 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Analyze and revise perfection memorandum to clarify Committee filings (.3); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.7). | Heo, Min W. | 1.00 | 660.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Meet with P. Dopsch and R. Mahyeri regarding due diligence of liens. | Anabi, Andrew Issa | 0.30 | 142.50 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Meet with A. Anabi and R. Mahyeri regarding due diligence of liens. | Dopsch, Peter C. | 0.30 | 322.50 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Meet with A. Anabi and R. Mahyeri regarding due diligence of liens. | Mahyera, Rohani | 0.30 | 217.50 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Meet with internal working group regarding case status and research update. | Anabi, Andrew Issa | 0.80 | 380.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTERMatter Number: 016291-0000003
Matter Name: JOINT MATTERSInvoice Number: 5797283
Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|--------------------------|-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|--------------------|--------------|------------------|
| 21-Dec-18 | Meet with internal working group regarding case status and research update. | Dopsch, Peter C. | 0.80 | 860.00 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Meet with internal working group regarding case status and research update. | Doufekias, Demme | 0.80 | 780.00 |
| 21-Dec-18 | Meet with internal working group regarding case status and research update. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.80 | 860.00 |
| 23-Dec-18 | Draft presentation for Committee regarding claims and lien investigations (2.7); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.4). | Harris, Daniel J. | 3.10 | 2,712.50 |
| 23-Dec-18 | Update and revise lien investigation slides and circulate to internal working group. | Heo, Min W. | 1.20 | 792.00 |
| 24-Dec-18 | Analyze draft presentation to Committee regarding investigation status. | Goren, Todd M. | 0.60 | 645.00 |
| 24-Dec-18 | Analyze draft presentation on lien challenge. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 0.70 | 836.50 |
| 24-Dec-18 | Analyze memorandum regarding perfection of security interests in security bond collateral accounts (.6); analyze and revise memorandum regarding post-petition liens on proceeds (3.5). | Richards, Erica J. | 4.10 | 3,587.50 |
| 26-Dec-18 | Correspond with D. Harris regarding status of analysis related to liens (.4); analyze revised draft of presentation to Committee (1.4); analyze estate law research (.7). | Dopsch, Peter C. | 2.50 | 2,687.50 |
| 26-Dec-18 | Analyze and revise presentation to Committee regarding lien investigation status (.8); correspond with internal working group regarding same (.4). | Goren, Todd M. | 1.20 | 1,290.00 |
| 26-Dec-18 | Analyze and revise updated presentations on lien analysis. | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 1.40 | 1,673.00 |
| 26-Dec-18 | Revise Committee presentation on investigation status (1.9); call with J. Dai (Jefferies) regarding same (.3). | Richards, Erica J. | 2.20 | 1,925.00 |
| 27-Dec-18 | Conduct legal research regarding state law liens analysis related to coal leases. | Dopsch, Peter C. | 0.80 | 860.00 |
| 28-Dec-18 | Follow up on remaining state law analysis (.6); revise memorandum from A. Anabi regarding same (.4). | Dopsch, Peter C. | 1.00 | 1,075.00 |
| Total: 027 | Lien Investigation | | 69.80 | 60,163.00 |
| Time Entry Review | | | | |
| 12-Dec-18 | Revise November invoice for compliance with U.S. Trustee guidelines. | Kissner, Andrew | 1.70 | 892.50 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Revise November invoice for compliance with U.S. Trustee guidelines. | Kissner, Andrew | 1.20 | 630.00 |
| Total: 032 | Time Entry Review | | 2.90 | 1,522.50 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003
Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283
Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Services | Timekeeper | Hours | Value |
|-------------|-----------------|-------------------|---------------------|--------------------------|
| | | | Current Fees | <u>712,494.00</u> |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003

Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283

Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

Timekeeper Summary

| No. | Timekeeper | Rate | Hours | Value |
|------------|---------------------------------------------|-------------|-----------------|-------------------|
| 12270 | Doufekias, Demme | 975.00 | 90.20 | 87,945.00 |
| 14140 | Goren, Todd M. | 1,075.00 | 31.30 | 33,647.50 |
| 14116 | Marinuzzi, Lorenzo | 1,195.00 | 62.40 | 74,568.00 |
| 18365 | Adeseye, Tola | 575.00 | 52.70 | 30,302.50 |
| 21822 | Anabi, Andrew Issa | 475.00 | 47.90 | 22,752.50 |
| 22806 | Bell, Mike | 715.00 | 33.90 | 24,238.50 |
| 20018 | Butterfield, Benjamin | 725.00 | 7.20 | 5,220.00 |
| 21869 | Frost, Alison | 460.00 | 35.70 | 16,422.00 |
| 19802 | Gambier, Lauren M. | 775.00 | 66.80 | 51,770.00 |
| 18102 | Harris, Daniel J. | 875.00 | 37.00 | 32,375.00 |
| 22117 | Heo, Min W. | 660.00 | 21.50 | 14,190.00 |
| 20380 | Kagel, Benjamin S. | 460.00 | 22.40 | 10,304.00 |
| 19671 | Kissner, Andrew | 525.00 | 45.50 | 23,887.50 |
| 23409 | Mahyera, Rohani | 725.00 | 6.90 | 5,002.50 |
| 19999 | Mateo, Kat E. | 600.00 | 1.70 | 1,020.00 |
| 19117 | Mbakwe, Jason N. | 535.00 | 168.70 | 90,254.50 |
| 20386 | Miriyala, Arvind S. | 460.00 | 3.30 | 1,518.00 |
| 21707 | Pundeff, Karina N. | 460.00 | 7.90 | 3,634.00 |
| 22265 | Radzinski, Julian N. | 725.00 | 37.70 | 27,332.50 |
| 21823 | Richardson Arnould, Ka | 475.00 | 16.60 | 7,885.00 |
| 21715 | Rosenberg, Adam N. | 460.00 | 62.80 | 28,888.00 |
| 16572 | Sassoon, Harriet | 600.00 | 12.00 | 7,200.00 |
| 18947 | Scheinok, Brittany | 550.00 | 15.00 | 8,250.00 |
| 20402 | Zidel, Max Phillip | 475.00 | 13.90 | 6,602.50 |
| 08676 | Dopsch, Peter C. | 1,075.00 | 25.00 | 26,875.00 |
| 14078 | Richards, Erica J. | 875.00 | 32.40 | 28,350.00 |
| 18387 | Braun, Danielle Eileen | 340.00 | 6.00 | 2,040.00 |
| 21970 | Konjuhi, Alex | 385.00 | 71.80 | 27,643.00 |
| 23251 | Musto, Michael | 245.00 | 0.30 | 73.50 |
| 19867 | Zaccarelli, Monet D. | 270.00 | 19.50 | 5,265.00 |
| 21932 | Effendowicz, Alexander | 385.00 | 10.80 | 4,158.00 |
| 15029 | Bergelson, Vadim | 330.00 | 40.50 | 13,365.00 |
| | Client Accommodation – ½ Non-Working Travel | | | (8,962.50) |
| | Client Accommodation – Time Entry Review | | | (1,522.50) |
| | TOTAL | | 1,107.30 | 712,494.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003
 Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

Task Code Summary

| Task Code | Description | Hours | Value |
|------------------|--------------------------------------------------|-----------------|-------------------|
| 003 | Assumption and Rejection of Leases and Contracts | 45.30 | 23,851.50 |
| 006 | Business Operations | 0.80 | 908.00 |
| 007 | Case Administration | 21.40 | 14,507.00 |
| 008 | Claims Administration and Objections | 11.30 | 12,619.50 |
| 010 | Employee Benefits and Pensions | 9.70 | 9,853.50 |
| 011 | Employment and Fee Applications | 47.50 | 39,615.50 |
| 012 | Employment and Fee Application Objections | 6.00 | 6,834.00 |
| 015 | Meetings and Communications with Creditors | 51.30 | 43,840.50 |
| 016 | Non-Working Travel | 15.00 | 17,925.00 |
| 017 | Plan and Disclosure Statement | 1.80 | 1,995.00 |
| 018 | Real Estate | 33.70 | 15,015.00 |
| 023 | Discovery | 665.80 | 373,024.00 |
| 024 | Hearings | 26.40 | 24,127.00 |
| 026 | Claims Investigation | 98.60 | 77,178.00 |
| 027 | Lien Investigation | 69.80 | 60,163.00 |
| 032 | Time Entry Review | 2.90 | 1,522.50 |
| | Client Accommodation – ½ Non-Working Travel | | (8,962.50) |
| | Client Accommodation – Time Entry Review | | (1,522.50) |
| | TOTAL | 1,107.30 | 712,494.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003
 Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

Disbursement Detail

| Date | Description | Value |
|-----------|-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------|----------|
| 31-Dec-18 | On-line Research - LEXIS | 1.40 |
| 26-Nov-18 | Travel, plane, L. Marinuzzi, travel to/from Texas for hearing, meeting with clients, 12/4-12/6/18 | 641.19 |
| 26-Nov-18 | Travel, plane, L. Marinuzzi, travel to/from Texas for hearing, meeting with clients, ticket changed, 12/4-12/6/18 | 200.00 |
| 30-Nov-18 | Local travel, taxi/car service, J. Mbakwe, 9:46 pm, 11/26/18 | 82.82 |
| 30-Nov-18 | Local travel, taxi/car service, J. Mbakwe, 12:02 am, 11/28/18 | 82.82 |
| 03-Dec-18 | Travel, plane, D. Doufekias, travel to/from Texas for hearing, meeting with clients, 12/4/18 | 1,600.40 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Travel, taxi/car service, D. Doufekias, travel from plane to hearing, 12/4/18 | 70.60 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Travel, taxi/car service, D. Doufekias, travel from Texas following hearing, 12/4/18 | 79.35 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Travel, plane, L. Marinuzzi, travel to/from Texas for hearing, changed flight, 12/4/18 | 542.00 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Travel, parking, L. Marinuzzi, travel to/from Texas for hearing, 12/4/18 | 39.00 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Travel, taxi/car service, L. Marinuzzi, travel from Texas following hearing, 12/4/18 | 34.66 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Travel, hotel, L. Marinuzzi, one-night stay at Marriott, in Texas for hearing, 12/4/18 | 696.01 |
| 05-Dec-18 | Travel, plane, T. Goren, travel to/from Texas for hearing, 12/17-18/18 | 768.40 |
| 05-Dec-18 | Travel, parking, D. Doufekias, travel to/from Texas for hearing, 12/4/18 | 30.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Travel, hotel, T. Goren, one-night stay at Marriott, in Texas for hearing, 12/17/18 | 342.98 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Travel, taxi/car service, T. Goren, travel to airport for hearing in Texas, 12/17/18 | 44.41 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Travel, hotel, L. Marinuzzi, one-night stay at Marroitt, in Texas for hearing, 12/17/18 | 253.74 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Travel, parking, L. Marinuzzi, travel to/from Texas for hearing, 12/17-18/18 | 78.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Travel, taxi/car service, T. Goren, travel to airport in Texas, following hearing, 12/18/18 | 39.73 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Travel, taxi/car service, T. Goren, return travel from Texas, following hearing, 12/19/18 | 85.50 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Travel, taxi/car service, L. Marinuzzi, travel to airport in Texas, following hearing, 12/18/18 | 38.70 |
| 31-Dec-18 | Local travel, taxi/car service, J. Mbakwe, 10:11 pm, 12/3/18 | 89.20 |
| 31-Dec-18 | Local travel, taxi/car service, T. Adeseye, 11:40 pm, 12/12/18 | 92.70 |
| 31-Dec-18 | Local travel, taxi/car service, J. Mbakwe, 12:43 am, 12/13/18 | 82.22 |
| 31-Dec-18 | Local travel, taxi/car service, T. Adeseye, 10:35 pm, 12/11/18 | 103.17 |
| 31-Dec-18 | Local travel, taxi/car service, T. Adeseye, 10:16 pm, 12/14/18 | 92.70 |
| 31-Dec-18 | Local travel, taxi/car service, T. Adeseye, 10:08 pm, 12/17/18 | 99.68 |
| 31-Dec-18 | Local travel, taxi/car service, T. Adeseye, 11:25 pm, 12/18/18 | 103.17 |
| 31-Dec-18 | Local travel, taxi/car service, J. Mbakwe, 1:43 am, 12/19/18 | 82.22 |
| 01-Dec-18 | EDiscovery, Epiq Managed Services, November 2018 | 1,913.88 |
| 28-Nov-18 | Business meals, 6 attendees, Westmoreland meeting, 11/28/18 | 120.00 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Business meals, 3 attendees, meetings with client, 12/4/18 | 60.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Travel meals, L. Marinuzzi, lunch, in Texas for hearing, 12/17/18 | 20.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Travel meals, L. Marinuzzi, dinner, in Texas for hearing, 12/17/18 | 20.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Travel meals, L. Marinuzzi, breakfast, in Texas for hearing, 12/18/18 | 20.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Travel meals, T. Goren, lunch, in Texas for hearing, 12/18/18 | 20.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Travel meals, T. Goren, breakfast, in Texas for hearing, 12/18/18 | 20.00 |
| 19-Dec-18 | Travel meals, T. Goren, lunch, in Texas for hearing, 12/19/18 | 20.00 |
| 17-Dec-18 | Travel, internet, T. Goren, travel to Texas for hearing, 12/17/18 | 18.99 |
| 03-Dec-18 | Local meals, A. Kissner, dinner, OT meal, 8:19 pm, 12/3/18 | 20.00 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Local meals, A. Konjuhi, dinner, OT meal, 8:20 pm, 12/11/18 | 20.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Local meals, A. Konjuhi, dinner, OT meal, 8:22 pm, 12/18/18 | 20.00 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Local meals, M. Heo, dinner, OT meal, 8:41 pm, 12/18/18 | 20.00 |
| 20-Dec-18 | Local meals, M. Heo, dinner, OT meal, 9:50 pm, 12/20/18 | 20.00 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003
 Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

| Date | Description | Value |
|------------------------------|----------------------------------------------------------------|-----------------|
| 03-Dec-18 | Local travel, taxi/car service, D. Harris, 9:44 pm, 12/3/18 | 40.77 |
| 04-Dec-18 | Local travel, taxi/car service, A. Kissner, 1:36 am, 12/4/18 | 34.84 |
| 11-Dec-18 | Local travel, taxi/car service, A. Konjuhi, 10:03 pm, 12/11/18 | 8.38 |
| 13-Dec-18 | Local travel, taxi/car service, L. Gambier, 9:39 pm, 12/13/18 | 24.12 |
| 18-Dec-18 | Local travel, taxi/car service, A. Konjuhi, 9:45 pm, 12/18/18 | 18.39 |
| Current Disbursements | | 8,956.14 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003
Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283
Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

Invoice Summary

| | <u>U.S.Dollars</u> |
|-------------------------|--------------------|
| Total Fees | 712,494.00 |
| Total Disbursements | 8,956.14 |
| Total Amount Due | 721,450.14 |

MORRISON | FOERSTER

Matter Number: 016291-0000003
 Matter Name: JOINT MATTERS

Invoice Number: 5797283
 Invoice Date: February 14, 2019

For your convenience, we have listed below previous invoices on this matter which our records show as outstanding and the total balance due on this account. If you have already submitted payment, we appreciate your promptness. If your records are not in agreement, or if we can provide additional assistance, please call our Billing Department at (415) 268-6446 or (866) 314-5320

| Date | Invoice Number | Currency | Original Invoice Amount | Payments Applied | Amount Outstanding |
|------------------|-----------------------|-----------------|--------------------------------|-------------------------|---------------------------|
| 29-Nov-18 | 5779752 | USD | 147,709.87 | 118,286.57 | 29,423.30 |
| 23-Jan-19 | 5792345 | USD | 363,192.66 | 0.00 | 363,192.66 |