

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
HOUSTON DIVISION**

In re:

Westmoreland Coal Company, et al.,¹

Debtors.

Chapter 11

Case No. 18-35672 (DRJ)

(Jointly Administered)

**MONTHLY STATEMENT OF SERVICES RENDERED
AND EXPENSES INCURRED BY JONES DAY, COUNSEL FOR
THE CONFLICTS COMMITTEE OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS
OF WESTMORELAND RESOURCES GP, LLC AND CONFLICTS COUNSEL
FOR WESTMORELAND RESOURCE PARTNERS, LP AND ITS SUBSIDIARIES,
FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2019 THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2019**

Name of Applicant:	Jones Day	
Applicant's Role in Case:	Counsel to the Conflicts Committee of the Board of Directors of Debtor Westmoreland Resources GP, LLC and Conflicts Counsel to Debtor Westmoreland Resource Partners, LP and its Debtor Subsidiaries	
Date Order of Employment Signed:	November 14, 2018 (Docket No. 490)	
	Beginning of Period	End of Period
Time period covered by this Statement:	1/1/19	1/31/19
Summary of Total Fees and Expenses Requested		
Total fees requested in this Statement:	\$1,409,436.00 (80% of \$1,761,795.00)	
Total reimbursable expenses requested in this Statement:	\$5,673.75	
Total fees and expenses requested in this Statement:	\$1,415,109.75	

¹ Due to the large number of Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, for which joint administration has been granted, a complete list of the Debtors and the last four digits of their tax identification, registration, or like numbers is not provided herein. A complete list of such information may be obtained on the website of the Debtors' claims and noticing agent in these chapter 11 cases at www.donlinrecano.com/westmoreland. Westmoreland Coal Company's service address for the purposes of these chapter 11 cases is 9540 South Maroon Circle, Suite 300, Englewood, Colorado 80112.

Summary of Professional Fees Requested:	
Total professional fees requested in this Statement:	\$1,757,300.00
Total actual professional hours covered by this Statement:	2,364.25
Average hourly rate for professionals:	\$743.28
Summary of Paraprofessional Fees Requested:	
Total paraprofessional fees requested in this Statement:	\$4,495.00
Total actual paraprofessional hours covered by this Statement:	14.90
Average hourly rate for paraprofessionals:	\$301.68

In accordance with this Court's *Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals* (Docket No. 495) (the "Interim Compensation Order"), Jones Day, as counsel to the Conflicts Committee (the "Conflicts Committee") of the Board of Directors of Westmoreland Resources GP, LLC and conflicts counsel to Westmoreland Resource Partners, LP ("WMLP") and its direct and indirect subsidiaries (collectively with WMLP, the "WMLP Debtors"),² as debtors and debtors in possession in the above-captioned cases, hereby submits its Monthly Statement of Services Rendered and Expenses Incurred for the Period from January 1, 2019 to January 31, 2019 (this "Statement").³

Itemization of Services Rendered and Expenses Incurred

1. Attached hereto as Exhibit A is a summary of the services rendered by Jones Day for which compensation is sought, by project category.

² The Debtors in the above-captioned cases, other than the WMLP Debtors, are referred to herein as the "WLB Debtors."

³ The period from January 1, 2019 to January 31, 2019 is referred to herein as the "Statement Period."

2. Attached hereto as Exhibit B is a listing of Jones Day professionals and paraprofessionals, including the standard hourly rate for each attorney⁴ and paraprofessional⁵ (collectively, the "Jones Day Professionals") who rendered services to the Conflicts Committee and the WMLP Debtors in connection with these chapter 11 cases during the Statement Period and the title, hourly rate, aggregate hours worked and the amount of fees earned by each Jones Day Professional. The blended hourly billing rate of Jones Day attorneys for all services provided during the Statement Period is \$743.28.⁶ The blended hourly rate of all paraprofessionals is \$301.68.⁷

3. Attached hereto as Exhibit C is a summary of the types of expenses for which reimbursement is sought. Attached hereto as Exhibit D is a detailed itemization of such expenses.

4. Attached hereto as Exhibit E are the time records of Jones Day, which provide a daily summary of the time spent by each Jones Day Professional during the Statement Period by project category.

Total Fees and Expenses Sought for the Statement Period

5. Total Amounts Sought for Statement Period. The total amounts sought for fees for professional services rendered and reimbursement of expenses incurred for the Statement Period are as follows:

⁴ Attorneys include partners, of counsel, counsel, associates, senior staff attorneys, staff attorneys and law clerks, as applicable during the Statement Period.

⁵ Paraprofessionals include paralegals, legal support personnel, project assistants and staff members, as applicable during the Statement Period.

⁶ The blended hourly billing rate of \$743.28 for attorneys is derived by dividing the total fees for attorneys of \$1,757,300.00 by the total hours of 2,364.25 for those same attorneys.

⁷ The blended hourly billing rate of \$301.68 for paraprofessionals is similarly derived by dividing the total fees for paraprofessionals of \$4,495.00 by the total hours of 14.90 for these same paraprofessionals.

Total Fees	\$1,761,795.00
Total Expenses	\$5,673.75
TOTAL	\$1,767,468.75

6. Allocation of Fees. Pursuant to paragraph 2(b) of the Interim Compensation Order, professionals are required "to allocate ... any fees sought in connection with each Monthly Fee Statement to the applicable Debtor or Debtor groups [i.e., the WMLP Debtors or the WLB Debtors] for which such fees relate[.]" Jones Day's services during the Statement Period (including, for the avoidance of doubt, all services performed for the Conflicts Committee) related solely to the WMLP Debtors. Accordingly, 100% of Jones Day's fees and 100% of Jones Day's expenses are allocated to the WMLP Debtors pursuant to paragraph 2(b) of the Interim Compensation Order.

7. Amount Sought to Be Paid. Jones Day seeks payment of \$1,415,109.75 (the "Interim Amount") from the WMLP Debtors for the Statement Period, representing (a) 80% of Jones Day's total fees for services rendered (i.e., \$1,409,436.00) and (b) 100% of the total expenses incurred (i.e., \$5,673.75).

Notice and Objection Procedures

8. In accordance with the Interim Compensation Order, this Statement has been served upon the following parties (collectively, as further defined in the Interim Compensation Order, the "Application Recipients"): (a) the Debtors, Westmoreland Coal Company, 9540 South Maroon Circle, Suite 300, Englewood, Colorado 80112, Attn: Jennifer Grafton (jgrafton@westmoreland.com); (b) counsel to the Debtors, Kirkland & Ellis LLP, 300 North LaSalle, Chicago, Illinois 60654, Attn: Gregory F. Pesce (gregory.pesce@kirkland.com) and Timothy R. Bow (timothy.bow@kirkland.com); (c) co-counsel for the Debtors, Jackson Walker LLP, 1401 McKinney Street, Suite 1900, Houston, Texas 77010, Attn: Patricia B. Tomasco (ptomasco@jw.com), Matthew D. Cavanaugh

(mcavenaugh@jw.com) and Jennifer F. Wertz (jwertz@jw.com); (d) counsel to the ad hoc group of secured creditors of Westmoreland Coal Company, Kramer Levin Naftalis & Frankel LLP, 1177 Avenue of the Americas, New York, New York 10036, Attn: Thomas Moers Mayer (tmayer@kramerlevin.com) and Stephen Zide (szide@kramerlevin.com); (e) counsel to the ad hoc group of secured creditors of WMLP, Schulte Roth & Zabel LLP, 919 Third Avenue, New York, New York 10022, Attn: David M. Hillman (david.hillman@srz.com) and Kristine G. Manoukian (kristine.manoukian@srz.com); (f) counsel to the official committee of unsecured creditors, Morrison & Foerster LLP, 250 West 55th Street; New York, New York 10019, Attn: Lorenzo Marinuzzi (lmarinuzzi@mofo.com), Todd M. Goren (tgoren@mofo.com) and Jennifer L. Marines (jmarines@mofo.com); and (g) the Office of the United States Trustee, 515 Rusk Street, Houston, Texas 77002, Attn: Hector Duran (hector.duran.jr@usdoj.gov) and Stephen D. Statham (stephen.statham@usdoj.gov). Jones Day submits that no further notice is required.

9. Pursuant to paragraph 2(d) of the Interim Compensation Order, objections to this Statement (an "Objection"), if any, must be served by an Application Recipient upon Jones Day and each of the other Application Recipients no later than March 22, 2019 (the "Objection Deadline"), setting forth the nature of the objection and the specific amount of fees or expenses at issue.

10. If no Objections to this Statement are received on or before the Objection Deadline, the WMLP Debtors shall pay to Jones Day the Interim Amount as outlined in paragraph 7 hereof.

11. To the extent an Objection to this Statement is received on or before the Objection Deadline, the WMLP Debtors may withhold payment of that portion of the Interim

Amount to which the Objection is directed and shall promptly pay the remainder of the Interim Amount. To the extent such Objection is not resolved, it shall be preserved and scheduled for consideration at the next interim fee application hearing.

Dated: March 1, 2019
Houston, Texas

Respectfully submitted,

/s/ Oliver S. Zeltner

Heather Lennox (admitted *pro hac vice*)
Oliver S. Zeltner (Tex. Bar No. 24104000)
JONES DAY
901 Lakeside Avenue
Cleveland, Ohio 44114
Telephone: (216) 586-3939
Facsimile: (216) 579-0212
E-mail: hlennox@jonesday.com
ozeltner@jonesday.com

Timothy W. Hoffmann (admitted *pro hac vice*)
JONES DAY
77 West Wacker
Chicago, Illinois 60601
Telephone: (312) 782-3939
Facsimile: (312) 782-8585
Email: thoffmann@jonesday.com

*Conflicts Counsel to the WMLP Debtors and
Counsel to the Conflicts Committee of Debtor
Westmoreland Resources GP, LLC*

EXHIBIT A

IN ACCOUNT WITH

JONES DAY

Cleveland
 901 Lakeside Avenue
 Cleveland, Ohio 44114
(216) 586-3939

Federal Identification Number: 34-0319085

February 27, 2019

704571

Invoice: 33241497

Westmoreland Resource Partners, LP
 9540 South Maroon Circle
 Suite 300
 Englewood, CO 80112

For legal services rendered for the period through January 31, 2019:

Asset Disposition	1,184.70	850,830.00
Case Administration	46.15	28,482.50
Claims Administration and Objections	248.90	203,800.00
Corporate Governance and Board Matters	54.30	48,657.50
Court Hearings	22.80	13,015.00
Employee Matters	90.20	82,977.50
Environmental Matters	24.00	18,990.00
Employment and Fee Applications	87.00	48,560.00
Financing and Cash Collateral	13.90	13,650.00
Litigation and Adversary Proceedings	191.80	147,680.00
Meetings	4.70	4,320.00
Non-Working Travel (all amounts reduced by 50%)	51.30	22,310.00
Plan and Disclosure Statement	105.00	70,897.50
Real Estate	26.90	16,200.00
Securities Matters	139.20	103,812.50
Tax Matters	88.30	87,612.50
Total Fees	2,379.15	USD 1,761,795.00
Total Disbursements & Charges		USD <u>5,673.75</u>

Please remit payment to:

ACH Transfer (preferred)

PNC Bank N.A.
 Pittsburgh, PA 15219
 Account Name: Jones Day
 Account No: 1130818681
 ABA No: 043000096

Wire Transfer

PNC Bank N.A.
 Pittsburgh, PA 15219
 Account Name: Jones Day
 Account No: 1130818681
 ABA No: 043000096
 Swift Code: PNCCUS33

Checks

Jones Day
 P.O. Box 70294
 Cleveland, OH 44190-0294

JONES DAY

TOTAL

USD 1,767,468.75

EXHIBIT B

JONES DAY

Westmoreland Resource Partners, LP

FEE SUMMARY - January 31, 2019

<i>Timekeeper Name</i>	<i>Title</i>	<i>Year</i>	<i>Bar</i>	<i>Billing</i>	<i>Billed</i>	<i>Hours</i>	<i>Total</i>
<i>Fees</i>							
M C CORCORAN	PARTNER	2004		850.00		188.90	155,252.50
P L ESCHBACH-HALL	PARTNER	1999		925.00		2.30	2,127.50
T P FITZSIMONS	PARTNER	2002		975.00		87.00	81,168.75
W A HERZBERGER	PARTNER	1987		975.00		8.80	8,580.00
T HOFFMANN	PARTNER	2003		975.00		202.60	197,535.00
K P HOLEWINSKI	PARTNER	1987		1,075.00		21.30	22,897.50
L J JENULL	PARTNER	2003		900.00		23.20	20,880.00
E KAPLAN	PARTNER	1998		925.00		4.30	3,977.50
C KIRSCHNER, JR.	PARTNER	1986		1,100.00		11.10	12,210.00
C E LADUZINSKI	PARTNER	2001		1,125.00		31.90	35,887.50
P D LAUN	PARTNER	1992		1,000.00		7.50	7,500.00
H LENNOX	PARTNER	1992		1,350.00		218.10	290,587.50
D RIMKUNAS	PARTNER	2001		1,050.00		6.00	6,300.00
K M SAMUELS	PARTNER	2006		850.00		7.90	6,715.00
A C THOMAS	PARTNER	2008		775.00		31.90	24,722.50
T V WALLACE	PARTNER	1986		1,100.00		4.70	5,170.00
T A WILSON	PARTNER	2003		975.00		14.00	13,650.00
E B WINSLOW	PARTNER	1995		1,050.00		23.40	24,570.00
TOTAL						894.90	919,731.25
R W HAMILTON	OF COUNSEL	1984		950.00		32.20	25,935.00
TOTAL						32.20	25,935.00
J K MURPHY	COUNSEL	1990		775.00		34.30	26,582.50
TOTAL						34.30	26,582.50
M C ALFANO	ASSOCIATE	2017		425.00		5.50	2,337.50
D W BERENS	ASSOCIATE	2017		425.00		38.80	16,490.00
J J BRENNAN	ASSOCIATE	2009		600.00		22.90	13,740.00
Z R BURKART	ASSOCIATE	2016		450.00		11.40	5,130.00
J N EDEL	ASSOCIATE	2013		525.00		200.80	103,661.25
N M FAAS	ASSOCIATE	2014		500.00		11.10	5,550.00
F E FREEMAN	ASSOCIATE	2015		600.00		36.70	22,020.00
E M GERMAN	ASSOCIATE	2018		400.00		5.50	2,200.00
J C GORDON	ASSOCIATE	2018		450.00		13.00	5,850.00
S L HENRY	ASSOCIATE	2018		400.00		11.50	4,600.00
M M HILDERBRAND	ASSOCIATE	2017		425.00		19.60	8,330.00
G M HUNTER	ASSOCIATE	2011		800.00		211.30	167,640.00
A P JOHNSON	ASSOCIATE	2018		450.00		67.05	30,172.50
M E KUBIUK	ASSOCIATE	2016		550.00		5.30	2,915.00
H P OSTER	ASSOCIATE	2018		400.00		50.90	20,360.00
O B PEDERSEN	ASSOCIATE	2018		400.00		16.50	6,600.00
I M PEREZ	ASSOCIATE	2016		500.00		41.10	20,550.00
M F PODOLSKY	ASSOCIATE	2017		425.00		116.00	49,300.00
T REYNOLDS	ASSOCIATE	2012		575.00		114.20	65,665.00
K A RUBIN	ASSOCIATE	2013		800.00		19.60	15,680.00
S D RUEBENSAAL	ASSOCIATE	2016		450.00		19.10	8,595.00
Z B SINGERMAN	ASSOCIATE	2018		400.00		13.90	5,560.00
J D STOLL	ASSOCIATE	2018		400.00		8.20	3,280.00
M R WALLER	ASSOCIATE	2018		450.00		12.60	5,670.00
O S ZELTNER	ASSOCIATE	2012		600.00		285.70	169,740.00
TOTAL						1,358.25	761,636.25
L C FISCHER	STAFF ATTY	1996		525.00		44.60	23,415.00
TOTAL						44.60	23,415.00
M T BARRIOS	PARALEGAL			300.00		10.80	3,240.00
C L SMITH	PARALEGAL			350.00		2.30	805.00

JONES DAY

TOTAL			13.10	4,045.00
M A WALTERS	PROJECT ASST	250.00	1.80	450.00
TOTAL			<u>1.80</u>	<u>450.00</u>
TOTAL			<u>2,379.15</u>	USD <u>1,761,795.00</u>

EXHIBIT C

Westmoreland Resource Partners, LP

DISBURSEMENT SUMMARY - January 31, 2019

Computerized Research Services	13.10	
Conference Charges	100.92	
Court Reporter Fees	4,650.70	
Document Reproduction Charges	779.40	
Travel - Taxi Charges	<u>129.63</u>	
TOTAL		<u>USD 5,673.75</u>

EXHIBIT D

Case Administration

DISBURSEMENT DETAIL - January 31, 2019

<i>Date</i>	<i>Timekeeper Name</i>	<i>Location</i>	<i>Amount</i>
COMPUTERIZED RESEARCH SERVICES			
01/23/19	O S ZELTNER	CLE	13.10
	Computerized research services - US Courts AO - Pacer Service Center 10/1/18 - 12/31/18 Service		
	Computerized research services Subtotal		13.10
CONFERENCE CHARGES			
01/17/19	H LENNOX	CLE	8.62
	Conference charges Phone call. 12/19/18		
01/17/19	H LENNOX	CLE	7.97
	Conference charges Phone call. 12/13/18		
01/17/19	H LENNOX	CLE	3.24
	Conference charges Phone call. 12/7/18		
01/17/19	T HOFFMANN	CHI	10.12
	Conference charges 12/15/18		
01/17/19	T HOFFMANN	CHI	4.51
	Conference charges 12/14/18		
01/17/19	T HOFFMANN	CHI	5.43
	Conference charges 12/12/18		
01/17/19	T HOFFMANN	CHI	9.73
	Conference charges 12/9/18		
01/17/19	T HOFFMANN	CHI	3.94
	Conference charges 12/3/18		
01/17/19	T HOFFMANN	CHI	3.78
	Conference charges 11/30/18		
01/17/19	L J JENULL	DAL	10.67
	Conference charges 12/04/18		
01/17/19	L J JENULL	DAL	11.31
	Conference charges 12/06/18		
01/17/19	L J JENULL	DAL	3.27
	Conference charges 12/05/18		
01/17/19	A P JOHNSON	CHI	18.33
	Conference charges 12/18/18		
	Conference Charges Subtotal		100.92
COURT REPORTER FEES			
01/11/19	O S ZELTNER	CLE	3,685.65
	Court reporter fees - Veritext Corporation 1/4/19 Robert Campagna & Steve Bremer Transcripts		
01/25/19	O S ZELTNER	CLE	935.05
	Court reporter fees - Veritext Corporation 1/4/19 Boyko Deposition Transcript, color exhibits, litigation package		
01/31/19	S M TRAWICK	DAL	30.00
	Court reporter fees Hearing transcript of 1/16/19 - Invoice #59834 1/20/19		
	Court reporter fees Subtotal		4,650.70
DUPLICATION CHARGES			
01/24/19	COL ACCOUNTING	COL	393.40
	Duplication charges through 1/24/19		
01/31/19	COL ACCOUNTING	COL	386.00
	Duplication charges through 1/31/19		
	Duplication charges Subtotal		779.40

LATE WORK TAXI

01/24/19	T P FITZSIMONS	CHI	29.82
	Late Work Taxi Review and revise documents. 1/14/19		
01/24/19	T P FITZSIMONS	CHI	29.81
	Late Work Taxi Review and revise documents. 1/14/19		
	Late Work Taxi Subtotal		59.63

TAXI FARE

01/17/19	O S ZELTNER	CLE	70.00
	Taxi fare Travel to Houston for 12/18/18 hearing 12/18/18 (car service from Cleveland airport to home) 12/18/18		
	Taxi Fare Subtotal		70.00

Total		USD	5,673.75
Grand Total		USD	5,673.75

EXHIBIT E

Asset Disposition

Page 1

01/01/19	T HOFFMANN	4.30	4,192.50
	Review/provide comment on bid (1.20); review/analyze bids (1.10); review/revise sale motion and related items (2.00).		
01/02/19	J N EDEL	0.30	157.50
	Communications with Hoffmann regarding proposed sale order and research.		
01/02/19	T P FITZSIMONS	1.50	1,462.50
	Review nondisclosure agreement for surety lenders (0.50); review and revise asset purchase agreements submitted by bidder (1.00).		
01/02/19	T HOFFMANN	1.50	1,462.50
	Review/revise term sheet offer for purchase of all assets (0.60); communicate with Lennox and FitzSimons regarding term sheet revisions (0.10); review/analyze draft sale order for substantially all assets (0.80).		
01/02/19	A P JOHNSON	1.20	540.00
	Revise exhibits to bidding procedures motion.		
01/02/19	H LENNOX	1.90	2,565.00
	Conference with Hillman (SRZ) regarding various asset sale and case issues (0.50); various communications with Jones Day team and Lazard regarding moving various bids forward (0.40); review new bid from bidder (0.20); communications with Cowan (Lazard), Jones Day team, Pesce (K&E), Hillman (SRZ) regarding same (0.80).		
01/02/19	K M SAMUELS	1.60	1,360.00
	Review and analyze comments from Lazard to takeback paper documents (0.50); call with Hunter and Samblanet regarding same (0.30); revise same (0.80).		
01/02/19	O S ZELTNER	0.30	180.00
	Review and analyze documents and communications from bidder regarding bid.		
01/02/19	O S ZELTNER	0.20	120.00
	Communications with Lennox, FitzSimons regarding surety nondisclosure agreement.		
01/03/19	J J BRENNAN	0.80	480.00
	Review Oxford asset purchase agreement and outline notes for revisions concerning labor and employment terms.		
01/03/19	M C CORCORAN	0.50	425.00
	Review/analyze bidder term sheet and email FitzSimons, Lennox, Hunter, Hoffmann, Zeltner, Laduzinski, Jenull and Podolsky regarding same (0.20); review/analyze protective order and email Hoffmann regarding same (0.30).		
01/03/19	M C CORCORAN	3.60	3,060.00
	Communicate with Lennox, Wilson, Hoffmann, Zeltner, Reynolds, Edel and Johnson regarding potential assets sales and plan issues (1.40); communicate with Hoffmann regarding potential asset sales (0.20); review/analyze motions and terms sheets related to potential asset sales (2.00).		
01/03/19	J N EDEL	0.40	210.00
	Various communications with Hoffmann, Zeltner, Reynolds regarding sale motion, order and bidding procedures.		
01/03/19	P L ESCHBACH-HALL	1.50	1,387.50
	Review purchaser's comments to asset purchase agreement.		
01/03/19	T P FITZSIMONS	3.50	3,412.50
	Correspondence with Hunter regarding review of lender term sheet and Oxford asset purchase agreement (0.50); telephone conference with Hoffmann regarding review of asset purchase agreements (0.30); review and revise note from bidder (0.80); review and revise Oxford asset purchase agreement (0.90); review and revise Kemmerer asset purchase agreement (1.00).		
01/03/19	T HOFFMANN	4.00	3,900.00
	Communicate with Laduzinski regarding tax structure and related issues (0.60); review/revise draft asset purchase agreements for both Oxford and Kemmerer (2.00); review/revise term sheet bid for Kemmerer assets (0.90); communicate with Reynolds regarding sale motion and related issues (0.20); communicate with Farrell (A&M) regarding executory contract schedule (0.30).		

Asset Disposition			Page 2
01/03/19	K P HOLEWINSKI	1.00	1,075.00
	Review markup of bidder asset purchase agreement (0.80); confer with Murphy on same via email (0.20).		
01/03/19	H LENNOX	1.50	2,025.00
	Review/analyze markup of credit bid term sheet (0.20); multiple communications with Pesce (K&E), Hillman (SRZ), Cowan (Lazard), Green, Jones Day team regarding new bids for Buckingham and Oxford (1.30).		
01/03/19	J K MURPHY	2.00	1,550.00
	Review of environmental provisions of purchase agreement.		
01/03/19	M F PODOLSKY	4.80	2,040.00
	Continue draft of Oxford asset purchase agreement markup.		
01/03/19	M F PODOLSKY	1.80	765.00
	Review, analyze and markup First Surety nondisclosure agreement.		
01/03/19	T REYNOLDS	5.30	3,047.50
	Communicate with Hoffmann regarding Buckingham / Oxford sale (0.20); research regarding status of Buckingham / Oxford sale documents (1.50); communicate with Zeltner, Lennox, Hoffmann, Edel and Wilson regarding status of chapter 11 cases and Buckingham / Oxford sale documents (1.50); revise sale papers to reflect Buckingham / Oxford sale construct (2.10).		
01/03/19	K M SAMUELS	3.50	2,975.00
	Review and revise note related to Kemmerer sale.		
01/03/19	O S ZELTNER	1.00	600.00
	Review and comment on draft First Surety confidentiality agreement (0.50); communications with Podolsky (0.20); Williams (Manier & Herod) (0.30) regarding same.		
01/04/19	J J BRENNAN	1.80	1,080.00
	Revise asset purchase agreement and draft summary of revisions for Podolsky.		
01/04/19	J N EDEL	0.90	472.50
	Various communications with Reynolds, Zeltner regarding sale process and documents (0.80); communicate with Lennox, Zeltner regarding communications with Ohio regulators (0.10).		
01/04/19	T P FITZSIMONS	2.40	2,340.00
	Review and revise Oxford asset purchase agreement (0.50); correspondence with Jones Day team regarding employee issues (0.40); correspondence with Jones Day team regarding key Oxford issues (0.20); review and revise Buckingham asset purchase agreement (0.80); correspondence with Jones Day team regarding bidder and employee issues (0.30); correspondence with Hunter regarding asset purchase agreement and drafting (0.20).		
01/04/19	T HOFFMANN	6.10	5,947.50
	Review/analyze structure and other issues relating to potential sale of all WMLP assets (1.20); communicate with Reynolds regarding sale structure and related items (0.60); communicate with Zeltner, Lennox and FitzSimons regarding sale structure and related items (0.30); review and provide edits to sale documents, including edits to bidding procedures order and sale order (4.00).		
01/04/19	A P JOHNSON	6.00	2,700.00
	Discuss project to research and draft emergency language for WMLP Oxford Sale Motion with Reynolds (0.20); research jurisdictional standard for deal protections (2.00); edit exhibit to sale motion (2.30); edit sale motion to conform to Local Rules and Complex Case Procedures (1.50).		
01/04/19	H LENNOX	6.10	8,235.00
	Conference with Hillman (SRZ) regarding offers and related issues (0.80); review and revise form bidding procedures and order (1.10); review and revise form sale order (1.10); multiple communications with Hoffmann, Reynolds regarding sale format, process and motion (1.10); conferences with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) regarding same (0.40); conference call with Pesce (K&E), Hillman (SRZ), Vescio (Houlihan Lokey), Green (Lazard) regarding potential transaction (1.00); conference with Lazard, Pesce (K&E), JD M&A team regarding bonding issues (0.60).		
01/04/19	M F PODOLSKY	2.20	935.00
	Continue draft of Kemmerer asset purchase agreement markup.		

Asset Disposition			Page 3
01/04/19	M F PODOLSKY	1.80	765.00
	Continue draft of Oxford asset purchase agreement markup.		
01/04/19	T REYNOLDS	10.60	6,095.00
	Revise sale pleadings to conform to Oxford / Buckingham sale construct.		
01/04/19	K M SAMUELS	2.00	1,700.00
	Review Kemmerer note comments from Lazard (0.20); revise note per the same (1.80).		
01/04/19	O S ZELTNER	0.90	540.00
	Communications with Lennox, Hoffmann regarding WMLP asset sale issues (0.50); communications with Hoffmann, Reynolds, Johnson regarding WMLP asset sale motion and bidding procedures (0.40).		
01/04/19	O S ZELTNER	0.80	480.00
	Communications with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee), Hagreen (WMLP), Williams (Manier & Herod) regarding First Surety confidentiality agreement (0.50); prepare execution version of same (0.30).		
01/05/19	M C CORCORAN	1.10	935.00
	Communicate with Lennox, Hoffmann, FitzSimons, Hunter, Zeltner, Holewinski, Reynolds, Podolsky, Cowan and Green (both Lazard) regarding assets sales and plan issues (0.80); review/analyze communications regarding issues relate to transfer of employees and reclamation bonds (0.30).		
01/05/19	J N EDEL	4.10	2,152.50
	Various communications with Lennox, Hoffmann, Reynolds regarding revisions to sale order (0.40); review and revise same (3.70).		
01/05/19	P L ESCHBACH-HALL	0.50	462.50
	Review employee-related issues relating to sale closing.		
01/05/19	T P FITZSIMONS	4.00	3,900.00
	Review and revise Oxford asset purchase agreement (1.50); correspondence with Jones Day team regarding employee issues (0.40); correspondence with Hunter and Podolsky regarding term sheet from senior lenders (0.30); conference call regarding asset purchase agreement (0.80); telephone conference with Podolsky regarding revisions to asset purchase agreement (0.30); telephone conference with Hoffmann regarding bonding requirements (0.20); correspondence with K&E regarding asset purchase agreement approach (0.20); review and revise asset purchase agreement (0.30).		
01/05/19	S L HENRY	0.70	280.00
	Analyze statutory obligations in WMLP sale to ensure all required elements are present.		
01/05/19	T HOFFMANN	5.10	4,972.50
	Review/revise bidding procedures (2.40); communicate with Lennox, Reynolds and Edel regarding various sale processes and related items (0.30); review/provide comments on term sheet bid (0.50); review/analyze comments to bidding procedures and related items (0.30); communicate with Calderon (Donlin Recano) regarding sale process and related noticing (0.40); review/analyze noticing issues with respect to sale (0.80); review/analyze executory contract schedule (0.40).		
01/05/19	G M HUNTER	1.10	880.00
	Call with Jones Day team regarding work in process and asset sale progress (0.60); follow-up calls and correspondence with FitzSimons and Podolsky (0.50).		
01/05/19	A P JOHNSON	4.80	2,160.00
	Edit sale motion (3.30); edit bidding procedures (1.50).		
01/05/19	P D LAUN	0.80	800.00
	Review/analyze Oxford bond information.		
01/05/19	H LENNOX	3.90	5,265.00
	Multiple conferences with Pesce (K&E) regarding bidder bid and ancillary issues (0.80); review and revise sale order (0.80); multiple conferences with Jones Day team and Lazard regarding Kemmerer bids, open issues and process forward (2.10); review and comment on lender term sheet markup (0.20).		
01/05/19	M F PODOLSKY	7.90	3,357.50
	Continue draft of Oxford asset purchase agreement markup (4.60); update draft and distribute updated bidder term sheet (2.20); attend call regarding the Oxford and Buckingham asset sale with Jones Day team, K&E and Lazard (0.80); attend call with FitzSimons regarding asset purchase agreement markup (0.30).		

Asset Disposition		Page 4	
01/05/19	T REYNOLDS	5.40	3,105.00
	Revise sale pleadings to conform to Oxford / Buckingham sale construct (3.70); communicate with Lennox regarding potential bidder for Oxford / Buckingham (0.40); communicate with Lazard, Lennox, Hoffmann and Corcoran regarding status of Oxford / Buckingham sale (1.30).		
01/05/19	O S ZELTNER	2.00	1,200.00
	Participate in call with Jones Day team, Cowan and Green (both Lazard) regarding WMLP asset sale process (0.80); communications with Lennox (0.30), Podolsky (0.40) regarding sale process issues; research data room documents regarding same (0.50).		
01/06/19	J N EDEL	4.90	2,572.50
	Various communications with Lennox, Hoffmann, Reynolds, Johnson regarding sale motion, bid procedures and order (0.70); review and revise sale order per Lennox comments and for consistency with motion (1.70); review and revise same based on structure as joint motion (2.50).		
01/06/19	T P FITZSIMONS	2.70	2,632.50
	Correspondence with K&E regarding asset purchase agreement (0.20); review and revise asset purchase agreement and provide summary (0.80); conference call with Jones Day regarding asset purchase agreement issues (0.30); conference call with bidder regarding asset purchase agreement (0.70); conference call with Lazard regarding asset purchase agreement open issues (0.70).		
01/06/19	T HOFFMANN	8.40	8,190.00
	Review/revise bidding procedures (1.90); review/analyze related comments from Lennox (0.20); review/revise sale motion (3.00); communicate with Reynolds regarding sale motion and related items (0.40); communicate with Reynolds and Calderon regarding service of sale motion and related items (0.40); review/analyze executory contract list and provide comments to Farrell (A&M) (0.60); participate in conference call with Hunter, FitzSimons, Cowan, Green (both Lazard) and potential buyer regarding sale process and related issues (0.90); participate in follow up call with FitzSimons and Hunter (0.30); review/analyze revised bidding procedures and related items (0.70).		
01/06/19	G M HUNTER	0.90	720.00
	Prepare for and attend call with bidder to discuss and negotiate certain terms of Oxford asset purchase agreement.		
01/06/19	A P JOHNSON	3.30	1,485.00
	Edit exhibit to sale motion (0.80); edit bidding procedures (1.70); draft declaration for sale motion (0.80).		
01/06/19	H LENNOX	3.20	4,320.00
	Multiple communications with Jones Day team, K&E team regarding bidder bid, asset purchase agreements and process (1.10); communications with Pesce (K&E) regarding same (.40); review and revise bidding procedures, draft sale order (1.60); communications with Hillman (SRZ) regarding bid term sheet (0.10).		
01/06/19	M F PODOLSKY	1.60	680.00
	Attend call with bidder counsel regarding asset purchase agreement markup (0.70); attend call with Jones Day internal team to discuss Oxford asset purchase agreement (0.60); attend internal call with Jones Day and Lazard team regarding the negotiation of the Oxford asset sale with bidder (0.30).		
01/06/19	T REYNOLDS	2.70	1,552.50
	Communicate with Donlin Recano and Hoffmann regarding service of Oxford / Buckingham sale motion (0.60); revise Oxford / Buckingham sale motion (0.60); communicate with Hoffmann, Hunter, FitzSimons and Lazard regarding Oxford / Buckingham (0.80); communicate with potential buyer for Oxford / Buckingham (0.70).		
01/07/19	J N EDEL	2.10	1,102.50
	Various communications with Lennox, Wilson, Hoffmann, Reynolds, Zeltner regarding sale motion and order (0.80); review and revise sale order per Lennox edits (0.40); participate in call with Hoffmann, Reynolds, Zeltner, Hunter, Hagreen (WMLP) regarding Oxford asset sale (0.60); review and revise sale motion per Reynolds comments (0.30).		
01/07/19	T P FITZSIMONS	1.00	975.00
	Review and revise asset purchase agreement (0.50); correspondence with K&E regarding same (0.30); correspondence with lender counsel regarding Oxford (0.20).		
01/07/19	S L HENRY	0.50	200.00
	Review local rules to ensure sale, publication, and executory contract notices comply with local rules (0.30); draft email to Reynolds regarding same (0.20).		

Asset Disposition		Page 5	
01/07/19	S L HENRY	3.80	1,520.00
	Review complex case procedures for local bankruptcy court to ensure the sale, publication, and executory contracts notices are in compliance with these procedures and draft email to Reynolds summarizing same (1.00); draft final notices for asset sale (2.80).		
01/07/19	S L HENRY	2.50	1,000.00
	Review draft motion for sale of assets (0.50); review precedent and draft notices for same (2.00).		
01/07/19	T HOFFMANN	6.10	5,947.50
	Review/revise sale motion (1.80); communicate with Reynolds regarding sale motion and related items (0.50); participate in conference call regarding sale status with Hunter, Hagreen (WMLP), Edel, Reynolds, FitzSimons and Podolsky (0.50); review/analyze issues relating to sale process and service timing (0.80); review/revise sale order (2.20); communicate with Pesce (K&E) regarding sale process (0.30).		
01/07/19	K P HOLEWINSKI	0.80	860.00
	Communicate with Murphy on bonding issues (0.60); review related communications from Podolsky on same and respond to same (0.20).		
01/07/19	G M HUNTER	0.90	720.00
	Call with Hagreen and A&M regarding Oxford entity structure and asset holding matters (0.60); call with Rimkunas and Rubin regarding potential asset sale transfer tax issues (0.30).		
01/07/19	A P JOHNSON	4.20	1,890.00
	Draft declaration for sale motion (3.40); meeting with Hoffmann regarding same (0.30); revise sale motion (0.50).		
01/07/19	P D LAUN	0.30	300.00
	Communicate with Jones Day team regarding bonding issues, collateral and permitting issues.		
01/07/19	H LENNOX	3.50	4,725.00
	Review/analyze and comment on sale order, bidding procedures, motion for sale (2.40); conferences with Hoffmann, Cowan (Lazard), Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) regarding status of same (0.80); conference call with Collins, Williams, Zeltner, Reynolds regarding First Surety issues regarding sales (0.30).		
01/07/19	J K MURPHY	3.00	2,325.00
	Review of environmental provisions of purchase agreement (0.50); research regarding permit transfer requirements (2.50).		
01/07/19	M F PODOLSKY	2.50	1,062.50
	Continue drafting Oxford asset purchase agreement (1.70); attend call with Hagreen and JD Team regarding Oxford asset purchase agreement (0.50); attend call with JD tax group regarding assets and potential transfer taxes (0.30).		
01/07/19	T REYNOLDS	9.90	5,692.50
	Revise Oxford / Buckingham sale motion (4.00); revise Oxford / Buckingham bidding procedures (1.70); communicate with Henry regarding Oxford / Buckingham notices (0.40); revise Oxford / Buckingham sale order (1.70); communicate with Hoffmann regarding notice issues (0.40); communicate with Hunter and representative from Westmoreland regarding corporate structure questions (0.60); revise exhibits to Oxford / Buckingham sale motion (1.10).		
01/07/19	O S ZELTNER	1.80	1,080.00
	Communications with Lennox, Williams and Collins (both Manier & Herod) regarding surety issues related to WMLP asset sale (0.50); communications with Hagreen (WMLP) and JD bankruptcy and M&A teams regarding sale and asset purchase agreement issues (0.70); communications with Podolsky regarding sale resolutions (0.20); research precedent document regarding same (0.40).		
01/08/19	M C CORCORAN	0.60	510.00
	Communicate with Johnson, Hoffmann, Lennox, Zeltner, FitzSimons, Hunter, Podolsky, Edel, Perez, Wilson and Reynolds regarding asset sales and plan issues.		

Asset Disposition

Page 6

01/08/19	J N EDEL	5.40	2,835.00
	Various communications with Pesce, Koenig (both K&E), Hoffmann, Zeltner, Reynolds regarding bidding procedures (0.40); review and analyze bid procedures sent from K&E compared to proposed procedures (0.80); participate in conference call with Pesce (K&E), Koenig (K&E), Lennox, Hoffmann, Reynolds regarding same (0.50); review and revise notice of sale (1.40), notice of assumption and assignment of contracts (0.90), and publication notice (0.40); various communications with Lennox, Hoffmann, Reynolds regarding same (0.60); coordinate creation of exhibit regarding assumed and assigned contracts (0.40).		
01/08/19	T P FITZSIMONS	4.30	4,192.50
	Conference call with Jones Day regarding permitting issues (0.50); telephone conference with Hunter and Podolsky regarding asset purchase agreement (0.50); correspondence regarding permit approvals (0.30); conference call with K&E regarding asset purchase agreement (0.30); review and revise resolutions (0.50); correspondence with Jones Day regarding asset purchase agreement (0.20); telephone conference with Hoffmann regarding tender offer (0.20); conference call with WMLP regarding disclosure schedules (1.00); conference call with Jones Day team regarding disclosure schedules (0.50); review and revise resolutions (0.30).		
01/08/19	S L HENRY	0.30	120.00
	Meet with Reynolds to discuss revisions to notices for Buckingham and Oxford asset sale.		
01/08/19	S L HENRY	0.20	80.00
	Revise notices for WMLP sale of Oxford and Buckingham assets.		
01/08/19	T HOFFMANN	8.60	8,385.00
	Review/analyze proposed bidding procedures for sale of mine and related assets (0.70); participate in conference call with Lennox, Pesce, Koenig (both K&E) and Reynolds regarding procedures (0.50); review/analyze issues relating to sale milestones in cash collateral order and related correspondence (0.30); communicate with Lennox and Reynolds regarding sale structure and related items (0.40); participate in a portion of a conference call with Hunter, FitzSimons, Hagreen (WMLP) and Farrell (A&M) regarding schedules (0.50); participate in follow up conference call with Hunter, Podolsky and FitzSimons (0.40); participate in conference call with Podolsky, Laun, Murphy, FitzSimons and Hunter regarding permit issues and related schedules (0.70); review/analyze Lazard comments to sale motion (0.30); communicate with Reynolds regarding comments (0.10); review/edit sale notices (1.20); review/analyze executory contract list (0.70); communicate with Farrell (A&M) regarding list (0.30); review/analyze bidding procedures, related order, sale order and motion (2.50).		
01/08/19	G M HUNTER	9.50	7,600.00
	Teleconference with Murphy, Laun and other members of working group regarding permitting and bonding transfer issues in relation to Oxford (0.80); call with parent counsel regarding strategy coordination and transaction process (0.50); call with parent personnel to summarize Oxford asset purchase agreement and discuss scheduling matters (2.50); follow-up calls with internal working group regarding schedules preparation (0.50); various internal coordination efforts regarding Oxford disclosure schedule preparation, including correspondence with working group and review and revision of draft schedule skeleton and introductory provisions (2.00); calls and correspondence with senior lender counsel regarding bidder asset purchase agreement (0.60); final review of and revisions to revised Oxford asset purchase agreement markup and distribution of same to bidder (1.20); correspondence with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) regarding comments to asset purchase agreement, and further revisions regarding same (0.50); further correspondence, and corresponding review of and revisions to asset purchase agreement, with senior lender counsel (0.50); review of data site permitting materials in connection with providing comments to disclosure schedules (0.40).		
01/08/19	A P JOHNSON	5.50	2,475.00
	Review and revise Oxford/Buckingham sale motion.		
01/08/19	P D LAUN	0.80	800.00
	Communicate with JD M&A and environmental teams regarding bond and permitting issues (0.50); review communications relating to permitting issues and bonds (0.30).		

01/08/19	H LENNOX	4.10	5,535.00
	Review/analyze K&E redraft of bid procedures for sale (0.30); conferences with Hoffmann, Reynolds, Pesce (K&E), Koenig (K&E) regarding same (0.70); review and comment on revised sale motion (0.40); review Lazard comments to motion and communications with Hoffmann, Reynolds regarding same (0.30); conference with Jones Day team regarding status of sale workstreams and related matters (0.50); review bidder letter (0.30); communications with Jones Day team and Green (Lazard) regarding various aspects of deal status, signing and closing conditions and timing (1.30); telephone conference with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) regarding same (0.10); conference with Hoffmann regarding asset purchase agreement schedules (0.20).		
01/08/19	J K MURPHY	3.00	2,325.00
	Call with client regarding permit transfer (0.50); research permit transfer requirements and prepare memo regarding same (2.50).		
01/08/19	H P OSTER	6.90	2,760.00
	Attend call with client and other parties for MLP asset sale to discuss asset purchase agreement and disclosure schedules (2.40); attend meeting with M&A team to discuss disclosure schedules (1.60); review leases to be added to asset purchase agreement disclosure schedules (2.90).		
01/08/19	M F PODOLSKY	8.80	3,740.00
	Attend call with A&M and Hagreen (WMLP) to discuss disclosure schedules and drafting responsibility (2.40); review documents provided in data room and begin to prepare attachments to the schedules (2.30); attend call with Hunter, FitzSimons, Oster and Singerman regarding review of data room for scheduling (1.20); begin draft of disclosure schedule (1.20); review and analyze indemnity agreements provided in the data room (0.60); attend call with Jones Day corporate group, Laun and Murphy to discuss bonding (0.50); attend call with Hunter and FitzSimons to discuss bonding in asset purchase agreement (0.40); attend call with K&E team to discuss Oxford/Buckingham asset purchase agreement (0.20).		
01/08/19	T REYNOLDS	4.30	2,472.50
	Communicate with Laun, FitzSimons and Hunter regarding bonding issues (0.50); revise Oxford sale motion (1.70); edit notices related to Oxford sale (0.50); communicate with Lennox and Hoffmann regarding Oxford bidding procedures (0.70); communicate with counsel for WLB Debtors regarding Oxford sale process (0.70); communicate with Lennox and Green (Lazard) regarding Oxford sale process (0.20).		
01/08/19	K M SAMUELS	0.50	425.00
	Review comments from lender's counsel regarding Kemmerer promissory note.		
01/08/19	Z B SINGERMAN	9.30	3,720.00
	Communicate with Podolsky, Hunter and FitzSimons regarding asset purchase agreement (0.70); review bonds to determine when collateral would be released (0.50); review indemnity agreements to determine when collateral would be released (2.40); communicate with Podolsky regarding the indemnity agreements (0.10); communicate with Podolsky, Hunter and WMLP counsel regarding schedules for asset purchase agreement (1.30); communicate with Podolsky, Hunter and Oster regarding schedules for asset purchase agreement (1.10); communicate with Podolsky and Oster regarding responsibilities for closing of deal (0.50); cross-check leases in the data room to list of leases provided by WMLP (2.70).		
01/09/19	J N EDEL	8.20	4,305.00
	Various communications with Hoffmann, Corcoran Reynolds, Johnson, Henry regarding sale transaction, notices, motion and order (1.40); review and revise exhibit executory contracts for assumption (1.20); participate in call with Hoffmann, Esposito, Farrell (both A&M) regarding revisions to same (1.30); review and revise motion to approve bid and objection deadline (1.80) and order related to same (0.90); review and revise notices of motion and sale and publication (0.40); review and analyze sale order edits from Koenig (K&E) (0.80); communicate with Lennox, Hoffmann, Reynolds regarding same (0.40).		

Date	Name	Hours	Amount
01/09/19	T P FITZSIMONS	5.20	5,070.00
	Correspondence with Jones Day team regarding tender offer mechanics (0.30); correspondence with bidder regarding asset purchase agreement (0.20); conference call with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) regarding 14D-9 (0.10); telephone conference with Hunter regarding tender documents and Oxford asset purchase agreement (0.20); review and revise asset purchase agreement (0.40); correspondence with Jones Day team regarding asset purchase agreement (0.20); telephone conference with Hunter regarding open items (0.40); correspondence with Hoffmann regarding escrow (0.20); telephone conference with Hoffmann regarding escrow (0.10); review and revise Lazard materials (0.60); correspondence with Lazard regarding response to bidder (0.20); review commitment letter and correspondence with Jones Day regarding same (0.40); correspondence with bidder regarding commitment letter (0.10); correspondence with Lazard regarding open points (0.20); conference call with bidder regarding bonding transfer and replacement (0.40); conference call with Laun and Hunter regarding revisions to asset purchase agreement in light of call with bidder (0.40); correspondence with Jones Day team regarding tender offer (0.20); review and revise asset purchase agreement and related correspondence (0.30); review and revise disclosure schedule (0.30).		
01/09/19	E M GERMAN	5.50	2,200.00
	Review lease schedules against leases in data room to determine whether any leases are missing.		
01/09/19	S L HENRY	0.10	40.00
	Communication and correspondence with Edel to discuss assignment of drafting notice for Oxford and Buckingham asset sale.		
01/09/19	S L HENRY	0.30	120.00
	Meet with Reynolds and Edel to discuss assignment of updating notices for Oxford and Buckingham asset sale.		
01/09/19	W A HERZBERGER	1.00	975.00
	Review asset purchase agreement and advise regarding real estate and real estate tax issues (0.80); discussion with Hunter regarding same (0.20).		
01/09/19	T HOFFMANN	11.00	10,725.00
	Review/analyze K&E edits to sale motion and related orders (0.50); communicate with Reynolds regarding edits (0.40); communicate with Dickson (Donlin Recano) and Edwards (Donlin Recano) regarding sale process and associated noticing (0.30); review/analyze issues relating to assignment of contracts in connection with sale (0.90); participate in conference call with Farrell (A&M), Edel and Reynolds regarding executory contracts (0.50); review/analyze Lennox comments to bidding procedures order (0.30); communicate with Koenig (K&E) regarding sale timing (0.20); review/analyze sale motion, bidding procedures order, bidding procedures and sale order (2.40); draft/revise order establishing bid deadline and related sale dates (2.10); communicate with FitzSimons regarding deposit and related issues (0.20); communicate with Pesce, Koenig (both K&E), Edel, Reynolds and Lennox regarding sale timing and related court process (0.30); review/analyze K&E comments to bidding procedures (0.60); communicate with Edel regarding comments (0.20); separate communications with Lennox regarding K&E comments to order (0.10); review/revise motion setting bid deadline and related sale dates (2.00).		
01/09/19	K P HOLEWINSKI	1.20	1,290.00
	Communications with Murphy on asset purchase agreement (0.20); review revisions to same (0.70); communications with Hunter on same (0.10); review communications from Podolsky on SMCRA questions (0.20).		
01/09/19	G M HUNTER	11.40	9,120.00
	Call with bidder regarding Oxford bonding matters including preparation and review of documents in connection with same (0.80); draft update email to Jones Day and Lazard teams summarizing discussions with bidder counsel and open items, and follow-up correspondence regarding same (0.90); calls with Murphy, Laun and FitzSimons regarding bonding matters (0.50); attention to various aspects of revised asset purchase agreement received from bidder, including revisions thereto, subsequent commentary and redistribution to bidder (3.50); review and provide comments to initial draft of Oxford disclosure schedules (2.10); review bonding materials provided by bidder and correspond internally regarding same (0.40); calls and correspondence with Green (Lazard) pertaining to various aspects of Oxford asset purchase agreement, including related revisions to asset purchase agreement (1.10); prepare and provide comments to asset purchase agreement summary slide in Lazard deck (0.80); correspondence and calls internally and with Lazard regarding real estate tax treatment in Oxford asset purchase agreement (1.00); call with bidder regarding real estate tax treatment in Oxford asset purchase agreement (0.30).		

Asset Disposition			Page 9
01/09/19	A P JOHNSON	0.80	360.00
	Edit sale motion (0.30); revise declaration to sale motion (0.50).		
01/09/19	P D LAUN	3.30	3,300.00
	Analyze/review Oxford bonds and indemnity agreements (0.80); multiple calls with Jones Day team (1.00); call with purchaser regarding same (0.50); review updated drafts of agreement and comment on same (1.00).		
01/09/19	H LENNOX	4.40	5,940.00
	Multiple communications with Jones Day team regarding open items for bidder asset purchase agreement and timing (1.60); multiple communications with Pesce (K&E) regarding same (0.70); review bonding materials (0.20); communications with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) regarding sale issues (0.20); review and revise current versions of sale motion, bid procedures and notices for sale (0.90); conferences with Cowan (Lazard), Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee), Pesce (K&E), Hoffmann regarding resolution of ancillary issues surrounding sale (0.80).		
01/09/19	J K MURPHY	6.30	4,882.50
	Review of mining permits and permit transfer provisions of asset purchase agreement (3.20); prepare environmental schedule (3.10).		
01/09/19	H P OSTER	6.30	2,520.00
	Review leases to be added to asset purchase agreement disclosure schedules.		
01/09/19	M F PODOLSKY	10.70	4,547.50
	Continue draft of disclosure schedules and attachments (6.70); continue drafting Oxford asset purchase agreement (1.60); review leases in preparation for schedule attachment (1.10); review permits provided in data room and begin preparing attachment (0.90); attend call regarding bonding with bidder team (0.40).		
01/09/19	T REYNOLDS	7.40	4,255.00
	Revise Oxford sale motion (2.00); revise Oxford bidding procedures (1.30); revise notices related to Oxford sale (1.00); draft emergency motion regarding Oxford sale (3.10).		
01/09/19	K A RUBIN	0.40	320.00
	Review revised draft of Oxford asset purchase agreement.		
01/09/19	K M SAMUELS	0.30	255.00
	Correspond with internal Jones Day team regarding comments from lenders counsel regarding Kemmerer note.		
01/09/19	Z B SINGERMAN	4.60	1,840.00
	Meet with Podolsky, German and Oster regarding missing leases to include in schedules (0.40); cross-references leases on Company's spreadsheet with leases in the virtual data room in order to ensure that all leases are included in schedules (4.20).		
01/09/19	M A WALTERS	1.80	450.00
	Revise Oxford asset purchase agreement.		
01/09/19	O S ZELTNER	0.50	300.00
	Communications with Lennox, Hoffmann, Reynolds, Edel regarding Oxford and Kemmerer sale issues.		
01/10/19	M C CORCORAN	1.40	1,190.00
	Develop comments to motion to approve sale and communicate with Reynolds regarding same.		
01/10/19	J N EDEL	7.90	4,147.50
	Various communications with Lennox, Hoffmann, Reynolds regarding motion and order to approve deadlines and related sale transaction documents (0.50); review and analyze revised assumption exhibit (0.80); various communications with Hoffmann, Esposito (A&M) regarding same (0.80); final review and revisions to sale order (1.40), sale and auction notice (1.30), publication notice (0.60), contract assignment notice (1.00), bidding procedures (0.30), sale motion (0.20); communicate with Hoffmann, Reynolds, Johnson, Gordon, Pedersen regarding Kemmerer sale documents (0.40); various communications with Dickson, Calderon (both Donlin) regarding noticing timelines and costs (0.30); participate (partial) in conference call regarding schedules with Jones Day, A&M teams (0.30).		
01/10/19	J C GORDON	1.60	720.00
	Phone call with Hoffmann, Reynolds, Edel, and Johnson to discuss sale documents and work plan (0.60); upload and organize relevant precedent documents to system and send email to working group with the uploaded documents (1.00).		

Date	Client	Hours	Amount
01/10/19	T HOFFMANN	9.20	8,970.00
	Review/revise motion to establish bid and related deadlines and related order (1.00); review/analyze sale structure and related correspondence from Lennox, Green (Lazard) and Cowan (Lazard) (0.30); communicate with Reynolds regarding edits to sale documents (0.30); review/analyze revised sale motion, sale order, bidding procedures and bidding procedures order (1.00); review/analyze Lennox comments to motion to set sale deadlines (0.20); review/analyze issues relating to sale timing, related court process and notice (0.80); review/analyze asset purchase agreement (0.50); review/analyze other bids and related documents (1.20); communicate with Dickson (Donlin Recano) and Reynolds regarding service related issues and timing (0.30); review/analyze proposed sale notices (0.80); communicate with Lennox regarding Buckingham transaction (0.20); communicate with Edel, Esposito (A&M) and Farrell (A&M) regarding executory contracts (0.30); review/analyze sale documents for separate sale transaction (0.70); communicate with Reynolds and Edel regarding separate transaction (0.10); communicate with Esposito (A&M), Farrell (A&M) and Edel regarding deposit accounts for sale (0.20); review/analyze issues relating to executory contracts (0.70); communicate with Esposito (A&M) regarding executory contracts (0.20); communicate with Reynolds and Edel regarding separate sale process and related timing (0.40).		
01/10/19	K P HOLEWINSKI	0.80	860.00
	Review revised asset purchase agreement (0.70); communications with Murphy on same (0.10).		
01/10/19	G M HUNTER	8.70	6,960.00
	Call with counsel to lenders regarding numerous aspects of work in process (0.40); various calls and correspondence with Parent personnel regarding Oxford asset purchase agreement scheduling matters, including related review of information provided and corresponding provisions of Oxford asset purchase agreement (3.00); draft Conflicts Committee transaction approval slide deck, including research and correspondence regarding applicable 363 standards (1.40); review and revise Lazard deck for Conflicts Committee, including preparation of asset purchase agreement term summary contained therein and related call with Lazard (1.30); continued attention to various aspects of Oxford asset purchase agreement in relation to permitting transfer and bonding provisions contained therein, including internal discussions and precedent review (0.80); calls and correspondence with Parent counsel regarding permit transferring process (0.40); revise Conflicts Committee approval resolutions (0.60); various correspondence with Lazard pertaining to Oxford sale process status and negotiation matters (0.80).		
01/10/19	A P JOHNSON	0.60	270.00
	Edit sale motion (0.20); call with Hoffmann, Edel, Reynolds, Gordon to discuss status of motion and ancillary pleadings (0.40).		
01/10/19	P D LAUN	0.30	300.00
	Communicate with Hunter, Murphy and FitzSimons regarding bonding issues and changes to sale agreement.		
01/10/19	H LENNOX	2.50	3,375.00
	Multiple communications with Jones Day team, Lazard regarding status of deal and open issues (1.60); conference with Pesce (K&E), Hillman (SRZ) regarding same (0.40); review latest sale motion (0.40); telephone conference with Cowan (Lazard) regarding latest issues regarding deal (0.10).		
01/10/19	H LENNOX	1.30	1,755.00
	Update conference call with Jones Day M&A team and SRZ M&A team regarding sale process (0.50); review and revise sale motion (0.40); conference with Hoffmann, FitzSimons about latest timing and state of play with bidder bid (0.40).		
01/10/19	J K MURPHY	2.70	2,092.50
	Review environmental provisions of asset purchase agreement (2.20); participate in call regarding bond issues (.50).		
01/10/19	H P OSTER	0.80	320.00
	Review Conflicts Committee minutes regarding Oxford asset sale.		
01/10/19	M F PODOLSKY	5.60	2,380.00
	Continue draft of schedules and attachments (4.00); attend call with A&M and WLB team to discuss schedules (0.70); attend call with Schulte team regarding asset purchase agreement (0.50); attend call with Hunter and FitzSimons to discuss process and open corporate items (0.40).		

Asset Disposition		Page 11	
01/10/19	T REYNOLDS	6.10	3,507.50
	Revise motion to hear Oxford sale motion on an emergency basis (2.40); revise Oxford sale order (0.30); revise Oxford sale motion (2.70); communicate with Donlin Recano regarding service of sale motion (0.20); revise Kemmerer sale order (0.50).		
01/11/19	M C CORCORAN	0.20	170.00
	Communications with Hunter and Reynolds regarding Oxford sale.		
01/11/19	J N EDEL	6.80	3,570.00
	Various communications with Lennox, Hoffmann, Reynolds, Gordon, Pedersen regarding workstreams related to Kemmerer and Oxford sales (0.90); draft motion of sale of Kemmerer mine (4.20); communicate with Wilson, Henry regarding fiduciary duties of debtors (0.30); review and analyze Henry research regarding same (0.20); conduct additional research regarding same (0.80); various communications with Gordon regarding new bid procedures and motion (0.40).		
01/11/19	T P FITZSIMONS	0.80	780.00
	Attend conference call with JD team regarding schedules (0.40); telephone conference with Hunter regarding asset purchase agreement and schedules (0.40).		
01/11/19	J C GORDON	5.80	2,610.00
	Draft and revise Kemmerer bidding procedures order and bidding procedures.		
01/11/19	S L HENRY	1.00	400.00
	Research and draft citation for debtor's duty to maximize the value of the estate under Fifth Circuit law.		
01/11/19	T HOFFMANN	9.60	9,360.00
	Review/analyze issues relating to publication notice (0.20); communicate with Lennox and Reynolds regarding publication notice (0.20); review/analyze sale notices and distribute to secured lenders (0.70); prepare schedule of sale milestones (0.50); communicate with Lennox and Zeltner regarding sale milestones (0.30); communicate with Farrell (A&M) regarding deposit account for sale (0.10); review/analyze forms for separate sale process (2.00); participate in call with Koenig, Pesce (both K&E), Hillman (SRZ) Yerramalli (Kramer Levin) and others regarding sale process (1.00); communicate with Cowan (Lazard) regarding sale milestones (0.10); review/analyze board materials relating to sale (0.80); communicate with Lennox and Hunter regarding materials and related issues (0.20); communicate with Esposito (A&M) regarding sale process and executory contracts (0.10); communicate with Hillman (SRZ), Vescio (Houlihan Lokey), Cowan (Lazard), Lennox and others regarding sale milestones (0.20); communicate with Dickson (DR) and Calderon (DR) regarding sale timing and notice issues (0.20); review/analyze sale order for separate sale process (1.70); review/revise bidding procedures and related order (1.30).		
01/11/19	G M HUNTER	8.60	6,880.00
	Call with Parent regarding various disclosure schedules matters (0.40); follow-up call with FitzSimons and Podolsky (0.30); call with Lazard and A&M regarding working capital adjustment (0.30); call with Parent regarding disclosure schedules (1.20); review and provide comments to revised draft of disclosure schedules (0.50); draft revisions to Oxford asset purchase agreement (0.80); revise bonding schedule (0.30); correspondence with Company regarding bonding schedule (0.40); various research and correspondence in relation to bonding agreement treatment in certain permit transfer scenarios (1.00); revise Conflict Committee transaction approval materials (0.40); provide various reports regarding Oxford sale status, including calls with counsel to Parent and counsel to lenders (1.00); call with counsel to bidder regarding certain Oxford asset purchase agreement and schedule matters (0.90); begin drafting revisions to Oxford asset purchase agreement pursuant to Lazard and Conflicts Committee input (1.10).		
01/11/19	P D LAUN	0.50	500.00
	Communicate with JD team regarding permitting and bonding issues and review correspondence from purchaser regarding same.		
01/11/19	H LENNOX	1.50	2,025.00
	Conferences with Hoffmann, Reynolds, Edel regarding auction motion, schedule and workstreams (0.60); conferences with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee), Hunter, Cowan (Lazard) regarding open issues in bidder asset purchase agreement and status of same (0.90).		
01/11/19	J K MURPHY	1.50	1,162.50
	Review revised asset purchase agreement (0.50); prepare environmental schedule (1.00).		
01/11/19	O B PEDERSEN	1.00	400.00
	Revise sale notice.		

Asset Disposition			Page 12
01/11/19	O B PEDERSEN	1.80	720.00
	Meet with Edel and Reynolds regarding drafting of notices (0.50); review docket regarding potential sale (0.50); draft publication notice (0.80).		
01/11/19	M F PODOLSKY	2.20	935.00
	Finish draft of schedules and updated attachments for distribution to bidder (1.50); attend call with JD team to discuss open scheduling items (0.40); update draft of asset purchase agreement (0.30).		
01/11/19	T REYNOLDS	7.10	4,082.50
	Revise Oxford sale motion (1.30); revise Oxford sale order (0.60); revise Oxford sale notices (0.80); draft Kemmerer sale order (4.40).		
01/11/19	O S ZELTNER	0.40	240.00
	Communications with Wilson, Edel regarding Oxford and Kemmerer sale issues.		
01/12/19	J N EDEL	3.20	1,680.00
	Various communications with Hoffmann, Pedersen, Gordon regarding Kemmerer bidding procedures, motion and notices (0.60); draft bidding procedures motion (2.60).		
01/12/19	T P FITZSIMONS	1.30	1,267.50
	Review and revise asset purchase agreement (0.50); telephone conference with Hunter regarding asset purchase agreement and open items (0.40); review intercompany resolution term sheet (0.40).		
01/12/19	J C GORDON	1.20	540.00
	Revise Kemmerer Bidding Procedures and related Order.		
01/12/19	T HOFFMANN	2.90	2,827.50
	Review/revise bidding procedures order and bidding procedures (2.80); communicate with Gordon regarding revisions (0.10).		
01/12/19	G M HUNTER	6.00	4,800.00
	Draft revisions to asset purchase agreement to incorporate working capital adjustment mechanism (2.90); call and correspondence regarding same with FitzSimons (0.70); review and revise Conflicts Committee deck materials pertaining to transaction approval (0.60); various correspondence with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) and Lazard regarding comments to working capital adjustment (0.40); call with Lazard regarding same (0.90); review and correspond regarding global settlement term sheet (0.50).		
01/12/19	H LENNOX	0.40	540.00
	Communications with Hunter, Cowan (Lazard), Hoffmann regarding updates regarding bidder bid.		
01/12/19	O B PEDERSEN	1.70	680.00
	Consult with Edel regarding information to be included in notices (0.20); draft sale notice (0.70); draft executory contract notice (0.40); revise publication notice (0.40).		
01/12/19	T REYNOLDS	1.40	805.00
	Revise Kemmerer sale order.		
01/13/19	J N EDEL	1.90	997.50
	Review and revise bidding procedures motion (1.10); various communications with Hoffmann, Reynolds, Gordon, Pedersen regarding same (0.50); review and revise same per Lennox comments (0.30).		
01/13/19	T P FITZSIMONS	0.30	292.50
	Telephone conference with Hunter regarding Oxford asset purchase agreement.		
01/13/19	J C GORDON	3.10	1,395.00
	Revise Kemmerer sale document, incorporating comments from Hoffmann and Lennox.		
01/13/19	T HOFFMANN	1.70	1,657.50
	Review/analyze revised asset purchase agreement and related issues, including working capital (0.50); review/revise sale motion and related pleadings, including bidding procedures order, bidding procedures and sale order (1.20).		

Asset Disposition		Page 13	
01/13/19	G M HUNTER	5.60	4,480.00
	Call with Lazard and A&M regarding net working capital analysis (0.50); revise draft asset purchase agreement with respect to net working capital analysis and distribute to working group (0.90); call with counsel to Parent (0.30); begin review of prior asset purchase agreement drafts in connection with preparation of revised Kemmerer-only bid draft (0.90); various correspondence with A&M and Lazard regarding working capital matters, including follow-up calls with A&M (1.50); further revisions to Oxford asset purchase agreement (0.50); distribute same and correspondence regarding distribution (0.20); review and provide comments to Oxford disclosure schedules (0.30); various internal correspondence with Lennox, FitzSimons and other members of Jones Day working group relating to process, status and negotiation (0.50).		
01/13/19	H LENNOX	3.00	4,050.00
	Review/analyze and revise draft Kemmerer sale order, bidding procedures and bidding procedures order (2.10); multiple conferences with Pesce (K&E), Hoffmann, Hunter regarding various sale issues (0.50); review and revise Cowan (Lazard) declaration for Oxford sale (0.40).		
01/13/19	O B PEDERSEN	1.50	600.00
	Consult with Edel regarding revisions to notices (sales, publications, and executory contracts) (0.20); review finished Motion for the Sale of the Kemmerer Assets to reconcile defined terms (0.20); revise publication notice to match language in the motion (0.20); revise sale notice to match language in the motion (0.50); revise executory contract notice to match language in the motion (0.40).		
01/14/19	M C CORCORAN	0.20	170.00
	Communicate with Hoffmann regarding Kemmerer and Oxford sale motions.		
01/14/19	J N EDEL	7.30	3,832.50
	Various communications with Lennox, Hoffmann, Corcoran, Reynolds, Zeltner regarding Kemmerer sale (1.30); various rounds of revisions to motion (2.30), sale order (1.60) and bidding procedures order (0.90) per Hoffmann comments; various communications with Esposito (A&M), Dickson, Calderon (both Donlin) regarding executory contract exhibits (0.40); review and analyze same (0.80).		
01/14/19	T P FITZSIMONS	1.70	1,657.50
	Office conference with Hoffmann regarding sale motion (0.30); review and revise Kemmerer asset purchase agreement (1.20); correspondence with Lennox and Hunter regarding transition services (0.20).		
01/14/19	S L HENRY	2.10	840.00
	Revise Buckingham/Oxford sale motion, sale order, and notices.		
01/14/19	T HOFFMANN	6.40	6,240.00
	Review/revise bidding procedures order and sale order (2.20); communicate with Esposito (A&M) regarding executory contracts (0.10); review/revise sale motion (2.90); communicate with Corcoran regarding sale schedule and court process (0.10); communicate with bidder regarding adequate assurance declaration and related items (0.20); review/analyze revised executory contract list (0.20); communicate with Reynolds and Edel regarding sale motion and related documents and process (0.40); review/analyze edits to sale motion (0.30).		
01/14/19	G M HUNTER	12.20	9,760.00
	Create markup for revised Kemmerer bid draft asset purchase agreement, including review of various iterations of prior sale documents (3.90); calls and correspondence with Podolsky and Oster regarding Kemmerer bid draft (0.80); call with counsel to lenders regarding transaction process (0.40); call with Samuels regarding bidder debt instrument (0.20); review terms of bidder debt instrument proposed by counsel to lenders (0.30); various calls with counsel to bidder relating to status of asset purchase agreement (1.30); calls and correspondence with counsel to WCC regarding transaction status (1.00); call with Lazard and A&M regarding net working capital matters regarding Oxford (0.80); call with Lazard regarding bidder bonding (0.30); research and draft report on Ohio law regarding mine bonding (0.80); various calls and correspondence in relation to AEP notice including review of draft asset purchase agreement regarding disclosure requirement concerning same (1.10); communications with Lazard and internally regarding transition services request from bidder, including review of request provided by bidder and review of certain matters related to Buckingham operations (1.30).		
01/14/19	H LENNOX	0.80	1,080.00
	Telephone conferences with Hoffmann, Hillman (SRZ), Marinuzzi (MoFo) regarding sales processes and timing.		

Asset Disposition			Page 14
01/14/19	H P OSTER Draft and revise asset purchase agreement for Kemmerer asset sale.	3.30	1,320.00
01/14/19	I M PEREZ Review dockets for sample transition services agreements.	3.00	1,500.00
01/14/19	M F PODOLSKY Review AEP agreement and legal issues related thereto (1.20); review markup of Kemmerer asset purchase agreement (0.70).	1.90	807.50
01/14/19	T REYNOLDS Revise Kemmerer sale order (1.20); revise notices related to Kemmerer sale (0.90); communicate with Donlin Recano regarding Oxford notices (0.30); revise Oxford sale motion (1.40); revise notices related to Oxford sale (0.60); communicate with Edel regarding Oxford status (0.10).	4.50	2,587.50
01/14/19	O S ZELTNER Communications with Perez, Green (Lazard) regarding transition services issues.	0.30	180.00
01/15/19	M C CORCORAN Communications with Green (Lazard) regarding asset sale process (0.20); review/analyze new bid for Oxford assets and related communications with Lennox, FitzSimons, Hunter, Podolsky, Reynolds and Edel regarding same (0.40).	0.60	510.00
01/15/19	J N EDEL Various communications with Dickson (Donlin), Esposito (A&M), Bow (K&E), Hoffmann, Hunter, Reynolds, Podolsky regarding schedules to Oxford asset sale and open issues related thereto (1.30); review and analyze notice of executory contracts related to same (0.40) review and revise contracts notice (0.80) and motion (0.70) related to Oxford sale; various communications with Cowan, Green (both Lazard), Lennox, Hoffmann, Corcoran, FitzSimons, Hunter, Zeltner, Reynolds, Podolsky regarding additional bids for assets and strategy (0.90); review and analyze letters/information related to same (0.40); various communications with Zeltner, Reynolds regarding sale timelines and hearing strategy (0.30).	4.80	2,520.00
01/15/19	T P FITZSIMONS Internal Jones Day call regarding status and schedule (0.40); correspondence with Lazard regarding transition services agreement (0.30); correspondence with Jones Day team regarding commitment letters and bonding (0.20); correspondence with working group regarding asset purchase agreement status (0.30); conference call with bidder regarding bonding (0.70); office conference with Hoffmann regarding intercompany agreement negotiations (0.20); telephone conference with Hunter regarding asset purchase agreement (0.20); telephone conference with Donlin regarding tender offer (0.20); correspondence with Donlin regarding same (0.10); review bid from bidder (0.30); conference call with Kirkland regarding asset purchase agreement (0.30); telephone conference with Hunter regarding bidder asset purchase agreement (0.20); telephone conference with Squire Patton Boggs regarding asset purchase agreement (0.20); telephone conference with Hunter regarding markup of asset purchase agreement (0.30).	3.90	3,802.50
01/15/19	J C GORDON Phone call with Hoffmann, Johnson, and rest of JD team to discuss progress of work streams.	0.20	90.00
01/15/19	T HOFFMANN Review/analyze bid for certain WMLP assets and related issues (0.80); communicate with Lennox regarding bid (0.20); review/revise sale notices (0.80); review/analyze revised contract list (0.30); communicate with Edel regarding list (0.20); review/analyze/provide comments to draft asset purchase agreement and purchased assets definition and other items (1.20); review/analyze noticing issues regarding sale (0.50); review/analyze separate asset purchase agreement and related documents (1.10).	5.10	4,972.50

Date	Name	Hours	Amount
01/15/19	G M HUNTER	14.40	11,520.00
	Attend internal work in process teleconference (0.50); call with bidder regarding bonding placement and permit transfer (0.50); review documentation provided by bidder with respect to bonding and communicate internally regarding same (0.60); various calls with lender counsel and WCC counsel regarding transaction status and process (1.30); draft sale process update communications to Lazard, Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) and others, and follow-up correspondence and calls regarding various aspects of same (1.00); review markup of Kemmerer auction draft asset purchase agreement and provide comments to Podolsky and Oster (0.90); various calls and correspondence regarding bidder letter and review of same (0.80); further calls and correspondence with WCC counsel (0.50); prepare markup of Oxford asset purchase agreement for distribution to bidder, including review of Buckingham documents in connection with same (2.30); calls and correspondence with bidder counsel in connection with asset purchase agreement and bonding matters and preparation of related internal updates and calls with FitzSimons (3.00); further review of bidder asset purchase agreement and finalization of markup including review of various drafts, provision of comments and related calls and correspondence (3.00).		
01/15/19	A P JOHNSON	0.50	225.00
	Participate in conference call with Hoffmann, Zeltner, Edel, Reynolds, and Corcoran regarding sale process and workstreams.		
01/15/19	P D LAUN	0.80	800.00
	Communicate with Hunter, Hoffman, FitzSimons, Murphy and Podolsky regarding bond issues, list, and commitment letter and review same (0.30); call with bidder regarding same (0.50).		
01/15/19	H LENNOX	2.00	2,700.00
	Multiple communications with Hunter, Cowan (Lazard), Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee), Podolsky regarding status of open items for Oxford asset purchase agreement (1.00); conference with Pesce (K&E) regarding new bid (0.20); communications with Lazard and JD team regarding new Oxford bid (0.70); review same (0.10).		
01/15/19	J K MURPHY	2.00	1,550.00
	Participate in call regarding bonding issues (0.90); review asset purchase agreement provisions regarding same (1.10).		
01/15/19	H P OSTER	7.10	2,840.00
	Draft asset purchase agreement for Kemmerer asset sale (1.70); edit Oxford asset purchase agreement to reflect new bidder (5.40).		
01/15/19	I M PEREZ	0.30	150.00
	Research dockets regarding transition services agreements.		
01/15/19	M F PODOLSKY	7.30	3,102.50
	Continue drafting Oxford bidder disclosure schedules and attachments (2.90); review and provide comments on redlines to confirm Oxford asset purchase agreement to bidder asset purchase agreement (1.70); draft disclosure schedules and conform attachments for distribution to bidder (1.60); attend bonding call with bidder (0.60); attend call with Hunter and Oster to discuss bidder asset purchase agreement (0.30); attend call with Hunter to discuss Kemmerer bid draft asset purchase agreement (0.20).		
01/15/19	T REYNOLDS	2.60	1,495.00
	Research regarding transition services precedent for Oxford sale (0.80); revise Oxford sale documents (1.60); communicate with Corcoran regarding presentation of evidence related to Oxford (0.20).		
01/15/19	O S ZELTNER	0.30	180.00
	Review revised bid received from bidder for Oxford assets and related communications.		
01/16/19	J N EDEL	5.90	3,097.50
	Various communications with Cowan, Green (both Lazard), Hoffmann, Reynolds regarding revisions to Kemmerer sale motion and bidding procedures (1.20); review and revise Kemmerer sale motion (3.30) and bidding procedures (0.70) related to same; various communications with Dickson (Donlin), Koenig (K&E), Hoffmann regarding contract schedules and service of same (0.70).		
01/16/19	T P FITZSIMONS	1.50	1,462.50
	Office conference with Hunter regarding asset purchase agreement status for Kemmerer and Oxford (0.30); attention to bidder issues list (0.20); correspondence with Jones Day regarding same (0.30); telephone conference with bidders counsel (0.30); correspondence with Kirkland and Jones Day regarding response to bidder bid (0.40).		

Asset Disposition

Page 16

01/16/19	T HOFFMANN	5.60	5,460.00
	Communicate with Hunter and FitzSimons regarding sale process (0.30); review and provide comments on Kemmerer sale motion (2.10), bidding procedures order (0.70), bidding procedures (0.60), sale order (0.90) and related notices (1.00).		
01/16/19	G M HUNTER	5.80	4,640.00
	Draft, revise and distribute new draft of Oxford asset purchase agreement (1.20); communications with lender counsel regarding Oxford bid (0.30); separate communications with lender counsel regarding Kemmerer bid (0.40); prepare comments to and review Kemmerer asset purchase agreement (1.00); prepare comments to and review Kemmerer auction asset purchase agreement (0.80); calls and correspondence with Lazard personnel pertaining to working capital adjustment at Oxford (0.60); various calls and correspondence with Parent counsel concerning Oxford disposition timeline and matters related to bids (0.50); review and provide comments to Oxford asset purchase agreement issues list prepared by bidder, including various internal calls and correspondence regarding same (1.00).		
01/16/19	A P JOHNSON	1.00	450.00
	Edit declaration in support of sale motion.		
01/16/19	H LENNOX	3.40	4,590.00
	Multiple telephone conferences with Pesce (K&E), Hillman (SRZ), JD team, Cowan (Lazard), Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) regarding competing Oxford bids and status (2.10); review and revise motion to sell Kemmerer assets (1.30).		
01/16/19	J K MURPHY	0.80	620.00
	Review environmental provisions of purchase agreement.		
01/16/19	H P OSTER	2.60	1,040.00
	Draft asset purchase agreement for Kemmerer mine.		
01/16/19	M F PODOLSKY	2.60	1,105.00
	Review and analyze markup and begin drafting Kemmerer asset purchase agreement.		
01/16/19	T REYNOLDS	0.30	172.50
	Review Oxford / Buckingham asset purchase agreement.		
01/17/19	M C CORCORAN	3.80	3,230.00
	Communications with Lennox, Hoffmann, Edel, Gordon, Cowan and Green (both Lazard) regarding motion to approve Kemmerer sale (0.20); develop comments to motion to approve Kemmerer sale and communicate with Hoffmann regarding same (3.60).		
01/17/19	J N EDEL	8.80	4,620.00
	Various communications with Lennox, Hoffmann, Corcoran, Reynolds, Zeltner, Dickson (Donlin), Green (Lazard), Esposito (A&M), Kweskin (SRZ) regarding filing of pleadings for Kemmerer and Oxford sale, including noticing and open items (1.90); various rounds of revisions Oxford sale order (0.80), Kemmerer sale order (0.50), Kemmerer sale motion (1.80), Kemmerer bidding procedures (1.00), Kemmerer Sale Notice (1.40), Kemmerer publication notice (0.60), Kemmerer assumption/assignment notice (0.80).		
01/17/19	T P FITZSIMONS	7.50	7,312.50
	Prepare for call with bidder (0.70); conference call with Lennox and Hunter to prepare for bidder call (0.30); telephone conference with Hunter regarding bidder (0.20); telephone conference with Kumar (Kirkland) regarding bidder bid (0.30); conference call with bidder (0.60); telephone conference with Hoffmann/Lennox regarding intercompany agreement and impact to M&A process (0.50); telephone conference with Kirkland regarding process (0.20); call with bidder team regarding status (0.50); review and revise Kemmerer asset purchase agreement (0.90); review and revise bidder asset purchase agreement (0.50); conflicts committee call (0.50); telephone conference with Hunter and Podolsky regarding asset purchase agreement (0.80); review and revise asset purchase agreement (0.40); review and revise Oxford asset purchase agreement (0.40); review and revise Oxford asset purchase agreement (0.30); related correspondence (0.40).		

Date	Name	Hours	Rate
01/17/19	T HOFFMANN	8.70	8,482.50
	Participate in conference call with Pesce (K&E), Mayer (Kramer Levin), Hillman (SRZ), Vescio (Houlihan Lokey) and others regarding Oxford/Buckingham sale (0.50); communicate with Hillman (SRZ) regarding Kemmerer sale process (0.40); review/analyze scheduling and notice issues with respect to the Kemmerer motion (1.20); communicate with Reynolds regarding filing of service and other items (0.70); review/revise Kemmerer sale motion (1.90); review/analyze comments to Kemmerer bidding procedures and other sale documents from Kweskin (SRZ) and related matters (1.30); review/analyze comments to sale motion from Corcoran and Lennox (0.50); communicate with Lennox regarding secured lender comments to Kemmerer sale pleadings and related matters (0.40); communicate with Corcoran, Green (Lazard), Lennox, Reynolds and Edel regarding Kemmerer sale documents (0.50); communicate with Kweskin (SRZ) regarding comments to Kemmerer sale documents (0.30); communicate with Hunter, Koenig (K&E), bidder counsel, and FitzSimons regarding Oxford/Buckingham sale process (0.60); communicate with Hunter, FitzSimons and Podolsky regarding sale schedules (0.40).		
01/17/19	G M HUNTER	11.10	8,880.00
	Review of contracts regarding O&G matters, including calls and correspondence with Hagreen (WMLP) and A&M (1.30); correspondence with bidder counsel and related review of current draft asset purchase agreement (0.50); call with FitzSimons regarding status (0.30); various internal calls and review of documents in preparation for negotiation with bidder counsel (0.50); review of documents, and related calls and correspondence with A&M and Parent, regarding Black Lung liability at Oxford in connection with bidder issues list (0.50); review and revise updated Kemmerer asset purchase agreement, including related review of other workstream asset purchase agreements (1.00); call with Centerview, Lazard, Parent counsel and bidder regarding bidder asset purchase agreement (0.50); call with Parent counsel and bidder regarding bankruptcy process and asset purchase process (0.50); attention to calls and correspondence regarding Oxford employees (0.40); review FitzSimons comments to asset purchase agreement and call with Oster and Podolsky to discuss revisions to Kemmerer asset purchase agreement (0.70); review and provide summary of bidder asset purchase agreement markup, including related follow-up correspondence (0.90); correspondence with bidder counsel regarding bonding requirements and updates, together with review of related bonding documentation prepared by Podolsky (0.40); call with internal working group regarding bidder asset purchase agreement markup (1.10); revise and distribute bidder Kemmerer asset purchase agreement (0.80); review revised Oxford asset purchase agreement received from bidder and correspond with Lazard, client and counsel to senior lender regarding same (0.40); initial review of proposed transition services agreement and correspondence with external working group regarding same (0.60); further revisions to bidder Kemmerer asset purchase agreement and correspondence with Lazard regarding same (0.30); correspondence with senior lender counsel in response to inquiries regarding bidder (0.40).		
01/17/19	P D LAUN	0.30	300.00
	Review/analyze bond summary and updated draft of Oxford sale agreement and communications with Hunter and Podolsky regarding same.		
01/17/19	H LENNOX	2.30	3,105.00
	Conference with Hoffmann regarding Kemmerer sale motion (0.50); review and revise same (0.60); review and revise draft Kemmerer sale order (0.30); multiple conferences with Hunter, FitzSimons, Hoffmann regarding various sale updates (0.90).		
01/17/19	H P OSTER	5.80	2,320.00
	Draft disclosure schedules for Kemmerer asset sale (1.20); edit Kemmerer asset purchase agreement regarding same (3.90); meet with Hunter and Podolsky regarding edits to Kemmerer asset purchase agreement regarding same (0.70).		
01/17/19	M F PODOLSKY	1.20	510.00
	Review, analyze and update bonding schedule (0.80); continue drafting Oxford asset purchase agreement (0.40).		
01/17/19	T REYNOLDS	3.00	1,725.00
	Research Bankruptcy Rules, Local Rules and Complex Case Procedures regarding sale deadlines in bidding procedures motion (0.90); revise Kemmerer bidding procedures motion (1.90); communicate with Hoffmann regarding Kemmerer bidding procedures motion (0.20).		
01/18/19	M T BARRIOS	0.90	270.00
	Prepare for and file Oxford sale motion.		

Asset Disposition		Page 18	
01/18/19	J N EDEL	9.60	5,040.00
	Research cases included in Kemmerer bidding procedures motion (0.70); communicate with Hoffmann regarding same (0.10); various communications with Lennox, Hoffmann, Johnson, Reynolds, Dickson (Donlin), Knight, Hillman (SRZ) regarding revisions to various Kemmerer pleadings and notices (1.40); review and revise Kemmerer documents related to the sale motion (1.90), sale order (0.70), bidding procedures (1.20), auction and hearing notice (0.70), publication notice (0.30), assumption and assignment notice (0.60); coordinate filing of same (1.70); communicate with Tywoniuk, Horton, Kost (all Conflicts Committee), Lennox regarding pleading (0.30).		
01/18/19	T P FITZSIMONS	2.60	2,535.00
	Review and revise asset purchase agreement (0.20); telephone conference with Hunter regarding asset purchase agreement revisions (0.20); correspondence with Jones Day deal team regarding asset purchase agreement (0.20); telephone conference with bidders counsel regarding bankruptcy structure (0.30); telephone conference with Hunter regarding open issues in bidder contract (0.10); review and revise bidder asset purchase agreement (0.20); correspondence regarding same (0.40); call with Conflicts Committee chair (0.20); conference call with Hoffmann and Hunter regarding filing of form asset purchase agreement (0.30); review and revise asset purchase agreement (0.20); correspondence regarding same (0.10); correspondence with Hunter regarding board process (0.20).		
01/18/19	T HOFFMANN	9.10	8,872.50
	Review/revise Kemmerer sale motion (2.10), notices (1.00), bidding procedures (0.50), bidding procedures order (0.90) and notices (1.00); review/analyze Kemmerer declarations (0.90); communicate with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee), Edel and Lennox regarding sale documents (0.40); communicate with Lennox regarding executory contract lists (0.10); review/analyze form Kemmerer asset purchase agreement (0.80); communicate with Edel, Burlacu, Calderon (both Donlin Recano) and others regarding service of Kemmerer sale motion (0.30); communicate with Edel regarding filing of Kemmerer motion and related items (0.60); communicate with Hillman, Knight (both SRZ) and Lennox regarding comments to form Kemmerer order (0.40); communicate with Pesce (K&E) regarding Oxford/Buckingham sale process (0.10).		
01/18/19	G M HUNTER	10.00	8,000.00
	Attention to numerous aspects of finalized Oxford negotiations with bidders, including calls internally and with Lazard and review of asset purchase agreements and preparation of markups (4.00); various calls and correspondence related to finalization of Kemmerer auction asset purchase agreement, including provision of several markups related thereto and correspondence with counsel to lenders (3.50); calls and correspondence with counsel to bidder related to process matters and Oxford asset purchase agreement (0.90); review and correspond regarding bidder letter from First Surety (0.50); draft and revise slides for Conflicts Committee pertaining to asset disposition (1.10).		
01/18/19	A P JOHNSON	1.50	675.00
	Edit bidding procedures (0.80); revise declaration in support of sale motion (0.70).		
01/18/19	P D LAUN	0.40	400.00
	Review/analyze additional information regarding bond transfers (0.20); communications with Hunter and Hoffman regarding same (0.20).		
01/18/19	H LENNOX	2.60	3,510.00
	Telephone conference with Brescia (counsel to Zurich), Bennett (counsel to Zurich), Zeltner regarding Kemmerer sale (0.30); follow-up with JD team regarding same (0.30); review and revise motion to sell Kemmerer assets (0.80); multiple conferences with Hoffmann, Hillman (SRZ) regarding same and regarding lender edits to papers (1.20).		
01/18/19	H P OSTER	1.10	440.00
	Attend calls with deal team and Conflicts Committee regarding final asset purchase agreement for Oxford (0.50); make final edits to asset purchase agreement regarding same (0.60).		
01/18/19	M F PODOLSKY	5.00	2,125.00
	Continue drafting Kemmerer asset purchase agreement (3.20); review data room for Kemmerer bonds (0.70); review and analyze bidder bonding on Oxford (0.60); review and provide comments on Robindale nondisclosure agreement (0.30); attend call to discuss Kemmerer asset purchase agreement with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) (0.20).		
01/18/19	T REYNOLDS	3.60	2,070.00
	Revise Kemmerer sale motion.		

Asset Disposition			Page 19
01/18/19	C L SMITH	0.30	105.00
	Communicate with Perez regarding filing (0.10); communications with Barrios, Zeltner regarding issues relating to filing of sale motion (0.20).		
01/18/19	O S ZELTNER	0.70	420.00
	Communications with Hoffmann, Edel regarding Kemmerer sale motion.		
01/19/19	J N EDEL	0.70	367.50
	Various communications with Lennox, Hoffmann, Reynolds, Pesce (K&E) regarding Oxford sale and related documents.		
01/19/19	T P FITZSIMONS	2.80	2,730.00
	Correspondence regarding competing bids (0.90); telephone conference with Hunter regarding bids (0.70); conference call with Kirkland regarding bid (0.30); conference call with bidder regarding bid (0.30); review and revise Lazard slides (0.60).		
01/19/19	T HOFFMANN	4.00	3,900.00
	Review/analyze bids for Oxford assets and related issues and correspondence from potential purchasers, Hunter, Lennox and others (1.20); communicate with Lennox regarding Oxford assets and related sale (0.40); participate in conference call with potential bidder, Hunter, Cowan (Lazard), Pesce (K&E) and others regarding Oxford sale process (0.50); review/analyze Kemmerer sale documents (0.70); review/analyze latest drafts of Oxford sale documents (1.20).		
01/19/19	G M HUNTER	5.80	4,640.00
	Calls with numerous parties in connection with Oxford auction (3.80); correspondence with Lazard and Jones Day working groups regarding all aspects of auction process (2.00).		
01/19/19	H LENNOX	2.20	2,970.00
	Conference with Williams (UMWA counsel) regarding Kemmerer sale motion and status of sale process (0.40); communications with Cowan (Lazard), Hoffmann regarding same (0.20); multiple communications with JD team, Cowan (Lazard), Green regarding status of Oxford negotiations, asset purchase agreement status and sale motion paper status (0.70); review and revise Cowan (Lazard) and Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) declarations for Kemmerer sale (0.70); review revised bids from Oxford bidders (0.20).		
01/19/19	H P OSTER	0.60	240.00
	Communicate with M&A team regarding finalizing the purchaser of the Oxford assets (0.30); discuss Oxford asset sale with Hunter (0.30).		
01/19/19	M F PODOLSKY	2.90	1,232.50
	Revise asset purchase agreement and prepare final form of disclosure schedules.		
01/19/19	T REYNOLDS	0.30	172.50
	Communicate with Hoffmann and Edel regarding Oxford sale documents.		
01/20/19	M C CORCORAN	1.00	850.00
	Develop joint motion to approve sale of Oxford assets and Buckingham mine and communication with Lennox, Hoffmann and Edel regarding same.		
01/20/19	J N EDEL	10.10	5,302.50
	Various communications with Lennox, Corcoran, Hoffmann regarding declaration related to Kemmerer sale and notice for same (0.40); communicate with Esposito (A&M) regarding open contract items (0.20); review and analyze K&E changes to motion and order regarding Oxford sale (0.30); review and revise Oxford sale motion (3.10), order (1.80), sale notice (1.20), publication notice (0.60), contract notice (1.10); various communications with Lennox, Hoffmann, Corcoran regarding same (1.40).		
01/20/19	T P FITZSIMONS	0.60	585.00
	Telephone conference with Hunter regarding bids and next steps to signing/closing (0.30); correspondence regarding asset purchase agreements with Kirkland and Jones Day teams (0.30).		
01/20/19	T HOFFMANN	7.10	6,922.50
	Review/analyze declarations in support of sale (0.60); communicate with Corcoran regarding declarations and related issues (0.20); review/revise Oxford sale motion (3.00); communicate with Edel regarding sale motion (0.30); review/revise Oxford sale order (1.50); communicate with Lennox regarding Oxford sale documents (0.20); review/analyze Oxford Sale notices (0.40) and bidding procedures (0.90).		

01/20/19	G M HUNTER	5.20	4,160.00	Provide comments to Lazard deck, including revisions to asset purchase agreement summary slide, and related internal correspondence (1.00); review and provide revisions to asset purchase agreement-specific resolutions and related correspondence (0.90); numerous correspondence with counsel to bidder regarding asset purchase agreement and process matters (1.30); correspondence with counsel to parent regarding asset purchase agreement and other coordination matters (0.40); calls with counsel to lenders regarding status (0.60); further calls and correspondence regarding finalizing Oxford transaction documentation (1.00).
01/20/19	H LENNOX	3.70	4,995.00	Review/analyze and revise Oxford sale motion and order (1.80); multiple communications with Pesce (K&E) Hoffmann, Edel regarding same (1.30); multiple communications with Cowan (Lazard), Green (Lazard), JD team regarding finalizing Oxford sale contract and sale process (0.60).
01/20/19	H P OSTER	3.10	1,240.00	Communicate with M&A team regarding finalizing purchase of Oxford assets (0.80); draft signature pages for Oxford asset purchase agreement (1.20); draft officer chart regarding signatories to Oxford and Kemmerer asset purchase agreements (1.10).
01/20/19	M F PODOLSKY	1.80	765.00	Update purchased contracts schedule attachment and finalize Oxford asset purchase agreement.
01/21/19	J N EDEL	12.90	6,772.50	Various communications with Lennox, Hoffmann, Kweskin, Hillman (both SRZ), Dickson (Donlin), Esposito (A&M), Pesce, Koenig (both K&E), and bidder counsel regarding status of and edits to various sale documents (2.40); review and revise sale motion (1.70), sale order (1.10), sale and auction notice (0.90), publication notice (0.70), assignment notice (1.30), bidding procedures (1.70); review and analyze schedules of contracts to be assumed and assigned (0.70); various communications with FitzSimons, Hoffmann, Hunter, Podolsky regarding same (0.80); assist in finalization of various sale documents (1.60).
01/21/19	T P FITZSIMONS	1.70	1,657.50	Telephone conference with Hunter regarding outside date and rejected contracts list (1.00); telephone conference with Lennox regarding outside date (0.30); correspondence with WMLP regarding signing process (0.40).
01/21/19	T HOFFMANN	10.00	9,750.00	Review/analyze K&E revisions to Oxford/Buckingham sale motion (0.60); review/revise sale motion (0.50), bidding procedures (0.50), sale order (1.00), and sale notices (0.80); review/analyze Oxford asset purchase agreement (0.90); communicate with bidder counsel regarding sale documents (0.20); communicate with Corcoran regarding stalking horse protections for Oxford sale (0.20); review/analyze Cowan declaration (0.50); review/analyze Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) comments to sale order (0.10); communicate with FitzSimons and Hunter regarding Oxford asset purchase agreement and related signing issues (0.50); communicate with Hunter and FitzSimons regarding settlement agreement and related issues (0.40); communicate with Edel, Pesce, Koenig (both K&E) and others regarding Oxford/Buckingham sale and related timing (0.50); participate in conference call with Hunter, Edel and Podolsky regarding Oxford sale process (0.40); communicate with Cowan and Green (both Lazard) regarding Oxford bidding procedures (0.20); review/analyze issues relating to executory contracts (0.70); communicate with Edel regarding sale documents and related comments (0.80); review/analyze sale order comments from stalking horse bidder (0.40); communicate with Corcoran, Edel and Lennox regarding sale order and related stalking horse bidder comments (0.20); communicate with Kweskin and Hillman (both SRZ) regarding comments to sale documents (0.30); communicate with Pesce (K&E), Lennox and Edel regarding status of Buckingham asset purchase agreement (0.20); communicate with Lennox regarding status of filing sale documents (0.10).
01/21/19	G M HUNTER	14.20	11,360.00	Calls and correspondence with bidder regarding finalization of Oxford asset purchase agreement and related schedules (3.20); various calls with counsel to lenders regarding Oxford asset purchase agreement status (0.40); coordination with WLB personnel regarding disclosure schedule matters, including various calls with Cottrell and Hagreen (both WMLP) (1.50); review and attend to calls and correspondence regarding Columbia settlement, including calls to bidder and WLB and drafting language for disclosure (2.30); calls with lender counsel and parent counsel regarding Oxford asset purchase agreement outside date and various related correspondence (0.80); attention to numerous aspects of finalizing asset purchase agreement and schedules for signature, including calls and correspondence with all relevant parties (6.00).

Date	Name	Hours	Amount
01/21/19	H LENNOX	2.40	3,240.00
	Review/analyze revised Oxford motion and bidding procedures (0.50); communications with Hoffmann, Edel, Pesce (K&E) regarding same and regarding timing of filing and service (0.90); review revised Cowan (Lazard) and Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) declarations for Oxford sale (0.50); conferences with Hunter, FitzSimons regarding outside date (0.30); conference with Cowan (Lazard) regarding latest bidder asset purchase agreement matter (0.20).		
01/21/19	M F PODOLSKY	7.30	3,102.50
	Begin final execution version of asset purchase agreement, disclosure schedules and all attachments (4.40); review and update schedules regarding issues raised by bidder (1.60); review and provide comments on the summary asset purchase agreement checklist in the sale motion (1.00); attend call with Hunter, Hoffmann, Edel and FitzSimons to discuss purchased contracts attachment (0.30).		
01/22/19	M T BARRIOS	0.20	60.00
	Communicate with Zeltner regarding filing of stipulation (0.10); file stipulation and circulate same (0.10).		
01/22/19	J N EDEL	7.70	4,042.50
	Various communications with Lennox, Hoffmann, Corcoran, Reynolds, Koenig (K&E), Esposito (A&M) regarding sale document finalization and filing (1.40); assist in finalization, filing and notice of same (2.20); review and analyze changes to sale motion (0.70); review and analyze final contract exhibit to same (0.20); review and analyze final filing (1.30); various communications with Dickson, Calderon (both Donlin), Koenig (K&E), Hoffmann, Reynolds regarding noticing of documents (0.70); various communications with Hoffmann, Farrell (A&M) regarding Marietta lease (0.40); research regarding same (0.60); communicate with Corcoran regarding noticing of motion (0.20).		
01/22/19	T P FITZSIMONS	2.40	2,340.00
	Telephone conference with Hunter regarding signing (0.20); correspondence with Jones Day team regarding signing (0.10); call with WMLP regarding open items (0.40); review and revise minutes of committee meeting (0.20); conference call with bidder and WMLP regarding open items (0.30); office conference with Hunter and Hoffmann regarding signing process (0.30); signing of asset purchase agreement and preparation of filings (0.90).		
01/22/19	T HOFFMANN	7.20	7,020.00
	Review/analyze issues relating to schedules, statements and other items on Oxford asset purchase agreement (0.30); communicate with Hunter and FitzSimons regarding schedules (0.10); communicate with Lennox and Pesce (K&E) regarding filing of Oxford/Buckingham sale motion (0.10); communicate with Farrell (A&M) regarding Oxford executory contracts (0.30); review/analyze issues relating to adequate assurance and related items (0.70); communicate with Corcoran regarding evidentiary issues for Oxford/Buckingham sale motion (0.70); communicate with Mijares-Shafai, Koenig (both K&E) and Reynolds regarding Oxford/Buckingham sale order (0.40); review/analyze issues relating to coal leases/property interests (1.00); communicate with Edel regarding same (0.20); communicate with FitzSimons and Hunter regarding finalization of Oxford asset purchase agreement (0.60); review/analyze Kemmerer sale declarations and related items (0.60); review/analyze filing version of Oxford/Buckingham sale motion and related documents (1.50); review/analyze service protocol for Oxford/Buckingham sale motion (0.50); communicate with Edel regarding service (0.20).		
01/22/19	G M HUNTER	6.50	5,200.00
	Numerous calls with WLB personnel regarding finalization of asset purchase agreement and disclosure schedules, and management of all workstreams (including calls and correspondence with all parties and counsel) regarding execution of Oxford asset purchase agreement.		
01/22/19	H LENNOX	3.40	4,590.00
	Communications with JD team, Koenig, Pesce (K&E) regarding finalizing and filing Oxford/Buckingham sale motion (0.80); review revised Oxford sale motion (0.30); conference with Hillman (SRZ) regarding Oxford sale motion (0.20); conferences with Pesce (K&E), Hoffmann, Hunter, Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) regarding asset purchase agreement matters (1.60); conference with Marinuzzi (MoFo) regarding sale and plan matters (0.20); telephone conference with Williams (First Surety counsel) regarding Oxford sale (0.30).		
01/22/19	M F PODOLSKY	2.50	1,062.50
	Prepare final executed copies and compile documents for signing, assist in facilitating signing process (1.80); attend call with WLB team to discuss schedule attachments (0.40); attend call with WLB team and bidder team to discuss any open issues with the schedules (0.30).		

Asset Disposition		Page 22	
01/22/19	T REYNOLDS	4.40	2,530.00
	Attention to finalizing and filing Oxford sale motion (1.20); communicate with counsel to City of Dover (0.30); communicate with Hunter regarding Oxford sale (0.10); research regarding anticipated objections to Oxford sale motion (2.10); communicate with Edel, Hoffmann and Donlin Recano regarding service of Oxford sale motion (0.70).		
01/23/19	M T BARRIOS	0.80	240.00
	Prepare for and file declarations (0.50); file Cowan (Lazard) declarations (0.30).		
01/23/19	Z R BURKART	1.00	450.00
	Review asset purchase agreement (0.50); discussion regarding Oxford closing process with Hunter, FitzSimons, Podolsky and Oster (0.50).		
01/23/19	J N EDEL	6.40	3,360.00
	Various communications with Hoffmann, Reynolds, Corcoran, Barrios Dickson, Calderon (both Donlin) regarding service of motion, declarations and related costs (1.70); coordinate filing and service of declarations (0.80); review and revise publication notice drafts (2.60); various communications with Farrell, Koncar, Esposito (all A&M) regarding Marietta lease agreements and Kemmerer contracts (0.60); review and analyze information related to same (0.70).		
01/23/19	T P FITZSIMONS	2.20	2,145.00
	Correspondence with Jones Day regarding bidder (0.20); conference call with Jones Day regarding Kemmerer process (0.50); telephone conference with bidder regarding asset purchase agreement (0.70); telephone conference with Hunter regarding bidder call (0.20); conference call with Jones Day regarding process to closing (0.40); correspondence with Jones Day team regarding bidder (0.20).		
01/23/19	T HOFFMANN	2.50	2,437.50
	Review/analyze issues relating to collective bargaining agreements and Kemmerer sale (0.30); communicate with Hunter and FitzSimons regarding Kemmerer sale (0.30); communicate with Edel and Dickinson (Donlin Recano) regarding service of Oxford/Buckingham sale motion (0.30); review/analyze filed versions of Oxford sale motion and related items (0.80); communicate with Corcoran regarding Kemmerer sale and related evidentiary issues (0.40); communicate with Lennox, Cowan and Green (both Lazard) regarding Kemmerer sale process (0.20); communicate with Podolsky and Reynolds regarding assignment of contracts in connection with Oxford sale (0.20).		
01/23/19	G M HUNTER	6.00	4,800.00
	Attention to various aspects of Kemmerer auction process, including review of previously received asset purchase agreements and internal calls and correspondence regarding collective bargaining matters and other Kemmerer closing condition matters (2.40); call with counsel to bidder regarding Kemmerer and related internal correspondence in preparation for same (1.40); internal Jones Day working group call regarding closing process for Oxford transaction (0.50); prepare report to Lazard regarding call with bidder and address follow-up correspondence (0.70); various correspondence with counsel to parent and counsel to lenders regarding post-signing matters in connection with Oxford asset purchase agreement (1.00).		
01/23/19	H LENNOX	0.60	810.00
	Conferences with FitzSimons, Hoffmann, Hunter regarding labor issues for Kemmerer sale (0.40); communications with Hoffmann regarding Oxford service (0.20).		
01/23/19	H P OSTER	3.00	1,200.00
	Attend call with potential bidder regarding Kemmerer asset sale (0.70); attend call with deal team regarding closing procedures for Oxford asset sale (0.60); draft closing checklist for Oxford sale (1.70).		
01/23/19	M F PODOLSKY	1.90	807.50
	Read and analyze sale order regarding transfer of purchased assets (0.90); attend call with bidder to discuss Kemmerer asset purchase agreement (0.60); call with Hunter to discuss closing process for Oxford (0.40).		
01/23/19	T REYNOLDS	2.00	1,150.00
	Communicate with Hoffmann, Edel and Donlin regarding service of Oxford motions (0.30); research regarding potential objections to Oxford sale motion (1.70).		
01/24/19	M T BARRIOS	0.30	90.00
	File additional sale declarations per Corcoran.		
01/24/19	Z R BURKART	1.90	855.00
	Review sale order (0.30); review asset purchase agreement and revise closing checklist (1.60).		

Asset Disposition		Page 23	
01/24/19	J N EDEL	8.50	4,462.50
	Participate in meeting with Hunter, Reynolds, Podolsky regarding sale process and next steps (0.70); various communications with Esposito, Koncar, Farrell (all A&M), Lennox, Hoffmann, Reynolds regarding Kemmerer executory contracts (0.60); review and analyze executory contract schedule for Kemmerer (0.40); research regarding mineral leases and sale (3.40); draft analysis of same (2.80); various communications with Farrell (A&M) regarding publication of sale notices (0.30); communicate with Zeltner and Podolsky regarding information requests from company related to sale transactions (0.30).		
01/24/19	T P FITZSIMONS	0.90	877.50
	Conference call with Jones Day regarding open workstreams (0.40); office conference with Hoffmann and Hunter regarding bonding commitments (0.50).		
01/24/19	T HOFFMANN	4.30	4,192.50
	Communicate with Reynolds regarding proposed EPA language (0.20); review and provide comments on 8k for sale motions (0.20); communicate with Corcoran regarding evidentiary issues for Oxford sale (0.30); communicate with Reynolds and Podolsky regarding assignment of contracts in connection with Oxford sale (0.10); review/analyze issues relating to mineral rights (0.40); communicate with Edel regarding executory contract and mineral right issues (0.20); review/analyze EPA comments to sale documents (0.80); communicate with Lennox and Corcoran regarding assignment of contracts in connection with Oxford sale (0.20); review/analyze issues relating to buyer procurement of replacement bonding (1.20); communicate with Cowan (Lazard), FitzSimons, Hunter and Lennox regarding bonding issues (0.30); communicate with Esposito (A&M) and Edel regarding Kemmerer executory contracts (0.40).		
01/24/19	G M HUNTER	2.30	1,840.00
	Prepare initial draft of 8-K description of asset purchase agreement (1.80); meeting with Jones Day bankruptcy team and Podolsky regarding assurances matters and closing process matters (0.50).		
01/24/19	H LENNOX	0.80	1,080.00
	Review/analyze Rogers papers (0.30); conference with Zeltner regarding same (0.10); communications with JD and K&E deal teams regarding Oxford closing items (0.40).		
01/24/19	H P OSTER	4.40	1,760.00
	Draft closing checklist for Oxford asset purchase (2.40); revise draft of 8-K regarding same (1.20); update Word chart and Excel file regarding officers of WMLP and subsidiaries party to Oxford and Kemmerer asset purchases (0.50); attention to communications regarding same (0.30).		
01/24/19	M F PODOLSKY	3.80	1,615.00
	Assist in preparing Oxford closing checklist (1.70); attend meeting with Hunter, Edel, and Reynolds to discuss sale order and potential objections (0.80); coordinate with company and prepare current list of directors and officers for Oxford and Kemmerer entities (0.80); continue analyzing sale order regarding transfer of purchased assets (0.50).		
01/24/19	T REYNOLDS	4.30	2,472.50
	Draft omnibus reply to objections to Oxford sale motion (2.40); communicate with Corcoran regarding expected objections to Oxford sale motion (0.20); communicate with Hunter regarding Oxford and Kemmerer asset purchase agreements (0.80); communicate with Hoffmann regarding EPA's requests relating to Kemmerer sale order (0.10); communicate with Hunter and Hoffmann regarding Ohio bonding requirements (0.80).		
01/25/19	Z R BURKART	1.00	450.00
	Discussion with Herzberger regarding transfer of deeds and review asset purchase agreement for same (0.50); discussion with Podolsky regarding transfer of deeds and draft correspondence for the same (0.50).		
01/25/19	J N EDEL	8.50	4,462.50
	Various communications with Hoffmann, Zeltner, Reynolds regarding construction of lease agreements for minerals and claims related thereto (0.80); research regarding construction of lease agreements for minerals (2.60) and claims related thereto (1.70); draft memorandum related to same (3.40).		
01/25/19	T P FITZSIMONS	0.50	487.50
	Call with Michelletti (WLB) regarding bonding.		

Asset Disposition		Page 24	
01/25/19	T HOFFMANN	2.70	2,632.50
	Review/analyze issues relating to assumed liabilities for Kemmerer transaction (0.40); communicate with Zeltner and Hunter regarding assumed liabilities (0.20); review/analyze EPA comments to sale order and related mark-up (0.50); review/analyze contract assignment issues in connection with Oxford sale and related evidentiary issues (0.70); participate in conference call regarding bonding with Preis (Centerview), Micheletti (WLB), Green (Lazard), Pesce and Koenig (both K&E) (0.70); communicate with Corcoran and Green (Lazard) regarding adequate assurance issues (0.20).		
01/25/19	G M HUNTER	7.00	5,600.00
	Calls and correspondence related to bonding matters (2.90); related review of statute and asset purchase agreement (1.00); calls and coordination regarding closing checklist matters, including providing comments thereto (0.90); call and correspondence with bidder regarding closing checklist matters (0.50); attention to 8-K (0.50); review bidder series B proposal and related correspondence (0.80); attention to Wyoming severance tax in relation to asset purchase agreement and bids for Kemmerer, including correspondence with A&M, Lazard and internally (0.40).		
01/25/19	H LENNOX	0.90	1,215.00
	Multiple communications with Hunter, Zeltner, Green regarding various aspects of Oxford and Kemmerer sales.		
01/25/19	H P OSTER	0.20	80.00
	Revise Oxford 8-K.		
01/25/19	M F PODOLSKY	0.30	127.50
	Review settlement agreement in connection with asset purchase agreement.		
01/25/19	T REYNOLDS	4.20	2,415.00
	Research regarding section 365 consent rights (0.90); revise omnibus response to objections to Oxford sale motion (0.70); communicate with Kirkland (Koenig) and Hoffmann regarding DOJ's requested edits to Oxford sale order (0.40); communicate with Merrett, Stoll and Ellman regarding section 365 consent rights (0.70); communicate with Edel regarding Ohio coal lease's executory status (0.20); revise Oxford sale order (1.30).		
01/25/19	J D STOLL	1.50	600.00
	Confer with Reynolds regarding Wyoming regulations (0.20); research Wyoming regulations and anti-assignment act case law (1.30).		
01/25/19	O S ZELTNER	0.30	180.00
	Communications with Hoffmann, Hunter, Podolsky regarding tax issues related to Kemmerer asset sale.		
01/26/19	J N EDEL	0.20	105.00
	Communicate with Hoffmann regarding contract counterparty request for adequate assurance.		
01/26/19	T P FITZSIMONS	2.10	2,047.50
	Review and revise tender offer documents (1.70); correspondence with Jones Day team regarding same (0.40).		
01/27/19	J N EDEL	0.40	210.00
	Various communications with Lennox, Hoffmann, Reynolds, Johnson regarding objections to contract schedules.		
01/27/19	T HOFFMANN	0.80	780.00
	Review/analyze EPA comments (0.30); communicate with Tenenbaum (EPA) regarding comments (0.10); communicate with Lennox regarding sale and cure objections (0.10); review/analyze informal objections and related issues (0.30).		
01/28/19	Z R BURKART	1.50	675.00
	Review data site (0.50); discussion with Hunter regarding closing deliverables (0.20); discussion with Hunter, FitzSimons and bidder regarding closing issues (0.50); review and revise officer's certificates and assignment and assumption agreements (0.30).		

01/28/19	J N EDEL	5.00	2,625.00
	Various communications with Lennox, Hoffmann, Reynolds, Zeltner regarding sale and bidding procedures hearings and preparations therefor (1.20); various communications with Johnson, Stenger (Contract Counterparty), Koenig, Migares-Shafai (both K&E) regarding inquiry related to assumption and assignment of agreement (0.90); review and analyze information related to same and additional contract inquiries (0.70); review and analyze summary chart of objections to Oxford Sale (0.30); participate in call with Green, Esposito (both A&M), Hoffmann, potential bidder regarding executory contract schedule (0.20); various communications with Hoffmann, Hilderbrand regarding good faith purchasers under section 363 and related causes of action (0.50); research regarding same (1.20).		
01/28/19	T P FITZSIMONS	4.80	4,680.00
	Telephone conference with Hunter regarding status of bonding (0.20); conference call with Ohio Department of Natural Resources regarding bonding (0.70); telephone conference with Hunter regarding bonding in light of Ohio Department of Natural Resources (0.30); office conference with Hoffmann regarding bidding procedures (0.50); telephone conference with Hunter regarding auction process (0.50); call with Jones Day bankruptcy team regarding auction process and bonding (0.80); call with Hoffmann and Hunter regarding auction process (0.40); telephone conference with bidder counsel regarding bonding (0.30); conference call with Lennox regarding bidder counsel call (0.40); conference call with Michelletti (WLB) regarding ARO liability (0.70).		
01/28/19	J C GORDON	0.30	135.00
	Call with Reynolds regarding Oxford sale objections (0.10); draft chart (0.20).		
01/28/19	M M HILDERBRAND	0.30	127.50
	Telephone calls with Edel discussing research project regarding section 363 sale issues.		
01/28/19	T HOFFMANN	7.30	7,117.50
	Review/analyze issues relating to deposits (0.20); communicate with Hutchinson (WLB), Farrell (A&M) and Vitale (A&M) regarding deposits (0.20); communicate with Tenenbaum (EPA) regarding sale order language (0.50); review/analyze committee issues to Oxford sale (0.20); review/analyze issues relating to Oxford executory contracts (0.90); communicate with Corcoran regarding executory contract issues (0.20); communicate with Farrell (A&M) and Esposito (A&M) regarding executory contracts (0.40); communicate with Lennox, Hunter and FitzSimons regarding bonding issues (0.30); communicate with bidder counsel, FitzSimons and Hunter regarding bonding issues (0.50); review/analyze issues relating to Kemmerer tax liability and assumed liabilities in connection with Kemmerer sale transaction (0.50); participate in conference call with Hunter, FitzSimons, Corcoran and Micheletti (WLB) regarding bonding (1.00); review/analyze issues and caselaw relating to adequate assurance (1.30); review/analyze issues relating to bonding (1.10).		
01/28/19	K P HOLEWINSKI	1.20	1,290.00
	Call with Reynolds on ARO points raised by Ohio (0.20); review research regarding same (0.20); review and comment on DOJ edits to sale order and email memo to Reynolds on same (0.80).		
01/28/19	G M HUNTER	8.70	6,960.00
	Internal correspondence and calls regarding Ohio Department of Natural Resources matters pertaining to bidder bid and approval (0.90); call with Ohio Department of Natural Resources regarding bidder bid and related issues (0.60); attention to AEP objection notice and various related correspondence (0.50); numerous calls and correspondence with Jones Day and Lazard working groups pertaining to bidder bid, Ohio Department of Natural Resources matters and related bid process matters (3.00); call with WLB personnel pertaining to reclamation liabilities (0.80); follow-up calls with Jones Day working group pertaining to reclamation matters and various process matters (1.00); review and provide report on certain privileged aspects of bidder asset purchase agreement matters and correspondence related to same (1.90).		
01/28/19	A P JOHNSON	5.40	2,430.00
	Draft objection charts for Oxford sale and Kemmerer bidding procedures (1.80); research sale requirements in 5th Circuit (3.60).		
01/28/19	H LENNOX	4.00	5,400.00
	Multiple communications with JD team regarding Oxford and Kemmerer hearings, potential Oxford bidder, bidder bonding, auctions and preparations for same (2.80); conferences with Pesce (K&E), Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee), Cowan (Lazard), Hillman (SRZ) regarding same (1.20).		

Asset Disposition		Page 26	
01/28/19	H P OSTER Meet with Edel, Podolsky, and Burkart regarding bills of sale and contract assignment for Oxford asset sale (0.50); attention to communications with client and deal team regarding same (0.40).	0.90	360.00
01/28/19	O B PEDERSEN Meet with Edel regarding motion for the sale of Kemmerer assets hearing summary (0.30); meet with Reynolds regarding motion for the sale of Kemmerer assets hearing summary (0.20).	0.50	200.00
01/28/19	M F PODOLSKY Review sale order and research precedent on ancillary agreements.	2.70	1,147.50
01/28/19	T REYNOLDS Communicate with Gordon regarding objection to Oxford sale motion (0.30); communicate with Hoffmann and Lennox regarding Oxford bid and auction issues (0.90); communicate with Hoffmann and Lennox regarding Ohio ARO issues (0.30); research regarding Ohio ARO issues (1.00); communicate with Corcoran and counsel for bidder regarding evidence of adequate assurance of future performance of assigned Oxford contracts (0.70); communicate with Hunter and Corcoran regarding evidence of adequate assurance of future performance of assigned Oxford contracts (0.30); communicate with counsel for DOJ regarding Kemmerer sale order edits (0.30); communicate with Lennox, Hoffmann, Corcoran, Fitzsimmons and Hunter regarding status of Oxford and Kemmerer sale processes (0.80).	4.60	2,645.00
01/28/19	J D STOLL Research Wyoming regulations and anti-assignment act caselaw (0.90); draft memo regarding research (1.00).	1.90	760.00
01/28/19	O S ZELTNER Communications with Hoffmann, Corcoran, Reynolds and Edel regarding Oxford auction and related sale process logistics.	0.80	480.00
01/29/19	Z R BURKART Discussion with Edel, Podolsky and Oster regarding sale order and closing deliverables (0.30); review sale order regarding closing deliverables (0.20); review and revise bill of sale, contracts assignment and assumption agreement, lease assignment and assumption agreement, officer's certificates and precedent and discussions regarding the same (2.00).	2.50	1,125.00
01/29/19	J N EDEL Various communications with Lennox, Hoffmann, Corcoran, Reynolds, Zeltner regarding status of sale hearings and objections to same (0.80); communicate with Goodman (contract counterparty) regarding inquiry to assumption/assignment notice (0.40); review and analyze affidavits of service related to sale and bidding procedures motions and related declarations (1.40); various communications with Hoffmann, Reynolds, Corcoran regarding same (0.30); various communications with Lennox, Zeltner, Bicek regarding coordination of auction logistics (0.60); various communications with Hoffmann, Hilderbrand regarding research regarding section 363(m) (0.30); review and analyze research from Hilderbrand regarding same (0.50); research regarding same (0.60).	4.90	2,572.50
01/29/19	T P FITZSIMONS Telephone conference with bidder counsel regarding bonding (0.50); telephone conference with bidder counsel regarding auction process (0.20); schedules call (0.60); call with bidder regarding bonding alternative structures (0.60).	1.90	1,852.50
01/29/19	M M HILDERBRAND Research legal issues regarding standards of approval of section 363 asset sales in the Fifth Circuit.	5.80	2,465.00
01/29/19	M M HILDERBRAND Draft memorandum regarding standards of approval of section 363 asset sales in the Fifth Circuit.	3.00	1,275.00
01/29/19	T HOFFMANN Review/analyze replacement bonding issues (0.70); communicate with Koenig (K&E) and Reynolds regarding sureties proposed sale order language (0.40); participate in conference call with bidder counsel, Hunter and FitzSimons regarding sale process (0.60); review/analyze potential objections from various parties and related issues (1.00); review/analyze issues relating to Oxford sale structure and related issues (2.00); review/analyze issues with respect to Ohio bonding pool (0.50); participate in conference call with bidders counsel, Hunter, FitzSimons and others regarding Oxford sale structure (0.60).	5.80	5,655.00

01/29/19	G M HUNTER	10.50	8,400.00
	Call with bidder regarding bankruptcy process (0.60); call with WLB personnel regarding Rogers Group litigation (0.40); call with WLB personnel regarding Kemmerer asset purchase agreement scheduling matters (0.50); further call with bidder regarding potential entity acquisition (0.60); various internal correspondence pertaining to equity acquisition and related bond pooling matters (1.20); calls with Lazard and internally regarding potential bidder bid (0.60); calls and correspondence with WLB and A&M relating to escrow arrangements in relation to potential bid (0.40); review and correspond regarding unsecured creditors' committee objection statement (0.50); attention to Ohio Department of Natural Resources matters and related statutory research, including internal calls and correspondence regarding same (2.90); call with Kirkland pertaining to regulatory approval matters (0.30); review and distribute real property deeds (0.30); meeting with Burkart pertaining to tangible property titling (0.20); review of existing bidder asset purchase agreement pertaining to privileged matters and related correspondence and calls internally in connection with regulatory approval matters (2.00).		
01/29/19	A P JOHNSON	7.10	3,195.00
	Research sale requirements in 5th Circuit (3.50); draft pleading for Oxford reply to adequate assurance objection (2.70); revise pleading for Oxford reply to adequate assurance objection (0.90).		
01/29/19	H P OSTER	2.00	800.00
	Draft officer's certificates for buyer and seller for Oxford asset purchase (0.30); attend call with deal team and client regarding disclosure schedules for Kemmerer asset purchase (1.20); search for Kemmerer permits in data room (0.20); proofread disclosure schedules (0.30).		
01/29/19	M F PODOLSKY	5.70	2,422.50
	Begin drafts of all ancillary agreements to the asset purchase agreement (2.90); prepare follow-up drafting chart and open items list following scheduling call (0.70); prepare updated shell disclosure schedule (0.70); consolidate communications and list of open items in preparation for scheduling call (0.50); attend call with Company regarding Kemmerer disclosure schedules (0.50); begin drafts of disclosure schedules (0.40).		
01/29/19	T REYNOLDS	6.70	3,852.50
	Review proposed rider to the Oxford sale order provided by surety parties (0.90); communicate with Hoffmann, Koenig (K&E) and counsel to surety parties regarding same (0.70); revise proposed rider to Oxford sale order provided by surety parties (1.00); communicate with Stoll regarding bidder research (0.10); communicate with Hunter and Edel regarding anticipated bids for Oxford (0.20); review research regarding section 365 consent rights (0.30); research regarding anticipated objections to Oxford sale motion (1.60); communicate with Corcoran, Hunter and Hoffmann regarding Oxford sale logistics (0.60); communicate with Morrison regarding bidder (0.10); communicate with Edel and Hoffmann regarding proposed auction rules for Oxford (0.30); revise omnibus reply to anticipated objections to Oxford sale motion (0.90).		
01/29/19	J D STOLL	1.40	560.00
	Confer with Reynolds regarding standing to object (0.10); research standing to object (1.30).		
01/29/19	O S ZELTNER	2.00	1,200.00
	Communications with Lennox, Reynolds, Edel regarding auction for Oxford assets and related sale issues (0.60); call with K&E, SRZ and Jones Day teams regarding Oxford sale hearing, Kemmerer bidding procedures hearing and related matters (0.50); communications with Lennox, Hunter, Podolsky regarding asset retirement obligation issues (0.30); communications with Hoffmann, Reynolds regarding bonding collateral (0.20); research and analyze documents regarding same (0.40).		
01/30/19	Z R BURKART	3.00	1,350.00
	Review and revise bill of sale, contracts assignment and assumption agreement and lease assignment and assumption agreement (1.50); review and revise officer's certificates (0.70); discussion with Hunter, Podolsky, Oster, FitzSimons and Lennox regarding closing (0.50); discussion with Hunter and Podolsky regarding closing (0.30).		

01/30/19	J N EDEL	10.10	5,302.50
	Various communications with Lennox, Hoffmann, Reynolds, Zeltner regarding status of case and necessary documents to prepare for auction (1.10); draft auction rules (2.10); draft auction script (2.70); various communications with attendees of auction regarding video conferencing and head counts (0.60); various communications with Hoffmann, Hilderbrand regarding good faith purchaser research (0.40); review and revise same (0.80); various communications with Pedersen, Alfano, Reynolds regarding hearing summaries (0.80); review and analyze same (0.30); various communications with Pesce, Koenig (both K&E), Cowan, Green (both Lazard) regarding auction rules (0.20); review and revise according to same (0.50); various communications with Cobb (Vorys Sater), Farrell (A&M), Hoffmann regarding New Lexington cure amounts (0.40); review and analyze Oxford contract communications tracker and communicate with Johnson regarding same (0.20).		
01/30/19	T P FITZSIMONS	3.40	3,315.00
	Advisors call (0.50); correspondence with Hunter (0.10); telephone conference with Hunter regarding bidder permitting issue (0.50); review and revise auction script (0.40); review bidder bid (0.50); conference call with WMLP advisors regarding auction (0.70); attention to bidder ability to provide bonding (0.30); telephone conference with Hunter regarding auction process (0.40).		
01/30/19	J C GORDON	0.80	360.00
	Draft and revise Oxford sale objection chart.		
01/30/19	M M HILDERBRAND	0.70	297.50
	Meet with Edel to regarding section 363 research.		
01/30/19	M M HILDERBRAND	6.50	2,762.50
	Research case law regarding section 363 sale approval standards in the Fifth Circuit.		
01/30/19	M M HILDERBRAND	3.30	1,402.50
	Draft memorandum regarding case law regarding section 363 sale approval standards in the Fifth Circuit.		
01/30/19	T HOFFMANN	7.40	7,215.00
	Review/analyze bid from alternate bidder (1.70); communicate with Lennox regarding alternate bidder (0.30); review/analyze research regarding bidder's ability to object to sale (1.20); communicate with Lennox regarding same (0.20); review/analyze research regarding 363(m) and related issues (0.50); review/analyze adequate assurance issues and related items (0.90); communicate with Corcoran and bidders counsel regarding adequate assurance and related items (0.50); participate in conference call with Hunter, FitzSimons, Podolsky, Edel, Corcoran and others regarding bonding and other items (0.40); communicate with Farrell (A&M) and Reynolds regarding executory contracts and related correspondence from counterparties (0.40); review/analyze issues relating to replacement bonds, sureties proposed sale order language and related matters (1.30).		
01/30/19	K P HOLEWINSKI	2.80	3,010.00
	Review materials regarding permitting issues (0.40); participate in call with Hunter and Lennox on permitting issues (0.50); review research regarding same (0.80); conference call with Murphy on question and issues (0.20); review related communications from Murphy from prior conversations with Ohio on bonding issues (0.20); communications with Hunter on call with Ohio regarding permitting (0.10); review draft email from Murphy on Ohio Permit block issues and communications with Hunter on same (0.50); review communications from Kirkland and Lazard on Ohio Department of Natural Resources issues and call (0.10).		
01/30/19	G M HUNTER	10.40	8,320.00
	Various calls with counsel to bidder concerning bonding, checklist matters, and various other closing and auction matters, and preparation of report regarding same to Jones Day and Lazard teams (1.00); calls and correspondence relating to permitting issue, including review of applicable statutes, and review of acquisition documentation (2.90); call with bidder regarding same (0.50); various correspondence with Jones Day and Lazard teams relating to same and Ohio Department of Natural Resources matters (1.00); review of topping bid submitted by bidder (0.70); call with Jones Day and Lazard teams regarding same (0.60); call with Murphy regarding permitting matters (0.50); call with bidder counsel regarding bond pooling matter (0.40); continued calls and correspondence regarding permitting and updated bidder bid (1.90); call with parent counsel regarding parent lender comments to existing asset purchase agreement (0.50); call with FitzSimons regarding same (0.40).		

Asset Disposition		Page 29	
01/30/19	A P JOHNSON Research sale approval requirements (2.70); revise pleading for Oxford Reply to Adequate Assurance Objection requirements for motion (1.80); revise Oxford cure objections chart (1.10).	5.60	2,520.00
01/30/19	H LENNOX Multiple conferences with Corcoran, JD team regarding status of sales discussions and preparations for auction and hearing (1.00); various communications with Hillman (SRZ), Pesce (K&E), Slade, Manoukian (SRZ) regarding same (0.40); multiple communications with Pesce (K&E) and JD team regarding permit matters for Oxford/Buckingham sale (1.60); review and revise language for Kemmerer order (0.40); review and revise auction script and notice of successful bidder (0.90); communications with Hoffmann, Edel regarding same (0.70); review new bidder bid (0.40); conferences with Brescia (Zurich counsel) and Hoffmann regarding sureties and collateral (0.60).	6.00	8,100.00
01/30/19	J K MURPHY Research regarding permitting issues (1.00); conference with Holewinski and Hunter regarding same (0.50); prepare memo regarding same (5.50).	7.00	5,425.00
01/30/19	H P OSTER Edit officer's certificates for Oxford asset purchase (0.20); attend catch-up call with deal team (0.50); cross check list of bonds for Oxford asset purchase agreement (0.90).	1.60	640.00
01/30/19	O B PEDERSEN Draft summary of sales motion for the hearing on motion to sell Kemmerer (2.50); edit summary of sales motion for the hearing on motion to sell Kemmerer (3.30); review file to ensure completeness of hearing binder (0.50); communicate with Edel regarding hearing summary content and format (0.20).	6.50	2,600.00
01/30/19	M F PODOLSKY Review and analyze bidder bid and related documents (1.40); continue to draft ancillary agreements to asset purchase agreement (0.70); call with bankruptcy team to discuss permitting issues and asset purchase agreement (0.60); review and analyze memo regarding permitting issues (0.60).	3.30	1,402.50
01/30/19	T REYNOLDS Communicate with Hoffmann and Lennox regarding auction details (0.20); research regarding adequate assurance standards in the Fifth Circuit (0.90); draft notice of successful bidder (1.60); communicate with Hunter, FitzSimons, Lennox and Hoffmann regarding Oxford auction status (0.60); research regarding bidder standing (0.90); communicate with Alvarez & Marsal regarding executory contract assumption (0.20); revise Oxford sale order (0.50); communicate with Lennox and counsel for sureties regarding Oxford sale order (0.30).	5.20	2,990.00
01/30/19	J D STOLL Research standing to object (0.40); draft memo with research findings (0.80); follow-up e-mail on caselaw (0.20).	1.40	560.00
01/30/19	O S ZELTNER Participate in planning call with Jones Day team regarding Oxford auction and February 4 hearing (0.50); communications with Lennox, Corcoran, Hoffmann regarding Oxford permitting and bonding issues (0.40); analyze statutes and case law regarding same (0.80).	1.70	1,020.00
01/31/19	Z R BURKART Review alternative bid materials (0.30); review correspondence from Ruebensaal regarding deeds (0.20).	0.50	225.00
01/31/19	J N EDEL Various communications with Hoffmann, Hildebrand regarding good faith purchaser research (0.40); review and revise same (0.80); review and revise auction rules to conform to K&E comments to auction script (0.30); various communications with Lennox, FitzSimons, Hoffmann, Hunter, Reynolds, Zeltner regarding same (0.50); communicate with Hillman, Kweskin (both SRZ), Pesce, Koenig (both K&E), Green, Cowan (both Lazard) regarding revisions to auction script and rules (0.50); review and revise same per various rounds of comments (1.80); various communications with Hoffmann, Spekhart (Ohio CAT Counsel) regarding Ohio CAT contracts (0.50); communicate with Podolsky regarding potentially assumed agreements (0.20); various communications with Hoffmann, Johnson, Reynolds regarding contract objections (0.40); participate in conference all regarding pre-auction matters (0.40).	5.80	3,045.00
01/31/19	T P FITZSIMONS Conference call with committee (0.70); call regarding Ohio Department of Natural Resources issues (0.30); conference call with State of Ohio (0.80).	1.80	1,755.00

01/31/19	T HOFFMANN	5.90	5,752.50
	Review/analyze Oxford bidding procedures, successful bid notice and other matters pertaining to auction (1.50); communicate with Lennox regarding baseline bid and related matters (0.50); review/analyze baseline bid (0.70); review/revise proposed sale order language from sureties (1.40); communicate with Cowan, Green (both Lazard) and FitzSimons regarding permit issues and other matters relating to bids (0.30); communicate with Lennox regarding permit matters (0.20); review/analyze matters relating to permitting and bonding (0.40); communicate with Lennox, Hunter, Pesce, Koenig (both K&E), Corcoran and FitzSimons regarding permitting issues (0.40); communicate with Lennox, Hunter, FitzSimons, Pesce, Koenig (both K&E), Murphy, Kern (Ohio AG), Tenenbaum (EPA), Ramos (Ohio DNR) and others regarding permits (0.50).		
01/31/19	K P HOLEWINSKI	1.50	1,612.50
	Review communications from Hunter on Ohio Department of Natural Resources issues (0.40); review correspondence from bidder's counsel on permitting issues (0.60); prepare response to JD team on permitting questions and bidder's responses and review related communication from Lennox and Hunter on same (0.50).		
01/31/19	G M HUNTER	7.50	6,000.00
	Attention to numerous aspects of Ohio Department of Natural Resources review and approval process, including calls with all parties (including Ohio Department of Natural Resources and Ohio Attorney General) pertaining to process and correspondence regarding same (5.00); various calls and correspondence with counsel to parent regarding asset purchase agreement matters in advance of auction in relation to requested amendments (1.00); various preparation related to auction and procedures, including calls with Jones Day and Lazard working groups (1.50).		
01/31/19	A P JOHNSON	1.90	855.00
	Update Oxford cure objections chart.		
01/31/19	H LENNOX	5.20	7,020.00
	Review/analyze and revise auction rules, auction script, potential Oxford sale order language to resolve objections (0.90); multiple communications with Jones Day team regarding various bidder and auction issues (0.60); conference with JD team and Pesce (K&E) and Koenig regarding Ohio Department of Natural Resources matters (0.40); conference call with JD team, K&E team, Ohio Department of Natural Resources regarding Oxford/Buckingham sale issues (0.80); follow-up calls with Pesce (K&E), Hillman (SRZ), Hoffmann, Cowan (Lazard), Hunter regarding same (1.10); communications with Hoffmann, Koenig regarding notifications of qualified and baseline bids (0.40); review research regarding bidders (0.50); add up call with JD team regarding auction (0.50).		
01/31/19	J K MURPHY	6.00	4,650.00
	Prepare for and participate in call with Ohio Department of Natural Resources and other state regulators regarding permitting issue (1.00); review of information from bidder regarding same (0.50); prepare summary of same (4.50).		
01/31/19	H P OSTER	0.10	40.00
	Attention to email regarding Oxford asset sale.		
01/31/19	M F PODOLSKY	0.80	340.00
	Review bidder list of bonds against current bond schedule.		
01/31/19	T REYNOLDS	5.20	2,990.00
	Communicate with Lennox, Barrios and Hoffmann regarding Oxford auction details (0.30); revise Oxford hearing summary (2.10); communicate with Koenig (K&E) and counsel for surety parties regarding Oxford sale (0.90); communicate with counsel for Komatsu Financial Limited Partnership regarding objection (0.30); research regarding same (0.30); revise notice of successful bid (0.30); communicate with Corcoran regarding auction status (0.20); communicate with Hoffmann and qualified bidders regarding baseline bid at Oxford/Buckingham auction (0.60); analyze objection of Hopedale Mining (0.20).		
01/31/19	O S ZELTNER	0.50	300.00
	Participate in call with Jones Day restructuring and M&A teams regarding Oxford auction and sale-related tasks.		
	TOTAL	1,184.70	USD 850,830.00

01/02/19	A P JOHNSON	1.50	675.00
	Update work in process report (1.00); schedule January conference calls to discuss work progress and updates (0.50).		
01/03/19	J N EDEL	2.60	1,365.00
	Participate in call with Lennox, Hoffmann, Wilson, Corcoran, Zeltner, Reynolds, Perez, Johnson regarding status of work streams and plan going forward (1.40); various follow up communications with Zeltner, Reynolds regarding same (0.70); review and analyze documentation related to same (0.50).		
01/03/19	T HOFFMANN	1.10	1,072.50
	Participate in conference call regarding open work streams with Lennox, Zeltner, Wilson, Edel and Reynolds (0.60); review/analyze various work streams and related documents (0.50).		
01/03/19	A P JOHNSON	1.50	675.00
	Discuss current status and assignment of work streams with Lennox, Hoffmann, Edel, Zeltner, and Reynolds.		
01/03/19	H LENNOX	1.90	2,565.00
	Review/analyze work in process report (0.20); multiple communications with Hoffmann, Zeltner, Corcoran, Wilson, Hunter regarding items for immediate attention and planning for sale and wind up items (1.70).		
01/03/19	I M PEREZ	1.00	500.00
	Participate on call with Lennox, Hoffmann, Wilson, Edel, Reynolds and Johnson to discuss next steps on asset sale, plan and disclosure statement, and other WMLP issues.		
01/03/19	T A WILSON	2.50	2,437.50
	Communicate with Zeltner regarding case status, upcoming deadlines, and strategy overview (1.00); review and analyze work in process report and background information (0.20); participate in conference call with Lennox, Hoffmann, Zeltner regarding case status, upcoming deadlines, and strategy overview (1.30).		
01/03/19	O S ZELTNER	1.40	840.00
	Participate in all hands call regarding case matters, including sale process, intercompany claims issues and case strategy.		
01/04/19	C L SMITH	0.10	35.00
	Obtain and distribute pleadings to Lennox, Zeltner, Hoffmann and Perez.		
01/07/19	A P JOHNSON	0.25	112.50
	Revise work in process report.		
01/08/19	J N EDEL	0.80	420.00
	Review and analyze work in process report in advance of Jones Day weekly conference call (0.30); participate in conference call regarding same (0.50).		
01/08/19	T P FITZSIMONS	0.50	487.50
	Conference call with Jones Day regarding work in progress.		
01/08/19	G M HUNTER	0.50	400.00
	Attend work in process teleconference regarding status of numerous workstreams.		
01/08/19	A P JOHNSON	5.00	2,250.00
	Schedule conference call and circulate conference call documents (0.30); participate in conference call with Lennox, Hoffmann, Zeltner, Reynolds, and Edel to discuss project updates (0.50); revise and update work in process report (3.70); call with Hoffmann to discuss revisions to work in process report (0.50).		
01/08/19	I M PEREZ	0.50	250.00
	Participate in work in progress call with Lennox, Hoffmann, FitzSimons, Hunter, Johnson, Podolsky, Corcoran, Edel, Wilson and Reynolds.		
01/08/19	M F PODOLSKY	0.50	212.50
	Attend work in process call on WMLP.		
01/08/19	T REYNOLDS	0.50	287.50
	Attend work in progress call.		

Case Administration			Page 2
01/08/19	O S ZELTNER	0.50	300.00
	Participate in weekly work in process call.		
01/09/19	A P JOHNSON	1.50	675.00
	Revise work in process report.		
01/09/19	C L SMITH	0.10	35.00
	Obtain and distribute pleading to Lennox, Zeltner, Hoffmann, Perez and Johnson.		
01/14/19	T HOFFMANN	0.90	877.50
	Review/revise work in process report (0.80); communicate with Johnson regarding updates (0.10).		
01/14/19	A P JOHNSON	1.10	495.00
	Revise work in process report in advance of conference call.		
01/14/19	I M PEREZ	0.50	250.00
	Prepare pro hac vice motion and ECF registration form for Corcoran (0.20); draft notice of appearance for Corcoran (0.30).		
01/14/19	C L SMITH	0.10	35.00
	Communications with Perez regarding Corcoran pro hac vice.		
01/15/19	M C CORCORAN	0.40	340.00
	Attend internal work in progress call.		
01/15/19	J N EDEL	0.60	315.00
	Participate in weekly status call (0.40); review and analyze work in process in preparation for same (0.20).		
01/15/19	T HOFFMANN	0.40	390.00
	Participate in work in process call with Reynolds, Edel, Zeltner, Wilson and Corcoran.		
01/15/19	A P JOHNSON	0.60	270.00
	Revise work in progress report.		
01/15/19	I M PEREZ	0.50	250.00
	Participate in work in progress call with Jones Day team.		
01/15/19	M F PODOLSKY	0.40	170.00
	Attend work in process call.		
01/15/19	T REYNOLDS	0.50	287.50
	Attend work in progress meeting.		
01/15/19	C L SMITH	0.20	70.00
	Communications with Corcoran regarding pro hac vice motion (0.10); prepare and e-file same (0.10).		
01/15/19	O S ZELTNER	0.70	420.00
	Attend weekly work in process call with Jones Day team (0.40); review and comment on work in process report (0.30).		
01/16/19	A P JOHNSON	0.60	270.00
	Revise work in process report.		
01/17/19	C L SMITH	0.30	105.00
	Review communication from Corcoran regarding pro hac vice order and obtain same form docket (0.10); prepare required attorney ECF registration (0.10); draft communication to Corcoran regarding same and next steps (0.10).		
01/18/19	A P JOHNSON	1.20	540.00
	Update work in process report.		
01/18/19	C L SMITH	0.20	70.00
	Communication to Court regarding attorney registration (0.10); communication to Corcoran regarding same (0.10).		
01/22/19	C L SMITH	0.20	70.00
	Communications with Corcoran regarding Court registration issues (0.10); communications with court regarding same (0.10).		

Case Administration			Page 3
01/22/19	O S ZELTNER	0.70	420.00
	Review case closing motion related to WLB subsidiaries and related documents (0.40); communications with Lennox, Laduzinski, Hunter regarding same (0.30).		
01/23/19	T HOFFMANN	0.70	682.50
	Review/revise work in process report.		
01/23/19	A P JOHNSON	1.50	675.00
	Revise work in process report.		
01/23/19	C L SMITH	0.20	70.00
	Communicate with Barrios regarding issues relating to Corcoran ECF registration (0.10); draft communication to clerk regarding same (0.10).		
01/24/19	M C CORCORAN	0.40	340.00
	Attend weekly work in progress call.		
01/24/19	J N EDEL	0.80	420.00
	Participate in weekly work in process call (0.50); review and analyze work in process report regarding same (0.30).		
01/24/19	T HOFFMANN	0.50	487.50
	Participate in work in process call with Lennox, Hunter, FitzSimons, Edel, Reynolds and others.		
01/24/19	G M HUNTER	0.50	400.00
	Attend internal work in process call.		
01/24/19	A P JOHNSON	0.50	225.00
	Participate in weekly status call with Lennox, Hoffmann, Zeltner, Reynolds, Edel, and Gordon to discuss status of various work streams.		
01/24/19	H LENNOX	0.40	540.00
	Participate in work in process call.		
01/24/19	I M PEREZ	1.00	500.00
	Participate in work in progress call with Jones Day and Alvarez & Marsal teams (0.50); prepare pro hac vice and notice of appearance for Hamilton (0.30); finalize notice of appearance for Corcoran (0.20).		
01/24/19	M F PODOLSKY	0.40	170.00
	Attend work in process call.		
01/24/19	T REYNOLDS	0.40	230.00
	Attend weekly work in progress call.		
01/24/19	C L SMITH	0.30	105.00
	Communications with Perez and Corcoran regarding notice of appearance (0.10); prepare and e-file same (0.10); review communications regarding pro hac vice motion for Hamilton (0.10).		
01/24/19	T A WILSON	0.50	487.50
	Prepare for and participate in work in process call with restructuring and corporate teams.		
01/24/19	O S ZELTNER	0.40	240.00
	Participate in weekly work in process call with Jones Day and A&M teams.		
01/26/19	H LENNOX	0.20	270.00
	Review/analyze WLB motion to close cases.		
01/28/19	A P JOHNSON	1.20	540.00
	Revise work in process report.		
01/29/19	I M PEREZ	0.50	250.00
	Coordinate filing of pro hac vice for Hamilton (0.10); revise draft of notice of appearance for Hamilton (0.20); coordinate service for objection and application filings (0.20).		
01/29/19	C L SMITH	0.20	70.00
	Communications with Perez regarding Hamilton pro hac vice motion (0.10); prepare and e-file same (0.10).		
01/31/19	A P JOHNSON	1.20	540.00
	Update work in process report.		

JONES DAY

Case Administration

Page 1

TOTAL	46.15	USD	28,482.50
--------------	--------------	------------	------------------

01/01/19	T HOFFMANN	0.80	780.00
	Review/analyze potential intercompany administrative claims (0.60); communicate with Lennox and Zeltner regarding intercompany claims (0.20).		
01/02/19	T P FITZSIMONS	0.70	682.50
	Correspondence with Jones Day team regarding term sheet (0.30); telephone conference with Hunter regarding tender offer, term sheet mark-up and process (0.40).		
01/02/19	H LENNOX	0.40	540.00
	Communications with Hillman (SRZ), Zeltner, Holewinski, Corcoran regarding administrative claims assertion and proof.		
01/02/19	I M PEREZ	2.20	1,100.00
	Discuss revisions to tender offer motion with Zeltner (0.20); revise motion accordingly (2.00).		
01/02/19	O S ZELTNER	6.20	3,720.00
	Communications with Lennox, Hoffmann regarding intercompany claims analysis (0.70); research and analyze case law, statutes and secondary sources regarding same (4.80); review and revise draft motion regarding same (0.50); communications with Perez regarding same (0.20).		
01/03/19	M C CORCORAN	0.20	170.00
	Review/analyze intercompany claims settlement proposal.		
01/03/19	O S ZELTNER	6.30	3,780.00
	Research and analyze case law, statutes, secondary sources and precedent documents regarding intercompany claim issues (5.90); communications with Lennox, Farrell (A&M) regarding same (0.40).		
01/04/19	I M PEREZ	1.70	850.00
	Review claims filed by government agencies against the WMLP debtors.		
01/04/19	O S ZELTNER	7.50	4,500.00
	Research and analyze case law, dockets and secondary sources regarding intercompany claims issues (4.20); outline arguments regarding same (2.40); communicate with Lennox regarding same (0.20); review and analyze Faas research regarding same (0.40); communications with Faas, Holewinski regarding same (0.30).		
01/05/19	J N EDEL	0.60	315.00
	Various communications with Lennox, Wilson, Zeltner regarding deadline to object to WLB plan confirmation regarding intercompany claims (0.30); review and analyze pleadings regarding same (0.30).		
01/05/19	H LENNOX	0.80	1,080.00
	Review/analyze research regarding admin claims (0.70); communications with Zeltner regarding same (0.10).		
01/05/19	O S ZELTNER	6.80	4,080.00
	Draft memorandum regarding intercompany claims issues (2.90); research and analyze case law and secondary sources regarding same (3.60); communications with Lennox, Corcoran regarding same (0.30).		
01/06/19	O S ZELTNER	3.70	2,220.00
	Draft application for administrative expense.		
01/07/19	T A WILSON	0.50	487.50
	Review and analyze letter from Schulte Roth regarding potential assertion of claims (0.20); communicate with Lennox, Corcoran, Zeltner regarding same (0.30).		
01/07/19	O S ZELTNER	8.20	4,920.00
	Communications with Lennox, Wilson, Corcoran regarding intercompany claims and related issues (0.60); review and analyze SRZ documents and letter regarding same (0.80); communications with Lennox, Wilson, Corcoran regarding same (0.50); draft application for allowance of administrative expenses (3.30); research statutes, case law and secondary sources regarding same (2.70); communications with Holewinski, Faas regarding same (0.30).		
01/08/19	T A WILSON	1.50	1,462.50
	Review and analyze draft complaint and draft administrative expense pleading prepared by lenders regarding potential claims (1.00); communicate with Zeltner regarding same (0.40); review and analyze response letter to lenders regarding potential claims (0.10).		

01/08/19	O S ZELTNER	1.30	780.00	Draft summary of Wyoming severance tax issue (0.80); communications with Lennox, Pesce (K&E) regarding same (0.30); communications with Farrell (A&M) regarding same (0.20).
01/08/19	O S ZELTNER	9.00	5,400.00	Draft application for allowance of administrative expenses (4.40); research case law, statutes and secondary sources regarding same (2.60); communications with Holewinski and Faas (0.30), Lennox (0.20), Hagreen (WMLP) (0.20) regarding same (0.30); communications with Corcoran regarding response to SRZ letter regarding intercompany matters (0.30); review and revise same (0.40); review and analyze SRZ comments to term sheet regarding intercompany issues (0.30).
01/09/19	M C CORCORAN	1.30	1,105.00	Prepare for and attend call regarding intercompany issues.
01/09/19	H LENNOX	1.00	1,350.00	Participate in call with WLB, WLB lenders, MLP lenders regarding intercompany issues.
01/09/19	T A WILSON	1.80	1,755.00	Prepare for and participate in conference call with Lennox, Corcoran, Zeltner, Schulte Roth personnel regarding asset retirement obligations and potential claims (0.60); review and revise application for allowance of administrative expense (0.90); communicate with Zeltner regarding same (0.30).
01/09/19	O S ZELTNER	9.60	5,760.00	Attend call with Lennox, Hoffmann, SRZ team regarding intercompany claims issues (0.50); draft and revise application for allowance of administrative expenses (3.80); communications with Lennox, Corcoran, Wilson regarding same (0.50); draft motion for approval of global settlement of intercompany issues (4.80).
01/10/19	M C CORCORAN	1.80	1,530.00	Develop comments to request for payment of administrative expense and communication with Wilson and Zeltner regarding same.
01/10/19	H LENNOX	1.60	2,160.00	Multiple conferences with Cowan (Lazard), Pesce (K&E), Hillman, Manoukian (both SRZ), Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee), Hoffmann regarding intercompany issues.
01/10/19	T A WILSON	0.20	195.00	Communicate with Zeltner, Corcoran regarding application for allowance of administrative expense.
01/10/19	O S ZELTNER	5.50	3,300.00	Draft motion for approval of global settlement of intercompany claims (3.20); communications with Lennox regarding same (0.20); revise application for allowance of administrative expenses (0.80); analyze case law regarding same (0.70); communications with Lennox, Corcoran, Wilson regarding same (0.30); communications with Hagreen (WMLP) regarding same (0.30).
01/11/19	H LENNOX	2.50	3,375.00	Multiple communications and conference calls with Pesce (K&E), Hillman (SRZ), Zide, Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee), Cowan (Lazard), JD team regarding potential settlement of intercompany issues (2.00); conference with Wilson regarding correspondence regarding same (0.20); review and revise draft of administrative claim request (0.30).
01/11/19	T A WILSON	4.80	4,680.00	Review and analyze correspondence and caselaw related to asset retirement obligations and related request for payment of administrative claim (1.30); communicate with Zeltner regarding same (0.10); draft letter regarding WLB parent regarding issues related to Oxford/Buckingham sale (3.20); communicate with Lennox regarding same (0.20).
01/11/19	O S ZELTNER	6.30	3,780.00	Draft motion for approval of global settlement of intercompany issues (3.80); research case law and precedent documents regarding same (0.90); communications with Lennox (0.20), Laduzinski and Jenull (0.20) regarding same; attend call with advisors to WMLP, Westmoreland Coal Company and their respective lenders regarding potential settlement of intercompany issues (0.70); call with creditor attorney regarding claims matters (0.30); communications with Hunter, Podolsky regarding settlement resolutions (0.20).
01/12/19	J J BRENNAN	1.80	1,080.00	Review intercompany settlement term sheet, outline revisions.

Claims Administration and Objections			Page 3
01/12/19	J J BRENNAN	0.60	360.00
	Draft summary of proposed revisions to intercompany settlement term sheet for Lennox.		
01/12/19	J J BRENNAN	0.50	300.00
	Conference with Kirschner regarding revisions to intercompany settlement term sheet.		
01/12/19	T HOFFMANN	2.60	2,535.00
	Review/analyze revisions to potential intercompany settlement term sheet (0.70); communicate with Lennox regarding term sheets and related items (0.40); participate in conference call with Lennox, Cowan (Lazard), Pesce (K&E), Mayer (Kramer Levin) and others regarding intercompany settlement term sheet (1.50).		
01/12/19	H LENNOX	5.60	7,560.00
	Review/analyze and revise intercompany claim term sheet (2.70); communications with Cowan (Lazard), JD team regarding same (0.70); review fees and costs for same for expense split for Hillman (SRZ) (0.50); all-hands conference call to discuss same (1.50); communications with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) regarding same (0.20).		
01/12/19	O S ZELTNER	9.30	5,580.00
	Draft motion for approval of global intercompany settlement (7.20); review, analyze and comment on draft intercompany settlement term sheet (0.50); communicate with Lennox (0.20), Hunter (0.20) regarding same; attend call with Jones Day team, Kirkland & Ellis, Schulte Roth and Kramer Levin attorneys regarding same (1.20).		
01/13/19	M C CORCORAN	1.10	935.00
	Prepare for and attend call on intercompany issues.		
01/13/19	T HOFFMANN	2.20	2,145.00
	Review/analyze intercompany settlement proposals and related issues (0.80); participate in conference call with Cowan (Lazard), Lennox, Pesce (K&E), Hillman (SRZ), Mayer (Kramer Levin) and others regarding intercompany settlement (1.40).		
01/13/19	H LENNOX	4.00	5,400.00
	Multiple communications with Cowan (Lazard), Tywoniuk, Horton, Kost (all Conflicts Committee) regarding intercompany claims term sheet (0.80); review and revise same (0.60); review Schulte term sheet (0.90); participate in all hands call regarding same (1.50); communications with review draft wind down budget from Campagna (A&M) (0.20).		
01/13/19	O S ZELTNER	7.10	4,260.00
	Draft motion for approval of global settlement of intercompany claims (3.40); research case law and dockets regarding same (1.70); attend call with Jones Day team, Kirkland & Ellis, Kramer Levin and Schulte Roth regarding same (1.20); review and analyze revisions to draft term sheet regarding same (0.30); review and analyze documents and communications regarding potential securities transaction regarding same (0.50).		
01/14/19	M C CORCORAN	0.60	510.00
	Prepare for and attend call on intercompany issues.		
01/14/19	H LENNOX	2.50	3,375.00
	Communications with Hillman (SRZ), Pesce (K&E) regarding intercompany claims term sheet (0.70); all hands call regarding same (0.70); follow-up communications an fact investigations regarding same (1.10).		
01/14/19	O S ZELTNER	8.30	4,980.00
	Draft and revise motion for approval of global settlement resolving intercompany claims (6.70); analyze case law and documents regarding same (0.80); communications with Lennox regarding same (0.20); attend call with Jones Day team, Kirkland & Ellis, Kramer Levin and Schulte Roth regarding same (0.60).		
01/15/19	J N EDEL	1.80	945.00
	Review and revise intercompany settlement motion (1.60); communicate with Zeltner regarding same (0.20).		
01/15/19	T HOFFMANN	0.40	390.00
	Participate in conference call regarding intercompany issues with Mayer (Kramer Levin), Yerramalli (Kramer Levin), Pesce (K&E), Hillman (SRZ), Lennox and others.		

01/15/19	H LENNOX	2.60	3,510.00	Review/analyze and revise WLB lender version of intercompany claim term sheet (1.30); participate in all hands call regarding same (0.60); multiple communications with Hoffmann, Hillman (SRZ), Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) regarding same (0.70).
01/15/19	O S ZELTNER	5.20	3,120.00	Attend call with Jones Day team, Kramer Levin, Kirkland & Ellis and Schulte Roth regarding intercompany matters (0.60); review and analyze revisions to draft term sheet regarding same (0.40); draft markup of revised term sheet (0.60); communications with Lennox and Hoffmann regarding same (0.30); revise motion to approve global settlement (2.80); communications with Hagreen (WMLP) regarding same (0.10); review data room documents and public filings regarding same (0.40).
01/16/19	H LENNOX	1.20	1,620.00	Multiple telephone conferences with Pesce (K&E), Hillman (SRZ), Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) regarding intercompany issues (0.40); review and revise administrative claim request (0.40); review and comment on new intercompany proposal (0.30); conference with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) regarding same (0.10).
01/16/19	O S ZELTNER	1.00	600.00	Communications with Lennox (0.20), Hillman (SRZ) (.10) regarding administrative claim request; revise same (0.20); revise motion for approval of global intercompany settlement (0.50).
01/17/19	M C CORCORAN	0.10	85.00	Communications with Lennox and Zeltner regarding WLB Debtors' black lung liabilities.
01/17/19	H LENNOX	2.10	2,835.00	Multiple conferences with Hillman (SRZ), Pesce (K&E), Mayer (Kramer Levin) regarding intercompany claims settlement (1.30); review and revise draft motion regarding same (0.80).
01/17/19	O S ZELTNER	5.00	3,000.00	Draft and revise motion for approval of global settlement of intercompany claims (0.90); communications with Lennox and Hoffmann, Pesce (K&E) regarding same (0.30); review and comment on resolutions approving same (0.80); communications with Podolsky regarding same (0.40); review and analyze comments to settlement term sheet (0.30); research data room documents and public filings regarding administrative expense claims against WMLP Debtors (0.70); communications with Lennox regarding same (0.20); communications with Kweskin (SRZ) regarding administrative expense application (0.30); review SRZ edits to same (0.30); communications with Lennox, Corcoran regarding same (0.40); analyze case law regarding same (0.40).
01/18/19	M C CORCORAN	1.90	1,615.00	Review/analyze SRZ comments to request for allowance of administrative expense for Oxford ARO and communication with Lennox, Hoffmann and Zeltner regarding same (1.20); communicate with Lennox regarding request for allowance of administrative expense for Oxford ARO (0.30); communicate with Hoffmann regarding request for allowance of administrative expense for Oxford ARO (0.20); communicate with Zeltner regarding request for allowance of administrative expense for Oxford ARO (0.20).
01/18/19	H LENNOX	3.60	4,860.00	Multiple conferences with Pesce (K&E), Hillman (SRZ), Yeramalli (Kramer Levin) regarding remaining intercompany claims issues (2.60); communications with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) regarding same (0.60); conference with Corcoran regarding administrative expense claims (0.40).
01/18/19	O S ZELTNER	3.50	2,100.00	Revise administrative claim application (1.70); communications with Lennox, Hoffmann and Corcoran regarding same (0.30); further communications with Lennox, Corcoran, Hillman (SRZ) regarding same (0.30); research statutes, rules and case law regarding same (0.80); attend call with Lennox, Brescia (Clark Hill) regarding surety issues (0.40).
01/19/19	M C CORCORAN	2.20	1,870.00	Develop request for allowance of administrative expense for Oxford ARO and communication with Zeltner regarding same (1.40); communications with Hillman (SRZ), Manoukian and Kweskin (all SRZ), Hoffmann and Lennox regarding request for allowance of administrative expense for Oxford ARO (0.80).
01/19/19	H LENNOX	2.00	2,700.00	Conferences with Pesce (K&E), Hillman (SRZ), Cowan (Lazard) regarding intercompany claims settlement (1.70); review and comment on administrative claim application (0.30).

01/19/19	O S ZELTNER	0.70	420.00
	Review revisions to administrative claim application (0.20); communications with Corcoran regarding same (0.20); review and analyze communications and case law regarding same (0.30).		
01/20/19	M C CORCORAN	0.40	340.00
	Communications with Hillman, Manoukian and Kweskin (all SRZ), Hoffmann and Lennox regarding request for allowance of administrative expense for Oxford ARO.		
01/20/19	H LENNOX	1.00	1,350.00
	Communications with Pesce (K&E), Cowan (Lazard), Hillman (SRZ) claims issues (0.60); communications with Corcoran, Schulte lawyers regarding administrative claim issues (0.40).		
01/20/19	O S ZELTNER	0.20	120.00
	Communications with Corcoran, Kweskin (SRZ) regarding administrative claim application.		
01/21/19	H LENNOX	0.30	405.00
	Review/analyze revised administrative claim request.		
01/22/19	H LENNOX	0.10	135.00
	Conferences with Hillman (SRZ), Pesce (K&E) regarding intercompany claims issues.		
01/23/19	T HOFFMANN	1.40	1,365.00
	Review/analyze issues relating to potential avoidance actions (1.10); communicate with Lennox, Corcoran and Zeltner regarding potential claims (0.30).		
01/23/19	H LENNOX	2.90	3,915.00
	Communications with Corcoran, Hillman (SRZ), Pesce (K&E), Zeltner regarding administrative claim (1.20); review edits thereto (0.40); communications with Pesce (K&E), Mayer (Kramer Levin), Hillman (SRZ), Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) regarding intercompany claim issues (1.30).		
01/23/19	O S ZELTNER	8.20	4,920.00
	Revise administrative expense application (1.70); review and analyze SRZ comments to same (0.30); communications with Lennox, Corcoran, Hoffmann regarding same (0.60); call with Corcoran and Kweskin (SRZ) regarding same (0.50); research statutes, case law and secondary sources regarding mechanic's lien claim issues in chapter 11 (5.10).		
01/24/19	H LENNOX	3.10	4,185.00
	Multiple conferences with Hillman (SRZ), Pesce (K&E), Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee), Hutchinson (WLB) regarding intercompany claims matters (2.40); conferences with Zeltner regarding administrative claim (0.30); review and revise same (0.40).		
01/24/19	O S ZELTNER	5.10	3,060.00
	Communications with Lennox, Hoffmann and Corcoran (0.40), Kweskin (SRZ) (0.20) regarding administrative expense application; revise same (1.20); research statutes, case law and secondary sources regarding mechanic's lien claim issues in chapter 11 (3.30).		
01/25/19	T HOFFMANN	3.20	3,120.00
	Review/analyze potential admin claim request and objection to WLB plan (1.00); participate in conference calls with Pesce, Koenig (both K&E), Hillman (SRZ), Mayer (Kramer Levin), Lennox and others regarding intercompany issues (0.80); review/analyze intercompany proposals (0.90); communicate with Lennox regarding proposals (0.50).		
01/25/19	H LENNOX	7.60	10,260.00
	Multiple conferences with parent, parent lenders, MLP lenders, advisors, Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) and other principals regarding potential intercompany settlement (6.60); communications with Zeltner regarding administrative claim (0.50); review and revise term sheet from Hillman (SRZ) (0.50).		
01/25/19	O S ZELTNER	5.10	3,060.00
	Review and comment on revised intercompany settlement term sheet (0.80); communications with Lennox, Hoffmann regarding same (0.20); research and analyze statutes, case law and secondary sources regarding Wyoming statutory lien issues (2.40); research case law and secondary sources regarding administrative expense application and related reply (1.70).		
01/27/19	H LENNOX	0.50	675.00
	Communications with Pesce (K&E), Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee), Hoffmann regarding status of intercompany settlement.		

01/28/19	H LENNOX	2.10	2,835.00
	Multiple communications with Hillman (SRZ), Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee), Pesce (K&E), Manoukian (SRZ), Corcoran, Mayer (Kramer Levin) regarding intercompany claims matters and potential settlement.		
01/28/19	O S ZELTNER	6.90	4,140.00
	Review omnibus claims procedures motion (0.40); communications with Lennox regarding same (0.10); revise application for allowance of administrative expenses (0.50); research case law and secondary sources for reply in support of same (2.80); communications with Lennox, Corcoran, Hoffmann regarding same (0.20); research statutes, case law and secondary sources regarding statutory lien issues in chapter 11 and under Wyoming law (2.90).		
01/29/19	T HOFFMANN	0.90	877.50
	Review/analyze intercompany term sheet (0.80); communicate with Lennox regarding term sheet (0.10).		
01/29/19	H LENNOX	6.80	9,180.00
	Review/analyze and mark-up term sheet from WLB lenders (1.00); multiple communications with Pesce (K&E), Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee), Mayer and Yeramalli (both Kramer Levin), Hillman (SRZ) regarding same (3.20); multiple communications with JD team, Hillman, Kweskin, Manoukian (all SRZ), Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) regarding administrative claim and related plan objection (2.60).		
01/29/19	O S ZELTNER	4.90	2,940.00
	Draft analysis of statutory lien issues under Wyoming law and chapter 11 (2.30); research case law and secondary sources regarding same (1.10); review revisions to intercompany settlement term sheet (0.30); analyze documents and legal issues regarding same (0.30); communications with Lennox regarding same (0.20); revise and finalize administrative expense application (0.40); coordinate filing of same (0.30).		
01/30/19	H LENNOX	1.80	2,430.00
	Multiple telephone conferences with Pesce (K&E), Hillman (SRZ), Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee), Mayer (Kramer Levin) regarding potential intercompany claims settlement and paths forward (1.20); review and comment on claims procedures (0.20); communications with Hillman (SRZ), Corcoran regarding administrative claim (0.40).		
01/30/19	O S ZELTNER	6.70	4,020.00
	Draft analysis of mechanics lien issues under Wyoming law and related chapter 11 statutes and case law (1.40); review and analyze cases and secondary sources regarding same (2.70); communications with Cottrell (Westmoreland Coal Company) regarding statutory lien claims (0.20); analyze documents regarding same (0.30); research case law and secondary sources for reply in support of administrative expense application (2.10).		
01/31/19	T HOFFMANN	0.80	780.00
	Review/analyze issues relating to potential intercompany settlement and related term sheet (0.60); communicate with Lennox regarding intercompany settlement structure and related items (0.20).		
01/31/19	H LENNOX	3.20	4,320.00
	Multiple conferences with Pesce (K&E), Hoffmann, Mayer (Kramer Levin), Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee), Hillman (SRZ), Cowan (Lazard) regarding potential resolution of some or all intercompany issues (1.20); review and revise term sheet (2.00).		
01/31/19	I M PEREZ	0.20	100.00
	Discuss statutory liens under Wyoming law research with Zeltner.		
01/31/19	O S ZELTNER	1.20	720.00
	Research and analyze case law regarding statutory lien claims in chapter 11 (0.90); communications with Perez regarding same (0.30).		
	TOTAL	248.90	USD 203,800.00

01/02/19	G M HUNTER	1.10	880.00
	Prepare for and attend Conflicts Committee/WLB call (0.80); correspond with Lennox regarding same (0.30).		
01/02/19	H LENNOX	0.30	405.00
	Review/analyze and revise 1/2 minutes (0.10); prepare and send meeting notice and agenda for Conflicts Committee call (0.20).		
01/03/19	H LENNOX	0.60	810.00
	Participate in Conflicts Committee meeting.		
01/03/19	O S ZELTNER	0.90	540.00
	Attend weekly Conflicts Committee meeting (0.50); draft minutes of same (0.40).		
01/06/19	H LENNOX	0.10	135.00
	Review/analyze and revise meeting minutes.		
01/07/19	M C CORCORAN	0.30	255.00
	Review/analyze letter from WMLP Lenders regarding ARO claims and related materials and communication with Lennox, Wilson and Zeltner regarding same.		
01/07/19	M F PODOLSKY	0.20	85.00
	Compile Conflicts Committee meeting minutes for execution.		
01/08/19	M C CORCORAN	1.40	1,190.00
	Develop response to letter from WMLP lenders regarding ARO claims and communication with Lennox, Wilson and Zeltner regarding same.		
01/08/19	H LENNOX	1.60	2,160.00
	Conference call with Cowan (Lazard), Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) regarding demand letter from MLP lenders (0.50); review and revise response to same (0.80); telephone conference with Hillman (SRZ) regarding same (0.30).		
01/08/19	H LENNOX	0.70	945.00
	Conferences with FitzSimons, Hunter regarding board materials (0.20); review prior presentations (0.20); prepare meeting notice (0.30).		
01/08/19	M F PODOLSKY	1.70	722.50
	Draft Conflicts Committee sale resolutions.		
01/09/19	H LENNOX	1.50	2,025.00
	Prepare notice and materials for Conflicts Committee meeting (0.90); telephone conferences with Green (Lazard) regarding same (0.20); update call with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) (0.40).		
01/10/19	G M HUNTER	1.00	800.00
	Attend meeting of Conflicts Committee.		
01/10/19	H LENNOX	1.90	2,565.00
	Update call with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) (0.30); participate in Conflicts Committee call (1.00); telephone conference with FitzSimons regarding board resolutions regarding bidder (0.20); review and revise same (0.20); communications regarding scheduling next board meetings (0.20).		
01/10/19	M F PODOLSKY	1.00	425.00
	Attend telephone Conflicts Committee meeting.		
01/10/19	O S ZELTNER	1.70	1,020.00
	Attend telephonic Conflicts Committee meeting (1.00); draft minutes of same (0.70).		
01/11/19	T P FITZSIMONS	0.50	487.50
	Review and revise board materials.		
01/11/19	G M HUNTER	0.80	640.00
	Attend Conflicts Committee meeting.		
01/11/19	H LENNOX	1.20	1,620.00
	Review/analyze meeting minutes from Conflicts Committee meeting (0.20); prepare meeting notice (0.20); attend Conflicts Committee call (0.80).		

Corporate Governance and Board Matters			Page 2
01/11/19	O S ZELTNER	0.90	540.00
	Attend telephonic Conflicts Committee meeting (partial) (0.50); draft minutes of same (0.40).		
01/12/19	H LENNOX	0.10	135.00
	Review/analyze revised resolutions approving Oxford sale transaction.		
01/13/19	G M HUNTER	0.70	560.00
	Attend Conflicts Committee meeting.		
01/13/19	H LENNOX	0.50	675.00
	Participate in Conflicts Committee call.		
01/13/19	O S ZELTNER	0.70	420.00
	Attend telephonic Conflicts Committee meeting (0.50); draft minutes of same (0.20).		
01/14/19	T P FITZSIMONS	0.50	487.50
	Attend Conflicts Committee call.		
01/14/19	G M HUNTER	0.40	320.00
	Attend Conflicts Committee meeting.		
01/14/19	H LENNOX	0.50	675.00
	Participate in Conflicts Committee meeting.		
01/14/19	O S ZELTNER	0.80	480.00
	Attend telephonic Conflicts Committee meeting (0.40); draft minutes of same (0.40).		
01/16/19	T P FITZSIMONS	0.50	487.50
	Conflicts committee call.		
01/16/19	G M HUNTER	0.50	400.00
	Attend Conflicts Committee meeting.		
01/16/19	H LENNOX	1.90	2,565.00
	Review/analyze and revise minutes from 1/11, 1/13 and 1/14 meetings (0.30); participate in Conflicts Committee call (0.50); follow-up call with Horton (0.30); follow-up with FitzSimons, Hoffmann (0.40); update call with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) (0.40).		
01/16/19	O S ZELTNER	0.90	540.00
	Attend telephonic Conflicts Committee meeting (0.50); draft minutes of same (0.40).		
01/17/19	T P FITZSIMONS	0.70	682.50
	Review and revise resolutions for Oxford sale.		
01/17/19	G M HUNTER	0.50	400.00
	Attend Conflicts Committee call regarding asset disposition process.		
01/17/19	G M HUNTER	0.40	320.00
	Review and provide comments to Conflicts Committee resolutions regarding intercompany settlement matters.		
01/17/19	H LENNOX	0.50	675.00
	Participate in Conflicts Committee call.		
01/17/19	M F PODOLSKY	4.30	1,827.50
	Draft resolutions approving intercompany settlement and tender offer.		
01/17/19	O S ZELTNER	0.80	480.00
	Attend telephonic Conflicts Committee meeting (0.50); draft minutes of same (0.30).		
01/19/19	G M HUNTER	1.00	800.00
	Prepare for and attend Conflicts Committee call regarding asset disposition (0.50); draft and revise minutes for same (0.50).		
01/19/19	H LENNOX	1.70	2,295.00
	Review two sets of committee minutes (0.20); prepare meeting notices (0.20); review and comment on board resolutions for intercompany settlement (0.60); review and comment on board materials regarding Oxford sale (0.20); participate in Conflicts Committee call (0.40); review minutes of same (0.10).		

Corporate Governance and Board Matters

Page 3

01/19/19	M F PODOLSKY	2.20	935.00
	Review limited partnership agreement and Conflicts Committee Charter and finish draft of intercompany settlement resolutions.		
01/20/19	T P FITZSIMONS	1.00	975.00
	Attend Conflicts Committee call.		
01/20/19	G M HUNTER	1.30	1,040.00
	Prepare for (0.30) and attend (1.00) Conflicts Committee call relating to approval of transaction.		
01/20/19	H LENNOX	2.80	3,780.00
	Review/analyze and revise resolutions or Oxford and other board meeting materials and circulate (0.80); communications with JD team, Lazard regarding same (0.80); prepare for (0.20) and participate in (1.00) Conflicts Committee call.		
01/20/19	O S ZELTNER	1.80	1,080.00
	Attend telephonic Conflicts Committee meeting (1.00); draft minutes of same (0.80).		
01/21/19	H LENNOX	0.40	540.00
	Participate in Conflicts Committee call.		
01/21/19	O S ZELTNER	0.80	480.00
	Attend telephonic Conflicts Committee meeting (0.40); draft minutes of same (0.40).		
01/22/19	H LENNOX	0.80	1,080.00
	Review/analyze and revise two sets of Conflicts Committee meeting minutes (0.50); conferences with JD team regarding same (0.30).		
01/24/19	T P FITZSIMONS	0.50	487.50
	Attend Conflicts Committee meeting.		
01/24/19	G M HUNTER	0.60	480.00
	Attend Conflicts Committee weekly status call.		
01/24/19	H LENNOX	0.50	675.00
	Participate in Conflicts Committee call.		
01/24/19	O S ZELTNER	0.90	540.00
	Attend telephonic Conflicts Committee meeting (0.50); draft minutes of same (0.40).		
01/28/19	H LENNOX	0.30	405.00
	Review/analyze and revise Conflicts Committee meeting minutes and prepare meeting notice.		
01/30/19	G M HUNTER	0.70	560.00
	Attend Conflicts Committee call.		
01/31/19	G M HUNTER	0.80	640.00
	Prepare for (0.20) and attend (0.60) Conflicts Committee call.		
01/31/19	H LENNOX	0.70	945.00
	Participate in Conflicts Committee call (0.60); review and revise minutes (0.10).		
01/31/19	O S ZELTNER	0.90	540.00
	Attend telephonic Conflicts Committee meeting (0.60); draft minutes of same (0.30).		
	TOTAL	54.30	USD 48,657.50

Court Hearings

Page 1

01/03/19	H LENNOX	0.80	1,080.00
	Appear for/attend (telephonically) court hearing (partial).		
01/16/19	H LENNOX	0.50	675.00
	Participate in court hearing regarding exclusivity motion.		
01/16/19	O S ZELTNER	0.40	240.00
	Attend hearing on exclusivity motion and case status update (telephonic).		
01/19/19	H LENNOX	0.40	540.00
	Conference call with Pesce (K&E), Slade (K&E), Corcoran regarding 1113 hearing.		
01/28/19	M C ALFANO	1.30	552.50
	Communicate with Edel, Barrios, Reynolds, and Pederson regarding summarizing pleadings and creating hearing binder (0.50); draft/compile same (0.80).		
01/28/19	M T BARRIOS	0.80	240.00
	Communicate with Edel and Reynolds regarding preparation of hearing binders.		
01/28/19	J N EDEL	1.30	682.50
	Various communications with Reynolds, Alfano, Pedersen, Barrios regarding hearing summaries and creation of hearing binders (0.80); review and analyze information related to same (0.50).		
01/29/19	M C ALFANO	4.20	1,785.00
	Review sale motion and draft sale hearing summary.		
01/29/19	M T BARRIOS	5.20	1,560.00
	Prepare indices for motion binders (2.10); revise indices and begin preparing binders for printing (3.10).		
01/29/19	H LENNOX	0.80	1,080.00
	Conference call with K&E, SRZ and JD teams regarding coordination for 2/4 hearing.		
01/29/19	O B PEDERSEN	3.50	1,400.00
	Draft summary of sales motion for the hearing on motion to sell Kemmerer assets (2.00); review sale motion to create a binder for sale hearing (1.50).		
01/30/19	M T BARRIOS	0.90	270.00
	Draft communication to Boritza regarding hearing binders (0.30); communicate with Alfano regarding edits to hearing binder index and revise same (0.30); revise indices for hearing binders (0.30).		
01/30/19	H LENNOX	0.80	1,080.00
	Call with K&E, SRZ and JD teams regarding preparations for 2/4 hearing.		
01/31/19	M T BARRIOS	0.70	210.00
	Prepare certificate of service and file witness and exhibit list and coordinate service of same (0.30); revise index and circulate same to Boritza (0.40).		
01/31/19	H LENNOX	1.20	1,620.00
	Participate (partial) in Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) preparation for 2/4 hearing (0.40); begin review of pleadings in preparation of 2/4 hearing (0.80).		
	TOTAL	22.80	USD 13,015.00

01/02/19	M C CORCORAN	0.50	425.00
	Review/analyze materials regarding potential 1114 claim and communicate with Edel regarding same.		
01/02/19	J N EDEL	2.50	1,312.50
	Various communications with Zeltner, Corcoran, Kirschner, Brennan regarding liabilities related to CBA (0.70); review and analyze existing research regarding same (0.50); research regarding same (1.30).		
01/02/19	C KIRSCHNER, JR.	0.10	110.00
	Review/respond to Brennan, Edel regarding arguments for potential pleadings.		
01/02/19	H LENNOX	0.50	675.00
	Telephone conference with Pesce (K&E) regarding WARN issues.		
01/02/19	O S ZELTNER	0.40	240.00
	Communications with Lennox, Edel regarding OPEB issues.		
01/03/19	J N EDEL	0.70	367.50
	Various communications with Corcoran, Zeltner regarding potential employment liabilities (0.40); draft summary of open items for call regarding same (0.30).		
01/03/19	H LENNOX	1.60	2,160.00
	Call with Pesce (K&E), Slade (K&E), SRZ lawyers regarding 1113/1114 motion and process (0.80); follow-up call with Pesce (K&E) (0.20); conference call with Mayer (Kramer Levin), Zide, Pesce (K&E) regarding WARN notices and labor transition issues (0.60).		
01/04/19	J J BRENNAN	2.90	1,740.00
	Telephone conference with Edel and Kirschner regarding potential company claims (0.90); attention to inquiries (0.20) from Podolsky regarding language in asset purchase agreement concerning WARN and new employee matters section (0.80); prepare WARN Act notice (0.60); review WARN Act notice prepared by lenders counsel, attorney conference with Kirschner regarding same (0.40).		
01/04/19	J N EDEL	4.40	2,310.00
	Research regarding employment issues (0.60); prepare materials for call (0.20); participate in call with Corcoran, Kirschner, Brennan, Zeltner regarding same (0.90); research regarding additional questions/information from call (0.80); various communications with Zeltner, Haggren (WMLP), Green (Lazard) regarding same (0.70); review and analyze information on data site regarding to same (1.20).		
01/04/19	C KIRSCHNER, JR.	1.60	1,760.00
	Prepare for and attend call with Brennan, Edel regarding potential 1114 pleading (1.00); review draft 1114 pleading (0.30); review/respond to Lennox regarding potential communications with employees (0.30).		
01/04/19	C KIRSCHNER, JR.	1.10	1,210.00
	Review/respond to communications with Lennox, Brennan regarding potential WARN Act notification and potential transactions (0.80); review draft WARN Act notification (0.30).		
01/04/19	H LENNOX	2.00	2,700.00
	Multiple communications with Pesce (K&E), Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) Hillman (SRZ), Cowan (Lazard), Jones Day team regarding potential WARN notices (1.30); review and revise same (0.70).		
01/05/19	C KIRSCHNER, JR.	0.50	550.00
	Review/respond to Lennox regarding list of employee issues.		
01/06/19	E KAPLAN	1.00	925.00
	Review draft 1113/1114 motion (0.90); communications with Lennox (0.10).		
01/06/19	C KIRSCHNER, JR.	2.30	2,530.00
	Review templates for WARN letters from Brennan (0.30); review DOL materials regarding components of notification letters in unionized setting (0.60); draft template WARN letter (0.70); draft message to Lennox regarding draft agreement (0.70).		
01/07/19	J J BRENNAN	1.10	660.00
	Review and revise draft letter to UWMA regarding collective bargaining agreement revisions.		
01/07/19	J N EDEL	1.20	630.00
	Various communications with Haggren (WMLP), Zeltner, Brennan regarding OPEB liabilities (0.70); review and analyze information related to same (0.50).		

Employee Matters			Page 2
01/07/19	E KAPLAN	0.50	462.50
	Review letter to UMWA (0.30); communications with Lennox (0.20).		
01/07/19	C KIRSCHNER, JR.	0.50	550.00
	Review draft 1113/1114 related papers.		
01/07/19	C KIRSCHNER, JR.	0.40	440.00
	Review/revise letter to union and draft messages to Brennan regarding same.		
01/07/19	H LENNOX	2.70	3,645.00
	Multiple communications with Pesce (K&E), Mayer (Kramer Levin), Manoukian (SRZ), Slade (K&E) regarding new UMWA proposal (2.60); review Kaplan comments regarding same (0.10).		
01/07/19	H LENNOX	1.20	1,620.00
	Multiple communications with Manoukian (SRZ), Cowan (Lazard) regarding 1113 motion and evidence.		
01/08/19	J J BRENNAN	0.30	180.00
	Conference with Edel concerning joint and several liability under federal labor law.		
01/08/19	M C CORCORAN	1.80	1,530.00
	Review/analyze draft 1113/1114 motion and communicate with Lennox regarding same.		
01/08/19	J N EDEL	0.40	210.00
	Various communications with Kirschner, Brennan, Zeltner regarding research and analysis regarding employee liabilities.		
01/08/19	H LENNOX	1.10	1,485.00
	Communications with Pesce (K&E), Manoukian (SRZ) regarding various 1113 and WARN issues (0.70); conference with Corcoran regarding 1113 motion (0.40).		
01/09/19	M C CORCORAN	4.70	3,995.00
	Develop comments to 1113/1114 motion and communication with Lennox regarding same.		
01/09/19	H LENNOX	1.40	1,890.00
	Review/analyze latest iterations of 1113 proposal (0.30); multiple communications with Pesce (K&E), Manoukian (SRZ), Gold (SRZ) regarding same (1.10).		
01/10/19	M C CORCORAN	2.40	2,040.00
	Develop comments to 1113/1114 motion and communication with Lennox regarding same (2.30); communications with Slade, Pesce (both K&E), Gold, Manoukian (both SRZ) and Lennox regarding 1113/1114 motion (0.10).		
01/10/19	H LENNOX	2.40	3,240.00
	Review/analyze and comment on 1113 motion.		
01/11/19	M C CORCORAN	1.30	1,105.00
	Review/analyze WMLP's lenders comments to 1113/1114 motion and communication with Lennox regarding same.		
01/11/19	E KAPLAN	0.30	277.50
	Review revised Section 1113 motion.		
01/11/19	C KIRSCHNER, JR.	0.20	220.00
	Review updated draft 1113 motion.		
01/11/19	H LENNOX	1.20	1,620.00
	Review/analyze lender changes to 1113 motion (0.40); communications with Corcoran and Pesce (K&E) regarding same (0.20); review and revise Cowan (Lazard) declaration (0.50); communications with Corcoran, Cowan (Lazard) regarding same (0.10).		
01/12/19	J J BRENNAN	2.30	1,380.00
	Review 1113 motion and outline notes and comments to same.		
01/12/19	M C CORCORAN	0.90	765.00
	Review/analyze revised 1113/1114 motion and communication with Lennox and Cowan (Lazard) regarding same.		

01/12/19	C KIRSCHNER, JR.	1.80	1,980.00
	Review/revise stipulation among employer groups (0.70); telephone call to Brennan regarding same (0.50); review revised draft from Brennan (0.30); review updated drafts of stipulation from Lennox (0.30).		
01/12/19	H LENNOX	2.10	2,835.00
	Review/analyze revised Cowan (Lazard) declaration (0.40); review revised 1113/1114 motion (0.90); edit same (0.40); conferences with Corcoran, Slade regarding same (0.40).		
01/13/19	C KIRSCHNER, JR.	0.30	330.00
	Review/respond to updated term sheet for stipulation among parties.		
01/13/19	H LENNOX	0.10	135.00
	Communications with Slade (K&E) regarding 1113/1114 motion.		
01/14/19	J J BRENNAN	0.90	540.00
	Draft analysis of 1113 motion and 1114 proposed order for Lennox.		
01/14/19	J J BRENNAN	0.80	480.00
	Telephone conference with bankruptcy team and counsel for Kramer, Levin, Schulte & Roth, and Kirkland.		
01/14/19	J J BRENNAN	0.40	240.00
	Review WARN Act side letter and draft assessment of same for Lennox.		
01/14/19	M C CORCORAN	1.50	1,275.00
	Communications with Lennox, Hoffmann and Zeltner regarding revisions to 1113/1114 motion (1.10); communications with Slade, French, Koenig, Pesce (all K&E), Lennox, Hoffmann, Zeltner and Cowan (Lazard) regarding 1113/1114 motion (0.20); review/analyze proposed order for 1113/1114 motion and communication with Lennox, Kaplan, Kirschner and Brennan regarding same (0.20)		
01/14/19	M C CORCORAN	0.20	170.00
	Communications with Zeltner (JD) regarding 1113/1114 motion.		
01/14/19	E KAPLAN	2.50	2,312.50
	Prepare for and participate in call regarding term sheet (1.30); review revised Section 1113 (0.70); send comments to Lennox (0.50).		
01/14/19	C KIRSCHNER, JR.	2.30	2,530.00
	Review/revise stipulation among parties (0.40); prepare for and attend all hands labor call (0.70); review/revise Section 1113 motion (0.70); review proposed order on 1113 motion (0.20); telephone call to Brennan regarding Section 1113 motion (0.30).		
01/14/19	H LENNOX	1.70	2,295.00
	Communications with Manoukian (SRZ) regarding labor issues (0.50); review communications from bidders regarding CBA issues (0.20); conference call with WLB, WLB lender and MLP lender representatives regarding labor issues among estates and in light of sales (1.00).		
01/14/19	O S ZELTNER	0.50	300.00
	Communications with Corcoran regarding revisions to section 1113/1114 motion (0.20); research data room documents regarding same (0.30).		
01/15/19	M C CORCORAN	2.60	2,210.00
	Prepare for and attend call with Slade (K&E) and Manoukian (SRZ) regarding 1113/1114 motion (1.00); communicate with Lennox regarding 1113/1114 motion (0.20); develop 1113/1114 motion and communication with Lennox regarding same (1.40).		
01/15/19	H LENNOX	0.30	405.00
	Review/analyze and revise draft 1113 order (0.10); telephone conference with Corcoran regarding call with Slade, Manoukian (SRZ) (0.20).		

01/16/19	M C CORCORAN	8.20	6,970.00
	Communicate with Manoukian (SRZ) regarding 1113/1114 motion (1.90); communicate with Slade (K&E), Manoukian (SRZ), Cowan (Lazard) and Vescio (Houlihan Lokey) regarding 1113/1114 motion (0.60); review/analyze motion to approve Kemmerer auction and communication with Hoffmann regarding same (1.20); develop 1113/1114 motion and communication with Lennox regarding same (2.80); communication with Slade, Pesce (both K&E), Manoukian (SRZ), Cowan (Lazard), Vescio (Houlihan Lokey), and Lennox regarding 1113/1114 motion (0.80); communication with Manoukian, Gold, Richman, Hillman (all SRZ), Cowan (Lazard), Vescio (Houlihan Lokey), and Lennox regarding 1113/1114 motion (0.70); communications with Slade and Yates (both K&E) regarding 1113/1114 motion (0.20).		
01/16/19	J N EDEL	0.30	157.50
	Various communications with Brennan regarding CBA, OPEB liabilities.		
01/16/19	H LENNOX	1.60	2,160.00
	Multiple communications with Corcoran, Cowan (Lazard), Manoukian (SRZ), Slade (K&E) regarding 1113 matters.		
01/21/19	H LENNOX	0.30	405.00
	Review/analyze Williams declaration and conferences with Corcoran regarding same.		
01/22/19	H LENNOX	0.60	810.00
	Conferences with Corcoran, Cowan (Lazard) regarding evidence for 1113/1114 hearing.		
01/23/19	J J BRENNAN	1.60	960.00
	Review NLRB precedent concerning potential waiver of joint employer claims.		
01/23/19	H LENNOX	0.70	945.00
	Communications with Pesce (K&E), Hillman (SRZ), Corcoran, Cowan (Lazard) regarding evidence for 1113 trial.		
01/24/19	J J BRENNAN	5.30	3,180.00
	Review NLRB interpretation of application of joint and several liability arising out of both a single employer or joint employer finding (2.70); review NLRB standards regarding CBA assignment issues (1.80); outline legal arguments regarding NLRA issues (0.80).		
01/24/19	H LENNOX	0.50	675.00
	Conferences with Slade (K&E), Pesce (K&E), Corcoran, Cowan (Lazard), Hillman (SRZ) regarding parent use of Kemmerer litigation exhibit.		
01/25/19	J J BRENNAN	1.80	1,080.00
	Begin draft of analysis of potential inter-company claims under federal labor law.		
01/29/19	O S ZELTNER	0.60	360.00
	Review stipulation and agreed order with HYG regarding equipment leases (0.20); communications with Bow and Weinhouse (both K&E) (0.20), Hunter and Reynolds (0.20) regarding same.		
01/30/19	P L ESCHBACH-HALL	0.30	277.50
	Review rules regarding controlled group liability for pension plans (0.10); communicate with Hoffmann regarding pension plan liability (0.20).		
	TOTAL	90.20	USD 82,977.50

01/02/19	N M FAAS	4.80	2,400.00
	Research Zeltner's follow up questions regarding SMCRA and send summary of research findings to Holewinski.		
01/02/19	K P HOLEWINSKI	1.70	1,827.50
	Review Zeltner memo regarding environmental liability and work on outline research issue to respond to same (1.50); communications with Faas on same (0.20).		
01/03/19	N M FAAS	4.00	2,000.00
	Communicate with Holewinski regarding follow up questions on SMCRA research (0.50); conduct additional research into Zeltner's follow up questions regarding SMCRA (3.00); send summary of research findings to Zeltner (0.50).		
01/03/19	K P HOLEWINSKI	4.20	4,515.00
	Review joint and several liability, citizen suit arguments and develop outline of arguments in response to case strategy questions by Zeltner (3.50); call with Zeltner on same (0.20); communications with Faas on draft arguments (0.50).		
01/04/19	O S ZELTNER	0.90	540.00
	Communications with Ramos (Ohio DNR), Idzkowski and Kern (both Ohio Attorney General's Office) regarding Oxford environmental issues (0.40); communications with Lennox, Hoffmann regarding same (0.50).		
01/05/19	K P HOLEWINSKI	1.90	2,042.50
	Respond to question from Hunter regarding compliance question (0.20); review SMCRA issues and forward information and memo on to team on same (0.50); follow up with Faas and Hido on same (0.30); conference call with Lennox and core team on schedule and case planning (0.90).		
01/07/19	K P HOLEWINSKI	0.30	322.50
	Communicate with Zeltner on admin claim questions via email.		
01/08/19	N M FAAS	2.30	1,150.00
	Review lenders' draft pleadings and check SMCRA citations for accuracy (1.80); send comments on pleadings and citations to Zeltner (0.50).		
01/08/19	K P HOLEWINSKI	2.70	2,902.50
	Review/analyze draft complaint of lenders and admin expense claim papers against parent (1.10); review select cases to provide comments on same to include direct and Clean Water Act claim (1.30); communications with Zeltner on same and review related emails (0.30).		
01/14/19	K P HOLEWINSKI	1.00	1,075.00
	Draft intercompany settlement motion (0.80); communications with Zeltner on same (0.20).		
01/16/19	K P HOLEWINSKI	0.20	215.00
	Respond to question on SMCRA question from Zeltner.		
	TOTAL	24.00	USD 18,990.00

01/02/19	L C FISCHER	6.50	3,412.50
	Review and analyze updated conflict inquiry reports covering all interested parties in connection with preparing the firm's first supplemental disclosure.		
01/02/19	L C FISCHER	1.00	525.00
	Review list of new parties submitted for inclusion in the firm's first supplemental disclosure as debtors' counsel (0.50); communication with Perez (JD) regarding same (0.50).		
01/02/19	I M PEREZ	4.50	2,250.00
	Draft summary of Jones Day's services during compensation period for fee application (2.30); draft legal standard for fee application (0.70); communicate with Fischer and Zeltner regarding supplemental declaration for retention application (0.20); review docket for updated interested parties (1.30).		
01/03/19	L C FISCHER	5.00	2,625.00
	Review and analyze conflict inquiry reports covering all interested parties in connection with preparing the firm's first supplemental disclosure as debtors' counsel.		
01/03/19	L C FISCHER	2.00	1,050.00
	Review list of new parties to be included in the firm's first supplemental disclosure (0.40); review inquiries relating to new matters and parties related to current interested parties in the chapter 11 cases (1.10); communication with Perez (JD) regarding same (0.50).		
01/03/19	I M PEREZ	1.00	500.00
	Draft and revise first interim fee application (0.80); communicate with Fischer regarding supplemental disclosure (0.20).		
01/04/19	I M PEREZ	0.80	400.00
	Revise budget for Jones Day's services.		
01/07/19	L C FISCHER	5.00	2,625.00
	Draft and revise list of new parties to be included in the firm's first supplemental disclosure (0.50); communications with Perez (JD) regarding same (0.50); review and analyze reports covering all interested parties for same (4.00).		
01/07/19	I M PEREZ	0.20	100.00
	Communicate with Fischer regarding supplemental disclosures.		
01/08/19	L C FISCHER	3.30	1,732.50
	Review and analyze updated reports covering all interested parties in connection with preparing the firm's first supplemental disclosure as debtors' counsel (3.00); initiate request for reports for new interested parties to be included in same (0.30).		
01/09/19	L C FISCHER	2.00	1,050.00
	Draft and revise disclosure documents for the firm's first supplemental disclosure as debtors counsel.		
01/09/19	I M PEREZ	0.50	250.00
	Draft supplemental declaration.		
01/10/19	L C FISCHER	6.00	3,150.00
	Draft and revise disclosure documents for the firm's first supplemental disclosure as counsel for the debtors (5.40); analyze conflict inquiry reports for same (0.60).		
01/10/19	I M PEREZ	3.20	1,600.00
	Review December billing statements and individual time entries to ensure compliance with applicable rules (0.50); revise draft of first interim fee application to include December time entries and amounts (2.50); discuss supplemental declaration with Fischer (0.20).		
01/10/19	O S ZELTNER	2.90	1,740.00
	Communications with Perez regarding interim fee application (0.20); review December invoice to ensure compliance with applicable rules (2.70).		
01/11/19	L C FISCHER	4.00	2,100.00
	Draft and revise disclosure documents for the firm's first supplemental disclosure as debtors' counsel.		
01/15/19	L C FISCHER	6.00	3,150.00
	Draft and revise disclosure schedules in connection with preparing the firm's first supplemental disclosure as debtors' counsel.		

Employment and Fee Applications			Page 2
01/15/19	I M PEREZ	0.10	50.00
	Discuss status of fee application and supplemental declaration with Zeltner.		
01/15/19	O S ZELTNER	4.80	2,880.00
	Draft and revise Jones Day first interim fee application (4.60); communications with Perez regarding same (0.20).		
01/16/19	L C FISCHER	3.80	1,995.00
	Draft and revise first supplemental disclosure document (2.00); communications with Perez regarding same (0.50); review and analyze additional reports for same (1.30).		
01/16/19	I M PEREZ	3.80	1,900.00
	Draft December fee statement (0.20); discuss supplemental disclosures with Fischer (0.20); review revisions to fee application (0.40); discuss revisions to fee application, December fee statement and supplemental disclosure declaration with Zeltner (0.80); draft supplemental disclosure declaration (2.20).		
01/16/19	O S ZELTNER	3.50	2,100.00
	Draft and revise Jones Day first interim fee application and related exhibits (2.70); communications with Perez regarding same and December monthly fee statement (0.80).		
01/17/19	H LENNOX	1.10	1,485.00
	Review/analyze December fees and expenses for reasonableness and compliance with guidelines.		
01/17/19	I M PEREZ	3.80	1,900.00
	Draft supplemental declaration to retention application (2.50); revise first interim fee application (1.30).		
01/17/19	O S ZELTNER	1.40	840.00
	Communications with Perez regarding first interim fee application (0.20); review and revise supplemental declaration to retention application (1.20).		
01/18/19	I M PEREZ	2.10	1,050.00
	Revise supplemental disclosure (0.30); revise first interim fee application to incorporate updated billing policies and updated amounts (1.80).		
01/18/19	O S ZELTNER	0.60	360.00
	Communications with Perez regarding supplemental declaration to retention application (0.20); review revisions to same (0.20); communications with Perez regarding first interim fee application (0.20).		
01/19/19	H LENNOX	0.70	945.00
	Review/analyze and revise supplemental disclosure.		
01/19/19	I M PEREZ	0.50	250.00
	Revise supplemental declaration to include edits from Lennox.		
01/19/19	O S ZELTNER	0.20	120.00
	Communications with Lennox, Perez regarding supplemental declaration to retention application.		
01/22/19	I M PEREZ	1.00	500.00
	Revise interim fee application to reflect final amounts and revise certification.		
01/22/19	C L SMITH	0.10	35.00
	Prepare for filing and e-file Jones Day supplemental disclosure in support of the firm's retention.		
01/22/19	O S ZELTNER	0.50	300.00
	Communications with Perez regarding first interim fee application (0.30); review revisions to same (0.20).		
01/23/19	I M PEREZ	0.40	200.00
	Revise first interim fee application to reflect final invoices.		
01/24/19	M T BARRIOS	0.20	60.00
	File December fee statement.		
01/24/19	O S ZELTNER	0.30	180.00
	Communications with Perez regarding December monthly fee statement (0.10); serve filed version on notice parties per interim compensation procedures (0.20).		
01/26/19	H LENNOX	1.20	1,620.00
	Review and revise first interim fee application.		

Employment and Fee Applications

01/29/19	I M PEREZ	0.50		250.00
	Review and provide comments on Lazard interim fee application.			
01/30/19	I M PEREZ	1.70		850.00
	Discuss edits to fee application with Zeltner (0.30), Lennox (0.30); review amounts to be included in certification in fee application (0.40); revise fee application per discussion (0.70).			
01/30/19	O S ZELTNER	0.30		180.00
	Communications with Lennox, Perez regarding interim fee application.			
01/31/19	I M PEREZ	0.50		250.00
	Revise first interim application for Jones Day (0.30); review and provide comments to Lazard fee application (0.20).			
TOTAL		87.00	USD	48,560.00

Financing and Cash Collateral

Page 1

01/02/19	H LENNOX	0.20	270.00
	Review/analyze Marinuzzi (MoFo) email to lenders regarding alleged unperfected collateral.		
01/06/19	H LENNOX	0.20	270.00
	Review/analyze unsecured creditors' committee demand letter.		
01/07/19	H LENNOX	1.80	2,430.00
	Review/analyze and revise cash collateral order draft from WLB regarding labor matters (0.60); telephone conference with Hillman (SRZ) regarding various interlender issues (0.40); review demand letter regarding same (0.30); telephone conferences with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee), Cowan (Lazard), Wilson regarding same (0.50).		
01/07/19	O S ZELTNER	1.10	660.00
	Review and revise draft cash collateral order stipulation regarding labor issues (0.80); communicate with Lennox regarding same (0.30).		
01/09/19	H LENNOX	0.60	810.00
	Review/analyze lender Cash Collateral Order stipulation (0.30); communications with Pesce (K&E), Manoukian (SRZ), Hillman (SRZ) regarding same (0.30).		
01/09/19	O S ZELTNER	0.20	120.00
	Review revisions to cash collateral stipulation regarding labor issues.		
01/10/19	H LENNOX	0.50	675.00
	Telephone conferences with Hillman (SRZ) regarding Cash Collateral Order deadlines, potential stipulation and related issues.		
01/11/19	H LENNOX	1.00	1,350.00
	Multiple communications with Hillman (SRZ), Zeltner, Hoffmann regarding revisions to Cash Collateral Order to extend sale milestones (0.70); review and revise draft stipulations regarding same and regarding labor (0.30).		
01/11/19	O S ZELTNER	2.40	1,440.00
	Draft second stipulation extending sale milestones in cash collateral order (1.40); communications with Lennox, Hoffmann, Corcoran (0.60), Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) (0.20), Hillman (SRZ) (0.20) regarding same.		
01/13/19	H LENNOX	0.30	405.00
	Communications with Hillman (SRZ), Marinuzzi (MoFo) regarding Cash Collateral Order with milestone dates.		
01/13/19	O S ZELTNER	1.20	720.00
	Communications with Lennox (0.20), Manoukian and Kweskin (both SRZ) (0.30), Pesce (K&E) (0.20), Marinuzzi (MoFo) (0.20) regarding stipulation extending sale milestones in cash collateral order; revise same (0.30).		
01/14/19	M T BARRIOS	0.30	90.00
	File second amended stipulation and communicate with Zeltner regarding same.		
01/14/19	H LENNOX	1.20	1,620.00
	Communications with Hillman (SRZ), Pesce (K&E), Zeltner regarding Cash Collateral Order amendment (0.20); telephone conference with Manoukian (SRZ) regarding WARN stipulation (0.50); call with WLB, WLB lenders, Manoukian (SRZ) regarding same (0.50).		
01/14/19	O S ZELTNER	0.90	540.00
	Finalize and coordinate filing of stipulation extending sale milestones in cash collateral order (0.50); communications with Lennox, Pesce (K&E), Kweskin (SRZ) regarding same (0.40).		
01/19/19	H LENNOX	0.10	135.00
	Communications with Manoukian (SRZ), Pesce (K&E) regarding Cash Collateral Order stipulation regarding employees.		
01/21/19	H LENNOX	0.90	1,215.00
	Review/analyze revised Cash Collateral Order stipulation (0.10); conferences with Pesce (K&E), Manoukian (SRZ) regarding same (0.80).		

Financing and Cash Collateral

Page 2

01/22/19	H LENNOX	0.40		540.00
	Communications with Pesce (K&E), Manoukian (SRZ), Zeltner regarding Cash Collateral Order stipulation and filing.			
01/22/19	O S ZELTNER	0.60		360.00
	Review and finalize cash collateral stipulation regarding statutory liabilities (0.30); coordinate filing of same (0.20); communications with Lennox regarding same (0.10).			
	TOTAL	13.90	USD	13,650.00

01/02/19	H LENNOX	0.20	270.00
	Communications with Marinuzzi (MoFo), Corcoran regarding unsecured creditors' committee depositions regarding intercompany issues.		
01/03/19	M C CORCORAN	0.10	85.00
	Communication with Aycock (K&E) regarding unsecured creditors' committee depositions.		
01/04/19	D W BERENS	0.70	297.50
	Meet with Corcoran to discuss preparations for upcoming hearing regarding Oxford/Buckingham sale (0.40); review and analyze rules of bankruptcy procedure 9014 and 6004 (0.30).		
01/04/19	M C CORCORAN	7.40	6,290.00
	Attend deposition of Campagna (A&M) and communication with Lennox, Hoffmann and Zeltner regarding summary of same (3.50); attend deposition of Bremer (Centerview) and communication with Lennox, Hoffmann and Zeltner regarding summary of same (3.50); communicate with Berens regarding Oxford sale hearing on other litigation issues (0.30); communication with Cowan and Green (both Lazard) regarding Oxford sale hearing (0.10).		
01/04/19	O S ZELTNER	1.60	960.00
	Attend (telephonically) Boyko deposition (partial) (1.30); communicate with Lennox, Hoffmann, Corcoran regarding depositions (0.30).		
01/05/19	D W BERENS	1.00	425.00
	Research and analyze Local Rules and case law governing introduction of witness testimony.		
01/06/19	D W BERENS	1.70	722.50
	Summarize requirements for introduction of fact and expert witness testimony in contested matter.		
01/07/19	D W BERENS	1.50	637.50
	Research and analyze Local Rule 9013-2 (0.20); conference call with Corcoran and Cowan and Green (both Lazard) to discuss bid procedures and sale process of Oxford and Buckingham mines (1.00); review and analyze materials sent by Green summarizing bid procedures and sale process of Oxford and Buckingham mines (0.30).		
01/07/19	M C CORCORAN	3.10	2,635.00
	Review/analyze research on potential ARO claims and communication with Lennox and Zeltner regarding same (0.60); prepare for and attend call with Cowan, Green (both Lazard) and Berens regarding Oxford sale hearing (1.30); review marketing materials for WMLP assets in preparation of Oxford sale hearing and communicate with Berens regarding same (0.90); communicate with Berens regarding Oxford sale hearing issues (0.30).		
01/08/19	D W BERENS	1.40	595.00
	Receive project for preparation of action list of outstanding evidence and witnesses to present in hearing in support of sale motion (0.40); research and analyze Complex Case Procedures (1.00).		
01/08/19	M C CORCORAN	3.40	2,890.00
	Consider arguments regarding ARO claims in draft adversary complaint and request for payment of administration expense (0.40); communicate with Zeltner regarding Oxford sale and ARO claim issues (0.30); communicate with Hoffmann regarding Oxford sale hearing (0.20); review/analyze joint motion to approve sale of Oxford and Buckingham (2.20); communicate with Berens regarding Oxford sale hearing (0.30).		
01/09/19	D W BERENS	4.10	1,742.50
	Review and analyze motion for sale of Oxford and Buckingham entities (1.00); review and analyze standards governing evidence and testimony needed for approval of sale of substantially all of debtor's assets in the Southern District of Texas (1.00); review and analyze Local Rules and General Orders regarding sales hearing in the Southern District of Texas (0.40); draft and review sales hearing checklist (1.00); take part in call with Corcoran and counsel for WMLP Ad Hoc Lender Group regarding issues concerning sale of Oxford and Buckingham entities raised in demand letter (0.70).		

01/09/19	M C CORCORAN	1.90	1,615.00
	Communicate with Zeltner regarding request for payment of administrative expense (0.20); prepare for and attend call with Kweskin, White, Skinner, Hillman (all SRZ), Morgan, Kennedy (both Dinsmore), Lennox, and Wilson regarding assertion of administrative expense relating to Oxford ARO (0.60); communicate with Hoffmann and Reynolds regarding Oxford sale (0.10); communicate with Johnson regarding Oxford sale hearing (0.10); communication with Green (Lazard) regarding asset sales (0.20); communication with Lennox regarding Oxford sale hearing (0.10); develop evidentiary presentation for Oxford sale hearing (0.60).		
01/10/19	D W BERENS	0.50	212.50
	Draft and review WMLP sales hearing checklist.		
01/10/19	M C CORCORAN	2.10	1,785.00
	Develop evidentiary presentation for Oxford sale hearing.		
01/11/19	D W BERENS	2.70	1,147.50
	Draft and review declaration of Cowan (Lazard) in support of Oxford asset sale (2.30); discuss preparation of declaration of Cowan (Lazard) in support of WMLP sale (0.40).		
01/11/19	M C CORCORAN	9.40	7,990.00
	Develop evidentiary presentation for Oxford sale hearing and communicate with Berens regarding same (6.90); communications with Gold, Manoukian, Hillman (all SRZ), Pesce (K&E), Slade, Glenn (all K&E), Ossi (DBR), Lennox, Hoffmann and Zeltner regarding 1113/1114 motion (0.10); develop declaration in support of 1113/1114 motion and communication with Lennox, Hoffmann and Zeltner regarding same (2.40).		
01/12/19	M C CORCORAN	0.90	765.00
	Develop declaration in support of 1113/1114 motion and communication with Lennox, Hoffmann and Zeltner regarding same (0.70); communication with Cowan, Green (both Lazard), Lennox, Hoffmann and Zeltner regarding declaration in support of 1113/1114 motion (0.20).		
01/13/19	M C CORCORAN	1.40	1,190.00
	Develop declaration in support of 1113/1114 motion and communication with Cowan, Green (both Lazard), Lennox, Hoffmann and Zeltner regarding declaration in support of 1113/1114 motion (0.40); communications with Slade, French, Koenig, Pesce (all K&E), Lennox, Hoffmann, Zeltner and Cowan (Lazard) regarding declaration in support of 1113/1114 motion (0.10); develop evidentiary presentation for Oxford sale hearing and communication with Lennox, Hoffmann and Reynolds regarding same (0.90).		
01/14/19	M C CORCORAN	6.80	5,780.00
	Develop declaration in support of 1113/1114 motion and communication with Cowan, Green (both Lazard), Lennox, Hoffmann and Zeltner regarding declaration in support of 1113/1114 motion (0.90); develop evidentiary presentation for Oxford sale hearing and communication with Lennox, Hoffmann and Reynolds regarding same (5.40); communication with Cowan, Green (both Lazard), Lennox, Hoffmann and Reynolds regarding declaration in support of Oxford sale hearing (0.30); communicate with Green (Lazard) regarding declaration in support of Oxford sale hearing and 1113/1114 motion (0.20).		
01/15/19	D W BERENS	1.90	807.50
	Draft form declaration of Alvarez and Marsal representative regarding cure amounts.		
01/15/19	M C CORCORAN	1.30	1,105.00
	Develop evidentiary presentation for Oxford sale hearing.		
01/16/19	D W BERENS	0.40	170.00
	Draft form declaration of Alvarez and Marsal representative of cure amounts for executory contracts in support of sale motion.		
01/16/19	M C CORCORAN	1.60	1,360.00
	Communications with Hoffmann and Johnson regarding Oxford sale hearing (0.20); develop evidentiary presentation for Oxford sale hearing and (1.20); communicate with Hoffmann regarding Oxford sale (0.20).		
01/17/19	D W BERENS	0.60	255.00
	Attend call with Corcoran, Slade, Williams, and Flynn concerning depositions regarding debtor's motion for an order authorizing debtor to reject certain collective bargaining agreements.		

01/17/19	M C CORCORAN	2.00	1,700.00	Prepare for and attend call with Slade (K&E) and Williams (Rumberger) regarding discovery respecting the Debtors' 1113/1114 motion (0.80); communication with Lennox, Hoffmann, Zeltner regarding discovery respecting the Debtors' 1113/1114 motion (0.20); communication with Cowan, Green (both Lazard) and Lennox regarding discovery respecting the Debtors' 1113/1114 motion (0.10); develop evidentiary presentation for Kemmerer sale motion (0.90).
01/18/19	D W BERENS	1.20	510.00	Review and edit Cowan (Lazard) declaration in support of Kemmerer sale motion (0.60); review and edit Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) declaration in support of Kemmerer sale motion (0.60).
01/18/19	M C CORCORAN	6.20	5,270.00	Prepare for and attend call with Slade (K&E), Manoukian and Gold (both SRZ) regarding hearing on 1113/1114 motion (1.10); develop evidentiary support for approval of Kemmerer sale and communication with Lennox, Hoffmann and Edel regarding same (4.20); communicate with Hoffmann and Johnson regarding evidentiary support for approval of Kemmerer sale (0.20); communicate with Lennox regarding hearing on 1113/1114 motion (0.30); communicate with Hoffmann regarding motion to approve Kemmerer sale (0.10); communicate with Edel regarding Kemmerer sale motion (0.30).
01/19/19	M C CORCORAN	0.40	340.00	Communicate with Pesce, Slade (both K&E) and Lennox regarding hearing on 1113/1114 motion.
01/20/19	M C CORCORAN	1.00	850.00	Develop evidentiary support for approval of Kemmerer sale and communication with Lennox, Hoffmann and Edel regarding same (0.70); communications with Cowan, Green (both Lazard), Lennox, Hoffmann and Edel regarding evidentiary support for approval of Kemmerer sale and hearing on 1113/1114 motion (0.30).
01/21/19	D W BERENS	3.00	1,275.00	Attend call with Corcoran, Slade (K&E), Williams (Rumberger), and Flynn regarding depositions regarding debtor's motion to reject certain collective bargaining agreements (0.40); draft and revise Cowan (Lazard) declaration in support of Kemmerer sale (0.30); review Cowan (Lazard) expert report reliance materials (1.00); review and edit Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) declaration in support of Oxford sale motion (1.30).
01/21/19	M C CORCORAN	7.10	6,035.00	Develop evidentiary support for approval of Oxford sale and communication with Lennox, Hoffmann and Edel regarding same (3.70); communicate with Cowan, Green (both Lazard), Lennox, Hoffmann and Edel regarding evidentiary support for approval of Kemmerer sale and approval of Oxford sale (0.60); communicate with Cowan (Lazard) regarding evidentiary support for approval of Oxford sale (0.10); communicate with Green (Lazard) regarding hearing on 1113/1114 motion (0.20); prepare for and attend call with Slade (K&E), Manoukian and Richman (both SRZ) regarding evidentiary support for 1113/1114 motion (0.80); prepare for and attend call with Slade (K&E) and Williams (Rumberger) regarding discovery respecting the Debtors' 1113/1114 motion (0.50); communicate with Berens regarding evidentiary support for approval of Kemmerer sale and approval of Oxford sale and 1113/1114 hearing (0.30); communicate with Lennox regarding hearing on 1113/1114 motion (0.20); communicate with Cowan (Lazard) regarding deposition for 1113/1114 hearing (0.10); communicate with Slade (K&E) regarding depositions for hearing on 1113/1114 motion (0.10); communicate with Tywoniuk (WMLP), Lennox and Hoffmann regarding evidentiary support for approval of Kemmerer sale and approval of Oxford sale (0.20); communicate with Hillman, Manoukian, Gold (all SRZ), Lennox and Hoffmann approval of Kemmerer sale and approval of Oxford sale (0.20); communicate with Lennox, Hoffmann and Edel regarding motion to approve Oxford Sale (0.10).
01/22/19	D W BERENS	2.20	935.00	Review, analyze, and consolidate documents related to sale process of Kemmerer entity to prepare for the deposition of Cowan (Lazard) (1.40); discuss with Corcoran preparation of deposition preparation materials of Cowan (Lazard), sale hearing checklist, and outline of direct testimony needed during sales hearing from process server (.80).

01/22/19	M C CORCORAN	7.30	6,205.00	Communicate with Berens regarding hearing on Kemmerer and Oxford sale motions and producing reliance materials for Cowan's 1113/1114 declaration (0.50); communicate with Hamilton regarding hearing on Kemmerer and Oxford sale motions (0.70); develop evidentiary support for Kemmerer and Oxford sale motions and communication with Tywoniuk (WMLP) regarding same (0.30); communicate with Manoukian (SRZ) regarding 1113/1114 hearing (0.30); communicate with Gold (SRZ) regarding reliance materials for Cowan's 1113/1114 declaration (0.10); communication with Hillman (SRZ), Manoukian (SRZ) and Gold reliance materials for Cowan's 1113/1114 declaration (0.70); communicate with Slade (K&E) regarding 1113/1114 hearing (0.10); review/analyze Cowan (Lazard) reliance materials and communication with Slade (K&E) regarding same (0.80); communicate with Lennox regarding hearing on Kemmerer and Oxford sale motions and 1113/1114 motion (0.20); communicate with Green (Lazard) regarding 1113/1114 hearing (0.30); communicate with Hunter regarding stalking horse protections requested by bidders (0.10); prepare for hearing on Kemmerer and Oxford sale motions (2.70); communication with Cowan (Lazard) regarding stalking horse protections requested by bidders (0.20); review/analyze discovery communications for 1113/1114 hearing (0.20); communication with Hoffmann regarding hearing on Oxford and Kemmerer sale motions (0.10).
01/22/19	R W HAMILTON	1.20	1,140.00	Telephone conference with Corcoran regarding bid procedures/sale motions regarding Oxford and Kemmerer and 1113/1114 motion and litigation strategy regarding same, depositions regarding same (0.80); review pleadings and discovery schedule regarding same and logistics for covering depositions regarding same (0.40).
01/22/19	H LENNOX	0.30	405.00	Conference with Corcoran regarding preparations for 2/4 sale hearing evidence.
01/23/19	D W BERENS	0.50	212.50	Review, analyze, and consolidate documents related to sale process of Kemmerer entity to prepare for the deposition of Cowan (Lazard) (0.10); attend call with Corcoran, Hoffmann, and bidder representatives regarding witness testimony as to adequate assurance of future performance (0.40).
01/23/19	M C CORCORAN	9.40	7,990.00	Develop evidentiary support of Kemmerer and Oxford sale motions and communication with Cowan, Green (both Lazard), Lennox and Hoffmann regarding same (0.80); develop evidentiary support of Kemmerer and Oxford sale motions and communication with Tywoniuk (WMLP), Lennox and Hoffmann regarding same (0.50); communicate with Manoukian (SRZ) regarding hearing on Kemmerer and Oxford sale and 1113/1114 motion (0.80); communicate with Manoukian and Gold (both SRZ) regarding hearing on Kemmerer and Oxford sale (0.30); review/analyze changes to request for allowance of administrative expense claim and communication with Lennox, Hoffmann and Zeltner regarding same (0.70); communicate with Zeltner regarding request for allowance of administrative expense claim (0.30); communicate with Kweskin (SRZ) and Zeltner regarding request for allowance of administrative expense claim (0.60); communication with Tywoniuk (WMLP) regarding request for allowance of administrative expense claim (0.20); communicate with Cowan (Lazard) and Green regarding hearing on 1113/1114 motion (0.30); communicate with Reynolds regarding Oxford sale motion (0.20); communicate with Hoffmann regarding Oxford sale motion (0.30); communicate with Hunter regarding Oxford sale motion (0.20); communicate with bidder counsel and Hoffmann regarding hearing on Oxford sale motion (0.40); communication with Lennox, Hoffmann, Reynolds and Edel regarding potential objections to Oxford sale motion (0.70); communication with Slade and McDonald (both K&E) regarding 1113/1114 hearing (0.30); communication with FitzSimons, Hunter, Podolsky, Hoffmann and Lennox regarding potential exhibits for the 1113/1114 hearing (0.20); communication with Cowan, Green (both Lazard) and Lennox regarding potential exhibits for the 1113/1114 hearing (0.10); prepare for hearing on Kemmerer and Oxford sale motions (2.50).
01/23/19	R W HAMILTON	0.30	285.00	Communication with Corcoran regarding 1113/1114 depositions, review background clippings on recent developments in Westmoreland chapter 11 proceedings.
01/23/19	O S ZELTNER	0.80	480.00	Communications with Cottrell (Westmoreland Coal Company) (0.10), Lennox and Hoffmann (0.30) regarding Rogers settlement and related issues; review documents regarding same (0.40).

01/24/19	D W BERENS	3.60	1,530.00
	Prepare deposition preparation notebook for Cowan (Lazard) (2.50); discuss preparation of witness and exhibit list with Corcoran (0.20); research representation of Debtor entities (0.20); prepare witness and exhibit list filing for February 4 sale hearing (0.70).		
01/24/19	M C CORCORAN	9.30	7,905.00
	Communications with bidder counsel regarding hearing on Oxford sale motion (0.20); communications with bidder counsel regarding hearing on Oxford Sale motion (0.10); communications with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) regarding declarations in support of Oxford and Kemmerer sale motions (0.10); communications with Lennox and Hoffmann regarding hearing on Oxford sale motion (0.30); communications with Cowan, Green (both Lazard) and Lennox regarding discovery issues respecting 1113/1114 motion (0.60); communicate with McDonald (K&E) regarding 1113/1114 discovery issues (0.20); communications with Slade (K&E) regarding 1113/1114 depositions (0.10); communicate with Zeltner regarding plan objection (0.30); communicate with Freeman (Jackson Walker) regarding hearing on Oxford and Kemmerer sale motions (0.10); communications with Calderon (Donlin) regarding hearing on Oxford and Kemmerer sale motions (0.10); communicate with Manoukian (SRZ) regarding 1113/1114 discovery issues (0.40); communicate with Lennox regarding application for administrative expense, confirmation issues, Oxford and Kemmerer sale motions and 1113/1114 motion (0.40); communicate with Berens regarding 1113/1114 discovery issues and evidentiary support for Oxford and Kemmerer sale motions (0.30); develop confirmation objection and communications with Lennox, Hoffmann and Zeltner regarding same (1.20); communicate with Hamilton regarding hearing on Oxford and Kemmerer sale motions and 1113/1114 motion (0.60); prepare for hearing on hearing on Oxford and Kemmerer sale motions and 1113/1114 motion (4.30).		
01/24/19	R W HAMILTON	2.50	2,375.00
	Review bid procedure and sale motions for Oxford and Kemmerer and 1113/1114 motion and supporting papers to prepare for depositions and February 4th hearing regarding same (0.50); office conferences with Corcoran regarding litigation strategy for same (1.20); review declarations in support of bid procedure and sale motions and 1113/1114 motion (0.80).		
01/24/19	O S ZELTNER	0.40	240.00
	Communications with Hunter and Podolsky (0.20), Cottrell (Westmoreland Coal Company) (0.20) regarding Rogers settlement issues.		
01/25/19	D W BERENS	2.50	1,062.50
	Prepare witness and exhibit list for February 4, 2019 hearing (1.50); prepare deposition preparation notebook for Cowan (Lazard) (1.00).		
01/25/19	M C CORCORAN	7.30	6,205.00
	Attend multiple intercompany claims calls (2.30); draft/revise discovery request for objection to plan confirmation (1.20); communicate with Reynolds regarding Oxford sale motion (0.10); communicate with Manoukian (SRZ) regarding hearing on 1113/1114 motion (0.50); communicate with Slade (K&E) regarding hearing on 1113/1114 motion (0.10); communicate with Zeltner regarding request for allowance of administrative expenses and objection to plan confirmation (0.10); communicate with Hoffmann regarding Oxford sale motion and intercompany claims disputes (0.10); review/analyze Williams declaration and communication with Lennox regarding same (0.30); communication with Manoukian, Gold (both SRZ), Ossi (DBR), Slade, French, McDonald, Pesce (all K&E) and Lennox regarding Williams declaration (0.20); review/analyze plan objections and communications with Lennox, Hoffmann and Zeltner regarding same (0.30); communications with bidder counsel, Hoffmann and Reynolds regarding inquiry regarding adequate assurances of future performance regarding assumption of contracts in connection with Oxford sale motion (0.20); communications with bidder counsel and Hoffmann regarding hearing on Oxford sale motion (0.10); communications with Pesce, Koenig (both K&E), Lennox and Zeltner regarding hearing on Oxford sale motion (0.10); communications with Green (Lazard) and Hoffmann regarding inquiry regarding adequate assurances of future performance regarding assumption of contracts in connection with Oxford sale motion (0.20); prepare for hearing on Oxford and Kemmerer sale motions and 1113/1114 motion (1.50).		
01/25/19	O S ZELTNER	1.30	780.00
	Communications with Lennox (0.30), Cottrell (Westmoreland Coal Company) and Hunter (0.40), Bow (K&E) (0.20) regarding Rogers settlement; review documents and analyze issues regarding same (0.40).		

01/26/19	M C CORCORAN	0.20	170.00
	Review/analyze communications regarding 1113/1114 discovery issues and communication with Slade (K&E) regarding same.		
01/27/19	D W BERENS	0.90	382.50
	Prepare witness and exhibit list for February 4, 2019 hearing.		
01/27/19	M C CORCORAN	2.70	2,295.00
	Prepare for deposition of Cowan (Lazard) (1.30); develop witness and exhibit list for hearing on Oxford and Kemmerer sale motions and communication with Berens regarding same (1.10); communication with Green (Lazard) regarding Oxford and Kemmerer sale process (0.20); communication with bidder counsel regarding Oxford sale motion (0.10).		
01/28/19	D W BERENS	1.90	807.50
	Draft witness and exhibit list for February 4, 2019 hearing.		
01/28/19	M C CORCORAN	8.60	7,310.00
	Prepare Cowan (Lazard) for deposition with Slade (K&E) and Green (Lazard) (3.00); communicate with bidder counsel, and Reynolds regarding Oxford sale hearing (0.50); communicate with FitzSimons, Hunter, Hoffmann and Micheletti (Westmoreland) regarding Oxford ARO and permitting issues (0.90); communicate with Lennox, FitzSimons, Hunter, Hoffmann and Reynolds regarding Oxford sale issues (0.50); communicate with Hamilton regarding Stein deposition (0.10); communication with Hoffmann, Hunter, Lennox and FitzSimons regarding Oxford sale motion (0.30); communicate with Hoffmann regarding Oxford ARO and permitting issues (0.10); communicate with Marinuzzo (MoFo) regarding Oxford sale motion and communication with Lennox, Hoffmann and Reynolds regarding same (0.20); communications with Lennox and Hoffmann regarding Oxford and Kemmerer sale hearing (0.10); communications with Slade (K&E) regarding Oxford and Kemmerer sale hearing (0.10); communication with bidder counsel regarding Oxford and Kemmerer sale hearing (0.10); prepare for 1113/1114 depositions of Puntus (Centerview) and Cowan (Lazard) (1.10); prepare for hearing on Oxford and Kemmerer sale motions (1.40); communicate with bidder counsel regarding Oxford sale (0.20).		
01/28/19	R W HAMILTON	7.80	7,410.00
	Review 1113/1114 briefing and declarations and prepare for deposition (2.50); attend deposition of Stein in 1113/1114 litigation (5.00); communications and telephone conference with Corcoran regarding Stein testimony at deposition regarding 1113/1114 motion and logistics for defending other depositions (0.30).		
01/29/19	M T BARRIOS	0.50	150.00
	Prepare for and file application for administrative expenses and objection to plan.		
01/29/19	D W BERENS	0.80	340.00
	Analyze and prepare exhibits to witness and exhibit list for February 4, 2019 hearing.		
01/29/19	M C CORCORAN	7.10	6,035.00
	Attend 1113/1114 deposition of Puntus (Centerview) (1.00); attend 1113/1114 deposition of Cowan (Lazard) (1.50); communicate with Hillman, Kweskin, Manoukian (all SRZ), Lennox, Zeltner, Hoffmann regarding confirmation objections, request for administrative expense, and 1113/1114 and sale motion hearing (0.50); communicate with Pesce, Slade (both K&E), Hillman (SRZ), Kweskin, Manoukian (all SRZ), Lennox, Zeltner, Hoffmann regarding confirmation objections, request for administrative expense, and 1113/1114 and sale motion hearing (0.70); communications with Slade (K&E) regarding Oxford and Kemmerer sale motions (0.10); review/analyze Ohio's confirmation objection and communication with Lennox, Hoffmann and Zeltner regarding the same (0.20); review/analyze information from bidder regarding ability to perform after close and communication with Hoffmann and Reynolds regarding same (0.80); communicate with Lennox and Zeltner regarding confirmation objection and request for administrative expense (0.30); communicate with Manoukian (SRZ) regarding 1113/1114 motion (0.50); communicate with bidder counsel regarding Oxford sale (0.10); communication with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) regarding Oxford sale hearing (0.10); review/analyze letter from Committee regarding Oxford sale motion and communication with Lennox, Hoffmann, Edel, Zeltner, Reynolds regarding bidders ability to perform after close (1.10); communications with Berens regarding exhibit list for hearing on Oxford and Kemmerer sale motions (0.20).		

01/29/19	R W HAMILTON	6.30	5,985.00
	Prepare for and attend deposition of Puntus (Centerview) regarding 1113/1114 motion and office conference with Corcoran regarding same (3.80); office conference with Corcoran and Cowan (Lazard) regarding Cowan (Lazard) deposition preparation and litigation strategy regarding sale motions for Kemmerer and Oxford mines and attend Cowan (Lazard) deposition (2.50).		
01/29/19	O S ZELTNER	0.20	120.00
	Communications with Edel regarding Rogers settlement.		
01/30/19	D W BERENS	1.70	722.50
	Analyze and prepare exhibits to witness and exhibit list for February 4, 2019 hearing. (1.00); draft witness and exhibit list for February 4, 2019 hearing (0.60); participate in call with Corcoran and representatives of Alvarez and Marsal regarding witness for February 4, 2019 hearing (0.10).		
01/30/19	M C CORCORAN	10.00	8,500.00
	Communicate with bidder counsel regarding Oxford sale motion (0.10); communicate with Manoukian and Gold (both SRZ) regarding 1113/1114 motion (1.10); communicate with Hoffmann regarding Oxford sale motion (0.20); communicate with Campagna, Esposito, Farrell (all A&M) and Reynolds regarding Oxford sale hearing (0.20); communicate with Hoffmann, Singer, Hughes, and Smith (all Squire) regarding Oxford sale hearing (0.30); communicate with Hunter, Lennox, Hoffmann, Holewinski and FitzSimons regarding Oxford permitting and bonding issues (0.60); communicate with Pesce (K&E), Slade (both K&E), Hillman (SRZ), Manoukian (both SRZ), Lennox and Hoffmann regarding 1113/1114 and sale motion hearing and intercompany issues (0.60); communicate with bidder counsel and Hoffmann regarding Oxford sale hearing (0.40); communicate with Hamilton regarding UMWA 1113/1114 deposition (0.10); communications with bidder counsel regarding protective order (0.10); review/analyze UWMA objection to confirmation and objection to 1113/1114 motion (0.80); communication with Lennox, Hoffmann, Reynolds, Edel and Zeltner regarding bidder's ability to perform after close (0.30); review/analyze 1113/1114 witness and exhibit list and communication with Cowan, Green (both Lazard) and Lennox regarding same (1.40); review/analyze 1113/1114 direct examination outline for Cowan (Lazard) (0.30); communication with Slade (K&E) regarding 1113/1114 witness and exhibit list (0.10); communications with Pesce, Koenig (both K&E) and Hoffmann regarding information from bidder regarding its ability to perform after close (0.10); communication with Marinuzzi, Harris (both MoFo) Pesce, Koenig (both K&E) and Hoffmann regarding same (0.10); review/analyze information and analysis regarding permitting issues and communications with Lennox, Hoffmann, Hunter and FitzSimons regarding same (0.20); review/analyze information from bidder regarding its ability to perform after close and communication with Lennox, Reynolds and Hoffmann regarding same (0.20); communicate with Berens regarding exhibit and witness list for Oxford and Kemmerer sale motions (0.20); communications with Koenig (K&E) and Reynolds regarding exhibit and witness list for Oxford and Kemmerer sale motions (0.10); prepare for hearing on Oxford and Kemmerer sale motions (2.50).		
01/30/19	R W HAMILTON	3.50	3,325.00
	Telephone conference with Corcoran, Lennox, Hoffmann and Holewinski regarding permit transfer issues regarding bid for Oxford assets (0.70); review briefing and declarations for sale hearings regarding Oxford and Kemmerer assets and prepare for hearing (0.30) review briefing and research regarding WMLP administrative claim (2.50).		
01/31/19	D W BERENS	4.00	1,700.00
	Analyze and prepare exhibits to witness and exhibit list for February 4, 2019 hearing (1.20); draft witness and exhibit list for February 4, 2019 hearing (1.30); prepare exhibit notebook for February 4, 2019 hearing (1.50).		
01/31/19	M C CORCORAN	7.30	6,205.00
	Attend 1113/1114 depositions of Martinez, Goodheart and Micheletti (all WMLP) (2.90); prepare Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) for Oxford and Kemmerer sale motions hearing (1.50); communications with Marinuzzi and Harris (both MoFo) regarding Oxford sale motion (0.30); communicate with bidder counsel regarding Oxford sale motion (0.20); develop witness and exhibit list for Oxford and Kemmerer sale motions and communicate with Berens regarding same (0.80); communications with Koenig (K&E) regarding witness and exhibit list for Oxford sale motion (0.10); communication with Lennox, Hoffmann, Reynolds, Edel and Johnson regarding informal objections to Oxford sale motion (0.40); communicate with Reynolds regarding objections to the Oxford sale motion (0.10); communication with Cowan, Green (both Lazard) and Lennox regarding hearing on Oxford and Kemmerer sale motions (0.20); prepare for hearing on Oxford and Kemmerer sale motions (0.80).		

Litigation and Adversary Proceedings

01/31/19	R W HAMILTON	0.80		760.00
	Communications with Corcoran regarding deposition logistics and preparations for sale hearing on February 4 and regarding WMLP administrative claim litigation strategy.			
	TOTAL	191.80	USD	147,680.00

Meetings

Page 1

01/02/19	H LENNOX	0.90		1,215.00
	Appear for/attend bi-weekly coordination meeting with WLB management and advisors and conflicts committee members (0.60); follow-up call with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) regarding same (0.30).			
01/02/19	O S ZELTNER	1.20		720.00
	Attend bi-weekly call with Conflicts Committee, WLB representatives and advisors to same (0.80); draft minutes of same (0.40).			
01/07/19	H LENNOX	0.60		810.00
	Multiple communications with Pesce (K&E), Hillman (SRZ), Cowan (Lazard) regarding all hands meeting to discuss global issues.			
01/09/19	O S ZELTNER	0.60		360.00
	Attend bi-weekly call with WMLP and Westmoreland Coal Company advisors regarding chapter 11 case matters and coordination.			
01/30/19	H LENNOX	0.50		675.00
	Participate in bi-weekly coordination meeting with WLB principals and advisors and Conflicts Committee principals and advisors.			
01/30/19	O S ZELTNER	0.90		540.00
	Attend chapter 11 coordination call with Conflicts Committee, Westmoreland Coal Company and advisors (0.50); draft minutes of same (0.40).			
	TOTAL	4.70	USD	4,320.00

Non-Working Travel

Page 1

01/27/19	M C CORCORAN	3.50		2,975.00
	Travel from Columbus to Chicago for depositions.			
01/27/19	R W HAMILTON	5.00		4,750.00
	Travel from Columbus to New York for depositions in 1113/1114 litigation.			
01/29/19	M C CORCORAN	5.00		4,250.00
	Travel from Chicago to New York for depositions (2.50); travel from New York to Columbus following depositions (2.50).			
01/29/19	R W HAMILTON	4.80		4,560.00
	Return to Columbus from depositions in New York.			
01/31/19	M C CORCORAN	4.00		3,400.00
	Travel from Columbus to Houston for Oxford auction and sale hearing.			
01/31/19	J N EDEL	6.70		3,517.50
	Travel to Houston, TX from Cleveland, OH for auction and sale hearings (includes delays).			
01/31/19	T P FITZSIMONS	7.50		7,312.50
	Travel to Houston for Oxford auction.			
01/31/19	G M HUNTER	3.50		2,800.00
	Travel from Cleveland to Houston for auction.			
01/31/19	H LENNOX	5.70		7,695.00
	Travel from Cleveland to Houston for auction and 2/4 hearing.			
01/31/19	O S ZELTNER	5.60		3,360.00
	Travel from Cleveland to Houston for auction and Oxford sale hearing.			
	TOTAL	51.30	USD	44,620.00

01/02/19	J N EDEL	2.10	1,102.50
	Draft disclosure statement (1.70); communicate with Zeltner regarding same (0.40).		
01/02/19	O S ZELTNER	3.10	1,860.00
	Draft WMLP Debtors' plan of liquidation.		
01/03/19	J N EDEL	4.10	2,152.50
	Various communications with Wilson, Zeltner regarding disclosure statement (0.70); draft same, including review an analysis of background materials (3.40).		
01/03/19	O S ZELTNER	1.00	600.00
	Communications with Wilson, Edel regarding plan and disclosure statement matters (0.80); communications with Lennox, Koenig (K&E) regarding WLB plan issues (0.20).		
01/04/19	J N EDEL	2.30	1,207.50
	Draft disclosure statement (1.90); review and analyze objections to WLB Debtors' plan (0.40).		
01/05/19	T A WILSON	0.20	195.00
	Communicate with Zeltner regarding plan and disclosure statement scheduling issues.		
01/05/19	O S ZELTNER	0.40	240.00
	Communications with Wilson, Edel regarding plan and disclosure statement issues.		
01/06/19	J N EDEL	0.60	315.00
	Communicate with Wilson, Zeltner regarding plan and disclosure statement (0.10); draft disclosure statement (0.50).		
01/06/19	O S ZELTNER	3.20	1,920.00
	Review and analyze precedent documents and communications regarding plan and disclosure statement issues (0.40); communications with Wilson, Edel regarding same (0.20); draft WMLP Debtors' plan of liquidation (2.60).		
01/07/19	J N EDEL	2.90	1,522.50
	Various communications with Wilson, Zeltner regarding plan and disclosure statement strategy (1.20); review and revise disclosure statement (1.70).		
01/07/19	T A WILSON	2.00	1,950.00
	Review and analyze Sherwin Alumina solicitation procedures motion (0.40); communicate with Lennox, Hoffmann, Zeltner, Edel regarding plan and disclosure statement issues (1.00); review and analyze first day declaration for Westmoreland debtors (0.40); communicate with Zeltner, Koenig (K&E) regarding plan matters (0.20).		
01/07/19	O S ZELTNER	0.90	540.00
	Communications with Lennox, Wilson, Edel regarding WMLP plan and disclosure statement issues (0.60); communications with Koenig (K&E), Wilson regarding same (0.30).		
01/08/19	H LENNOX	0.50	675.00
	Conference with Hillman and Manoukian (both SRZ) regarding various case issues, including labor and intercreditor issues.		
01/11/19	H LENNOX	0.20	270.00
	Telephone conferences with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee), Campagna (A&M) regarding planning for case windup.		
01/16/19	T HOFFMANN	0.80	780.00
	Review/analyze wind down budget and related items.		
01/16/19	H LENNOX	0.30	405.00
	Conference with Hoffmann, Zeltner regarding WLB plan.		
01/16/19	O S ZELTNER	2.50	1,500.00
	Research case law and secondary sources regarding WLB plan issues (2.10); communications with Lennox and Hoffmann regarding response to WLB plan (0.40).		
01/17/19	O S ZELTNER	4.40	2,640.00
	Research case law, secondary sources and public filings for objection to WLB plan.		

Plan and Disclosure Statement

Page 2

01/18/19	O S ZELTNER	5.80	3,480.00
	Draft objection to WLB plan (3.10); research and analyze case law and secondary sources regarding same (2.70).		
01/19/19	H LENNOX	0.30	405.00
	Review/analyze draft sources and uses.		
01/19/19	O S ZELTNER	2.30	1,380.00
	Research and analyze case law and secondary sources for objection to WLB plan.		
01/20/19	O S ZELTNER	8.10	4,860.00
	Draft objection to WLB plan (5.40); research and analyze case law regarding same (2.70).		
01/21/19	O S ZELTNER	10.60	6,360.00
	Draft objection to WLB plan (6.90); research and analyze case law and secondary sources regarding same (3.70).		
01/22/19	M C CORCORAN	1.20	1,020.00
	Develop objection to WLB confirmation and email Lennox, Hoffmann and Zeltner regarding same.		
01/22/19	H LENNOX	1.50	2,025.00
	Review/analyze and revise WLB plan objection (0.70); conferences with Zeltner, Corcoran, Hoffmann regarding same (0.70); conference with Hillman (SRZ) regarding same (0.10).		
01/22/19	O S ZELTNER	7.90	4,740.00
	Draft and revise objection to confirmation of WLB plan (2.80); research case law and secondary sources regarding same (4.60); communications with Lennox, Hoffmann, Corcoran regarding same (0.50).		
01/23/19	T HOFFMANN	1.30	1,267.50
	Review/analyze issues relating to objection to WLB Debtors' plan (1.00); communicate with Zeltner, Lennox and Corcoran regarding objection (0.30).		
01/23/19	H LENNOX	1.20	1,620.00
	Review/analyze and revise objection to WLB Plan (0.70); communications with Zeltner, Hillman (SRZ), Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) regarding same (0.50).		
01/23/19	O S ZELTNER	1.40	840.00
	Draft and revise objection to WLB plan (1.10); communications with Lennox, Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) regarding same (0.30).		
01/24/19	T HOFFMANN	0.80	780.00
	Review/analyze issues relating to potential objection to WLB plan (0.60); communicate with Lennox, Corcoran and Zeltner regarding objection (0.20).		
01/24/19	H LENNOX	2.00	2,700.00
	Conferences with Zeltner, Corcoran, Manoukian (SRZ) regarding WLB plan objection (0.60); review and revise same (0.80); conference with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) regarding same (0.20); review and comment on lender comments regarding same (0.40).		
01/24/19	O S ZELTNER	6.20	3,720.00
	Revise objection to WLB plan (1.80); review SRZ comments to same (0.50); analyze legal issues regarding same (2.10); communications with Lennox, Corcoran, Hoffmann (1.00), Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) (0.30), SRZ team (0.50) regarding same.		
01/25/19	J N EDEL	0.40	210.00
	Various communications with Hillman (SRZ), Lennox regarding exit financing under parent plan (0.20); review and analyze same (0.20).		
01/25/19	H LENNOX	1.60	2,160.00
	Communications with Kweskin (SRZ), Zeltner, Corcoran regarding WLB plan objection (1.10); review and revise same (.50).		
01/25/19	O S ZELTNER	4.30	2,580.00
	Revise objection to Westmoreland Coal Company chapter 11 plan (1.80); communications with Lennox (0.30), Manoukian and Kweskin (both SRZ) (0.50) regarding same; analyze legal issues and arguments regarding same (1.70).		

Plan and Disclosure Statement

Page 3

01/26/19	T HOFFMANN	2.10	2,047.50
	Review/analyze WLB plan objections (1.90); communicate with Lennox regarding objections (0.20).		
01/27/19	O S ZELTNER	0.40	240.00
	Revise objection to Westmoreland Coal Company plan.		
01/28/19	H LENNOX	0.40	540.00
	Review/analyze objections to WLB plan.		
01/28/19	O S ZELTNER	2.60	1,560.00
	Revise objection to Westmoreland Coal Company chapter 11 plan (0.90); communications with Lennox and Corcoran (0.20), Manoukian and Kweskin (both SRZ) (0.50) regarding same; review objection of WMLP lenders to Westmoreland Coal Company plan (0.30); analyze legal issues for plan objection (0.70).		
01/29/19	T HOFFMANN	0.90	877.50
	Review/analyze draft objection to WLB plan and related admin expense request (0.70); communicate with Zeltner and Manoukian (SRZ) regarding objection (0.20).		
01/29/19	O S ZELTNER	3.90	2,340.00
	Revise and finalize objection to Westmoreland Coal Company chapter 11 plan (0.80); analyze legal issues regarding same (0.40); communications with Manoukian and Kweskin (both SRZ) (0.70), Lennox, Hoffmann and Corcoran (0.50), Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) (0.20) regarding same; call with Jones Day and SRZ teams regarding plan objections and related issues (0.50); coordinate filing and service of same (0.30); review revisions to WMLP lenders' objection to Westmoreland Coal Company chapter 11 plan (0.20); review and analyze filed objections to Westmoreland Coal Company plan (0.30).		
01/31/19	I M PEREZ	5.10	2,550.00
	Discuss contract rejection issues with Zeltner (0.10); research standard for rejection of contracts in the Fifth Circuit (1.80); draft objection to rejection of agreement in connection with WLB plan (3.20).		
01/31/19	O S ZELTNER	1.20	720.00
	Communications with Kweskin (SRZ) (0.20), Koenig (K&E) (0.20), Lennox, Reynolds and Perez (0.30) regarding Westmoreland Coal Company plan rejection provision and potential objection; analyze legal issues regarding same (0.50).		
	TOTAL	105.00	USD 70,897.50

01/19/19	W A HERZBERGER	1.00	975.00
	Review correspondence from Hunter regarding deed/property conveyance requirements (0.40); review real estate schedule (0.20); correspondence to Hunter regarding real estate conveyance issues (0.40).		
01/22/19	S D RUEBENSAAL	0.30	135.00
	Correspondence with real estate team regarding drafting of deeds.		
01/25/19	W A HERZBERGER	1.50	1,462.50
	Attention to real estate/deed issues (1.00); discussion with Burkart and review asset purchase agreement provisions regarding deed requirements (0.50).		
01/25/19	S D RUEBENSAAL	0.30	135.00
	Correspondence with real estate team regarding sale order and required real estate deliverables.		
01/28/19	W A HERZBERGER	1.80	1,755.00
	Coordinate/advise regarding real estate issues and documents.		
01/28/19	S D RUEBENSAAL	3.00	1,350.00
	Review asset purchase agreement, real estate schedules to asset purchase agreement, sale order and precedent bankruptcy deeds (1.10); review real estate contents of data room (0.30); conference calls with corporate and real estate teams regarding drafting of deeds (0.30); begin drafting forms of Ohio and Kentucky deeds (1.30).		
01/29/19	W A HERZBERGER	2.00	1,950.00
	Review real estate documents and advise/coordinate regarding real estate.		
01/29/19	S D RUEBENSAAL	2.70	1,215.00
	Finish drafting forms of Ohio and Kentucky deeds (1.00); revise forms of Ohio and Kentucky deeds based on real estate team's comments (0.30); correspondence with corporate team regarding forms of Ohio and Kentucky deeds and deed recordation (0.30); begin reviewing real estate contents of data room in anticipation of compiling deeds (1.10).		
01/30/19	S D RUEBENSAAL	4.70	2,115.00
	Continue reviewing real estate contents of data room in anticipation of compiling deeds.		
01/31/19	W A HERZBERGER	1.50	1,462.50
	Review/coordinate real estate deeds and legal description issues for closing.		
01/31/19	S D RUEBENSAAL	8.10	3,645.00
	Finish reviewing real estate contents of data room in anticipation of compiling deeds (5.50); draft list of document requests and questions for client based on review (1.00); correspondence with corporate team and client regarding the same (0.50); compile legal descriptions for Belmont and Columbiana Counties (1.10).		
	TOTAL	26.90	USD 16,200.00

01/02/19	F E FREEMAN	0.30	180.00
	Revise Schedule 14D-9 for tender offer per Jones Day tax comments.		
01/02/19	E B WINSLOW	1.50	1,575.00
	Review/analyze draft 14D-9 (1.20); communicate with working group regarding same (0.30).		
01/03/19	T P FITZSIMONS	1.20	1,170.00
	Review and revise 14D-9.		
01/03/19	F E FREEMAN	0.30	180.00
	Revise Schedule 14D-9 for tender offer per Jones Day working group comments.		
01/03/19	A C THOMAS	2.00	1,550.00
	Review and drafting of comments to Schedule 14D-9.		
01/03/19	E B WINSLOW	1.20	1,260.00
	Review/analyze draft 14D-9 (1.00); communicate with working group regarding same (0.20).		
01/04/19	T P FITZSIMONS	0.20	195.00
	Correspondence with Jones Day team regarding Schedule 14D-9.		
01/04/19	F E FREEMAN	1.50	900.00
	Revise Schedule 14D-9 for tender offer (0.70); research precedent securities filings (0.80).		
01/04/19	A C THOMAS	1.30	1,007.50
	Review and drafting of comments to Schedule 14D-9 related to proposed tender offer.		
01/04/19	E B WINSLOW	1.70	1,785.00
	Review/analyze draft 14D-9 and related strategic considerations (1.20); communicate with working group regarding same (0.50).		
01/07/19	F E FREEMAN	0.40	240.00
	Discuss Schedule 14D-9 internally and revise.		
01/07/19	T REYNOLDS	0.20	115.00
	Communicate with Stoll regarding tender offer research project.		
01/07/19	J D STOLL	1.20	480.00
	Meet with Reynolds regarding Schedule 14D-9 (0.20); summarize Schedule 14D-9 (1.00).		
01/07/19	A C THOMAS	1.20	930.00
	Review and drafting of comments to Schedule 14D-9 related to proposed tender offer.		
01/07/19	E B WINSLOW	2.00	2,100.00
	Review/analyze 14D-9 and related strategic considerations (1.60); working group communications regarding same (0.40).		
01/08/19	H LENNOX	0.20	270.00
	Communications with Pesce (K&E), Winslow regarding tender offer.		
01/08/19	T REYNOLDS	1.00	575.00
	Review summary of WMLP tender offer (0.20); research regarding precedent for WMLP tender offer (0.80).		
01/08/19	J D STOLL	0.80	320.00
	Summarize Schedule 14D-9.		
01/08/19	A C THOMAS	1.00	775.00
	Respond to question regarding required financial statements in tender offer documents and related matters.		
01/08/19	E B WINSLOW	0.70	735.00
	Review/analyze tender offer timing and related disclosure considerations (0.40); working group communications regarding same (0.30).		
01/09/19	F E FREEMAN	7.70	4,620.00
	Discuss Schedule 14D-9 with client (0.40); draft various tender offer documents (Schedule TO, offer to purchase, notice of guaranteed delivery, letter to brokers, summary advertisement, press release) (7.30).		

Securities Matters

Page 2

01/09/19	H LENNOX	0.70	945.00
	Communications with Jones Day team, Pesce (K&E), Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) regarding tender offer timing and documents.		
01/09/19	M F PODOLSKY	0.40	170.00
	Attend call with Freeman and WMLP to discuss tender offer Schedule 14D-9.		
01/09/19	A C THOMAS	0.50	387.50
	Respond to questions regarding timing of proposed tender offer and SEC review.		
01/09/19	A C THOMAS	0.50	387.50
	Respond to questions regarding Schedule 14D-9 and related matters.		
01/09/19	E B WINSLOW	0.60	630.00
	Review/analyze tender offer timing and related strategic considerations (0.40); working group communications regarding same (0.20).		
01/10/19	F E FREEMAN	8.60	5,160.00
	Draft tender offer documents, including Schedule TO and Schedule 13E-3, offer to purchase, letter of transmittal (7.40); discuss drafting internally with Waller (0.80); review Conflicts Committee meeting minutes (0.40).		
01/10/19	H LENNOX	0.20	270.00
	Communications with Cowan (Lazard) and Jones Day team regarding tender.		
01/10/19	T REYNOLDS	0.50	287.50
	Communicate with Hoffmann and Zeltner regarding WMLP tender offer.		
01/10/19	M R WALLER	3.50	1,575.00
	Draft/revise letter of transmittal (2.20); communicate with working group regarding drafting of tender offer documents and review relevant documents (0.80); draft/revise notice of guaranteed delivery (0.50).		
01/10/19	E B WINSLOW	1.30	1,365.00
	Review/analyze draft tender offer documents and precedent regarding same (0.80); communicate with working group regarding tender offer timing and related strategic considerations (0.50).		
01/11/19	F E FREEMAN	4.00	2,400.00
	Revise offer to purchase (2.00); review tender offer documents for compliance with regulation (2.00).		
01/11/19	M E KUBIUK	5.00	2,750.00
	Review/form check Schedule TO and Schedule 13E-3.		
01/11/19	A C THOMAS	1.50	1,162.50
	Review and drafting of comments to documents for proposed tender offer, including Schedule TO and 14d-9 (1.00); respond to related questions from client and counsel to WCC regarding tender offer process (0.50).		
01/11/19	M R WALLER	3.80	1,710.00
	Draft/revise Schedule TO compliance check (3.50); communicate with working group regarding such (0.30).		
01/11/19	E B WINSLOW	1.70	1,785.00
	Review/analyze draft tender offer documents (0.70); communicate with working group regarding same (0.50); review/analyze precedent regarding same (0.50).		
01/12/19	F E FREEMAN	2.00	1,200.00
	Discuss and circulate drafts of tender offer documents internally (0.50); revise offer to purchase (1.50).		
01/12/19	G M HUNTER	1.50	1,200.00
	Various internal correspondence regarding tender offer process (0.40); review and provide comments to draft tender offer documents (1.10).		
01/12/19	A C THOMAS	3.00	2,325.00
	Review and drafting of comments to documents for proposed tender offer, including Schedule TO and 14d-9 (2.50); respond to related questions from client and counsel to WCC regarding tender offer process (0.50).		
01/12/19	E B WINSLOW	1.20	1,260.00
	Review/analyze draft tender offer documents and communicate with working group regarding same.		

01/13/19	F E FREEMAN	1.30	780.00	Revise tender offer documents (1.00); discuss cost estimates with financial printer (0.30).
01/13/19	A C THOMAS	1.50	1,162.50	Review and drafting of comments to documents for proposed tender offer, including Schedule TO and 14d-9 (1.20); respond to related questions from client and counsel to WCC regarding tender offer process (0.30).
01/13/19	E B WINSLOW	0.50	525.00	Communicate with working group regarding tender offer timing and strategic considerations.
01/14/19	F E FREEMAN	1.00	600.00	Revise and circulate tender offer documents (0.50); discuss cost estimates with financial printer (0.20); discuss tender offer with counsel for offeror (0.30).
01/14/19	A C THOMAS	1.00	775.00	Review and drafting of comments to documents for proposed tender offer, including Schedule TO and 14d-9 (0.70); respond to related questions from client and counsel to WCC regarding tender offer process (0.30).
01/14/19	E B WINSLOW	0.70	735.00	Review/analyze tender offer disclosure considerations (0.40); communicate with working group regarding same and tender offer alternatives (0.30).
01/15/19	F E FREEMAN	1.20	720.00	Review Schedule TO / Schedule 13E-3 for compliance with regulation (0.60); discuss tender offer costs and structure internally (0.60).
01/15/19	M E KUBIUK	0.30	165.00	Review financial statement requirements for 13E-3.
01/15/19	A C THOMAS	2.50	1,937.50	Review and drafting of comments to documents for proposed tender offer, including Schedule TO and 14d-9 (0.50); review of Limited Partnership Agreement and drafting of summary email regarding General Partner redemption provision (1.60); respond to related questions from client regarding tender offer process (0.40).
01/15/19	E B WINSLOW	0.80	840.00	Review/analyze draft tender offer documents (0.40); communicate with working group regarding same and related alternatives and strategic considerations (0.40).
01/16/19	M C CORCORAN	0.70	595.00	Communication with Lennox, Winslow, Zeltner, Jenull, Freeman, Hunter, Laduzinski, Hoffmann and Wallace regarding tender versus redemption of MLP units (0.50); communications with Hoffmann regarding tender versus redemption of MLP units (0.20).
01/16/19	T P FITZSIMONS	1.30	1,267.50	Review shareholdings for purposes of drag along and related correspondence (0.40); correspondence regarding tax implications of tender or redemption (0.40); office conference with Hoffmann regarding tender offer (0.10); conference call with Kirkland regarding tender offer (0.40).
01/16/19	T P FITZSIMONS	0.60	585.00	Telephone conference with Lennox regarding tender offer (0.30); office conference with Hoffmann regarding tender offer and asset purchase agreement (0.30).
01/16/19	F E FREEMAN	2.60	1,560.00	Attend conference call with Jones Day and counsel for offeror to discuss tax implications of tender offer and alternatives to tender offer (1.00); attend to working group email discussion of tender offer alternatives internally (1.60);
01/16/19	T HOFFMANN	1.20	1,170.00	Communicate via email with Corcoran regarding potential tender offer and related issues (0.30); communicate with Lennox, Wallace, Winslow and others regarding potential tender offer (0.50); review/analyze related tax issues (0.40).

01/16/19	G M HUNTER	1.30	1,040.00
	Various internal calls and correspondence regarding redemption proposed by Parent (0.80); call with Parent counsel regarding redemption and tender offer (0.50).		
01/16/19	H LENNOX	2.30	3,105.00
	Multiple communications with Pesce (K&E), Jenull, Wallace, Winslow, Thomas, Ritts regarding tender/redemption issues.		
01/16/19	A C THOMAS	3.80	2,945.00
	Review and drafting of comments to documents for proposed tender offer, including Schedule TO and 14d-9 (1.50); review of Limited Partnership Agreement and drafting of summary email regarding General Partner redemption provision (1.80); respond to related questions from client regarding tender offer process (0.50).		
01/16/19	E B WINSLOW	2.30	2,415.00
	Prepare for and participate in working group calls regarding tender offer documentation and related considerations (1.10); review/analyze issues related to redemption alternative (1.20).		
01/16/19	O S ZELTNER	1.10	660.00
	Communications with Lennox, Hunter, Jenull, Winslow regarding potential tender offer (0.40); review and analyze documents and communications regarding same (0.70).		
01/17/19	T P FITZSIMONS	0.60	585.00
	Call with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) regarding tender offer/redemption (0.40); correspondence with Winslow regarding same (0.20).		
01/17/19	F E FREEMAN	1.80	1,080.00
	Review WMLP partnership agreement and shareholder records regarding Series B conversion mechanics and process (0.80); discuss tender offer process and redemption mechanics internally and with offeror counsel (0.70); discuss costs with financial printer (0.30).		
01/17/19	H LENNOX	0.70	945.00
	Multiple communications with Pesce (K&E), Winslow, Thomas, Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) regarding tender process.		
01/17/19	A C THOMAS	2.00	1,550.00
	Review of Limited Partnership Agreement and drafting of summary email regarding General Partner redemption provision (1.60); respond to related questions from client regarding tender offer process (0.40).		
01/17/19	E B WINSLOW	1.70	1,785.00
	Call with working group regarding tender offer considerations and related alternatives (0.50); various follow-up communications with working group regarding same (1.20).		
01/18/19	A C THOMAS	0.30	232.50
	Call with lenders' counsel to discuss proposed tender offer and related matters.		
01/18/19	E B WINSLOW	1.20	1,260.00
	Communicate with working group regarding tender offer documentation and related considerations (0.70); call with lenders' counsel at Schulte regarding same (0.50).		
01/19/19	M F PODOLSKY	0.90	382.50
	Begin draft of signing 8-K.		
01/21/19	E B WINSLOW	0.30	315.00
	Communicate with working group regarding tender offer timing and strategic considerations.		
01/24/19	T P FITZSIMONS	1.40	1,365.00
	Review and revise 8-K (0.40); review and revise 8-K (0.20); review and revise tender offer materials (0.80).		
01/24/19	F E FREEMAN	0.50	300.00
	Discuss timing of tender offer documents and review revisions from WLB counsel.		
01/24/19	A C THOMAS	0.50	387.50
	Review and drafting of comments to revised documents related to proposed tender offer, including Schedule TO, offer to purchase and Schedule 14D-9.		

01/25/19	F E FREEMAN	3.20	1,920.00
	Review and revise draft tender offer documentation (2.50); discuss tender offer documents internally (0.50); discuss offer timing and process financial printer (0.20).		
01/25/19	M F PODOLSKY	0.70	297.50
	Update draft and prepare 8-K for filing.		
01/25/19	A C THOMAS	2.00	1,550.00
	Review and drafting of comments to revised documents related to proposed tender offer, including Schedule TO, offer to purchase and Schedule 14D-9.		
01/25/19	A C THOMAS	0.30	232.50
	Respond to questions from WMLP regarding structure and timing of proposed tender offer.		
01/25/19	M R WALLER	1.80	810.00
	Draft/revise WMLP offer to purchase, tender offer press release, letter to clients, letter of transmittal, form of summary advertisement, letter to brokers, Schedule TO, and Schedule 14D (1.30); communicate in firm regarding such (0.50).		
01/25/19	E B WINSLOW	1.80	1,890.00
	Review/analyze revised Kirkland drafts of tender offer documents (1.10); communicate with working group regarding same and related tender offer considerations (0.70).		
01/26/19	T HOFFMANN	1.20	1,170.00
	Review/analyze tender offer documents (1.00); communicate with Lennox regarding documents (0.20).		
01/26/19	G M HUNTER	2.20	1,760.00
	Draft comments to revised Schedule 14D-9, reviewing in connection with same Board minutes and prior correspondence in relation to background section (1.90); various correspondence with Jones Day working group regarding same (0.30).		
01/26/19	H LENNOX	0.20	270.00
	Communications with Hoffmann, Freeman regarding tender documents.		
01/26/19	A C THOMAS	5.70	4,417.50
	Review, drafting and coordination of comments to revised documents related to proposed tender offer, including Schedule TO, offer to purchase and Schedule 14D-9.		
01/26/19	M R WALLER	3.50	1,575.00
	Draft/revise tender offer documents (2.70); communicate in firm regarding the same (0.80).		
01/26/19	E B WINSLOW	2.20	2,310.00
	Review/analyze tender offer documents (1.70); communicate with working group regarding same (0.50).		
01/27/19	H P OSTER	1.10	440.00
	Revise final proof of Oxford 8-K.		
01/27/19	M F PODOLSKY	1.10	467.50
	Review and provide comments on 8-K proof.		
01/28/19	F E FREEMAN	0.30	180.00
	Discuss tender offer timing internally.		
01/28/19	G M HUNTER	0.90	720.00
	Attention to asset purchase agreement execution 8-K.		
01/28/19	M F PODOLSKY	1.30	552.50
	Finalize proof and file 8-K.		
01/28/19	A C THOMAS	1.00	775.00
	Review, drafting and coordination of comments to revised documents related to proposed tender offer, including Schedule TO, offer to purchase and Schedule 14D-9.		
01/31/19	H LENNOX	0.40	540.00
	Communications with Freeman, Laduzinski regarding tender timing issues and tax issues.		
01/31/19	A C THOMAS	0.30	232.50
	Respond to questions from client regarding timing of potential tender offer.		

JONES DAY

Securities Matters

Page 1

TOTAL	139.20	USD	103,812.50
--------------	---------------	------------	-------------------

01/02/19	L J JENULL	2.30	2,070.00
	Review and revise Schedule 14D-9 document for tax issues (1.50); review bid letter for tax issues (0.40); attend call with Lennox, Laduzinski, and Sexton (K&E) to discuss tax issues related to reorganization (0.40).		
01/02/19	C E LADUZINSKI	3.80	4,275.00
	Review and revise Schedule 14D-9 for tender offer (2.50); communicate with Jenull regarding tax comments to same (0.50); conference call with Sexton (K&E), Lennox and Jenull regarding net operating losses and tender offer matters (0.50); communicate with Lennox regarding WMLP asset bid documents and tender offer matters (0.30).		
01/02/19	H LENNOX	0.50	675.00
	Communications with Laduzinski, Sexton (K&E), Jenull regarding net operating loss issues.		
01/02/19	K A RUBIN	0.40	320.00
	Review term sheet for potential acquisition of Kemmerer assets.		
01/02/19	T V WALLACE	0.50	550.00
	Exchange multiple e-mails regarding tax discussion in tender offer documents (0.30); review same (0.20).		
01/03/19	C E LADUZINSKI	2.90	3,262.50
	Review and comment on WMLP bid letter (0.80); communicate with Rubin regarding tax review of WMLP bid letter and asset purchase agreement and preliminary transfer tax analysis (0.50); review asset purchase agreement (0.30); review as-filed WLB plan and disclosure statement (0.50); communicate with Lennox regarding tax analysis of same (0.30); communicate with Hoffmann regarding WMLP asset sale structure and timing (0.50).		
01/03/19	D RIMKUNAS	1.00	1,050.00
	Review transfer tax analyses, regarding analysis, review relevant laws, review documents.		
01/03/19	K A RUBIN	1.30	1,040.00
	Communications with Laduzinski and Rimkunas regarding transfer taxes relating to proposed sales (0.50); review asset purchase agreement markups relating to bid (0.80).		
01/04/19	C E LADUZINSKI	1.10	1,237.50
	Review comments to Schedule 14D-9 for proposed tender offer (0.30); review and respond to Lennox FICA question (0.80).		
01/07/19	C E LADUZINSKI	1.30	1,462.50
	Review revised Schedule 14D-9 for proposed tender offer for common units (0.40); communicate with Lennox, Winslow regarding same (0.30); communicate with Rubin regarding tax analysis of asset bids and purchase agreements (0.30); communicate with Lennox and Jenull regarding timing of Westmoreland sale (0.30).		
01/07/19	D RIMKUNAS	1.00	1,050.00
	Review sales tax analysis, communications regarding transfer taxes, term sheet, call with JD B&R, calls with Rubin.		
01/07/19	K A RUBIN	1.80	1,440.00
	Call with Laduzinski regarding proposed asset sale transactions (0.80); communications with Rimkunas and Podolsky regarding transfer taxes relating to proposed sales (1.00).		
01/08/19	C E LADUZINSKI	0.70	787.50
	Communicate with Hoffmann, Jenull and Wallace regarding structural alternatives to tender offer (0.40); review correspondence from Lennox and Winslow regarding securities law aspects of tender offer (0.10); review and analyze Rimkunas preliminary transfer tax analysis for WMLP asset sale (0.20).		
01/08/19	D RIMKUNAS	3.00	3,150.00
	Research OH, WY, KY laws (1.50); draft analysis regarding same (1.20); communications regarding analysis (0.30).		
01/08/19	K A RUBIN	0.40	320.00
	Communications with Laduzinski and Rimkunas regarding transfer taxes relating to proposed sales.		

Tax Matters		Page 2	
01/09/19	G M HUNTER Call with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) regarding Schedule 14D-9 and related internal follow-up correspondence pertaining to Conflicts Committee comments and process.	0.80	640.00
01/09/19	L J JENULL Attend call with Lennox, Laduzinski, and Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee) to discuss tax issues and tender offer.	0.80	720.00
01/09/19	L J JENULL Attend call with Olesen of PwC to discuss PwC tax deliverables and model (0.60); correspond with Sexton (K&E) and Lennox regarding calculations and information for tax analysis to be prepared by PwC (0.10).	0.70	630.00
01/09/19	C E LADUZINSKI Communicate with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee), Lennox, Jenull regarding tax aspects of WMLP sale process and tender offer (1.20); communicate with Sexton (K&E), Lennox and Jenull regarding PWC work plan, Kramer Levin tender offer tax analysis, and net operating losses (0.80); communicate with Rimkunas and Rubin regarding transfer tax analysis on WMLP asset sale (0.40); communicate with Lennox, Winston regarding tender offer documents (0.30).	2.70	3,037.50
01/09/19	H LENNOX Telephone conference with Laduzinski to prepare for tax call (0.20); call with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee), Laduzinski, Jenull regarding tax issues (0.80); follow-up communications with Laduzinski, Sexton (K&E), Jenull, Pesce (K&E) (0.50).	1.50	2,025.00
01/09/19	D RIMKUNAS Communications with JD tax and bankruptcy teams regarding transfer taxes (0.50); review relevant state laws (0.50).	1.00	1,050.00
01/10/19	L J JENULL Review and revise tax provisions in tender offer documents.	2.00	1,800.00
01/10/19	C E LADUZINSKI Communicate with Freeman, Zeltner, Rubin and Jenull regarding tax review of offer to purchase and letter of transmittal for tender offer and tax insert for motion regarding same (1.00); communicate with Kusnetz and Jenull regarding PWC tax model for WMLP (0.50).	1.50	1,687.50
01/10/19	K A RUBIN Review offer to purchase (0.40); draft tax comments to same (0.40).	0.80	640.00
01/11/19	L J JENULL Review and revise tax provisions in tender offer documents.	4.00	3,600.00
01/11/19	C E LADUZINSKI Review, analyze and comment on tender offer documents (2.00); communicate with Rubin and Jenull regarding tax comments to same (0.50); communicate with Kusnetz (SRZ), Jenull and Lennox regarding valuation analysis (0.80); communicate with Hoffmann and Zeltner regarding asset sale bids (0.20).	3.50	3,937.50
01/11/19	K A RUBIN Review offer to purchase (2.20); draft tax comments to same (2.30).	4.50	3,600.00
01/12/19	L J JENULL Review and revise tax provisions in tender offer documents.	2.50	2,250.00
01/12/19	C E LADUZINSKI Review and comment on revised offer to purchase for tender offer and draft of tax insert for motion regarding same (2.00); communicate with Rubin and Jenull regarding tax comments to same (1.00); communicate with Lennox, Jenull and Kusnetz regarding valuation analysis (0.50).	3.50	3,937.50
01/12/19	K A RUBIN Review revised offer to purchase (0.90); draft tax comments to same (0.80); draft tax language for motion relating to tender offer (0.80).	2.50	2,000.00
01/13/19	L J JENULL Discuss tax issues related to tender offer with Laduzinski and Wallace.	0.50	450.00
01/13/19	C E LADUZINSKI Conference call with Jenull and Wallace regarding valuation analysis in context of various transactions (0.70); communicate with Winslow and Lennox regarding tender offer matters (0.80).	1.50	1,687.50

01/13/19	T V WALLACE	0.80	880.00
	Calls with Laduzinski and Jenull regarding possible issues related to requested valuation and partnership tax basis (0.60); review communications with background for same (0.20).		
01/14/19	L J JENULL	1.00	900.00
	Prepare for and attend call with PwC, SRZ, and K&E to discuss valuation study of WMLP assets and WMLP tax returns (0.50); prepare for and attend call with K&E, PwC, A&M, and Lazard to discuss WMLP asset valuations and tax reporting issues (0.50).		
01/14/19	C E LADUZINSKI	1.50	1,687.50
	Conference call with Dillow (PWC), Sexton (K&E), Kusnetz (SRZ), Jenull regarding valuation analysis (0.50); conference call with Dillow (PWC), Sexton (K&E), Jenull regarding tax return preparation and K-1s (0.50); communicate with Jenull regarding same (0.50).		
01/15/19	L J JENULL	1.50	1,350.00
	Review and revise tax portions of tender offer motion.		
01/15/19	K A RUBIN	3.50	2,800.00
	Review intercompany settlement motion (0.50); draft tax comments to same (0.80); research regarding tax withholding on disposition of units in tender offer (1.50); draft tax comments to letter of transmittal (0.70).		
01/16/19	L J JENULL	4.90	4,410.00
	Tax analysis related to impact of redemption and tender offer on public unit holders (2.00); communicate with JD team regarding tax analysis related to impact of redemption and tender offer on public unit holders (1.00); attend call with Wallace and Sexton (K&E) to discuss tender offer and related tax issues (1.00); attend call with PwC, SRZ, and K&E to discuss tax return preparation and related issues (0.50); attend call with K&E to discuss tender offer and redemption process and documentation (0.40).		
01/16/19	C E LADUZINSKI	1.50	1,687.50
	Communicate with Jenull and Wallace regarding tax analysis of tender offer vs redemption (1.00); review and analyze correspondence from Lennox, Winslow, Freeman, Jenull and Wallace regarding same (0.50).		
01/16/19	T V WALLACE	2.00	2,200.00
	Call with Kirkland tax lawyers, Laduzinski and Jenull regarding tax issues related to (1.00); preparatory and follow-up calls and e-mails (1.00).		
01/17/19	L J JENULL	0.50	450.00
	Attend call with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee), Lennox, Wallace, and Winslow to discuss tender offer, redemption process, and related tax issues.		
01/17/19	C E LADUZINSKI	0.80	900.00
	Conference call with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee), Lennox, Winslow, Wallace, Jenull regarding tax consequences of tender offer transaction (0.50); communicate with Lennox, Jenull and Wallace regarding same (0.30).		
01/17/19	H LENNOX	0.50	675.00
	Tax call with Wallace, Winslow, Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee), Jenull regarding tax issues for sale and tender.		
01/17/19	T V WALLACE	1.40	1,540.00
	Call with Tywoniuk (Conflicts Committee), Lennox, Winslow and Jenull regarding limitations on tax information for purposes of evaluating the effects of a redemption (1.00); follow-up e-mails (0.20); draft examples for same (0.20).		
01/22/19	C E LADUZINSKI	0.80	900.00
	Preliminary review of WLB case closing motion and Description of Transaction Steps (plan supplement) (0.50); communicate with Sexton (K&E), Lennox, Zeltner and Hunter regarding same (0.30).		
01/23/19	C E LADUZINSKI	0.80	900.00
	Telephone conference with Sexton (K&E) regarding Description of Transaction Steps filing with Plan Supplement (0.50); follow up with Lennox regarding same (0.30).		
01/24/19	K A RUBIN	2.00	1,600.00
	Review all tender offer documents received from K&E.		

01/25/19	L J JENULL	2.50		2,250.00
	Review and revise tax provisions in tender offer documents (1.50); review comments from K&E related to same (0.50); attend call with Laduzinski and Sexton (K&E) to discuss tax comments to tender offer documents (0.50).			
01/25/19	C E LADUZINSKI	3.30		3,712.50
	Review and comment on various tender offer documents (1.80); communicate with Rubin and Jenull regarding tax comments to same (0.50); conference call with Sexton (K&E) and Jenull regarding timing of tender offer vs sale transactions (0.70); follow-up correspondence with Lennox regarding same (0.30).			
01/25/19	K A RUBIN	2.00		1,600.00
	Revise comments to tender offer documents (1.50); communications with Laduzinski and Jenull regarding same (0.50).			
01/26/19	C E LADUZINSKI	0.30		337.50
	Review correspondence from Winslow and Thomas regarding tender offer mechanics and open issues.			
01/31/19	C E LADUZINSKI	0.40		450.00
	Communicate with Lennox regarding timing of tender offer vs asset sales.			
	TOTAL	88.30	USD	87,612.50