

**IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
HOUSTON DIVISION**

In re:	§	
	§	Chapter 11
WESTMORELAND COAL COMPANY, <i>et al.</i> , ¹	§	
	§	Case No. 18-35672 (DRJ)
Debtors.	§	
	§	(Jointly Administered)
	§	

**NOTICE OF SUBMISSION OF REIMBURSEMENT REQUESTS
FOR EXPENSES INCURRED BY MEMBERS OF THE OFFICIAL
COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS**

PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that pursuant to the *Order Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals* [Docket No. 495] (the “**Interim Compensation Procedures Order**”), Morrison & Foerster LLP and Cole Schotz P.C., counsel for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the “**Committee**”), have collected and hereby submit the following requests for reimbursement of expenses incurred by members of the Committee:

Committee Member	Total Reimbursement Requested
Ohio Machinery Co.	\$27,269.27
Wheeler Machinery Co.	\$25,361.95

¹ Due to the large number of debtors in these chapter 11 cases, for which joint administration has been granted, a complete list of the debtors and the last four digits of their tax identification, registration, or like numbers is not provided herein. A complete list of such information may be obtained on the website of the Debtors’ claims and noticing agent in these chapter 11 cases at www.donlinrecano.com/westmoreland. Westmoreland Coal Company’s service address for the purposes of these chapter 11 cases is 9540 South Maroon Circle, Suite 300, Englewood, Colorado 80112.

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that the expense reimbursement reports supporting the Committee members' reimbursement requests are attached hereto as **Exhibits A** and **B**.²

PLEASE TAKE FURTHER NOTICE that pursuant to the Interim Compensation Procedures Order, each party receiving notice of these requests will have until 4:00 p.m. (Prevailing Central Time) 21 days after service of this notice to object to the expense reimbursements requested herein. Upon the expiration of such 21-day period, the Debtors shall be authorized and directed to pay 100% of the expenses requested herein. If an objection is timely filed and served in accordance with the Interim Compensation Procedures Order, the Debtors shall be authorized and directed to pay 100% the expenses that are not subject to an objection.

[Signature page follows]

² Additional documentation supporting each Committee member's request will be made available upon request.

Dated: April 8, 2019

/s/ Michael D. Warner

Michael D. Warner (TX Bar No.00792304)
COLE SCHOTZ P.C.
301 Commerce Street, Suite 1700
Fort Worth, TX 76102
T: (817) 810-5250
F: (817) 977-5273
mwarner@coleschotz.com

-and-

Lorenzo Marinuzzi, Esq. (Admitted Pro Hac Vice)
Todd Goren, Esq. (Admitted Pro Hac Vice)
Jennifer L. Marines, Esq. (Admitted Pro Hac Vice)
MORRISON & FOERSTER LLP
250 West 55th Street
New York, New York 10019
Telephone: (212) 468-8000
Facsimile: (212) 468-7900
lmarinuzzi@mofocom
tgoren@mofocom
jmarines@mofocom

*Counsel for the Official Committee of Unsecured
Creditors*

EXHIBIT A

Ohio Machinery Co.

WOLCOTT RIVERS GATES
 ATTORNEYS AT LAW
 CONVERGENCE CENTER V
 200 BENDIX ROAD, SUITE 300
 VIRGINIA BEACH, VIRGINIA 23452-1396
 TELEPHONE (757) 497-6633
 FAX (757) 497-6225
 FEDERAL I.D. 54-0965451
 www.wolcottriversgates.com

ATTN: WALTER C. KEAL
 OHIO MACHINERY CO.
 3993 E. ROYALTON ROAD
 BROADVIEW HEIGHTS OH 44147

PAGE 1
 04/03/2019
ACCT NO.: XXXXXXXXXX
INVOICE NO.: 451776

RE: WESTMORELAND COAL UCC

			HOURS	
10/16/2018	CDS	ANALYSIS OF PROPOSED FIRST DAY ORDERS AND DEADLINES FOR OBJECTION, COMMUNICATE WITH OFFICE OF THE UNITED STATES TRUSTEE, DEBTORS COUNSEL, AND SEVERAL OTHER PROFESSIONALS REGARDING COMMITTEE FORMATION AND INITIAL STEPS WITH RESPECT THERETO.	1.00	350.00
10/18/2018	CDS	PARTICIPATE IN ORGANIZATIONAL MEETINGS AND SEVERAL TELEPHONE CALLS ARRANGING FOR NEXT STEPS IN COMMITTEE BUSINESS.	1.80	630.00
	JDS	READ COMMITTEE FORMATION PLEADING.	0.10	30.00
10/19/2018	EMY	CONF. CALL WITH UST, SUBSEQUENT CONF. CALL WITH UNSECURED CREDITOR COMMITTEE.	0.50	125.00
	CDS	PARTICIPATE IN COMMITTEE FORMATION MEETING AND CONDUCT DISCUSSION REGARDING PROFESSIONAL INTERVIEWS, ORGANIZE PROFESSIONAL PRESENTATIONS AND DISSEMINATE NECESSARY DOCUMENTS TO COMMITTEE MEMBERS AND VARIOUS OTHER PARTIES.	2.40	840.00
	CLB	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH C. SPECKHART AND VARIOUS PARTIES REGARDING LOGISTICS FOR MONDAY'S MEETING WITH PROFESSIONALS IN NYC.	1.00	90.00
	JDS	READ EMAIL FROM C. SPECKHART REGARDING COMMITTEE MATTERS; TELECONFERENCE WITH C. BRADLEY REGARDING THE SAME.	0.10	30.00
10/20/2018	CLB	CREATE DATA ROOM CONTAINING PROFESSIONALS' PRESENTATION MATERIALS AND CIRCULATE LINK TO SAME TO COMMITTEE MEMBERS.	1.50	135.00
10/21/2018	CLB	UPDATE DATA ROOM AND RECIRCULATE LINK TO COMMITTEE MEMBERS.	0.80	72.00
	CDS	PREPARATIONS FOR COMMITTEE FORMATION PROCESS INCLUDING REVIEW OF PROFESSIONAL MATERIALS AND DISCUSSION WITH COUNSEL FOR OTHER COMMITTEE MEMBERS ABOUT CASE OBJECTIVES AND PROFESSIONAL SELECTION.	3.00	1,050.00
10/22/2018	CLB	COMMUNICATIONS WITH VARIOUS COMMITTEE MEMBERS REGARDING LOGISTICS FOR COMMITTEE PROFESSIONALS PRESENTATIONS; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH C. SPECKHART REGARDING SAME.	0.50	45.00
	CDS	PARTICIPATE IN COMMITTEE FORMATION PROCESS.	6.00	2,100.00

ACCT NO.: [REDACTED]
 INVOICE NO.: 451776

RE: WESTMORELAND COAL UCC

			HOURS	
10/23/2018	CDS	DISCUSSIONS WITH L. MARINUZZI REGARDING WEEKLY CALLS AND IMMEDIATE ACTION ITEMS FOR COMMITTEE MEMBERS INCLUDING PREPARATION OF BYLAWS AND CERTAIN CONFIDENTIALITY AGREEMENTS.	0.80	280.00
10/24/2018	JDS	READ EMAIL REGARDING INITIAL COMMITTEE MATTERS; READ EMAIL FROM A. KISSNER RE: COAL ACT FUNDS MOTION AND COMPLAINT.	0.10	30.00
10/25/2018	EMY	INITIAL CALL WITH MOFO.	0.70	175.00
	JDS	READ EMAIL FROM A. KISSNER REGARDING UPDATE AND PREPARATION FOR UPCOMING COMMITTEE CALL; READ/REVIEW AGENDA REGARDING THE SAME. READ EMAIL FROM A. KISSNER REGARDING COMMITTEE UPDATE.	0.10	30.00
10/31/2018	EMY	WEEKLY COMMITTEE CONF. CALL.	1.10	275.00
	JDS	READ EMAIL FROM A. KISSNER RE: CONTINUANCE OF SECOND DAY HEARING; ATTEND VIA TELECONFERENCE 10/31/18 COMMITTEE CALL.	0.15	45.00
	CDS	PARTICIPATE IN COMMITTEE CONFERENCE CALL AND DISCUSS STATUS OF FIRST DAY MATTERS WITH L. MARINUZZI.	0.90	315.00
11/01/2018	JDS	READ EMAIL FROM A. KISSNER RE: CONTINUANCE OF A SECOND DAY HEARING; COMMUNICATION WITH E. CONWAY RE: COMMITTEE MEETINGS; READ EMAILS EXCHANGED RE: UPDATE ON WLP FINAL DIP ORDER.	0.15	45.00
	JDS	READ EMAILS EXCHANGED RE: COMMITTEE BYLAWS.	0.10	30.00
11/02/2018	JDS	READ EMAIL FROM A. KISSNER RE: 11/2/18 CASE UPDATE.	0.10	30.00
11/06/2018	CDS	REVIEW COMMITTEE MATERIALS IN ADVANCE OF COMMITTEE CALL TOMORROW.	0.30	105.00
	JDS	READ/REVIEW NOTICE RE: HEARING ON DISCLOSURE STATEMENT; INTERNAL COMMUNICATIONS RE: SAME.	0.10	30.00
11/07/2018	EMY	WEEKLY COMMITTEE CONF. CALL.	0.60	150.00
	JDS	ATTEND VIA TELECONFERENCE 11/7/18 COMMITTEE CALL.	0.35	105.00
	CDS	MEETING IN NYC WITH L. MARINUZZI AND MOFO PROFESSIONAL TEAM.	1.00	350.00
	CDS	ANALYSIS OF INFORMATION SHARED REGARDING MLP DEBTOR GROUP AND POTENTIAL IMPLICATIONS OF SALE PROCESS ON PREPETITION CLAIM AMOUNTS.	0.90	315.00
11/12/2018	JDS	READ EMAIL FROM A. KISSNER RE: 11/9/18 COMMITTEE UPDATE.	0.10	30.00
11/15/2018	EMY	CONF. CALL, LISTENED TO SECOND DAY HEARINGS.	1.25	312.50
11/19/2018	EMY	WEEKLY COMMITTEE CONF. CALL.	0.60	150.00
	CDS	EXTENSIVE COMMUNICATION WITH C. KEAL AND MOFO TEAM REGARDING RETENTION APPLICATIONS.	2.00	700.00
11/20/2018	JDS	READ EMAILS EXCHANGED RE: COMMITTEE PROFESSIONAL RETENTION MATTERS.	0.10	30.00

ACCT NO.: [REDACTED]
 INVOICE NO.: 451776

RE: WESTMORELAND COAL UCC

			HOURS	
11/21/2018	CDS	COMMUNICATION WITH L. MARINUZZI REGARDING RETENTION APPLICATIONS, PROGRESS IN SETTLEMENT WITH SENIOR SECURED AND STATUS OF MLP PROCESS.	0.90	315.00
11/27/2018	JDS	READ EMAIL FROM A. KISSNER RE: COMMITTEE CALL MATERIALS AND UPDATE.	0.10	30.00
	CDS	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF COMMUNICATIONS FROM MOFO REGARDING STATUS OF KERP PROCEEDINGS.	0.40	140.00
	CDS	COMMUNICATIONS WITH MOFO REGARDING UPCOMING PROCEEDINGS ON PROFESSIONAL RETENTIONS IN TEXAS, ANALYSIS OF ISSUES FOR EVIDENTIARY PRESENTATION, DISCUSS SCHEDULING AND LOGISTICS WITH C. KEAL.	1.10	385.00
	CDS	PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALLS WITH COUNSEL FOR CAT FINANCIAL.	0.50	212.50
11/28/2018	EMY	WEEKLY COMMITTEE CONF. CALL.	0.60	150.00
	CDS	COMMUNICATE WITH COMMITTEE PROFESSIONALS REGARDING STATUS OF RETENTION MOTIONS.	0.40	140.00
11/29/2018	JDS	READ AND DRAFT REPLY TO C. SPECKHART RE: JEFFRIES RETENTION ORDER; DRAFT EMAIL TO C. SPECKHART RE: ORDER VACATING JEFFRIES RETENTION ORDER.	0.10	30.00
12/03/2018	CDS	COMMUNICATION WITH T. MAYER, L. MARINUZZI, G. PESCE AND CLIENT REGARDING EXPECTATIONS FOR HEARING ON JEFFERIES RETENTION.	0.70	297.50
12/04/2018	CDS	MEET WITH CLIENT AND COMMITTEE COUNSEL, PREPARE FOR HEARINGS ON JEFFERIES RETENTION APPLICATION.	6.00	2,100.00
12/05/2018	CDS	TRAVEL TO TX FROM VA FOLLOWING RESOLUTION OF MATTERS PERTAINING TO JEFFERIES RETENTION.	5.50	962.50
12/10/2018	JDS	READ/REVIEW EMAIL FROM A. KISSNER RE: COMMITTEE UPDATE 12/4/18; READ EMAIL FROM B. BUTTERFIELD RE: STATUS OF COMMITTEE NEGOTIATIONS OVER DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.	0.10	30.00
12/12/2018	EMY	WEEKLY COMMITTEE CONF. CALL.	0.80	200.00
12/18/2018	JDS	READ EMAIL FROM B. BUTTERFIELD RE: HEARING UPDATE.	0.10	30.00
12/19/2018	EMY	WEEKLY COMMITTEE CONF. CALL.	0.70	175.00
	JDS	ATTEND VIA TELECONFERENCE 12/19/18 COMMITTEE CALL.	0.15	45.00
	CDS	PARTICIPATE TELEPHONICALLY IN HEARING ON DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND OTHER MATTERS SET FOR OMNIBUS PROCEEDINGS.	2.00	700.00
12/27/2018	JDS	READ EMAIL FROM B. BUTTERFIELD RE: COMMITTEE UPDATE AND RECENT FILINGS.	0.10	30.00
	JDS	READ EMAIL FROM A. KISSNER RE: EXCLUSIVITY EXTENSION MOTION.	0.10	30.00
	CDS	PARTICIPATE IN COMMITTEE CALL.	0.50	175.00
01/02/2019	EMY	WEEKLY COMMITTEE CONF. CALL; LISTENED TO HEARING ON RETIREE REPRESENTATIVE.	0.45	112.50

ACCT NO.: [REDACTED]
 INVOICE NO.: 451776

RE: WESTMORELAND COAL UCC

			HOURS	
01/09/2019	JDS	ATTEND 1/9/19 COMMITTEE CALL.	0.35	105.00
	EMY	WEEKLY COMMITTEE CONF. CALL.	0.40	100.00
01/10/2019	OVA	TELEPHONIC ATTENDANCE OF THE COMMITTEE CALL.	0.50	150.00
	JDS	ATTEND 1/10/19 COMMITTEE CALL.	0.20	60.00
	EMY	LISTENED TO COMM. CALL RE: PROPOSAL	0.75	187.50
01/11/2019	JDS	ATTEND 1/11/19 COMMITTEE CALL.	0.15	45.00
	EMY	LISTENED TO COMM. CALL RE: PROPOSAL.	0.25	62.50
01/14/2019	EMY	COMM. CALL REVIEWING TERM SHEET REVISIONS FROM DEBTOR.	0.25	62.50
01/16/2019	CDS	PARTICIPATE IN COMMITTEE CONFERENCE CALL.	0.30	105.00
	JDS	ATTEND 1/16/19 HEARING TELEPHONICALLY.	0.30	90.00
	EMY	WEEKLY COMMITTEE CONFERENCE CALL.	0.45	112.50
01/18/2019	EMY	COMM. CALL WITH MOST RECENT SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS.	0.20	50.00
	CDS	COMMUNICATIONS WITH MOFO REGARDING STATUS OF DISCUSSION WITH WLB LENDERS AND DEBTORS REGARDING COMMITTEE SETTLEMENT.	0.20	70.00
	CDS	COMMUNICATE WITH A. SMITH REGARDING TERMS OF SETTLEMENT.	0.20	70.00
01/20/2019	CDS	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF CASE STATUS CORRESPONDENCE FROM MOFO AND ATTENTION TO APPROACHING DATES AND DEADLINES.	0.30	105.00
01/22/2019	CDS	RECEIPT AND PRELIMINARY REVIEW OF AGENDA AND CALL MATERIALS IN ADVANCE OF TOMORROW'S COMMITTEE DISCUSSION.	0.30	105.00
01/23/2019	JDS	ATTEND 1/23/19 COMMITTEE CALL.	0.25	75.00
	EMY	WEEKLY COMMITTEE CONF. CALL.	0.40	100.00
01/24/2019	CDS	REVIEW OF UCC DRAFT STATEMENT IN RESPECT OF WLB SETTLEMENT, RESPOND TO MOFO REGARDING SAME.	0.30	105.00
01/26/2019	CDS	REVIEW OF CLAIMS MATTERS, DISCUSS WITH COUNSEL FOR DEBTOR AND COMMITTEE.	0.50	175.00
01/28/2019	CDS	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF COMMITTEE COMMUNICATION REGARDING CONFIRMATION OBJECTIONS.	0.30	105.00
01/29/2019	CDS	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF CALL AGENDA.	0.30	105.00
01/30/2019	CDS	REVIEW MATERIALS AND SUMMARY OF RECENT FILINGS IN ADVANCE OF COMMITTEE CALL.	0.40	140.00
	EMY	WEEKLY COMMITTEE CONF. CALL.	0.70	175.00
	JDS	ATTEND WEEKLY COMMITTEE CALL.	0.25	75.00
01/31/2019	CDS	COMMUNICATIONS WITH MOFO REGARDING STATUS OF MATTER AND UPCOMING DATES AND DEADLINES, MOTIONS PENDING AND STATUS OF 1113/1114 PROCEEDINGS.	0.30	105.00
	CDS	COMMUNICATIONS WITH MOFO REGARDING STATUS OF MATTER AND		

ACCT NO.: [REDACTED]
 INVOICE NO.: 451776

RE: WESTMORELAND COAL UCC

			HOURS	
		UPCOMING DATES AND DEADLINES, MOTIONS PENDING AND STATUS OF 1113/1114 PROCEEDINGS.	0.30	105.00
02/03/2019	JDS	READ/REVIEW EMAIL FROM A. KISSNER RE: CASE UPDATE; READ EMAIL FROM E. RICHARDS RE: CASE UPDATE.	0.10	30.00
02/04/2019	CDS	REVIEW DOCKET AND COMMUNICATE WITH MOFO AND CLIENTS REGARDING PRESENT STATUS OF MATTERS.	0.30	105.00
	EMY	LISTENED TO OMIBUS HEARING	0.75	187.50
02/05/2019	CDS	REVIEW MATERIALS CIRCULATED IN ADVANCE OF COMMITTEE CALL, REVIEW KEMMERRER MINE SALE ASPECTS AND CURE SCHEDULE.	0.30	105.00
02/06/2019	EMY	WEEKLY COMMITTEE CONF. CALL.	0.45	112.50
02/08/2019	CDS	RECEIVE AND REVIEW UPDATE TO COMMITTEE FROM MOFO, ANALYZE PENDING MATTERS ON DOCKET AND REVIEW STATUS OF UPCOMING CONFIRMATION PROCEEDINGS.	0.40	140.00
02/13/2019	EMY	WEEKLY COMMITTEE CONF. CALL.	0.40	100.00
	CDS	REVIEW OF COMMITTEE COMMUNICATIONS AND TELEPHONE DISCUSSION WITH L. MARINUZZI.	0.60	210.00
	JDS	ATTEND 2/13/19 COMMITTEE CALL.	0.40	120.00
02/15/2019	JDS	READ EMAIL FROM A. KISSNER RE: COMMITTEE UPDATE.	0.10	30.00
	CDS	REVIEW OF STANDING MOTION AND ATTACHED COMPLAINT, COMMUNICATIONS WITH MOFO REGARDING SAME.	0.75	262.50
02/18/2019	JDS	ATTEND 2/18/19 COMMITTEE MEETING.	0.20	60.00
	CDS	PARTICIPATE IN COMMITTEE CONFERENCE CALL.	0.40	140.00
	EMY	COMM. CALL RE: SETTLEMENT WITH MLP LENDERS.	0.30	75.00
02/20/2019	CDS	PARTICIPATE IN COMMITTEE CALL.	0.25	87.50
02/24/2019	EMY	COMM. CALL RE: SETTLEMENT WITH MLP LENDERS.	0.25	62.50
02/25/2019	JDS	READ EMAIL FROM A. KISSNER RE: COAL ACT SETTLEMENT.	0.10	30.00
02/26/2019	CDS	REVIEW DOCKET AND AGENDA IN ADVANCE OF CONFIRMATION PROCEEDINGS.	0.50	175.00
02/27/2019	JDS	ATTEND 2/27/19 COMMITTEE CALL.	0.10	30.00
	CDS	PARTICIPATE IN COMMITTEE CALL.	0.25	87.50
02/28/2019	CDS	ATTEND CONFIRMATION AND SALE HEARINGS AT WLB/MLP AS WELL AS MEETINGS WITH ESTATE PROFESSIONALS.	4.00	1,400.00
03/01/2019	JDS	READ EMAIL FROM A. KISSNER RE: SUMMARY OF WLB CONFIRMATION HEARING.	0.10	30.00
03/06/2019	JDS	ATTEND 3/6/19 WEEKLY COMMITTEE CALL.	0.10	30.00
	EMY	WEEKLY COMM. CONF. CALL.	0.15	37.50

ACCT NO.: [REDACTED]
 INVOICE NO.: 451776

RE: WESTMORELAND COAL UCC

		HOURS	
	CDS FOLLOW UP WITH J. STIFF REGARDING COMMITTEE CALL.	0.15	52.50
03/13/2019	JDS ATTEND 3/13/19 COMMITTEE CALL; FOLLOW-UP TELECONFERENCE WITH C. SPECKHART.	0.10	30.00
	EMY WEEKLY COMM. CONF CALL.	0.10	25.00
03/20/2019	EMY WEEKLY COMM. CONF. CALL.	0.25	62.50
	JDS ATTEND 3/20/19 COMMITTEE CALL.	0.20	60.00
03/21/2019	CDS RECEIPT OF UPDATE FROM MOFO REGARDING STATUS CONFERENCE HELD IN TEXAS.	0.30	127.50
03/22/2019	CDS RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF COMPLAINT FILED ON BEHALF OF WLB PURCHASER AND READ NOTE FROM MOFO REGARDING SAME.	0.30	127.50
03/26/2019	JDS READ/REVIEW EMAIL RE: TRO HEARING.	0.10	30.00
03/27/2019	JDS ATTEND 3/27/19 WEEKLY COMMITTEE TELECONFERENCE.	0.15	45.00
	JDS TELECONFERENCE WITH C. SPECKHART RE: OHIO CAT/WHEELER COMMITTEE FEES & EXPENSES.	0.10	30.00
	FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED	73.60	22,302.00
10/19/2018	OUT OF TOWN TRAVEL - CDS/TRAVEL TO NYC FOR UCC COMMITTEE COUNSEL PITCHES - ELYSEE HOTEL		442.99
11/06/2018	OUT OF TOWN TRAVEL - TRAVEL/LODGING/PARKING		609.19
12/05/2018	OUT OF TOWN TRAVEL - CULLEN D. SPECKHART		63.83
12/06/2018	OUT OF TOWN TRAVEL - CULLEN D. SPECKHART		1,749.00
03/01/2019	OUT OF TOWN TRAVEL - TRAVEL TO HOUSTON FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING - CULLEN D. SPECKHART		1,121.26
03/22/2019	OUT OF TOWN TRAVEL - CULLEN D. SPECKHART		981.00
	ADVANCES THRU 03/31/2019		4,967.27
	TOTAL CURRENT WORK		27,269.27
	PLEASE REMIT		\$27,269.27

EXHIBIT B

Wheeler Machinery Co.

WOLCOTT RIVERS GATES
 ATTORNEYS AT LAW
 CONVERGENCE CENTER V
 200 BENDIX ROAD, SUITE 300
 VIRGINIA BEACH, VIRGINIA 23452-1396
 TELEPHONE (757) 497-6633
 FAX (757) 497-6225
 FEDERAL I.D. 54-0965451
 www.wolcottriversgates.com

WHEELER MACHINERY AP
 4901 WEST 2100 SOUTH
 SALT LAKE CITY UT 84120

PAGE 1
 04/03/2019
ACCT NO.: [REDACTED]
INVOICE NO.: 451775

RE: WESTMORELAND COAL COMPANY UCC

			HOURS	
10/10/2018	CDS	REVIEW MATERIALS PREPARED FOR UNITED STATES TRUSTEE, COMMUNICATE WITH APPROPRIATE INDIVIDUALS AT OFFICE OF UST REGARDING SOLICITATION MATTERS, PROVIDE UPDATES TO CLIENTS REGARDING FORMATION PROCESS.	2.00	700.00
	CLB	REVISE AND UPDATE SOLICITATION PACKAGE FOR MEMBERSHIP ON UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE; CIRCULATE SAME TO C. SPECKHART FOR REVIEW.	1.10	99.00
	CLB	REVISE AND UPDATE SOLICITATION PACKAGE FOR MEMBERSHIP ON UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE; CIRCULATE SAME TO C. SPECKHART FOR REVIEW.	1.10	99.00
10/16/2018	CDS	ANALYSIS OF PROPOSED FIRST DAY ORDERS AND DEADLINES FOR OBJECTION, COMMUNICATE WITH OFFICE OF THE UNITED STATES TRUSTEE, DEBTORS COUNSEL, AND SEVERAL OTHER PROFESSIONALS REGARDING COMMITTEE FORMATION AND INITIAL STEPS WITH RESPECT THERETO.	1.00	350.00
10/18/2018	CDS	PARTICIPATE IN ORGANIZATIONAL MEETINGS AND SEVERAL TELEPHONE CALLS ARRANGING FOR NEXT STEPS IN COMMITTEE BUSINESS.	1.80	630.00
	JDS	READ COMMITTEE FORMATION PLEADING.	0.10	30.00
10/19/2018	EMY	CONF. CALL WITH UST, SUBSEQUENT CONF. CALL WITH UNSECURED CREDITOR COMMITTEE.	0.50	125.00
	CDS	PARTICIPATE IN COMMITTEE FORMATION MEETING AND CONDUCT DISCUSSION REGARDING PROFESSIONAL INTERVIEWS, ORGANIZE PROFESSIONAL PRESENTATIONS AND DISSEMINATE NECESSARY DOCUMENTS TO COMMITTEE MEMBERS AND VARIOUS OTHER PARTIES.	2.40	840.00
	CLB	MULTIPLE COMMUNICATIONS WITH C. SPECKHART AND VARIOUS PARTIES REGARDING LOGISTICS FOR MONDAY'S MEETING WITH PROFESSIONALS IN NYC.	1.00	90.00
	JDS	READ EMAIL FROM C. SPECKHART REGARDING COMMITTEE MATTERS; TELECONFERENCE WITH C. BRADLEY REGARDING THE SAME.	0.10	30.00
10/20/2018	CLB	CREATE DATA ROOM CONTAINING PROFESSIONALS' PRESENTATION MATERIALS AND CIRCULATE LINK TO SAME TO COMMITTEE MEMBERS.	1.50	135.00

ACCT NO.: [REDACTED]
 INVOICE NO.: 451775

RE: WESTMORELAND COAL COMPANY UCC

			HOURS	
10/21/2018	CDS	PREPARATIONS FOR COMMITTEE FORMATION PROCESS INCLUDING REVIEW OF PROFESSIONAL MATERIALS AND DISCUSSION WITH COUNSEL FOR OTHER COMMITTEE MEMBERS ABOUT CASE OBJECTIVES AND PROFESSIONAL SELECTION.	3.00	1,050.00
	CLB	UPDATE DATA ROOM AND RECIRCULATE LINK TO COMMITTEE MEMBERS.	0.80	72.00
10/22/2018	CDS	PARTICIPATE IN COMMITTEE FORMATION PROCESS.	6.00	2,100.00
	CLB	COMMUNICATIONS WITH VARIOUS COMMITTEE MEMBERS REGARDING LOGISTICS FOR COMMITTEE PROFESSIONALS PRESENTATIONS; FOLLOW-UP COMMUNICATIONS WITH C. SPEKHART REGARDING SAME.	0.50	45.00
10/23/2018	CDS	DISCUSSIONS WITH L. MARINUZZI REGARDING WEEKLY CALLS AND IMMEDIATE ACTION ITEMS FOR COMMITTEE MEMBERS INCLUDING PREPARATION OF BYLAWS AND CERTAIN CONFIDENTIALITY AGREEMENTS.	0.80	280.00
10/24/2018	JDS	READ EMAIL REGARDING INITIAL COMMITTEE MATTERS; READ EMAIL FROM A. KISSNER RE: COAL ACT FUNDS MOTION AND COMPLAINT.	0.10	30.00
10/25/2018	EMY	INITIAL CALL WITH MOFO.	0.70	175.00
	CDS	COMMUNICATIONS WITH COMPANY REGARDING LIENHOLDER PAYMENT PROCESS, ANALYSIS OF CAPITAL AND DEBT STRUCTURE WITH REFERENCE TO PROPOSED DIP PROVISIONS AND CASH COLLATERAL ORDER, PRELIMINARY REVIEW OF COMMITTEE BYLAWS AND CONFIDENTIALITY PROVISIONS, DISCUSSION WITH CLIENT.	1.40	490.00
	JDS	READ EMAIL FROM A. KISSNER REGARDING UPDATE AND PREPARATION FOR UPCOMING COMMITTEE CALL; READ/REVIEW AGENDA REGARDING THE SAME; READ EMAIL FROM A. KISSNER REGARDING COMMITTEE UPDATE.	0.10	30.00
10/29/2018	CDS	REVIEW COMMITTEE BYLAWS IN ADVANCE OF CIRCULATION TO CLIENT FOR ENDORSEMENT.	0.40	140.00
10/31/2018	EMY	WEEKLY COMMITTEE CONF. CALL.	1.10	275.00
	CDS	PARTICIPATE IN COMMITTEE CONFERENCE CALL AND DISCUSS STATUS OF FIRST DAY MATTERS WITH L. MARINUZZI.	0.90	315.00
	JDS	READ EMAIL FROM A. KISSNER RE: CONTINUANCE OF SECOND DAY HEARING; ATTEND VIA TELECONFERENCE 10/31/18 COMMITTEE CALL.	0.15	45.00
11/01/2018	JDS	READ EMAIL FROM A. KISSNER RE: CONTINUANCE OF A SECOND DAY HEARING; COMMUNICATION WITH E. CONWAY RE: COMMITTEE MEETINGS; READ EMAILS EXCHANGED RE: UPDATE ON WLP FINAL DIP ORDER.	0.15	45.00
	JDS	READ EMAILS EXCHANGED RE: COMMITTEE BYLAWS.	0.10	30.00
11/02/2018	JDS	READ EMAIL FROM A. KISSNER RE: 11/2/18 CASE UPDATE.	0.10	30.00
11/05/2018	CDS	EMAILS WITH L. MARINUZZI REGARDING WORKPLAN AND DIVISION OF LABOR FOR PROFESSIONALS, REVIEW SAME IN CONNECTION WITH RETENTION APPLICATIONS.	0.50	175.00

ACCT NO.: [REDACTED]
 INVOICE NO.: 451775

RE: WESTMORELAND COAL COMPANY UCC

			HOURS	
11/06/2018	JDS	READ/REVIEW NOTICE RE: HEARING ON DISCLOSURE STATEMENT; INTERNAL COMMUNICATIONS RE: SAME.	0.10	30.00
	CDS	ANALYSIS OF DIP LANGUAGE REGARDING RENTED EQUIPMENT, DISCUSS WITH G. PESCE AND L. MARINUZZI WITH REFERENCE TO UNDERLYING DOCUMENTS AND DEFINITIONS OF PRE-EXISTING LIENS.	1.30	455.00
	CDS	REVIEW COMMITTEE MATERIALS IN ADVANCE OF COMMITTEE CALL TOMORROW.	0.30	105.00
11/07/2018	JDS	ATTEND VIA TELECONFERENCE 11/7/18 COMMITTEE CALL.	0.35	105.00
	EMY	WEEKLY COMMITTEE CONF. CALL.	0.60	150.00
	CDS	MEETING IN NYC WITH L. MARINUZZI AND MOFO PROFESSIONAL TEAM.	1.00	350.00
	CDS	ANALYSIS OF INFORMATION SHARED REGARDING MLP DEBTOR GROUP AND POTENTIAL IMPLICATIONS OF SALE PROCESS ON PREPETITION CLAIM AMOUNTS.	0.90	315.00
11/12/2018	JDS	READ EMAIL FROM A. KISSNER RE: 11/9/18 COMMITTEE UPDATE.	0.10	30.00
11/15/2018	EMY	CONF. CALL, LISTENED TO SECOND DAY HEARINGS.	1.25	312.50
11/16/2018	CDS	FURTHER REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF DRAFT RETENTION PLEADINGS AND DISCUSS DECLARATIONS WITH CLIENT, ANALYSIS OF APPLICABLE BANKRUPTCY COURT PRECEDENT AND PARAMETERS OF LIVE TESTIMONY.	2.30	805.00
11/19/2018	CDS	REVIEW COMMITTEE MATERIALS AND PARTICIPATE ON COMMITTEE CONFERENCE CALL.	1.00	350.00
	EMY	WEEKLY COMMITTEE CONF. CALL.	0.60	150.00
11/20/2018	JDS	READ EMAILS EXCHANGED RE: COMMITTEE PROFESSIONAL RETENTION MATTERS.	0.10	30.00
11/21/2018	CDS	COMMUNICATION WITH L. MARINUZZI REGARDING RETENTION APPLICATIONS, PROGRESS IN SETTLEMENT WITH SENIOR SECURED AND STATUS OF MLP PROCESS.	0.90	315.00
11/27/2018	JDS	READ EMAIL FROM A. KISSNER RE: COMMITTEE CALL MATERIALS AND UPDATE.	0.10	30.00
	CDS	FURTHER COMMUNICATIONS WITH D. BLANKS REGARDING STATUS OF CLAIMS RECONCILIATIONS AND NEGOTIATIONS.	0.40	140.00
	CDS	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF COMMUNICATIONS FROM MOFO REGARDING STATUS OF KERP PROCEEDINGS.	0.40	140.00
	CDS	COMMUNICATIONS WITH MOFO REGARDING UPCOMING PROCEEDINGS ON PROFESSIONAL RETENTIONS IN TEXAS, ANALYSIS OF ISSUES FOR EVIDENTIARY PRESENTATION, DISCUSS SCHEDULING AND LOGISTICS.	1.10	385.00
11/28/2018	EMY	WEEKLY COMMITTEE CONF. CALL.	0.60	150.00
	CDS	COMMUNICATE WITH COMMITTEE PROFESSIONALS REGARDING STATUS OF RETENTION MOTIONS.	0.40	140.00
11/29/2018	JDS	READ AND DRAFT REPLY TO C. SPECKHART RE: JEFFRIES RETENTION ORDER; DRAFT EMAIL TO C. SPECKHART RE: ORDER VACATING JEFFRIES RETENTION ORDER.	0.10	30.00

ACCT NO.: [REDACTED]
 INVOICE NO.: 451775

RE: WESTMORELAND COAL COMPANY UCC

		HOURS	
	CDS	COMMUNICATION WITH L. MARINUZZI REGARDING ENTRY OF ORDER APPROVING COMMITTEE RETENTION MOTIONS.	0.50 175.00
12/10/2018	JDS	READ/REVIEW EMAIL FROM A. KISSNER RE: COMMITTEE UPDATE 12/4/18; READ EMAIL FROM B. BUTTERFIELD RE: STATUS OF COMMITTEE NEGOTIATIONS OVER DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.	0.10 30.00
12/12/2018	EMY	WEEKLY COMMITTEE CONF. CALL.	0.80 200.00
12/18/2018	JDS	READ EMAIL FROM B. BUTTERFIELD RE: HEARING UPDATE.	0.10 30.00
12/19/2018	JDS	ATTEND VIA TELECONFERENCE 12/19/18 COMMITTEE CALL.	0.15 45.00
	EMY	WEEKLY COMMITTEE CONF. CALL.	0.70 175.00
	CDS	PARTICIPATE TELEPHONICALLY IN HEARING ON DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND OTHER MATTERS SET FOR OMNIBUS PROCEEDINGS.	2.00 700.00
12/21/2018	CDS	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF UPDATE FROM MOFO REGARDING EXCLUSIVITY EXTENSION, REVIEW DOCKET.	0.30 105.00
12/27/2018	JDS	READ EMAIL FROM B. BUTTERFIELD RE: COMMITTEE UPDATE AND RECENT FILINGS.	0.10 30.00
	JDS	READ EMAIL FROM A. KISSNER RE: EXCLUSIVITY EXTENSION MOTION.	0.10 30.00
	CDS	PARTICIPATE IN COMMITTEE CALL.	0.50 175.00
01/02/2019	EMY	WEEKLY COMMITTEE CONF. CALL; LISTENED TO HEARING ON RETIREE REPRESENTATIVE.	0.45 112.50
01/09/2019	JDS	ATTEND 1/9/19 COMMITTEE CALL.	0.35 105.00
	EMY	WEEKLY COMMITTEE CONF. CALL.	0.40 100.00
01/10/2019	OVA	TELEPHONIC ATTENDANCE OF THE COMMITTEE CALL.	0.50 150.00
	JDS	ATTEND 1/10/19 COMMITTEE CALL.	0.20 60.00
	EMY	LISTENED TO COMM. CALL RE: PROPOSAL	0.75 187.50
01/11/2019	JDS	ATTEND 1/11/19 COMMITTEE CALL.	0.15 45.00
	EMY	LISTENED TO COMM. CALL RE: PROPOSAL.	0.25 62.50
	CDS	FOLLOW UP FROM COMMITTEE CALL; REVIEW NOTICE OF AGREEMENT AND REVISED WLB SETTLEMENT TERM SHEET.	0.50 175.00
01/14/2019	EMY	COMM. CALL REVIEWING TERM SHEET REVISIONS FROM DEBTOR.	0.25 62.50
	CDS	ANALYSIS OF CURRENT PLAN POSTURE, PARTICIPATE IN COMMITTEE CONFERENCE CALL, FOLLOW UP REGARDING REVISED TERM SHEET.	0.80 280.00
01/16/2019	CDS	PARTICIPATE IN COMMITTEE CONFERENCE CALL.	0.30 105.00
	EMY	WEEKLY COMMITTEE CONFERENCE CALL.	0.45 112.50
	JDS	ATTEND 1/16/19 HEARING TELEPHONICALLY.	0.30 90.00
01/18/2019	EMY	COMM. CALL WITH MOST RECENT SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS.	0.20 50.00
	CDS	COMMUNICATIONS WITH MOFO REGARDING STATUS OF DISCUSSION WITH WLB LENDERS AND DEBTORS REGARDING COMMITTEE SETTLEMENT.	0.20 70.00
	CDS	COMMUNICATE WITH A. SMITH REGARDING TERMS OF SETTLEMENT.	0.20 70.00

ACCT NO.: [REDACTED]
 INVOICE NO.: 451775

RE: WESTMORELAND COAL COMPANY UCC

			HOURS	
01/20/2019	CDS	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF CASE STATUS CORRESPONDENCE FROM MOFO AND ATTENTION TO APPROACHING DATES AND DEADLINES.	0.30	105.00
01/22/2019	CDS	RECEIPT AND PRELIMINARY REVIEW OF AGENDA AND CALL MATERIALS IN ADVANCE OF TOMORROW'S COMMITTEE DISCUSSION.	0.30	105.00
01/23/2019	JDS	ATTEND 1/23/19 COMMITTEE CALL.	0.25	75.00
	EMY	WEEKLY COMMITTEE CONF. CALL.	0.40	100.00
01/24/2019	CDS	REVIEW OF UCC DRAFT STATEMENT IN RESPECT OF WLB SETTLEMENT, RESPOND TO MOFO REGARDING SAME.	0.30	105.00
01/26/2019	CDS	REVIEW OF CLAIMS MATTERS, DISCUSS WITH COUNSEL FOR DEBTOR AND COMMITTEE.	0.50	175.00
01/28/2019	CDS	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF COMMITTEE COMMUNICATION REGARDING CONFIRMATION OBJECTIONS.	0.30	105.00
01/29/2019	CDS	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF CALL AGENDA.	0.30	105.00
01/30/2019	CDS	REVIEW MATERIALS AND SUMMARY OF RECENT FILINGS IN ADVANCE OF COMMITTEE CALL.	0.40	140.00
	EMY	WEEKLY COMMITTEE CONF. CALL.	0.70	175.00
	JDS	ATTEND WEEKLY COMMITTEE CALL.	0.25	75.00
01/31/2019	OVA	TELEPHONIC ATTENDANCE OF THE COMMITTEE CALL.	0.50	150.00
02/03/2019	JDS	READ/REVIEW EMAIL FROM A. KISSNER RE: CASE UPDATE; READ EMAIL FROM E. RICHARDS RE: CASE UPDATE.	0.10	30.00
02/04/2019	CDS	REVIEW DOCKET AND COMMUNICATE WITH MOFO AND CLIENTS REGARDING PRESENT STATUS OF MATTERS.	0.30	105.00
	EMY	LISTENED TO OMIBUS HEARING.	0.75	187.50
02/05/2019	CDS	REVIEW MATERIALS CIRCULATED IN ADVANCE OF COMMITTEE CALL, REVIEW KEMMERRER MINE SALE ASPECTS AND CURE SCHEDULE.	0.30	105.00
02/06/2019	EMY	WEEKLY COMMITTEE CONF. CALL.	0.45	112.50
02/08/2019	CDS	RECEIVE AND REVIEW UPDATE TO COMMITTEE FROM MOFO, ANALYZE PENDING MATTERS ON DOCKET AND REVIEW STATUS OF UPCOMING CONFIRMATION PROCEEDINGS.	0.40	140.00
02/13/2019	EMY	WEEKLY COMMITTEE CONF. CALL.	0.40	100.00
	CDS	REVIEW OF COMMITTEE COMMUNICATIONS AND TELEPHONE DISCUSSION WITH L. MARINUZZI.	0.60	210.00
	JDS	ATTEND 2/13/19 COMMITTEE CALL.	0.40	120.00
02/15/2019	JDS	READ EMAIL FROM A. KISSNER RE: COMMITTEE UPDATE.	0.10	30.00
	CDS	REVIEW OF STANDING MOTION AND ATTACHED COMPLAINT, COMMUNICATIONS WITH MOFO REGARDING SAME.	0.75	262.50

ACCT NO.: [REDACTED]
 INVOICE NO.: 451775

RE: WESTMORELAND COAL COMPANY UCC

			HOURS	
02/18/2019	JDS	ATTEND 2/18/19 COMMITTEE MEETING.	0.20	60.00
	CDS	PARTICIPATE IN COMMITTEE CONFERENCE CALL.	0.40	140.00
	EMY	COMM. CALL RE: SETTLEMENT WITH MLP LENDERS.	0.30	75.00
02/20/2019	CDS	PARTICIPATE IN COMMITTEE CALL.	0.25	87.50
02/24/2019	EMY	COMM. CALL RE: SETTLEMENT WITH MLP LENDERS.	0.25	62.50
02/25/2019	JDS	READ EMAIL FROM A. KISSNER RE: COAL ACT SETTLEMENT.	0.10	30.00
02/26/2019	CDS	REVIEW DOCKET AND AGENDA IN ADVANCE OF CONFIRMATION PROCEEDINGS.	0.50	175.00
02/27/2019	JDS	ATTEND 2/27/19 COMMITTEE CALL.	0.10	30.00
	EMY	WEEKLY COMM. CONF. CALL.	0.20	50.00
	CDS	PARTICIPATE IN COMMITTEE CALL.	0.25	87.50
02/28/2019	CDS	ATTEND CONFIRMATION AND SALE HEARINGS AT WLB/MLP AS WELL AS MEETINGS WITH ESTATE PROFESSIONALS.	4.00	1,400.00
03/01/2019	JDS	READ EMAIL FROM A. KISSNER RE: SUMMARY OF WLB CONFIRMATION HEARING.	0.10	30.00
03/06/2019	JDS	ATTEND 3/6/19 WEEKLY COMMITTEE CALL.	0.10	30.00
	EMY	WEEKLY COMM. CONF. CALL.	0.15	37.50
	CDS	FOLLOW UP WITH J. STIFF REGARDING COMMITTEE CALL.	0.15	52.50
03/13/2019	JDS	ATTEND 3/13/19 COMMITTEE CALL; FOLLOW-UP TELECONFERENCE WITH C. SPECKHART.	0.10	30.00
	EMY	WEEKLY COMM. CONF CALL.	0.10	25.00
03/20/2019	EMY	WEEKLY COMM. CONF. CALL.	0.25	62.50
	JDS	ATTEND 3/20/19 COMMITTEE CALL.	0.20	60.00
03/21/2019	CDS	RECEIPT OF UPDATE FROM MOFO REGARDING STATUS CONFERENCE HELD IN TEXAS.	0.30	127.50
03/22/2019	CDS	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF COMPLAINT FILED ON BEHALF OF WLB PURCHASER AND READ NOTE FROM MOFO REGARDING SAME.	0.30	127.50
03/26/2019	JDS	READ/REVIEW EMAIL RE: TRO HEARING.	0.10	30.00
03/27/2019	JDS	ATTEND 3/27/19 WEEKLY COMMITTEE TELECONFERENCE.	0.15	45.00
	JDS	TELECONFERENCE WITH C. SPECKHART RE: OHIO CAT/WHEELER COMMITTEE FEES & EXPENSES.	0.10	30.00
		FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED	<u>72.60</u>	<u>22,207.50</u>
10/19/2018		OUT OF TOWN TRAVEL - CDS/TRAVEL TO NYC FOR UCC COMMITTEE COUNSEL PITCHES - ELYSEE HOTEL		442.99
11/06/2018		OUT OF TOWN TRAVEL - TRAVEL/LODGING/PARKING		609.19

WHEELER MACHINERY AP

ACCT NO.: [REDACTED]
INVOICE NO.: 451775

RE: WESTMORELAND COAL COMPANY UCC

03/01/2019	OUT OF TOWN TRAVEL - TRAVEL TO HOUSTON FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING - CULLEN D. SPECKHART	1,121.27
03/22/2019	OUT OF TOWN TRAVEL - CULLEN D. SPECKHART	<u>981.00</u>
	ADVANCES THRU 03/31/2019	<u>3,154.45</u>
	TOTAL CURRENT WORK	25,361.95
	PLEASE REMIT	<u>\$25,361.95</u>